Hfx. No. 454744

Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

Application by Victory Farms Incorporated and Jonathan Mullen Mink Ranch Limited (the "Applicants") for relief under the Companies' Creditors Arrangement Act

AFFIDAVIT OF BEN DURNFORD

- I, Ben Durnford, make oath and give evidence as follows:
 - 1. I am a partner with McInnes Cooper, which represents Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as the Court-appointed Monitor (the "Monitor") of the Applicants pursuant to the Companies' Creditors Arrangement Act.
 - 2. I have personal knowledge of the evidence sworn to in this Affidavit except where otherwise stated to be based on information or belief.
 - 3. I state, in this Affidavit, the source of any information that is not based on my own personal knowledge, and I state my belief of the source.
 - 4. Paragraph 21 of the August 31, 2016 Initial Order in these proceedings provided that the Monitor and counsel to the Monitor were to be paid their reasonable fees and disbursements by the Applicants at their standard rates. The Administration Charge created within the August 31, 2016 Initial Order provided security over the assets of the Applicants in respect of the fees and disbursements incurred by the Monitor and by the Monitor's counsel, both before and after the issuance of the Initial Order.
 - 5. This Affidavit is made in support of a Motion by the Monitor for an Order which includes approval of the fees and disbursements of the Monitor and the Monitor's counsel for the period from August 31, 2016 through to the date these CCAA proceedings are terminated with the issuance of a Discharge Certificate (as defined in the draft Discharge Order).
 - 6. It is my understanding that the Monitor's own accounts shall be appended to the Tenth Report of the Monitor, which is to be filed in support of the present Motion.
 - 7. During the period between August 31, 2016 and November 15, 2017, McInnes Cooper recorded 443.9 hours worked in respect of these CCAA proceedings, which amounted to fees totalling \$172,985.64 Disbursements incurred by McInnes Cooper during this same period totalled \$345.56, and HST applicable to the accounts totalled \$25,956.24 for a grand total of \$199,287.44. Attached hereto in a bundle collectively marked as Exhibit "A" are the statements of account issued by McInnes Cooper in this matter in connection with these CCAA proceedings over the period described above.
 - 8. Attached hereto in a bundle marked as Exhibit "B" is a schedule summarizing each invoice noted in Exhibit "A" along with a breakdown of hours worked, including the fees, disbursements, HST and total fees charged in each invoice.

- 9. Each invoice attached in the Exhibit "A" bundle, as well as the breakdown accompanying the schedule found at Exhibit "B", specify the nature of the disbursement incurred on the file, the name of the timekeeper performing the work, his or her hourly rate, and the HST components applicable to the accounts.
- 10. I verily believe that the professional rates charged by McInnes Cooper throughout these CCAA proceedings are consistent with the rates charged by other Atlantic Canadian legal practitioners for the provision of similar services.
- 11. I estimate that additional professional time to complete these CCAA proceedings will be required by McInnes Cooper, in an amount not likely to exceed \$5,000.
- 12. This Affidavit is sworn in respect of a Motion which includes a request for the approval of the fees and disbursements of the Monitor's legal counsel, and for no other purpose.

SWORN TO at Halifax, County of Halifax, Province of Nova Scotia, this 15th day of November, 2017 before me:

A Barrister in the Supreme Court of

Nova Scotia TEDDY J. COMEAU A Barrister of the Supreme Court of Nova Scotia BEN DURNFORD

2016

Hfx. No. 454744

Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

Application by Victory Farms Incorporated and Jonathan Mullen Mink Ranch Limited (the "Applicants") for relief under the Companies' Creditors Arrangement Act

CERTIFICATE OF EXHIBIT

This is Exhibit "A" of the Affidavit of Ben Durnford Sworn to before me this 15th day of November, 2017.

A Barrister of the Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

TEDDY J. COMEAU A Barrister of the Supreme Court of Nova Scotia



Deloitte 1969 Upper Water Street

Suite 1500 - Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 3R7

Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016023438 September 12, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending September 12, 2016, including:

29-Aug -16-	Emails with J. Foran; Discussion with J. Stringer;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
30 Aug 16	Email exchanges and discussion with J. Foran and K. MacLeod; Prepare Consent to Act as Monitor; File Consent and send to Deloitte; Review materials in preparation for Court; Discuss ALC and NAFA situation with J. Foran;	BRD	2.50 hrs.	\$ 812.50
31 Aug 16	Preparation for Chambers; Attend Chambers and recover issued Order; Courier letter and Order to T. Hill; Assist Deloitte with publication of necessary information; Review newspaper proofs and review Digby County Courier publication; Follow up discussions and emails with Deloitte;	BRD	3.10 hrs.	\$ 1,007.50
31 Aug 16	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
1 Sep 16	Emails with Deloitte regarding paper publication;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
6 Sep 16	Call to J. Foran and review Foran	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 32.50

File:	142706
-------	--------

2		

	voicemail;			
7 Sep 16	Call to J. Foran to discuss DIP Motion;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
7 Sep 16	Review Term Sheet; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 150.00
8 Sep 16	Emails with J. McElman and J. Foran; Attend conference call with FCC counsel; Revise draft First Report of Monitor;	BRD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 422.50
8 Sep 16	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Telephone conference with Josh McElman and Gavin MacDonald; Review First Report of Monitor; Various emails;	JDS	1.40 hrs.	\$ 700.00
9 Sep 16	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Review revised Monitors Report;	JDS	2.20 hrs.	\$ 1,100.00
9 Sep 16	Email J. Foran; Review draft Report and recommend amendments; Email to T. Hill; Review McElman and Hill emails; Review revised draft Report; ; Review draft Motion materials;	₿RD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 422.50
Total Hours	.		13.10	
Our Fee:				\$ 4,975.00
Administra	tíve Fee			\$ 149.25
Total Profes	Total Professional Fees			\$ 5,124.25

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	4.10	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,050.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	9.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 2,925.00
	13.10		\$ 4,975.00

File: 142706

HST On Fees	\$ 768.64
Total Amount Due	\$ 5,892.89
Balance Due	\$ 5,892.89

Benjamin R. Durnford

Adjusted Fee - \$4,097.50
Admin Charge - 122.93
Tax 633.06
\$4,853.49



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016023438 September 12, 2016

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT File: 142706

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

> REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

\$ 5,124.25 **Total Professional Fees** \$ 768.64 **Total HST** \$ 5,892.89 **Total Amount Due**

\$ 5,892.89 **Balance Due**

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

Please include the Invoice number with your wiring Instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard. Interest may be charged on overdue accounts.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016024080 September 23, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending September 23, 2016, including:

12 Sep 16	Emails with J. Foran; Review Report and suggest revisions; Edit RBC letter; Filing and service of Report; Preparation of Affidavit of Service;	BRD	3.00 hrs.	\$ 975.00
13 Sep 16	Prepare Affidavit of Service and file; Send to T. Hill and J. Foran;	BRD	0.90 hrs.	\$ 292.50
14 Sep 16	Emails with T. Hill and J. Foran;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
15 Sep 16	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Review materials from Maurice Chiasson;	JDS	2.00 hrs.	\$ 1,000.00
15 Sep 16	Discussion with J. Foran; Review M. Chiasson email and later submission; Emails with T. Hill; Prepare Chambers remarks; Discussions with J. Foran regarding Supplemental Report; Review variance report of Deloitte; Emails with T. Hill;	BRÐ	5.40 hrs.	\$ 1,755.00
16 Sep 16	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Finalize Supplemental Report; Various emails;	JDS	1.10 hrs.	\$ 550.00

2	File: 142706

		_		
16 Sep 16	Prepare materials for Chambers; Arrange and revise Supplemental Report of Monitor; File and Distribute Supplemental Report; Attend Chambers Hearing; Post-Hearing discussion with T. Hill, J. Foran and K. McLeod;	BRD	4.50 hrs.	\$ 1,462.50
19 Sep 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 350.00
19 Sep 16	Emails with J. Foran regarding payment to mink supplier; Affidavit of Service regarding Supplemental Report (prepared and filed); Review new paragraph 16 of Order and comment;	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 357.50
20 Sep 16	Discussions with J. Foran; Email T. Hill regarding Motion; Consider preference issue;	BRD	0.50 hrs.	\$ 162.50
20 Sep 16	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 250.00
21 Sep 16	Review ALC Brief; Review NAFA Brief; Discussions and emails with J. Foran and K. McLeod regarding tax payments, preferences;	BRD	3,20 hrs.	\$ 1,040.00
21 Sep 16	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Review Submissions; Telephone conferences with James Foran;	JDS	1.90 hrs.	\$ 950.00
22 Sep 16	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Conference with James Foran; Review draft Second Report;	JDS	1.50 hrs.	\$ 750.00
22 Sep 16	Prepare speaking notes for Chambers; Emails and discussions with J. Foran, T. Hill and M. Chiasson; Meeting with Counsel; Attend Chambers Motion; Post-Hearing Discussion; Review Second Monitor's Report and advise;	BRD	6.30 hrs.	\$ 2,047.50
Total Hours			32.80	
.ota. Hoalo				@ 40 007 E0

Our Fee:

\$ 12,007.50

File: 142706

Administrative Fee		
Total Professional Fees		

\$ 360.23

\$ 12,367.73

Fee Summary

Name_	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	7.70	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,850.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	25.10	\$ 325.00	\$ 8,157.50
	32.80		\$ 12.007.50

HST On Fees	\$ 1,855.16
Total Amount Due	\$ 14,222.89
Balance Due	\$ 14,222.89

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016024080

September 23, 2016

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees \$ 12,367.73

Total HST \$ 1,855.16

Total Amount Due \$ 14,222.89

Balance Due \$ 14,222.89

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016025163 September 30, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending September 30, 2016, including:

23 Sep 16	Revise Report No. 2 of Monitor; Discussions with J. Foran and J. Stringer; Review Preference Issue; Review Cash Flows; File report and service; Emails with G. Didiodato;	BRD	3.40 hrs.	\$1,105.00
23 Sep 16	Revise Report; Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 450.00
26 Sep 16	Complete Affidavit of Service; File Affidavit of Service; Discussions with J. Foran regarding various matters;	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 357.50
26 Sep 16	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
27 Sep 16	Prepare for extension Hearing; Attend decision reading; Pre- and Post-Hearing meetings with P. Branton and T. Hill; Prepare notes for Chambers; Review and reply to J. Foran emails regarding DIP;	BRD	4.10 hrs.	\$ 1,332.50
27 Sep 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
28 Sep 16	Emails to T. Hill, P. Branton, J. Foran regarding DIP loan; Discussions with J. Foran; Review	BRD ·	3.00 hrs.	\$ 975.00

File: 142706

	CCAAs. 23 and adverse change requirements; Prepare notes for Hearing; Attend Hearing; Post-Hearing meeting with J. Foran; Emails with G. Didiodato regarding Order; Review Deloitte posting of Order;			
28 Sep 16	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	1.00 hrs.	\$ 500.00
29 Sep 16	Emails with T. Hill and P. Branton; Email and discussion with M. Chiasson; Discussion with J. Foran; Emails to Foran and McLeod regarding NAFA position;	BRD	1.00 hrs.	\$ 325.00
29 Sep 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 400.00
Total Hours			15.70	
Our Fee:				\$ 5,645.00
Administrat	ive Fee		_	\$ 169.35
Total Profes	sional Fees			\$ 5,814.35

Fee Summary

Name_	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	3.10	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,550.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	12.60	\$ 325.00	\$ 4,095.00
	15.70		\$ 5,645.00

HST On Fees	\$ 872.15
Total Amount Due	\$ 6,686.50
Balance Due	\$ 6,686.50

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016025163 September 30, 2016

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees\$ 5,814.35Total HST\$ 872.15Total Amount Due\$ 6,686.50

Balance Due \$ 6,686.50

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016026947

October 24, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending October 24, 2016, including:

30 Sep 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
3 Oct 16	Review P. Branton email;	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 32.50
4 Oct 16	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 250.00
4 Oct 16	Review CNH fax; Change E-service list; Email to Monitor regarding cash flow; Discussion with Kurt McLeod regarding DIP loan, change of feed supplier and s. 32 of CCAA; Email to Monitor on subject;	BRD	1.40 hrs.	\$ 455.00
5 Oct 16	Review K. McLeod and J. Foran emails; Prepare communication to secured creditors; Confirm DIP arrangements;	BRD	1.00 hrs.	\$ 325.00
5 Oct 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 250.00
6 Oct 16	Emails to/from B. Durnford;	KG	0.20 hrs.	\$ 75.00
6 Oct 16	Email exchange with J. Foran and M. McLeod; Email secured creditors for security packages; Emails to K. Gardiner; Review FCC Security; Fax	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 390.00

7 Oct 16	Conducting PPSA searches in the Province of Nova Scotia against Jonathan Mullen Mink Ranch Limited, Victory Farms Incorporated, Jonathan Mullen, Jonathan Luke Mullen, Trinity Farms Inc. and Above & Beyond Farms Inc., at the request of K. Gardiner; forwarding search results to K. Gardiner;	JRG	0.40 hrs.	\$ 68.00
7 Oct 16	Email exchange with Farm Loan Board; Receive NAFA security;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
7 Oct 16	Review security file; email to J. Gray; search Nova Scotia Registry of Joint Stock Companies website;	KG	4.80 hrs.	\$ 1,800.00
11 Oct 16	Review security file; PPSA search results; work on letter to Monitor; email to T. Parker;	KG	5.70 hrs.	\$ 2,137.50
12 Oct 16	Emails to/from T. Parker; review security file; work on letter to monitor;	KG	3.70 hrs.	\$ 1,387.50
12 Oct 16	Receiving NS Farm Loan Board security bundle and sending to K. Gardiner;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
12 Oct 16	Conduct search on Property on Line; email results to K. Gardiner;	TP	0.20 hrs.	\$ 24.00
12 Oct 16	Conducting PPSA search in the Province of Nova Scotia against Trinity Farms Inc., at the request of K. Gardiner; forwarding search results to K. Gardiner;	JRG	0.20 hrs.	\$ 34.00
13 Oct 16	Email to K. Gardiner with parcel registers;	TP	0,20 hrs.	\$ 24.00
13 Oct 16	Emails to/from B. Durnford; office conference with B. Durnford; review security documents;	KG	4.10 hrs.	\$ 1,537.50
13 Oct 16	Discussion with K. Gardiner; Review NAFA file; Email to P. Branton regarding Consignment Agreement; Review T. Hill email; Send Agreement to K. Gardiner; Review	BRD	1.00 hrs.	\$ 325.00

2

		3		File: 14270
	J. Foran email;			
14 Oct 16	Email to T. Hill; Email to M. Chiasson; Review Chiasson reply; Email J. Foran re: Appraisal;	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 130.00
14 Oct 16	Review security file; letter to monitor;	KG	1.60 hrs.	\$ 600.00
19 Oct 16	Emails to K. Gardiner forwarding ALC security file; Review J. Foran email;	BRD	0,30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
20 Oct 16	Discuss HST issue with J. Foran; Review materials, CCAA and resource materials; Provide advices to J. Foran regarding HST and follow up exchange with J. Foran;	BRD	2.20 hrs.	\$ 715.00
20 Oct 16	Varíous emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 150.00
21 Oct 16	Discussion with J. Stringer regarding HST issue;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
24 Oct 16	Meeting with James Foran;	JDS	1.00 hrs.	\$ 500.00
24 Oct 16	Review file materials and one hour meeting with J. Foran and K. McLeod;	BRD	1.40 hrs.	\$ 455.00
Total Hours	-		33.40	

Administrative Fee

Our Fee:

Total Professional Fees

\$ 12,122.50

\$ 363.68

\$ 12,486.18

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	2.50	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,250.00
Karen Gardiner	20.10	\$ 375.00	\$ 7,537.50
Benjamin R. Durnford	9.80	\$ 325.00	\$ 3,185.00
Joanne R. Gray	0.60	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00
Tammy Parker	0.40	\$ 120.00	\$ 48,00
	33.40		\$ 12,122.50

Disbursements: (HST Exempt)

PPSA Registrations/Searches	\$ 61.25	
Total Disbursements		\$ 61.25
HST On Fees	_	\$ 1,872.93
Total Amount Due		\$ 14,420.36
Balance Due		\$ 14,420.36

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016026947

October 24, 2016

File: 142706

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 12,486.18
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 61.25
Total HST	\$ 1,872.93
Total Amount Due	\$ 14,420.36

Balance Due \$14,420.36

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Hallfax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615

ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please Include the Involce number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016029599 November 15, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Hajifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending November 15, 2016, including:

25 Oct 16	Review cash flow statements;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
25 Oct 16	Review cash flow analysis;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
28 Oct 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
28 Oct 16	Review J. Foran update; Email to K. Gardiner regarding priorities agreement validity point;	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 357.50
28 Oct 16	Review security file; work on letter to monitor;	KG	1.60 hrs.	\$ 600.00
31 Oct 16	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS .	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
1 Nov 16	Email to K. Gardiner and J. Stringer regarding qualification language for security vetting regarding disputed priority agreement;	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 195.00
10 Nov 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 150.00
10 Nov 16	Email to J. Foran and setting up meeting for Monday, November 14;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
10 Nov 16	Conduct search for properties; email results to K. Gardiner;	TP	0.20 hrs.	\$ 24.00

File: 142706

14 Nov 16	Review cash-flows; Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Meeting with James Foran;	JDS	1.90 hrs.	\$ 950.00
14 Nov 16	Review cash flows and mink condition report; Meeting with K. McLeod, J. Foran and J. Stringer to discuss next steps;	BRD	2.10 hrs.	\$ 682.50
14 Nov 16	Conduct online search; copy documents;	DLB	0.50 hrs.	\$ 60.00
Total Hours	;		9.30	
Our Fee:				\$ 3,449.00
Administra	tive Fee			\$ 103.47
Total Profes	ssional Fees			\$ 3,552.47

2

Fee Summary

<u>Name</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	2.80	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,400.00
Karen Gardiner	1.60	\$ 375.00	\$ 600.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	4.20	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,365.00
Tammy Parker	0.20	\$ 120.00	\$ 24.00
Don Brown	0.50	\$ 120.00	\$ 60.00
•	9.30		\$ 3,449.00

HST On Fees	\$ 532.87
Total Amount Due	\$ 4,085.34
Balance Due	\$ 4,085.34

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2016029599

November 15, 2016 File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE:

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees\$ 3,552.47Total HST\$ 532.87Total Amount Due\$ 4,085.34

Balance Due

\$4,085.34

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code; NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring Instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016031544 November 30, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending November 30, 2016, including:

8 Nov 16	Review security documents; review and revise letter to monitor; review PPSA search results;	KG	4.20 hrs.	\$ 1,575.00
10 Nov 16	Emails to/from T. Panterre re: property search; review search results; work on security review;	KG	3.20 hrs.	\$ 1,200.00
14 Nov 16	Review security documents; review and revise letter to monitor; email to D. Brown re: property search; review search results;	KG	3.80 hrs.	\$ 1,425.00
15 Nov 16	Review security documents; review and revise letter to monitor;	KG	2.90 hrs.	\$ 1,087.50
16 Nov 16	Emails to/from B. Durnford; revise and revise letter to monitor;	KG	2.60 hrs.	\$ 975.00
16 Nov 16	Review J. Foran emails and cash position information; Revise security review and dialogue with K. Gardiner; Discuss status of Extension Hearing with J. Foran; Email to Foran regarding Monitor's Report outline;	BRD	2.10 hrs.	\$ 682.50

		2		File: 142706
16 Nov 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Review outline of Report;	JDS	1.00 hrs.	\$ 500.00
17 Nov 16	Review and revise letter to monitor; email to B. Durnford;	KG	0.90 hrs.	\$ 337.50
17 Nov 16	Review Motion materials;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
18 Nov 16	Emails to/from B. Durnford; review and revise security review;	KG	0.90 hrs.	\$ 337.50
18 Nov 16	Revising security review and discussions with K. Gardiner; Send Report; Emails with K. McLeod and discussion regarding Third Report;	BRD	1.70 hrs.	\$ 552.50
21 Nov 16	Review and revise draft Report; Discussions with J. Foran and K. McLeod; Discussion with J, Stringer regarding payments to Trinity Farms; Revise Report; Conference call with Deloitte; Review final version and coordinate filling;	BRD	3.60 hrs.	\$ 1,170.00
21 Nov 16	Telephone conference with James Foran; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Review draft Receiver's Report; Various emails;	JDS	2.40 hrs.	\$ 1,200.00
22 Nov 16	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 300.00
22 Nov 16	Review K. McLeod emails; Email regarding filing; Preparing Affidavit of Service and meeting J. Foran to execute; Filing Affidavit with Court; Email to G. Didiodato; Email exchange with T. Hill;	BRD	3.10 hrs.	\$ 1,007.50
23 Nov 16	Review materials for Motion; Prepare speaking notes; Email J. Foran and K. McLeod regarding investigation of Trinity payments; Assemble materials for Chambers; Discussion with J. Stringer;	BRD	1.80 hrs.	\$ 585.00
23 Nov 16	Various emails;	JDS	0,20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
24 Nov 16	Prepare for Chambers; Attend Chambers Hearing of Motion for further extension; Discuss matters after Court and email C. Piercey and	BRD	2.20 hrs.	\$ 715.00

		3		File: 142706
	J. Foran;			
24 Nov 16	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 300.00
25 Nov 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 250.00
25 Nov 16	Emails from M. Chiasson; Email to J. Foran and K. McLeod; Consider Payments matter; Discussion with J. Foran;	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 195.00
29 Nov 16	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JD\$	0.30 hrs.	\$ 150.00
29 Nov 16	Discussion with J. Foran regarding mink count and payments issue; Reporting Memo to file and J. Stringer;	BRD	0.70 hrs.	\$ 227.50
Total Hours			40.10	
Our Fee:				\$ 14,972.50
Administrat	tive Fee		_	\$ 449.18

Fee Summary

\$ 15,421.68

<u>Name</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	5.80	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,900.00
Karen Gardiner	18.50	\$ 375.00	\$ 6,937.50
Benjamin R. Durnford	15.80	\$ 325.00	\$ 5,135.00
	40.10		\$ 14,972.50

HST On Fees	\$ 2,313.25
Total Amount Due	\$ 17,734.93
Balance Due	\$ 17,734. <u>93</u>

Benjamin R. Durnford

Total Professional Fees



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016031544 November 30, 2016

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT File: 142706

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees \$ 15,421.68 **Total HST** \$ 2,313.25 **Total Amount Due** \$ 17,734.93

Balance Due \$ 17,734.93

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2016033922 December 22, 2016

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending December 22, 2016, including:

30 Nov 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 150.00
30 Nov 16	Review of letter to debtors; Revising and sending comments to J. Foran;	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 390.00
1 Dec 16	Review M. Chiasson and J. Foran email exchanges;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 65.00
2 Dec 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 200.00
2 Dec 16	Coordinating meeting for Monday, December 5, regarding liquidation scenario; Email J. Stringer;	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 130.00
5 Dec 16	Office conference with B. Durnford; review PPSA search results; determine priority ranking; emails to/from B. Durnford;	KG	1.10 hrs.	\$ 412.50
5 Dec 16	Review liquidation analysis and provide commentary; Attend lengthy meeting at Deloitte to discuss analysis; Review of security registrations and documentation to address priority rankings; Discussion with K. Gardiner; Prepare overview	BRD	5.40 hrs.	\$ 1,755.00

	memorandum; Email exchanges with J. Foran and J. Stringer;			
5 Dec 16	Meeting with James Foran; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Review Realization Schedule; Review draft Fourth Report of Receiver; Various emails; Revise priorities memo;	JDS	3,00 hrs.	\$ 1,500.00
6 Dec 16	Office conference with B. Durnford, J. Stringer; review and revise priority ranking table; email to/from B. Durnford;	KG	1.80 hrs.	\$ 675.00
6 Dec 16	Conference with Ben Durnford; Review and revise Priorities and Security Report; Various emails;	JDS	1.30 hrs.	\$ 650.00
 6 Dec 16	Assembling priorities table and overview for J. Foran and K. MacLeod; Review of security materials and intercreditor agreement; Meeting with J. Stringer and K. Gardiner to discuss; Calls with J. Foran and K. MacLeod regarding Agristability fund and change;	BRD	3,40 hrs.	\$ 1,105.00
7 Dec 16	Conduct serial number search; Review results; Discussion with J. Stringer; Call with J. Foran;	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 260.00
7 Dec 16	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
7 Dec 16	Conducting four (4) searches in the Province of Nova Scotia against Serial Nos. 1GCJK34618E144377, LA0602525, 2167, and M600027 at the request of B. Durnford; forwarding results of same to B. Durnford.	SLH	0.30 hrs.	\$ 39.00
8 Dec 16	Discussion with J. Stringer; Review realizations table and commenting to J. Foran; Review P. Branton email; Meeting with K. MacLeod, J. Foran and J. Stringer to review realization schedule; Review Fourth Report and revising;	BRD	2.70 hrs.	\$ 877.50
8 Dec 16	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	1.60 hrs.	\$ 800.00

2

File: 142706

	Review revised realization schedule; Various emails; Meeting with James Foran;			
9 Dec 16	Emails with J. Foran; Review T. Hill's email; Review finalized Realization Schedule and covering email;	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 130.00
9 Dec 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 300.00
15 Dec 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 350.00
15 Dec 16	Email exchanges with J. Foran; Discussion with J. Stringer;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
20 Dec 16	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JD\$	0.40 hrs.	\$ 200.00
21 Dec 16	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 100.00
21 Dec 16	Review T. Hill emails; Email J. Foran and discussion with J. Stringer;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 97.50
Total Hours			27.00	***
Our Fee:				\$ 10,384.00
Administrative Fee				\$ 311.52
Total Profes	sional Fees			\$ 10,695.52

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	8.70	\$ 500.00	\$ 4,350.00
Karen Gardiner	2,90	\$ 375.00	\$ 1,087.50
Benjamin R. Durnford	15.10	\$ 325.00	\$ 4,907.50
Sherry L. Hancock	0.30	\$ 130.00	\$ 39.00
	27.00		\$ 10,384.00

PPSA Registrations/Searches \$ 35.00

Total Disbursements \$ 35.00

File: 142706

HST On Fees	\$ 1,604.33
Total Amount Due	\$ 12,334.85
Balance Due	\$ 12,334.85

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2016033922 December 22, 2016

File: 142706 GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 10,695.52
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 35.00
Total HST	\$ 1,604.33
Total Amount Due	\$ 12,334.85

Balance Due \$ 12,334.85

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swlft Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your Wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017002623

February 8, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending February 8, 2017, including:

6 Jan 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
6 Jan 17	Discussing matters with J. Stringer; Email exchange with J. Foran regarding progress of VFI negotiation with secured creditors;	BRD	0,60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
17 Jan 17	Email J. Foran re status of matter.	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
18 Jan 17	Discussion with J. Foran re next steps.	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
18 Jan 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
20 Jan 17	Review J. Foran email.	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
25 Jan 17	Review VFI Motion materials. Discussion with J. Foran regarding Fifth Report, Conference call with T. Hill and J. Foran. Post-call emails.	BRD	1.60 hrs.	\$ 536.00
26 Jan 17	Discussions with J. Foran. Revising Fifth Report and commenting to J. Foran.	BRD	2.50 hrs.	\$ 837.50
27 Jan 17	Discussions with J. foran. Emails to	BRD	3.80 hrs.	\$ 1,273.00

	K. MacLeod. Review cash flows and Fifth Report. Filing Fifth Report and preparing Affidavit of Service. Email exchanges with M. Chiasson. Discussions with T. Hill and J. Stringer. Addressing ALC query about paragraph 6-7 or Report.			
27 Jan 17	Review Fifth Report; Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	1.80 hrs.	\$ 927.00
30 Jan 17	Prepare for Chambers. Attending Extension Motion hearing. Post-Hearing discussion with FCC Counsel, NSFLB and Monitor. Emails with T. Hill.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
30 Jan 17	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
31 Jan 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
31 Jan 17	Conference call with J. Foran and T. Hill. Review J. Foran emails. Second call with Monitor, NAFA, Debtors and counsel. Post-call emails with J. Foran. Further half hour discussion with J. Foran regarding next steps and alternatives.	BRD	2.40 hrs.	\$ 804.00
1 Feb 17	Email exchanges with J. Foran, J. Stringer and K. MacLeod on timeline for sale.	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
1 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
2 Feb 17	Review draft documents; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Meeting with James Foran; Conference call with Tim Hill;	JDS	3.40 hrs.	\$ 1,751.00
2 Feb 17	Review stalking horse procedure order and related materials. Review DIP order (No. 2) and Notice. Meeting with J. Foran and K. MacLeod of Deloitte. Conference call with counsel re next steps.	BRD	3.70 hrs.	\$1,239.50
3 Feb 17	Review stalking Horse bidding	BRD	1.80 hrs.	\$ 603.00

\$ 13,264.16

	procedure order and related materials. Discussion contents with J. Stringer. Sending comments to Monitor and T. Hill.			
3 Feb 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
6 Feb 17	Review draft APA and sending comments to T. Hill. Discussion with J. foran regarding DIP overpayment.	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
6 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Review draft Asset Purchase Agreement;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
7 Feb 17	Conference call with Tim Hill and James Foran; Conference(s) with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	1.90 hrs.	\$ 978.50
7 Feb 17	Review draft motion materials. Discussing matters with J. Stringer. Review s. 36 CCAA. Attending meeting and conference call with Deloitte and other counsel. Review draft Sixth Report of Monitor and comment on T. Hill emails. Review earlier security findings.	BRD	1.90 hrs.	\$ 636.50
Total Hours		-	32.00	
Our Fee:				\$ 12,754.00
Administrati	ve Fee		_	\$ 510.16

3

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	11.30	\$ 515.00	\$ 5,819.50
Benjamin R. Durnford	20.70	\$ 335.00	\$ 6,934.50
	32,00		\$ 12,754.00

Total Professional Fees

File: 142706

HST On Fees	\$ 1,989.62
Total Amount Due	\$ 15,253.78
Balance Due	\$ 15,253.78

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2017002623

February 8, 2017

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees\$ 13,264.16Total HST\$ 1,989.62Total Amount Due\$ 15,253.78

Balance Due \$ 15,253.78

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name; McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017004644

February 28, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending February 28, 2017, including:

8 Feb 17	Review 6th Report and registering comments. Review M. Chiasson emails and T. Hill reply. Blackline changes to Report. Proposing advertizing plan for assets.	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00
8 Feb 17	Various emails; Review draft Sixth Report of Monitor; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	1.00 hrs.	\$ 515.00
9 Feb 17	Revising Sixth Report. Review T. Hill revisions to APA and materials. Email and discussions with J. Foran re Sixth Report of Monitor.	BRD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 435.50
9 Feb 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Review revised Sale Agreement; Review Motion documents;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
10 Feb 17	Revising Sixth Report. Discussions with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Serving list with Report. Preparing Affidavit of Service.	BRD	1.90 hrs.	\$ 636.50
14 Feb 17	Revising affidavit of service. Emailing counsel to confirm	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 402.00

		2		FIIC. 142
	adjournment of hearing. Attending Court to file Affidavit of Service.			
14 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
15 Feb 17	Review T. Hill email and responding. Discussion with J. Foran re: timeline of process to sell assets. Review brief from ALC. Review CNH Brief. Emails to K. MacLeod and T. Hill re equipment leases. Preparing Confidentiality and Non-Disclosure Agreement for J. Foran.	BRD	3.70 hrs.	\$ 1,239.50
15 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
16 Feb 17	Preparation for Chambers. Attending Chambers. Post-Chambers email to J. foran and discussion with K. MacLeod.	BRD	5.30 hrs.	\$ 1,775.50
16 Feb 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
21 Feb 17	Peruse letter from James Foran;	JDS	0.10 hrs.	\$ 51.50
21 Feb 17	Discussion with J. Foran. Review CNH leases and T. McEwen letter. Email to T. Hill and J. Foran.	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
23 Feb 17	Emailing J. Foram and K. MacLeod regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement and sale of assets. Review ALC email.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
23 Feb 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
24 Feb 17	Print Property Online parcel registered;	LHAW	0.20 hrs.	\$ 29.00
24 Feb 17	Emails to J. Foran; Review NDA and email K. MacLeod re: contents of ALC Agreement; Attend at offices of Deloitte to review equipment list; Email J. Foran and K. MacLeod re: sale process; Review T. Hill email;	BRD	1.80 hrs.	\$ 603.00
24 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
27 Feb 17	Emails with J. Foran; Review ALC	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00

	email and comment to J. Foran re: Non-Disclosure Agreement language;				
27 Feb 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50	
28 Feb 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00	
Total Hours	;		23.60		
Our Fee:				\$ 8,804.00	
Administrat	tive Fee		BA-FRA-ARI	\$ 352.16	
Total Profes	ssional Fees			\$ 9,156.16	

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	5.20	\$ 515.00	\$ 2,678.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	18.20	\$ 335.00	\$ 6,097.00
Laurinda Wile	0.20	\$ 145.00	\$ 29.00
	23.60		\$ 8,804.00

HST On Fees	\$ 1,373.42
Total Amount Due	\$ 10,529.58
Balance Due	\$ 10,529.58



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017004644

February 28, 2017

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

\$ 9,156.16 **Total Professional Fees Total HST** \$ 1,373.42 **Total Amount Due** \$ 10,529.58

\$10,529.58 **Balance Due**

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number; 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.

MCINNES COOPER

Deloitte 1969 Upper Water Street Suite 1500 - Purdy's Wharf Tower II Halifax, NS B3J 3R7

Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017007177

March 31, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending March 31, 2017, including:

28 Feb 17	Emails with J. Foran and T. Hill regarding NDA and position of American Legend Cooperative.	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
1 Mar 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
1 Mar 17	Email exchange with J. Foran and T. Hill. Review K. MacLeod emails. Discussing APA schedules with K. MacLeod. Follow up email to J. Foran and K. MacLeod regarding rental payments to mink rancher and need to document.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
2 Mar 17	Discussions with J. Foran and K. MacLeod regarding sale process. Amending information package for bidders. Revising disclaimers and ALC letter from J. Foran. Follow-up review and advice regarding real property schedule, leased equipment schedule and employee schedule.	BRD	3.10 hrs.	\$ 1,038.50
3 Mar 17	Discussion with K. MacLeod. Emails with J. Foran. Discussion with J.	BRD	2.40 hrs.	\$ 804.00

Email exchange with Agents for BNS

		3		File: 142706
	re silverado vehicle. Emails to T. Hill and J. Foran re letter;			
24 Mar 17	Emails with K. MacLeod and J. Foran re: bid deadline and next planning stages.	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
24 Mar 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
27 Mar 17	Conference call with counsel and emails to J. Foran re next steps.	BRD	0.70 hrs.	\$ 234.50
27 Mar 17	Various emails; Conference call with James Foran; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
Total Hours Our Fee:			20.30	\$ 7,160.50
				\$ 286.42
Administrat	tive Fee ssional Fees			\$ 7,446.92
10(4) 11010		· C		
	<u>r</u>	ee Summa <u>ry</u>		
Name	Hours	Rate	Amount	
John D. Stri		515.00	\$ 1,030.00	
Benjamin R		335.00	\$ 6,130.50	
	20.30		\$ 7,160.50	
Dieburgeru	ents: (HST Applicable)			
			\$ 21.55	
Long Distan			\$ 21.05 	404.55
Total Disbu	rsements			\$ 21.55
HST On Fee	9S			\$ 1,117.04
	able Disbursements			\$ 3.23
Total Amoun	it Due			\$ 8,588.74
Balance Du	е			\$ 8,588.74



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017007177

March 31, 2017

File: 142706

RE:

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

\$8,588.74

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Balance Due

Total Professional Fees	\$ 7,446.92
Total Taxable Disbursements	\$ 21.55
Total HST	\$ 1,120.27
Total Amount Due	\$ 8,588.74

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615

ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017009650

April 28, 2017 File: 142706 1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending April 28, 2017, including:

30 Mar 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
31 Mar 17	Emails with T. Hill re: claims process Order. Discussion with J. Stringer. Emails with J. Foran re Report and Hearing.	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00
31 Mar 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Review draft Motion documents; Various emails;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
3 Apr 17	Discussion with J. foran and K. MacLeod. Review and revise Seventh Report of Monitor. Discussion with J. Stringer re various issues. Review claims process Order and DIP issue. Emailing T. Hill re error in DIP No. 2 Order and inquiring re correction.	BRD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 435.50
3 Apr 17	Various emails; Review draft Seventh Report of the Monitor; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
4 Apr 17	Review final draft of Seventh Report. Filing with Court. Discussions with J. foran and K. MacLeod. Review	BRD	2.70 hrs.	\$ 904.50

File: 142706
\$ 412.00
\$ 435.50
\$ 360.50
\$ 770.50
\$ 360.50
\$ 1,574.50
\$ 737.00
\$ 257.50
\$ 154.50

	FCC email. Email T. Hill re FCC claim. Emails with Deloitte. Filing and service of Report letters to BNS and WCB.			
4 Apr 17	Review Motion materials; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
5 Apr 17	Emails with J. Foran. Preparing Affidavit of Service. Filing Affidavit of Service. Emailing J. Foran re RBC withdrawal issue;	BRD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 435.50
6 Apr 17	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
6 Apr 17	Discussion with J. Foran. Review M. Chiasson email re valuation and T. Hill reply. Email T. Hill re: s. 36(7) comfort. Review G. MacDonald brief and T. MacEwan submission. Follow up email to J. Foran re: FCC position.	BRD	2.30 hrs.	\$ 770.50
7 Apr 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
7 Apr 17	Preparations for hearing. Attending pre-hearing meeting with Counsel. Attending hearing. Post-hearing discussions and review emails of Counsel and Monitor;	BRD	4.70 hrs.	\$ 1,574.50
10 Apr 17	Review revised orders. Attending Chambers Application. Emails with Counsel. Discussion with J. Foran re next steps.	BRD	2.20 hrs.	\$ 737.00
10 Apr 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
11 Apr 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
12 Apr 17	Emails with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Review claims package and providing comments. Review Crown claim issue.	BRD	1.00 hrs.	\$ 335.00
12 Apr 17	Review Proof of Claim documents; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00

		3		File: 142706
13 Apr 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
13 Apr 17	Discussion with J. Foran. Review email re claims process. Review package of claims materials and email K. MacLeod.	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
17 Apr 17	Various emails; Review draft Supplemental Report;	JDS	0,30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
18 Apr 17	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103,00
18 Apr 17	Discussion with K. MacLeod re Agrainvestment program and \$15,000 payment. Revising Supplemental Seventh Report and sending to James Foran. Review Foran email re next steps.	BRD .	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00
19 Apr 17	Review J. Foran letter to RBC and reply via email. Inquiry re Supplemental Seventh Report.	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
20 Apr 17	Emails with K. MacLeod re Supplemental Seventh Report.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
21 Apr 17	Discussion with J. Foran re RBC account recovery issue. Emailing J. Foran re Supplemental Seventh Report.	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00
21 Apr 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
24 Apr 17	Emails with K. MacLeod re Supplemental Seventh Report.	BRD	0.70 hrs.	\$ 234.50
24 Apr 17	Review revised Report; Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
25 Apr 17	Emails with K. MacLeod re cash flows and draft supplement Report. Final review of Report. Filing and service of Report. Preparing Affidavit of Service.	BRD	3.40 hrs.	\$ 1,139.00
25 Apr 17	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
26 Apr 17	Discussion with K. MacLeod. Filing Affidavit of Service. Discussion with B. Stilwell and follow up email to B.	BRD	2.40 hrs.	\$ 804.00

27 Apr 17	Stilwell. Discussion Review financial standard Agristability fund a Stilwell. Discussion with K. exchange with B. Subsidiary. Review requirement to pay emails with J. forar re CRA.	atement re nd forward to MacLeod, Ema Stilwell re NAFA v CRA v, Discussion ar	nd		1.30 hrs.	\$ 435.50
Total Hours					33.20	
Our Fee:						\$ 12,310.00
Administrat	ive Fee					\$ 492.40
Total Profes	sional Fees					\$ 12,802.40
			Fee Summa	ary		
Name		Hours	Rate	An	nount	
John D. Strir	nger	6.60	\$ 515.00	\$ 3,39	99.00	
Benjamin R.	Durnford	26,60	\$ 335.00	\$ 8,9	11.00	
		33.20		\$ 12,31	0.00	
HST On Fee	s				_	\$ 1,920.36
Total Amoun	t Due					\$ 14,722.76
Balance Due	•				=	\$ 14,722.76



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

P.O. Box 730

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Invoice No.: 2017009650

April 28, 2017

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE:

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees \$ 12,802.40

Total HST \$ 1,920.36

Total Amount Due \$ 14,722.76

Balance Due \$ 14,722.76

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: Molnnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017012037

May 30, 2017 File: 142706 1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending May 30, 2017, including:

26 Apr 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
27 Apr 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
28 Apr 17	Discuss CRA issues with J. Foran and K. MacLeod; Research law re: RTP delivery during CCAA; Emails with T. Hill and J. Stringer; Prepare letter contents for K. MacLeod; Discussions with J. Foran re: Claims Bar Date;	BRD	3.20 hrs.	\$ 1,072.00
28 Apr 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
1 May 17	Discussion with J. Stringer. Emails with J. Foran and K. MacLeod re CRA issue. Conference call with Stilwell and Hill to discuss. Review T. Hill emails. Review CRA August 17, 2016 RTP. Email to colleague seeking research on point. Discussion RBC issue.	BRD	2.50 hrs.	\$ 837.50
1 May 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben	JDS	1,40 hrs.	\$ 721.00

	Durnford; Conference call with James Foran, Tim Hill, and Brian Stillwell;			
2 May 17	Review T. Hill email re auction and DIP repayment. Responding to J. Foran. Emails to J. Stringer. Review of Julie Mullen RTP demand and advising K. MacLeod. Review research findings. Discussion with J. Foran.	BRD	1.70 hrs.	\$ 569.50
2 May 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
3 May 17	Review ALC and CRA Proofs of Claim. Review NAFA Proof of Claim. Emails to J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Discussion with J. Foran re: Various. Discussion with S. Foreman of Department of Justice; Emails with B. Stilwell and T. Hill. Follow up emails with J. Foran.	BRD	3.70 hrs.	\$ 1,239.50
3 May 17	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS ·	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
4 May 17	Discussions with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Review CRARTP issue. Emails with Monitor, T. Hill, B. Stilwell, G. MacDonald and S. Foreman. Follow up email with J. Foran, B. Stilwell and G. MacDonald.	BRD	3.20 hrs.	\$ 1,072.00
4 May 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
5 May 17	Advising J. Foran re closing process and review email from T. Hill and B. Stilwell. Emails to G. MacDonald and J. McElman. Email with S. Foreman. Discussions with K. MacLeod re CRA issue, certificate issuance and proof of claim review. Review CRA Notice of Dis allowance and letter to CRA.	BRD	3.70 hrs.	\$ 1,239.50
5 May 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
8 May 17	Various emails; Meeting with James	JDS	1.60 hrs.	\$ 824.00

		Ü		
	Foran to discuss Proofs of Claim;	·		
8 May 17	Attending meeting at Deloitte to address certificate of Monitor. Review voice mail and email of B. Stilwell. Emailing B. Stilwell. Revising certificate. Filing certificate at Court. Distributing certificate to purchaser and vendor. Attending Deloitte to address ALC and NAFA claims. Revising Notice of Disallowance for ALC. Meeting with J. Stringer and Monitor.	BRD	4.10 hrs.	\$ 1,373.50
9 May 17	Discussion with J Foran. Review ALC security agreements. Email to J. Foran re: GSA from 2013. Emails with K. MacLeod. Conference call with RBC. Email to T. Hill and B Stilwell. Review of post call wrap up by J Foran.	BRD	2.80 hrs.	\$ 938.00
9 May 17	Telephone conferences with James Foran; Review security; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Telephone conference with RBC counsel; Meeting with James Foran; Various emails; Telephone conference with Tim Hill, Brian Stillwell and James Foran;	JDS	4.00 hrs.	\$ 2,060.00
10 May 17	Meeting with J. Foran and J. Stringer. Review of Proof of Claim Issue. Review of BNS matter. Addressing CNH matter.	BRD	2.90 hrs.	\$ 971.50
10 May 17	Review appraisal; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Meeting with James Foran;	JDS	2.90 hrs.	\$ 1,493.50
11 May 17	Discussion with J. Foran re various administration charge and banking issues. Conference call with K. MacLeod, J. Foran and J. Stringer re DIP release. Review NAFA emails. Follow up with J. Foran on ALC and NAFA distributions. Review E. Hellriegel email.	BRD	1.80 hrs.	\$ 603.00
11 May 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Telephone	JDS	1.40 hrs.	\$ 721.00

conference with James Foran;

12 May 17	Preparation of Distribution brief and Notice of Motion. Preparing draft Distribution Order.	BRD	3.10 hrs.	\$ 1,038.50
12 May 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
15 May 17	Discussion with J. Foran. Review B. Stilwell correspondence. Meeting with J. Stringer to discuss DIP repayment. Email to B. Stilwell and review reply.	BRD	2.50 hrs.	\$ 837.50
15 May 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	1.40 hrs.	\$ 721.00
16 May 17	Emails with J. Foran re DIP issue and pre-payment of mink care. Discussion D. Lawson meeting with J. foran and DIP refund. Discussion distribution hearing mechanics.	BRD	0.80 hrs.	\$ 268.00
16 May 17	Various emails; Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
17 May 17	Discussion wit J, foran. Addressing queries re ALC security. Review explanation for J. Foran re his discussion with P. Cosentino of ALC. Providing comments to J. Foran.	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 402.00
17 May 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Review documents;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
18 May 17	Review proof of claim additional support. Email and discussion with J. Foran. Emails with t. Hill re Silverado. Emails with B. Stilwell re sale of Silverado. Email and discussion with M. Chiasson. Review Notice of Dispute. Discussion with J. Stringer.	BRD	3.20 hrs.	\$ 1,072.00
18 May 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	1.10 hrs.	\$ 566.50
19 May 17	Review Motion documents;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
24 May 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Review draft Monitor's Report;	JDS	1.10 hrs.	\$ 566.50

4

\$ 6.51

\$ 6.51

Long Distance Courier

Total Disbursements

HST On Fees HST On Taxable Disbursements	\$ 4,194.29 \$ 0.98
Total Amount Due	\$ 32,163.74
Balance Due	\$ 32,163.74



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2017012037

May 30, 2017

File: 142706 GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 27,961.96
Total Taxable Disbursements	\$ 6.51
Total HST	\$ 4,195.27
Total Amount Due	\$ 32,163.74

Balance Due \$ 32,163.74

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

proof of claim negotiation.

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017015841

June 30, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending June 30, 2017, including:

29 May 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.50 hrs.	\$ 257.50
30 May 17	Discussion with J. Stringer. Review M. Chiasson email and respond to M. Chiasson. Discussion with K. MacLeod. Emails with J. Foran. Review T. McEwan letter to Court. Review T. Hill fillings and preparing for Chambers.	BRD	2.10 hrs.	\$ 703.50
30 May 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
31 May 17	Review Materials. Meeting with J. Foran and K. MacLeod re various outstanding matters. Attending extension hearing. Post meeting discussion with M. Chiasson. Emails to T. Hill re: equipment and extension order.	BRD	2.00 hrs.	\$ 670.00
2 Jun 17	Discussion with M. Chiasson. Emails and discussion with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Email exchange with M. Chiasson re extension on	BRD	0.90 hrs.	\$ 301.50

2 Jun 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
6 Jun 17	Review M. Chiasson email. Emailing J. Foran. Email to M. Chiasson.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
6 Jun 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
7 Jun 17	Emails re: Agristability fund.	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
7 Jun 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
13 Jun 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
15 Jun 17	Email to J. foran and K. MacLeod. Revising Notice, Brief and Distribution Order. Causing C. Lirette to prepare Affidavit. Emails with K. MacLeod.	BRD	0.90 hrs.	\$ 301.50
15 Jun 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Prepare Affidavit of Counsel for Distribution Motion; request PPSA and Bank Act searches; review searches;	CL.	0.30 hrs.	\$ 63.00
15 Jun 17	Review and revise draft Motion documents; Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
15 Jun 17	Conducting PPSA and Bank Act searches in the Province of Nova Scotia against Victory Farms Incorporated and Jonathan Mullen Mink Ranch Limited at the request of C. Lirette; forwarding results of same to C. Lirette.	SLH	0.30 hrs.	\$ 40.50
16 Jun 17	Meeting with K. MacLeod re distribution figures. Follow-up revisions of motion materials. Discussing equipment and insurance policy with J. Stringer.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
16 Jun 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
20 Jun 17	Emails with J. Foran and T. Hill. Calls to Court house re Motion Scheduling. Review RBC set-off	BRD	1.80 hrs.	\$ 603.00

2

	issue and emailing RBC General Counsel office. Review and reply to T. Hill emails;			
20 Jun 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
21 Jun 17	Email with J. Foran re timing of hearing.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
21 Jun 17	Various emails;	JD\$	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
23 Jun 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
26 Jun 17	Review E. Helreigel email re Chevrolet truck. Forwarding to J. Foran and T. Hill.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
27 Jun 17	Emailing T. McEwan re tractors. Email to T. Hill and J. Foran re letters to BNS releasing Chevrolet. Considering RBC set-off issue and emailing T. Hill.	BRD	1.30 hrs.	\$ 435.50
28 Jun 17	Emails with T. MacEwan and T. Hill. Email exchange with B. Stilwell and J. foran. Follow up re CNH Tractors and BNS Chevrolet. Email to E. Hellriegel re truck retrieval.	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 402.00
Total Hours			16.80	
Our Fee:				\$ 6,286.50
Administrat	tive Fee		_	\$ 251.46
Total Professional Fees				\$ 6,537.96

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
John D. Stringer	4.20	\$ 515.00	\$ 2,163.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	12.00	\$ 335.00	\$ 4,020.00
Chris Lirette	0.30	\$ 210.00	\$ 63.00
Sherry L. Hancock	0.30	\$ 135.00	\$ 40.50
	16.80		\$ 6,286.50

Disbursements: (HST Exempt)		
PPSA Registrations/Searches	\$ 17.50	
Total Disbursements		\$ 17.50
Disbursements: (HST Applicable)		
Bank of Canada Searches - (CSRS)	\$ 28.00	
Total Disbursements		\$ 28.00
HST On Fees		\$ 980.69
HST On Taxable Disbursements		\$ 4.20
Total Amount Due		\$ 7,568.35
Balance Due		\$ 7,568.35



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2017015841

June 30, 2017

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 6,537.96
Total Taxable Disbursements	\$ 28.00
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 17.50
Total HST	\$ 984.89
Total Amount Due	\$ 7,568.35

Balance Due \$7,568.35

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scolia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017018808

July 31, 2017 File: 142706 1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending July 31, 2017, including:

4 Jul 17	Email to T. Hill and J. Foran regarding next steps in process. Review response emails.	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
4 Jul 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
5 Jul 17	Call with T. Hill and J. Foran. Email exchange and discussion of tractors with T. McEwan. Revising Monitor letter to BNS. Email exchange with RBC to settle set-off claim.	BRD	2.00 hrs.	\$ 670.00
5 Jul 17	Conference call with James Foran and Tim Hill; Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.90 hrs.	\$ 463.50
6 Jul 17	Emails with J. Foran. Review of Hill letter. Review Hill email. Review draft Motion materials. Review J. Foran email to T. Hill.	BRD	0.50 hrs.	\$ 167.50
6 Jul 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
12 Jul 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
14 Jul 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00

2

Eilo:	142706
File:	142700

\$ 17.50

			3			File, 142700
	Foran and T. Hill. R correspondence to A					
25 Jul 17	Emails to T. Hill. Er MacEwan. Email ex Foran re CNIT Tract	changes with	BR J.	D	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
25 Jul 17	Conference with Be	n Durnford;	JD	S	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
26 Jul 17	Email exchanges wi T. MacEwan. Email hearing. Review M. re Distribution Sche Court to schedule h	s to T. Hill re Chlasson ema dule. Calls to		D	2.10 hrs.	\$ 703.50
26 Jul 17	Various emails; Con Durnford;	ference with B	Ben JD	S	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
27 Jul 17	Emails to J. Foran a Conference call with and NAFA Commen distribution.	Monitor re: A	LC	D	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
28 Jul 17	Discussion with J. F exchanges with T. N tractors.		BR NH	D	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
Total Hours	5				19.90	
Our Fee:						\$ 7,599.50
Administra	tive Fee				<u></u>	\$ 303.98
Total Profe	ssional Fees					\$ 7,903.48
			Fee Sum	mary		
Name		Hours	Rate	Amoun	t	
John D. Str	inger	5.50	\$ 515.00	\$ 2,832.50		
Benjamin R	_	14.00	\$ 335.00	\$ 4,690.00		
Chris Lirette		0.20	\$ 210,00	\$ 42.00		
Joanne R. (Gray _	0,20	\$ 175,00	\$ 35.00	.	
		19.90		\$ 7,599.50		
Disbursem	ents: (HST Exempt)					
PPSA Regi	strations/Searches			\$ 17.50		

Total Disbursements

HST On Fees	\$ 1,185.52
Total Amount Due	\$ 9,106.50
Balance Due	\$ 9,106.50



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017018808

July 31, 2017

File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

P.O. Box 730

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al. RE:

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Balance Due

Total Professional Fees	\$ 7,903.48
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 17.50
Total HST	\$ 1,185.52
Total Amount Due	\$ 9,106.50

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Hallfax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper \$ 9,106.50

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017021676

August 31, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending August 30, 2017, including:

31 Jul 17	Review J. Foran email with amended distribution schedule.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
3 Aug 17	Revising Brief, Order and Notice of Motion. Email to J. Foran seeking comments on draft materials;	BRD	1.40 hrs.	\$ 469.00
4 Aug 17	Discussion with J. Stringer re brief and making revisions.	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
4 Aug 17	Various emails; Review and revise draft Motion for Distribution; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
8 Aug 17	Email to K. MacLeod. Discussing Report contents with K. MacLeod. Review web for Report examples re: approval of conduct. Email to K. MacLeod re Report. Review draft wording.	BRD	0.90 hrs.	\$ 301.50
9 Aug 17	Emails with K. MacLeod. Revising brief to account for extension request. Review J. Foran emails. Revising Ninth Report and sending blackline to K. MacLeod and J. Foran.	BRD	2.20 hrs.	\$ 737.00

9 Aug 17	Various emails; Review draft Ninth Report of the Monitor;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
10 Aug 17	Discussion with J. Stringer re sharing of expenses from Administrative reserve. Emails to J. Stringer. Discussion with J. Foran. Email to T. Hill re: various. Review Hill's Motion materials. Email and call to K. MacLeod re: timing of Report. Revising submissions. Discussions with M. Chiasson re: ALC objection to distribution. Updating various as to conversation.	BRD	2.60 hrs.	\$ 871.00
10 Aug 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Review Motion materials for Extension of Stay;	JDS	1.10 hrs.	\$ 566.50
11 Aug 17	Emails and discussion with T. Hill. Emails to J. Foran and J. Stringer. Conference call with Monitor to discuss ALC position. Follow-up email to B. Stilwell re matter. Email to T. Hill re filling. Revising motion documents and filling. Service of motion documents and preparing Affidavit of Service. Filling Affidavit of Service.	BRD	4.80 hrs.	\$ 1,608.00
11 Aug 17	Various emails; Conference call with James Foran;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
14 Aug 17	Various emails; Review final Ninth Report of Monitor;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
16 Aug 17	Calls with J. Foran to discuss briefs of NAFA and ALC. Review submissions and evidence from ALC and NAFA. Discussion with J. Stringer. Emails and call to T. Hill. Emailing materials to parties missed on ALC send. Emails to RBC General Counsel.	BRD	1.70 hrs.	\$ 569.50
16 Aug 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford; Review Pre-Hearing Brief of Brian Stilwell; Review Pre-Hearing Brief of Maurice Chiasson and supporting Affidavit;	JDS	1.00 hrs.	\$ 515,00

File: 142706

17 Aug 17	Review briefs on ALC, Victory and NAFA. Preparation of oral remarks for chambers. Discussions with T. Hill, M. Chiasson, J. Stringer and J. Foran re: hearing positions. Review Thiesen Affidavit and Agristability Handbook. Preparing case for Chambers.	BRD	5.10 hrs.	\$ 1,708.50
17 Aug 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.60 hrs.	\$ 309.00
18 Aug 17	Prepare argument for Hearing; Review cases and Orders from Dufferin case on conduct approval; Meeting with k. MacLeod and J. Foran to discuss; Attendance at Hearing and post-Hearing discussion with counsel; Amend wording of Order and circulate to counsel; Letter to Court; File amended draft Order; Emails to E. Hellreigel and K. MacEachern; Email counsel;	BRD	4.90 hrs.	\$ 1,641.50
18 Aug 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
21 Aug 17	Receipt of Order from Court and circulate to service list;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
22 Aug 17	Email to K. MacLeod re: CNH tractor matter and review of Monitor letter;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
Total Hours			30.10	
Our Fee:				\$ 11,091.50
Administrat	tive Fee		_	\$ 443.66
Total Profes	ssional Fees			\$ 11,535.16

3

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer Benjamin R. Durnford	5.60 24.50	\$ 515.00 \$ 335.00	\$ 2,884.00 \$ 8,207.50
· , · · · · · · ·	30.10		\$ 11,091.50

Disbursements: (HST Exempt)

Notice of Motion	\$ 66.00	
Total Disbursements	\$ 66.0	0
HST On Fees	\$ 1,730.2	27
Total Amount Due	\$ 13,331.4	13
Less Funds Transferred From Trust	\$ 5,158.6	i4
Balance Due	\$ 8,172.7	79



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017021676

August 31, 2017

File: 142706

RE:

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 11,535.16
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 66.00
Total HST	\$ 1,730.27
Total Amount Due	\$ 13,331.43
Less Funds Transferred From Trust	\$ 5,158.64

Balance Due \$ 8,172.79

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions.

We also accept Visa and MasterCard.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017024356 September 29, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending September 29, 2017, including:

6 Sep 17	Email exchanges with K. MacLeod re various. Email exchange with T. McEwan re tractor repossession.	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
11 Sep 17	Discussions with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Review J. Foran email re CNH tractor issue;	BRD	0.50 hrs.	\$ 167.50
12 Sep 17	Email exchange with J. Foran re: insurance issue and recovery of tractors.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
13 Sep 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.40 hrs.	\$ 206.00
14 Sep 17	Discussion with K. MacLeod. Sending invoices to K. MacLeod per request of Monitor.	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
18 Sep 17	Review T. Hill email.	BRD	0.10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
21 Sep 17	Discussion with T. Hill re matters.	BRD	0,10 hrs.	\$ 33.50
26 Sep 17	Drafting Notice of Motion for Distribution and Discharge Order. Drafting Durnford Affidavit. Drafting brief in support. Drafting Discharge	BRD	4.00 hrs.	\$ 1,340.00

			2			1110, 1721
	Order. Drafting Dis Reviewing file mate Report.					
27 Sep 17	Emailing materials Review response. Affidavit re fee app	Amending	BRD		0,30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
Total Hours				• •	6.40	
Our Fee:	•				0.40	\$ 2,216.00
Administra	tive Fee				_	\$ 88.64
	ssional Fees					\$ 2,304.64
			Fee Summa	<u>ary</u>		
Name		Hours	Rate	Amount		
John D. Stri	inger	0.40	\$ 515.00	\$ 206.00		
Benjamin R	. Durnford	6.00	\$ 335.00	\$ 2,010.00		
		6.40		\$ 2,216.00		
HST On Fee	es					\$ 345,70
Total Amour	nt Due					\$ 2,650.34
Balance Du	e ·					\$ 2,650.34

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017024356 September 29, 2017

File: 142706

RE:

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees \$ 2,304.64

Total HST \$ 345.70

Total Amount Due \$ 2,650.34

Balance Due

\$ 2,650.34

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code; NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper

Please include the Involce number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.

Interest may be charged on overdue accounts.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017027293

October 31, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500

Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending October 31, 2017, including:

29 Sep 17	Revising motion materials for next Victory Farms Motion. Preparing Book of Authorities.	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
2 Oct 17	Revising form of Discharge Order.	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
3 Oct 17	Email to J. Foran. Amending draft Distribution Order to include pay into Court scenario.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
5 Oct 17	Emails with J. Foran and discussion. Review J. Foran response and revising motion materials;	BRD	0.50 hrs.	\$ 167.50
10 Oct 17	Review J. Foran email; Email to J. Foran re: scheduling of Motion; Call and discussion with K. MacLeod;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
10 Oct 17	Various emails;	JDS	0,20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
12 Oct 17	Emails with J. Foran and K. MacLeod re: various matters, including scheduling of distribution hearing;	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50
13 Oct 17	Emails with J. Foran and K. MacLeod; Calls to D. Lewis of Court	BRD	0.70 hrs.	\$ 234.50

		2		File: 14270
	and amend Motion materials; Emails to Monitor;			
17 Oct 17	Emails to counsel and Court re: arrangement of hearing date;	BRD	0,40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
24 Oct 17	Revising motion materials. Emails with J. Foran and K. MacLeod. Meeting with Deloitte to plan next steps. Revising materials further. Email to T. McEwan and K. MacLeod. Advising re review of intercreditor debt.	BRD	3.00 hrs.	\$ 1,005.00
25 Oct 17	Gathering Affidavit Exhibits and emails with K. MacLeod re CNH tractor issue.	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
26 Oct 17	Email exchange with J. Foran. Review J. Foran voicemail.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
27 Oct 17	Review T. MacEwan email re tractors;	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
30 Oct 17	Emails and discussion with J. Foran re Victory account payables. Review inter company receivables and related Company financial statements. Discussion with J. Stringer and J. Foran.	BRD	1.50 hrs.	\$ 502.50
Total Hours	:		9.70	
Our Fee:	•			\$ 3,285.50
Administra	tive Fee			\$ 131.42
Total Profe	ssìonal Fees			\$ 3,416.92

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	0.20	\$ 515.00	\$ 103.00
Benjamin R. Durnford	9.50	\$ 335.00	\$ 3,182.50
	9.70		\$ 3,285.50

HST On Fees	\$ 512.54
Total Amount Due	\$ 3,929.46
Balance Due	\$ 3,929.46

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017027293

October 31, 2017

File: 142706

RE:

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Total Professional Fees	\$ 3,416.92
Total HST	\$ 512.54
Total Amount Due	\$ 3,929.46

Balance Due \$ 3,929.46

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia
Halifax Business Support Centre
5251 Duke Street
Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code; NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McIrines Cooper

Please include the involce number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.

Interest may be charged on overdue accounts.



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

Invoice No.: 2017028655 November 14, 2017

File: 142706

1300-1969 Upper Water Street

Purdy's Wharf Tower II

P.O. Box 730

Halifax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter for the period ending November 14, 2017, including:

30 Oct 17	Review financial statements of related companies; Conferences with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
30 Oct 17	Conduct NS PPSA searches against Above & Beyond Farms Inc., Organic Management Solutions Inc. and Trinity Farms Inc.; forward results to B. Durnford;	AJW	0.30 hrs.	\$ 45.00
31 Oct 17	Review outline of Report (No. 10) of Monitor and advising J. Foran re additional points to cover. Follow-up discussions with J. Foran re: various final matters in proceedings and estimates to complete. Exchange of email re fractors with J. Foran.	BRD	1.90 hrs.	\$ 636.50
31 Oct 17	Various emails;	JDS	0.20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
1 Nov 17	Discussions and email exchanges with J. Foran re various. Follow up discussion and PPSA search re Providence Farms	BRD	0.40 hrs.	\$ 134.00
1 Nov 17	Conducting PPSA search in the Province of Nova Scotia against	JRG	0.20 hrs.	\$ 35.00

_	

		۷		1 110. 1-127
	Providence Farms Inc., at the request of B. Durnford; forwarding search results to B. Durnford;			
1 Nov 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails;	JDS	0.30 hrs.	\$ 154.50
2 Nov 17	Discussion with J. Foran and J. Stringer re various distribution issues. Email to K. MacLeod, Revising brief to Court;	BRD	1.20 hrs.	\$ 402.00
2 Nov 17	Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0.10 hrs.	\$ 51.50
3 Nov 17	Conference with Ben Durnford; Various emails; Review draft Monitor's Report;	JDS	0.70 hrs.	\$ 360.50
3 Nov 17	Email exchange with J. Foran re Report issues. Review of draft Tenth Report of Monitor. Discussion with J. Stringer. Emails with J. Foran. Email from T. McEwan.	BRD	1.00 hrs.	\$ 335.00
6 Nov 17	Property online search;	LHAW	0.30 hrs.	\$ 43.50
6 Nov 17	Review revised draft Tenth Report of Monitor; Conference with Ben Durnford; Attend at meeting with James Foran; Various emails;	JDS	1.90 hrs.	\$ 978.50
6 Nov 17	Revising draft Tenth Report. Discussing missing components with J. Stringer. Emailing mark-up to J. Foran. Meeting with J. Foran and call with K. MacLeod re Report.	BRD	2.40 hrs.	\$ 804.00
7 Nov 17	Amending brief to Court. Discussion with J. Foran re Distribution schedule.	BRD	0.60 hrs.	\$ 201.00
8 Nov 17	Conferences with Ben Durnford; Review draft and distribution schedule; Various emails;	JDS	0.80 hrs.	\$ 412.00
8 Nov 17	Review Distribution tables with J. Foran. Preparing some oral presentation notes for November 22 Hearing. Discussion with J. Stringer.	BRD	1.10 hrs.	\$ 368.50
9 Nov 17	Revising brief, orders and Notice	BRD	0.30 hrs.	\$ 100.50

	with updated distribution figure. Revising Durnford Affidavit. Emails with J. Foran.			
9 Nov 17	Various emails; Conference with Ben Durnford;	JDS	0,20 hrs.	\$ 103.00
10 Nov 17	Discussion with J. Foran. Planning final report filing and making further revisions. Emails with K. MacLeod re accounts.	BRD	0.50 hrs.	\$ 167.50
14 Nov 17	Review J. Foran email and T. Hill letter. Advising Monitor re inclusion of letter and advising Court of statutory declaration to come.	BRD	0.20 hrs.	\$ 67.00
Total Hours			15.30	<u> </u>
Our Fee:				\$ 5,863.00
Administrat	ive Fee	No. and the state of the state	\$ 234.52	
Total Profes	ssional Fees			\$ 6,097.52

Fee Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
John D. Stringer	4.90	\$ 515.00	\$ 2,523.50
Benjamin R. Durnford	9.60	\$ 335.00	\$ 3,216.00
Joanne R. Gray	0.20	\$ 175.00	\$ 35.00
Audrey Whitman	0.30	\$ 150.00	\$ 45.00
Laurinda Wile	0.30	\$ 145.00	\$ 43.50
	15.30		\$ 5,863.00

Disbursements: (HST Exempt)

Prothonotary	\$ 66.00
PPSA Registrations/Searches	\$ 26.25

Total Disbursements \$92.25

HST On Fees	\$ 914.63
Total Amount Due	\$ 7,104.40
Balance Due	\$ 7,104.40

Benjamin R. Durnford



Attn: Mr. James Foran, Senior Manager - Financial

Advisory Services

1300-1969 Upper Water Street Purdy's Wharf Tower II P.O. Box 730 Hallfax, NS B3J 2V1

Tel: (902) 425-6500 Fax: (902) 425-6350

mchfx@mcinnescooper.com

Invoice No.: 2017028655

November 14, 2017 File: 142706

GST/HST Registration #:119398691RT

RE: Engagement as prospective Monitor counsel regarding Victory Farms Inc et al.

REMITTANCE COPY PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Balance Due

Total Professional Fees	\$ 6,097.52
Total Non-Taxable Disbursements	\$ 92.25
Total HST	\$ 914.63
Total Amount Due	\$ 7,104.40

Alternatively, payment may be wired to:

The Bank of Nova Scotia Halifax Business Support Centre 5251 Duke Street Halifax, Nova Scotia, Canada

Bank Number: 002 Swift Code: NOSCCATT Account Number: 700030002615 ABA Number: 026002532 Transit Number: 33993 Account Name: McInnes Cooper \$7,104.40

Please include the invoice number with your wiring instructions. We also accept Visa and MasterCard.

Interest may be charged on overdue accounts.

Hfx. No. 454744

Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

Application by Victory Farms Incorporated and Jonathan Mullen Mink Ranch Limited (the "Applicants") for relief under the Companies' Creditors Arrangement Act

CERTIFICATE OF EXHIBIT

This is Exhibit "B" of the Affidavit of Ben Durnford Sworn to before me this 15th day of November, 2017.

A Barrister of the Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

TEDDY J. COMEAD A Barrister of the Supreme Court of Nova Scotia

Date of Invoice	Invoice No.	Fees (inclusive of Admin Fees)	нѕт	Disbursements	Total
Sept/12/16	2016023438 (Adjusted)	\$4,220.43	\$633.06	\$0	\$4,853.49
Sept/23/16	2016024080	\$12,367.73	\$1,855.16	\$0	\$14,222.89
Sept/30/16	2016025163	\$5,814.35	\$872.15	\$0	\$6,686.50
Oct/24/16	2016026947	\$12,486.18	\$1,872.93	\$61.25	\$14,420.36
Nov/15/16	2016029599	\$3,552.47	\$532.87	\$0	\$4,085.34
Nov/30/16	2016031544	\$15,421.68	\$2,313.25	\$0	\$17,734.93
Dec/22/16	2016033922	\$10,695.52	1,604.33	\$35.00	\$12,334.85
Feb/08/17	2017002623	\$13,264.16	\$1,989.62	\$0	\$15,253.78
Feb/28/17	2017004644	\$9,156.16	\$1,373.42	\$0	\$10,529.58
Mar/31/17	2017007177	\$7,446.92	\$1,120.27	\$21.55	\$8,588.74
Apr/28/17	2017009650	\$12,802.40	\$1,920.36	\$0	\$14,722.76
May/30/17	2017012037	\$27,961.96	\$4,195.27	\$6.51	\$32,163.74
Jun/30/17	2017015841	\$6,537.96	\$984.89	\$45.50	\$7,568.35
Jul/31/17	2017018808	\$7,903.48	\$1,185.52	\$17.50	\$9,106.50
Aug/31/17	2017021676	\$11,535.16	\$1,730.27	66.00	\$13,331.43
Sep/29/17	2017024356	\$2,304.64	\$345.70	\$0	\$2,650.34
Oct/31/17	2017027293	\$3,416.92	\$512.54	\$0	\$3,929.46
Nov/14/17	2017028655	\$6,097.52	914.63	\$92.25	\$7,104.40
TOTALS		\$172,985.64	\$25,956.24	\$345.56	\$199,287.44

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
14-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
10-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	335	167.5
09-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
09-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
08-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	8,0	515	412
08-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	335	368.5
07-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
06-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.9	515	978.5
06-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.4	335	804
06-Nov-17	787	Laurinda Wile	0.3	145	43.5
03-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
03-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1	335	335
02-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.1	515	51.5
02-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.2	335	402
01-Nov-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	154.5
01-Nov-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
01-Nov-17	1937	Joanne R. Gray	0.2	175	35
31-Oct-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
31-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.9	335	636.5
30-Oct-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
30-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.5	335	502.5
30-Oct-17	1807	Audrey Whitman	0.3	150	45
27-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
26-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
25-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
24-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3	335	1,005.00
17-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
13-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.7	335	234.5
12-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
10-Oct-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
10-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
05-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	335	167.5
03-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	335	368.5
02-Oct-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
29-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
27-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
26-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4	335	1,340.00
21-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	335	33.5
18-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	335	33.5
14-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
13-Sep-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
12-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
11-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	335	167.5

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
06-Sep-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
22-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
21-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
18-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
18-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4.9	335	1,641.50
17-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	515	309
17-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	5.1	335	1,708.50
16-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	1	515	515
16-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.7	335	569.5
14-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	515	309
11-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
11-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4.8	335	1,608.00
10-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.1	515	566.5
10-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.6	335	871
09-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	515	309
09-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.2	335	737
08-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.9	335	301.5
04-Aug-17	28	John D. Stringer	0,6	515	309
04-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0,3	335	100.5
03-Aug-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.4	335	469
31-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
28-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
27-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
26-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
26-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.1	335	703.5
25-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
25-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
24-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	154.5
24-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.4	335	469
21-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0,7	515	360,5
21-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.5	335	1,172.50
21-Jul-17	835	Chris Lirette	0.2	210	42
21-Jul-17	1937	Joanne R. Gray	0.2	175	35
20-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	335	167.5
19-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.3	515	669.5
19-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.5	335	502.5
18-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
18-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
14-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
12-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
06-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
06-Jul-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	335	167.5
05-Jul-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	515	463.5

Work Date keeper Timekeepe Hours Rate 05-Jul-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2 335 04-Jul-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515	Amt 670 206
oo dan 17	206
04 bit 17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515	
04-Jul-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.6 335	201
28-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.2 335	402
27-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335	435.5
26-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335	67
23-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515	103
21-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515	103
21-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335	67
20-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515	206
20-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.8 335	603
16-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515	309
16-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.1 335	368.5
15-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515	412
15-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.9 335	301.5
15-Jun-17 835 Chris Lirette 0.3 210	63
15-Jun-17 1486 Sherry L. Hancock 0.3 135	40.5
13-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515	103
07-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515	154.5
07-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.1 335	33.5
06-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515	154.5
06-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335	67
02-Jun-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515	154.5
02-Jun-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.9 335	301.5
31-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2 335	670
30-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515	206
30-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.1 335	703.5
29-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515	257.5
29-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.2 335	737
26-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515	103
26-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335	268
25-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.7 515	875.5
25-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.5 335	502.5
24-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.1 515	566.5
19-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515	154.5
18-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.1 515	566.5
To May (1	072.00
17-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.9 515	463.5
17-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.2 335	402
16-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515	309
16-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335	268
15-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515	721
15-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335	837.5

Work Date keeper Timekeepe Hours Rate Amt 12-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 12-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 3.1 335 1,038.50 11-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 1.8 335 603 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 2.9 515 1,493.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 4.1 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Dumford 3.2 335 1,239.50		Time				
12-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.1 335 1,038.50 11-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.8 335 603 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.8 335 603 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 515 1,493.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 569.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 837.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 837.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 837.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 435.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 100.5 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R.	Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe			
11-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 11-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.8 335 603 10-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 2.9 515 1,493.50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 4 515 2,060.00 08-May-17 21 John D. Stringer 1.6 515 824 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 42 02-May-17	12-May-17	28	John D. Stringer			
11-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.8 335 603 10-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 2.9 515 1,493,50 10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971,5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50	12-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford			
10-May-17 32 John D. Stringer 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 87.5 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 87.5 02-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 87.5 04-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 87.5 05-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,072.00 03-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,039.00 04-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 234.5 04-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 268 04-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 10.55 05-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 10.55 05-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R.	11-May-17	28	John D. Stringer			
10-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.9 335 971.5 09-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 4 515 2,060.00 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.6 515 824 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 3-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 589.5 01-May-	11-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.8		
09-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 4 515 2,060.00 09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.6 515 824 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 599.5 01-May-17 31 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 599.5	10-May-17	28	John D. Stringer			•
09-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.8 335 938 08-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.6 515 824 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 599.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr	10-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford			
08-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.6 515 824 08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 599.5 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 599.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 87.5 28-Apr-1	09-May-17	28	John D. Stringer			
08-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 4.1 335 1,373.50 05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00	09-May _" 17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford			
05-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 </td <td>08-May-17</td> <td>28</td> <td>John D. Stringer</td> <td>1.6</td> <td></td> <td></td>	08-May-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.6		
05-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 721 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 21 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 <	08-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford			
04-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 589.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 589.5 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 1,072.00 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 804	05-May-17	28	John D. Stringer			
04-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17	05-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.7		•
03-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 <td< td=""><td>04-May-17</td><td>28</td><td>John D. Stringer</td><td>0.6</td><td></td><td></td></td<>	04-May-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6		
03-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.7 335 1,239.50 02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17	04-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.2		•
02-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.4 515 206 02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17	03-May-17	28	John D. Stringer	8.0		
02-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.7 335 569.5 01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 31 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 <t< td=""><td>03-May-17</td><td>312</td><td>Benjamin R. Durnford</td><td>3,7</td><td></td><td></td></t<>	03-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3,7		
01-May-17 28 John D. Stringer 1.4 515 721 01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 <td< td=""><td>02-May-17</td><td>28</td><td>John D. Stringer</td><td>0.4</td><td></td><td></td></td<>	02-May-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4		
01-May-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.5 335 837.5 28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-	02-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.7		
28-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.8 515 412 28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17	01-May-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.4		
28-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.2 335 1,072.00 27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 153 257.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 154.5	01-May-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.5		
27-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309 27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 100.5	28-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	8.0		
27-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1.3 335 435.5 26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 335 268 17-	28-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.2		•
26-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5 26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Ap	27-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6		
26-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 2.4 335 804 25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17	27-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3		
25-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	26-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.5		
25-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 3.4 335 1,139.00 24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	26-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.4		
24-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	25-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2		
24-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.7 335 234.5 21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	25-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.4		
21-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	24-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	
21-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	24-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.7		
20-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.2 335 67 19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5 16-4.5 15-4.5 15-4.5 15-4.5	21-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2		
19-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.3 335 100.5 18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	21-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	8.0		
18-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.2 515 103 18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	20-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2		
18-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.8 335 268 17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	19-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3		
17-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	18-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2		
17-74pt-17 25 doi:10.00 545 454.5	18-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.8		
13_Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	17-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3		
13-Api-17 20 00m B. 0m 30	13-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3		
13-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 0.4 335 134	13-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4		
12-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.6 515 309	•	28	John D. Stringer	0.6		
12-Apr-17 312 Benjamin R. Durnford 1 335 335	•	312	Benjamin R. Durnford			
11-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.3 515 154.5	•	28	John D. Stringer	0.3		
10-Apr-17 28 John D. Stringer 0.5 515 257.5	10-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	515	257.5

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
10-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.2	335	737
07-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
07-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4.7	335	1,574.50
06-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
06-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.3	335	770.5
05-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3	335	435.5
04-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.8	515	412
04-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.7	335	904.5
03-Apr-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
03-Apr-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3	335	435.5
31-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	515	309
31-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	8.0	335	268
30-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
27-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	515	463.5
27-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.7	335	234.5
24-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
24-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
23-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
21-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.7	335	904.5
20-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
20-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
17-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	335	67
14-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
14-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.5	335	502.5
13-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
09-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.3	335	1,105.50
08-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5
06-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.9	335	301.5
03-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.4	335	804
02-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.1	335	1,038.50
01-Mar-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	154.5
01-Mar-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	335	368.5
28-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
28-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
27-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	154.5
27-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.8	335	268
24-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	515	257.5
24-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.8	335	603
24-Feb-17	787	Laurinda Wile	0.2	145	29
23-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	515	154.5
23-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	335	368.5
21-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.1	515	51.5
21-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	335	100.5

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
16-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
16-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	5.3	335	1,775.50
15-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.8	515	412
15-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.7	335	1,239.50
14-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	515	257.5
14-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.2	335	402
10-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.9	335	636.5
09-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	515	463.5
09-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3	335	435.5
08-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	1	515	515
08-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	8.0	335	268
07-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.9	515	978.5
07-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.9	335	636.5
06-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	515	463.5
06-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
03-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	515	103
03-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.8	335	603
02-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	3.4	515	1,751.00
02-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.7	335	1,239.50
01-Feb-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	515	309
01-Feb-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	335	134
31-Jan-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	515	463.5
31-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.4	335	804
30-Jan-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	515	360.5
30-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	335	368.5
27-Jan-17	28	John D. Stringer	1.8	515	927
27-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.8	335	1,273.00
26-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.5	335	837.5
25-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.6	335	536
20-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	335	33.5
18-Jan-17	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	515	206
18-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	335	33.5
17-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	335	33.5
06-Jan-17	. 28	John D. Stringer	0.5	515	257.5
06-Jan-17	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	335	201
21-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
21-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
20-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	500	200
15-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	500	350
15-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
09-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	500	300
09-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	325	130
08-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.6	500	800

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
08-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.7	325	877.5
07-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
07-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.8	325	260
07-Dec-16	1486	Sherry L. Hancock	0.3	130	39
06-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.3	500	650
06-Dec-16	204	Karen Gardiner	1.8	375	675
06-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.4	325	1,105.00
05-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	3	500	1,500.00
05-Dec-16	204	Karen Gardiner	1,1	375	412.5
05-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	5.4	325	1,755.00
02-Dec-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.4	500	200
02-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	325	130
01-Dec-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	325	65
30-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	500	150
30-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.2	325	390
29-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	500	150
29-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.7	325	227.5
25-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	500	250
25-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	325	195
24-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	500	300
24-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.2	325	715
23-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
23-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.8	325	585
22-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.6	500	300
22-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.1	325	1,007.50
21-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	2.4	500	1,200.00
21-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.6	325	1,170.00
18-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	0.9	375	337.5
18-Nov-16 ,	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.7	325	552.5
17-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
17-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	0.9	375	337.5
16-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	1	500	500
16-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	2.6	375	975
16-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.1	325	682.5
15-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	2.9	375	1,087.50
14-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.9	500	950
14-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	3.8	375	1,425.00
14-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.1	325	682.5
14-Nov-16	605	Don Brown	0.5	120	60
10-Nov-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	500	150
10-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	3.2	375	1,200.00
10-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	325	65
10-Nov-16	767	Tammy Parker	0.2	120	24

	Time			ь.	
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
08-Nov-16	204	Karen Gardiner	4.2	375	1,575.00
01-Nov-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.6	325	195
31-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
28-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
28-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	1.6	375	600
28-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	325	357.5
25-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
25-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0,2	325	65
24-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	. 1	500	500
24-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.4	325	455
21-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
20-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	500	150
20-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	2.2	325	715
19-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
14-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	1.6	375	600
14-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.4	325	130
13-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	4.1	375	1,537.50
13-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1	325	325
13-Oct-16	767	Tammy Parker	0.2	120	24
12-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	3.7	375	1,387.50
12-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
12-Oct-16	767	Tammy Parker	0.2	120	24
12-Oct-16	1937	Joanne R. Gray	0.2	170	34
11-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	5.7	375	2,137.50
07-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	4.8	375	1,800.00
07-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	325	65
07-Oct-16	1937	Joanne R. Gray	0.4	170	68
06-Oct-16	204	Karen Gardiner	0.2	375	75
06-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.2	325	390
05-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	500	250
05-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1	325	325
04-Oct-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	500	250
04-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.4	325	455
03-Oct-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	325	32.5
30-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
29-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.8	500	400
29-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1	325	325
28-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	1	500	500
28-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3	325	975
27-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
27-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4.1	325	1,332.50
26-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
26-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	325	357.5
1		-			

	Time				
Work Date	keeper	Timekeepe	Hours	Rate	Amt
23-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.9	500	450
23-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.4	325	1,105.00
22-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.5	500	750
22-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	6.3	325	2,047.50
21-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.9	500	950
21-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.2	325	1,040.00
20-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.5	500	250
20-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.5	325	162.5
19-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.7	500	350
19-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.1	325	357.5
16-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.1	500	550
16-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	4.5	325	1,462.50
15-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	2	500	1,000.00
15-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	5.4	325	1,755.00
14-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	325	65
13-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.9	325	292.5
12-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3	325	975
09-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	2.2	500	1,100.00
09-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3	325	422.5
08-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	1.4	500	700
08-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	1.3	325	422.5
07-Sep-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.3	500	150
07-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.3	325	97.5
06-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.1	325	32.5
01-Sep-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	0.2	325	65
31-Aug-16	28	John D. Stringer	0.2	500	100
31-Aug-16	312	Benjamin R. Durnford	3.1	325	1,007.50
_			443.9		166,935