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Court File No.: CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
[COMMERCIAL LIST]

BETWEEN:

PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant

-and -

ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Respondent

NOTICE OF MOTION
Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (the “Receiver’, in its capacity as receiver of the assets, property and
undertaking of the Respondent, will make a Motion to a Judge of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice
(Commercial List) on 26 January 2023 at 12:30 am or as soon after that time as the Motion can be heard, via

Zoom.

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The Motion is to be heard via videoconference.

THE MOTION IS FOR
1. Orders substantially in the form attached as Schedules A and B approving the actions and

conduct of the Receiver, and the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal counsel.

2. Such further and other relief as to this Honourable Court may seem just.

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE



1. The grounds set out in the Thirteen Report of the Receiver dated 23 January 2023 and the

Supplement to the Thirteenth Report dated 20 January 2023 (together, the “13th Report”)

2. Such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may permit.

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE will be used at the hearing of the motion:

1. The 13t Report; and

2. Such further and other evidence as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may permit.

23 January 2023

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP
Barristers & Solicitors

1 First Canadian Place

100 King Street West, Suite 1600
Toronto ON M5X 1G5

Tel:  416-862-7525

Fax. 416-862-7661

E. Patrick Shea (#39665K)
Tel: (416) 369-7399
Fax: (416) 862-7661

Lawyers for the Receiver



Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

THE HONOURABLE ) THURSDAY, THE
)
JUSTICE OSBORNE ) 26™" DAY OF JANUARY, 2023
BETWEEN:
PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
-and -
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY
Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985 ¢ B-3,
as amended, and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, as amended

ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court-
appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of Rose of Sharon

(Ontario) Retirement Community was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Thirteenth Report of the Receiver dated ## January 2023 (the
“Thirteenth Report”) and the Supplement to the Thirteenth Report also dated ## January 2023
(the “Supp Thirteenth Report”) and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver, no

one appearing for any other person on the service list:

1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Thirteenth Report and the Supp
Thirteenth Report be and are hearby approved, including the actions and activities of the Receiver

as described therein.



2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the period September 28, 2011 to December 31, 2022 as set out in Appendix
“F to the Thirteenth Report, be and is hereby accepted and approved.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver for the period
January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2022 as further described in the Affidavit of Hartley Bricks sworn
18 January 2023, the fees and disbursements of Blaney McMurtry LLP for the period January 1,
2017 to September 30, 2022 as further described in the Affidavit of Chad Kopach sworn 19 January
2023 the fees and disbursements of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP for the period December 1, 2013
to December 31, 2022 as further described in the Affidavit of Clifton Prophet sworn 23 January
2023, be and are hereby approved.

4, THIS COURT ORDERS that the claims by the Receiver against York Health Care
Developments Inc. in Court File No CV-12-463472 be and are hereby dismissed without costs.
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Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

THE HONOURABLE ) THURSDAY, THE
)
JUSTICE OSBORNE ) 26™" DAY OF JANUARY, 2023
BETWEEN:
PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
-and -
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY
Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985 ¢ B-3,
as amended, and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, as amended

ORDER
(Approval of Vesting Certificates)
THIS MOTION, made by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court-
appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of Rose of Sharon

(Ontario) Retirement Community was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Thirteenth Report of the Receiver dated 23 January 2023 (the
“Thirteenth Report”) and the Supplement to the Thirteenth Report also dated 23 January 2023
(the “Supp Thirteenth Report”) and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver, no

one appearing for any other person on the service list:

1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that: (a) Receiver’s actions in completing

the Receiver’s Certificates as authorized and directed by paragraph 4 of the Approval and Vesting



Order dated 27 July 2022 (the “Condo AVQO?”) as described in the Thirteenth Report and the Supp
Thirteenth Report be and are hereby validated and approved; and (b) the property described in
Appendix A to the Supp Thirteenth Report and attached as Schedule A to this Order (the

“Purchased Property”) is vested in the persons identified opposite each person’s name on Schedule

A (the “Purchaser’) as contemplated by the Condo AVO free and clear of the Encumbrances (as
defined in the Condo AVO) identified on Appendix B to the Supp Thirteenth Report and attached
as Schedule B to this Order

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that:

(@)

(b)

once completed by the Receiver as contemplated by paragraph 4 of the Condo
AVO, a Vesting Certificate (as defined by the AVO) constitutes part of the Condo
AVO to which it is attached and is an Order of the Superior Court under which the
property identified on the Vesting Certificate is vested in the purchaser(s) identified
in that Vesting Certificate free and clear of the encumbrances identified in the
Vesting Certificate for the purposes of s. 25(2) of the Land Titles Act, RSO 1990, ¢
L.5 (the “LTA”); and

the land registrar shall, without requiring further evidence or proof, make such
entries in the register as are necessary to give effect to the Condo AVO and this
Order by: (a) reflecting the Purchasers identified on Schedule A as the owner of
the Purchased Property identified opposite the name of that Purchaser on the
Schedule A; and (b) deleting and expunging from title to the Purchased Property
the Encumbrances identified on Schedule B all as required by paragraph 5 of the
Condo AVO.
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INTRODUCTION

1.

Pursuant to an Order (the “Appointment Order”) of the Ontario Superior Court of
Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) dated September 27, 2011 (the “Appointment
Date”), Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”),
was appointed as receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of all of the current and future
assets, undertakings and properties of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
(“Rose”). A copy of the Amended and Restated Appointment Order is attached hereto as
Appendix “A”.

Rose’s principal asset is a 12-storey building (the “Building”) located at 15-17
Maplewood Avenue, Toronto, Ontario (the “Property’), which is comprised of a 60 bed
long-term care facility located on floors 4 through 6 (the “Nursing Home”) with a
municipal address of 17 Maplewood Ave., and 91 life-lease units (“Residential Units”,
and individually “Residential Unit”) located on floors 2, 3 and 7 through 12 (the

“Residential Component”) with a municipal address of 15 Maplewood Ave.

On June 6, 2017, the Receiver brought a motion to, amongst other things, seek the
Court’s approval to 1) enter into an Exclusive Listing Agreement with John A. Jensen
Realty Inc. (“Jensen”) to market and sell the Nursing Home, and ii) enter into a
Marketing and Sales Agreement with Milborne Real Estate Inc. (“Milborne”) for the
marketing and sale of the available residential condominium units. In support of that
motion, the Receiver filed with the Court its Eighth Report to the Court dated May 12,
2017 (the “Eighth Report”). Based on the Eighth Report and the submissions made by
counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the Court granted an order (the “June 6

Order”) approving the relief sought.

On December 19, 2019, the Receiver brought a motion to, amongst other things, request
the Court issue an order approving an Agreement of Purchase and Sale (the “LTC
Transaction”) dated May 10, 2019 as amended (the “APS”), as between the Receiver
and Rykka Care Centres LP (“Rykka” or the “Purchaser”) and, to the extent the
conditions of the APS are satisfied, vesting in the Purchaser all the right, title and interest

in the Assets (as defined in the APS) free and clear of all liens, security interests and
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other encumbrances, save and except for the permitted encumbrances referred to in the
APS. In support of that motion, the Receiver filed with the Court its Tenth Report to the
Court dated December 10, 2019 (the “Tenth Report”). Based on the Tenth Report and
the submissions made by counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the Court granted

an Approval and Vesting Order (the “LTC AVO”) approving the relief sought.

On June 10, 2021, the Receiver brough a motion to, amongst other things, update the
Court on the status of the Transaction and request the Court amend the AVO to substitute
Arirang Age-Friendly Community Centre (“Arirang”) as Purchaser as a result of an
assignment of the APS by Rykka to Arirang. In support of that motion, the Receiver filed
with the Court its Eleventh Report to the Court dated June 1, 2021. Based on the Eleventh
Report and the submissions made by counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the

Court granted the relief sought (the “June 10 Order”).

On July 27, 2022, the Receiver brought a motion to, amongst other things: 1) update the
Court on the status of the Condominium Application and seek the Court’s approval of a
mechanism for the issuance of an Approval and Vesting Order (Condominium and
Service Units) (the “Condo AVO”) in order to complete the sale of Residential Units as
condominium units, i1) update the Court on the status of the Transaction and the licence
transfer process, iii) update the Court on its dealings with the Union, iv) seek the Courts
approval of the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the
period September 27, 2011 to April 15, 2022 (the “Interim R&D”) and Receiver’s
actions and activities as set out in the Receiver’s Twelfth Report to the Court dated July
14, 2022 (the “Twelfth Report™) filed in support of the its motion, a copy of which is
attached hereto as Appendix “B” (without appendices). Based on the submissions made
by counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the Court granted the relief sought. A
copy of the Condo AVO issued by Justice Gilmore on July 27, 2022 is attached hereto as
Appendix “C”. A copy of the Order of Justice Gilmore dated July 27, 2022 approving
the Twelfth Report and the Interim R&D is attached hereto as Appendix “D”.

The purpose of this Thirteenth Report to the Court (the “Thirteenth Report”) is to:
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a) update the Court on the status of the sale of Residential Units as condominium
units;

b) update the Court on the status of the LTC Transaction;

c) seek the Court’s approval to make distributions to Peoples Trust Company
(“Peoples™), the first secured creditor and Applicant in these proceedings, from
the proceeds of the sale of the condominium units;

d) seek the Court’s approval of the professional fees and disbursements of the
Receiver, including those of its legal counsel Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP and
Blaney McMurtry LLP;

e) seek the Court’s approval of the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the period September 27, 2011 to December 31, 2022;

f) seek an order dismissing certain claims and cross claims against York Health
Developments Inc.; and

g) seek the Court’s approval of this Thirteenth Report and the actions and activities
of the Receiver from July 14, 2022 to the date of this Thirteenth Report.

TERMS OF REFERENCE

8.

In preparing this Thirteenth Report, the Receiver has reviewed unaudited financial

information and other records related to Rose and the Nursing Home provided by

Assured Care Consulting Inc. (“ACC”), the manager of the nursing home, and

information provided by third-party sources, and has held discussions with individuals

involved in administering the Nursing Home (collectively, the “Information”). Except

as described in this report:

(a)

the Receiver has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal
consistency and use in the context in which it was provided. However, the
Receiver has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or

completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially
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(b)

(c)

-5-

comply with Canadian Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the Chartered
Professional Accountants Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver
expresses no opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under CAS in

respect of the Information;

some of the information referred to in this Thirteenth Report consists of forecasts
and projections which were prepared based on estimates and assumptions. Such
estimates and assumptions are, by their nature, not ascertainable and as a
consequence, no assurance can be provided regarding the forecasted or projected
results. Accordingly, the reader is cautioned that the actual results will likely vary
from the forecasts or projections, even if the assumptions materialize, and the

variations could be significant; and

the Receiver has prepared this Thirteenth Report in its capacity as a Court-
appointed officer to support the Court’s approval of its course of action with
respect to a sale of the Property, and the other relief being sought. Parties using
this report, other than for the purposes outlined herein, are cautioned that it may

not be appropriate for their purposes.

Capitalized terms not defined in this report are as defined in the Appointment Order, or

the Receiver’s First through Twelfth Reports. All references to dollars are in Canadian

currency unless otherwise noted.

The Receiver has sought the advice of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP (“Gowlings”),

counsel to the Applicant, for general legal matters that have arisen in respect of the

receivership. Where the Receiver has required independent legal advice, the Receiver has

sought the counsel of Blaney McMurtry LLP (“Blaneys”).

STATUS OF THE CONDOMINIUM AND SALE OF THE CONDOMINIUM UNITS

11.

As set out in paragraph 37 of the Twelfth Report, on May 18, 2022 the condominium was

registered by the City of Toronto as Toronto Standard Condominium Corporation #2911
(“TSCC#2911”). A copy of the registered Declaration for TSCC#2911 is attached as
Appendix “J” to the Twelfth Report.
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13.

14.
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Subsequent to the registration of TSCC#2911, the Receiver, with the assistance of
Gowlings, finalized the Disclosure Statement which included the Declaration, the Budget
Statement, the By-Laws, the Rules Governing the Use of Units and Common Elements,

and the Shared Facilities Agreement.

In addition, the Receiver, in its capacity as members of the First Board of Directors of
TSCC#2911, entered into a Condominium Management Agreement with Sterling
Karamar Property Management (“Sterling”) dated July 1, 2022 for the day-to-day

management of the condominium corporation.

The Receiver, with Sterling’s assistance, arranged for the appropriate insurance to be put

in place for the condominium corporation.

Sale and Closing of the Settlement Units

15.

16.

17.

Further to paragraph 38 of the Twelfth Report, on August 30, 2022 the Receiver issued
Purchase Notices to 38 Settling Unitholders representing 43 units which Purchase
Notices detailed the Unit Purchase Price required to be paid by each Settling Unitholder
within 60 days of the date of the Purchase Notice in order to complete the purchase of

their unit.

The Receiver identified a Korean speaking law firm that specialized in real estate

transactions and provided

In total, 32 Settling Unitholders representing 41 units elected to complete the purchase of
their unit, and, as set out in paragraph 40 of the Twelfth Report, the units were conveyed
to those parties through the Condo AVO. The proceeds from the closing of the 41 units

were as follows:

Purchase Price as per Settlements $ 8,900,500.76
Less: Credits as per Agreements of Purchase and Sale (5,503,774.60)
Plus: Outstanding CAM and current month adj. 610,676.77
Plus: Outstanding Interest on Right to Occupy Agreements 586,587.53

Plus: Property Tax Adjustment 7,720.09
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Plus: Status Certificate Fees 4,633.00
Total Proceeds Received by the Receiver $ 4,446,721.70

With respect to the three Settling Unitholders who elected not to complete the purchase
of their unit, two (unit #308 and #1005) advised the Receiver before the end of the 60-
day period of their decision not to complete their purchase, and, as such, those units
reverted to the Receiver. The Settling Unitholder of the third unit (unit #907) sought an
extension to November 15, 2022 to advise the Receiver of their intention to purchase,
which the Receiver granted. They then sought a further extension to February 2023 to
advise the Receiver of their decision, which the Receiver declined to grant. As a result,
third unit reverted to the Receiver, and all three units were then included in the lot of
units to be marketed and sold by Milborne to the general public as discussed further

below.

York Health Care Settlement and Claim Dismissal

19.

With respect to unit 903, as set out in paragraph 51 of the Eleventh Report, the Receiver
had previously agreed to a settlement with respect to its claims in court file CV-12-
463472 against York Health Care Developments Inc. (“York Health Care”). That
settlement provided for the Receiver to receive a payment from Assured Care Consulting
Inc. (“ACC”) upon the closing of its purchase of unit 903 (the Eleventh Report
erroneously referred to unit 901). York Health Care was the original purchaser of unit
903 but had assigned its Right to Occupy Agreement to ACC prior to the receivership.
The Receiver, York Health Care and ACC documented this settlement through a Multi-
Party Agreement in October 2022 which provided that upon completion of the acquisition
of unit 903, and upon payment by ACC to the Receiver of $40,000 (the “YHC
Settlement Funds”), the Receiver shall provide a full and final release and obtain an
order dismissing the claim and all cross claims against York Health Care without costs.
The acquisition of unit 903 by ACC (through its assignee 1916778 Ontario Inc.) was
completed on October 31, 2022. The Receiver received the YHC Settlement Funds on
that date and provided York Health Care with a full and final release. The Receiver is

now seeking an order dismissing the claim and all cross claims against York Health Care.



Marketing and Sale of the Remaining Units

20.

21.

22.

Milborne was originally tasked with the marketing and sale of 47 units. With three
Settling Unitholders not completing their purchase, that number increased to 50 units (the

“Milborne Units”).

Milborne’s primary marketing strategy consisted of advertising two to four of the
Milborne Units at a time on the Toronto Regional Real Estate Board’s Multiple Listing
Service (“MLS”), which serves over 70,000 realtors and places the listings on Realtor.ca
for public facing visibility. While only a small number of the Milborne Units would be
publicly listed for sale at any particular point in time, so as to not flood the market with
numerous competitive listings, all the Milborne Units were available for sale and
Milborne would direct parties to unlisted Milborne Units if they were not satisfied with
the Milborne Units that were listed on MLS. Upon the sale of an MLS-listed unit, the
furniture and fixtures would be moved to another Milborne Unit which would then be

advertised on MLS. Thus far, 13 different units have been listed on MLS.
Milborne’s other marketing activities included the following:

e arranged for each MLS-listed unit to be professional staged and professionally

photographed;

e created the website 15maplewood.com that provided further marketing
information (building features, photos and 3D tours, unit dimensions, floor plans

and neighbourhood information) to interested parties;

e placed two advertisements in The Korean Times Daily, a Toronto newspaper and

media outlet catering to the Korean community;

e sent email notices to its database of real estate agents/brokers advising of the

availability of the Milborne Units; and

e placed sandwich board signage in the local area advertising the Milborne Units;
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24.

25.

26.

-9.

With input from Milborne and the Receiver, Gowlings prepared an agreement of
purchase and sale based on the Ontario Real Estate Association standard Form 100 but
tailored for a sale by a Receiver on an “as is, where is” basis. The Receiver issued
Vesting Certificates with respect to the Milborne Units on the Closing Date of each unit

upon the receipt of the total purchase price.

Listing prices for the Milborne Units were established by Milborne, in consultation with
the Receiver, Peoples and CMHC, and were based on current market activity adjusted for
the relative quality of the Building and the individual units (location, amenities, age of
the Building), that they were being marketed as resale units on an “as-is, where-is” basis
without the benefit of any warranty, and the fact that it was a sale by a Receiver. Sales of
the Milborne Units to date, as set out below, have all achieved their listing prices or

above, which occurred in instances where there were multiple offers for a unit.

Active listing of the Milborne Units commenced on September 27, 2022. As of January
19, 2023, the following is the sales status of the Milborne Units:

Units Sold & Closed 32
Units Sold, Firm and Scheduled to Close after Jan 19,

2023 7
Units Sold but still in 10-day Rescission Period 1
Units Available for Sale 10
Total Milborne Units 50

The proceeds from the closing of the 32 Milborne Units were as follows:

Total Purchase Price $ 14,427,400.00
Less: Real Estate Commission (including HST) (804,978.10)
Total Proceeds from Sale of Milborne Units $13,442,421.90

The above amounts do not include typical closing adjustments for property taxes,
common area maintenance fees, law society levy and status certificates. The Total
Purchase Price also include proceeds from the sale of locker and parking units. Proceeds

from closings are remitted to Gowlings which they hold in their trust account and
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periodically transfer to the Receiver. Gowlings has thus far transferred to the Receiver
proceeds totalling $12,663,029.40 from the sale of the 24 Milborne Units that closed in
2022, and 6 units that closed thus far up to January 13, 2023.

Milborne continues to actively market the remaining Milborne Units and has advised the
Receiver that expects it will take a further four to five months to sell and close the

remaining units.

Condominium Board of Directors

28.

29.

30.

Pursuant to the Order of Justice McEwen dated June 10, 2021, upon declaration of the
condominium by the City of Toronto, the first board of directors of TSCC#2911 was
comprised of three employees of the Receiver, being Hartley Bricks, Catherine Hristow
and Jorden Sleeth (the “First Board”). The First Board executed the required Resolution
of the Declarant and four by-laws required under the Condominium Act, 1998 (the
“Condo Act”). It also arranged for two bank accounts to be opened in the name of the
condominium corporation (an operating account and a reserve fund account) and ensured

that the appropriate insurance was put in place as required under the by-laws and the

Condo Act.

The First Board on behalf of TSCC#2911 entered into a Condominium Management
Agreement with Sterling Karamar Property Management (“Sterling”) effective July 1,
2022 to act as the property manager for the condominium. Sterling has also been
engaged by the Receiver since the commencement of the receivership to manage the
Residential Component on its behalf, and thus was very familiar with the Property.
Sterling continues to play a dual role as the Receiver winds down the operation of the

Residential Component as condominium units are sold.

Pursuant to section 43(1) of the Condo Act, given that over 50% of the condominium
units have been sold and closed, a Turn-over meeting was held on December 20, 2022 at
which meeting a new board of three members was elected from the new owners of the

condominium units. None of the First Board members remains on the board of directors

of TSCC#2911.
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STATUS OF THE LTC TRANSACTION

31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

Upon issuance of the June 10 Order which substituted Arirang as the Purchaser under the
LTC AVO, by letter dated June 17, 2021, the Receiver advised the Ministry of Long-
Term Care (the “Ministry”) of the substitution and requested that it commence its licence

transfer process with respect to Arirang.

Through the later half of 2021 and early 2022, Arirang provided the Ministry with the
information it had requested in order to assess Arirang’s application. Throughout its
review, the Receiver has been in periodic contact with the Ministry to ascertain the status
of the review. On May 10, 2022, the Ministry advised the Receiver via e-mail that they
had received all of the required documents from Arirang and were reviewing same and
were working on the format and timing of the public consultation. However, they further
advised that they were in a “writ period” due to the provincial election and the public

consultation would not be finalized until a new government was put in place.

On July 15, 2022, the Ministry issued a Notice of Public Consultation setting the public

meeting for August 23, 2022. The Receiver attended the meeting which was uneventful.

On July 22, 2022, Arirang submitted the proposed Management Agreement (“ACC
MA”) between itself and Assured Care Consulting Inc. (“ACC”) that would provide for
ACC’s continued management of the Nursing Home on behalf of Arirang upon the
closing of the LTC Transaction. On October 19 & 21, 2022, the Ministry advised Arirang
that it required certain clarifications/changes to the ACC MA.

On October 24, 2022, the Receiver was advised that the principal of ACC had decided to
retire and he wished to wind-up his business in the near term. Arirang advised the
Ministry of this predicament and that it needed to conduct a search for a new manager for

the Nursing Home.

Since it was apparent that the LTC Transaction would not close by the outside date of
December 31, 2022 as set out in the Amended and Restated Agreement of Purchase and
Sale dated April 1. 2021 as between the Receiver and Arirang, on December 29, 2022,

the parties executed a First Amending Agreement that 1) extended the outside date to
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March 31, 2023, and ii) agreed that the parties would use commercially reasonable efforts
to obtain Ministry approval of the licence transfer by February 28, 2023. A copy of the
First Amending Agreement is attached hereto as Appendix “E”.

On January 10, 2023, Arirang advised that its board of directors had approved the
engagement of UniversalCare Canada Inc. (“Universal”) as the nursing home manager
for the Nursing Home. On January 11, 2023, Arirang submitted a new management
agreement between itself and Universal (the “Universal MA”) to the Ministry and
requested an expedited review of the contract given that the form of the agreement was
near identical to that of the ACC MA (and incorporated the changes the Ministry had
previously requested to the ACC MA) and that Universal is an established nursing home
manager well known to the Ministry. As of the date of this Thirteenth Report, the
Ministry has not yet issued its approval of the Universal MA or the transfer of the

Nursing Home licence to Arirang.

INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

38.

39.

Attached hereto as Appendix “F” is the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the interim period May 1, 2022 to December 31, 2022 and for the
entire period of the receivership, September 27, 2011 to December 31, 2022 (the
“R&D”). The R&D indicates that as of December 31, 2022, the balance in the Receiver’s
bank accounts, including the account maintained by Sterling Karamar Property
Management (the firm engaged by the Receiver to manage the Residential Component),
is $13,241,321. The R&D excludes the bank account maintained by the Nursing Home

manager for the Nursing Home which is discussed in the following paragraph.

The R&D includes receipts and disbursements from the Residential Component and
receipts from the Ministry on account of monthly funding of the Nursing Home. In
accordance with the Appointment Order, this funding is transferred to the bank account
established for Nursing Home operations. As of December 31, 2022, the balance in the
bank account maintained by ACC was $1,640,506.28. The high account balance is
substantially due to the funding received from the Ministry in 2022 for Covid-related and

other ministry programs which the Nursing Home has been unable to spend, and which, if
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unspent, must be repaid to the Ministry. The Nursing Home manager is currently
assessing the extent of the repayment to the Ministry; however, it could exceed $1.0

million.

The Receiver notes that the receipts for the life lease residence with respect to the interim
period May 1 to December 31, 2022 indicate negative receipts of $1,004,534. This
negative amount results from a reclassification of approximately $1,479,000 of nursing
home-related receipts that had erroneously been recorded under the life lease residence in

the previous R&D.

Disbursements in respect of Condominium Fees reflects the monthly common area
maintenance fees paid to TSCC#2911 in respect of unsold units, and also includes a
payment of $500,000 to the condominium’s reserve fund account, a disbursement that
was agreed to by Peoples and CMHC and provided for in the Disclosure Statement and
Budget Statement in order to establish an immediate fund to support any significant

capital repairs to the Building in the near term.

The Receiver is seeking the Court’s approval of the R&D.

PROPOSED DISTRIBTUTION TO SECURED CREDITOR

43.

As set out in the paragraph 18 of the First Report, Rose’s indebtedness to Peoples at that
time was approximately $15 million. Peoples has provided the Receiver with a payout
statement dated January 9, 2023, attached hereto as Appendix “G”, indicating that the
amount of Rose’s indebtedness has increased to $38,275,605 (the “Peoples Loan”). As
set out in that payout statement, the increase in the Peoples Loan over the past 11 2 years
is due to: i) accrued interest at prime plus 1.25% amounting to approximately $7.5
million, ii) Peoples’ payment of property taxes for the Property totalling approximately
$1.9 million, iii) late payment interest (interest charged on payments not made) of
approximately $1.8 million, and iv) sundry charges of approximately $12.2 million
(substantially comprised of loans to the Receiver by way of Receiver’s Certificates of
$6.5 million, $860,000 of legal fees, $1,050,000 payment to Trisura Guarantee Insurance
Company in settlement of a lien claim, and $3.7 million of sundry account interest). The

Peoples Loan continues to accrue per diem interest at $3,140.03.
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Peoples’ security over Rose’s assets includes a charge/mortgage in the amount of
$17,300,162.50 registered in the Land Titles Division of the Toronto Registry Office, a
General Assignment of Rents and a General Security Agreement (“Peoples’ Security”).
Blaneys has provided its opinion to the Receiver that Peoples’ Security is a legal, valid
and binding obligation of Rose that is enforceable against Rose. Blaneys’ opinion is

subject to the standard qualifications set out therein.

Based on the realizations on Rose’s assets to date, and the anticipated proceeds from the
sale of the Nursing Home and the balance of the Residential Units, net of costs and
further professional fees, Peoples will suffer a significant shortfall on the Peoples’ Loan

such that there will not be any funds available for distribution to subordinate creditors.

Based on the security opinion received, the Receiver is seeking an order to make an
initial distribution to Peoples of $13.0 million, and to make distributions from time to
time of all funds coming into its hands in respect of the realization of the assets of Rose,
to Peoples, subject to such reserves as the Receiver may deem prudent, such realizations

up to a maximum of the Peoples Loan without further order of this Court.

STATEMENTS OF ACCOUNT OF THE RECEIVER AND ITS COUNSEL

47.

48.

The Receiver, and its legal counsel, Gowlings and Blaneys, have maintained detailed
records of their professional time and costs in this matter. Pursuant to paragraph 18 of
the Appointment Order, the Receiver and its legal counsel were directed to pass their
accounts from time to time before the Court and were granted a Receiver’s Charge (as

such term is defined in the Appointment Order) over the Property.

The total fees of the Receiver during the period from January 1, 2017 to November 30,
2022 amount to $1,331,991.00 together with expenses and disbursements in the sum of
$27,635.04 and harmonized sales tax (“HST”) in the amount of $176,728.01, totaling
$1,536,354.05 (the “Receiver’s Fees”). The time spent by the Receiver is more
particularly described in the Affidavit of Hartley Bricks sworn January 18, 2023 (the
“Bricks Affidavit”) in support hereof and attached hereto as Appendix “H”. As noted
in the Bricks Affidavit, there was an error in invoice dated July 24, 2019 for the period
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June 1 to June 30, 2019, which invoice was overstated by $7,468.50. This amount will be

deducted from the Receiver’s next invoice.

The total fees of Gowlings during the period from March 5, 2015 to December 31 2022
amount to $1,673,864.50 together with expenses and disbursements in the sum of
$39,961.48 and HST in the amount of $221,870.68, totaling $1,935,696.66 (the
“Gowlings Fees”). The time spent by Gowlings is more particularly described in the
Affidavit of Clifton Prophet sworn January 23, 2023 (the “Prophet Affidavit”) in
support hereof and attached hereto as Appendix “I”.

The total fees of Blaneys during the period from January 1, 2017 to September 30, 2022
amount to $139,757.00 together with expenses and disbursements in the sum of
$3,053.90 and HST in the amount of $18,338.86, totaling $161,200.36 (the “Blaneys
Fees”). The time spent by Blaneys is more particularly described in the Affidavit of
Chad Kopach sworn January 19, 2023 (the “Kopach Affidavit”) in support hereof and
attached hereto as Appendix “J”.

Other than the error discussed in paragraph 54, the Receiver is of the view that the fees
and disbursements set out in the Bricks Affidavit, the Prophet Affidavit, and the Kopach
Affidavit (collectively, the “Professional Fees”) are reasonable in the circumstances of
this case. Prior to taking any advances against the Receiver’s Fees or Gowlings Fees, the
Receiver has obtained Peoples approval, which has been provided in each instance.

Accordingly, the Receiver is seeking the Court’s approval of the Professional Fees.

RECEIVER’S REQUEST TO THE COURT

52.

The Receiver respectively requests the Court make an Order:

a) approving this Thirteenth Report and the Receiver’s the actions and activities as

described herein;

b) approving an initial distribution to Peoples in the amount of $13.0 million, and future
distributions to Peoples from time to time up to a maximum of the Peoples’ Loan

without further order of this Court;
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c) approving the Professional Fees;
d) approving the R&D; and

e) dismissing the claim and all cross claims in court file CV-12-463472 against York

Health Care without costs.

All of which is respectfully submitted to this Honourable Court.
DATED this 23" day of January, 2023.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC.
Receiver and Manager of the current and future
assets, undertakings and properties of

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
and not in its personal capacity

Per: M

Hartley BricKs, MBA, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT
Senior Vice-President
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Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST
THE HONOURABLE ) TUESDAY , THE 27" DAY
)
JUSTICE C. CAMPBELL ) OF SEPTEMBER, 2011
BETWEEN:
PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
- and -
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY
Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act,
R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, as amended, and under section 101 of the
Courts of Justice Act, R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43

PPOINTMENT ORDER

THIS APPLICATION made by Peoples Trust Company (“Peoples Trust” or the
“Applicant”) for an Order pursuant to section 243(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act,
R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, as amended (the "BIA") and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act,
R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43, as amended (the "CJA") appointing Deloitte & Touche Inc. (“Deloitte”)

as receiver and manager (in such capacities, the "Receiver') without security, of all of the
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assets, undertakings and properties of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (the

“Debtor”), was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Affidavit of Michael Lombard sworn September 22, 2011, and the
Exhibits thereto and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Applicant and counsel for the
Debtor no one appearing for any other party although duly served as appears from the Affidavits
of Service of Alma Cano, sworn September 23 and September 26, 2011, and on reading the

Consent of Deloitte to act as the Receiver,
SERVICE

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Application and the
Application Record herein is hereby abridged and validated so that this motion is properly

returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof.
APPOINTMENT

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to section 243(1) of the BIA and section 101 of
the CJA, Deloitte is hereby appointed Receiver, without security, of all of the Debtor’s current
and future assets, undertakings and properties of every nature and kind whatsoever, wherever

situate, including all proceeds thereof (the "Property").

RECEIVER’S POWERS

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby empowered and authorized, but not
obligated, to act at once in respect of the Property and, without in any way limiting the generality
of the foregoing, the Receiver is hereby expressly empowered and authorized to do any of the

following where the Receiver considers it necessary or desirable:

(a) to take possession of and exercise control over the Property and any and

all proceeds, receipts and disbursements arising out of or from the

Property;

(b) to receive, preserve, and protect and maintain control of the Property, or

any part or parts thereof, including, but not limited to, the changing of
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locks and security codes, the relocating of Property to safeguard it, the

engaging of independent security personnel, the taking of physical

inventories and the placement of such insurance coverage as may be

necessary or desirable;

subject to section 110 of the Long-Term Care Homes Act, S.0. 2007, c. 8
(the “LTCHA”™) to manage, operate, and carry on the business of the
Debtor, including the powers to enter into any agreements, incur any
obligations in the ordinary course of business, cease to carry on all or any

part of the business, or cease to perform any contracts of the Debtor;

subject to section 110 of the LTCHA, to engage consultants, appraisers,
agents, experts, auditors, accountants, managers, counsel and such other
persons from time to time and on whatever basis, including on a temporary
basis, to assist with the exercise of the Receiver's powers and duties,
including without limitation those conferred by this Order, and in this
regard the Receiver is specifically authorized to retain counsel for the
Applicant to advise and represent it save and except on matters upon
which the Receiver in its judgment determines it requires independent

advice, in which case the Receiver shall retain Blaney McMurtry LLP;

to purchase or lease such machinery, equipment, inventories, supplies,
premises or other assets to continue the business of the Debtor or any part

or parts thereof;

to receive and collect all monies and accounts now owed or hereafter
owing to the Debtor and to exercise all remedies of the Debtor in
collecting such monies, including, without limitation, to enforce any

security held by the Debtor;

Notwithstanding anything in this Order, the Debtor is the licensee (the
“Licensee”) of the long-term care home located at 17 Maplewood Avenue,

Toronto, Ontario which forms a part of the Property (the “Home”). The
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Home is currently licensed pursuant to the LTCHA and the regulations
thereunder. Toronto Central Local Health Integration Network (“TC
LHIN”) will continue to pay the Licensee (and the Receiver will be
entitled to receive such payments) pursuant to the Service Accountability
Agreement in respect of the Home between the TC LHIN and the Debtor
effective March 4, 2011 (the “SAA™) and the Ministry of Health and
Long-Term Care (together-with-the-FCHIN-the “MIOH”) will continue
to pay the Licensee (which payments shall be received by the Receiver in
accordance with this Order) pursuant to—the existing agreement-
agreements. Any monies received by the Debtor or the Receiver from the
MOH_or the TC LHIN shall be used or applied by the Receiver for the
operation of the Home in accordance with the SAA, any agreement with
the MOH and the LTCHA. Any payments by the TC LHIN shall be subject
to TC LHIN review and reconciliation as provided for under the SAA and
applicable law and written policy. Any payments by the MOH shall be
subject to MOH review and reconciliation as provided for under any
agreement with the Debtor or the Receiver and applicable law and written
policy. For clarity, subject to the foregoing reconciliations. any surplus
monies arising from the operation of the Home may be applied by the

Receiver in accordance with this Order.
to settle, extend or compromise any indebtedness owing to the Debtor;

to execute, assign, issue and endorse documents of whatever nature in
respect of any of the Property, whether in the Receiver's name or in the

name and on behalf of the Debtor, for any purpose pursuant to this Order;

to undertake environmental or workers' health and safety assessments of

the Property and operations of the Debtor;
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to apply for such permits, licenses, approvals or permissions as may be
required by any governmental authority with respect to the Property,

including, without limitation, licenses under the LTCHA

to initiate, prosecute and continue the prosecution of any and all
proceedings and to defend all proceedings now pending or hereafter
instituted with respect to the Debtor, the Property or the Receiver, and to
settle or compromise any such proceedings. The authority hereby
conveyed shall extend to such appeals or applications for judicial review

in respect of any order or judgment pronounced in any such proceeding;

to market any or all of the Property, including advertising and soliciting
offers in respect of the Property or any part or parts thereof and negotiating
such terms and conditions of sale as the Receiver in its discretion may

deem appropriate;

to sell, convey, transfer, lease or assign the Property or any part or parts

thereof out of the ordinary course of business,

(1) without the approval of this Court in respect of any transaction not
exceeding $50,000 provided that the aggregate consideration for all

such transactions does not exceed $200,000; and

(i1) with the approval of this Court in respect of any transaction in
which the purchase price or the aggregate purchase price exceeds

the applicable amount set out in the preceding clause;

and in each such case notice under subsection 63(4) of the Ontario
Personal Property Security Act, or section 31 of the Ontario Mortgages
Act, as the case may be, shall not be required, and in each case the Ontario

Bulk Sales Act shall not apply.
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to apply for any vesting order or other orders necessary to convey the

Property or any part or parts thereof to a purchaser or purchasers thereof,

free and clear of any liens or encumbrances affecting such Property;

to report to, meet with and discuss with such affected Persons (as defined
below) as the Receiver deems appropriate on all matters relating to the
Property and the receivership, and to share information, subject to such

terms as to confidentiality as the Receiver deems advisable;

to register a copy of this Order and any other Orders in respect of the

Property against title to any of the Property;

to apply for any permits, licences, approvals or permissions as may be
required by any governmental authority and any renewals thereof for and
on behalf of and, if thought desirable by the Receiver, in the name of the
Debtor;

to enter into agreements with any trustee in bankruptcy appointed in
respect of the Debtor, including, without limiting the generality of the
foregoing, the ability to enter into occupation agreements for any property

owned or leased by the Debtor;

to exercise any shareholder, partnership, joint venture or other rights

which the Debtor may have; and

to take any steps reasonably incidental to the exercise of these powers or

the performance of any statutory obligations.

and in each case where the Receiver takes any such actions or steps, it shall be exclusively

authorized and empowered to do so, to the exclusion of all other Persons (as defined below),

including the Debtor, and without interference from any other Person.
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DUTY TO PROVIDE ACCESS AND CO-OPERATION TO THE RECEIVER

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that (i) the Debtor, (ii) all of its current and former directors,
officers, employees, agents, accountants, legal counsel and shareholders, and all other persons
acting on its instructions or behalf, and (iii) all other individuals, firms, corporations,
governmental bodies or agencies, or other entities having notice of this Order, including without
limitation Mr. Charles Daley and IWOK Corporation (all of the foregoing, collectively, being
"Persons"” and cach being a "Person") shall forthwith advise the Receiver of the existence of
any Property in such Person's possession or control, shall grant immediate and continued access
to the Property to the Receiver and any party the Receiver retains in accordance with sub-
paragraph 3(d) of this Order and section 110 of the LTCHA, and shall deliver all such Property

to the Receiver upon the Receiver's request.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons shall forthwith advise the Receiver of the
existence of any books, documents, securities, contracts, orders, corporate and accounting
records, and any other papers, records and information of any kind related to the business or
affairs of the Debtor, and any computer programs, computer tapes, computer disks, or other data
storage media containing any such information (the foregoing, collectively, the "Records") in
that Person's possession or control, and shall provide to the Receiver or permit the Receiver to
make, retain and take away copies thereof and grant to the Receiver unfettered access to and use
of accounting, computer, software and physical facilities relating thereto, provided however that
nothing in this paragraph 5 or in paragraph 6 of this Order shall require the delivery of Records,
or the granting of access to Records, which may not be disclosed or provided to the Receiver due
to the privilege attaching to solicitor-client communication or due to statutory provisions

prohibiting such disclosure.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that if any Records are stored or otherwise contained on a
computer or other electronic system of information storage, whether by independent service
provider or otherwise, all Persons in possession or control of such Records shall forthwith give
unfettered access to the Receiver for the purpose of allowing the Receiver to recover and fully
copy all of the information contained therein whether by way of printing the information onto

paper or making copies of computer disks or such other manner of retrieving and copying the
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information as the Receiver in its discretion deems expedient, and shall not alter, erase or destroy
any Records without the prior written consent of the Receiver. Further, for the purposes of this
paragraph, all Persons shall provide the Receiver with all such assistance in gaining immediate
access to the information in the Records as the Receiver may in its discretion require including
providing the Receiver with instructions on the use of any computer or other system and
providing the Receiver with any and all access codes, account names and account numbers that

may be required to gain access to the information.
NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE RECEIVER

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that no proceeding or enforcement process in any court or
tribunal (each, a ""Proceeding'), shall be commenced or continued against the Receiver or any
party the Receiver retains in accordance with sub-paragraph 3(d) of this Order and section 110 of
the LTCHA_(the “Manager”) except with the written consent of the Receiver or with leave of
this Court.

NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE DEBTOR OR THE PROPERTY

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Proceeding against or in respect of the Debtor or the
Property shall be commenced or continued except with the written consent of the Receiver or
with leave of this Court and any and all Proceedings currently under way against or in respect of

the Debtor or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended pending further Order of this Court.

NO EXERCISE OF RIGHTS OR REMEDIES

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that all rights and remedies against the Debtor, the Receiver
and the Manager, or affecting the Property, are hereby stayed and suspended except with the
written consent of the Receiver or leave of this Court, provided however that this stay and
suspension does not apply in respect of any "eligible financial contract" as defined in the BIA,
and further provided that nothing in this paragraph shall (i) empower the Receiver or the Debtor
to carry on any business which the Debtor is not lawfully entitled to carry on, (ii) exempt the
Receiver or the Debtor from compliance with statutory or regulatory provisions relating to health,

safety or the environment, (iii) prevent the filing of any registration to preserve or perfect a
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security interest, or (iv) prevent the registration of a claim for lien. For clarity, this paragraph 9

shall apply to the Manager solely in its capacity as agent for the Receiver.

NO INTERFERENCE WITH THE RECEIVER

10. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Person shall discontinue, fail to honour, alter, interfere
with, repudiate, terminate or cease to perform any right, renewal right, contract, agreement,
licence or permit in favour of or held by the Debtor, without written consent of the Receiver or

leave of this Court.

CONTINUATION OF SERVICES

11.  THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons having oral or written agreements with the
Debtor or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods and/or services, including
without limitation, all computer software, communication and other data services, centralized
banking services, payroll services, insurance, transportation services, utility or other services to
the Debtor are hereby restrained until further Order of this Court from discontinuing, altering,
interfering with or terminating the supply of such goods or services as may be required by the
Receiver or Manager, and that the Receiver shall be entitled to the continued use of the Debtor’s
current telephone numbers, facsimile numbers, internet addresses and domain names, provided in
each case that the normal prices or charges for all such goods or services received after the date
of this Order are paid by the Receiver in accordance with normal payment practices of the Debtor
or such other practices as may be agreed upon by the supplier or service provider and the

Receiver, or as may be ordered by this Court.

RECEIVER TO HOLD FUNDS

12, THIS COURT ORDERS that all funds, monies, cheques, instruments, and other forms
of payments received or collected by the Receiver from and after the making of this Order from
any source whatsoever, including without limitation the sale of all or any of the Property and the
collection of any accounts receivable in whole or in part, whether in existence on the date of this
Order or hereafter coming into existence, shall be deposited into one or more new accounts to be
opened by the Receiver, at least one of which will describe the account holder as “Deloitte &
Touc _— v+ of f i i ity” (the "Post
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Receivership Accounts") and the monies standing to the credit of such Post Receivership

Accounts from time to time, net of any disbursements provided for herein, shall be held by the

Receiver to be paid in accordance with the terms of this Order or any further Order of this Court.

EMPLOYEES

13.  THIS COURT ORDERS that all employees of the Debtor shall remain the employees of
the Debtor until such time as the Receiver, on the Debtor's behalf, may terminate the employment
of such employees. Neither the Receiver nor the Manager shall be liable for any employee-
related liabilities, including any successor employer liabilities as provided for in section
14.06(1.2) of the BIA, other than such amounts as the Receiver may specifically agree in writing
to pay, or in respect of its obligations under sections 81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the

Wage Earner Protection Program Act.

PIPEDA

14. THIS COURT ORDERS that, pursuant to clause 7(3)(c) of the Canada Personal
Information Protection and Electronic Documents Act, the Receiver shall disclose personal
information of identifiable individuals to prospective purchasers or bidders for the Property and
to their advisors, but only to the extent desirable or required to negotiate and attempt to complete
one or more sales of the Property (each, a ""Sale™). Each prospective purchaser or bidder to
whom such personal information is disclosed shall maintain and protect the privacy of such
information and limit the use of such information to its evaluation of the Sale, and if it does not
complete a Sale, shall return all such information to the Receiver, or in the alternative destroy all
such information. The purchaser of any Property shall be entitled to continue to use the personal
information provided to it, and related to the Property purchased, in a manner which is in all
material respects identical to the prior use of such information by the Debtor, and shall return all
other personal information to the Receiver, or ensure that all other personal information is

destroyed.

LIMITATION ON ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES

15. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing herein contained shall require the Receiver to

occupy or to take control, care, charge, possession or management (separately and/or collectively,
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"Possession'") of any of the Property that might be environmentally contaminated, might be a
pollutant or a contaminant, or might cause or contribute to a spill, discharge, release or deposit of
a substance contrary to any federal, provincial or other law respecting the protection,
conservation, enhancement, remediation or rehabilitation of the environment or relating to the
disposal of waste or other contamination including, without limitation, the Canadian
Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario Water
Resources Act, or the Ontario Occupational Health and Safety Act and regulations thereunder
(the "Environmental Legislation"), provided however that nothing herein shall exempt the
Receiver from any duty to report or make disclosure imposed by applicable Environmental
Legislation. The Receiver shall not, as a result of this Order or anything done in pursuance of the
Receiver's duties and powers under this Order, be deemed to be in Possession of any of the

Property within the meaning of any Environmental Legislation, unless it is actually in possession.

LIMITATION ON THE RECEIVER’S LIABILITY

16. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver shall incur no liability or obligation as a
result of its appointment or the carrying out the provisions of this Order, save and except for any
gross negligence or wilful misconduct on its part, or in respect of its obligations under sections
81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the Wage Earner Protection Program Act. Nothing in this
Order shall derogate from the protections afforded the Receiver by section 14.06 of the BIA or by

any other applicable legislation.

RECEIVER'S ACCOUNTS

17. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be paid
their reasonable fees and disbursements, in each case at their standard rates and charges, and that
the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be entitled to and are hereby granted a charge (the
"Receiver's Charge') on the Property, as security for such fees and disbursements, both before
and after the making of this Order in respect of these proceedings, and that the Receiver's Charge
shall form a first charge on the Property in priority to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges

and encumbrances, statutory or otherwise, in favour of any Person, but subject to sections

81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of the BIA.
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18. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and its legal counsel shall pass its accounts
from time to time, and for this purpose the accounts of the Receiver and its legal counsel are

hereby referred to a judge of the Commercial List of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice.

19.  THIS COURT ORDERS that prior to the passing of its accounts, the Receiver shall be
at liberty from time to time to apply reasonable amounts, out of the monies in its hands, against
its fees and disbursements, including legal fees and disbursements, incurred at the normal rates
and charges of the Receiver or its counsel, and such amounts shall constitute advances against its

remuneration and disbursements when and as approved by this Court.
FUNDING OF THE RECEIVERSHIP

20.  THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and it is hereby empowered to
borrow by way of a revolving credit or otherwise, such monies from time to time as it may
consider necessary or desirable, provided that the outstanding principal amount does not exceed
$500,000.00 (or such greater amount as this Court may by further Order authorize) at any time, at
such rate or rates of interest as it deems advisable for such period or periods of time as it may
arrange, for the purpose of funding the exercise of the powers and duties conferred upon the
Receiver by this Order, including interim expenditures. Subject to section 107 of the LTCHA,
the whole of the Property shall be and is hereby charged by way of a fixed and specific charge
(the "Receiver's Borrowings Charge') as security for the payment of the monies borrowed,
together with interest and charges thereon, in priority to all security interests, trusts, liens,
charges and encumbrances, statutory or otherwise, in favour of any Person, but subordinate in
priority to the Receiver’s Charge and the charges as set out in sections, 81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of
the BIA.

21.  THIS COURT ORDERS that neither the Receiver's Borrowings Charge nor any other
security granted by the Receiver in connection with its borrowings under this Order shall be

enforced without leave of this Court.
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22. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is at liberty and authorized to issue

certificates substantially in the form annexed as Schedule "A" hereto (the "Receiver’s

Certificates") for any amount borrowed by it pursuant to this Order.

23. THIS COURT ORDERS that the monies from time to time borrowed by the Receiver
pursuant to this Order or any further order of this Court and any and all Receiver’s Certificates
evidencing the same or any part thereof shall rank on a pari passu basis, unless otherwise agreed

to by the holders of any prior issued Receiver's Certificates.

GENERAL

24.  THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver may from time to time apply to this Court

for advice and directions in the discharge of its powers and duties hereunder.

25.  THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing in this Order shall prevent the Receiver from
acting as a trustee in bankruptcy of the Debtor.

26. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,
regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give
effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this
Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully
requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this
Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and

its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.

27.  THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and is hereby authorized and
empowered to apply to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body, wherever located,
for the recognition of this Order and for assistance in carrying out the terms of this Order, and
that the Receiver is authorized and empowered to act as a representative in respect of the within
proceedings for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized in a jurisdiction outside

Canada.

28. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Plaintiff shall have its costs of this motion, up to and

including entry and service of this Order, provided for by the terms of the Plaintiff’s security or,
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if not so provided by the Plaintiff's security, then on a substantial indemnity basis to be paid by
the Receiver from the Debtor's estate with such priority and at such time as this Court may

determine.

29-28A, THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding any other provision of this Order, the
Receiver and Manager shall comply with the SAA. the L TCHA and the regulations thereunder as
they apply to the managementoperation of the Home and theneither TC [HIN nor MOH shall net
be subject to paragraphs 9 and 10 of this Order in relation to any non-compliance with the SAA..
the LTCHA and the regulations thereunder by the Receiver and/or the Manager with respect to
the manasementoperation of the Home.

29. 36
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THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party may apply to this Court to vary or amend this
Order on not less than seven (7) days' notice to the Receiver and to any other party likely to be

affected by the order sought or upon such other notice, if any, as this Court may order.

ﬂ[,;/(m:) ¥
7

Natasha Brown
Registrar

8L RAURTRE N0

BEC 2 3 2011
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SCHEDULE "A"
RECEIVER CERTIFICATE

CERTIFICATE NO.

AMOUNT $

1. THIS IS TO CERTIFY that Deloitte & Touche Inc., the receiver and manager (the
"Receiver'") of the current and future assets, undertakings and properties of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Corporation of every nature and kind whatsoever, wherever situate (the
“Debtor”), including all proceeds thereof (collectively, the “Property”) appointed by Order of
the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the "Court'") dated the _ day of
_,20__ (the "Order') made in an action having Court file number __ -CL- , has
received as such Receiver from the holder of this certificate (the ""Lender') the principal sum of
$ , being part of the total principal sum of § which the Receiver is

authorized to borrow under and pursuant to the Order.

2, The principal sum evidenced by this certificate is payable on demand by the Lender with
interest thereon calculated and compounded [daily][monthly not in advance on the day
of each month] after the date hereof at a notional rate per annum equal to the rate of per

cent above the prime commercial lending rate of Bank of from time to time.

3. Such principal sum with interest thereon is, by the terms of the Order, together with the
principal sums and interest thereon of all other certificates issued by the Receiver pursuant to the
Order or to any further order of the Court, a charge upon the whole of the Property, in priority to
the security interests of any other person, but subject to the priority of the charges set out in the
Order and in the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, and the right of the Receiver to indemnify itself

out of such Property in respect of its remuneration and expenses.

4. All sums payable in respect of principal and interest under this certificate are payable at
the head office of the Lender.

5. Until all liability in respect of this certificate has been terminated, no certificates creating

charges ranking or purporting to rank in priority to this certificate shall be issued by the Receiver
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to any person other than the holder of this certificate without the prior written consent of the

holder of this certificate.

6. The charge securing this certificate shall operate so as to permit the Receiver to deal with
the Property as authorized by the Order and as authorized by any further or other order of the
Court.

7. The Receiver does not undertake, and it is not under any personal liability, to pay any sum

in respect of which it may issue certificates under the terms of the Order.

DATED the day of ,20

DELOITTE & TOUCHE INC. solely in its
capacity as Receiver of the Property, and not in
its personal capacity

Per:

Name: Daniel R. Weisz
Title: Senior Vice President
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INTRODUCTION

1.

Pursuant to an Order (the “Appointment Order”) of the Ontario Superior Court of
Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) dated September 27, 2011 (the “Appointment
Date”), Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”),
was appointed as receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of all of the current and future
assets, undertakings and properties of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
(“Rose”). A copy of the Amended and Restated Appointment Order is attached hereto as
Appendix “A”.

Rose’s principal asset is a 12-storey building (the “Building”) located at 15-17
Maplewood Avenue, Toronto, Ontario (the “Property’), which is comprised of a 60 bed
long-term care facility located on floors 4 through 6 (the “Nursing Home”) with a
municipal address of 17 Maplewood Ave., and 91 life-lease units (“Residential Units”,
and individually “Residential Unit”) located on floors 2, 3 and 7 through 12 (the

“Residential Component”) with a municipal address of 15 Maplewood Ave.

On June 6, 2017, the Receiver brought a motion to, amongst other things, seek the
Court’s approval to enter into an Exclusive Listing Agreement with John A. Jensen
Realty Inc. (“Jensen’) to market and sell the Nursing Home. In support of that motion,
the Receiver filed with the Court its Eighth Report to the Court dated May 12, 2017 (the
“Eighth Report”). Based on the Eighth Report and the submissions made by counsel for
the Applicant and the Receiver, the Court granted an order (the “June 6 Order”)
approving the relief sought.

On April 1, 2019, the Receiver brought a motion to, among other things, seek the Court’s
approval to appoint three officers of Deloitte to the first Board of Directors (the “First
Board”) of the condominium corporation (the “Condo Corporation™). In support of that
motion, the Receiver filed with the Court its Ninth Report to the Court dated February 25,
2019 (the “Ninth Report”). Based on the Ninth Report and the submissions made by
counsel for the Receiver and the Applicant, the Court granted an order (the “First Board
Order”) approving the relief sought.
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On December 19, 2019, the Receiver brought a motion to, amongst other things, request
the Court issue an order approving an Agreement of Purchase and Sale (the “LTC
Transaction”) dated May 10, 2019 as amended (the “APS”), as between the Receiver
and Rykka Care Centres LP (“Rykka” or the “Purchaser”) and, to the extent the
conditions of the APS are satisfied, vesting in the Purchaser all the right, title and interest
in the Assets (as defined in the APS) free and clear of all liens, security interests and
other encumbrances, save and except for the permitted encumbrances referred to in the
APS. In support of that motion, the Receiver filed with the Court its Tenth Report to the
Court dated December 10, 2019 (the “Tenth Report”). Based on the Tenth Report and
the submissions made by counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the Court granted

an Approval and Vesting Order (the “LTC AVO”) approving the relief sought.

On June 10, 2021, the Receiver brough a motion to, amongst other things: 1) update the
Court on the status of the Transaction and request the Court amend the AVO to substitute
Arirang Age-Friendly Community Centre (“Arirang”) as Purchaser as a result of an
assignment of the APS by Rykka to Arirang; ii) update the Court on the status of the
Receiver’s plan of condominium application in respect of the Residential Component (the
“Condominium Application”) and seek an order foregoing the requirement for certain
lender consents as typically required under the Condominium Act; ii1) update the Court on
the Receiver’s appeal (the “Appeal”) of the decision of the Ontario Labour Relations
Board (“OLRB”) concerning its decision dated April 12, 2018 regarding the application
by the United Food and Commercial Workers International Union, Local 175 (the
“Union”) to have the Receiver recognized as a successor employer (the “OLRB
Decision”); iv) seek the Court’s approval to amend the First Board Order with respect to
the amend the Receiver appointees to be appointed as directors and officers of the First
Board; v) seek the Court’s approval of the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the period September 27, 2011 to April 30, 2021; vi) seek the Court’s
approval to dismiss an action brought by Rose against the former CEO of Rose and one
of his companies; vii) seek the Court’s approval to increase the maximum amount that the
Receiver is authorized to borrow pursuant to paragraph 20 of the Appointment Order
from $6,500,000 to $7,000,000; and viii) seek the Court’s approval of the Receiver’s

actions and Activities. In support of that motion, the Receiver filed with the Court its
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Eleventh Report to the Court dated June 1, 2021 (the “Eleventh Report™), a copy of
which, without appendices, is attached hereto as Appendix “B”. Based on the Eleventh
Report and the submissions made by counsel for the Applicant and the Receiver, the
Court granted the relief sought. A copy of Order of Justice McEwen dated June 10, 2021
(“June 10 Order”) is attached hereto as Appendix “C”.

7. The purpose of this Twelfth Report to the Court (the “Twelfth Report”) is to:
a) update the Court on the status of the Condominium Application and seek the
Court’s approval of a mechanism for the issuance of an Approval and Vesting
Order in order to complete the sale of Residential Units as condominium units;
b) update the Court on the status of the Transaction and the licence transfer process;
c) update the Court on its dealings with the Union;
d) seek the Court’s approval of the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the period September 27, 2011 to April 15, 2022; and
e) seek the Court’s approval of this Twelfth Report and the actions and activities of
the Receiver from June 2, 2021 to the date of this Twelfth Report.
TERMS OF REFERENCE
8. In preparing this Twelfth Report, the Receiver has reviewed unaudited financial

information and other records related to Rose and the Nursing Home provided by
Assured Care Consulting Inc. (“ACC”), the manager of the nursing home, and
information provided by third-party sources, and has held discussions with individuals
involved in administering the Nursing Home (collectively, the “Information”). Except

as described in this report:

(a) the Receiver has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal
consistency and use in the context in which it was provided. However, the
Receiver has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or

completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially
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comply with Canadian Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the Chartered
Professional Accountants Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver
expresses no opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under CAS in

respect of the Information;

(b) some of the information referred to in this Twelfth Report consists of forecasts
and projections which were prepared based on estimates and assumptions. Such
estimates and assumptions are, by their nature, not ascertainable and as a
consequence, no assurance can be provided regarding the forecasted or projected
results. Accordingly, the reader is cautioned that the actual results will likely vary
from the forecasts or projections, even if the assumptions materialize, and the

variations could be significant; and

(c) the Receiver has prepared this Twelfth Report in its capacity as a Court-appointed
officer to support the Court’s approval of its course of action with respect to a sale
of the Property, and the other relief being sought. Parties using this report, other
than for the purposes outlined herein, are cautioned that it may not be appropriate

for their purposes.

Capitalized terms not defined in this report are as defined in the Appointment Order, or
the Receiver’s First through Eleventh Reports. All references to dollars are in Canadian

currency unless otherwise noted.

The Receiver has sought the advice of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP (“Gowlings”),
counsel to the Applicant, for general legal matters that have arisen in respect of the
receivership. Where the Receiver has required independent legal advice, the Receiver has

sought the counsel of Blaney McMurtry LLP (“Blaneys”).

STATUS OF THE CONVERSION TO CONDOMINIUMS

11.

Paragraphs 21 through 37 of the Eleventh Report set out the history and status of the
Condominium Application up to mid-2021. Briefly, the Condominium Application was
started by Rose in 2007 as it was a requirement under both the terms of the Construction

Loan from Peoples Trust Company (“Peoples”) and the CMHC Special Conditions
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Forming Part of the Certificate of Insurance that the Building be registered as a
condominium. The Receiver attempted to continue Rose’s initial Condominium
Application, however, the timeframe to complete that application had expired and the
City would not extend it, resulting in the Receiver having to commence a new
Condominium Application that was accepted through a Notice of Decision dated July 11,
2016 (the “2016 Notice of Decision”). A copy of the 2016 Notice of Decision is attached
hereto as Appendix “D”.

The Revised Notice and the Revised Conditions

12.

13.

14.

As reported in the Eleventh Report, on January 13, 2021, the City issued a Revised
Notice of Decision Under S. 51(45) of the Planning Act (the “Revised Notice”) which set
out the Revised Conditions (Attachment 1 of the Revised Notice) that the City required to
be completed in order for the condominium to be approved and registered. A copy of the

Revised Notice is attached hereto as Appendix “E”,

The Revised Conditions reflected five changes between the 2016 Notice of Decision and
the Revised Notice. First, under Revised Condition #1, the plans to be submitted for
approval were to be substantially in accordance with plans dated February 4, 2019 (the
“2019 Plans”) (the previous plans were dated January 4, 2016). The 2019 plans reflected
the GFA & Usage Variance (as discussed in paragraph 34 of the Eleventh Report) and the

Parking Variance (as defined and discussed below).

The second change in the Revised Notice was the removal of Condition 4 which formerly
required that “Visitor parking spaces will be clearly defined on the condominium plan to
be registered and the Declaration shall contain a clause clearly specifying visitors parking
shall form part of the common elements and neither be used by or sold to unit owners or
be considered part of the exclusive use portions of the common elements.” However,
since the occupancy permit for the Building was issued in 2010 and the Nursing Home
was opened in 2011, none of the underground parking spaces had been used for visitor
parking as access to the underground parking garage has been secured through the use of
key fobs which open the electronic door, making visitor parking impractical in the

circumstances. As a result, the Receiver applied for a minor variance to the site specific
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by-law to remove the requirement for visitor parking and to amend the allocation of the
30 underground parking spots in the building from 15 Nursing Home/15 Residential
Component to 4 Nursing Home/26 Residential Component (the “Parking Variance”).
This allocation reflected the ongoing usage of the Nursing Home while also provided
more parking spots for the users of the Residential Component. The Parking Variance

was granted on December 19, 2018.

Revised Condition 8 reflected the third change, wherein the City changed the condition to
read “free-hold component” from “retail component” in order to properly reflect the
Nursing Home as the party sharing water services with the condominium. As set out in
the APS, the intent is that on the closing of the LTC Transaction, the Receiver will

convey a free-hold interest in the Nursing Home portion of the Property to Arirang.

The fourth change further extended the time frame for registering the condominium to 5

years from the date of the Revised Notice.

The fifth change was a new condition that required the Receiver to contact each life lease
purchaser that had entered into a Court approved Settlement Agreement for the purchase
of their unit and to provide them with a direction to advise any sub-tenants in their unit of
the pending condominium registration and the potential for requiring vacant possession.

The Receiver sent the required notice to the life lease purchasers on May 5, 2011.

As part of the Receiver’s Condominium Application submissions, the Receiver’s survey
consultant advised that the structural drawings that we intended to submit included
copyright language from NCK Engineering Ltd. (“NCK?”), the original engineering firm
that prepared the drawings, and that the land registry office would not accept those
drawings. As a result, the Receiver’s engineering consultant, Norman Lee & Associates
(“Lee”) contacted NCK who provided structural drawings without the copyright notice
on October 25, 2021.

The Receiver’s consultants completed the final condominium drawings and those, along
with the other documentation requested by the City to clear all of the Revised Conditions

in the Revised Notice, were submitted to the City on November 5, 2021.
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The delays encountered by the Receiver

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

The Receiver had understood that the typical timeframe for the City to review the
documentation in respect of satisfying conditions for a condominium application was

three weeks.

On November 18, 2021, the City contacted Gowlings requesting they submit a
Development Approval Resubmission form in order for the City to finish the processing
of the Condominium Application. That resubmission form was completed and submitted

on that same day.

Having heard no response from the City, on December 16, 2021 Gowlings wrote to the
City asking for an update on the Condominium Application. The City responded on that
day that Community Planning was waiting for comments from the Engineering &
Constructions Services Division (“ECS”), who they advised are responsible for final

sign-off of conditions 7 through 10 of the Revised Conditions.

Gowlings followed up with Community Planning again on January 4, 11, 21, 28, and 31,
2022. Finally, on January 31, Community Planning advised that ECS was looking for
documentation in support of the Advisory Notes section of the Revised Notice, which

were included as Attachment 2.

On February 3, 2022, Gowlings and Community Planning had a telephone discussion
during which Community Planning agreed that the Advisory Notes section is separate
from the Revised Conditions section and do not constitute conditions that ECS should be
having in regards to their final sign-off on conditions 7 through 10 of the Revised
Conditions. Further, Community Planning agreed that on the strength of the closed status
of the building permits and receipt of conformance certificates by the City’s building
division, ECS ’s scope of final review should be reduced only to a sign-off on Revised
Conditions 7 through 10. Community Planning indicated that they would relate this
position to ECS.

The Receiver notes that it and Gowlings had previously attempted to address the

Advisory Notes in 2018; however, neither could locate the Amending (Minor Variations)
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Site Plan Agreement File No. 10/5/285 dated December 10, 2003 (the “Amending SPA”)
(the Receiver notes that the Revised Notice incorrectly listed the date of the amendment
as December 10, 2013), nor any drawings or consultant reports concerning site servicing,
grading and stormwater manager. As a result, in 2018 Lee reached out to the Toronto
Building Division of the City of Toronto to obtain those materials. The response from
the City dated August 21, 2018 was that they could not locate the required permits in
their files. A copy of the email from City is attached hereto as Appendix “F”.

Having not heard back, Gowlings followed up on with Community Planning on February

14, 15, 22, and March 3, 2022 with no response.

On March 23, 2022, Gowlings reached out to the City Councillor’s office for Ward 12 to
see if they could be of assistance in getting the City to respond to our Condo Application.
On March 30, 2022, the City Councillor’s office advised that they had spoken with the

Manager of Community Planning about the matter.

On March 31, 2022, the Receiver reached out directly to Community Planning for an
update and advised that all of the Rose of Sharon stakeholders, including the life lease

purchasers, Arirang and Peoples were eager for this to move forward expeditiously.

Community Planning responded on that same day advising that they had again reached
out to ECS who advised that they are continuing to work to clear the conditions in the

Revised Notice.

The Receiver again reached out to Community Planning on April 7, 2022 who advised

that they are in correspondence with ECS but have not received their clearance.

ECS clears conditions but not Advisory Notes

31.

Finally, on April 8, 2022, Community Planning provided a memorandum from ECS (the
“ECS 2022 Memorandum”) in which they advised Community Planning that Revised
Conditions 7 through 10 had been satisfied. However, ECS noted that the specific
conditions in the Site Plan Agreement as set out in the Advisory Notes remained

outstanding. ECS further suggested that it may be advisable to seek the input of Legal
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Services, the City’s legal counsel, with respect to the outstanding Site Plan Agreement
matters. A copy of the ECS 2022 Memorandum is attached hereto as Appendix “G”.
The Receiver notes that the date of the ECS 2022 Memorandum was dated in error as

April 8,2021. Further, the date of Amending SPA should have read December 10, 2003.

Along with the ECS 2022 Memorandum, ECS provided three forms of certificates (the
“Proposed Site Certificates”) which Community Planning advised, if signed by the
Receiver’s Consulting Engineer, would to their satisfaction address Condition 4 of the
Site Plan Agreement. Condition 4 relates to “Site Grading and Drainage” and requires
the owner to “grade the Site and to provide facilities for the proper and controlled
disposal of storm, surface and waste water from the Site and from any building or
structure thereon in accordance with the plans to be approved by and to the satisfaction of

the Director of Buildings and the Commissioner of Operations Services for the City.”

The Receiver notes that neither the Receiver nor the City are in possession of the
approved plans for storm, surface and waste water for the site. As such, when the
Receiver queried Lee if he was able to execute the Proposed Site Certificates, he advised
that he could not since he did not have the approved plans/drawings and he (nor anyone
for that matter) was in a position to inspect work that is buried beneath the Property. The
Receiver further notes that the Occupancy Permit was issued on November 4, 2010, and
since that time, the Receiver is not aware of any issues relating to the storm, surface and
waste water at the Property. One would also expect that the City would not issue an
Occupancy Permit if it had not already certified that the storm, surface and waste water
management for the site had been constructed to the City’s satisfaction. Further, the
Building Permit was closed by the City in July 2018 indicating that the various City
departments would have been satisfied that the building was constructed according to the

approved plans and complied with the Ontario Building Code.

On April 12, 2022, Gowlings wrote to the City advising that it was unable to execute the
Proposed Site Certificates due to the lack of plans, drawings and reports related thereto.

Gowlings reiterated that the Advisory Notes are “advisory” only and not conditions, and
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that there is a process outside of Section 51 of the Planning Act to deal with the matters,

but that they should not hold up the approval of the Condominium Application.

On April 13, 2022, Community Planning responded that they had met with ECS,
Transportation Services and Legal Services and advised that release of the condominium
for registration should not take place until the outstanding site plan matters had been
addressed. Community Planning suggested that the Receiver contact the original
consultants who produced the stormwater report, the site servicing and grading plans and
the other drawings approved by the City to collect the necessary documents and complete
the Proposed Site Certificates. = Community Planning claimed that they needed
confirmation that the Site Plan Agreement had been executed as agreed to and they did
not have another mechanism to do so. A copy of the email string containing Gowlings
April 12 email to Community Planning and Community Planning’s response thereto

dated April 13, 2022 is attached hereto as Appendix “H”.

On May 4, 2022, Gowlings wrote to the City of Toronto Legal Services (“Gowlings’
May 4 Letter”) contending, among other things, that the Advisory Notes have no status
under the Planning Act and do not bind the applicant, that the age of documents referred
to make it impossible to deal with the notes, even more so since the neither the City nor
the Receiver have a copy of the Amending SPA, and that twice previously the City has
advised that there were no outstanding Site Plan Agreement conditions that were required
to be satisfied prior to the release of the plan of condominium for registration. Attached

hereto as Appendix “I” is a copy of Gowlings’ May 4 Letter.

In response to Gowlings’ May 4 Letter, on May 6, 2022 Community Planning advised
Gowlings by email that they were releasing the condo plans for registration. The plans
were registered with the Land Registry Office on May 18, 2022 (the “Declaration Date”)
as Toronto Standard Condominium Corporation No. 2911 (“TSCC 2911” or the “Condo

Corporation”). A copy of the registered Declaration is attached hereto as Appendix “J”.
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Conveyance of the Condominium Units

38.

39.

40.

As set out in the previous reports to the Court, Peoples and 35 purchasers under Right to
Occupy Agreements (“RTOAs”, also known as “life leases”) representing 44 units in the
Residential Component (the “Settling Unitholders™) entered into settlement agreements
(“Settlements™) (eight Settling Unitholders purchased more than one Residential Unit)
that set out the terms under which those Settling Unitholders could ultimately purchase
their Residential Unit as a condominium. The Court issued orders on September 10, 2013
(the “ALUs Settlement Approval Order”) and December 13, 2013 (the “December 13
Order”) approving the Settlements, copies of which are attached hereto as Appendix

“K” and “L”, respectively. The Settlements were conditional on the following:
a) the conversion of the Residential Component to condominiums;

b) the payment of certain amounts (the “Unit Purchase Price”) by the Settling
Unitholders as set out Settlements within 60 days of the Receiver delivering a

notice (the “Purchase Notice”) to the Settling Unitholder;

The Settlements provide that upon payment of the Unit Purchase Price, each of the
Settling Unitholders shall purchase their units on an “as-is, where-is” basis and the
Receiver and Peoples shall have no liability in respect of the units and shall be released
and discharged from all claims arising from or related to the unit the RTOAs or any
dealings with the Receiver, Rose of Sharon or the Property. Given the registrations
against the Property, the Receiver is of a view that the most effective and efficient way to

convey title is via a vesting order.

The Receiver is proposing that the Court make a single “blanket™ approval and vesting
order (the “Condo AVQ”) authorizing the Receiver to sell the condominium units to
either: (a) the Settling Unitholders who wish to purchase their Residential Unit in
accordance with the Settlement; or (b) purchasers who submit offers through the listing
of the condominium units with a broker retained by the Receiver (“New Purchasers”).
The Condo AVO provides for certificates (“Vesting Certificates”) to be delivered to

each purchaser on closing that will identify: (a) the purchaser; and (b) the specific unit or



41.

42.

43.
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units being purchased by that purchaser, and any related property (such as appliances), as
well as any parking units and locker units. The Vesting Certificates will have the legal
effect of conveying title to the purchaser “free and clear” in accordance with the terms of
the approval and vesting order and will be registered on title in the same manner as a
certificate delivered under a “standard” approval and vesting order. The Receiver is of
the view that this process will provide a cost-efficient and timely method for transfer of

title to the Residential Units.

The Declaration requires that the Service Units (as defined in Appendix “J”, and which
includes those areas in the Building that are jointly used by the Residential Component
and the Nursing Home, such as the garbage collection room, the mechanical room, the
plumbing room, etc.) be conveyed by the Declarant to the Condo Corporation and
Arirang, as tenants-in-common, each as to an undivided 50% interest, within 120 days
after the Declaration Date or as soon as possible thereafter. The Receiver is proposing
that the Condo AVO also provide for the transfer of the Service Units, which will be

completed through the filing of Vesting Certificates at the appropriate time.

The Receiver has, with the assistance of Gowlings, developed a “template” agreement of
purchase and sale that will be used in connection with the sale of condominium units. A
copy of that template agreement is attached as Appendix “M” (the “Template Sale
Agreement”). The Receiver, subject to agreement with a purchaser, may amend the

Template Sale Agreement should the particular circumstances of a transaction warrant it.

To assist Settling Unitholders, the Receiver is contemplating identifying lawyers who
speak Korean and who are familiar with the process of completing a real estate
transaction based on a vesting order. Any such lawyer(s) would be identified to
purchasers by the Receiver, but would be retained directly by the purchasers at their
discretion. Purchasers would be responsible for paying their own professional fees and

disbursement associated with the transfer of any condominium unit(s) that they purchase.

STATUS OF THE LTC TRANSACTION

44,

Upon issuance of the June 10 Order which substituted Arirang as the Purchaser under the

LTC AVO, by letter dated June 17, 2021, the Receiver advised the Ministry of Long-
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Term Care (the “Ministry”) of the substitution and requested that it commence its licence

transfer process with respect to Arirang.

The Receiver has been in periodic contact with the Ministry who advises that they are
still conducting their review of Arirang’s licence transfer application. Further, the
Ministry advises that it still needs to conduct a public consultation as provided for under
the Fixing Long Term Care Act, 2021, which meeting has not yet been scheduled as the
Ministry paused its review during the recent provincial election. As a result, the Receiver
anticipates that it will be a further six to nine months to complete the LTC Transaction

with Arirang.

STATUS OF APPEAL OF THE UNION

46.

47.

48.

49.

As set out in the Eleventh Report, on March 31, 2021, the Division Court released its
Reasons for Decision in which it dismissed the Receiver’s appeal of the OLRB Decision
released April 18, 2018 which declared that the Receiver was a successor employer of the

Union and found:

a) the language of s. 14.06(1.2) of the BIA was not “explicit statutory language” that

isolated the Receiver from being declared a successor employer; and

b) liability as a successor employer is not a “liability...that is in respect of employees

of the debtor”.

On June 17, 2021, CaleyWray, counsel for the Union, wrote to Gowlings asking who was
acting on behalf of the purchaser of the Nursing Home, which inquiry was responded to

forthwith by Gowlings.

By letter dated February 2, 2022, CaleyWray wrote to Gowlings requesting an update on
the status of the sale of Nursing Home, which inquiry was also responded to by

Gowlings.

The Receiver notes that since the Reasons for Decision were released, the Union has not

approached the Receiver with a request to bargain to negotiate a collective agreement.
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INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

50.

51.

52.

Attached hereto as Appendix “N” is the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and
Disbursements for the interim period May 1, 2021 to April 30, 2022 and for the entire
period of the receivership, September 27, 2011 to April 30, 2022 (the “R&D”). The
R&D indicates that as of April 30, 2022, the balance in the Receiver’s bank accounts in
respect of the Life-Lease Residence, including the account maintained by Sterling
Karamar Property Management (the firm engaged by the Receiver to manage the Life-
Lease Residence), is $218,200. The R&D excludes the bank account maintained by the
Nursing Home manager for the Nursing Home which is discussed in the following

paragraph.

The R&D includes receipts and disbursements from the Life-Lease Residence and
receipts from the Ministry on account of monthly funding of the Nursing Home. In
accordance with the Appointment Order, this funding is transferred to the bank account
established for Nursing Home operations. As of April 30, 2022, the balance in the bank
account maintained by ACC was $1,444,312. Any excess funds not required for
operation of the Nursing Home are from time-to-time transferred back to the Receiver’s
bank account. Since the Appointment Date up to April 30, 2022, $2,282,400 in excess

funds have been transferred back to the Receiver’s bank account.

The Receiver is seeking the Court’s approval of the R&D.

RECEIVER’S BORROWINGS

53.

Since the commencement of the receivership, the Receiver has borrowed $6,500,000
from Peoples by way of Receiver’s Certificates in order to fund the receivership,
substantially as a result of the cost to remediate certain Building deficiencies (as
discussed in the Second, Third and Seventh Reports) and to fund professional fees and
disbursements in connection with the Priority Issue (the issue of priority between Peoples
and the Life-Lease Purchasers as discussed in the Third through Sixth Reports), the
Statement of Claim and the Construction Lien Action (as discussed in the Second, Third,

Fifth, Seventh, Eighth Reports), the OLRB Decision and the Condominium Application.
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In addition, the Residential Component continues to operate at a recurring cash deficit of

between $15,000 to $30,000 per month.

54.  Pursuant to the June 10 Order, the Court increased the Receiver’s borrowing limit to
$7,000,000 to provide the Receiver with sufficient financing, if needed, to continue to
manage the receivership. The Receiver has not required to borrow further funds from
Peoples as a result of the Nursing Home generating excess cash which, as per above, the
Receiver has transferred back to the Receiver’s bank account when funds are required.

As aresult, the Receiver’s current borrowings remain at $6,500,000.

RECEIVER’S REQUEST TO THE COURT

55. The Receiver respectively requests the Court make an Order:

a) approving this Twelfth Report and the Receiver’s the actions and activities as

described herein;

b) vesting title in the Residential Units to Settling Unitholders and New Purchasers, and
transfer of title of the Service Units to the co-tenants, subject to the registration by the

Receiver of Vesting Certificates; and

c) approving the R&D.

All of which is respectfully submitted to this Honourable Court.
DATED this 14" day of July, 2022.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC.
Receiver and Manager of the current and future
assets, undertakings and properties of

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
and not in its personal capacity

Hartley Bricks, MBA, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT
Senior Vice-President

Per:
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Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST
THE HONOURABLE ) WEDNESDAY, THE
)
JUSTICE GILMORE ) 27TH DAY OF JULY, 2022
BETWEEN:
PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
- and —

ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985 ¢ B-3,
as amended, and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, as amended

APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER
(CONDOMINIUM AND SERVICE UNITS)

THIS MOTION, made by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court-
appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (the “Debtor”) for an order approving: (a) the sale by the
Receiver of condominium units located at 15 Maplewood Avenue, Toronto (the “Residential
Units”) and related parking units, locker units and other related property (together with Residential
Units, the “Condo Units”) pursuant to agreements of purchase and sale (the “Sale Agreement”)
substantially in the form attached as Appendix “M” to the Twelfth Report of the Receiver dated
14 July 2022 (the “Twelfth Report”); (b) the transfer of the Service Units as defined in the
Declaration attached as Appendix “J” to the Twelfth Report the “Declaration”); and (c) vesting
in the purchaser identified in the applicable Sale Agreement the Condo Unit subject to that Sale

1
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Agreement or the Service Units in the transferees as required by the Declaration, was heard this

day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Twelfth Report and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the

Receiver, no one appearing for any other person on the service list:

1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Receiver is authorized to enter into
and complete the sale of the Condo Units pursuant to the Sale Agreement with such amendments

to the Sale Agreement as the Receiver may deem necessary or advisable.

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Receiver is authorized to transfer

the Service Units as required by the Declaration.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized and directed to: (a)
complete the Schedules to the Certificate in the form attached as Schedule A (the “Vesting
Certificate”); and (b) take such additional steps and execute such additional documents as may be
necessary or desirable for the completion of: (i) the sale of the Condo Units and the conveyance
of the Condo Units to the purchasers of those Condo Units; and (ii) the transfer of the Service

Units as required by the Declaration.

4. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that upon the registration of the Vesting
Certificate, all of the title and interest in and to the Condo Unit or Service Unit identified on
Schedule A to the Vesting Certificate shall vest absolutely in the purchaser or transferee identified
on Schedule A to the Vesting Certificate (the “Purchaser” or the “Transferee”) as owner of the
Condo Unit or Service Unit, free and clear of and from any and all security interests (whether
contractual, statutory, or otherwise), hypothecs, mortgages, trusts or deemed trusts (whether
contractual, statutory, or otherwise), liens, executions, levies, charges, or other financial or
monetary claims, whether or not they have attached or been perfected, registered or filed and
whether secured, unsecured or otherwise (collectively, the “Claims”) including, without limiting
the generality of the foregoing: (a) any encumbrances or charges created by the Order dated 27
September 2011; (b) all charges, security interests or claims evidenced by registrations pursuant
to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) or any other personal property registry system;
and (c) those Claims listed on Schedule B to the Vesting Certificate (all of which are collectively

referred to as the “Encumbrances”, which term shall not include the permitted encumbrances,
2
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easements and restrictive covenants listed on Schedule C to the Vesting Certificate) and, for
greater certainty, this Court orders that all of the Encumbrances affecting or relating to the Condo
Unit or Service Unit identified on Schedule B to the Vesting Certificate are hereby expunged and
discharged as against the Condo Unit or Service Unit identified on Schedule A to the Vesting
Certificate.

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon the registration in the Land Registry Office for Land
Titles Division of Metropolitan Toronto (64 and 66) (CRO#80) of an Application for Vesting
Order in the form prescribed by the Land Titles Act (Ontario) and/or the Land Registrations
Reform Act (Ontario), the Land Registrar is hereby directed to enter the Purchaser or Transferee
identified on Schedule A to the Vesting Certificate as the owner of the Condo Unit or Service Unit
identified on Schedule A to the Vesting Certificate in fee simple, and is hereby directed to delete
and expunge from title to the Condo Unit or Service Unit identified on Schedule A to the Vesting
Certificate all of the Claims listed in Schedule B to the Vesting Certificate.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that for the purposes of determining the nature and priority of
Claims, the net proceeds from the sale of the Condo Units shall stand in the place and stead of the
Condo Units, and that from and after the delivery of the Vesting Certificate all Claims and
Encumbrances shall attach to the net proceeds from the sale of the Condo Units with the same
priority as they had with respect to the Condo Units immediately prior to the sale, as if the Condo
Units had not been sold and remained in the possession or control of the person having that

possession or control immediately prior to the sale.

7. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS the Receiver to file with the Court a copy of
the relevant Vesting Certificates, forthwith after the completion of the sale of a Condo Unit or the

transfer of a Service Unit in accordance with this Order.
8. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding:

(a) the pendency of these proceedings;
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(b) any applications for a bankruptcy order now or hereafter issued pursuant to the
Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) in respect of the Debtor and any

bankruptcy order issued pursuant to any such applications; and
() any assignment in bankruptcy made in respect of the Debtor;

the vesting of a Condo Unit or Service Unit pursuant to this Order shall be binding on any trustee
in bankruptcy that may be appointed in respect of the Debtor and shall not be void or voidable by
creditors of the Debtor, nor shall it constitute nor be deemed to be a fraudulent preference,
assignment, fraudulent conveyance, transfer at undervalue, or other reviewable transaction under
the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) or any other applicable federal or provincial
legislation, nor shall it constitute oppressive or unfairly prejudicial conduct pursuant to any

applicable federal or provincial legislation.

0. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,
regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada to give effect to this Order and to
assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals,
regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully requested to make such orders and to
provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable

to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this

Order.
K /j’?“* V.
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Schedule A — Form of Vesting Certificate
Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

BETWEEN:

PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
- and —
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985 ¢ B-3,
as amended, and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, as amended

VESTING CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice dated 27 September 2011,

the Receiver was appointed as the receiver of the undertaking, property and assets of the the

Debtor.

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated 27 July 2022 (the “Sale Order”), the Court
approved: (a) the sale by the Receiver of Condo Units pursuant to Sale Agreements and the transfer
of Service Units pursuant to the Declaration; and (b) the vesting of Condo Units in those Purchasers
identified in Sale Agreements entered into by the Receiver and the vesting of Service Units in the
Transferees identified in the Declaration. Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial

capitals have the meanings set out in the Sale Order.
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THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

1. The person identified on the attached Schedule A as the Purchaser of the Condo Unit
identified on Schedule A has paid and the Receiver has received the purchase price for the Condo
Unit in accordance with the applicable Sale Agreement between the Receiver and the Purchaser.
OR The person identified on the attached Schedule A as the Transferee of the Service Units
identified on Schedule A is the Transferee of that Service Unit as required by the Declaration.

[Delete Onel

2. On the date identified below, all of the title and interest in and to the Condo Unit OR
Service Unit [Delete One] identified on Schedule A vested absolutely in the Purchaser OR
Transferee [Delete Onef identified on Schedule A as registered owner of the Condo Unit OR
Service Unit [Delete One/ identified on Schedule A free and clear of and from any and all Claims
including, without limiting the generality of the foregoing: (a) any encumbrances or charges
created by the Order dated 27 September 2011; (b) all charges, security interests or claims
evidenced by registrations pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) or any other
personal property registry system; and (c) those Claims listed on Schedule B (all of which are
collectively referred to as the “Encumbrances”, which term shall not include the permitted
encumbrances, easements and restrictive covenants listed on Schedule C), and all of the
Encumbrances affecting or relating to the Condo Unit OR Service Unit /Delete One] identified on
Schedule A are hereby expunged and discharged as against that Condo Unit OR Service Unit
[Delete One].

DATED at on this day of 202

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC.,, in its
capacity as Receiver of the undertaking,
property and assets of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community, and not in
its personal capacity

Per:

Name:
Title:
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PURCHASER OR TRANSFEREE /[DELETE ONE]

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF CONDO UNIT OR SERVICE UNIT /DELETE ONE]
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Schedule B

Claims to be Deleted and Expunged from Title

73



Schedule C
Permitted Encumbrances, Easements and Restrictive Covenants

(Unaffected by the Vesting Order)
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Schedule D

Approval and Vesting Order
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PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY -and- ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT

COMMUNITY
Applicant Respondent
Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL
ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT
TORONTO

APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER
(CONDOMINIUM AND SERVICE UNITS)

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP
Barristers & Solicitors

1 First Canadian Place

100 King Street West, Suite 1600
Toronto ON M5X 1G5

E. Patrick Shea (#39665K)
Tel: (416) 369-7399
Fax: (416) 862-7661

Lawyers for the Receiver
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Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST
THE HONOURABLE ) WEDNESDAY, THE
)
JUSTICE GILMORE ) 27TH DAY OF JULY, 2022
BETWEEN:
PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Applicant
- and —

ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Respondent

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985 ¢ B-3,
as amended, and section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, as amended

ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court-
appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (the “Debtor”) for an order approving: (a) the Twelfth Report
of the Receiver dated 14 July 2022 (the “Twelfth Report”); and (b) the Receiver’s Interim
Statement of Receipts and Disbursement for the period September 27, 2011 to April 30, 2022
attached as Schedule “N” to the Twelfth Report (the “Interim R&D”’), was heard this day at 330

University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Twelfth Report and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the

Receiver, no one appearing for any other person on the service list:
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1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Twelfth Report and the Interim

(/j?m\"\//ﬁ\

R&D be and are hereby approved.
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PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY -and- ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT
COMMUNITY

Applicant Respondent

Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT
TORONTO

ORDER

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP
Barristers & Solicitors

1 First Canadian Place

100 King Street West, Suite 1600
Toronto ON M5X 1G5

E. Patrick Shea (#39665K)
Tel: (416) 369-7399
Fax: (416) 862-7661

Lawyers for the Receiver
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FIRST AMENDING AGREEMENT

THIS FIRST AMENDING AGREEMENT is made as of this 29" day of December, 2022 (this
“Agreement”),

BETWEEN:
DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., solely in its capacity as
court-appointed receiver and manager of ROSE OF SHARON
(ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY and not in its personal
or corporate capacity

(the “Vendor™)
- and -

ARIRANG AGE-FRIENDLY COMMUNITY CENTRE, a non-
share, not-for-profit corporation existing under the laws of Canada

(the “Purchaser”)

WHEREAS the Vendor and the Purchaser entered into an agreement of purchase and sale dated
the 13" day of May, 2019, as amended and restated on the 1% day of April, 2021 (collectively, the
“Purchase Agreement”), whereby the execution of the Purchase Agreement has been authorized
and approved, with such amendments as the Vendor may deem necessary, by an amended and
restated approval and vesting order dated the 10" of June, 2021;

AND WHEREAS the Vendor and the Purchaser have agreed to amend the Purchase Agreement,
as more particularly set out in this Agreement;

IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants and agreements herein set out, the sum of Two
Dollars ($2.00) now paid by each of the parties hereto to the other and other good and valuable
consideration (the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged by each party hereto),
the parties hereto covenant and agree as follows:

1. Recitals. The recitals to this Agreement are true in substance and in fact.

2. Capitalized Terms. Unless otherwise defined herein, all capitalized terms contained in
this Agreement shall have the same meanings as ascribed thereto in the Purchase
Agreement.

3. Amendments. The Purchase Agreement is hereby amended as follows:

(a) Section 1.1 (Closing Date) of the Purchase Agreement is hereby deleted in its
entirety and replaced with the following:



(b)

(©)
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“Closing Date” means the date which is fifteen (15) days immediately following
the later of written confirmation from the Vendor to the Purchaser that: (a) the
Approval and Vesting Order has been amended as required, and (b) the MLTC has
approved the purchase by the Purchaser contemplated under this Agreement and
the MLTC has issued or approved the Purchaser for transfer of the Licence(s) or
for issue of licences similar to the Licence(s) to the Purchaser; or such earlier date
as agreed by the parties, but in no event will the Closing Date be later than March
31,2023

Section 4.3(c) (Mutual Conditions) of the Purchase Agreement is hereby deleted in
its entirety and replaced with the following:

“(c)  the MLTC shall have approved the purchase by the Purchaser contemplated
under this Agreement and the MLTC shall have approved the Purchaser for
transfer of the Licence(s) or for issue of the Replacement Licence (the
“MLTC Approval”),”

The following paragraph shall be added at the end of Section 4.4 (Transfer of
Licenses) of the Purchase Agreement:

“The Vendor and Purchaser further agree to use commercially reasonable efforts to
obtain MLTC Approval on or before February 28, 2023.”

Miscellaneous.

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

Except as amended herein, all other terms and conditions of the Purchase
Agreement shall remain the same and in full force and effect and the Purchase
Agreement is hereby ratified and confirmed by the parties hereto to the effect and
with the intent that the Purchase Agreement and this Agreement shall be read and
construed as one document.

Time is of the essence hereof and shall remain of the essence of the Purchase
Agreement, and no variation of this Agreement shall operate as a waiver of this
provision.

This Agreement shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their respective
successors and assigns and shall enure to the benefit of the parties hereto and their
respective successors and permitted assigns.

The parties agree that this Agreement may be executed in counterpart and
transmitted by pdf or email and that the reproduction of signatures in counterpart
by way of pdf or email will be treated as though such reproduction were executed
originals.

[Signature Page Follows]
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties hereto have executed this Agreement as of the date set out
above.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC.,, solely
in its capacity as court-appointed receiver and
manager of ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO)
RETIREMENT COMMUNITY and not in its
personal capacity

Name: ” Hartiéy Bricks
Title: Senior Vice President

I have authority to bind the above.

ARIRANG AGE-FRIENDLY COMMUNITY

CENTRE

Per:
Name:
Title:

I have authority to bind the above.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF the parties hereto have executed this Agreement as of the date set out
above.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., solely
in its capacity as court-appointed receiver and
manager of ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO)
RETIREMENT COMMUNITY and not in its
personal capacity

Per:

Name:
Title:

I have authority to bind the above.

ARIRANG AGE-FRIENDLY COMMUNITY
CENTRE

|
Per: /)‘:—;:;2/‘

Name: /,'é,jét HAHA
Title:

I have authority to bind the above.
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IN THE MATTER OF THE RECEIVERSHIP OF
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements

for the period September 27, 2011 to December 31, 2022

Receipts

Ministry of Health funding

Receipts from preferred accommodation re: nursing home residents

Receipts from life lease residence
Proceeds from sale of condominium units
Receiver borrowings

Nursing Home - Return of excess funding
Cash in bank

HST refund

Proceeds from litigation settlements
Property tax refund

Misc. other receipts

Total receipts

Disbursements

Funding of Nursing Home

Life lease residence disbursements
Receiver fees

Legal fees

HST/PST paid

Condominium Fees

Insurance

Consulting fees/Commissions

Buyout of kitchen equipment lease
Property taxes

Building Condition Assessment
Appraisal fees

City of Toronto Development Charges
Ministry of Health & Long-Term Care fees
Other Miscellaneious disburements
Bank Charges

Total disbursements

Excess of receipts over disbursements

88

Sept 17/11 to May 1/22to  Sept 17/11 to
Apr 30/22 Dec 31/22 Dec 31/22
$ 33,424,209 $ 3,306,084 § 36,730,293
14,792,575 2,570,134 17,362,709
11,019,249 (1,004,534) 10,014,715
- 14,331,046 14,331,046
6,500,000 - 6,500,000
2,282,400 450,000 2,732,400
404,887 - 404,887
432,457 197,817 630,274
660,000 - 660,000
139,700 - 139,700
400,647 27,798 428,445

$ 70,056,124

$ 19,878,346

$ 89,934,469

$ 47,765,095
15,828,474
2,589,327
2,489,392
748,758

54,612
162,232
60,913
14,419
41,270
51,282
14,628
3,750
2,150
11,622

$ 4,352,755
471,772
366,816
521,549
121,523
927,031

75,031

7,822

$ 52,117,850
16,300,246
2,956,143
3,010,941
870,280
927,031
54,612
237,264
60,913
14,419
41,270
62,207
14,628
3,750
2,150
19,445

$ 69,837,924

$ 6,855,224

$ 76,693,148

$ 218,200

$ 13,023,121

$ 13,241,321
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Peoples Group

January 09, 2023

Rose Of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement
Suite 500-920 Yonge Street
Toronto, ON M4W 3C7

RE: Rose Of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement
15-17 Maplewood Avenue Toronto, ON

STATEMENT FOR DISCHARGE PURPOSES - Mortgage No. 41600
(Effective January 09, 2023 - interest currently paid to July 29, 2011)

Principal Balance as at July 29 2011 $14,884,569.80
Interest Rate P+1.25 from July 29 2011 to January 09 2023 $7,451,337.94
Tax Account (A Minus Balance is a Credit) $1,938,885.40
Late Payment Interest $1,773,141.31
Discharge Penalty $ 0.00
Statement Fee $ 0.00
Discharge Fee $ 0.00
Sundry Account (A Minus Balanceis a Credit) $12,227,670.81
Total Amount $38,275,605.26
Per Diem from January 09, 2023 $3,140.03

The loan balance outstanding as at January 09, 2023 will be $38,275,605.26.

THE AMOUNTS IN THIS STATEMENT ARE CALCULATED ON THE BASIS THAT ALL PAYMENTS UP
TO AND INCLUDING THE ACTUAL PAYOUT ARE MADE AND HONOURED. If any such payments are
not made or honoured, then the amounts in this statement will no longer be valid and will be replaced
without notice by amounts reflecting such non-payment. WE WILL NOT BE OBLIGED TO PROVIDE A
DISCHARGE OF OUR MORTGAGE, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY TERMS OR CONDITIONS
ACCOMPANYING PAYOUT, UNLESS AND UNTIL ANY SUCH PAYMENTS ARE MADE OR
HONOURED, so the obligation to ensure that all such payments are made and honoured is on the party
relying on this statement and making payment to us in accordance with it.

All taxes and other charges paid by us from the time of preparation to the closing date and not indicated
on this statement are the responsibility of the Mortgagor.

Funds received after 12:00 P.M. of the proposed discharge date will be subject to an additional daily
interest charge of $3,140.03 until paid. If the proposed discharge date is on Friday, funds received after
12:00 P.M. will be subject to additional interest until the next business day. If this is a floating rate
mortgage, the daily interest charge is subject to change in the Prime Lending Rate of the Bank of
Montreal.

Payment must be in the form of a wire or direct deposit as per our wire instructions. Please include the
appropriate form of Discharge Documentation (including PPSA Security if applicable) for execution by
Peoples Trust Company.

This statement may not be used past the end of the month in which it was issued.

If this loan is in an MBS Pool, the Discharge Statement may be subject to CMHC approval. If
approved, a final Discharge penalty calculation must be requested no more than 5 business days
prior to payout. If this is a final penalty calculation, the penalty is valid only for the effective date
on this statement.

Paul DeLuca
Senior Manager, Credit & Default Management E.& O.E.

peoplesgroup.com

WESTERN OFFICE

Suite 1400 - 888 Dunsmuir St.

Vancouver, BC V6C 3K4
Tel: 604-683-2881

PRAIRIE OFFICE

Suite 1130, 605 - 5 Ave SW
Calgary, ABT2P 3H5

Tel: 403-237-8975

EASTERN OFFICE

Suite 1310 - 95 Wellington St. W
Toronto, ON M5J 2N7

Tel: 416-368-3266
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Court File No. CV-11-9399-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

BETWEEN:

PEOPLES TRUST COMPANY
Plaintiff
-and —
ROSE OF SHARON (ONTARIO) RETIREMENT COMMUNITY

Defendants

AFFIDAVIT OF HARTLEY BRICKS
(Sworn January 18, 2023)

I, HARTLEY BRICKS, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE
OATH AND SAY AS FOLLOWS:

L. I am a Chartered Professional Accountant, Chartered Insolvency and Restructuring
Professional qualified to practice in the Province of Ontario, and am a Senior Vice-President of
Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”), the Court-Appointed receiver and manager (the
“Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and propei’ties of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement
Community (the “Debtor”). Unless I indicate to the contrary, the facts herein are within my
personal knowledge and are true. Where I have indicated that I have obtained facts from other

sources, 1 believe those facts to be true.

2. Attached hereto as Exhibit “A” is a schedule summarizing each invoice issued by
the Receiver for services rendered during the period January 1, 2017 to November 30, 2022 (the
“Period”).

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit “B” are true copies of the invoices for fees and

disbursements incurred by Deloitte with respect to Rose for the Period, including a detailed
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description of the activities, number of hours worked, applicable hour rates and totals. I have
identified an error in the invoice dated July 24, 2019 for the period June 1 to June 30, 2019, which
invoice was overstated by $7,468.50. This amount will be deducted from the Receiver’s next
invoice. Other than the error identified, I confirm that these accounts accurately reflect the services

provided by the Receiver in this proceeding for the Period.

4. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by Deloitte throughout the course
of these proceedings are comparable to the rates charged by other accounting firms in the Toronto
market for the provision of similar services, and are comparable to the hourly rates charged by

Deloitte for services rendered in relation to similar proceedings.

s I make this affidavit in support of a motion by the Receiver for, inter alia, approval

of the fees and disbursements of the Receiver.

SWORN BEFORE ME

over video conference this

18" day of January, 2023 in accordance
with Ontario Reg.431/20.

The affiant was located in Toronto,

in the Province 9;Ont rio, while the
Commissioner, Ja@_;&a_);m%cét/

was located in Toronto

lors

HARTLEY M. BRICKS

A commissioner for taking oaths, affidavits, etc.

Todd Jeffrey Ambachtsheer,
a Commissioner, efc., Province of Ontario,
Expires September 9, 2024.
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EXHIBIT “A”

To the Fee Affidavit of Hartley Bricks sworn January 18, 2023

SWORN BEFORE ME

over video conference this

18" day of January, 2023 in accordance

with Ontario Reg.431/20.

The affiant was located in Toronto,

in the Province of Ontar hile the
Commlsswner 'iv)\/\Ilv }\( V74
was located in Toronto,
in the Province j

A commissioner for taking oaths affidavits, etc.
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EXHIBIT “A”

Summary of the Inveices of
Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver and Manager of
Rose of Sharen (Ontario) Retirement Community
for the period January 1, 2017 to November 30, 2022

95

Average
Total Invoice Hourly Fee
Invoice Date Invoice Period Fees Disb. HST Amount Hours Rate
. January 1, 2017 to N
April 18, 2017 March 31, 2017 15,708.00 - 2,042.04 (S 17,750.04 3571% 440.00
April 1, 2017 to
August 1, 2017 June 30,2017 61,941.50 27.62 8,055.99 70,025.11 147.7 419.37
July 1, 2017 to
August 18, 2017 July 31,2017 15,774.50 - 2,046.79 17,821.29 36.2 435.76
August 1,2017 to
September 13, 2017 August 31,2017 17,295.00 - 2,248.35 19,543.35 379 456,33
September 1, 2017 to
November 8, 2017 October 31, 2017 47,317.00 - 6,151.21 53,468.21 97.6 484 .81
December 13, 2017 | Tovember 1, 2017 o 24,854.00 12797  3,247.66 28,229.63 535 464.56
November 30, 2017
" | December 1, 2017 to
March 8§, 2018 December 31, 2017 20,707.50 43.23 2,684.59 23,435.32 432 479.34
January 1, 2018 to
March 8, 2018 February 28, 2018 41,908.50 25.84 5,451.46 47,385.80 87.9 476.77
March 1, 2018 to
July 19, 2018 June 30, 2018 65,085.00 84.46 8,472.03 ..73,641.49 1’30.9 . 49721
November2, 2018 |9 1 §?1§5‘1’80 ctober 69,985.00 188.81 9,122.60 | - 79,296.41 148.7 470.65
October 29, 2019 to "
January 16,2019 December 31, 2018 37,980.00 131.57 4,954.50 43,066.07 81.8 464.30
March 19, 2019 January 1, 2019 to 70,480.00 686.83 9,251.69 80,418.52 136.5 516.34
February 28, 2019
March 1, 2019 to
May 18, 2019 March 31, 2019 21,622.50 - 2,810.93 24,433.43 42.6 507.57
April 1,2019 to
June 18, 2019 May 31, 2019 27,928.00 177.89 3,653.77 31,759.66 56.4 49518
June 1, 2019 to
July 24, 2019 June 30, 2019 15,168.00 - 1,971.84 17,139.84 15.6 972.31
November 12,2019 |7 1 i?lg (;‘l’gocmber 28,741.50 61567]  3,81643 33,173.60 57.1 503.35
November 1, 2019 to
January 6, 2020 December 31, 2019 16,090.50 357.31 2,138.22 18,586.03 31.2 515.72
Junes, 2020  |°anvary 1,2020 to May 35,003.00 36036 |  4,597.24 39,960.60 743 471.10
31, 2020
June 1, 2020 to
September 11, 2020 August 11, 2020 13,030.50 4,807.28 2,318.91 20,156.69 26.8 486.21
August 12, 2020 to )
November 19, 2020 October 31, 2020 30,772.00 - 3,993.86 34,765.86 59.3 518.92
- November 1, 2020 to i
January 21,2021 December 31, 2020 38,475.00 - 5,001.75 43,476.75 72.7 529.23
January 1, 2021 to
March 24, 2021 February 28, 2021 64,893.50 - 8,436.16 73,329.66 118.1 549.48
< March 1, 2021 to
May 3, 2021 April 30, 2021 35,900.00 - 4,667.00 40,567.00 67.2 53423
May 1, 2021 to
July 15, 2021 June 30, 2021 36,436.50 - 4,736.75 41,173.25 71.2 511.75
October 7, 2021 July 1, 2021 to 35,667.00 - 4,636.71 40,303.71 67.5 528.40

August 31, 2021
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September 1, 2021 to
November 12, 2021 October 31, 2021 48,184.00 - 6,263.92 54,447.92 85.4 56422
November 1, 2021 to
January 24, 2022 December 31, 2021 28,296.00 - 3,678.48 31,974.48 522 542.07
. January 1, 2022 to
April 18, 2022 March 31, 2022 42,714.00 44.84 5,558.65 48,317.49 76.8 556.17
April 1,2022to
June 10, 2022 May 31, 2022 65,178.00 8,473.14 73,651.14 115.8 562.85
June 1, 2022 to
August 23, 2022 July 31,2022 84,684.50 23.92 11,012.09 95,720.51 147.7 573.35
October 28,2022 |  Augustl, 2022t 87,346.00 | 10,976.19| 12,781.88 111,104.07 1515 576.54
September 30, 2022
October 1, 2022 to
December 19, 2022 November 30, 2022 86,824.50 8,955.25 12,451.37 108,231.12 151.1 574.62
Total $ 1,331,991.00 |8 27,635.04 | $ 176,728.01 | § 1,536,354.05 2,578.1 516.66




EXHIBIT “B”

To the Fee Affidavit of Hartley Bricks sworn January 18, 2023

SWORN BEFORE ME

over video conference this

18" day of January, 2023 in accordance
with Ontario Reg.431/20.

The affiant was located in Toronto,

in the Province of Ontario, while the
Commissione\‘,/]c)@7 /J;‘fl QAV/L%/\ZM/
was located in Toronto,
in the Provirce T10.

:bc%dmer.em.mofo:m. ,
for Deloitte LLP and Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Expires Septsmber 9, 2024.
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- Deloitte LLP
e OI e Bay Adelaide Centre
@ 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON, M5H QA9

Tel: (416) 601-6150

Fax: (416) 601-6151

www.deloitte.ca
Private and Confidential

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Date:

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Invoice Number:

22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200 Client/Mandate Number:
Toronto, ON M5H OA9 Billing Partner:

April 18, 2017
4330260
902388-1000002
Adam Bryk

GST/HST Registration Number: 13324 5290

Invoice

For professional services rendered for the period January 1 to March 31, 2017 in
connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):

Summary of Fees

Professional Position Hours Rate | Fees

Hartley Bricks Director 29.2 $490.00  $14,308.00
Julie Haghiri Senior Associate 5 $250.00  $1,250.00
Rose Brown Administrator 1.5 $100.00 $150.00
Total hours and professional fees 35.7 $15,708.00

Our Fee| $ 15,708.00

HST@13%| 2,042.04

Amount Payable (CAD){ $ 17,750.04

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



99

Date Professional Hours |Narrative

1/3/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and respond to correspondence from E. Golden regarding
KRMC fees.

1/5/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.4 Review and execute disbursements, discussion with E. Golden
regarding status of motion materials.

1/6/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1 Discussion with E. Golden regarding court report; discussion with R.
Berg regarding operational matters.

1/11/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.3 Review of files and provide info for 3. Haghiri for review of unit
numbers and discussion after her review; review of monthly
reports.

1/11/2017 |Haghiri, Golnaz 3.5 Attend on site to review life lease units and internal discussions in
respect of same.

1/12/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 5 Review and revise report to court; discussion with 3. Haghiri
regarding unit numbering; correspondence with N. Lee regarding
status of work at premises and accounting of same; forward draft
report to P. Shea for comments.

1/12/2017 |[Haghiri, Golnaz 1.5 Responding to emails; review unit documents and internal
discussions in respect of same.

1/13/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Discussion with E. Golden regarding motion materials; review and
execute disbursements.

1/16/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with N. Lee regarding status of repairs and cost of
electrical/mechanical work incurred; review of notice of motion.

1/17/2017 |}Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review of notice of motion; correspondence with R. Berg regarding
LSA.

1/18/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Correspondence with Gowlings regarding notice of motion and court|
report.

1/19/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with E. Golden regarding Notice of Motion and
message to P. Shea regarding timing for meeting; review and
execute disbursements.

1/20/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Discussion with E. Golden and P. Shea regarding status of motion
materials and comments on same; correspondence with R. Berg re
operational matters.

1/25/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements.

1/30/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.1 Discussion with E.Golden regarding status of notice of motion.

1/31/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.1 Discussion with M. Mallich regarding status.

2/3/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Call with R. Lupo of Gowlings regarding status of condo conversion;
prepare email update for M. Mallich; review and execute
disbursements.

2/6/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and execute disbursements.

2/8/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and execute disbursements.

2/9/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Conference call with Gowlings, N. Lee and D. Miret regarding status
of condo conversion, plus follow up correspondence; discussion
with P. Shea regarding motion materials.

2/10/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1 Conference call with E. Golden and P. Shea regarding motion
materials and report to court.

2/10/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.6 Input incoming receipts and disbursement into Ascend and -
reconcile bank to general ledger.

2/13/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2 Discussion with P. Crisolago regarding budget and water meters;
review of union motion materials.

2/13/2017 |{Brown, Rose 0.2 Wire transfer between Accounts.

2/14/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and execute disbursements.
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Date Professional Hours |Narrative .

2/15/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.6 Review of draft UFCW order and provide comments to P. Shea;
conference call with Sterling Karamar regarding condo budget.

2/15/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.4 Transfer between account and wire to ACC for funding January

\ 2017.

2/21/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review and execute disbursements; prepare materials on tenants
and other docs for court report.

2/21/2017 |Wilson, Natalie 0.2 Prepare cheques and return via courier.

2/22/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.6 Review-and execute disbursements; correspondence from R. Berg
regarding operational matters.

2/22/2017 |Wilson, Natalie 0.2 . [Prepare cheques and return via courier.

2/27/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with R. Berg regarding MOH matters.

3/6/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1 Review of correspondence from R. Berg regarding MOH issues and
prepare correspondence regarding same. .

3/8/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.2 Correspondence with R. Berg regarding MOH matters; review and
execute disbursements; correspondence with E. Golden re motion
materials; correspondence with M. Mallich re update.

3/9/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1 Conference call with Sterling Karamar to discuss status of water
meter proposal and condo budget.

3/13/2017 |{Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with M Mallich
regarding status.

3/14/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Correspondence with R. Berg regarding LLSA.

3/21/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements

3/28/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Discussion with P, Shea regarding status and court dates;
discussion with E. Golden regarding motion materials; discussion
with P, Shea.

3/30/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.3 Update documents on page.
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— Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
e o I t e Bay Adelaide Centre
© 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON, M5H OA9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Private and Confidential Date: August 1, 2017
Invoice Number: 4451068

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Client/Mandate Number: 902388.1000002

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Billing Partner: Paul Casey

22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H QA9 GST/HST Registration Number: 12289 3605

Invoice #41

For professional services rendered for the period April 1 to June 30, 2017 in
connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “"Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):
Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate
Adam Bryk Partner 1.5 $575.00 $ 862.50
Hartley Bricks Director 106.7 $490.00 52,283.00
Catherine Hristow Director 0.9 $490.00 441.00
Anna Koroneos Senior Manager 6.6 $450.00 2,970.00
Julie Haghiri Senior Associate 11.7 $250.00 2,925.00
John Youn Analyst 17.2 $125.00 2,150.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 3.1 $100.00 310.00
Total hours and professional fees 147.7 61,941.50
Out of pocket expenses| $ 27.62
Subtotal 61,969.12
HST@13% 8,055.99
Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 70,025.11

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Page 2 of 4
Date Professional Hours Narrative
4/3/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review and execute disbursements; review of motion matierals.
4/5/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Correspondence with Sterling regarding cash flow and water
meters; review and execute disbursements; set up conference call;
messages exchanged with H. Milborne.
4/5/2017|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust Banking Administration - Transfer between Accounts.
4/6/2017|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Revise report to court.
4/7/2017|Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Conference call with CMHC and Peoples to discuss status of
receivership; revise court report.
4/10/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review correspondence from N. Lee and revise court report;
respond to correspondence from Gowlings re agreement of
purchase and sale; correspondence with Peoples and Gowlings re
PPSA registrations.
4/10/2017|Koroneos, Anna 0.1 Prepare PPSA registrations
4/10/2017|Youn, John 3.0 Summary of life lease units update for March 31, 2017; questions
. and discussions with H. Bricks.
4/11/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.7 Revise court report; review of files for settlement agreements and
forward to Blaneys.
4/11/2017|Youn, John 3.0 Review of amortization input; review and finalizing update for life
lease units.
4/17/2017|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and respond to correspondence from R. Berg re nursing
home matters.
4/18/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Update R&D; correspondence with M. Mallich re demand letters.
4/19/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.4 Correspondence re site tour; update R&D; discussion with E.
Golden re status; review and revise Marketing and Sale Agreement
with Milborne and forwa/rd same.
4/19/2017|Brown, Rose 0.5 Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and transfer to
ACC.
4/20/2017|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements.
4/20/2017|Brown, Rose 0.7 Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques.
4/21/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Prepare R&D; review and execute disbursements.
4/24/20171Bricks, Hartley 4.5 Prepare R&D; revise report to court.
4/25/2017]Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Finalize court report and appendices; discussion with P. Shea re
union matter.
4/27/2017]Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Finalize report to court and forward to A. Bryk for review.
4/28/2017{Bryk, Adam 1.5 Review of Eight Report.
4/28/2017|Hristow, Catherine 0.9 QA of Eighth Report to the Court.
5/1/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.7 Update report to court; correspondence concerning site tour;
forward floor plans to Milborne.
5/2/2017]|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Discussion with E. Golden re status; finalize materials and forward
to E. Golden; finalize fee affidavit and forward.
5/9/2017|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Discussion with E. Golden re status, disc. with J. Youn re arrears
file and forward arrears info to Golden; review letter re CAM arrears
and provide comments.
5/9/2017|Youn, John 0.7 Calculation of arrears workbook: separation between pre-
settlement and post-settlement amount.
5/10/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Correspondence concerning demand letters to unitholders; prepare
for site visit; review and execute disbursements.
5/11/2017|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Site visit with CMHC, Peoples and Milborne; conference call to

discuss OLRB status and strategy.
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Page 3 of 4
Date Professional Hours Narrative
5/11/2017}|Brown, Rose 1.0 Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and prepare
transfer between accounts.
5/11/2017[Youn, John 2.0 Site tour and discussions with CMHC and Peoples Trust
5/12/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review and provide comments on final version of motion materials;
review and execute amendment to LSAA; discussion with Ryhan of
ACC.
5/15/2017|8Bricks, Hartley 1.2 Discussion with E. Golden re status of NOM and letters to life lease
purchasers re outstanding CAM; review of OLRB correspondence.
5/16/2017]Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Prepare responses to undertakings in litigation.
5/16/2017|Brown, Rose 0.6 Update website with two documents; prepare stop payment sent to
TD Bank and email Sterling to confirm: stop have been placed.
5/17/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Review and research info for undertakings.
5/18/2017]Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Review and execute disbursements; review of correspondence from
Gowlings reundertakings; discussion with E. Golden re status;
correspondence with Unit holders regarding outstanding CAM
payments.
5/19/2017|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Review and respond to correspondence from life lease purchaser re
arrears.
5/23/2017}Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Discussion with E. Golden re motion matters; review and respond
to correspondence from life lease purchase re CAM fees; respond to
correspondence from a party interested in nursing home:
5/24/2017]Bricks, Hartley 1.4 Review and respond to correspondence from life lease purchasers.
5/25/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Review and respond to correspondence from a life lease
purchasers.
5/26/2017|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Review and execute disburseemtns; review and respond to
’ questions from life lease purchasers.
5/26/2017|Koroneos, Anna 1.0 Review of motion record and receiver's report.
5/26/2017|Youn, John 2.0 CAM fee reconciliation as per H. Bricks.
5/29/2017|Bricks, Hartley 0.3 Review of correspondence from a life lease purchaser, review of
files and correspondence with C. Prophet re same; review of
correspondence from R. Berg. —
5/31/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Review of factum and provide comments to E. Golden; discussion
with C. Prophet re settlement agreements; review and respond to
correspondence from life lease purchasers.
5/31/2017|Haghiri, Golnaz 1.0 Preparing 246 (2) reports.
5/31/2017|Koroneos, Anna 0.5 With H. Bricks on 246-2 Notices outstanding; with J. Haghiri on
preparation of all o/s 246-2 notices since 9/2012 and R&Ds for
each.
6/1/2017|Haghiri, Golnaz 3.8 Reconciling General Ledger to prepare 246(2) reports for previous
periods.
6/5/2017)Koroneos, Anna 5.0 Prepare for and attend at court; prepare interim R&D since last
court approval; prepare mini supplementary report.
6/7/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review of orders and endorsements; review of correspondence
from E. Golden; discussion with A. Koroneos re court appearance.
6/7/2017]Youn, John 1.0 News article translation from Korean to English and provide to H.
. Bricks. ,
6/8/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Disc. with R. Berg re nursing home matters; review and respond to

correspondence from life [ease residents.
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Date

Professional

Hours

Narrative

6/9/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Discussion with H. Milborne re agreement and forward final
agreement for execution; discussion with contractors re quotes for
repairs to building; discussion with P. Shea re various matters;
correspondence with assistant to an MP re meeting to discuss
status of receivership.

6/9/2017

Haghiri, Golnaz

5.1

Discussions with H. Bricks regarding 246 reports; continue working
on the R&D.

6/9/2017

Youn, John

3.0

Calculation of arrears spreadsheet update; summary of arrears
payment from April to June 2017.

6/14/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.5

Review and respond to correspondence from life lease purchasers;
correspondence with C. Prophet re same.

6/15/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.5

Review and respond to correspondence from D. Minet re building
matters; prepare update for Peoples; discussion with P. Crisalogo
re lockers and other matters; review and respond to
correspondence from R. Berg.

6/16/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.0

Review of CMA and respond back to H. Milborne; correspondence
with P. Crisolago re metering and other matters; correspondence
with R. Lupo re metering; discussion with C. Prophet re status of
various matters.

6/19/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Prepare response to Gowlings re undertakings.

6/19/2017

Youn, John

1.5

Calculation of arrears review and update for missing receipts.

6/20/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.5

Conference call with Gowlings and Avis to discuss condo matters;
discussion with R. Berg re various matters; prepare response to
Gowlings re undertakings.

6/21/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Discussion and correspondence with R. Berg re operational
matters; discussion and correspondence with Kadima
Intermanagement regarding their quote.

6/22/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.0

Review and respond to questions from Peoples and CMHC;
correspondence with Milborne regarding CMA.

6/26/2017

Bricks, Hartley

5.0

Meeting at Rose of Sharon with J. Shietman re review of proposal
for repair of building; discussion with E. Golden re Kim motion;
review and provide comments on factum; prepare supplemental
report and forward to E. Golden for comments and finalize same;
prepare correspondence to R. Lupo regarding parking; review of
files and provide unit information to Milborne.

6/27/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.5

Review of R&D's prepared by Julie and discussion regarding same;
review and respond to questions from Milborne.

6/27/2017

Haghiri, Golnaz

0.7

Discussions with H. Bricks regarding ﬁnal 246 draft; finalize the
documents for OSB.

6/28/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.0

Review and respond to correspondence from E. Golden; review
motion materials.

6/29/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.2

Review of s. 246 reporting and discuss with J. Haghiri; attendance
on site to meet with property manager and contractor to review
lockers to be built and other building matters; review of parking
and locker analysis; prepare response to unit purchaser re
outstanding CAM fees.

6/29/2017

Haghiri, Golnaz

1.1

Finalizing the package for OSB.

6/29/2017

Youn, John

1.0

Parking lot ownership/usage summary.

6/30/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Correspondence with J. Jensen re status; review of revised quote
received from Kadima and follow up questions re same.

Total hours

147.7
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— Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
e Ol e Bay Adelaide Centre
L 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON, M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Private and Confidential Date: August 18, 2017
Invoice Number: 4462657
Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Client/Mandate Number: 902388.1000002
c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Billing Partner: Paul Casey
22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST Registration Number: 12289 3605
For professional services rendered for the period July 1 to 31, 2017 in connection
with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (“"Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):
Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate
Hartley Bricks Director 30.8 $490.00 $ 15,092.00
John Youn Analyst 4.5 $125.00 562.50
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 0.9 $100.00 90.00
Total hours and professional fees 36.2 15,744.50
Out of pocket expenses| $ -
Subtotal 15,744.50
HST@13% 2,046.79
Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 17,791.29

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
7/4/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.9 Conference call with Gowlings and R. Avis re status of condo
conversion; correspondence with Kadima re quote and Sterling
Karamar re building matters; correspondence with M. Mallich re
renovation quotes.
7/5/2017|Bricks, Hartley 0.7 Correspondence with M. Mallich re renovation quotes and follow up

correspondence with Sterling Karamar to obtain further info on
Total Renovation quote.

7/10/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Correspondence and discussion with R. Berg re operational
matters; correspondence with P. Crisolago re applicances;
discussion with J. Chu re analysis.

7/10/2017|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque.

7/11/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Preparation for and attendance in court for motion to argue against
lifting the stay re Grace Kim application; review of analysis of
appliances and forward schedule to B. Kim to prepare; review and
execute disbursements.

7/11/2017|Youn, John 1.0 Restoration analysis for select units. ‘

7/12/2017|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Correspondence with an interested purchaser and arrange
conference call; review of appliance analysis; review and execute
disbursements; review of LSAA provided by the Centril LHIN.

7/13/2017{Bricks, Hartley 0.7 Conference call with a party interested in LTC.

7/14/2017]Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review of Milborne analysis and discussion with J. Youn re same.

7/14/2017|Youn, John 1.5 Estimated proceeds analysis.

7/24/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Prepare update for Peoples Trust; discussion with R. Berg re air
conditioning problem; review and execute disbursments.

7/25/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review and execute disbursements; conference call with Gowlings
and N. Lee to discuss status of condo application; prepare update
for Peoples.

7/26/2017Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Review of locker inventory and discuss same with J. Youn; respond
to correspondence from M. Mallich; discussion with 1. Jensen re

¥ status. )

7/26/2017|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement cheque.

7/26/2017|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement cheque.

7/26/2017|Youn, John 2.0 Locker listing.

7/27/2017|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Review of locker analysis and forward to 1. Renwick; review and
respond to correspondence from M. Mallich re unit pricing; review

7/28/2017{Bricks, Hartley 2.8 Discussion with J. Shtieman re construction contract;
correspondence with M. Kim re timing for meeting with MPP;
execute listing agreement and forward to ). Jensen; prepare
correspondence to J. Yoon re removal of property.

7/31/2017|Bricks, Hartley 3.7 Review of locker and parking situation; review of outstanding
matters list and forward various documents to Gowlings; discussion
with J. Renwick of Milborne Real Estate re unit pricing and lockers;
correspondence with P. Crisalogo of Sterling re list of agreements.

Total hours 36.2
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=m Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
' e °| e Bay Adelaide Centre
© 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON, M5H 0OAS

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Private and Confidential Date: September 13, 2017
Invoice Number: 4480338

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Client/Mandate Number: 902388.1000002

¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Billing Partner: Paul Casey

22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST Registration Number: 12289 3605

Invoice #42a

For professional services rendered for the period August 1 to 31, 2017 in connection
with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):

Summary of Fees

Professional Position Hours Rate
Hartley Bricks Director 34.5 $490.00 $ 16,905.00
Anne Baptiste Analyst 1.0 $125.00 125.00
John Youn Analyst 1.0 $125.00 125.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 1.4 $100.00 140.00
Total hours and professional fees 37.9 17,295.00
HST@13% 2,248.35
Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 19,543.35

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative

8/1/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Preparation for and attendance at a meeting with J. Renwick and
D. Palmieri of Milborne Real Estate to review units to be sold, work
to be completed and other matters; review and execute
disbursements; discussion with R. Berg re various matters.

8/1/2017 {Youn, John 1.0 B1 and B2 locker listing mapping.

8/2/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.1 Correspondence with J. Yoon re removal of items; review and
execute disbursements; review of floor plans provided by N. Lee.

8/3/2017 Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with a party interested in Rose of Sharon; review and
execute disbursements.

8/8/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Prep for and attendance on conference call with Gowlings for
update on condo conversion; correspondence with P. Crisalogo re
reserve fund study; prepare letter for Norman Lee re City of
Toronto document access; review and execute disbursements.

8/8/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.5 Input receipts and monthly entries for July 2017,

8/9/2017 |Baptiste, Anne 1.0 July banking admin and reconciliation

8/9/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Meeting at Rose of Sharon with J. Renwick, Daneilla and 1.
Shteiman to discuss work to be done on property.

8/10/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Review and execute disbursements; prepare correspondence to

Gowlings re questions on property; arrange call with Peoples and
CMHC; forward unit drawings to Milborne.

8/11/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Conference call with Y. Boswell, M. Mallich and J. Theriault re
status of condo; follow up message with J. Jensen and J. Renwick;
review of responses from D. Miret; discussion with J. Renwick re
unit values; review of files re architectural plans and forward to

contractor. ;

8/14/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.3 Review and respond to correspondence from P. Lee re Chaplaincy
office; respond to correspondence from J. Shtieman.

8/14/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque.

8/15/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Meeting with a party interested in LTC and subsequent discussion

with P. Shea regarding same.

8/16/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review of correspondence from Gowlings re condo matters; disc.
with J. Shtieman re timing for commencing work.

8/17/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Telephone discussion with a party interested in the nursing home;
review and respond to correspondence from building
superintendent re tenant matters; forward monthly reports to
Peoples.

8/18/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Review of correspondence from R. Berg re LTC results and respond
to same; discussion with J. Renwick re status of unit values;
review and execute disbursements.

8/21/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review of correspondence from J. Renwick re condo pricing and
forward same to M. Mallich; review of analysis of nursing home
pricing prepared by J. Jensen and forward same to M. Mallich.
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Date

Professional

Hours

Narrative

8/22/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.5

Review of Jensen data room; review of Kadima quote and
correspondence with J. Shtieman re same; review of outstanding
condo list; bi-weekly conference call to discuss status of condo
application; discussion with P. Crisolago re outstanding items;
discussion with J. Jensen re offer procedures and website; review
and execute disbursements.

8/24/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Review of Shared Services Agreement and correspondence with
Gowlings regarding same; correspondence with Gowlings
regarding reserve study and correspondence with P. Crisolago re
same.

8/24/2017

Brown, Rose

0.6

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques.

8/28/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.5

Review of outstanding items list; meeting with a party interested
in nursing home; conference call with Gowlings, J. Jensen and J.
Renwick to discuss shared services agreement and follow up
correspondence with Assured Care and Sterling Karamar.

8/30/2017

Bricks, Hartley

0.8

Correspondence with J. Shtieman re status; correspondence re
Grace Kim.
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= Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
e OIt e Bay Adelaide Centre
@ 8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON, M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Private and Confidential Date: November 8, 2017
Invoice Number: . 4524988

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Client/Mandate Number: * 902388.1000002

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Billing Partner: Paul Casey

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST Registration Number: 12289 3605

Invoice #43

For professional services rendered for the period September 1 to October 31, 2017
in connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as
Deloitte Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):

Summary of Fees

Professional Position Hours Rate
Hartley Bricks Director 96.3 $490.00 $ 47,187.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 1.3 $100.00 130.00
Total hours and professional fees 97.6 47,317.00
HST@13% 6,151.21
Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 53,468.21

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Date

Professional

Hours

Narrative

9/1/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.0

Discussion with P. Shea and E. Golden re condo application
matters; review and execute disbursements

9/5/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Correspondence with P. Crisolago re outstanding matters;
correspondence with 1. Shtieman re drawings, review of same and
forward to Milborne and counsel; conference call for status update
on condo application.

9/6/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Review of files re CAM arrears, correspondence with Sterling re
ledgers; discussion with Jensen re status and review of files;
meeting with R. Cho, MPP and staff to discuss status of sale
process for nursing home.

9/8/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Review of correspondence concerning lockers; review and execute
disbursements; discussion with N. Lee re site plan agreement.

9/12/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.5

Review and respond to correspondence from property manager;
correspondence with contractor.

9/13/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.5

Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with J.
Shtieman re contract and progress; correspondence with R, Berg
re operational matters.

9/18/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.5

Preparation for and attendance at court for the motion to obtain
possession of the unit inhabited by Grace and Imseop Kim; review
and respond to questions concerning the property asked by the
insurer for the renewal of the policy; review of shared services
agreement and surveys and disc. with J. Renwick re shared units;
review of shared costs.

9/19/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Conference call with Gowlings et al to discuss status of condo
application.

9/22/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.5

Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with R. Berg;
discussion with legal counsel to a potential purchaser.

9/22/2017

Brown, Rose

0.4

Banking administration: prepare wire to ACC and input into
Ascend.

9/25/2017

Bricks, Hartley

0.2

Review and execute disbursments.

9/26/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.0

Discussion with P. Shea and E. Golden re potential for stalking
horse process.

9/27/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Discussion with R. Berg re shared costs and prepare analysis of
same; correspondence with contractor re status of renovations;
review and execute disbursements.

9/28/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.8

Discussion with J. Jensen re status; review of various materials for
LTC due diligence room and accumulate same.

9/29/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.0

Review of nursing home marketing info and prepare info for same;
discussion with D. Daley re shared facilities agreement;
correspondence with insurer regarding proposed renewal.

9/29/2017

Brown, Rose

0.3

Banking administration: disbursement cheques.

10/2/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.5

Site visit with contractor and Milborne to discuss status; review of
shared facilities; correspondence with insurer.

10/3/2017

Bricks, Hartley

4.5

Conference call to discuss status of condo application; further
discusion with Y. Boswell re information requested; review and
execute disbursements; review of shared facilities issues.

10/4/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Discussion with J. Renwick re status; disc. with R. Berg re
operational matters.

10/5/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.2

Discussion with S. Orloff of Wyse re quote for hydro meters and
subsequent disc. with R. Berg and J. Renwick re same; review of
Wyse agreement.
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10/6/2017 {Bricks, Hartley 4.5 Prepare info for CMHC; disc. with S. Orloff re metering;
correspondence with R. Berg re door to LTC.

10/10/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.2 Review and respond to correspondence from D. Daley; review of

_|condo budget; review and execute disburements. ’

10/12/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review and revise condo budget; review and execute
disbursements.

10/13/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with R. Berg re budget and other issues; discussion
with D. Miret re building GFA.

10/16/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Correspondence with CMHC; review of nursing home budget;
review and execute disbursements.

10/17/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Discussions with S. Orloff re proposals; discussions with N. Lee re
update; coordinate site tour with CMHC; attend update call re
status of condo application.

10/18/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Review of first draft of APS template for LTC and make
comments/notes; meeting with P. Shea to discuss APS and other
matters.

10/18/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.4 Trust banking administration: prepare monthly TSF to ACC.

10/19/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Further review of APS and forward comments to Shea; discussion
with ACC regarding cable rates.

10/19/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.2 Confirm transfer was processed to ACC and input into Ascend.

10/23/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 4.5 "|Prepare condo budget; review and respond to questions from D.
Miret; review expert! report on Architect and provide comments to
C. Stanek.

10/25/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Conference call with R. Lupo and D. Dalley re status of various
outstanding matters in condo application; discussion with
interested party re status of sale process and follow up with
email; discussion with J. Shietman re status of work at site and
change orders; messages for P. Crisolago re water meters; further
review of expert report and provide comments to C. Stanek.

10/26/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Site tour with CMHC at property; prepare condo budget; various
discussions with R. Berg and J. Jensen re status.

10/27/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Review of Wyse contract; review of files re parking;
correspondence with contractor re invoice; correspondence with
Jane and Daniela re timing for site visit.

10/30/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Prepare condo budget and notes; review construction invoice and
correspondence with J. Shtieman re same; discussion with R. Lupo
and D. Dalley re outstanding matters; review files for by-law re
parking and forward same to Gowlings.

10/31/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Review and execute disbursements; prepare correspondence to an
interested party; review of condo act requirements.

10/31/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.8 Condo update call with team; revisions to notes to budget;

discussion with D. Miret re gross floor area calculations;
correspondence with interested parties.
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Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON, M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Private and Confidential Date: December 13, 2017
Invoice Number: 4557458

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community Client/Mandate Number: 902388.1000002 Paul

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Billing Partner: Casey

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto, ON MSH 0A9

Invoice #44

GST/HST Registration Number: 12289 3605

For professional services rendered for the period November 1 to 30, 2017 in
connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community ("Rose of Sharon” or the “*Company”):

Summary of Fees

Professional Position Hours Rate
Paul Casey Partner 0.6 $575.00 $ 345.00
Hartley Bricks Director 50.1 $490.00 24,549.00
Anne Baptiste Analyst 1.0 $125.00 125:00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 1.8 $100.00 180.00
Total hours and professional fees 53.5 24,854.00

Out of Pocket Expenses:
Mileage 28.98
Courier 98.99
Subtotal 24,981.97
HST@13% 3,247.66 ¢

Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 28,229.63

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493%
(equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which
remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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11/1/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Prepare report to court for transfer of land and directors.

11/1/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: tranfer between accounts.

11/2/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Draft report to court.

11/2/2017 |Baptiste, Anne 0.5 September bank reconciliation.

11/3/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.3 Discussion with P. Shea re report to court and status of other
matters.

11/3/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.

11/6/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review of reserve fund study; review and execute disbursements;
correspondence with Gowlings re condo application.

11/7/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Review of shared facilities and services information and prepare
schedule; correspondence with R. Berg regarding operational
matters; correspondence with water company re meeting to
review work at premises.

11/8/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.8 Review and revise shared facilities agreement; discussion with D.
Dalley re status of various issues; respond to correspondence from
an interested party; discussion with E. Golden re status of various
matters.

11/9/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.7 Correspondence with N. Lee re information requested by City
inspector, review of files re same and correspondence with D.
Miret re site survey.

11/10/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Meeting with an interested party; discussion with R. Berg re status
of sale process and other matters.

11/13/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Meeting at the property with contractor and Milborne Real Estate
to review work completed by contractor.

11/14/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Discussion with D. Miret re outstanding matters; review of
correspondence from an interested party and telephone discussion
re same; revise Shared Facilities Agreement; bi-weekly update call
with team re condo application; review of draft report and vesting
order from P. Shea and correspondence regarding same.

11/14/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.5 Banking administration: update GL with deposit received and
prepare/send wire to ACC.

11/15/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Meeting with R. Berg re renovation matters; site meeting for pdi of
residential component.

11/17/2017 [Baptiste, Anne 0.5 October reconciliations.

11/17/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with C. Prophet re party interested in Rose of
Sharon.

11/20/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Review area calculations provide by D. Miret and revise Shared
Facilities Agreement; correspondence concerning MOH review;

‘ review of Wyse agreement comments from Gowlings. |

11/21/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.2 Review correspondence from G. Kim and correspondence with P.
Shea and E. Golden regarding same; meeting with Water Meter
installers, subsequent discussions with property manager and
Norman Lee re water meter issues.

11/21/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.2 Update website page with documents.

11/22/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.7 Discussion with E. Golden and prepare supplemental report to
court re Unit PH8; correspondence with contractor re changes.
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11/23/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Correspondence with the contractor; discussion with E. Golden re
draft report, revise same and finalize; review and execute
disbursements.

11/23/2017 |Brown, Rose 0.6 Trust banking administration: disburement cheques; input receipts
and reconcile GL to Bank.

11/23/2017 |Casey, Paul 0.6 Review estate disbursements and emails H. Bricks; review
Supplementary Report.

11/24/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with
contractor re status.

11/27/2017 {Bricks, Hartley 3.3 Review of by-laws and correspondence with Gowlings regarding
same; discussion with N. Lee re status; review and execute
disbursements.

11/28/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Preparation for and attendance on bi-weekly conference call with
team; discussion with N. Lee re status of building inspections;
discussion with D. Miret re status of condo documents.

11/29/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 4.5 Prepare info for J. Jensen; prepare terms and conditions of sale;
correspondence with D. Daley re various matters.

11/30/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Forward preliminary comments and info to J. Jensen; attendance

at property to meet City building inspector with N. Lee; call with R.
Lupo and D. Daley re Shared Services Agreement.
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Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement

Community c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9
Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees
Invoice # 45

For for the period December 1 to December 31, 2017 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community ("Rose of Sharon” orthe

“Company").

Please see the attached Appendices for details.

Expense

Sales Tax

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per

Total Amount Dde (CAD)

Invoice 8000041446

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: March 08,2018
Client No.: * 1154220
WBS#: PEQC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration: 12289 3605
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HST applicable 20,607.50
HST applicable 43,23
HST at 13.00% 2,684.59

23,335.32

annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate
Paul Casey Partner 0.2 $575.00 115.00
Hartley Bricks Director 415 $490.00 20,335.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 1.2 $100.00 120.00
Ada Koo Analyst 0.3 $125.00 37.50
Total hours and professional fees 432 20,607.50
Qut of Pocket Expenses:
Mileage 43.23
Subtotal 20,650.73
HST@13% 2,684.59
Amount Payable (CAD) 23,335.32
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Date

Professional

Hours

Narrative

12/1/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.0

Discussion with C. Prophet re status of various matters.

12/4/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.0

Review of comments from J. Jensen and respond to same;
correspondence with Milborne re condo budget.

12/4/2017

Casey, Paul

0.2

Discussion with H. Bricks; account administration.

12/5/2017

Bricks, Hartley

1.2

Review and execute disbursements; discussion with R. Berg re purchase
of unit; discussion with N. Espinoza re background.

12/6/2017

Bricks, Hartley

0.2

Discussion with R. Berg re status of condo conversion.

12/8/2017

Bricks, Hartley

19

Meeting with D. Palmieri and J. Renwick re condo budget;
correspondence with Wyse meters re status of contract; correspondence
with Gowlings re timing for meeting; discussion with M. Mallich re unit
pricing. 7

12/11/2017

Bricks, Hartley

50

Review and revise condo budget and notes; review of files re Site
Servicing Agremeent.

12/12/2017

Bricks, Hartley

43

Conference call with team to discuss status; review of files re settlement
agreement for R. Berg and ACC; review of condo budget;
correspondence with D. Palmieri and J. Shteiman re site visit; review of
contractor invoices.

12/12/2017

Brown, Rose

0.2

Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.

12/13/2017

Bricks, Hartley

25

Discussion with N. Lee re outstanding matters; correspondence with R.
Shiwram of Canada Brokerlink re status of condo application; conference
call with Malvina of Wyse Metering and D. Dalley of Gowlings to discuss
contract.

12/14/2017

Bricks, Hartley

55

Review of revised Wyse Meter agreement and discussion with D. Dalley
regarding same; discussion with J. Armstrong of Edison re draft report
and disc. with D. Dalley re same; review correspondence from M. Mallich
re HST issue, review of files and discussion with D. Dalley regarding same;
review and respond to correspondence from J. Jensen re nursing home
budget; correspondence with R. Ahmad re cash floxv\ for LTC.

12/14/2017

Koo, Ada

0.3

Bank reconciliation.

1271572017

Bricks, Hartley

4.0

Revise condo budget; discussion with R. Berg re various matters; review
and execute Wyse agreement.

12/18/2017

Bricks, Hartley

2.8

Review of revised LTC budget and correspondence with J. Jensen re
same; correspondence with R. Berg and R. Lupo regarding APS;
correspondence with Gowlings re tax matters; correspondence with D.
Dalley re Wyse agreement. »

12/19/2017

Bricks, Hartley

3.0

Discussion with Y. Boswell re status of various issues; correspondence
with N. Espinoza re site visit; discussion with C. Stanek re litigation;
correspondence with J. Jensen re budget; conference call with team to
discuss status of condo application.

12/19/2017

Brown, Rose

0.7

Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.

12/20/2017

Bricks, Hartley

45

Meeting at property for review of units with contractor; review of draft
APS for unit 203 and provide comments to R. Lupo.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
12/21/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 31 Review and revise APS and various correspondence with R.Lupo and D.
Miret re same.
12/21/2017 |Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: prepare disbursement cheques and review
balance in account online.
12/22/2017 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Review and revise APS and correspondence and discussions with R. Berg

regarding same; review of correspondence from J. Jensen regarding LTC
budget, review and respond re same.




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement

Community ¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9
Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees
Invoice # 46

For the period January 1 to February 28, 2018 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the "Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”).

Please see the attached Appendices for details.

Expense

Sales Tax

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per

Total Amount Due (CAD)

Invoice 8000041441

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON MSH 0A9

Tel: (416)601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: March 08,2018
Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration: 12289 3605

HST applicable 41,908.50
HST applicable 25.84
HST at 13.00% 5,451.46

47,385.80
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annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate
Hartley Bricks Director 849 $490.00 41,601.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 2.7 $100.00 270.00
Ada Koo Analyst 0.3 $125.00 37.50
Total hours and professional fees 87.9 41,908.50
Out of Pocket Expenses:
Mileage 25.84
Subtotal 41,934.34
HST@13% 5,451.46
Amount Payable (CAD) 47,385.80
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Date Professional Hours Narrative

1/8/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Various correspondence with D. Dalley and R. Berg re condo APS; review
APS for condo unit-and execute same.

1/9/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 45 Correspondence with N. Lee re status; review outstanding items list;
review of J. Jensen analysis; prepare for and attend team conference call
re condo application; review of files re site certificates; correspondence
with contractor; review and execute disbursements.

1/9/2018 |Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.

1/10/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 50 Prepare sale process documents; discussion with N. Lee re status;
conference call to discuss parking issue; discussion with E. Goiden and N.
Espinoza re eviction issue.

1/11/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Discussion with R. Berg re status; discussion with J. Jensen re analysis and
timing; review and execute disbursements.

1/11/2018 |Brown, Rose 0.5 Input various receipts and reconcile bank to GL; complete draft transfer
calculation for December 2017.

1/12/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Prepare sale process documents.

1/15/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 40 Review of pricing schedule provided by Milborne and prepare questions
regarding same; update proceeds analysis; review and execute
disbursements; discussion with an interested party; review of Wyse
Metering agreement; correspondence with Gowlings re status.

1/15/2018 |Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking Administration: prepare transfers.

1/16/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 32 Correspondence concerning Wyse Agreement; discussion with
contractor re status of work and coordinate final PDI; review of bylaw re
parking and correspondence to J. Jensen.

1/17/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 1.3 Discussion with J. Renwick re status of sale process and parking issue;
correspondence concerning eviction matter.

1/17/2018 [Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.

1/18/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review and respond to correspondence concerning outstanding CAM
fees; review and execute disbursements.

1/19/2018 |Bricks, Hdrtley 28 Review of files re CAM fees; review of correspondence re marketing
process; review and execute disbursements.

1/22/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Prepare analysis and correspondence to Peoples re minimum pricing for
nursing home and condo units.

1/22/2018 |[Brown, Rose 0.2 Prepare transfer to ACC.

1/23/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 45 Review and respond to various correspondence from Y. Boswell; disc.
with N. Lee re status; conf. call with team to discuss status of condo
application; subsequent call with N. Espinoza re site visit; review and
execute disbursements.

1/23/2018 |Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: sent transfer to TD Bank and input transfer
and incoming wire from the Ministry into Ascend.

1/24/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 5.5 Prepare estimated realizable value analysis and forward to N. Espinoza

and discussion regarding same; correspondence with D. Dalley re APS.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative

1/25/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 40 Review and respond to correspondence from N. Espinoza re questions
from CMHC; Update CAM fee schedules.

1/25/2018 [Koo, Ada 03 Bank reconciliation December 2017.

1/26/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 52 Attend at premises for final PDI of condo units; various discussion with N.
Espinoza re status; update CAM fee schedules.

1/30/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with R. Berg re
operational matters.

1/31/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Conference call with a party interested in the nursing home.

2/1/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 40 Discussion with D. Daley re residential APS matters; update life lease
schedules; respond to Sterling Karamar regarding a unit-holder's inquiry
regarding life lease CAM arrears. *

2/2/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Correspondence with Sterling Karamar and revise life lease ledgers for
updated info; correspondence with Y. Boswell regarding pricing of
residential units.

2/5/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 3.8 Prepare terms and conditions of sale and form of offer; review of Kadima
invoices and correspondence regarding same; disc. with a party
interested in nursing home.

2/6/2018 |[Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Conference call with team re status; subsequent discussion with N.
Espinoza; review of contractor invoices.

2/7/2018 |Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque and input deposits.

2/8/2018  |Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Conference call with Gowlings to prepare for meeting with City Planner.

2/12/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Prepare for and attend a meeting with City Planner and Gowlings to
discuss by-law/parking matters; follow up disc with Gowlings and
D.Miret; arrange conferece call to-update R. Lupo.
2/13/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Conference call with Gowlings to discuss parking issue; further discussion
and correspondence with E. Golden re parking issue.

2/14/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 0.9 Discussion with E. Golden regarding parking by-law issue.

2/15/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Discussion with Y. Boswell re reserve fund, CAM fees and unit pricing;
review of cash flow forecast.

2/16/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review of cash flow forecast and correspondence with ACC regarding
funding.

2/20/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 30 Update CAM Fees; discussion with J. Renwick.

2/22/2018 |Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Conference call with property manager and Milborne to discuss reserve

fund study and condo application.




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees
Invoice # 147

For professional services rendered for the period March 1 to June 30,
2018 in connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,,
now known as Deloitte Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the
“Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of

Sharon” or the “Company”).

Please see the attached appendices for details.

Expense

Sales Tax

Invoice 8000181142

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

July 19,2018
1154220
PEOC0004
Paul Casey

12289 3605

65,085.00

84.46

8,472.03

73,641.49

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate
Paul Casey Partner 0.6 $600.00 360.00
Hartley Bricks Director 1218 $525.00 63,945.00
Emily Klien Analyst 2.0 $225.00 450.00
Ada Koo Analyst 1.6 $125.00 200.00
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 4.9 $100.00 490.00
Total hours and professional fees 1309 65,085.00
Out of Pocket Expenses:
Mileage 9.94
Courier 74.52
Subtotal 65,169.46
HST@13% 8,472.03
Amount Payable (CAD) 73,641.49
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Date Professional Hours 7 Narrative
3/1/2018|Bricks, Hartley 45 Prepare report regarding the status of the nursing home sale process
and correspondence with P. Shea regarding same; discussion with N. Lee
regarding plumbing inspector matters and forward email regarding
same; prepare correspondence re o/s CAM arrears.
3/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Finalize ninth report to court and forward to P. Shea; prepare
correspondence to life lease purchasers re CAM Arrears and discussion
with E. Golden re same.
3/2/2018]|Casey, Paul 0.2 Review Court Report.
3/5/2018|Bricks, Hartley 6.0 Attendance at OLRB Tribunal for hearing of Union application;
correspondence with Gowlings re settlement agreements, discussion
with D. Dalley re same; review of files and forward documents to same;
review and execute disbursements.
3/6/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Conference call with P. Shea, E. Golden and N. Espinoza to discuss OLRB
tribunal and a party interested in purchasing Peoples debt; review and
execute disbursements.
3/7/2018|Bricks, Hartley 35 Conference call with team to discuss status of condo registration;
discussion with P. Shea re meeting with interested party; review and
analysis of Edison Report.
3/8/2018Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review and analysis of Edison report and correspondénce with P.
Crisolago of Sterling Karamar regarding same; discussion with P.
Crisolago re fire review.
3/11/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with Y. Boswell re site visit for appraisal; review and
execute disbursements.
3/13/2018|Bricks, Hartley 15 Discussion with Y. Boswell re status; correspondence with Sterling
Karamar re Edison report.
3/13/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration; prepare transfers between accounts.
3/14/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Review and execute disbursements; review LSAA amendments.
3/14/2018|Brown, Rose 0.1 Trust banking administration: send transfer between accounts to TD
Bank.
3/15/2018|8Bricks, Hartley 1.9 Review and execute disbursements; review of LSAA; review of monthly
reporting from ACC.
3/15/2018|Koo, Ada 0.3 January 2018 bank reconciliation.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
3/16/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Discussion with R. Gillooly of Sterling Karamar regarding reserve fund
study; coordinate conference call with J. Armstrong of Edison concerning
reserve fund study.
3/19/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.0 Review and respond to email from N. Espinoza re status; correspondence
re funding to ACC; review and execute disbursements.
3/19/2018{Brown, Rose 0.1 Trust banking: review account online for transfer to ACC.
3/20/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Conference call with J. Armstrong of Edison and R. Gillooly of Sterling
Karamar re Reserve Fund Study; review of revised reserve fund cash flow
table and forward to Milborne for comments.
3/20/2018]|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: wire transfer to ACC.
3/21/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Conference call with team re status of condo application; further call with
Y. Boswell re reserve fund contributions.
3/22/2018|Brown, Rose 0.1 Trust banking administration: transfer to ACC.
3/23/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Review and execute disbursements; enroll in Transfer Payment Common
Registration system with Government of Ontario for ROS; conference call
with Gowlings to discuss parking issues.
3/26/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with J. Jensen re status; review and execute disbursements;
discussion with R. Berg re status of various issues.
3/27/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Conference call with J. Renwick and D. Palmieri re reserve fund
contribution impact on CAM Fees and parking.
4/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review of monthly reporting; correspondence to appraisers; review and
execute disbursements.
4/3/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Correspondence with appraisers and prepare information requested;
correspondence with R. Berg re information requested; correspondence
with N. Lee re status.
4/3/2018|Koo, Ada 03 February bank reconciliation.
4/4/2018]Bricks, Hartley 40 Attend team conference call for status update on condo appl and
subsequent call with Y. Boswell; telephone discussion with N. Lee re
status of permit approval; discussion with N. Espinoza re team meeting,
cash flow funding and appl for minor variance of zoning; prepare
correspondance.
4/5/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Prepare outstanding matters chart.
4/6/2018)Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review correspondence from interested party, and correspondence with
C. Stanek regarding same.
4/9/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.2 Conference call with Gowlings to discuss plan for applying for minor

variance; correspondance with Kadima re washer/dryer and review of
files for drawings for unit; review and respond to correspondance from B.
Parker; discussion with N. Lee re permits; prepare information for
appraiser.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative

4/10/2018|Bricks, Hartley 13 Update emails to N. Espinoza; review and respond to email from B.
Parker; review of files for site plans.

4/11/2018|Bricks, Hartley 05 Correspondence with ACC re invoices.

4/12/2018|Bricks, Hartley 33 Prepare analysis and correspondence to Peoples and CMHC; review and
execute disbursements.

4/16/2018|Bricks, Hartley 32 Prepare reserve fund analysis and correspondence with J. Armstrong of
Edison regarding same; correspondence with appraisers re infomation
requests.

4/16/2018|Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: transfer between accounts and input EFT
deposit. '

4/17/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review of information requested by appraiser and forward same;
correspondence with ACC re funding; review of cash flow forecast
prepared by Sterling and arrange for funding.

4/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 35 Team call to discuss status of condo application; prepare tracking
schedule; review and provide comments to P. Shea on Court application
re OLRB decision.

4/19/2018{Bricks, Hartley 30 Prepare project time line schedule and forward to Gowlings for

.|comments; finalize and sign Receiver Certificate and deliver to N.

Espinoza.

4/19/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: deposit.

4/20/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Correspondence with C. Stanek re counter offer and respond to same;
review and execute disbursements.

4/20/2018(Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: review funds online line and confirm
balance transferring with Property Management.

4/23/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Discussion with D. Palmieri re reserve fund and CAM Fees and prepare
correspondence to J. Armstrong re same.

4/23/2018{Casey, Paul 0.1 Emails H. Bricks and account administration.

4/24/2018|Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Review of correspondence from J. Armstrong of Edison and prepare
correspondence to Y. Boswell re reserve fund and CAM Fees; conference
call with Gowlings and N. Lee to discuss City of Toronto letter, review of
files regarding past correspondence.

4/25/2018Casey, Paul 0.3 Emails H. Bricks re OLRB discussion.

4/27/2018(Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: input deposit.

4/30/2018{Bricks, Hartley 1.2 Conference call with team re status; telephone S. Orloff at Wyse Meter re
status of installation; prepare correspondence to K. Bull of City of
Toronto re status of permits.

5/1/2018]Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with Y. Boswell re CMA for property; send email to City

of Toronto re permits.
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Date  |Professional Hours Narrative
5/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.3 Review of CBRE appraisal and prepare correspondence to Y. Boswell
concerning appraised values; review and respond to correspondence
from the City; respond to call from CRA re status of receivership.
5/3/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements.
5/3/2018|Brown, Rose 0.9 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques.
5/3/2018Klein, Emily 20 Prepare formated version of condo budget and notes.
5/3/2018|Koo, Ada 0.3 Rose of Sharon March bank reconciliation.
5/7/2018]Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Correspondence with Y. Boswell concerning appraisals and
correspondence with K. French of Altus.
5/8/2018|Bricks, Hartley 14 Review and respond to correspondence from Y. Boswell re reserve fund;
correspondence with Edison re reserve fund; review of correspondence
and discussion with N. Lee re mechanical work to be completed, email
and discussion with Omar of Diversitech regarding same.
5/9/2018|Bricks, Hartley 22 Revise budget statement and notes; review and execute disbursements;
correspondence with a party interested in the nursing home.
5/10/2018|Bricks, Hartley 25 Review of Altus draft appraisal and correspondence regarding same;
prepare analysis and correspondence re appraisals.
5/14/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review of project schedule and forward to N. Espinoza.
5/14/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking: disbursement cheque.
5/15/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Update condo budget and notes and supporting schedules; review and
execute disbursements; correspondence with D. Miret re locker
dimensions.
5/17/2018|Bricks, Hartley 03 Discussion with R. Berg re status; review and execute disbursements.
5/17/2018|Koo, Ada 0.3 April bank reconciliation.
5/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 24 Review of revised Altus appraisal and respond to K. French; prepare
correspondance to Y. Boswell re appraisals; work on condo budget.
5/22/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.1 Review and modify terms and conditions of sale; conference call with
’ team to discuss status of various issues; correspondance with B. Kim re
appliance schedule and repairs; correspondance with D. Palmieri re
awning; review of correspondance re lobby and party room; discussion
Jen.
5/23/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.2 Correspond with D. Palmieri re awning; review and execute
disburseements; forward final Altus appraisal to CMHC.
5/23/2018|Brown, Rose 05 Trust banking administration: prepare transfer to ACC and between
accounts.
5/24/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Correspondence with Y. Boswell and review of files re condo pricing;

correspondence with J. Jensen re pricing/cap rate update; review and
execute disbursements. ‘
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
5/25/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Discussion with Y. Boswell re condo pricing; telephone discussion with G,
Kim and subsequent discussion with E. Golden.
5/28/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Prepare correspondence to Y. Boswell re busing home and condo
pricing; forward budget and notes to Gowlings and Melbourne for
comments.
5/29/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Team discussion re condo conversion status and agreement of purchase
and sale; correspondence with G. Kim.
6/7/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Meeting with G. Kim, update to E. Golden and P. Shea; respond to
correspondence from D. Dalley re unit PH8.
6/7/2018|Brown, Rose 0.5 Trust banking administration: prepare transfer and disbursement cheque
and input into Ascend.
6/8/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.6 Discussion with D. Dalley re contents of APA for unit PH8; review and
execute and forward to G. Kim.
6/11/2018|Bricks, Hartley 15 Prep for and attend conference call with team re status of condo
application; review and execute disbursements; correspondance with D.
Palmeri re model suites.
6/12/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence with D. Palmieri re meeting; correspondence with B.
Parker re meeting with the City.
6/13/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Call with D. Palmieri and A. Rudberg re model suites.
6/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Attendance at property to meet with Milborne and Model Interiors re
model suites and other matters; prepare correspondence to Property
Manager re issues to be addressed; review of files re lockers.
6/19/2018|Bricks, Hartley 04 Review comments from E. Golden and respond to G. Kim email; review
and execute disbursements.
6/20/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Respond to correspondence from G. Kim; review comments on condo
budget and revise; forward questions on budget to Sterling Karamar.
6/20/2018|Brown, Rose 04 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque and review account
online for prepare of transfer to ACC.
6/21/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review and execute disbursements; meeting with the City of Toronto to
discuss plan of condominium and parking issue.
6/21/2018|Koo, Ada 04 [Bank reconciliations for two bank accounts.
6/22/2018|Bricks, Hartley 04 Discussion with R. Berg re status of various issues.
6/22/2018|Brown, Rose 04 Trust banking administration: transfer and prepare disbursement cheque.
6/25/2018]Bricks, Hartley 0.7 Conference call to discuss status of condo application and other issue;

forward Edison Reserve Fund study to D. Dalley.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
6/27/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.8 Discussion with C. Prophet re status of various issues; review of minor
variance application, sign and send back to B. Parker; review and respond
to correspondence from C. Stamek re need to get court order striking
cross claims.
6/27/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque and prepare for

courier.

130.9
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DeIOitte ll)l;‘lllig:cl:structurisngggzsss07

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community IS( 812; ggkg}g?

¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200 -
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: November 02, 2018
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 12289 3605
For professional services rendered
Fees
Invoice #48
For services rendered forthe period July 1 to October 31,2018 in
connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now
known as Deloitte Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the
“Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of
Sharon” or the “Company”):
Please see the attached appendices for details.
HST applicable 69,985.00
Expense
HST applicable 188.81
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 9,122.60

Total Amount Due (CAD) 79,296.41

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Summary of Fees
Professional Position Hours Rate

Paul Casey Partner 2.8 $600.00 $ 1,680.00
Hartley Bricks Director 121.5 $525.00 63,787.50
Anna Koroneos Senior Manager 6.0 $470.00 2,820.00
Sean Jack Analyst 12.0 $225.00 2,700.00
Ada Koo Analyst 15 $125.00 187.50
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 49 $100.00 490.00
Total hours and professional fees 148.7 69,985.00

Out of Pocket Expenses:
Mileage 6.96
Taxi 24.38
Courier 157.47
Subtotal 70,173.81
HST@13% 9,122.60
Amount Payable (CAD)| $ 79,296.41
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
7/4/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and respond to correspondence from R. Berg and D. Palmieri.
7/4/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques.
7/5/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements; correspondence with P. Crisclago re
furniture.
7/6/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.2 Review and respond to correspondence from R. Berg re union matters;
update condo budget and notes.
7/9/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Correspondence with Sterling Karamar re G/L expense account details
and review of same; prepare condo budget and notes.
7/10/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.5 Correspondence with Sterling re expense details; correspondence with C.
j Stanek re status of sale of Unit 901; revise condo budget.
7/11/2018|Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Revise notes to budget; review of condo plan as provide by D. Miret and
correspondence concerning lockers.
7/12/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and execute disbursements.
7/16/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.6 Discussion with N. Lee re status of building permits; conference call with
team re status of condo application.
7/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Discussion with R. Berg re status of various issues; review and execute
disbursements.
7/23/2018Brown, Rose 0.8 Trust banking administration: input ministry funds, prepare transfer to
ACC, obtain signature and send to TD bank; prepare email to ACC and
input into GL.
7/24/2018|Casey, Paul 25 Telephone calls from Counsel; conference calls with Gowlings and
Blaneys; meetings and calls with A. Koroneos and on-site team; debrief
and further reporting emails.
7/24/2018{Koroneos, Anna 45 With P. Casey, E. Golden and P. Shea; discussion with H. Bricks; attend at
reception to meet with tenant family member; travel to and attend at
Rose of Sharon for Sheriff eviction.
7/25/2018|Casey, Paul 0.1 Emails regarding eviction.
7/25/2018]|Koroneos, Anna 0.1 Review of emails on eviction status.
7/26/2018|Casey, Paul 0.2 Emails regarding status of Uni PH8t; meeting A. Koroneos and
instructions.
7/26/2018|Koo, Ada 04 Trust bank account reconciliation for June 2018 (2 bank accounts).
7/26/2018|Koroneos, Anna 0.1 Review of emails on eviction status and reentry with property manager
and E. Golden.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
7/27/2018]Koroneocs, Anna 0.3 Review of email from B. Kim and respond with questions on G. Kim's
attendance.
7/30/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Discussion with A. Koroneos re status of G. Kim; review and respond to
correspondence from J. Milnes.
7/31/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review of CRA assessments and correspond. with J. Milnes and R. Ahmad
: re same; review and respond to correspondence from P. Crisolago.
8/1/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review cash flow forecast prepared by Sterling Karamar; correspondence
with Edison re status of proposal.
8/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with N. Lee re status of landscaping issue and prepare
corresp. to counsel; review and execute disbursements; correspond from
Sterling re operational matters. '
8/2/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: prepare transfer between account and
send to the bank.
8/3/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.2 Review and execute disbursements.
8/7/2018|Koroneos, Anna 07 Telephone call with B. Kim of ROS regarding G. Kim's attendance on site;
email to E. Golden and H. Bricks; telephone call with E. Golden and
subsequent call with B. Kim and G. Kim on access; review and respond to
emails from B. Kim and E. Goiden.
8/8/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Conference call with team to discuss status of condo application;
discussion with N. Lee re status of landscaping agreement.
8/13/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and execute disbursements; review and respond to correspond.
from B. Kim re operational matters.
8/13/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques.
8/14/2018]Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review and execute disbursements; review of shared facilities draft.
8/17/2018|Bricks, Hartley 04 Discussion with N. Espinoza re status of various issues.
8/20/2018]Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Attend team conference call re status of condo application;
correspondence to B. Parker re status and timing for discussion;
discussion with D. Dalley re comments on budget notes.
8/21/2018|Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: review account online for incoming wire
and prepare transfer to ACC for H. Bricks to sign.
8/22/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: transfer have signed and send to TD Bank;
send email to ACC to confirm transfer sent and input into Ascend.
8/27/2018]Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Review and excecute disbursements; review budget.
8/29/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.7 Review insurance renewal and review of files regarding same.
8/30/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.6 Respond to questions from insurance broker; review shared facilities
agreement; review of furnishings proposal and respond to D. Palmieri.
8/31/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.0 Review shared facilities agreement and forward to D. Dalley.
9/4/2018|Bricks, Hartley 25 Review and execute listing agreement extension; prepare information

requested by Jensen.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
9/5/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Conference call re status of condo conversion; review of D. Palmeri's
comments on budget and revise same.
9/6/2018Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Correspondence re meeting with parties interested in LTC; review and
respond to information requested by insurance broker.
9/10/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.
9/12/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.2 Arrange meeting with interested parties; review and execute
disbursements; review of cash funding request from Sterling Karamar
and process same.
9/12/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: transfer between accounts. »
9/14/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.5 Discussion with B. Rudberg regarding model suites and lobby furniture.
9/17/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Conference call with team re status of condo application; meeting with
parties interested in purchasing nursing home; review of shared facilities
agreement comments.
9/17/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: update GL incoming deposit and reconcile
to Ascend.
9/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Attendance at Ministry of Labour for mediation with Union, various
discussions with P. Shea regarding same; review and revise terms and
conditions of sale and APS.
9/20/2018|Bricks, Hartley 6.0 Draft APS; correspondence with B. Rudberg re model suites;
correspondence with ACC re MOH correspondence and adjustments;
forward draft docscuments to P. Shea.
9/20/2018|Brown, Rose 0.2 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque.
9/21/2018|Bricks, Hartley 14 |Correspondence with B. Parker re parking study; review of files, prepare
. questions for nursing home administrator facility and parking; review
and respond to correspondence from insurer.
9/24/2018{Koo, Ada 0.3 Prepared July bank reconciliation.
9/25/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Correspondence with Gowlings re minor variance application including
review of documents; discussion with J. Jensen re timing of sale process.
9/26/2018|Bricks, Hartley 0.8 Correspondence with Sterling re comments on Shared Facilities
Agreement; review of Gowlings comments on same; review and execute
disbursements.
9/27/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Update shared facilities agreement; review of outstanding matters and
update same; review of lobby furniture quotation and correspondence
with D. Palmeri re same.
9/28/2018|Bricks, Hartley 35 Discussion with D. Daley re outstanding issues; revise sections of Shared
Facilities Agreement for insurance and forward to D. Daley for
comments; update project schedule and forward to Gowlings for
comments. s
10/1/2018|Bricks, Hartley 45 Review of Jensen marketing website and prepare comments; conference

call with team re status of condo application; respond to emails from D.
Daley.
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Date Professional Hours Narrative
10/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley 25 Review correspondence re expression of interest, corresp. to P. Shea re
same; review of APS for new condo sales.
10/3/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.8 Review of Condo APS and provide comments to Gowlings; review of
correspondence from Sterling Karamar re Shared Facilities Agreement
comments, and prepare correspondence to Gowlings re same.
10/4/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.5 Discussion with a party interested condos; review and execute
disbursements; correspondence concerning Diversatech and repairs and
maintenance matters.
10/9/2018|Bricks, Hartley 1.1 Correspondence with B. Rudberg re model suites; review and execute
disbursements; review and respond to correspondence re parking at the
property.
10/11/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.3 Pfepare Schedule D; correspondence with R. Berg re parking.
10/15/2018|Bricks, Hartley 5.8 Correspondence with B. Rudberg re furnishings; review and execute
disbursements; prepare schedule D and forward to D. Dalley; call with
team re status of condo application; revise condo budget for insurance
costs; revise Schedule D and resend to D. Daley.
10/15/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: prepare rush cheque and take to reception
for pick up.
10/16/2018|Bricks, Hartley 30 Review of Declaration; respond to queries from D. Daley; review and
execute disburements.
10/16/2018|Koo, Ada 04 August bank reconciliation.
10/17/2018|Bricks, Hartley 40 Review of Declaration and prepare comments for Gowlings.
10/17/2018{Brown, Rose 0.4 Trust banking administration: disbursement cheque; review banking
entries for September and input into Ascend.
10/18/2018|Bricks, Hartley 3.5 Discussion with J. Jensen re status; review of correspondence from a
party interested in LTC and respond to same; review of Declaration and
Shared Facilities Agreement and forward comments to D. Daley; review
and execute disbursements.
10/18/2018|Brown, Rose 03 Trust banking administration: prepare transfer between accounts.
10/19/2018|8Bricks, Hartley 0.1 Review and respond to questions from J. Jensen.
10/22/2018/Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Prepare information for J. Jensen; correspondence with P. Shea re APS
and terms and conditions of sale; discussion with a party interested in
property.
10/22/2018|Jack, Sean 40 Prepare financial and format financial information for nursing home from
nursing home manager reports.
10/22/2018|Koo, Ada 04 September bank reconciliations (2 accounts).
10/22/2018|Koroneos, Anna 0.3 With H. Bricks and search land title for 15 and 17 Maplewood then
Vaughan Road address, report back with document.
10/23/2018}8Bricks, Hartley 3.0 Prepare information requested by J. Jensen; respond to correspondence

from an interested party.




138

Date Professional Hours Narrative

10/23/2018]Jack, Sean 8.0 Prepare financial and format financial information for nursing home from
nursing home manager reports.

10/24/2018|Bricks, Hartley 40 Attendance at property to meet with B. Rudberg and D. Palmieri to
review model suites, party room and PHS; review of garden storage
room in penthouse; review of storage rooms in parking; correspondence
with P. Crisolago re work to be completed.

10/25/2018|Bricks, Hartley 2.5 Revise Terms and Conditons of sale; prepare sale materials and load into
drop box.

10/25/2018|Brown, Rose 0.5 Trust banking administration: reconcile GL to Bank and prepare transfer
to ACC and send to TD Bank.

10/26/2018|Bricks, Hartley 30 Prepare materials for sale process; corresp. with B. Parker re status of
parking study; discussion with C. Prophet re status of sale process.

10/29/2018|Bricks, Hartley 4.0 Prepare info for sales process; correspondence with B. Parker re by-laws;
discussion with J. Jensen re data room.

10/29/2018|Brown, Rose 0.3 Trust banking administration: deposit.

10/30/2018|Bricks, Hartley 5.0 Prepare info for data room; discussion with J. Jensen re financial
information; conference call with team to discuss status of condo
application and other matters; discussion with D. Palmieri re marketing
strategy.

10/31/2018|Bricks, Hartley 45 Discussion with Y. Boswell re status; prepare professional fee analysis for

Y. Boswell; prepare information for data room; discussion with J. Jensen
re status; correspondence with D. Daley and D. Mlret re mechanical
room.

148.7
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Date: January 16,2019
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For professional services rendered for the period October 29 to December
31, 2018 in.connection with the appointment of Deloitte & Touche
Inc., now known as Deloitte Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager
“““““““““““““““““““““““““““““““““““ (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Commuinity (“Rose
of Sharon” or the "Company”).
Please see attached appendices for details.
HST applicable 37,980.00
Expense
HST applicable 131.57
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 4,954.50

Total Amount Due (CAD) 43,066.07

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Name Level Rate Hours Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 525.00 66.00 34,650.00
Jack, Sean Analyst 225.00 14.00 3,150.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 100.00 1.80 180.00
Total hours and professional fees 81.80 37,980.00
Expenses
Mileage 19.32
Courier 77.28
Office Supplies 34.97
Total Expenses 131.57
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Date Professional Narrative Hours
10/29/2018}Jack, Sean Prepare and format financial information from nursing home manager 8.0
reports.
10/30/2018|Jack, Sean Prepare and format financial information from nursing home manager 40
reports. -
11/1/2018|Bricks, Hartley Prepare info for data room; prepare fee analysis for Y. Boswell; revise and 4.0
finalize terms and conditions of sale and draft APS.
11/2/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review of financial analysis, discussion with R. Berg and R. Ahmad re 2.3
reconciliation of results; discussion with J. Jensen re sales process and
provide documents re same.
11/2/2018|Jack, Sean Prepare and format financial information from nursing home manager 20
reports.
11/5/2018|8Bricks, Hartley Discussion with a person interested in the property; review and respond 45
to various correspondence in connection with condo application;
conference call with J. Jensen to review dataroom contents.
11/6/2018]Bricks, Hartley Review marketing budget prepared by D. Palmieri; provide data room 20
info to J. Jensen; discussion with N. Espinoza re status; prepare summary
of Union status and forward to P. Shea for comments.
11/7/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review of files and provide J. Jensen with information for data room. 0.5
11/7/2018|Brown, Rose Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques. 0.5
11/8/2018|Bricks, Hartley Correspondence with J. Jensen re purchaser interest; review and respond 45
to correspondence from R. Berg re 2019 Budget allocations; discussion
with R. Berg re budget allocations; review of dataroom; discussion with J.
Jensen re status.
11/12/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to correspondence from D. Dalley; discussion with 15
R. Berg re request for a visit from federal MP. ’
11/13/2018|Bricks, Hartley Team call to discuss status of condo application; correspondence re 0.7
insurance.
11/19/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review of correspondence from B. Stoyles re comments on insurance 1.2
section of Shared Facilities Agreement and correspondence with D.
Daley re same; update project tracking schedule and distribute.
11/20/2018|Bricks, Hartley Correspondence with R. Berg re various matters. 0.2
11/21/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; discussion with N. Lee re status of 0.8
water for unit 313; respond to correspondence from N. Espinoza re status
of various issues; correspondence with D. Palmieri re status of marketing
plan.
11/22/2018|Brown, Rose Trust banking administration: prepare transfers. 0.5
11/23/2018|Bricks, Hartley Various corresp. with D. Palmieri re marketing materials; review and 0.5
execute disburements.
11/26/2018|Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of correspondence from Y. 0.5
Boswell.
11/27/2018|Bricks, Hartley Various correspondence with J. Jensen and R. Berg re site tours; 1.1
discussion with J. Jensen re site tours and other sale process matters.
11/28/2018|Bricks, Hartley Attendance at City of Toronto Committee hearing for minor variance 5.5
application; further meeting with P. Lee re concerns on condo plan;
prepare correspondence to team re results of minor variance application;
review of files and discussion with R. Berg re use of space.
11/29/2018|8Bricks, Hartley Prepare materials for due diligence; prepare response to P. Lee letter. 45
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Professional

Narrative

Hours

11/30/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with R. Berg re due diligence info requests; prepare response
to P. Lee letter and forward to P. Shea and E. Golden for comments;
correspondence with P. Crisolago re relocation of superintendent's
office.

2.5

12/3/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with N. Lee re exit doors; review, analysis and respond to corresp.
from a life lease purchase re CAM fees; corresp. with D. Palmieri re status
of marketing program.

35

12/4/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare schedule illustrating determination of shared facility utilities
percentages and forward to J. Jensen; conference call with team to
discuss status of condo application; corresp. with P. Crisolago re access
door.

2.5

12/5/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with D. Palmeri re work to be done at the property, follow up
with P. Crisolago; review of floor plan files; review and execute
disbursements.

35

12/6/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Review of 2019 budget for LTC, compare to-prior results, forward
questions to R. Berg and review of responses, provide to J. Jensen for
data room.

0.5

12/7/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare status update email for N. Espinoza and Y. Boswell; corresp. with
D. Palmieri re work to be done on site; review and execute
disbursements.

2.1

12/10/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with ). Jensen re status of site tours; corresp, with J. Jensen re data
room materials and review of same; disc. with Y. Boswell re CMHC
certificate and status of sales processes.

2.0

12/11/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Review of pictures taken of condo model suites, party room and lobby
and forward to CMHC and Peoples; review and execute disbursements;
correspondence with ACC re invoices; corresp. with J. Jensen re site visits
and due diligence materials.

1.5

12/12/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with J. Jensen re data room materials.

1.2

12/13/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with J. Jensen re due
diligence requests; prepare due diligence materials.

2.5

12/14/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Review corresp. and disc. status of sale process with J. Jensen.

0.8

12/17/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Reviewand respond to various corresp from J. Jensen; disc. with R.
Shiwram of Brokerlink re premium payment and corresp. with Sterling
Karamar re same.

1.5

v 12/18/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare due diligence materials and forward to J. Jensen.

1.6

12/19/2018

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Transfer between account.

03

12/19/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with team re status of condo application; disc. with R. Berg re
various operational matters; review of shared facilities agreement and
send comments to D. Daley; review and execute disbursements; corresp
with B. Parker re requirement by the City of Toronto for an ESA in order
to convey strip of land.

2.7

12/20/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Various corresp. with J. Jensen re due diligence request.

0.5

12/21/2018

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Transfer to ACC and input incoming EFT
in GL.

0.5

12/21/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Attend at premises to review space for superintendent and discuss
operational matters with R. Berg.

15

12/31/2018

Bricks, Hartley

Review and prepare response to due diligence questions from an
interested party.

1.3

81.8
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Bay Adelaide Centre
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Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community ¢/o
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

d Date: March 19, 2019
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 133245290RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period January 1 to February 28, 2019 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
"Company”):
Please see the attached appendices for details.
HST applicable 70,480.00
Expense
\ HST applicable 686.83
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 9,251.69

Total Amount Due (CAD) 80,418.52

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Summary of Fees

Name Level Rate Hours Amount

Paul Casey Partner 600.00 1.7 1,020.00
Hartley Bricks Director 525.00 131.5 69,037.50
Catherine Hristow Director 525.00 0.2 105.00
Ada Koo Analyst 125.00 0.3 37.50
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 100.00 2.8 280.00
Total hours and professional fees 136.5 70,480.00
Expenses Amount

Courier - 61.75
Travel 39.87
Photography (for Condo Marketing Program) 585.21

Total Expenses 686.83
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

1/2/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of quote for PH8 and forward to D. Palmieri for comments;
review and execute disbursements.

0.7

1/3/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Attendance at 15 Maplewood to meet with P. Crisolago to review work
to be completed at premises; prepare ninth report to court,
correspondence to P. Shea re same; review and respond to due diligence
questions sent by R. Berg.

5.0

1/4/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with J. Jensen re status of sale process; review of condo
documents.

46

1/7/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Revise ninth report to court for OLRB status and forward to P. Shea for
comments; respond to P. Crisolago re quote for PH8 and comments
from D. Palmieri.

3.0

1/7/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques.

04

1/8/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Correspondence with D. Palmieri re PH8 and site visit; review and
respond to corresp. from P. Crisolago; review and execute
disbursements.

06

1/9/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of balcony repair quote and correspondence with P. Crisolago re
same; respond to various questions from J. Jensen.

1.2

1/9/2019

Koo, Ada

November bank reconciliation.

0.3

1/10/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to various due diligence requests from J. Jensen;
discussion with J. Jensen re status of sale process; discussion with P. Shea
re his conversation with counsel to a purchaser and status of OLRB
Decision appeal.

3.4

1/11/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Various discussions with J. Jensen re due diligence questions, review of
files and prepare response; correspondence with R. Berg re leased assets
and vacation pay; correspondence with D. Palmieri re meeting; review of
SFA allocations.

2.6

1/14/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare for and attend a meeting on site with H. Milborne and various of
his associates to review the units and discuss marketing process;
discussion with J. Jensen re offer status; discussion with P. Shea re offer
status; revise condo budget.

44

1/15/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with D. Daley and D. Miret re condo documents; review and
execute disbursements; review of offers received for nursing home,
prepare analysis of same, discussion with J. Jensen re offers received,
prepare confirmation emails to parties submitting offers.

6.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours
1/16/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare for conference call with J. Jensen, N. Espinoza and P. Shea to 5.0
discuss offers received and next steps; prepare correspondence to
offerors and review with J. Jensen and P. Shea; discussion with R. Bergre
operational matters.
1/17/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare and send correspondence to Offerors; discussion with J. Jensen 1.8
re his discussions with an Offeror; correspondence from B. Kim re status
of bathroom in PH8 and correspondence with D. Palmieri re same.
1/17/2019|Brown, Rose Confirm incoming wire received; prepare wire for return of wire funds for 04
offer not accepted.
1/18/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare condo application and sales process status update for N, 0.5
Espinoza.
1/18/2019{Brown, Rose Trust account administration: disbursement wire. 0.5
1/18/2019]Casey, Paul Discussion H. Bricks regarding sale process; execute wire transfer for 0.2
return of deposit.
1/21/2019|Bricks, Hartley Discussion with J.-Jensen re status with offers; discussion with R. Berg re 6.0
building matters; review and revise budget and condo documents;
various correspondence to D. Daley re condo documents.
1/22/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of standard unit by-law and correspondence with P. Crisolago re 40
same; review of 2018 general ledger and adjust Budget Statement;
review and execute disbursements,
1/22/2019{Brown, Rose Trust account administration: disbursements transfer to ACC, 04
1/23/2019{Bricks, Hartley Discussion with J. Jensen re sale process; review and execute 2.5
disbursements; discussion with N. Espinoza regarding provision analysis
and prepare response to same.
1/23/2019{Brown, Rose Confirm transfer to ACC with TD bank. 0.1
1/24/2019]Bricks, Hartley Conference call with team to discuss status of the Condo application and 5.0
sale process; review various condo documentss; review unit plans.
1/25/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review and revise unit plans; conference call with N. Espinoza and Y. 3.9
Boswell to discuss status of condo application and LTC sale process.
1/25/2019|Brown, Rose Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques. 0.2
1/28/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of amended offers and responses to clarification questions; 47
various discussions with J. Jensen and P. Shea re offers; correspondence
with N. Espinoza and Y. Boswell to arrange conference call to discuss
same.
1/29/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of second round offers in detalil, prepare summary schedule and 5.2

forward to N. Espinoza and V. Boswell and subsequent conference call to
discuss offers; prepare correspondence to offeror seeking further
clarification; prepare comments for Peoples/CMHC.
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

1/30/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with D. Palmieri re condo documents; discussion with insurer
re standard unit by-law; discussion with A. Prete of MOHLTC re licencing
matters; prepare correspondence to CMHC re LTC sale process
background.

3.2

1/31/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with J. Jensen re offers and status; review and respond to
various correspondence from P. Crisolago re property matters; review
and execute disbursements.

13

2/1/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Revise maintenance fees for parking and storage, revise budget and
forward to D. Palmieri; discussion with Y. Boswell re nursing home offers
and prepare correspondence to N. Espinoza with Receiver's
recommendation; review and execute disbursements.

5.6

©2/7/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with P. Casey and P. Shea re status of judicial review of OLRB
Decision.

0.5

2/7/2019

Casey, Paul

Discussion with H. Bricks and P. Shea re status of appeal of OLRB
Decision.

0.5

2/11/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Respond to question from Y. Boswell re sale process matters;
correspondence with Rykka; prepare schedules to APS; discussion with P.
Cho and prepare letter re rejection of offer; correspondence to D.
Palmieri and D. Dalley re condo matters.

42

2/12/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Correspondence with D. Dalley re Standard Unit by-law; various
discussion with R. Berg re status of sale process and operational matters;
review of condo documentss; prepare schedules to LTC APS.

45

2/12/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust banking administration: prepare wire transfer to return offer
deposit; prepare disbursement cheque and put front desk for pick up.

0.5

2/13/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and revise SFA and forward to D. Dalley;-review and execute
disbursements; discussion with J. Jensen re sale process matters; team
conference call to discuss status of condo application; discussion with Y.
Boswell re LTC sale matters; review of APS documents.

55

2/14/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of APS documents, discussion with P. Shea re status of order,
review of draft order language and provide comments; update ninth
report of Receiver and forward to P. Shea.

4.0

2/15/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with D. Palmieri re status and timing for discussion; discussion
with E. Petes of MOH re licence transfer process; review of Development
Agreement and L-SAA; discussion with D. Palmieri re preliminary
comments and timing to discuss.

25

2/19/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of correspondence from B. Parker and prepare notes on same;
discussion with P. Shea regarding condo docs and LTC APS; prepare
blackline changes to LTC documents and forward to P. Shea; conference
call with H. Milborne and D. Palmieri re condo budget and documents.

6.5

2/20/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare response to P. Lee letter to City of Toronto; review and execute
disbursements; discussion with R. Berg re LTC space usage.

6.0

2/21/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare response to P. Lee corresp; discussion of response with P. Shea.

42
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Date Name Narrative Hours
2/22/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of correspondence from J. Jensen re purchaser request for 3.0
environmental reports, review of files and emails and respond to same;
revise and finalize budget and notes.
2/24/2019|Casey, Paul Review Court Report and comments to H. Bricks. 1.0
2/24/2019|Hristow, Catherine  |Review report to the court regarding the appointment of directors. 0.2
2/25/2019(Bricks, Hartley Review and revise various condo documents and forward to D. Dalley; 5.5
: various correspondence with D. Dalley re condo documents; discussion
with an individual concerning the status of the sale of the LTC; discussion
with counsel to an interested party; respond to question from offeror
review of P. Casey comments on ninth report.
2/25/2019|Brown, Rose Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques. 03
2/26/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare correspondence to CMHC and Peoples re status of sale 1.5
processes; discussion with J. Jensen re due diligence matters.
2/27/2019]Bricks, Hartley Discussion with Y. Boswell re status of LTC sales processes. 0.5
2/28/2019]Bricks, Hartley Conference call with CMHC re status of sale of LTC; review of LTC APS 24

documents and provide comments to P. Shea; correspondence with R.
Berg re asset listing preparation.

T 1365
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Deloitte. I 584371

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community -I‘;:L gﬂgg gg}:g:g?

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0AS

d Date: May 18,2019
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period March 1 to 31, 2019 in connection with the appointment
of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte Restructuring
Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
{Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company").
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 21,622.50
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 2,810.93

Total Amount Due (CAD) 24,433.43

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Deloitte.

Appendix # 1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Rate Hours Amount

Paul Casey Partner 600.00 0.2 120.00
Hartley Bricks Director 525.00 40.6 21,315.00
Ada Koo Analyst 125.00 0.3 37.50
Rose Brown Trust Administrator 100.00 1.5 150.00

Total hours and professional fees 42.6 21,622.50
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

3/4/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of correspondence from J. Jensen re environmental
reports, review of files and respond to same; further discussion
with 1. Jensen re status; review comments from Gowlings and
revise various condo documents.

3.0

3/4/2019

Koo, Ada

Bank reconciliation for January 2019.

0.1

3/5/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp. from LTC purchaser and forward questions
to D. Dalley for comment.

0.5

3/6/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of letter from Korean community group to MOHLTC,
forward to CMHC with comments; discussion with B. Parker re
response to City re letter, review of files re By-law and amenity
space and respond to correspondence from D. Miret.

2.2

3/6/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust banking administration: disbursement wire to ACC.

0.3

3/7/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare response to questions raised by the purchaser
including discussion with P. Shea; provide due diligence
materials to LTC purchaser.

2.5

3/11/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and provide comments on letter to City of Toronto;
various correspondence with D. Daley re condo documents;
correspondence with N. Espinoza re status of condo process.

2.2

3/12/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Various correspondence with D. Dalley re condo documents;
discussion with R. Berg re inventory count; discussion with 1.
Jensen re status of due diligence and arrange for environmental
site visit; review and execute disbursements.

2.5

3/12/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust banking administration: input deposit made by offsite
staff, update website page.

0.4

3/13/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of monthly report and discussion with ACC re changes
to reporting; review and execute disbursements.

1.7

3/13/2019

Brown, Rose

Prepare transfer between accounts.

0.2

3/14/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Various correspondence with D. Palmieri re status of marketing
process; corresp. with P. Crisolago re status of quote on PHS;
arrange conference call for status update; discussion with R.
Berg re F/S matters.

2.8

3/15/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Discussion with R. Berg re reporting matters; correspondence
with purchaser re status of APS.

0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

3/18/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of files and prepare corresp to Gowlings re status of 3.4
condo application; review of response from B. Parker;
discussion with J. Jensen re sale process matters; discussion
with D. Dalley; conference call with Peoples and CMHC re
status of condo app and sales process.

3/19/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review and respond to 1.5
corresp from R. Berg; prepare updated timeline.

3/20/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements: review of email from D. 0.6
Dalley and forward to N. Espinoza.

3/20/2019|Brown, Rose Input deposit received from offsite staff. 0.1

3/21/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare schedules for APS; discussion with R. Berg re status of 3.0
various issues; finalize project scheduling timetable and
forward to N. Espinoza.

3/22/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of purchaser comments on APS, discussion comments 4.0
with P. Shea; prepare schedules for APS; review and execute
disbursements.

3/25/2019|Bricks, Hartley Discusson with 1. Jensen re status of draft APS; prepare 3.5
schedules for APS.

3/26/2019|Bricks, Hartley Prepare schedules for APS; review L-SAA agreement, discuss 2.4
with P. Casey and execute.

3/26/2019|Casey, Paul Meeting H. Bricks and review of Ministry agreement. 0.2

3/27/2019{Bricks, Hartley Review of contracts and prepare schedule for APS; 2.0
correspondence with R. Berg re various matters.

3/28/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.5

3/28/2019|Brown, Rose Trust banking administration: disbursement cheques and 0.5
transfer to ACC.

3/29/2019|Bricks, Hartley Review of correspondence from purchaser, review of files and 1.8
prepare response to same; correspondence with P. Crisolago re
status of various issues with property.

3/29/2019]|Koo, Ada February bank reconciliation for 2 bank accounts. 0.2

42.6
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DeIOitte$ ll)re‘lzgeicReestructurigI(:cO6391 21

e,
Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community c/o Deloitte ?:-::é; gi} g; gg}:g}g?

Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

d Date: June 18,2019
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period April 1 to May 31,2019 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touché Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
"Company"):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 27,928.00
Expense
HST applicable 177.89
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 3,653.77

Total Amount Due (CAD) 31,759.66

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall bé charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid. -
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Casey, Paul Partner 0.3 $ 600.00 | $ 180.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 51.2 $ 525.00 | $ 26,880.00
Haghiri, Golnaz Senior 1.9 $ 295.00 | $ 560.50
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.3 $ 125.00 | $ 37.50
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.7 $ 100.00 | $ 270.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 56.4 $ 27,928.00
Expenses:

Courier $ 177.89
Total fees and expenses $ 28,105.89
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Date Name Narrative Hours
4/1/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. Shea re court hearing; review of OLRB 1.3
factum.
4/1/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.4
4/2/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. to counsel concerning status of work streams; disc. 2.2
with R. Berg re vacation pay matters; prepare corresp. to life
lease purchasers re status.
4/3/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with D. Daley re corresp. to life lease purchasers; 1.0
prepare corresp. to Life lease purchasers; review of quote to
repair PH8 and corresp. with D. Palmieri re same.
4/5/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with J. Jensen re 1.3
status of purchaser; disc. with P. Shea re AVO and APS.
4/8/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with D. Miret re status of submissions; corresp. with 2.4
R. Berg re vacation pay info; revise letter to life lease
purchasers and update schedules for payment amounts on
closing.
4/9/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review vacation accrual materials and respond to R. Berg; call 2.8
with N. VanderKooy of MOHLTC re status of license transfer
process; update parking schedule and forward to B. Kim for
confirmation; disc. with J. Haghiri re update of schedule of
purchase price.
4/9/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea re position on various APS items and then 2.0
call with purchaser to discuss business terms
4/9/2019 |[Haghiri, Golnaz Work on the purchase notice amount calculation; discussion 1.9
with H. Bricks in respect of same.
4/10/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from D. Daley re budget documents, disc. 2.5
re same and revise; disc. with J. Jensen re status of purchaser
due diligence
4/11/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review of wage grid and percent increases and retro pay 2.8
accrual info from R. Berg and prepare corresp to J. Jensen;
review and execute disbursements.
4/15/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review of revised APS and provide comments to P. Shea. - 1.0
4/16/2019 |Casey, Paul Update meeting with H. Bricks regarding sales processes. 0.2
4/16/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Casey re sale process and status of APS. 0.2
4/17/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with P. Shea 0.5
regarding APS.
4/17/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2
4/23/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. to B. Parker re status of City review of drawings 0.1
4/23/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer between 0.9
accounts and prepare wire to ACC.
4/24/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. concerning B. Kim's office; disc. with J. Jensen re 0.8
status of transaction; corresp. with Ryhan re cash flow
4/25/2019 |Brown, Rose Complete transfer to ACC and send to TD Bank for processing - 0.2
input into Ascend.
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

4/25/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from N. Espinoza; corresp. to.
D. Miret and D. Daley re update on timing; review of purchaser
blackline changes to APS and disc. same with P. Shea; disc.
with D. Palmieri re status of CMA

2.2

4/26/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with B. Parker re meeting with the City and prepare
corresp. regarding same; disc. with N. Espinoza re questions
and response to CMHC and email to Y. Boswell re same.

1.5

4/30/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with J. Jensen re due diligence materials and review of
correspondence from purchaser regarding same.

0.5

5/1/2019

Casey, Paul

Meeting H. Bricks and execute closing documents.

0.1

5/1/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review transition agreement and provide comments to P.
Shea.

0.5

5/2/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Preparation for and attendance at City of Toronto planning
dept. to discuss zoning and housing issues; further disc. with
P. Shea and B. Parker re preparation of response to the City;
review of draft response to City and provide comments to
Gowlings.

2.9

5/2/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. -

0.2

5/3/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with B. Parker re response to City of Toronto and review
and provide comments on same.

1.0

5/6/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of CMA from Milborne and forward to CMHC; corresp.
with S. Gray re status of APS; conf. call with team to provide
update on meeting with City and other matters with Condo and
LTC; prepare written summary of matters discussed on the call
to N. Espinoza.

2.9

5/7/2019.-

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare schedules for LTC APS, review of revised approval and
vesting order and provide comments to P. Shea; review of
draft language to the City and provide comments to B. Parker

3.0

5/8/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp. from B. Parker re bylaw interpretation,
further review of bylaw and respond to same; prepare
documents for LTC APS

2.8

5/9/2019

Koo, Ada

March bank reconciliation for 2 bank account

0.2

5/9/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of contracts schedule and forward to P. Shea; disc.
with Shea re status of APS and response to City of Toronto;
disc. with 1. Jensen re status; review and execute
disbursements.

1.5

5/10/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with P. Shea re status of LTC APA; review of
purchaser changes to APA, disc. with P. Shea and meeting re
same.

1.5

5/14/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of execute APS, review and execute Authorization;
corresp. with J. Atchison re status of due diligence; draft court
report

5.0

5/15/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Draft report to court; review and execute disbursements.

4.0

5/22/2019

Koo, Ada

April bank reconciliation

0.1

5/22/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with B. Parker re status of City decision; corresp. with
nursing home administrator re status of B. Kim move; forward
monthly management report to S. Gray

0.4

5/23/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Update GL and reconcile bank
to GL and prepare transfer to ACC.

0.8
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Date Name Narrative Hours

5/28/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. Shea re timing for divisional court appeal. 0.1

5/29/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with Helen re timing for meeting with purchaser; 0.5
corresp. with J. Jensen re listing extension.

Total 56.4
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Rose of Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period June 1 to June 30, 2019 in connection with the

appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte Res
tructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of Sharon
(Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the “Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Sales Tax

}

Invoice

8000691862

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: July 24,2019

Client No.: 1154220

WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
HST applicable 15,168.00
HST at 13.00% 1,971.84

Total Amount Due (CAD) 17,139.84

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. [nterest slfall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% {equivalent to 18% per

annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 14.4 $ 525.00 7,560.00
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.1 $240.00 24.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 1.1 $ 105.00 7,584.00
Total Hours and Professional Fees 15.6 15,168.00
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Time Details - June 1

2019 to June 30, 2019

Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

6/5/2019

{

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re status of various
issues; disc. with P. Shea re Union
notice of motion; review and respond to
corresp. from N. Espinoza.

1.7

6/4/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with J. Jensen re due
diligence materials; coordinate site visit;

0.5

6/4/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Update
Ascend with Property Mgmt entries.

0.1

6/6/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration -
Disbursement cheques

0.1

6/11/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. re B. Kim move; disc. and
corresp with B. Parker re City of
Toronto decision and next steps.

0.8

6/10/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Draft report to court in preparation for
approval of sale of nursing home.

1.7

6/12/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare corresp. to M. Lombard re
status of condo application.

0.2

6/18/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with B. Parker re status of
discussions with the City; corresp and
discussion with R. Berg re offering
services to apartment residents;
respond to email from Y. Boswell.

0.9

6/17/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Continue to draft court report for
approval of APS.

6/19/2019

Koo, Ada

May bank reconciliation

6/24/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Daley re upcoming call
with Nursing Home purchaser; review
of shared facilities agreement; conf. call
with S. Gray of Rykka and counsel to
discuss outstanding items; disc. with M.
Mallich of Peoples re status of various.
matters.

6/25/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from
R. Berg; respond to email from D.
Dalley re condo docs.

0.6

6/25/2019

Brown, Rose

Telephone call from Ryhan and confirm
cheques and transfer will be completed
next day.

0.1

6/26/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration -
Disbursement cheques. Prepare
transfer to ACC.

0.8

160
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

6/27/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. from J. Atchinson re request
to extend due diligence period and
respond to same; review of corresp.
from.B. Parker re City's response and
forward same to Peoples and CMHC

1.8

6/26/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Draft court report for sale of property

2.4

15.6
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¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: November 12, 2019
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period July 1 to October 31,2019 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
“Company”):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 28,741.50
Expense
HST applicable 615.67
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 3,816.43

Total Amount Due (CAD) 33,173.60

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Total Fees and Expenses

Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Bricks, Hartley Director 53.9 525.00 | % 28,297.50

Koo, Ada Analyst 0.8 240.00 | $ 192.00

Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.4 105.00 | $ 252.00

Total Professional Hours and Fees 57.1 $ 28,741.50

Out-of-pocket Expenses $ 615.67
$

29,357.17
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

7/2/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of files re previous amenity offerings for residential
component; conf. call with Gowlings to discuss strategy for
dealing with City building dept issues with usage.

2.7

7/3/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re amenity offerings; prepare draft brochure
of amenities and forward to R. Berg for comments; conf. call
with N. Lee, D. Daley and B. Parker re site plan agreement
issues.

2.0

7/4/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare update email to M. Mallich; corresp. with R. Berg re
amenities.

1.0

7/5/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Revise draft court report; review of corresp. from B. Parker re
status of City response.

1.2

7/8/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re status of amenity brochure; revised draft
court report for approval of the APS.

1.9

7/9/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with R. Berg regarding temperature levels and need
for a new air conditioner, review of quotation and approve
purchase.

0.2

7/10/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of revised amenity brochure and discussion with R.
Berg re same; further revisions; disc. with P. Crisolago re
amenity offerings. Disc. with J. Jensen re status of due
diligence period.

2.4

7/11/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with B. Kim re amenity brochure, finalize and send to
B. Parker and respond to questions re same.

1.2

7/12/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of bylaw and condo approval conditions and respond to
corresp. from B. Parker; review and execute disbursements.

0.8

7/15/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with purchaser counsel re status of due diligence
condition waiver; disc. with 3. Jensen re status of purchaser
and APS.

0.4

7/16/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with E. Petes of MOH re licencing transfer process; disc.
with P, Shea re purchase due diligence status; conf. call with
counsel for the purchaser to discuss status of due diligence and
proposed amendment; disc. with C. Prophet re status

2.3

7/16/2019

Koo, Ada

Prepare June bank reconciliations.

0.2

7/22/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and prepare comments on amending agreement,
discuss same with P. Shea and forward revised comments.

1.3

7/22/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Update GL with incoming wire
received from Ministry, Reconciling GL to bank, Prepare
transfer to ACC and send to the bank.

0.8

7/23/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Send in transfer to ACC and
input into Ascend.

0.2

7/23/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare update on status of key issues for CMHC; disc. with R.
Berg re status of various matters.

1.4

7/24/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review of revised amending agreement and disc same with P.
Shea; corresp with M Lombard re property taxes and prepare
and forward schedule of taxes paid during receivership.

1.8
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

7/25/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Further disc. with P. Shea re amending agreement; corresp..-
with S. Gray re clarification of certain portions of agreemenf';
finalize and execute amending agreement.

0.7

7/26/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp with J. Jensen re
status of amendment and review of timelines in APS; respond
to correspondence from R.Berg

11

7/29/2019

Bricks, Hartley

review and execute disbursements; corresp. re timing for site
visit with purchaser; corresp. with ACC re noise complaint.

0.8

7/30/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp, to M. Mallich and Y. Boswell re update on Condo
application and nursing home sale process; review of
amendment and corresp. with P. Shea re second deposit;
corresp. re timing for site visit

1.2

8/1/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re status; review and execute
disbursements.

0.4

8/6/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp from tenant of 1105;
preparation and attendance at a meeting with the nursing
home purchaser at the property to review shared units, shared
facilities and easements.

3.1

8/7/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with R. Berg re
operational matters; review corresp. from Toronto Hydro and
forward to P. Crisolago.

1.1

8/9/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re resident matters; review and execute
disbursements; corresp. with N. Lee re status of completion of
superintendent space.

1.1

8/13/2019

Brown, Rose

Prepare wire transfer to Gowlings re transfer of deposit from
nursing home purchaser.

0.1

8/13/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare update on status of key issues for M. Mallich; review
and respond to corresp from N. Lee; meeting with parties
renting a unit in residential component re status of property.

1.2

8/14/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with B. Parker re status of City response.

0.2

8/14/2019

Brown, Rose

Send Wire request'to TD bank, confirm with the bank that they
have received and input into Ascend.

0.2

8/19/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to insurer regarding questions for
insurance renewal.

0.5

8/20/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with B, Parker re status of response from City and
request to set up meeting.

0.5

8/21/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with J. Jensen re info requests from Rykka and
corresp. with R. Berg regarding same; review of purchaser
comments on Shared Facilities Agreement and forward to D.
Dalley for comments.

0.8

8/23/2019

Brown, Rose

Prepare transfer to ACC.

0.3

8/26/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Dalley re purchaser's comments on Shared
Facilities Agreement.

0.7

8/28/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements.

0.2

9/6/2019

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; disc. with J. Jensen re
status; corresp. with M. Mallich re status.

1.2

9/6/2019

Koo, Ada

Preapre July bank reconciliation.

0.2
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Date Name Narrative Hours
9/11/2019 Bricks, Hartiey Review of files to prepare for meeting with City; pre-meeting 2.8
with B. Parker and P. Shea to discuss approach; attend
meeting with City solicitors to discuss bylaw usage compliance
issues.
9/12/2019 Bricks, Hartley Update email to M. Mallich and Y. Boswell re results of meeting 0.7
with the City and disc. with M. Mallich re same
9/16/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2
9/16/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with D. Dalley re Rykka changes to Shared Facilities 1.2
Agreement; conf. call with T. Katz and D. Dalley to discuss
changes to Shared Facilities Agreement.
9/17/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft corresp. to City of Toronto prepared by 1.8
Gowlings, review of files, and provide comments on same.
9/18/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with B. Parker re 0.7
response to the City of Toronto building department.
9/19/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re calculations of gross floor area and 0.8
amenity space and response to the City of Toronto; review and
execute disbursements.
9/23/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.2
9/24/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re building matters and response to the 0.7
city; disc. with J. Jensen re status of transaction.
9/26/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status of condo application and 0.7
transaction; review and execute disbursements.
9/26/2019 Koo, Ada Prepare August bank reconciliation for 2 accounts 0.2
9/27/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re status of condo application and other 0.3
issues.
10/16/2019 [Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker and P. Shea re status of City decision on 1.1
usage submission and disc. with floor area issues; conf. call
with T, Katz re status of SFA and proposal to move forward
with Court approval.
10/17/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Status update with M. Lombard and P. De Luca of Peoples. 0.5
10/21/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of nursing home 1.2
- reporting; prepare corresp. to nursing home purchaser re
monthly reporting and timing for court approval
10/21/2019 |Koo, Ada Prepare Sept. bank reconciliation for review. 0.2
10/22/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review cash flow forecast 0.5
and approve funds transfer.
10/22/2019 |[Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Reconcile Ascend GL to Bank 0.4
balance, Prepare transfer to ACC and have signed and send by
email to TD Bank. Confirm transfer with TD by phone. Confirm
process and input into Ascend and file back up.
10/23/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to questions from M. Mallich re status. 0.3
10/24/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Update Court report for approval of Nursing home APS; 2.2
corresp. with Gowlings re status of condo application.
10/25/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.3
10/28/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Transfer between accounts. 0.2




167

Date Name Narrative . Hours
10/28/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and revise report to court for sale approval; review of 2.3
’ draft amendment to APS and corresp. with P. Shea regarding

; same
10/29/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Emails with P. Shea re amendment to APS 0.2
Total 57.1
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Deloitte. oo

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community I::( g} gg gg}:g} 2(1)

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: January 06, 2020 \
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner;  Paul Casey
HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
For professiohal services rendered
Fees
For the period November 1 to December 31, 2019 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
“Company”):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 16,090.50
-
Expense
HST applicable 357.31
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00% 2,138.22
Total Amount Due (CAD) 18,586.03

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum), Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount
|casey, Paul Partner 1.0 |3 600.00 | $ 600.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 28.3 $ 525.00 | $ 14,857.50
Hristow, Catherine Director 1.0 $ 525.00 | $ 525.00
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.1 $ 240.00 | $ 24.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 0.8 $ 105.00 | $ 84.00
| Total Professional Hours and Fees 31,2 $ 16,090.50
Out of pocket expenses (courier, City of Toronto zoning review fees) $ 357.31
Total Fees and Expepses $ 16,447.81
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Work performed from November 1, 2019 to December 31, 2019

Date Name Narrative Hours

11/1/2019 Brown, Rose Checking account online for incoming wire. 0.1

11/4/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with Gowlings re 0.9
response from City.

11/5/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with P. Shea and B. 0.6
Parker re status of City response and options.

11/8/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.2

11/8/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Disbursement transfer between accounts. 0.2

11/13/2019 |[Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with Gowlings re status of response from the City; 0.4
review and execute disbursements.

11/14/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Crisolago re departing superintendent and 0.2
proposed replacement.

11/18/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to questions from Purchaser; Prepare for 4.7
and attend Divisional Court hearing re OLRB decision; further
disc. with P Shea and C. Stanek re same.

11/20/2019 |[Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with C. Jung of 0.5
City of Toronto re timing of response re bylaw matter.

11/21/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with M. Mallich and Y. Boswell re status of city 0.2
response; further corresp. with P. Shea re same.

11/25/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from the City and arrange meeting with 0.5
Gowlings to discuss; corresp. with P. Crisolago re departure of
building superintendent and proposed replacement.

11/25/2019 |Koo, Ada Prepare October bank of reconciliations (2) for review. 0.1

11/26/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from the City, disc. same with B. Parker 2.7
and P. Shea, prepare corresp. to Peoples regarding status;
corresp. with P. Crisolago re building superintendent; update
Peoples Trust; review of B. Parker memo.

11/28/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re status; corresp. with Y. Boswell re 0.7
City requirements re amenities; review and execute
disbursements.

12/2/2019 Bricks, Hartley Various corresp. with R. Berg and H. Jung re operational 0.3
matters.

12/3/2019 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with ACC and H. Jung re operational matters. 0.6

12/3/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. Send 0.2
email to client to pick up cheque.

12/4/2019 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Crisolago re status of replacement of 0.8
superintendent and various other issues with property; disc.
with R. Berg re status of nursing home and property.

12/5/2019 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.2

12/10/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status; corresp. with C. Jung of City of 1.2
Toronto re timing for response; review and execute
disbursements
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Date Name Narrative Hours

12/11/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with Y. Boswell re status update; corresp. with B. Parker 1.4
re building drawings, review of same and provide comments.

12/12/2019 |Hristow, Catherine QA review of Receiver's tenth report to the Court and provide 1.0
comments to H. Bricks regarding same.

12/12/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review P. Shea comments on report, revise report and 4.0
prepare appendices and forward to C. Hristow for comments;
prepare status memo for Y. Boswell of CMHC

12/13/2019 |Casey, Paul Emails H. Bricks regarding comments on court report. 1.0

12/13/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review comments on 10th report, finalize and forward to P. 4.2
Shea; prepare status update on various matters for Y. Boswell.

12/16/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. from R. Berg re 0.5
operational matters.

12/16/2019 |Brown, Rose Update website. 0.2

12/17/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Preparation for and attendance in court for the hearing of the 1.8
motion for approval and vesting order, various discussions
with P. Shea re same.

12/18/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with R. Berg 0.5
regarding MOH review report.

12/19/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with N. Lee 0.4
regarding proposed work for 3rd floor superintendent's unit.

12/20/2019 |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N. Lee re HVAC issues and disc. with P. Crisolago re 0.8
same

12/20/2019 |Brown, Rose Confirm transfer process with HB. 0.1

Total 31.2
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Rose of Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period January 1 to May 31, 2020 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte &Touche Inc.,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the "Receiver”) of Rose
of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community {“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Expense

Out of pocket Expenses

Sales Tax

Invoice
Deloitte LLP
Bay Adelaide Centre

8001222758

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca
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Date: June 05, 2020

Client No.: 1154220

WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
HST applicable 35,003.00
HST applicable 360.36
HST at 13.00% 4,597.24

Total Amount Due (CAD) 39,960.60

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Deloitte.

Appendix #1
Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours , Rate Amount
Casey, Paul Partner o | 600.00 600.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 62.3 525.00 32,707.50
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.2 525.00 105.00
Keene, Ashley Senior 0.2 295.00 59.00
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.4 240.00 96.00
Florea, Ramona Analyst 2.7 240.00 648.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 7.5 105.00 787.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees 74.3 35,003.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses:

Travel 86.65

Application Fees (City of Toronto) 273.71 360.36
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 35,363.36
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Date Name Narrative Hours

1/2/2020 Brown, Rose Input into Ascend GL entries for Property Mgmt company 0.2
accounts and print support and file.

1/6/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Cecconi of CMHC re arranging a site visit at 0.4
the property, corresp. with P. De Luca re same; corresp with
B. Parker re timing for meeting with the City.

1/6/2020 Brown, Rose Process transfer to ACC. 0.2

1/7/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; prepare cash flow 2.0
analysis; prepare correspondence to P. Deluca re request for
funding.

1/8/2020 Casey, Paul Review H. Bricks email regarding funding request and TC H. 0.2
Bricks.

1/8/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. Casey re funding request to Peoples; review 1.0
of files re Licensing Transfer Process.

1/9/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp to C. Jung of the City of Toronto re request for 0.1
assistance in setting up meeting re condo application.

1/10/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Crisolago re status of residential units. 0.2

1/13/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare corresp to MOH re licensing transaction proposal; 1.3
corresp. with E. Petes re contact info for Director; corresp. '
with S. Gray re status of licensing transaction proposal letter.

1/14/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. De Luca re professional fee questions and status 0.7
of funding; corresp. with B. Parker and P. Shea re City
response to request for meeting.

1/14/2020 Brown, Rose Sent HB wire info sheet. 0.1

1/15/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement input GL. 0.1

1/15/2020 Bricks, Hartley Finalize Receiver's Certificate, sign and forward to Peoples 0.2
Trust.

1/16/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with Gowlings 1.5
re meeting with the City; review of operating results for
nursing home and corresp. with R. Berg regarding same.,

1/17/2020 Bricks, Hartley Meeting at property with P. De Luca and R. Cecconi re tour of 2.5
facility and status of operations; disc. with H. Jung re nursing
home matters.

1/20/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from B. Parker re status; review of legal 1.0

invoices; review and execute disbursements.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

1/20/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Transfer between accounts. 0.2

1/21/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin. - Input disbursements into Ascend. 0.2

1/22/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.3

1/22/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from City and Corresp. with B. Parker re 1.0
same; review and execute disbursements.

1/23/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of ledgers provided by Sterling and update life lease 2.5
amounts owing.

1/23/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare transfer to ACC, send to TD Bank and confirm 0.5
receipt. Input into Ascend.

1/24/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Prepare additional transfer to ACC. 0.3

1/27/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of nursing home budget; respond to corresp. from a 0.5
life lease purchaser re status of condo application.

1/27/2020 Brown, Rose Sent out transfer between accounts - ACC. 0.1

1/29/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with R. Berg re 1.0
LTC operational matters.

1/31/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. to S. Gray re update on status of court order, 0.3
licence transfer process and condo application.

2/3/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; respond to corresp from 0.5
R. Berg

2/3/2020 Casey, Paul Meeting H. Bricks regarding status and funding. 0.2

2/3/2020 Koo, Ada Prepare December bank reconciliation - 2 accounts. 0.2

2/5/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare transfer between accounts and send to TD Bank. 0.2

2/6/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from P. De Luca re 3.2
appraisals; update Estimated Proceeds Analysis; review and
execute disbursements.

2/10/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N. Lee regarding third floor HVAC issue and other 0.5
building matters.

2/19/2020 Casey, Paul Review and execute estate disbursements. 0.1

2/25/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - reconcile account to GL and 0.5
prepare transfer to ACC.

2/26/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - have transfer to ACC signed 0.3
and scan send to TD Bank. Confirm received with TD Bank.

2/28/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of corresp. from 0.4
B. Parker re City of Toronto status.

3/2/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re operational matters; review of corresp. 0.2

from B. Parker re status of city review
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Date Name Narrative Hours

3/5/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit. 0.3

3/5/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of PPR review from the City of Toronto and disc. with 1.0
B.. Parker and P. Shea re same; corresp. with N. Lee re
permit issues

3/10/2020 Koo, Ada Prepare January bank reconciliation. 0.2

3/10/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with 1. Jensen re status of City review of condo docs 0.2

3/17/2020 Bricks, Hartley Provide update to S. Gray re status of condo application and 1.3
LTC; update to P. DelLuca re status of property and operating
costs.

3/18/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of LSAA amending agreement and corresp. with R. 1.5
Berg re same.

3/20/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with Ryhan re 0.5
boiler issues.

3/23/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.3

3/24/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer to ACC and 0.5
send and confirm with TD Bank Rec'd and processed.

3/24/2020 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

3/25/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administraiton - Input wire process yesterday 0.2
and send email to ACC to confirm amounts.

3/26/2020 Bricks, Hartley -/ Review and respond to corresp. from R. Berg re operational 0.8
matters; disc. with P. Crisolago re property matters

3/30/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re status of home; review of operating 1.3
results

3/31/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of LSAA Amending Agreement and execute same; 1.5
disc. Amending Agreement with P. Casey

3/31/2020 Casey, Paul TC Bricks, review and execute LHIN agreement, 0.5

4/1/2020 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire disbursement. 0.1

4/1/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Print back and prepare 0.3
transfer between account and send for signing.

4/1/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of cash flow requirements and prepare disbursement 1.1
re same; corresp. with P. Shea re status of nursing home.,

4/2/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Have transfer between 0.8
account signed and send to TD Bank and input into Ascend.
Update Property management company with Mar entries.

4/2/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re ministry funding and status of home 0.3

4/6/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours
4/7/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp from a life lease unit holder, review of 1.2
records, disc. same with P. Shea and respond; corresp. with
R. Berg re status of various issues.
4/9/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R, Berg re operational matters. 0.2
4/13/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly operating report; review and execute 1.0
disbursements
4/14/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp from J. Jensen re status of 0.8
various matters; review and execute disbursements.
4/15/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re operational matters and provincial 2.7
emergency order; review of Approval and Vesting Order,
draft letter to the MOH and forward to S. Gray.
4/16/2020 Keene, Ashley Website update. 0.2
4/16/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re operational matters; revise licence 2.8
transfer application letter, compile appendices, and forward
to MOLTC
4/21/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re status; review and respond to 1.0
request for update from P. Deluca.
4/22/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp from P. Deluca. 0.4
4/23/2020 Bricks, Hartley Various corresp re operational matters in LTC. 0.5
4/23/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Pull online banking reports, 0.6
input ministry funding and prepare transfer to ACC and send
to HB for signature.
4/24/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.3
4/24/2020 Brown, Rose Request Transfer to ACC be signed and send to TD Bank, 0.5
Confirm wire with TD Bank and input in to Ascend.
4/27/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp from B. Parker re city of toronto permit 1.6
fees, logon to website and pay fees; review of ledgers;
corresp. with R. Berg re status of LTC.
4/28/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting and ledger reports. 2.5
4/29/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re status of operations; corresp. with J. 0.5
Jensen re purchaser.
4/30/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.2
4/30/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of files and prepare corresp. to life lease purchasers 2.6
re status of condo application.
5/4/2020 Florea, Ramona Preparing Maplewood letters for mail out. 2.0
5/4/2020 Bricks, Hartley Revise letter to life lease purchasers and forward to R. 0.5

Florea; review and execute disbursements.
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Date Name Narrative ( Hours

5/4/2020 Brown, Rose Inputting entries into Ascend for Property Mgmt account. 0.1

5/5/2020 Florea, Ramona Preparing Maplewood letters for mail out. 0.7

5/7/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp from MOH and forward to R. Berg; corresp. 1.2
with B. Parker re City of Toronto timing; review and execute
disbursements.

5/11/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft services agreement from University Health 1.8
Network, disc. with R. Berg re same, forward to P. Shea for
comments, prepare changes to agreement.

5/12/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from R. Berg. 0.5

5/14/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re extension of listing agreement, status 1.4
of nursing home and condo application; disc. with P. Shea re
UHN agreement; review and execute listing extension.

5/15/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea re UHN agreement; review of corresp from 0.9
counsel to UHN, disc. with R. Berg re status and UHN and
follow up with P. Shea.

5/19/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re status of operations and use of 0.3
pandemic funding from MOH.

5/20/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with B. Parker re 0.8
zoning review.

5/21/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N. Lee re zoning review and building permits; 1.4
review and execute disbursements.

5/22/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re employee matters and corresp. with 0.4
P. Shea re same.

5/25/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from R. Berg re operational 1.4
matters; review of minor variance application, forward
questions to Gowlings and execute same; review and execute
wire transfer to ACC.

5/25/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administraition - Input receipts and 0.5
disbursement process for the month. Prepare transfer to
ACC.

5/26/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re previous parking decision, review of 0.4
files and forward same.

5/27/2020 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with R. Berg, N. Bosco, P. Shea and N. Gupta re 0.7
LTC employee matters.

5/28/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration ~ Disbursement cheque. 0.3

5/28/2020 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with M. Mallich, N. Dawkins, A. Pomerleau, P. Shea 1.2
re status of receivership; further disc. with P. Shea re
employee matters.

Total 74.3




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period June 1 to August 11, 2020 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose
of Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses ~ Committee of Adjustment Fee

Sales Tax

Invoice 8001358203

Deloitte LLP
Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416)601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration :

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

September 11, 2020
1154220

PEOC0004

Paul Casey

133245290RT0001

13,030.50

4,807.28

2,318.91

20,156.69

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Casey, Paul Partrger 0.7 600.00 420.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 23.2 525.00 12,180.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.3 525.00 157.50
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.6 105.00 273.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 26.8 13,030.50
Out-of-pocket Expenses - Committee of Adjustment Fee 4,807.28
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 17,837.78
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Appendix #2

Work performed from June 1, 2020 to August 11, 2020
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execute funding transfer; respond to info requests from S.
Gray.

Date Name Narrative Hours

6/1/2020 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

6/1/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer between 0.3
accounts and input into Ascend.

6/1/2020 Casey, Paul Emails H. Bricks re media inquiry and release. 0.5

6/1/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. with CBC reporter, disc. same with 2.0
counsel and Deloitte media representative, draft response
and coordinate same

6/3/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status of purchaser, and other 1.0
matters; review and execute disbursements.

6/4/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re purchaser and corresp. to Peoples and 1.5
CMHC re same; disc. with R. Berg re employee matters,
review of draft corresp. and corresp. with Gowlings re same
and timing for disc.

6/5/2020 Brown, Rose Scan chequre received from CRA. 0.3

6/9/2020 Casey, Paul Review Province of Ontario Health extension agreement and 0.2
sign.

6/9/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit - prepare, scan and 0.6
take to the bank..

6/9/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with Gowlings, R. Berg, N. Bosco re employee matters. 0.8

6/10/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of monthly 1.0
reporting from Sterling Karamar; corresp. with R. Berg re
HST returns.

6/15/2020 Bricks, Hartley Update project tracking schedule and forward to B. Parker for 0.8
his input.

6/17/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; update project tracking 0.4
schedule.

6/18/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re status with City of Toronto minor 1.2
variance application; conf. call with Peoples and CMHC to
discuss status; various corresp with R. Berg regardin UHN
agreement and MOH funding.

6/22/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg; review of corresp. from J. Jensen re 0.9
email from Rykka; review and execute disbursements.

6/24/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re pandemnic funding; review and 0.8
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Date Name Narrative Hours

6/24/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare transfer to ACC, have signed and send to TD Bank - 0.3
confirm received and processed.

6/25/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare additonal transfer to ACC, have signed and send to 0.2
TD Bank - confirm received and processed.

6/25/2020 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. re pandemic funding; review of corresp. from R. 0.4
Berg re terminated employee.

6/25/2020 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer, 0.1

6/29/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Cho re status of nursing home licence transfer 0.6
approval process.
7/6/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from J. Jensen; 0.5
7/7/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of corresp. from 0.5
MOH and forward to R. Berg.
7/7/2020 Brown, Rose Input property management monthly entries into Ascend. 0.1
7/8/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of corresp. from 0.7
B. Parker.

7/9/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp with R. Ahmad 0.5
re disbursements.

7/15/2020 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re meeting with the City of Toronto; 0.7
various corresp. with R. Berg.

7/16/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.5

7/17/2020 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with City of Toronto to discuss Draft plan 0.8

7/17/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

7/20/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare draft corresp. re City of Toronto meeting and forward 0.5
to B. Parker for comments

7/22/2020 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; 0.5

7/29/2020 Brown, Rose Preparing transfer to ACC, have signed, send to TD bank 0.6
confirm by phone received.

7/29/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare update for Peoples Trust 0.6

7/29/2020 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer. 0.1

8/5/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare response to email from MLTC and forward to P. Shea 1.2
for comments

8/10/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare and finalize letter to MLTC re response to questions 3.0

on proposal to transfer nursing home licence; review of
materials re Union matter.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

8/11/2020 Bricks, Hartley Prepare estimated future funding shortfall analysis; update 1.8
shortfall on construction loan analysis, review and execute
disbursements.

Total 26.8




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon {Ontario) Retirement Community
c/o.Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period August 12 to October 31, 2020 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details,

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8001467495
Deloitte LLP

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: November 19,2020

Client No.: 1154220

WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
HST applicable 30,722.00
HST at 13.00% 3,993.86

Total Amount Due (CAD) 34,715.86

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0,04939% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley- Director 51.4 565.00 29,041.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.4 565.00 226.00
Florea, Ramona Analyst 4.5 240.00 1,080.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 3.0 125.00 375.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 59.3 30,722.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 30,722.00
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Appendix #2
Work performed from August 12,2020 to October 31, 2020
Date Name Narrative Hours
26-08-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1
26-08-20 Brown, Rose Reconcile Ascend to Online banking report and input wire 0.8
received form Ministry of Health, Prepare transfer to ACC,
have signed and send/confirm with TD received and process.
Send email to ACC.
28-08-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of reply factum and forward comments to P.Shea 1.3
03-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.5
04-09-20 Brown, Rose Prepare transfer between accounts and have signed and send 0.4
to TD Bank for processing.
04-09-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer between accounts. 0.1
08-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.3
11-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of corresp. from 1.5
Ministry re funding; review of submission from Union
15-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status of nursing home purchase and 2.5
review of files re information requested, email to R. Berg re
information to be compiled
16-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to R. Swimraman re insurance renewal 1.5
information
21-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Draft 11th report to court; prepare updated information on 6.5
the LTC for Purchaser.
23-09-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve disbursements. 0.1
23-09-20 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Input incoming EFT receipts 0.7
and Ministry funding into Ascend. Reconcile GL to Online
banking reports. Prepare transfer ACC have signed and send
to TD Bank, confirm transfer with TD and process to Ascend.
25-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; prepare info for 6.5
dropbox; draft 11th report to court
29-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare report to court; disc. with J. Jensen re info 7.0
requested; upload info to dropbox; corresp. with R. Berg re
annual reporting matters.
30-09-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare court report and forward to P. Shea for comments; 4.3
disc. with J. Jensen re info to be uploaded to dropbox and
“|confidentiality matters.
02-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of insurance renewal corresp. and disc. same with R. 0.8

Berg;
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Date Name Narrative Hours

05-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea regarding eleventh report and revise 1.5
same.

05-10-20 Florea, Ramona Redacting and removing confidential and sensitive 4.5
information on LTC documents as per J. Jensen's request.

07-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of comments on Eleventh Report and revise same; 1.5
prepare R&D.

08-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; respond to P. Deluca 0.8
with status update; respond to broker re insurance renewal

13-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare R&D for court report; disc. with 1. Jensen re status of 4.0
information compiled and reviewed; disc. with R. Berg re LTC
matters.

15-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and forward redacted files; review and provide 3.5
comments on submissions to Committee of Adjustments.

20-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status and prepare email re LOA 0.5
employees

22-10-20 Brown, Rose Prepare schedule of Prov. of Ontario receipts and send to 0.5
Ryhan at ACC.

23-10-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

23-10-20 . |Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status; review and execute 1.6

’ disbursements; review of corresp. from MLTC.

23-10-20 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer to ACC, have 0.5
signed and send to TD Bank, confirm detail of wire with TD
contact. Input into Ascend and file back up.

26-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Senatore of MLTC re licence transfer proposal 1.5

and public meetings, corresp. with S. Gray re same and

forward Notices to R. Berg for translation and posting.

27-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with J. Senatore 1.7
re public meeting notice

27-10-20 Brown, Rose Input transfer to ACC and file back up. 0.1

28-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare status update for P. Deluca re condo application and 0.8
nursing home licence approval

30-10-20 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to questions from B. Parker re garbage 1.3
situation at the property and forward further questions to
property manager; review of submissions to Committee of
Adjustments

Total 59.3




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Forthe period November 1,2020 to December 31, 2020 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details,

Sales Tax

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered, Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per

Total Amount Due (CAD)

Invoice 8001566678

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: January 21, 2021
Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration : 122893605RT0001

HST applicable 38,475.00
HST at 13.00% 5,001.75
43,476.75
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annumy). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Casey, Paul Partner 0.5 640.00 320.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 64.9 565.00 36,668.50
Hristow, Catherine .|Director 0.3 565.00 169.50
Keene, Ashley Senior 0.1 295.00 29.50
Baek, Seo Hee Senior v 2.5 295.00 737.50
Brown, Rose |Trust Administrator 4.4 125.00 550.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 72.7 g 38,475.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses - ) -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) ) 38,475.00
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Appendix #2

Work performed from November 1,2020 to December 31, 2020

Date Name Narrative Hours

2-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of receipts and disbursements, disc. with R. Berg re 1.2
status of nursing home.

2-Nov-20 Brown, Rose Update Ascend for banking entries for Oct/20, Prepare 0.6
transfer between account, send for signature and email to TD
Bank to process.

3-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare report to court; review and execute disbursements 2.5

3-Nov-20 Brown, Rose Confirm transfer completed and input into Ascend and file 0.2
backup.

4-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare R&D; corresp. with property manager and Gowlings 3.0
re info for committee hearing.

5-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with H. Milborne re market conditions; review and 1.4
execute disbursements; conf. call with MLTC and Rykka re
prep for public consultation call; review July reporting
package for nursing home and forward to purchaser.

6-Nov-20 Casey, Paul Review emails from H. Bricks re status. 0.1

9-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of B. Parker draft corresp. to Committee of 1.0
Adjustments and provide comments on same.

11i-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Review Brian Parker corresp and provide comments; update 3.5
court report and R&D

12-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Conf, call with Rykka re preparation for public meeting; 2.3
corresp. from B. Parker re timing for Committee of
Adjustments hearing and information required

18-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Revisions to court report; corresp with S. Gray re status of 2.5
fee payments; corresp. with R. Berg re meeting

19-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re committee of adjustment hearing 2.8
preparation and review of files re same; corresp. with ACC re
surplus cash in bank; review and execute disbursements

23-Nov-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare status update for P. Deluca; forward public meeting 1.0
info to J. Jensen; email to P. Crisolago re posting of public
meeting notice

24-Nov-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

24-Nov-20 Brown, Rose Update Ascend with incoming receipts, Reconcile bank 0.9

balance to Ascend. Prepare transfer to ACC and send to
signing officers, Email transfer request to TD Bank and
confirm receipt and process entries in Ascend. Send email
ACC to confirm receipt of fund
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

24-Nov-20

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; review of letter prepared
by B. Parker to Committee of Adjustments and provide
comments on same; review of corresp. from City of Toronto
Transportation dept.

1.2

25-Nov-20

Baek, Seo Hee

Discussion with H.Bricks re nursing home - translate Korean
news article.

1.0

25-Nov-20

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with B.Choi and S. Baek re translation for public
meeting and corresp. with J. Senatore of MLTC re same;
review of Korean Times article and forward to S. Gray;
review of monthly reporting; respond to questions from P.
Deluca.

2.8

25-Nov-20

Casey, Paul

Reporting email and response with H. Bricks.

0.2

26-Nov-20

Hristow, Catherine

Review and approve wire transfer.

0.1

26-Nov-20

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement wires.

1.0

27-Nov-20

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; disc. with R. Berg re
public meeting; various corresp. with R. Berg re preventative
maintenance re HVAC.

1.5

30-Nov-20

Baek, Seo Hee

Attend MLTC public meeting, translate Korean questions into
english

1.5

30-Nov-20

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare and attend MLTC public meeting on license transfer;
further disc. with corresp. with S. Gray and J. Jensen, update
P. Shea.

2.5

1-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with B. Parker re committee meeting; disc. with R.
Berg re minor variance support letter and provide details on
same.

1.3

2-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Various corresp. and review of docs re committee of

adjustments; review of corresp. re OLRB matter; disc. with R.

Berg re various matters; prepare corresp. to Gowlings re
condo application matters.

3.5

3-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with H. Milborne re status; review of OLRB matter
and various corresp. re same; arrange for letters from life
lease purchasers in support of minor variance, various
corresp. with B. Parker; arrange for updated Reserve Fund
Study with Edison Engineering.

3.0

4-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; review of files re condo
application.

1.0

7-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Review of OLRB response and corresp. to J. Smith re same;
provide update on various events to P. Deluca. '

1.8

8-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; review and respond to
inquiries from P. DeLuca.

1.3

10-Dec-20

Bricks, Hartley

Attend Committee of Adjustment meeting for minor variance;
review of condo documents; disc. with R. Berg re status.

2.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

11-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare condo budget, corresp. to Sterling Karamar and 4.0
Assured Care re information required to update condo
budget; corresp. to Edison re status; respond to request re
media questions.

14-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Meeting to discuss OLRB mediation; corresp. with Edison re 4.0
proposal; review and revise budget; disc. with R. Berg re
nursing home matters.

14-Dec-20 Casey, Paul Review media report and email H. Bricks. 0.2

15-Dec-20 Keene, Ashley Website update. 0.1

15-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Prepare budget, review of documents; review and execute 2.5
disbursements; corresp. with P. DeLuca re media reporting.

16-Dec-20 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Inputting Deposit of Nov 25, 0.3
2020

16-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Prep for and attend mediation for OLRB complaint. 3.5

17-Dec-20 Brown, Rose Banking Adm - Disbursement cheque, have signed and 0.4
prepare courier slip.

18-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Review of budget info; review of APS with Rykka, disc. with*J. 4.0
Jensen re status; disc. with R. Berg re various nursing home
matters.

21-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with Ministry of Long Term Care re status of review of 1.8
license application; review and execute disbursements; disc.
with S. Gray re status and further disc. with J. Jensen and P.
Shea re same

21-Dec-20 Brown, Rose Update Ascend with various receipts received in account and 0.5
prepare ACC transfer.

22-Dec-20 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

22-Dec-20 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen; prepare update for P. DelLuca; review 1.5
and approve nursing home funding transfer.

22-Dec-20 Brown, Rose Complete transfer to ACC and input into Ascend and file back 0.5
up. Send email confirmation to Rhyan at ACC.

Total 72.7




Deloitte.

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period January 1,2021 to February 28, 2021 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8001695046

Deloitte LLP

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel:  (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151
www.deloitte,ca

Date: March 24, 2021

Client No.: 1154220

WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey

HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
HST applicable 64,893.50
HST at 13.00 % 8,436.16

Total Amount Due (CAD) 73,329.66

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



Deloitte.

Appendix #1
Summary of Fees
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount
“|Casey, Paul Partner 0.2 640.00 128.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 113.1 565.00 63,901.50
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.6 565.00 339.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 4.2 125.00 525.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 118.1 64,893.50
Out-of-pocket Expenses -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 64,893.50
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Work performed from January 1,2021 to February 28, 2021
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monthly reporting; corresp. with S. Gray re status of financial
info to be delivered to MLTC.

Date Name Narrative Hours

4-Jan-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

4-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re status; review of funding request for 2.5
residential component; review of monthly reporting.

4-Jan-21 Brown, Rose Prepare transfer between accounts and send to TD Bank, 0.8
Updated Ascend for Dec deposit make by offsite staff.

5-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Compile and forward information to Edison Engineering for 2.5
Reserve Fund Study update.

6-Jan-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

7-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley . Prepare budget, review of corresp from MLTC and forward to 3.2
R. Berg; Disc. with E. Golden re status of various matters.

8-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with C. Tong re expense info; prepare budget; 3.8

’ review of corresp. from MLTC and forward to S. Gray.

11-Jan-21 Hristow, Catherine Correspondence regarding cheque over $25,000 and approve 0.1
same on bank reconciliation.

11-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of info provided by R. Ahmad and revised condo 1.5
budget.

12-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with P. Shea re 3.3
status; conf. call with J. Smith re next steps for OLRB matter. :

13-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft final notice from City of Toronto; respond to 4.0
corresp. from P. DeLuca; review of further documents for
condo application.

15-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from H. Jung re backflow tests; review 0.4
and execute disbursements.

18-Jan-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve cheque. 0.1

18-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements, review of condo files and 2.5
prepare for disc. with Gowlings.

19-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with Gowlings and D. Miret to discuss plan to 3.0
complete condo application; review of files and forward
documents to D. Dalley.

20-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N, Lee re status and engineer signoffs; review of 1.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

21-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen; disc. with S. Gray re status; update 3.5
email to P. Deluca; review and execute disbursements;

-|review of various corresp. re condo application.

22-Jan-21 Brown, Rose Input various receipts received in Jan/21, Prepare transfer to 0.5
ACC, have signed and send to TD Bank, Confirm transfer and
input into Ascend.

22-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting of nursing home; review of 1.8

, monthly transfer to nursing home and approve same; disc.

with R. Berg re status.

22-Jan-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer. 0.1

25-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; disc. with Gowlings re condo 3.3
application and prepare documents re same; review of files
re landscaping and forward documents to Gowlings.

27-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with R. Berg re operational matters; review and 1.5
execute disbursements; disc. with Rykka re status of APS.

28-Jan-21 Casey, Paul Update emails from H. Bricks and exchange re status. 0.2

28-Jan-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from Rykka re APS and discuss same with 2.4
P. Shea and E. Golden; review and execute disbursements.

1-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of condo docs for submission; review of monthly 4.5
residential reporting; review of CAM fee arrears.

2-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; preparations for condo 3.5
approval and condo sale process.

3-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from a life lease purchaser; 1.5
corresp. with R. Berg re status of nursing home.

4-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft assignment agreement, review of APS re 2.3
assignment provisions, corresp. with P. Shea re assignment.

8-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; draft correspondence to 1.9
life lease purchasers and forward to Gowlings for comment;
corresp. with Gowlings re assignment agreement.

9-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft condition status chart, review of files and 3.2
condo documents; corresp. with P. Deluca re status of
assignment of APS

9-Feb-21 Brown, Rose Review and print wire request for Legal and fees. 0.1

10-Feb-21 Brown, Rose Prepare wire for Fees and Legal fees and send to HB/CH for 0.8
signing, Send to TD Bank confirm wire rec'd and processed.
Update Ascend with incoming Wire form Ministry and Monthly
EFT's.

10-Feb-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve disbursement. 0.1




197

Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

10-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of shared facilities agreement and corresp. with D.
Dalley ré same; review of work process and corresp re
meeting to discuss same; emails with superintendent re
subtenants

2.6

11-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review revised shared facilities agreement; respond to
corresp from S. Gray; review of corresp from J. Smith and
respond to same.

2.7

12-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Conf, call with J. Smith and R. Berg re employee matter;
disc. with P. Shea re various matters; conf. call with Gowlings
re Condo material status; corresp. with purchaser re
assignment agreement; review of revised condo docs and
provide comments to Gowlings.

6.2

16-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with Gowlings, D. Miret and N. Lee regarding condo
documents; disc. with J. Smith, R. Berg and H. Yung re
employee matters; disc. with P. Shea re condo matters and
other issues; prepare report to court.

5.8

17-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Draft report to court; review and execute disbursements;
corresp. with J. Jensen re status

5.0

18-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Draft report to court; review of legal fee invoices and approve
same.

4.2

18-Feb-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques.

0.7

19-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of assignment agreement and disc. with P. Shea re
same; prepare report to court.

4.5

22-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare report to court and R&D; corresp. with J. Smith re
OLRB matter; review of Reserve Fund Study and corresp.
with Edison re same; review and execute disbursements.

4.7

23-Feb-21

Hristow, Catherine

Review and approve wire transfer.

0.1

23-Feb-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Update GL for incoming wire
and deposits, Prepare transfer and send to signing officers
and send signed transfer to TD Bank. Confirm with TD Bank
they received and processed. Input into Ascend.

0.7

23-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare R&D; disc. with J. Armstrong of Edison re Reserve
Fund Study; corresp. with R. Berg re employee matters.

5.0

24-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare report to court and R&D; various disc. with J. Smith
regarding settlement disc. re employee matter; various
corresp regarding assignment of APS.

5.0

25-Feb-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and provide comments on amended APS; various
corresp with J. Smith regarding settlement discussions on
employee matter; prepare report to court.

6.0

25-Feb-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Adm - Disbursement cheque.

0.4
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Date Name Narrative Hours
26-Feb-21 Bricks, Hartley Prepare report to court and forward to counsel for comments; 3.8
corresp. with Rykka and Gowlings concerning assignment
agreement.
Total 118.1




Deloitte. invoice 8001788623

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community E:L gﬂ gg gg} :g} g?

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: May 03, 2021
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Paul Casey
HST Registration : 122893605RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period March 1,2021 to April 30,2021 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
“Company"):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 35,900.00
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00 % 4,667.00

Total Amount Due (CAD) 40,567.00

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 62.2 565.00 35,143.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.3 565.00 169.50
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 0.8 125.00 100.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 3.9 125.00 487.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees 67.2 ; 35,900.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 35,900.00
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Appendix #2

Work performed from March 1,2021 to April 30, 2021
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

1-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Various disc. and corresp. with Gowlings and Rykka
concerning assignment agreement and amended APS; review
and execute disbursements

2.5

1-Mar-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Input deposits for Feb 19/21
into Ascend and update Property Mgmt account in Ascend for
Feb/21 and file back up.

0.5

2-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with P. De Luca re status of assignment agreement
and other matters; disc. with R. Berg re operational matters;
review cash flow forecast and transfer of funds request.

3.0

2-Mar-21

Brown, Rose

Prepare transfer between accounts and confirm processed by
Td Bank.

0.3

3-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of files re settlement agreements; corresp to
Gowlings re settlement agreement extension.

2.2

3-Mar-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Confirm transfer between
account was completed. Input transfer and incoming wire
into Ascend.

0.3

5-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with B. Parker re comments on report and status of
condo application; disc. with R. Berg re insurance and other
matters; review of insurance coverage.

3.0

8-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of condo docs; review of condo occupancy; prepare
and attend meeting with Peoples and CMHC to discuss status
of various issues; review and execute disbursements.

4.5

9-Mar-21

¢

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from T. Hahn re condo
documents including various disc. with P. Shea re same.

1.5

11-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with R. Berg re employee matters; review of SFA to
prepare for disc. with T. Hahn.

1.4

12-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with T. Hahn re SFA and further disc. with D. Dalley
re same.

1.5

15-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Attendance at building to meet with T. Hahn and review
shared facilities; review and revise shared facilities
allocations and forward to D. Dalley; review and execute
disbursements; corresp. re insurance certificate.

4.0

16-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with P. Shea re assignment; corresp. with D. Dalley
re SFA; review of insurance certificate.

1.0

17-Mar-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of questions from T. Hahn, review of files and
corresp. with ACC and Sterling re same; corresp. with J.
Armstrong re Reserve Fund study.

2.5
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Date

Name Narrative Hours

18-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from T. Hahn re SFA, review of files, 2.8
corresp. with P. Crisolago and disc. with R. Ahmad, and
prepare response to same;

19-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Respond to questions from T. Hahn. 0.5

22-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of comments from T. Hong on SFA, review of files and 3.5
disc. with building superintendent and property manager and
forward comments to Gowlings; review and execute SAA
extension and Declaration of Compliance.

22-Mar-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

22-Mar-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Update Ascend with Ministry 0.5
wire received. Reconcile bank account to online banking
report, Prepare month transfer to ACC and send for
signature.

23-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P, Shea re Amended APS and SFA; review of 1.5
amended APS and provide comments to P. Shea; respond to
email from T. Hahn.

23-Mar-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Send Transfer to ACC and 0.4
confirm received and processed. Input into Ascend and file
back up.

24-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with J. 1.8
Armstrong re RFS; corresp. with J. Jensen re update; disc.
with P. Shea re status of APS.

26-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of revisions to SFA and corresp. with D. Dalley re 1.5
same; corresp. with T. Hahn re status.

29-Mar-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Input and print disbursement 0.3
cheque. Review wire request.

29-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from T. .Hahn; review and 3.5
revise Budget Statement and Disclosure Statement and
forward same to D. Dalley.

29-Mar-21 Conorton, Laura Preparing and processing wires for Gowling and DRI 0.8

29-Mar-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfers. 0.1

30-Mar-21 Bricks, Hartley Forward documents to T. Hahn and respond to various 0.5
inquiries;

30-Mar-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - copy and send out signed 0.2
cheques.

1-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of amended APS and consent and various disc. with 2.5
P. Shea re same; execute consent and APS.

6-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with MLTC regarding assignment of APS and 0.5

rescheduling of conf. call.




203

Date Name Narrative Hours

9-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. re condo 2.5
application and condo materials; review of monthly report

12-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; corresp. with D. Miret re 0.5
comments from LRO.

13-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of R. Lupo email on wording to life lease purchasers 0.8
and corresp. with B. Parker re same; disc. with M. Allore of
MLTC re status of assignment and timing for new license
transfer process.

14-Apr-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque and 0.2
prepare courier slip.

14-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Respond to email from P. Deluca re update; corresp. with B. 2.8
Parker re condo submissions; review of LRO response and
disc. with D. Miret and D. Dalley re response from LRO and
next steps.

15-Apr-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Print cheque, have signed and 0.1
mail out.

20-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re letters to life lease purchasers, revise 1.0
same, corresp. with Sterling Karamar re addresses.

21-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Revise letter to life lease purchasers; review of files for life 3.2
lease purchaser addresses; corresp. with P. Lee re contact
info for life lease purchasers; review of monthly reporting;
disc. with R. Berg re status of various matters.

23-Apr-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare Transfer between 0.8
account and Wire to ACC, confirm with TD and input into
Ascend and file back up.

23-Apr-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfers. 0.1

23-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of cash flow 1.5
funding request and approve same.

26-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from P. Lee. 0.2

27-Apr-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Input print disbursement 0.3
cheque, have signed and send out.

28-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements and corresp. with Sterling 0.5
re same.

30-Apr-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea re court report and court hearing; 3.5
revisions to report; disc. with R. Berg re nursing home bank
account.

Total 67.2
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Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc,

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period May 1, 2021 to June 30, 2021 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc.,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”}):

Please see the appendices for details.

Sales Tax

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per

Total Amount Due (CAD)

Invoice 8001953221

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel:  (416)601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: July 15, 2021
Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Philip Reynolds
HST Registration : 122893605RT0001

HST applicable 36,436.50
HST at 13.00 % 4,736.75
41,173.25
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annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1
Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Bricks, Hartley Director 60.1 565.00 33,956.50
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.8 565.00 452.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 0.6 125.00 75.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 3.5 125.00 437.50
Keene, Ashley Senior 0.5 295.00 147.50
Florea, Ramona Analyst 5.7 240.00 1,368.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 71.2 36,436.50

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Total Fees and Expenses

(CAD)

36,436.50
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Work performed from May 1,2021 to June 30, 2021
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

3-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with J.
Armstrong re final Reserve Fund Study report; corresp. with
P. Lee re life lease purchaser contacts.

0.4

3-May-21

Brown, Rose

Print Apr entries and input into Ascend for Property
Management company. Input Disbursement cheque.

0.3

4-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of life lease purchaser contact info provided by P.
Lee, update files, revise letter to life lease purchasers and
forward to R. Florea for finalization and distribution.

3.7

4-May-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Print disbursement request
and input into Ascend.

0.5

5-May-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement
cheques, have signed, copy and mail out.

0.5

5-May-21

Fiorea, Ramona

Emails and call with H. Bricks re review of life lease »
purchaser contact info; revise and finalize letter to life lease
purchasers for distribution; distribution of letters by email
and coordinating with the print shop for mailing.

5.2

5-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of info provided by Sterling Karamar, prepare capital
repairs ledger and forward same to P. DelLuca

2.5

6-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to various enquiries from life lease
purchasers regarding letter received and estimated amounts
payable to complete purchase; corresp. with C. Prophet re
terms of settlement agreements.

5.0

6-May-21

Florea, Ramona

Emails H. Bricks re undeliverable emails to life lease
purchasers; updating life lease purchaser contact info;
redistribution of letters to life lease purchasers.

0.5

7-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from life lease purchasers
and provide estimated amounts to complete purchase; disc.
with 1. Jensen re status; disc. with P, Shea re status of
comments on court report.

4.0

10-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from various life lease
purchasers; update schedules for amounts owed by life lease
purchasers.

4.0

11-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to various corresp. from life lease
purchasers; review and execute extension of listing

|agreement with J. Jensen.

4.5

12-May-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to inquiries from various life lease
purchasers; review and execute disbursements; provide
update to P. Deluca;

1.8

13-May-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Send Wire instruction to ACC.

0.1
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Date Name Narrative Hours

14-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Various corresp. with life lease purchasers and respond to 2.0
inquiries re amounts required for purchase.

14-May-21 Brown, Rose Confirm transfer was received from ACC and input into 0.2
Ascend.

17-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with life lease purchaser regarding change in name 0.3
of purchaser

17-May-21 Brown, Rose Confirm transfer and input into Ascend. 0.2

19-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Update report to court; respond to various inquiries from life 2.5
lease purchasers

20-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with life lease purchaser regarding purchase of their 0.5
unit; review and execute disbursements.

25-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to inquiries from life lease purchasers; 3.5
review and execute disbursements; revise Court report and
forward to P. Shea for comments

25-May-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer 0.1

25-May-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - prepare Transfer between 0.7
accounts, have signed and send to TD Bank, Confirm TD
Received and input into Ascend and file back.

26-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of files and respond to requests from T. Hong of 1.0
Arirang.

27-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Respond to further info request from T. Hong 0.5

28-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. Shea re court report 0.3

31-May-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea re comments on report and revise same; 3.0
forward draft to C. Hristow

31-May-21 Brown, Rose Update Ascend with Deposit made by onsite staff and 0.3
reconcile GL to Bank.

31-May-21 Hristow, Catherine Review draft Eleventh Report to the Court and provide 0.5
comments to H. Bricks.

1-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Further changes to report, finalize and forward to P. Shea for 2.5
service

1-Jun-21 Brown, Rose Review account online and update Ascend with incoming wire 0.1
from Ministry.

2-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.3

2-Jun-21 Keene, Ashley Website update. 0.2

7-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from T. Hong and review of files re same; 0.8
review and execute disbursements; respond to questions
from P. Deluca.

8-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; respond to N. Lee re 0.5

status of condo application.




208

Date Name Narrative Hours

10-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Preparation for and attendance at court hearing re approvals 1.5
required for condo application and other matters; corresp.
with D. Dalley re timing for final condo application
submission; review and execute disbursements.

11-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly report; respond to corresp. from R. Berg. 1.2

14-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review and respond to 0.5
corresp. from B. Parker re letter to life lease purchasers.

15-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of files re building drawings requested by Arirang; 1.2
corresp. with life lease purchaser re amounts owing for their
unit.

16-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. concerning site 0.8
visit by Arirang.

17-3un-21 Bricks, Hartley Prepare corresp to MLTC regarding License Transfer 1.0
Application for Arirang.

17-Jun-21 Keene, Ashley Website update. 0.3

18-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of various condo documents; corresp. with D. Dalley 2.0
re condo application submissions.

21-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review and respond to 2.5
corresp. from D. Dalley re condo application details and
timing; disc. with R. Berg re status; corresp. with MLTC re
application for license transfer.

22-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.5

22-Jun-21 Brown, Rose Update Ascend with Ministry wire, Prepare wire to ACC and 0.4
send for signatures.

23-Jun-21 Hristow, Catherine ° Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

23-Jun-21 Brown, Rose Send transfer to ACC and confirm TD Bank received and 0.2
processed. Input into Ascend.

28-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute condo documents; review and execute 2.5
disbursements

29-Jun-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of files and provide various CAD files to Arirang; 2.8
respond to inquiries from life lease purchasers

30-Jun-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer; correspondence with H. 0.1
Bricks regarding condominium documents.

30-Jun-21  |Conorton, Laura Processing transfer of funds between R and Prop Mgmt. 0.6
accounts; correspondence with TD

Total 71.2




Deloitte. Invoice 8002118624

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (bntario) Retirement Community '}l:'ae:( gﬂg; gg}g]g?

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: October 07,2021
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Philip Reynolds
HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period July 1, 2021 to August 31, 2021 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community {"Rose of Sharon” or the
“Company”):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 35,667.00
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00 % 4,636.71

Total Amount Due (CAD) 40,303.71

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. interest shall be calculated at.a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 60.7 565.00 34,295.50
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.5 565.00 282.50
Conorton, Laura -~ |Trust Administrator 0.2 150.00 30.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 4.5 150.00 675.00
Florea, Ramona Analyst 1.6 240.00 384.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 67.5 35,667.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses ) -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 35,667.00
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Work performed from July 1,2021 to August 31, 2021
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

5-Jul-21

Conorton, Laura

Correspondence with TD Bank on transfer from June 30;
admin, filing

0.2

5-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of monthly reporting; review and execute
disbursements; disc. with R. Berg re nursing home status;
disc. with E. Golden re court order re Yoon claim and provide
same

3.3

6-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with J. Jensen re status; corresp. with H. Milborne re
unit pricing update; corresp. with D. Dalley re status of final
condo application submissions

2.5

7-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley.

review of monthly reporting; review of files re parking and
lockers and provide info to H. Milborne

3.8

8-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

review and execute disbursements; review corresp. from life
lease purchaser and respond with purchase notice amounts;
corresp. with D. Dalley re Daily Commercial News info
including corresp. with Sterling Karamar re same

4.0

9-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp. from Arirang re MLTC application;
arrangements for Arirang tour of premises; prepare
purchaser calculations

3.6

12-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of condo documents; disc. with R. Berg re nursing
home matters

2.2

13-3ul-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques.

0.2

14-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with a life lease purchaser, review of files and
respond to same; review and execute disbursements; disc.
with N. Lee re forms to be completed

3.5

19-Jui-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from D. Dalley; provide
status update to P. Deluca

1.2

20-Jul-21

Damiani, Stefano

Review and approve two wire transfers, emails with R. Brown
on same.

0.2

20-Jul-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Prepare two wire for Fee and
Legal Fees and send to HB for signature. Send signed wire
request to TD Bank and confirm received. Receive and input
wire into Ascend and file back up.

1.3

20-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with D. Dalley re condo submission and the City's
request re new condition; prepare wording for Affidavit of
mailing; review and execute wire transfer

1.8

21-Jul-21

Brown, Rose

Prepare monthly transfer to ACC.

0.6

22-Jul-21

Damiani, Stefano

Review and execute wire transfer, correspondence with R.
Brown on same.

0.1




212

Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

22-Jul-21

Brown, Rose

Complete Transfer to ACC, input int Ascend and email to
ACC.

0.2

22-1ul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; conf. call with D. Dalley,
N. Lee, D. Miret re remaining conditions; review of files re
building approvals

2.5

27-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

i
H

/

Attend to Avis Surveying and disc. with D. Miret re building
drawings, review of same and sign drawings for submission
to the City of Toronto; review and execute disbursments

3.3

28-Jul-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. from T. Hahn re unit pricing and corresp. with H.
Milborne re same; prepare R&D

3.5

29-Jul-21

Florea, Ramona

Admin - preparing and combining emails and letters sent by
mail to ROS life lease purchasers for sworn affidavit; emails
with H. Bricks; videoconference with D. Daley. for sworn
affidavit and signature, scan and email signed affidavit to D.
Daley.

1.6

3-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from various life lease
purchasers; review and execute disbursements; corresp. with
D. Dalley re condo submission

1.2

4-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with D. Dalley re condo docs; disc. with R. Berg re
status; review and prepare R&D

3.1

4-Aug-21

Brown, Rose

Input Month EFT receipt into Ascend and ,file back up.

0.1

9-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of monthly reporting; corresp. with D. Dalley re
condo submissions and timing

1.4

10-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from P. DeLuca re condo
condition clearance and performance bond

0.5!

11-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with various life lease purchasers re timing for
condo registration; review and execute disbursments

0.9

12-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with a life lease purchaser; review and execute
disbursements; review of files re MOH documentation and
forward to R. Berg

1.1

13-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with a life lease purchaser; corresp. with D. Dalley
re status

0.6

16-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Various corresp. with counsel and a life lease purchaser
concerning purchase of his unit; review and execute
disbursements

1.3

17~-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of cash flow forecast and prepare transfer request to
fund property management account

0.5

17-Aug-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer between
accounts.

0.6

18-Aug-21

Damiani, Stefano

Review and sign bank transfer, correspondence with R.
Brown on same.

0.1
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

18-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with life lease purchaser re purchase of their unit,
review of files and respond re same; review and execute
disbursements

1.6

23-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and revise condo budget; corresp. with R. Lupo and
K. Strong re status of issue with life lease purchaser

1.4

24-Aug-21

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Admin - Review account online & input Ministry
funding & bank charges. Prepare transfer to ACC and send to
HB/SD for signature. Email signed transfer form to TD and
confirm by telephone the details. Send email to ACC, Input
into Ascend.

1.5

24-Aug-21

Damiani, Stefano

Review disbursement, sign wire transfer, emails with R.
Brown.

0.1

24-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with T. Hong and B. Lee of Arirang re available financial
info; review and execute disbursements; review of files re
condo management agreement and corresp. and disc. with
Sterling Karamar re same

3.0

26-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with P. Shea re status; corresp. concerning life lease
purchaser; conf. call with Infrastructure Ontario and Arirang
regarding audited income statement and other financial info.

2.4

27-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of revised pricing from Milborne and update
realizations schedule

2.8

30-Aug-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with S. Russo and M. Jules of Sterling Karamar
regarding condo management agreement and condo docs;
review and revise agreement; update condo docs and
forward to S. Russo for comments

3.7

Total

67.5
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Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period September 1,2021 to October 31, 2021 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8002195564
Deloitte LLP

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: November 12, 2021

Client No.: 1154220

WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Philip Reynolds

HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
HST applicable 48,184.00
HST at 13.00 % 6,263.92

Total Amount Due (CAD) 54,447.92

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered, Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum), Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1
Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Schieman, D'Arcy Partner 4.0 650.00 2,600.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 77.1 580.00 44,718.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.6 580.00 348.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 0.7 140.00 98.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.8 140.00 392.00
Alvi, Farrah Consultant 0.2 140.00 28.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 85.4 48,184.00

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Total Fees and Expenses

(CAD)

48,184.00
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Appendix #2

Work performed from September 1,2021 to October 31, 2021
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

7-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. re HVAC repair
cost; disc. with H. Milborne re updated unit pricing and work
to be done on units; corresp. with. P. Crisolago re building
repairs and clean up; corresp. with a life lease purchaser.

3.5

8-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review area sizing and pricing; prepare corresp. to T. Hong
re unit pricing; review and execute undertaking; corresp.
with P. De Luca re status;

4.0

8-Sep-21

Hristow, Catherine

Review and sign Rose of Sharon undertaking.

0.3

9-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Schieman re HST issues; review of files re HST
and CRA correspondence and forward same to D, Schieman;
review and execute disbursements.

3.8

9-Sep-21

Schieman, D'Arcy

Preparing for and participating in discussion with H. Bricks
regarding tax matters; reviewing documents.

11

10-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with Sterling Karamar to discuss condo
management agreement and shared facilities agreement;
review of files re agreements and update and forward to
Sterling; corresp. concerning HVAC repairs; further disc. with
D. Schieman re HST matters.

2.5

10-Sep-21

Schieman, D'Arcy

Preparing for and participating in discussion with H. Bricks
regarding tax matters; reviewing documents.

1.5

13-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. to MOH re status of licence transfer review; corresp.
with P. De Luca re update; corresp. with life lease purchaser
re status and amounts owed.

2.5

14-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with Gowlings re NCK engineering matter; Conf.
call with Sterling Karamar to discuss Shared Facilities and
Condo Mgmt Agreement; review SFA and condo mgmt.;
review and execute disbursements.

3.5

16-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review Sterling Karamar's changes to condo mgmt agmt,
revise same; update budget statement, notes and schedules
and forward to D. Dalley.

4.0

17-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with R. Berg re operational matters; disc. with N. Lee re
status of property and billings.

0.7

20-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Further review and revise condo management agmt and
forward final version to Sterling Karamar.

2.0

21-5ep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of condo documents and corresp. with D. Dalley re
same; corresp. with various life lease purchasers re timing
for condo approval.

3.7

22-Sep-21

Conorton, Laura

Preparing disbursements to a consultant.

0.2

22-Sep-21

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp from MOH re funding; corresp. from MOH
re timing for completion of Iice;nce transfer process.

1.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

23-Sep-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and sign transfers between accounts. 0.1

23-Sep-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Reconcile bank to GL, Prepare 1.2
monthly transfer to ACC and send out for signature. Prepare
disbursement cheque, have signed and send out.

27-Sep-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with D. Schieman re HST; review of files and forward 2.0
further HST corresp. to D. Schieman; review of monthly
operating report from Sterling.

27-Sep-21 Schieman, D'Arcy Reviewing documents; preparing for and participating in call 0.6
with H. Bricks.

29-Sep-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re status of condo and nursing home 1.5
matters; review of insurance renewal materials and corresp.
with R. Shwiram re same; corresp. with S. Han re status of
MLTC licence transfer review.

30-Sep-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of revised condo docs and provide comments to D. 2.5
Dalley re same; review of monthly operating report from
ACC.

1-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with D. Schieman and 1. Milnes re HST matters. 0.8

1-Oct-21 Schieman, D'Arcy Communicating with H. Bricks and J. Milnes regarding tax 0.8
matters.

4-0Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N. Lee re status of engineer sign off; corresp. with 2.0
Sterling re condo registration.

5-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with Sterling Karamar re condo registration matters; 3.5
review of files and prepare information for condo turnover.

6-0Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with R. Berg re 1.5
status of condo and other matters; review and respond to
inquiry from life lease purchaser

12-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with N. Lee re 2.2
response from engineering firm; corresp. with life lease
purchaser.

13-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; corresp. with P. Shea re status 1.0
of life lease purchaser issue

14-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with N. Lee; 1.8
disc. with R. Berg re nursing home matters.

15-Oct-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfers between; accounts. 0.1

15-0Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to life lease purchaser re their unit; 2.7
update life lease schedules; prepare statutory reporting.

15-Oct-21 Conorton, Laura Preparing transfer to Rose of Sharon prop mgmt account 0.5

18-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of monthly 1.4

reporting; corresp. with a life lease purchaser re timing for
payments.
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Hours

Date Name Narrative

18-Oct-21 Brown, Rose Discuss monthly transfer to ACC with HB and Ryhan form 0.3
ACC.

19-Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. De Luca re status and timing and prepare 3.0
response re same including update estimated realizations
schedule; corresp. with N. Lee re NCK Engineering signoff.

19-0Oct-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Disbursement cheque. 0.3

25-Oct-21 Alvi, Farrah Prepare bank reconciliation for September, 0.2

26-0ct-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and exécute disbursements; corresp. with R. Berg re 2.0
status of condo application; conf. call with D. Dalley. D. Miret
and N. Lee re condo application.

27-0ct-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare transfer to ACC and 1.0
confirm with TD Bank and ACC received. Email Ryhan
regarding transfer funds back to Receiver's account.

27-0ct-21 Bricks, Hartley Prepare R&D for 246(2) reports; review and execute wire 5.8
transfer.

27-0ct-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1

28-0ct-21 Bricks, Hartley Prepare R&D for's. 246(2) reports; correspondence with D. 4.2
Dalley re condo application;

29-0Oct-21 Bricks, Hartley Respond to an inquiry from a life lease purchaser including 7.5
analysis of amounts owed; prepare R&Ds for s. 246(2)
reports

Total 85.4




DE'Oitte@ | Invoice 8002348558

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community ;g:( Eﬂ 8 gg}:g} g?

¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: January 24,2022
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004
Engagement Partner:  Philip Reynolds
HST Registration : 133245290RT0001
For professional services rendered
Fees
For the period November 1, 2021 to December 31, 2021 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the
“Company"):
Please see the appendices for details.
HST applicable 28,296.00
Sales Tax
HST at 13.00 % 3,678.48

Total Amount Due (CAD) 31,974.48

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 47.0 580.00 27,260.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.3 580.00 174.00
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.4 580.00 232.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 2.5 140.00 350.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.0 140.00 280.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 52.2 28,296.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses -
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 28,296.00
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Work performed from November 1,2021 to December 31, 2021
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Date Name Narrative Hours

1-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Prepare s. 246(2) notices and R&Ds and disc. same with C. 4.7
Hristow; corresp. with R. Berg re nursing home matters.

2-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Finalize s. 246(2) reports and disc. with C. Hristow re same; 3.8
review and execute disbursements; forward original consents
re Condo Act to Gowlings.

3-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute listing extension with Jensen Realty; 4.0
review of email from P. Shea re purchase request for payout
info and prepare same.

4-Nov-21 Damiani, Stefano Review and approve wire transfers. 0.1

4-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of files and prepare payout statement for a life [ease 4.2
purchaser; review and execute disbursements.

4-Nov-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administraiton - Disbursement Wires. 0.6

5-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp from S. Han re Arirang licence transfer and 2.0
documents relating to same, review of files and respond to
same.

8-Nov-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Input Receipts and Disbursement for 0.2
Property Mgmt account and file back up.

9-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp with S. Han re status of licence transfer review; , 2.4
corresp with P. De Luca re status update; disc. With J. Jensen
re status; review and execute disbursements.

10-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc with P. De Luca re timing for condo approval. 0.2

11-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Respond to various enquires from life lease purchasers; disc 2.4
with R. Berg re status of various matters; review of monthly
report.

15-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re LTC matters; disc. with a life lease 0.8
purchaser re status of condo application.

16-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; disc. with J. Jensen re status; 1.7
review and execute disbursements.

17-Nov-21 Conorton, Laura Preparing wire payments. 0.4

17-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with K. Fawcett re condo application status; disc. 1.5
with H. Milborne re sale process

18-Nov-21 Conorton, Laura Wire payment and banking entries. 0.5

18-Nov-21 Damiani, Stefano Review disbursement request and sign wire payment. 0.1

23-Nov-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer of funds. 0.1
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transfer of funds to receiver; review of monthly management
report; review and execute disbursements.

Date Name Narrative Hours
23-Nov-21 Damiani, Stefano Review and sign wire transfer, instructions to R. Brown on 0.1
same.
23-Nov-21 Conorton, Laura Banking entries. 0.2
29-Nov-21 Conorton, Laura Banking entries. 0.2
29-Nov-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with R. Berg re 2.3
status; review of correspondence re life lease purchaser;
corresp. from City re status of review
30-Nov-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2
2-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; review and execute 2.4
disbursements; disc. with R. Berg re status of nursing home
matters; corresp. with life lease purchaser re status.
6-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with H. Milborne re status; review of monthly 1.5
reporting; corresp. with Gowlings re settlement agreement
extensions.
7-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements. 0.5
8-Dec-21 Conorton, Laura Processing transfer of funds to prop mgmt account. 0.5
8-Dec-21 Damiani, Stefano Review and approve wire transfer. 0.1
9-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and revise acknowledgement and settlement 1.7
agreement and forward back to Gowlings.
10-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from S. Han re status of licence transfer 1.9
and forward same to P. De Luca; disc. with P. Shea re life
lease purchaser agreement.
13-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of legal invoice 1.8
and prepare disbursement voucher re same; corresp. with R.
Berg re status.
14-Dec-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit. 0.4
14-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from CRA re HST refunds, advise ACC re 1.8
same; disc. with P. Shea re agreement with a life lease
purchaser and review revised document.
15-Dec-21 Conorton, Laura Processing disbursement. 0.5
15-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartiey Review and execute disbursements; review and finalize 1.6
agreement with life lease purchaser and execute same.
15-Dec-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and sign acknowledgement and payment agreement. 0.1
16-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with Gowlings re status of City's review; review R. 1.1
Avis invoice and prepare disbursement voucher.
17-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with P. Shea re agreement with life lease purchaser and 1.6
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Date Name Narrative Hours

17-Dec-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - send wire instruction sheet to. 0.1
HB.

17-Dec-21 Conorton, Laura Processing wire payment. 0.2

20-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. concerning building condition assessment; 0.3

21-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with T. Hahn re building condition assessment; 0.7
review and execute disbursements.

22-Dec-21 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement transfer to ACC. 0.5

22-Dec-21 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute wire transfer. 0.1

22-Dec-21 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer. 0.1

Total 52.2
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Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
¢/o.Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period January 1, 2022 to March 31, 2022 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc,, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community {"Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company").

Please see the appendices for details.

Expense

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8002542606

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel:  (416) 601-6150
Fax:  (416) 601-6151

www.deloitte.ca

Date:

Client No.:

WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

GST/HST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00 %

Total Amount Due (CAD)

April 18, 2022
1154220
PEOC0004
Philip Reynolds

122893605RT0001

42,714.00

44.84

5,558.65

48,317.49

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpald from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Bricks, Hartley - Director 71.6 580.00 41,528.00
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.6 580.00 348.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.3 580.00 174.00
Dew, Todd Senior 0.4 295.00 118.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.8 140.00 392.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 1.1 140.00 154.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 76.8 42,714.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses 44.84
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 42,758.84
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Date Name Narrative Hours

04-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re nursing home status; corresp. with K. 3.8
Fawcett re status of City review of condo application; review
of corresp. from MOH re LSAA; respond to various life lease
purchaser corresp.

05-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from life lease purchasers; 1.6
review of monthly reporting.

05-01-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Input deposit for Dec 30/21 deposited 0.5
by onsite staff, Input monthly receipts & disbursements in
Ascend for Dec/21 for Property Mgmt Company.

06-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.5

06-01-22 Dew, Todd Trust Accounting 0.2

07-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R. Berg re nursing home matters 0.5

10-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with T. Hong re 2.5

’ site visit; corresp. with R. Berg re nursing home status;

review of monthly reporting.

11-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with N. Lee re status and invoicing; corresp. with K. 1.7
Fawcett re status of City review; corresp. with P. DeLuca re
status of City and licence transfer process.

12-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with T. Hahn re site visit; corresp. with life lease 0.5
purchaser re status.

13-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with E. Golden re receivership status; review of corresp. 0.8
from MOH.

14-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Respond to inquiries from life lease purchasers; corresp. with 3.0
R. Berg re nursing home status; review monthly reporting.

17-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of November financial report for nursing home; 1.3
review and respond to correspondence from T. Hahn.

19-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with Gowlings re status of City review; corresp. wit 1.4
R. Berg re status of nursing home. )

20-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of files re 1.7
purchase notices.

21-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of cash flow 2.2
forecast and arrange for funds transfer to property manager;
review corresp. from City of Toronto re status.

24-01-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Monthly transfer to ACC. 0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

24-01-22 Conorton, Laura Processing wire to property management account. 0.3

24-01-22 Damiani, Stefano Review and sign wire transfer; telephone call with TD re wire 0.1
processing.

24-01-22 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer. 0.1

24-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute wire transfers. 0.1

25-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of files and 2.2
prepare information for purchase notices

26-01-22 Dew, Todd Trust accounting. 0.2

27-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from MOH; corresp. with S. Han re status 1.9
of submissions to MOH; corresp. with P. Deluca re status of -
condo application and MOH submissions

28-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp from City of Toronto re status condo application 0.1

31-01-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from City of Toronto, review of files re 3.2
Site Plan conditions; corresp. with D. Dalley re same

01-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status of licence transfer process and 0.5
condo application.

02-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker, D. Dalley and N. Lee re City of Toronto 4.2
conditions, review of files and send various emails re same;
review and respond to questions from P. De Luca

03-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re City of Toronto disc.; Review and 0.7
execute disbursements.

07-02-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Input monthly entries in 0.1
Ascend for Property Mgmt Companies.

07-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. Deluca re status of condo registration, 0.5
corresp with Gowlings re City of Toronto.

09-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Respond to questions from P. Deluca; send email to S. Han 2.5
requesting update; review of term sheet; review and execute
disbursements; corresp. with T. Hahn, review of files and
forward documents

10-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with R. Berg re 1.8
nursing home matters; review of monthly reporting.

11-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with S. Han and review of documents submitted to 1.5
MOH re licence transfer.

22-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; corresp. with Gowlings 2.5
concerning City review of condo application; disc. with R.

Berg re status.
22-02-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Scan return item and send to 0.3

Property Mgmt Company, Input deposit into Ascend process
by onsite staff.
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status of discussions re condo application and strategy to
move forward.

Date Name Narrative Hours
|23-02-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Monthly transfer to ACC. 0.5

23-02-22 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer between accounts. 0.1

24-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements 0.4

25-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Respond to various inquiries from life lease purchasers; disc. 2.2
with J. Jensen re status.

28-02-22 Conorton, Laura Processing wire payments. 0.4

28-02-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker; review and execute disbursements. 1.3

01-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re condo application; disc. with R. 1.5
Berg re status; corresp. with P. Deluca re status

03-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting and corresp. with Sterling re 2.4
same;

07-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; respond to life lease 0.9
purchaser re status;

08-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re City of Toronto 0.4

09-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of monthly reporting; review of cash flow forecast 1.4
from Sterling and approve transfer re same.

10-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review pf corresp. from CRA, review of files and respond to 1.4
same.

11-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with B. Parker 0.8
re status. :

11-03-22 Conorton, Laura Processing transfer of funds to PM account 0.4

11-03-22 Damiani, Stefano Review bank transfer, sign wire. 0.1

14-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with P. De Luca re status; review of monthly 1.7
reporting; corresp. to-B. Parker re status

15-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with J. Jensen re status; review and execute 0.7
disbursements

17-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with life lease 1.4
purchaser re status

22-03-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Pull online report and reconcile Ascend 0.7
to the bank, Prepare transfer to ACC and send for

22-03-22 , Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer. 0.1

23-03-22 Brown, Rose Confirm transfer was completed and input into Ascend and 0.2
file back up.

28-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; disc. with B. Parker re 0.7
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Date Name Narrative Hours
29-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review and execute 5.5
confirmation from MLTC; Review of files and update
purchaser notice amounts
29-03-22 Damiani, Stefano Review disbursement package and sign cheques. - 0.4
30-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with M. Lombard and P. DeLuca re status; left message 2.5
for C. Jung; review and execute MLTC acknowledgement;
31-03-22 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with Arirang and MLTC re status; prepare email 3.2
update for Peoples Trust; prepare corresp. to C. Jung re
status of condo review and review of response to same.
Total 76.8
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Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period April 1,2022 to May 31, 2022, in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc., now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc, as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”):

Please see the appendices for details.

Sales Tax

Invoice

8002687536

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: {416) 601-6150
Fax: (416)601-6151

www.deloitte.ca

Date:

Client No.:

WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

GST/HST Regjistration:

QST Registration:

HST applicable

HSTat 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

June 10,2022
1154220
PEOC0004
Philip Reynolds

122893605RT0001
1000870419TQ0002

65,178.00

8,473.14

73,651.14

Accounts shall be due and p%yable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Appendix #1
Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Bricks, Hartley Director 111.1 580.00 64,438.00
|Hristow, Catherine Director 0.1 580.00 58.00
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.1 580.00 58.00
Alvi, Farrah Consultant 0.4 125.00 50.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 3.5 140.00 490.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 0.6 140.00 84.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 115.8 65,178.00

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Total Fees and Expenses (CAD)

65,178.00
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consultant reports.

Date Name Narrative Hours

04-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; Review of corresp. from 1.4
MLTC; review of monthly reporting

05-04-22 Brown, Rose Input Receipts and disbursement for Property Manage 0.3
Account for Mar/22, Input EFT Receipts into Ascend and file
back up.

05-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with R Berg re status; respond to inquiry from life lease 1.8
purchaser; review of files re City of Toronto condo conditions.

06-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from MLTC; corresp. with a life lease 2.0
purchaser; review and execute disbursements; disc. with J.
Jensen re status.

07-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Prepare corresp. to C. Jung re status of City response and 1.2
corresp. with B. Parker re same.

08-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Corresp. with B. Parker re City of Toronto 0.3

11-04-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Deposit 0.2

11-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from City of Toronto; conf. call with B. 3.2
Parker, D. Dalley and N. Lee re City response and strategy to
respond; review of files re condo corresp.; provide update on
Condo process to Peoples; review HST refund.

13-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of corresp. from City of Toronto and review of files re 2.5
previous certification by consultants; corresp. with B. Parker.

13-04-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

14-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of files; disc. with B. Parker, D. Dalley and P. Shea re 2.0
City response and go forward plan including contents of
report to court.

18-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Call with S. Han to discuss status of condo application and 4.5
follow up email; draft report to court.

19-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of files and draft court report re history of condo 5.0
application.

20-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of files re consultant reports from construction of 3.5
building and corresp. with B. Parker re same.

20-04-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Deposit. 0.2

21-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Further review of ROS files, prepare corresp. to B. Parker re 5.0




233

Date Name Narrative Hours

22-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; review of files re 3.2
consultant certificates; continue draft of report to court.

22-04-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Input wires received. 0.8

22-04-22 Hristow, Catherine Review and approve transfer; confirm same with the bank. 0.1

25-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with B. Parker re documents concerning Advisory Notes 3.0
and further review of files regarding same; corresp. with T.
Hong re meeting

26-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Conf. call with S. Han T. Hahn, B. Parker re status of condo 2.5
application; review of files re site servicing and landscaping
plan.

27-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Continue drafting report to court; corresp. with B. Parker re 1.8
status of responding letter to the City of Toronto.

28-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Continue drafting report to court; corresp with D.Miret re 5.5
submitted building plans.

29-04-22 Bricks, Hartley Prepare court report materials; corresp with B.Parker re 3.8
status of response to the City of Toronto Community
Planning; discussion with J.Jensen re status

02-05-22 Conorton, Laura Trust Banking - Processing wire payments. 0.6

02-05-22 Damiani, Stefano Review disbursement request, sign wire. 0.1

02-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Revise report to court; corresp. with R. Berg re status; 4.0
review and execute disbursements; corresp. with B. Parker re
status of legal response

03-05-22 Brown, Rose Trust Bankin - Input bank charges for wire. Confirm wire 1.0
processed. Update Ascend with Deposits and interest earned
on accounts.

03-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Prepare R&D for court report; prepare s. 246(2) report; 2.8
respond to corresp. from B. Parker

04-05-22 Brown, Rose Review Ascend and send wire instructions to H. Bricks. 0.1

04-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of draft letter from Gowlings and provide comments; 2.5
disc. with P. Shea re status and next steps.

05-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Further changes to repor to court and forward to P. Shea for 2.2
comments; review and execute disbursements.

06-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from C. Jung re condo 3.0

application approval; various corresp. with Gowlings re next
steps; corresp. with Peoples re condo approval; arrange call
with Milborne re sale process; review of files re purchase
notices
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

09-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with Sterling re account ledgers and review of
same; update amounts owed by life lease purchasers; draft
corresp. to life lease purchasers re status and timing for
delivery of purchase notice.

5.5

10-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Continue updating amounts for purchase notices; respond to
corresp. from purchasers; corresp. with Gowlings re condo
docs.

3.5

11-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Continue updating amounts for purchase notices; respond to
various life lease purchasers questions; corresp. with P.
Deluca re site visit; corresp. with MLTC re status of license
transfer process.

3.5

12-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Meeting at building with H. Milborne and P. Crisolago to
review work to be done to prepare for sale; respond to
various life lease purchaser questions and update contact
details.

4.5

13-05-22

Alvi, Farrah

Trust Banking - Account reconciliation.

-

0.4

16-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with various life lease purchasers re purchase notice
and lockers; corresp. with Gowlings re APS; corresp. with P.
Deluca re R&D; corresp. with D. Shieman re HST.

2.8

17-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute listing extension agreement; disc. with J.
Jensen re status; corresp. with Gowlings re APS and review
of same.

1.8

18-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and revise APS; corresp. with various life lease
purchasers; corresp. with P. Deluca re appraisals and contact
appraisers for proposals.

3.2

19-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements.

0.3

24-05-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking - Reconcile Ascend to Bank, Prepare Transfer
to ACC, have signed and send to TD Bank for processing.

0.5

24-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with K. Strong re APS and other documents; review
and revise Schedules to APS; review and respond to life lease
purchaser corresp.

4.4

25-05-22

Bricks, Hartiey

Disc. with K. Strong re APS; review various documents;
execute wire transfer.

3.0

26-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Revise Schedules to APS and forward to K. Strong for
comment; review and respond to various corresp. from life
lease purchasers.

2.5

27-05-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute wire transfer; draft purchase notice
template.

2.4

27-05-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking - Input bank charges into ascend.

0.2
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Date Name Narrative Hours
30-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Disc. with Altus group re appraisal proposal; prepare 4.5
purchase notices and forward to Gowlings for comments;
review of Condo Management Agreement and corresp. with
Steriing Karamar re same; review of condo docs for purchase
notice
31-05-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of appraisal proposals and prepare email to P. Deluca 2.5
re same; review and execute disbursements; disc. withC.
Prophet re Settlement Agreement terms.
Total 115.8
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4

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community
c/o Deloitte Restructuring inc.

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto.ON. M5H 0A9

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period June-1; 2022 to July 31, 2022 in connection with the
appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc,, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the "Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontatio) Retirement Community (“Rose of Sharon” or the

“Company”}:

Please see the appendices for details.

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax

Invoice 8002845109

Deloitte LLP
Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel:  (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416} 601-6151

www.deloitte.ca

Date:

Client No.:

WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

GST/HST Registration:

QST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

August 23, 2022
1154220
PEOC0004
Philip Reynolds

133245290RT0001
1012314163TQ0001

84,684.50

23.92
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11,012.09

95,720.51

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent-to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Sleeth, Jorden Partner 1.5 640.00 960.00
Schieman, D'Arcy Partner (Tax) 7.6 700.00 5,320.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 125.9 580.00 73,022.00
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.5 580.00 290.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 4.5 580.00 2,610.00
Scullion, Maria Director (Tax) 2.7 640.00 1,728.00
Dew, Todd Senior 0.4 295.00 118.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 1.7 140.00 238.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 2.4 140.00 336.00
Alvi, Farrah Consultant 0.5 125.00 62.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees 147.7 84,684.50
Out-of-pocket Expenses 23.92
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 84,708.42
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

01-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Update condo docs.; corresp. with various life lease
purchasers.

4.0

02-06-22

Conorton, Laura

Trust Banking - Prepare and process wire transfer.

0.4

02-06-22

Damiani, Stefano

Review and sign wire transfer, email to L. Conorton on same.

0.1

02-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Dalley re condo docs, update same; update
budget statement; corresp. with P. Crisolago re landscaping
quote; respond to corresp. from life lease purchasers;
execute appraisal proposal and compile and forward
documents to appraisers.

6.0

03-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of G/L provided by Sterling and update budget
statement; respond to questions from life lease purchasers;
provide documents to appraiser.

4.6

06-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from a life lease purchaser;
corresp. with D. Dalley re declarant duties and condo
management agreement.

0.8

07-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp. from Sterling Karamar re condo
management agreement; respond to corresp. from a life
lease purchaser; review and execute disbursemients.

1.3

08-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Dalley re condo documents and review of same;
disc. with K. Strong re APS documents; review of revised
Wyse Meter Agreement and corresp. with D. Dalley re same;
corresp. re appraiser site visit.

2.2

13-06-22

Alvi, Farrah

Trust Banking - Account reconciliation.

0.5

13-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and revise condo docs and corresp. with D. Dalley re
same; review and execute disbursements; corresp. with a life
lease purchaser.

3.3

14-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with D. Dalley re condo mgmt. agmt, conf. call with
Sterling Karamar re same; respond to info request from
appraiser; corresp. with D. Dalley re submetering agmt;
corresp. with insurer re condo corp.; forward condo docs to
board members.

4.3

15-06-22

Conorton, Laura

Trust Banking - Prepare and process wire transfers.

0.8

15-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with MLTC re timing for public meeting; corresp.
with P. DeLuca re update; review of APS schedules and
forward comments to K. Strong.

3.5
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

16-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Respond to various corresp. from a life lease purchaser;
prepare for and attend condo board meeting with C. Hristow,
1. Sleeth, D. Dalley of Gowlings; finalize condo corp
organizing docs and execute; corresp. with property manager
re quote and installation of card access to building.

5.3

16-06-22

Sleeth, Jorden

Condo corp meeting - prepare for and attend, arrange
execution of documents.

1.5

16-06-22

Hristow, Catherine

Review condominium documents; attend conference call with
H. Bricks, J. Sleeth and D. Daley.

1.5

16-06-22

Schieman, D'Arcy

Analysis of HST issues.

0.7

17-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with K. Ma re
cash flow; disc. with D. Shieman re HST; respond to corresp.
from a life lease purchaser; leave message with CRA re NOA;
corresp. with Sterling re CMA and further corresp. with D.
Dalley re same.

4.5

17-06-22

Schieman, D'Arcy

Disc. with H. Bricks re HST issues with sale of units.

1.4

17-06-22

Scullion, Maria

Call with D. Schieman re: GST/HST status of sale of life
interest condo units (subject to a life lease).

0.8

20-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp with life lease purchasers; corresp with Sterling re
funding and disbursements; corresp with P.Deluca re status
of LTC sale; disc with P. Shea re AVO; revise purchase
notices and forward to P.Shea.

3.7

21-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp and disc. with P.Shea re AVO; review and respond to
corresp from life lease purchasers.

1.7

22-06-22

Damiani, Stefano

Review banking package and sign wire transfer.

0.1

22-06-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Review account online and
update Ascend with incoming wire and deposits, Prepare
monthly transfer to ACC.

1.0

22-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp with appraiser and prepare and provide documents
requested; corresp with R. Ahmad and R. Berg re cash flow
and transfer to Receiver; corresp with D. Daley re condo docs
and review of same.

3.5

23-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Correspondence with P.Shea re court date and materials;
corresp. with D.Schieman re HST; review of court materials.

1.0

24-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of draft AVO and provide comments to P.Shea;
review and execute disbursements.

1.5

24-06-22

Schieman, D'Arcy

Analysis of HST issues.

0.6

27-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Revise court report for vesting order process and various
updates; review and complete insurance questionnaire
including various discussions and emails with R. Shiwram of
Brokerlink.

5.4
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

28-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute disbursements; corresp. with Sterling re
cash flow and review of same; corresp. with R, Shiwram re
insurance matters.

1.2

29-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and execute condo management agmt, shared
facilities agmt and Wyse agmt, forward to C. Hristow; various
corresp. with D. Dalley re condo docs; corresp. with K.
Strong re APS and o/s matters; review CF forecast and
arrange for transfer to PM account.

4.4

30-06-22

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with K. Strong and P. Shea to discuss APS and
vesting order; prepare condo docs and forward to Milborne;
revise disclosure statement and schedules and forward to D.
Dalley.

4.6

30-06-22

Hristow, Catherine

Review Shared Services Agreement, Property Management
Agreement and Metering Agreement; correspondence with H.
Bricks; authorize signature on documents.

1.8

30-06-22

Conorton, Laura

Processing funds transfer.

0.4

30-06-22

Damiani, Stefano

Review funding transfer, sign wire payment.

0.1

05-07-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Print monthly reconciliations
from Property Mgmt. and input into ascend.

0.1

05-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of Property mgmt. agmt; corresp with Sterling re
ledgers and cash flow; review CMA and forward to D. Daley

2.7

06-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Conf call with Sterling re CMA and transition matters; review
of draft appraisal and provide comments on same; review
and execute disbursements

3.0

07-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare amendment to Property Mgmt. Agmt and forward to
Sterling; corresp with Sterling re disbursements and execute
same

4.5

08-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Update purchase notice amounts; revise purchase notice and
forward to Gowlings for comments; review and execute
disbursements

4.0

08-07-22

Schieman, D'Arcy

1.8

11-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Forward documents to Sterling; corresp. with H. Milborne re
parking and locker matters; review and respond to corresp.
from Sterling re banking matters; corresp. with Gowlings re
APS and court materials '

4.2

12-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with appraisers re status; update email to P.
Del.uca; conf. call with Arirang and Infrastructure Ontario to
discuss history of nursing home and status; corresp. with
Gowlings re court materials.

4.5

13-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of comments from P. Shea and update report;
forward report to C. Hristow for review; conf. call with
Gowlings to discuss finalizing report and APS matters.

4.0
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

13-07-22

Hristow, Catherine

Discussion with H. Bricks regarding Twelfth Report to the
Court and future attendance in Court; review draft Twelfth
Report and supporting documentation and provide comments
on same.

1.2

14-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review and provide comments on draft vesting order; revise
court report, finalize and send to Gowlings for service

1.4

15-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Provide Gowlings with documents for motion materials;
prepare purchase notices; respond to corresp. from life lease
purchasers re status; review and respond to corresp. from
MLTC re public meeting

3.5

18-07-22

Conorton, Laura

Website update

0.1

18-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of motion record; review of APS; revise purchaser
notice; review MLTC public notice and forward to ACC for
posting

2.6

19-07-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Adm. - disbursement cheques

0.3

19-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp. with a life lease purchaser; review of appraisal all
and forward to Peoples; corresp with Sterling re cash flow
funding; review and execute disbursements

2.5

20-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Corresp and disc with appraiser re status; corresp with H.
Milborne re CMA and pricing, and review of files re same;
corresp with P. Deluca re pricing; revise purchaser notices

1.9

21-07-22

Dew, Todd

Trust Banking - Prepare and process funds transfer.

0.4

25-07-22

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Update Ascend with Ministry
funds, Prepare month transfer to ACC.

0.8

25-07-22

Damiani, Stefano

Review and approve funding transfer request; telephone call
with TD Bank re wire.

0.2

25-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Conf. call with Sterling to discuss amending agmt and
transition matters; corresp. with an appraiser; review and
approve quote for roof leak investigation; execute wire
transfer and other disb.; provide update to P. Deluca;
complete info for new bank acct.; corresp. with Gowlings re
APS and schedules.

5.8

26-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Review of corresp. from H. Milborne and corresp. with K.
Strong re same; corresp. from S. Han re prep for closing
meeting; review and execute disbursements;

3.0

26-07-22

Brown, Rose

inquire with TD bank on open account for sale condominium

0.1

27-07-22

Bricks, Hartley

Prep. for and attend court hearing for approval of vesting
process; various corresp. with life lease purchasers re status
and locker availability; disc. with P. Shea re court hearing
and other matters

5.5

27-07-22

Scullion, Maria

Review of D. Schieman analysis, disc. with D. Schieman re
same.

0.7
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Date Name Narrative Hours
27-07-22 Schieman, D'Arcy Prepare HST analysis, forward to M. Scullion and disc. re 1.4
same.,
28-07-22 Scullion, Maria Reviewing exempting provisions. Review and disc. with D. 1.2
Schieman re analysis.
28-07-22 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.1
28-07-22 Bricks, Hartley Respond to various corresp. re lockers; update purchase 2.7
notice and forward to K. Strong; corresp. with D. Dalley re
condo documents; review and execute disbursements.
28-07-22 Schieman, D'Arcy Finalize HST analysis and forward to H. Bricks. 1.7
29-07-22 Bricks, Hartley Review of email from D. Schieman re HST; corresp. with 3.3
Sterling re storage areas; review and respond to various
corresp. re locker requests; respond to corresp. from MLTC.
Total 147.7




DE'Oitte@ Invoice 8003002813

Bay Adelaide Centre
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Rose of Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community ;:L Eﬁgg 28}:2: g?

¢/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc. www.deloitte.ca
8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200
Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Date: October 28, 2022
Canada Client No.: 1154220
WBS#: PEOC0004

Engagement Partner:  Philip Reynolds

GST/HST Registration;:  133245290RT0001
QST Registration: 1012314163TQ0001

For professional services rendered

Fees

For the period August 1, 2022 to September 30, 2022 in connection with
the appointment of Deloitte & Touche Inc, now known as Deloitte
Restructuring Inc., as Receiver and Manager (the “Receiver”) of Rose of
Sharon (Ontario) Retirement Community {“Rose of Sharon” or the
“"Company"):

Please see the appendices for details.

HST applicable 87,346.00

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses
(Model Suite Furniture Rental)

HST applicable 10,976.19
Sales Tax

HST at 13.00 % 12,781.88

Total Amount Due (CAD) 111,104.07

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Sleeth, Jorden Partner 0.3 650.00 195.00
Bricks, Hartley Director 143.8 595.00 85,561.00
Damiani, Stefano Director 0.4 595.00 238.00
Hristow, Catherine Director 0.4 595.00 238.00
Dew, Todd Senior 0.8 305.00 244.00
Conorton, Laura Trust Administrator 1.0 150.00 150.00
Brown, Rose Trust Administrator 4.8 150.00 720.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 151.5 87,346.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses (Model Suite Furniture Rental) 10,976.19
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 98,322.19
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Work performed from August 1, 2022 to September 30, 2022
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

8/2/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to corresp. from Sterling; conf. call with
Sterling re status of condo management; review and execute
disbursements; review of Milborne pricing and appraisal and
provide analysis to P. DelLuca; respond to corresp. from
tenant; review and revise Disclosure documents.

5.3

8/3/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with K. Strong re status; disc. with a party interested in
en bloc purchase; respond to inquiry from life lease
purchaser; respond to corresp. from MLTC; respond to
questions from Sterling re bank account set up; follow up
with broker re condo insurance.

4.4

8/4/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Site meeting with H. Milborne to review suites for showing;
corresp. with Sterling re site work to be completed; review
and revise Disclosure Package.

4.0

8/5/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Review of draft appraisal and corresp. with CHS re same;
review of Gowlings changes to purchase notice and update
same; review and respond to corresp. from H. Milborne;
provide updated account statement for a life lease purchaser.

3.3

8/8/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Prepare purchase notices; corresp. with K. Strong re APS
matters; prepare status update for P. DelLuca; prepare
updated net realizations analysis and provide to P. Deluca;
attend video meeting with Arirang and MLTC.

7.2

8/9/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Respond to corresp. from various life lease purchasers;
prepare Purchase Notices; review final appraisal and update
schedule; review and respond to corresp. from K. Strong;
provide info to Sterling for bank account.

7.5

8/10/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Disc. with K. Strong re status and APS; prepare purchase
notices and upload to Sharefile; review and execute
disbursements; respond to inquiry from life lease purchaser.

5.0

8/10/2022

Conorton, Laura

Trust Banking - Prepare disbursement for appraisal fees.

0.1

8/17/2022

Damiani, Stefano

Review bank transfer request, sign wire payment, emails.

0.1

8/17/2022

Conorton, Laura

Trust Banking - Processing transfer from Operating account
to PM account

0.2

8/17/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Review of APS documents and respond to questions from K.
Strong; corresp. with Sterling re repair work at premises;
review and execute staging contract; review and execute
disbursements.

5.2
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Date Name Narrative Hours
8/18/2022 Bricks, Hartley Convene board meeting for 15 Maplewood condo corp. and 4.8
prepare minutes; attend conf. call with Arirang and their
counsel to discuss closing matters; review revised Schedule
to APS and corresp. with K. Strong re same; disc. with P.
Shea re status.
8/18/2022 Hristow, Catherine Attend First Meeting of the Board of Directors. 0.3
8/18/2022 Sleeth, Jorden Condo board meeting. 0.3
8/19/2022 Bricks, Hartley Review and execute disbursements; prepare reconciliation of 3.2
disbursements between owner/condo/LTC; review and
respond to emails from life lease purchasers
8/22/2022 Damiani, Stefano Review and sign wire transfer request, emails. 0.1
8/22/2022 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Update Ascend with various 1.0
entries, reconciliation GL to Bank and prepare transfer funds
to ACC, have signed and send to TD Bank.
8/22/2022 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from S. Han re public 5.2
meeting; review info request from Sterling re condo bank
account, review of docs, execute signature card and forward
to directors; corresp. with K. Strong re APS and review of
same.
8/22/2022 Dew, Todd Prepare bank reconciliation for Rose accounts. 0.4
8/23/2022 Bricks, Hartley Attend MLTC pre-meeting and public meeting; review and 4.5
respond to corresp. from S. Han re ARR audits; call to MLTC
re ARR audits; review and respond to corresp. from a life
lease purchaser.
8/23/2022 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Confirm ACC received wire and Input wire 0.2
into Ascend.
8/24/2022 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Input disbursements. 0.2
8/29/2022 Bricks, Hartley Review APS and provide comments to Gowlings; finalize 6.0
Purchaser Notices; provide update to P. DelLuca; disc. with H.
Milborne re status and timing; corresp. with Sterling re status
of work at building.
8/30/2022 Bricks, Hartley Finalize and send out purchase notices and purchase 5.7
agreements; various corresp. with purchasers; conf. call with
Sterling re status; disc. with Ryhan re invoices.
8/31/2022 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to various corresp. from life lease 5.0
purchasers regarding purchase notice and purchase
agreement; corresp. with Sterling re work at property and
parking matters
9/1/2022 Bricks, Hartley Review and respond to corresp. from life lease purchasers, 5.5
including revising purchase agreements; review and execute
disbursements.
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

9/2/2022

Bricks, Hartley

Review and respond to various corresp. from life 