

This is Affidavit #1 of Kibben Jackson in this case and was made on October 22, 2015

No. S144832 Vancouver Registry

IN THE SUPREME COURT OF BRITISH COLUMBIA

BETWEEN:

BANK OF MONTREAL

PETITIONER

AND:

KATZIE COAST MARINE SERVICES INC.
KATZIE COAST MARINE OPERATIONS (2009) INC.
COAST MARINE SERVICES 2004 LTD.
0818987 B.C. LTD.
COAST MARINE SERVICES INC.
KATZIE FIRST NATION BAND

RESPONDENTS

AFFIDAVIT

- I, Kibben Jackson, of 2900 550 Burrard Street, Vancouver British Columbia, lawyer, AFFIRM THAT:
- 1. I am a partner at Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP ("FMD"), counsel for Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as court appointed receiver and manager (the "Receiver") of the Respondents Katzie Coast Marine Services Inc., Katzie Coast Marine Operations (2009) Inc., Coast Marine Services 2004 Ltd., 0818987 B.C. Ltd. and Coast Marine Services Inc., and as such have personal knowledge of the facts hereinafter deposed to except where stated to be on information and belief, in which case I verily believe them to be true.
- 2. I am one of the individuals that had primary carriage of this matter at FMD, and I am authorized to make this affidavit on behalf of FMD.

- 3. I have reviewed the Third Report of the Receiver, dated October 21, 2015 (the "**Third Report**"), to be filed in these proceedings. Capitalized terms used herein but not otherwise defined have the same meanings as are ascribed to them in the Third Report.
- 4. Attached hereto and marked as indicated are the following Exhibits (collectively, the "FMD Invoices"):

Exhibit	Invoice description	Amount
A	Invoice # 838402 dated August 13, 2014	\$8,066.24
В	Invoice # 844753 dated September 8, 2014	\$7,252.05
C	Invoice # 854919 dated October 16, 2014	\$20,902.13
D	Invoice # 864078 dated November 19, 2014	\$17,943.54
Е	Invoice # 876213 dated December 22, 2014	\$8,594.60
F	Invoice # 881664 dated January 19, 2014	\$4,111.80
G	Invoice # 891206 dated January 31, 2015	\$8,130.52
Н	Invoice # 901559 dated March 31, 2015	\$6,564.46
I	Invoice # 918072 dated June 2, 2015	\$4,648.81
J	Invoice # 919069 dated June 8, 2015	\$6,567.55
K	Invoice # 928335 dated July 14, 2015	\$504.43
L	Invoice # 936615 dated August 17, 2015	\$4,776.67
M	Invoice # 947505 dated September 24, 2015	\$1,543.93
N	Invoice # 951899 dated October 13, 2015	\$2,175.61

- 5. As detailed in the FMD Invoices, from June 3, 2014 to September 30, 2015, FMD's invoiced fees amounted to \$88,791.50 and FMD incurred and invoiced for disbursements in the amount of \$2,244.96 and taxes in the amount of \$10,745.88, for a total of \$101,782.34.
- 6. As at the date of this affidavit, FMD has yet to invoice for additional work in progress, consisting of fees and disbursements of approximately \$2,000 (exclusive of taxes), and estimates that it will generate further fees and disbursements of approximately \$2,500 (exclusive of taxes) to the completion of this matter, assuming the Receiver's application for discharge is not opposed.
- 7. The work carried out by FMD as counsel to the Receiver in these proceedings includes, but is not limited to, the following:
 - (a) assisting the Receiver with the sale of certain vessel assets, including drafting sale agreements, managing the closing of the transaction and managing payment of the sale proceeds;
 - (b) liaising with creditors and the Transport Canada Vessel Registry with respect to the discharge of certain marine mortgages;
 - (c) preparing for and attending at Court applications for approval of the Receiver's activities and for vesting orders relating to the sale of various assets;
 - (d) reviewing and advising on the insurance claim relating to the Miller 309, including communications with the Underwriters and Katzie First Nation;
 - (e) negotiating and drafting the Revised Settlement Agreement;
 - (f) ongoing communications with creditors and other stakeholders; and
 - (g) generally advising the Receiver on legal matters relating to the receivership.
- 8. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief, the information contained in FMD Invoices as to:
 - (a) the number of hours worked;

- (b) the nature of work performed;
- (c) the identity of the individuals who performed work; and
- (d) the rates charged for the work performed,

is true and correct in all respects.

9. The fees set out in the FMD Invoices are calculated on the basis of the hours spent by FMD personnel, multiplied by the applicable standard hourly rates charged by FMD. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief, those hourly rates are consistent with those charged by other law firms for work of a similar nature in Vancouver, B.C.

AFFIRMED BEFORE ME at Vancouver, British Columbia, on October 22, 2015

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

KIBBEN JACKSON

DANIELLE R. TOIGO

Barrister & Solicitor
Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
2900 - 550 Burrard Street
Vancouver, BC V6C 0A3
604 631 4783

The AND COMPANY CONTROL OF THE COMPANY CONTROL OF THE COMPANY CONTROL OF THE CONT

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

8/13/2014 Invoice #: 838402 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through 7/31/2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$7,067.00

Total Disbursements

144.00

Total Taxes

855.24

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 8,066.24

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per. K.M. Jackson

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors

Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



8/13/2014 Invoice #: 838402 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

06/03/14	Review demand lett Verbrugge;	ers issued by Bank of Mo	ntreal and forward	ded by Mr.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
06/14/14	Emails exchanged vinsurance; review erregarding same;	witih Mr. Lee regarding iss mails exchanged among N	ue with respect to //r. Lee, Bank of N	cancellation of Montreal and BLG	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
06/15/14	Review draft Petition to Mr. Lee with com	n, affidavit and Receiversl ments on draft Receiversl	nip Order forward	ed by Mr. Lee; ema	ail
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00
06/16/14	Review email from Mr. Lee providing comments on draft receivership materials; telephone conversation with Mr. Lee regarding issues with respect to insurance, management of operations and receivership generally; telephone conversation and emails exchanged with Mr. Verbrugge regarding same; further telephone conversation with Mr. Lee regarding same;				d
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.70 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 350.00
06/19/14	Review emails forw with respect to insur	arded by Mr. Lee regaridn rance;	g timing for receiv	vership and issues	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
06/24/14	Review email from I appointment of rece	Mr. Lee regarding reinstate eiver;	ement of insuranc	e and timing for	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
06/25/14	Review amended pereview draft order a	etition and affidavits in sup nd emails exchanged with	pport circulated by Mr. Verbrugge a	Mr. Verbrugge; nd Mr. Lee regardir	ng

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

same; review amended draft order;

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 838402

	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00
06/26/14		Mr. Verbrugge and Mr. L ng to insurance coverage			er
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00
06/27/14	telephone conversa	n Mr. Lee regarding insura ation with Mr. Lee regardir pinted receiver; review em asurance;	ig same and rega	rding assets over	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
07/02/14	to location of vesse vessel and environ	and conference with Huey els and insurance coverag mental issues; email from ig notice of civil claim; rev comments.	e in respect of sui Paul Chambers r	nk barge, arrested egarding arrest of	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 600.00
07/03/14	obligations of Rece conference with Mi arrest of vessel; tel	nip Order and law pertaining order and law pertaining in chael Parrish regarding in lephone conversation with disale of same; emails exage.	ith Huey Lee rega surance claim and counsel for Impe	arding same; d salvage as well a rial Paving regardir	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 650.00
07/03/14	arrest, salvage, jur	se upon numerous maritin isdiction and coverage; re payment of arrest costs.			
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00
07/10/14	Review emails from	m Huey Lee and Graham 'ding same.	Walker regarding	insurance claim; er	nail
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
07/15/14	forwarded by Huey pertaining to same with counsel for cr	Huey Lee regarding statu Lee regarding insurance e; email to Huey Lee regar editor seeking to arrest sh	claim and attachi ding foregoing; te	ng documents	on
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00
07/21/14	Telephone conver Vancouver Sand a	sation with Paul Chamber and Gravel.	s regarding claims	s by and against	



Page 4

Invoice #: 838402

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.30 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 150.00

07/28/14

Emails with Kibbon Jackson regarding draft Request for Particulars with respect to vessels; reviewing and revising same; emails with Huey Lee regarding comments

on draft Request for Particulars;

Vicki Tickle

Associate

0.60 hrs.

420.00/hr

\$ 252.00

07/30/14

Email from counsel for Imperial Paving with respect to continuation of trial and terms on which receiver to sell vessel; emails exchanged and conferences with Paul Chambers and Magnus Verbrugge regarding same; email to counsel for Imperial Paving providing receiver's response with respect to proposal; review email from Paul Chambers attaching various documents with respect to ongoing dispute with Vancouver Sand and Gravel; telephone conversation with Paul Chambers regarding same; telephone conversation and email from Paul Chambers regarding issue with respect to bank mortgages and amounts secured by same; begin review of security documents and other information forwarded by Paul Chambers.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

3.10 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 1,550.00

07/31/14

Review tax issues with Kibben Jackson; review additional tax issues with Kibben

Jackson.

F.S. Schober

Partner

0.50 hrs.

750.00/hr

\$ 375.00

07/31/14

Review and draft amendments to bill of sale forwarded by Paul Chambers; email to Paul Chambers and Huey Lee attaching same with comments; emails exchanged with Frank Schober regarding tax ramifications of sale; email to Paul Chambers and Huey regarding Vancouver Sand and Gravel agreements and issues pertaining to same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

2.20 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 1,100.00

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
F.S. Schober	Partner	750.00	0.50	375.00
K.M. Jackson	Partner	500.00	12.00	6,000.00
M.D. Parrish	Partner	440.00	1.00	440.00
Vicki Tickle	Associate	420.00	0.60	252.00
		Total	14.10	CAD \$ 7,067.00



Page 5 Invoice #: 838402

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 7,067.00 353.35 494.69	
Total Fees I	ncluding Taxes		\$ 7,915.04
Disburseme Taxable	ents		
06/25/14	Lasercopy	133.20	
06/30/14	Lasercopy	6.40	
07/28/14	Lasercopy	4.40	
Total Disbur	sements	144.00	
GST		7.20	
Total Disbur	sements Including Taxes		151.20
Total Fees,	Disbursements and Taxes	CA	AD \$ 8,066.24
Tax Summary			
GST		360.55	
BCPST		494.69	
Total Taxes Inc	cluded in This Bill	855.24	

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



8/13/2014 Invoice #: 838402 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through 7/31/2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 7,067.00

Total Disbursements 144.00

Total Taxes 855.24

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 8,066.24

Tax Summary

GST 360.55 BCPST 494.69

Total Taxes Included in This Bill 855.24

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

	But he was not a set of the first set of the
	This is Exhibit referred to in the
	affidavit of Kibben Jackson
	made before me on this
	day of 0 A 0 Dec 20 15
	1970
	A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia
day an	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

9/8/2014 Invoice #: 844753 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through 8/31/2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$6,129.00

Total Disbursements

379.30

Total Taxes

743.75

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 7,252.05

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M. Jackson

E.&Ø/E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin L **Barristers and Solicitors** Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 - 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



9/8/2014 Invoice #: 844753 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Review email from Paul Chambers providing draft email to Brian Hall with response 08/01/14 to proposal in respect of resolution of matters between Vancouver Sand and Gravel and Coastal Marine; email to Paul Chambers attaching revised draft and addressing various issues with respect to same; continue reviewing bank security documents, including mortgages with respect to ships and security for guarantees; conference with Brent Lewis regarding same; instructions to Suzanne Volkow regarding

K.M. Jackson

searches to be performed in respect of same. Partner

1.80 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 900.00

Review results of search of Ships Registry in respect of Transporter 2; email to 08/05/14

client concerning effect of description of security in registry and matters related to same; emails exchanged with client regarding same and further research to be

performed.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.70 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 350.00

Telephone conversation with counsel for Imperial Paving regarding sale of 08/06/14

Malaspina Straits; emails exchanged with client regarding same and email to Jordan Kinghorn regarding same; emails from Paul Chambers regarding additional research with respect to vessels and encumbrances registered against same;

instructions to Suzanne Volkow regarding same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.40 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 200.00

Review registry searches of vessels; email to Paul Chambers and Huey Lee 08/07/14

attaching same and providing comments with respect to encumbrances registered

against same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.40 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 200.00

Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding encumbrances registered against 08/08/14

vessels and possible further investigation regarding bank security; review notice of civil claim filed against Coast Marine by Warrior Marine; email to Paul Chambers

and Huey Lee regarding same.

Montréal Québec City Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa London Paris Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 844753

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.40 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 200.00 K.M. Jackson Partner 08/12/14 Review emails from Paul Chambers attaching draft listing agreement and proposal from Accurate Bailiffs; instructions to Vicki Tickle regarding review of same; email to Paul Chambers regarding same; review results of registry search of Coast 12 and email to Paul Chambers regarding same. 0.30 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 150.00 K.M. Jackson Partner Conference with Kibben Jackson for instructions on file; review file materials 08/13/14 provided by same; review Deloitte Listing Agreement and standard from agreement provided by Accurate bailiffs; revise Deloitte Listing Agreement; emails with Vicki Tickle regarding same; emails with Paul Chambers regarding revised Listing Agreement. 1.90 hrs. Danielle R. Toigo Associate 330.00/hr \$ 627.00 08/13/14 Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers, Vicki Tickle and Danielle Toigo regarding review of listing agreement; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding advising counsel for Imperial Paving with respect to listing of vessel. K.M. Jackson Partner 500.00/hr \$ 100.00 08/13/14 Reviewing and revising draft listing agreement; emails with Danielle Toigo and Paul Chambers regarding same. Vicki Tickle Associate 0.60 hrs. 420.00/hr \$ 252.00 08/18/14 Email from Paul Chambers regarding listing of Malaspina Straits; email to counsel for Imperial Paving to advise as to same. Partner K.M. Jackson 0.20 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 100.00 08/19/14 Review draft purchase and sale agreement for Katzie Pride forwarded by Paul Chambers; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding same; draft amended purchase and sale agreement and forward to Paul Chambers with comments. K.M. Jackson Partner 2.20 hrs. \$ 1,100.00 08/20/14 Numerous emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding amendments to draft Purchase and Sale Agreement for Katzie Pride; draft amendments to same and email clean and comparison versions to Paul Chambers; draft precedent purchase and sale agreement for future sales of assets under \$250,000; email same to Paul Chambers with comments. K.M. Jackson Partner 3.50 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 1,750.00 08/21/14 Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding delivery of deposit.

0.20 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 100.00



Page 4

Invoice #: 844753

Matter Number: 242587.00098 **Matter: Katzie Group of Companies** Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

08/22/14

Email from Paul Chambers attaching sale agreements for CFW Vagg Katzie Pride; email to Paul Chambers regarding payment of deposit and completion of same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.20 hrs.

\$ 100.00

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	500.00	10.50	5,250.00
Vicki Tickle	Associate	420.00	0.60	252.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	330.00	1.90	627.00
_		Total	13.00	CAD \$ 6,129.00



Page 5 Invoice #: 844753

Our Fees GST BCPST	_	\$ 6,129.00 306.45 429.03	
Total Fees In	ncluding Taxes		\$ 6,864.48
Disburseme	nte		
Non-Taxable			
08/05/14	Registration/Court Fees /DYE DURHAM/6130915/MISCELLANEOUS	20.00	
08/13/14	Registration/Court Fees /DYE DURHAM/6135875/MISCELLANEOUS	180.00	
08/20/14	BC Online Searches/Queries	14.00	
Taxable			
08/01/14	Lasercopy	1.60	
08/05/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	48.00	
08/07/14	Lasercopy	11.20	
08/12/14	Lasercopy	0.80	
08/13/14	Lasercopy	18.00	
08/13/14	Lasercopy	12.80	
08/13/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	52.90	
08/14/14	Lasercopy	0.40	
08/20/14	BC Online Searches/Queries	3.00	
08/25/14	Lasercopy	1.20	
08/25/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.40	
08/29/14	Trust Administration Fee (BC)	15.00	
Total Disbur	sements	379.30	
GST		8.27	
Total Disbu	sements Including Taxes		387.57
Total Fees,	Disbursements and Taxes	C/	AD \$ 7,252.05
Tax Summary	,		
GST		314.72	
BCPST		429.03	



Page 6 Invoice #: 844753

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

743.75

A STATE OF THE PARTY OF THE PAR	
This is Exhibit referred to	
affidavit of Kinden Jack	Son
made before me on this22	
day of	15
971	
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia	1
Controller delicus and stock and stock to the division of the controller delication of the controller d	
Commission and the state of the control of the control of the commission of the commission of the control of th	manyahingga gangi

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
Barristers and Solicitors
Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

October 16, 2014 Invoice #: 854919 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through September 30, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 18,393.00

Total Disbursements 291.40

Total Taxes 2,217.73

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 20,902.13

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M. Jackson

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors
Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 - 550 Burrard Street , Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



October 16, 2014 Invoice #: 854919 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

09/03/2014 Telephone conversation with Paul Chambers regarding issues with respect to insurer and removal of barge; emails exchanged with Michael Parrish regarding same. \$ 200.00 0.40 hrs. 500.00/hr K.M. Jackson Partner 09/04/2014 Telephone conversation with Michael Parrish regarding insurance claim and issues with respect to denial of coverage and preservation of barge; email to Paul Chambers and Michael Parrish regarding same. \$ 450.00 0.90 hrs. 500.00/hr K.M. Jackson Partner 09/05/2014 Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding review of insurance materials; telephone conversation with Huey Lee regarding insurance claim. 500.00/hr \$ 100.00 Partner 0.20 hrs. K.M. Jackson 09/05/2014 Review and respond to e-mails regarding insurance and marine issues; consider and advise upon insurance and marine issues; draft preliminary action item plan. 440.00/hr \$ 440.00 1.00 hrs. Partner M.D. Parrish 09/08/2014 Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers and Huey Lee regarding denial of coverage by insurer and review of same by Faskens; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers and Vicki Tickle regarding preparation of materials for application for approval of sale of Katzie Pride. K.M. Jackson Partner 0.40 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 200.00 09/08/2014 Review and respond to e-mails regarding denial of coverage; consider coverage issues. \$ 264.00 Partner 0.60 hrs. 440.00/hr M.D. Parrish 09/08/2014 Emails with Kibben Jackson and Paul Chambers regarding application for approval of sale of Katzie Pride vessel.

Montréal

Ottawa

Toronto

Calgary

Vancouver

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 854919

	Vicki Tickle	Associate	0.20 hrs.	420.00/hr	\$ 84.00
09/09/2014	Reviewing receivers Pride'; drafting notice	hip materials and agreem e of application for approv	ent for purchase a	and sale of 'Katzie der.	
	Vicki Tickle	Associate	1.50 hrs.	420.00/hr	\$ 630.00
09/10/2014		ielle Toigo regarding appl vith respect to same; orga		al and vesting orde	er,
	Vicki Tickle	Associate	0.40 hrs.	420.00/hr	\$ 168.00
09/11/2014		update and status e-mail g insurance claim and los	s.	ers; review	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.70 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 308.00
09/12/2014	Review and reply to policy and related d	e-mails from Mr. Chambe ocuments.		nce denial; review	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00
09/15/2014		adjuster and surveyor's re e forwarding communicat			e;
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00
09/15/2014		d to e-mails regarding clai urance Act; review and re			
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00
09/16/2014	report and timing for sale of Katzie Pride	ations with Allison Burton or service of materials in so c; telephone conversation surveyor report as well as same.	upport of applicati with Michael Parri	on for approval of ish regarding reviev	v
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
09/16/2014	Review documents analyze technical c	and file; review numerous ausation issues.	s expert survey re	ports; consider and	I
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	4.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,980.00
09/17/2014	Conference with Mand denial letter from	ichael Parrish regarding ir om adjustor.	itial review of insu	ırance claim, surve	у
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00



Page 4 Invoice #: 854919

09/17/2014	Continue reviewing documents and expert reports; telephone conference with Graham Walker of BLG regarding background and history of events; review case law regarding various issues of maritime insurance; draft list of outstanding documents; review and respond to e-mails regarding status and strategy; prepare for meeting with Deloitte.					
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	2.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,100.00	
09/18/2014	Emails with Mr. Jack Danielle R. Toigo	son regarding application Associate	shells. 0.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 33.00	
09/18/2014	Katzie Pride insuran	e with Michael Parrish, Huce claim and strategy with	n respect to same) .		
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.90 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 450.00	
09/18/2014	advise upon issue re mails regarding reta coverage issues; re	end at meeting with Huey egarding denial of covera iner of surveyors; review view law regarding maritir	ge; send and resp and respond to e-	oond to numerous -mails regarding	s e-	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	3.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,320.00	
09/19/2014	Chambers, Huey Le	mendments to Receiver's se and Michael Parrish wit scerning Miller 309 insurat	th comments; revi			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	2.80 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00	
09/19/2014		d to e-mails from surveyo revise report to Deloitte; c				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	2.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 880.00	
09/21/2014	approval of Receive	lication and Vesting Order er's activities; emails exch n respect of same and dra	anged with Huey	Lee, Paul Chamb		
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	3.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 1,700.00	
09/22/2014	revise and finalize	omments on notice of app draft order; emails with Kil Lewis regarding filing and Associate	oben Jackson reg		ne; \$ 264.00	
09/22/2014	Review and respon	nd to e-mails regarding sta conference with surveyor r Partner	itus; continue ana	lyzing coverage	, 22	



Page 5 Invoice #: 854919

09/23/2014	Receive instructions Court priorities; reserved Fergus J.L. McDonnell	from Kibben Jackson reg arch same; draft email to Student	arding BIA and B Kibben Jackson r 0.80 hrs.	C Civil Rules of egarding same. 230.00/hr	\$ 184.00
09/23/2014	Kleaman regarding texchanged with Pau	cchanged with counsel for iming for application and I Chambers and Huey Le nails exchanged with Mag Partner	issues with respe e regarding same	ct to same; emails ; telephone	\$ 450.00
09/23/2014	Review and respond consider policy and coverage theory.	d to e-mails from Graham formulate coverage theor	Walker regarding y; review evidenc	coverage issues; e to support	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00
09/24/2014	regarding timing of a vessel; emails exchanged regarding same, incomplete sale price; emails exclusive regarding instructions to Laura	xchanged with counsel for application and issues con anged and conferences with the second and the second and telephone of the second and telephone of the second as a smith to draft Amending the and send same to Huese Partner	ncerning same, in vith Huey Lee and tory of vessel and conversation with ourchase and sale Agreement; revie	cluding sale price of Paul Chambers basis for reduced counsel for agreement; we and draft chambers for reviev	of
09/24/2014	Draft amendment a Laura J. Smith	greement to purchase an Associate	d sale agreement 1.20 hrs.	270.00/hr	\$ 324.00
09/24/2014	Policy and Marine I conference with Grant Conference with Confer	ng and considering nume nsurance Act to formulate aham Walker (BMO coun and reply to e-mails regar Partner	e theory of covera sel) regarding cov	ge; telephone rerage issues; repo	
09/25/2014	Emails from Paul C	chambers and Huey Lee r to same and forward same exchanged with Counsel f	egarding draft am e to Counsel for F	ending agreement; Purchaser for	



Page 6 Invoice #: 854919

09/26/2014	Numerous emails exchanged with Paul Chambers and Huey Lee regarding explanation for lower sale price of Katzie Pride and costs to repair; email to counsel Katzie First Nation and Mr. Kleaman regarding same; emails exchanged with counsel for Gisbourne Marine to exchange endorsed copies of Amending Agreement; emails exchanged with counsel for Katzie First Nation regarding adjournment and conditions of same.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 650.00
09/26/2014	Review and respond M.D. Parrish	d to e-mails regarding stra Partner	tegy and action it 0.20 hrs.	ems. 440.00/hr	\$ 88.00
09/27/2014	Draft affidavit of Paul Chambers attaching an amending agreement; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers and Huey Lee regarding same and finalization of same as well as timing for delivery of additional materials.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.60 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 300.00
09/29/2014	Email from counsel emails exchanged v	for Kleaman advising that with client regarding same	they will not oppo	ose application;	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
09/29/2014	Review and respon	d to e-mails from surveyor Partner	rs regarding issue 0.10 hrs.	es. 440.00/hr	\$ 44.00
09/30/2014	4 Email from counsel for Kleaman attaching Application Response; email same to client.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
09/30/2014	Telephone conference with David Trickett regarding repair and valuation issues and questions; review and respond to e-mails from Deloitte regarding repair and valuation.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00



Page 7 Invoice #: 854919

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson M.D. Parrish Vicki Tickle Danielle R. Toigo Laura J. Smith Fergus J.L. McDonnell	Partner Partner Associate Associate Associate Student	500.00 440.00 420.00 330.00 270.00 230.00	15.90 19.90 2.10 0.90 1.20 0.80	7,950.00 8,756.00 882.00 297.00 324.00 184.00
i cigas v.c. Moderno		Total	40.80	CAD \$ 18,393.00



Page 8 Invoice #: 854919

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 18,393.00 919.65 1,287.51	
Total Fees Incl	uding Taxes	***************************************	\$ 20,600.16
Disbursement Non-Taxable 09/22/14	Registration/Court Fees /DYE	80.00	
	DURHAM/6157682/COURT SERVICES		
Taxable			
09/09/14	Lasercopy	9.60	
09/09/14	Lasercopy	2.00	
09/22/14	Lasercopy	10.00	
09/22/14	Lasercopy	13.60	
09/22/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	71.60	
09/22/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	15.20	
09/22/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	6.00	
09/22/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	15.20	
09/22/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	6.00	
09/22/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	28.85	
09/22/14	Lasercopy	0.80	
09/23/14	Lasercopy	7.60	
09/24/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	14.95	
09/25/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
09/25/14	Lasercopy	1.60	
09/26/14	Lasercopy	1.60	
09/27/14	Lasercopy	0.80	
09/27/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	1.60	
09/27/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
09/30/14	Lasercopy	1.20	



2,217.73

Page 9 Invoice #: 854919

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

Total Disbursements GST	291.40 10.57
Total Disbursements Including Taxes	301.97
Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes	CAD \$ 20,902.13
Tax Summary	000.00
GST	930.22
BCPST	1,287.51

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors
Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



October 16, 2014 Invoice #: 854919 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through September 30, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 18,393.00

Total Disbursements 291.40

Total Taxes 2,217.73

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 20,902.13

Tax Summary

 GST
 930.22

 BCPST
 1,287.51

 Total Taxes Included in This Bill
 2,217.73

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

made before me on this ...22.....

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLrd Barristers and Solicitors Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

Total Fees

FASKEN O
MARTINEAU

November 19, 2014 Invoice #: 864078 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

\$ 15,529.00

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through October 31, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

mentoralitum

Total Disbursements

Total Disbursements 524.82
Total Taxes 1,889.72

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 17,943.54

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Pét K.M. Jackson

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Colonia Taraka Outana Araba Araba Araba

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLM Barristers and Solicitors Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg



November 19, 2014 Invoice #: 864078 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

10/01/2014	forward same to clie	for Katzie First Nations at ent; instructions to Lisa Le	wis regarding filir	to application; og application recor	d.
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/02/2014	4 Emails exchanged with counsel for Katzie First Nation and Michael Parrish regarding attendance at application for approval of sale and denial of insurance claim.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/02/2014	Review and respond to e-mails regarding instructions and preliminary advice from surveyor; prepare for telephone conference with counsel for Katzie (interested party) regarding insurance claim; continue researching insurance issues and developing insurance claim.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00
10/03/2014	Certificate; review d	urt and stand in for Kibber ocumentation for vessel s	n Jackson; prepar ale and mortgage	re Receiver's e discharge.	
	Fergus J.L. McDonnell	Student	2.80 hrs.	230.00/hr	\$ 644.00
10/03/2014	Review correspondence; prepare Bill of Sale; review Court documents and executed Purchase Agreement; intra-office conference with Kibben Jackson and Fergus McDonnell.				
	Jonathan W. Conlin	Associate	1.00 hrs.	290.00/hr	\$ 290.00
10/03/2014	Prepare for and attend at chambers on application for order approving sale of Katzie Pride and related assets; emails exchanged with Huey Lee and Paul Chambers regarding result of same and closing; instructions to and numerous conferences with Jon Conlin and Ferg McDonnell regarding closing and documents to be delivered in connection with same; emails exchanged with counsel for purchaser regarding closing and documents to be exchanged; conference call with				



Page 3 Invoice #: 864078

	Michael Parrish and K.M. Jackson	Gord Plottel to discuss st Partner	tatus of insurance 2.00 hrs.	e claim. 500.00/hr	\$ 1,000.00
10/03/2014	Prepare for and atte Katzie) regarding in advice.	end telephone conference surance claim; e-mail to s	with Gordon Plot urveyor regarding	tel (counsel for g status of review a	and
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00
10/05/2014	Emails with Magnus Jonathan W. Conlin	s Verbrugge regarding BM Associate	O mortgage. 0.10 hrs.	290.00/hr	\$ 29.00
10/05/2014		with Jon Conlin and Ferg I livered; review email from	McDonnell regard Jon Conlin to Ma	ling closing and agnus Verbrugge	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/06/2014	Prepare documents Fergus J.L. McDonnell	for sale of Katzie Pride. Student	1.80 hrs.	230.00/hr	\$ 414.00
10/06/2014	Attend to all Closing Jonathan W. Conlin		1.50 hrs.	290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
10/06/2014	Numerous emails exchanged with and from Jon Conlin and Ferg McDonnell regarding closing of sale of Katzie Pride and issues pertaining to same; emails exchanged with Huey Lee, Paul Chambers and Michael Parrish regarding meeting with bank to discuss status of receivership, including insurance claim. K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs. 500.00/hr \$ 100.00				
10/06/2014	Review and respon surveyor regarding	d to e-mails regarding sur additional advice.	vey issues and in		, ,,,,,,,,
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 88.00
10/07/2014	Update documents Fergus J.L. McDonnell	for sale of Katzie Pride. Student	0.30 hrs.	230.00/hr	\$ 69.00
10/07/2014	Closing. Jonathan W. Conlin	Associate	1.10 hrs.	290.00/hr	\$ 319.00
10/07/2014	Review emails from of sale of Katzie Pri	Jon Conlin, counsel for G de; emails exchanged with	Sisbourne and client and Micha	ent regarding closir ael Parrish regardir	ng ng



Page 4 Invoice #: 864078

	meeting to discuss in K.M. Jackson	nsurance claim and other Partner	matters. 0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00	
10/07/2014	Review and respond to e-mails regarding status; telephone conference with David Trickett regarding various damages and valuation issues; continue researching and analyzing issues; telephone conference with Paul Chambers regarding analysis and advice; draft overall claim analysis.					
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 660.00	
10/08/2014	claim and issues with exchanged with Mich	ng email from Michael Par n respect to same, as wel nael Parrish regarding am	l as strategy reco endments to sam	mmendation, email	ls	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00	
10/08/2014	conference with Dav	d legislation; conduct over id Trickett regarding advic ents; draft e-mail report an Partner	ce and surveys; red d analysis; revise	eview and analyze report and analys		
	W.D. Pallisii	ranner	3.50 hrs.	440.00/hr \$	3 1,540.00	
10/09/2014	0/09/2014 Prepare for and attend on teleconference with Michael Parrish, Huey Lee and Pau Chambers to discuss memo regarding insurance claim and issues pertaining to same.				il	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00	
10/09/2014	Review and respond to e-mails from surveyor regarding advice and issues; review further surveys; e-mail report to Deloitte; prepare for telephone conference with Deloitte; draft and revise final report for Deloitte.				,	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	3.10 hrs.	440.00/hr \$	1,364.00	
10/10/2014	Review draft memorandum regarding insurance claim prepared by Michael Parrish; draft amendments to same and email to Michael Parrish, Huey Lee and Paul Chambers with comments on same.					
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00	
10/10/2014	Continue drafting and revising reporting letter to Deloitte; consider and investigate cost and legal strategy issues.					
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.40 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 616.00	
10/14/2014	Prepare for and attend at meeting with Huey Lee, Paul Chambers, Wellie Tjoe and Larry Chipman to discuss status of receivership, issues with respect to insurance claim and other matters relating to receivership generally; emails exchanged and telephone conversation with Michael Parrish regarding insurance claim and other options for recovery with respect to Miller 309.					



Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson Page 5 Invoice #: 864078

	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 650.00
10/14/2014	Review and respond to e-mails regarding report, advice and instructions; revise report to Deloitte; consider further issues and questions regarding insurance claim and valuation; review case law regarding negligent valuation and advice; draft preliminary advice to Deloitte.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00
10/15/2014	Email from Paul Cha Jonathan W. Conlin	ambers regarding Sales I Associate	nvoices. 0.10 hrs.	290.00/hr	\$ 29.00
10/15/2014	regarding same; tele Parrish regarding ac	Michael Parrish regarding d potential negligent valua ephone conversation and ditional facts relating to re ts to draft email to client re Partner	ation claim; email emails exchanged regligent valuation	to Michael Parrish d with Michael	
10/15/2014	potential cialin agail	g and analyzing insurand nst valuator; draft reportin s regarding status and act Partner	a e-mail to Doloitt	e; review and reply	•
10/16/2014		ce with previous surveyor			•
	and document inves M.D. Parrish	tigation. Partner	0.30 hrs.		
4044710044				440.00/hr	\$ 132.00
10/17/2014	Dana regarding insu	rith Huey Lee regarding crance claim and possible	ommunications wi	ith counsel for Kat veyor.	zie
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/19/2014	19/2014 Review TCB Marine survey; report to Deloitte regarding TCB Marine survey; review and respond to e-mails regarding insurance claim and action items.				w
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 176.00
10/20/2014	survey performed by and Paul Chambers Katzie Band, Michae insurance claim and	lichael Parrish attaching a Trickett; emails exchang regarding effect of same; Il Parrish and client regard other matters; telephone claim and potential claim Partner	ed with Michael P emails exchange ding timing for call conversation with	arrish, Huey Lee d with counsel for	e \$ 150.00



Page 6 Invoice #: 864078

10/20/2014	Review and respond to numerous e-mails regarding insurance claim and claim vs. surveyor; telephone call from surveyor regarding 2008 report.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 176.00
10/23/2014	insurance claim, pot generally; email to c	trustee, Michael Parrish ential claim against surve ounsel for Kleaman reque	yor and status of esting meeting to	receivership discuss same.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
10/23/2014	respond to e-mails r	nd at conference call with egarding status of action	items and further	investigations.	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.30 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 132.00
10/24/2014	regarding meeting to	xchanged with counsel fo o discuss insurance claim changed with Magnus Ve	and payment of	legal costs of Mr.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
10/27/2014	7/2014 Emails exchanged with Michael Parrish regarding email from counsel for Kleaman requesting written questions; emails exchanged with Huey Lee regarding same.				ו
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/27/2014	Review and respond to e-mails regarding interview with Gordon Kleaman; consider strategy.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 88.00
10/28/2014		r Katzie Band regarding c ng input with respect to sa same.			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00
10/29/2014	Emails exchanged with counsel for Bank regarding communications with counsel for Kleaman.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
10/30/2014	Numerous emails exchanged with counsel for Katzie Band, counsel for Mr. Kleaman and Michael Parrish regarding additional information of Mr. Kleaman relating to insurance claim and value of Miller 309; conference with Michael Parrish regarding same; emails exchanged with client regarding same.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
10/30/2014	Review and respor	nd to numerous e-mails fro	om Deloitte and o	oposing counsel	



Page 7

Invoice #: 864078

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

regarding documents and status of investigations.

M.D. Parrish

Partner

1.50 hrs.

440.00/hr

\$ 660.00

10/31/2014 Emails exchanged with Michael Parrish and counsel for Kleaman regarding

insurance claim and value of barge; attend on teleconference with Michael Parrish,

counsel for Kleaman and Kleaman regarding same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.50 hrs.

500.00/hr

\$ 250.00

10/31/2014 Review and respond to numerous e-mails regarding questions to and telephone

conference with Gordon Kleaman; telephone conference with Gordon Kleaman and

counsel; notes to file regarding facts, legal issues and action items.

M.D. Parrish

Partner

1.70 hrs.

440.00/hr

\$ 748.00

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	500.00	9.00	4,500.00
M.D. Parrish	Partner	440.00	20.00	8,800.00
Jonathan W. Conlin	Associate	290.00	3.80	1,102.00
Fergus J.L. McDonnell	Student	230.00	4.90	1,127.00
		Total	37.70	CAD \$ 15,529.00



Page 8 Invoice #: 864078

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 15,529.00 776.45 1,087.03	
Total Fees In	cluding Taxes	to constant	\$ 17,392.48
Disburseme	nts	*	
<u>Taxable</u>		40.00	
10/01/14	Lasercopy	42.00	
10/01/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
10/01/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
10/01/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	6.40	
10/01/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	19.95	
10/01/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	23.95	
10/02/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	23.95	
10/02/14	Lasercopy	0.80	
10/03/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
10/03/14	Lasercopy	4.40	
10/03/14	Lasercopy	1.20	
10/06/14	Lasercopy	2.80	
10/06/14	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	59.85	
10/07/14	Lasercopy	3.20	
10/07/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 28rd Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
10/07/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 28rd Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
10/07/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 28rd Floor Xerox 5775	5.20	
10/07/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 28rd Floor Xerox 5775	1.20	
10/07/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 28rd Floor Xerox 5775	5.20	
10/07/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	



Page 9 Invoice #: 864078

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Total Fees,	Disbursements and Taxes	CAD	17,943.54
Total Disbur	sements Including Taxes		551.06
GST		26.24	
Total Disbur	sements	524.82	
10/15/14	Quicklaw Searches QUICKLAW SERVICE/SINGLE	8.27	
10/15/14	Quicklaw Searches QUICKLAW	258.22	
10/15/14	Lasercopy	1.60	
10/14/14	Lasercopy	3.20	
10/14/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	3.20	
10/14/14	Lasercopy	14.40	
10/07/14	Delivery/Courier Expense /CORPORATE	23.03	

Tax Summary

GST	802.69
BCPST	1,087.03
Total Taxes Included in This Bill	1,889.72

FASKEN O

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4 November 19, 2014 Invoice #: 864078 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through October 31, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 15,529.00

Total Disbursements

524.82

Total Taxes

1,889.72

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 17,943.54

Tax Summary

GST

802.69

BCPST

1,087.03

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

1,889.72

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronta

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

This is Exhibit referred to in the affidavit of
made before me on this 22
day of
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O MARTINEAU

December 22, 2014 Invoice #: 876213 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through November 30, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 7,582.50

Total Disbursements 97.56

Total Taxes 914.54

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 8,594.60

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Pet: K.M. Jackson E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa



December 22, 2014 Invoice #: 876213 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

11/03/2014	Conference with Mr. Parrish regarding conversation with Mr. Kleaman and counsel for Mr. Kleaman as well as next steps for addressing issues raised therein; review email from Michael Parrish to client regarding same; emails exchanged with Michael Parrish regarding commencing action against Seaspan in order to preserve claim in light of potential limitation issue.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00
11/03/2014		ze new fact information fro eps; report to Deloitte.	om Gordon Kleam	an; consider and	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00
11/04/2014	Research subrogati preserving claim vs.	on and limitation period is . Seaspan.	sues; report to De	eloitte regarding	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.20 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 528.00
11/07/2014	researching potentia	d to e-mails regarding bar al downtime claim under h	ull policy.		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00
11/11/2014	Miller 309 as well a Parrish regarding sinsurance claim and	n Paul Chambers regarding s potential sale of same; t ame and regarding consid d claim against Seaspan; el Parrish, regarding foreg	elephone convers lerations with resp email to Paul Cha	sation with Michael bect to pursuit of imbers and Huey	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.70 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 350.00
11/11/2014		d to e-mails regarding bar	ge issues and str	ategy; consider and	t
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 220.00

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 876213

11/12/2014	Review and respond M.D. Parrish	to e-mails regarding insu Partner	rance issues and 0.30 hrs.	strategy. 440.00/hr	\$ 132.00
11/13/2014	discuss insurance cl with Huey Lee regar	e call with Huey Lee, Pau aim and strategy for deali ding payment of accounts	ng with Miller 309 prior to passing	r; emails exchange same.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
11/13/2014		ce with Paul Chambers ar couza regarding documen			
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 440.00
11/14/2014	regarding same; em comments on recirci procedure for discha	Purchase and Sale Agreer ails with Paul Chambers r ulate draft agreement; em arging vessel mortgage.	egarding same; r	evise same based	on
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	2.50 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 825.00
11/14/2014	purchase and sale a emails exchanged v	vith and instructions to Da agreement for Miller 309; r vith Danielle Toigo, Huey l hase and sale agreement	eview and note a Lee and Paul Cha	mendments to san ambers regarding	f ne;
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 250.00
11/17/2014	Review and respond	d to e-mails regarding sur	vevor advice and	opinion.	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.10 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 44.00
11/18/2014	Review e-mail from in barge.	Paul Chambers regarding	receiver decision	n to disclaim intere	st
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 33.00
11/18/2014	interest in Miller 309	with Paul Chambers regar as well as to prepare inte	erim statement of	accounts.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
11/19/2014	Review Receivership Order to determine scope of powers to disclaim interest in debtor's assets; review annotated BIA with respect to same; conference with Kibben Jackson regarding same; emails to Mr. Jackson and Mr. Grieve regarding same; emails to Paul Chambers regarding same; draft disclaimer letter and send to Mr. Chambers for comment.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	2.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 693.00



Page 4 Invoice #: 876213

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

K.M. Jackson

M.D. Parrish

Danielle R. Toigo

11/19/2014	D14 Emails with Danielle Toigo and Kibben Jackson regarding Miller 309 and disclaimer; review file and study law regarding same; emails with Danielle Toigo regarding factual background and recommendation and duties of the Receiver.				
	J.F. Grieve	Partner	0.70 hrs.	725.00/hr	\$ 507.50
11/19/2014	4 Numerous emails exchanged with Danielle Toigo, John Grieve and Paul Chambers regarding disclaimer of interest of receiver in Miller 309; review draft notice of disclaimer prepared by Danielle Toigo and draft amendments to same.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00
11/19/2014		ence with Mr. Trichett rega regarding document reque			
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.80 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 352.00
11/21/2014	Emails exchanged receiver in Miller 3	d with counsel for Kleaman 809.	regarding discla	imer of interest of	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00
11/21/2014	014 Research, analyze and draft denial challenge letter.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	3.00 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,320.00
11/25/2014	Continue researd	ning and drafting insurance	claim letter.		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.20 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 528.00
Professional Summary					
Professiona	<u>al</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
J.F. Grieve		Partner	725.00	0.70	507.50

500.00

440.00

330.00

Total

2.60

9.60

4.70

17.60

1,300.00

4,224.00

1,551.00

CAD \$ 7,582.50

Partner

Partner

Associate



Page 5 Invoice #: 876213

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 7,582.50 379.13 530.78	
Total Fees Inc	luding Taxes	200000	\$ 8,492.41
Disbursement Non-Taxable 11/14/14	sundry Expense - Payable to: RECEIVER GENERAL OF CANADA /	5.00	
	FEE FOR FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST TO TRANSPORT CANADA/ 13NOV/ SAC/ 19337		
<u>Taxable</u>			
11/13/14	Lasercopy	0.40	
11/14/14	Lasercopy	4.80	
11/17/14	Lasercopy	12.00	•
11/17/14	Lasercopy	1.60	
11/17/14	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	8.80	
11/17/14	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	8.80	
11/17/14	Postage	1.60	
11/18/14	Search Fees - Payable to: AMEX BANK OF CANADA /	31.00	
11/19/14	Lasercopy	0.40	
11/20/14	Lasercopy	2.00	
11/20/14	Lasercopy	2.80	
11/21/14	Lasercopy	3.60	
11/25/14	Lasercopy	7.20	
11/26/14	Telephone Charges - Payable to: DIALOGUE	7.56	
Total Disburs	ements	97.56	
GST		4.63	
Total Disburs	ements Including Taxes		102.19
Total Fees, [Disbursements and Taxes	C.	AD \$ 8,594.60



Page 6 Invoice #: 876213

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Tax Summary

GST
BCPST
.
Total Taxes Included in This Bill

383.76 530.78 914.54

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia		This is Exhibit referred to in the affidavit of
Elizabeth and all some for a committed and and and and and and and and all some and a some a some a some a some and a some	1 1 1 1 1 1 1	A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

January 19, 2015 Invoice #: 881664 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through December 31, 2014 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 3,663.00

Total Disbursements

8.80

Total Taxes

440.00

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 4,111.80

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per/K.M. Jackson

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

Innda

Parin

lakanna-kira

FASKEN (G)
MARTINEAU

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

January 19, 2015 Invoice #: 881664 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

FEE MEMORANDUM

12/03/2014		d to email regarding status	; ;		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.10 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 44.00
12/05/2014	Emails with Paul Ch	ambers regarding sale of	Malaspina Straits	i.	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 33.00
12/05/2014	reduced sale price, to vesting order; ins	vith Paul Chambers regard as well as notification of Ir tructions to Danielle Toigo	nperial Paving an	d issues nectaining	· ·
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 200.00
12/07/2014	ransport Canada F agreement to accou	ieneral Towing for purchas Registry filings for vessel; r Int for discharge of mortga Pers with comment on scho Associate	eview and revise ges against vess	draft purchase	s \$ 330.00
12/08/2014	Emails with Paul Ch	ambers.			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 33.00
12/16/2014	Emails with Jon Cor	nlin regarding process for	discharging ship r	mortgages.	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	330.00/hr	\$ 33.00
12/23/2014	Emails exchanged v	vith Gary Harlow regarding	difficulties effect	ting transfer of ship	s
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 100.00



Page 3 Invoice #: 881664

\$ 100.00

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

K.M. Jackson

12/24/2014	Draft letter to Vessel regarding same.	Registry for Gary Harlow	; emails exchang	ed with Gary Harl	low
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	500.00/hr	\$ 150.00
12/24/2014	Continue researchin challenge letter.	g; analyzing; considering,	drafting and revis	sing coverage de	nial
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	2.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,100.00
12/29/2014		eviewing and finalizing cov glegal and factual theory.	erage denial cha	llenge letter;	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	3.50 hrs.	440.00/hr	\$ 1,540.00
12/30/2014		ind email from Michael Pa ael Parrish, Huey Lee and			

Professional Summary

0.20 hrs.

500.00/hr

Partner

Professional	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	500.00	1.10	550.00
M.D. Parrish	Partner	440.00	6.10	2,684.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	330.00	1.30	429.00
		Total	8.50	CAD \$ 3,663.00



Page 4 Invoice #: 881664

Our Fees GST BCPST Total Fees Including Taxes Disbursements	\$ 3,663.00 183.15 256.41 \$ 4,102.56
Taxable	
12/07/14 Lasercopy	8.00
12/24/14 Lasercopy	0.40
12/24/14 Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.40
Total Disbursements	8.80
GST	0.44
Total Disbursements Including Taxes	9.24
Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes	CAD \$ 4,111.80
Tax Summary	
GST	183.59
BCPST	256.41
Total Taxes Included in This Bill	440.00

Same and the second
This is Exhibit referred to in the
affidavit of Kingen Jackson
made before me on this
day of MA Oper 20 15
970
A Commissioner for taking
Affidavits for British Columbia
The Committee of the co
<mark>Mediatura</mark> gennig stalmust, imm 100-100 - at telepoman ingehoven visiteten 350 blevamen mendelverspektivetel <mark>käälijä</mark> pelität 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100 - 100
↓ . ↓

A Commence

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

January 31, 2015 Invoice #: 891206 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through January 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 6,742.50

Total Disbursements 557.05

Total Taxes 830.97

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 8,130.52

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M. Jackson E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



January 31, 2015 Invoice #: 891206 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

01/02/2015	Emails exchanged with Michael Parrish and Paul Chambers regarding delivery of letter in draft to counsel for Kleaman and counsel for BMO.					
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00	
01/02/2015	Review and respond challenge letter; revi	l to numerous emails rega ew email from Mr. Tweeda	rding challenge le ale; draft email to	etter; revise Mr. Walker;		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.80 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 360.00	
01/07/2015	Review and respond regarding challenge	l to emails from Mr. Kleand letter; revise challenge let	on's and Bank of ter.	Montreal's counsel		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 180.00	
01/08/2015	Emails with Paul Ch approval of same.	ambers regarding purchas	se of Katzie Pride	and application for	r	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00	
01/08/2015	01/08/2015 Review and respond to emails regarding proposed letter to Insurer; telephone conference with Mr. Walker regarding letter to Insurer; report to Deloitte regar letter to Insurer; finalize and send letter to Insurer.					
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 585.00	
01/09/2015	Review and respond	d to emails regarding statu	s and action item	s.		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00	
01/10/2015	Commence drafting notice of application and draft Order for application of approval of sale of Malaspina Straits.					
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.50 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 180.00	

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London París Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 891206

01/12/2015	Commence reviewing and revising Receiver's Second Report; emails with Paul Chambers regarding same.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 396.00
01/12/2015	Review and respond forward.	to numerous emails rega	arding action items	s and strategy goin	g
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 135.00
01/13/2015	Jackson regarding s comments made by	and revising Receiver's So ame; emails with Paul Ch Michael Parrish; continue g Order and draft Order fo Associate	ambers regarding drafting and revision	same; review sing notice of	\$ 972.00
01/13/2015	regarding abandonn and email to Danielle	chael Parrish regarding lan nent; review amended dra e Toigo with comments on I timing for application.	oft report prepared	l by Danielle Toigo	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 262.50
01/13/2015	Review and revise of interest.	court report; consider and	analyze ramificat	ions of disclaimer o	of
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 180.00
01/14/2015	instruct on filing and	application materials for a			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.70 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 252.00
01/14/2015		with Danielle Toigo and Pa Kinghorn; review final ma			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
01/15/2015		vith Paul Chambers regard neering report to Jordan K			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.00 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 360.00
01/15/2015		ation with Jordan Kinghor mails exchanged with Dai			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00



Page 4 Invoice #: 891206

01/15/2015 Review and respond to emails from surveyor Tricket regarding comments on letter and facts.				er	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00
01/20/2015	Email to Paul Cham purchaser of Malasp	bers; emails with Jordan I oina Straits.	Kinghorn; emails	with counsel for	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
01/21/2015	Emails with Jordan l Danielle R. Toigo	Kinghorn. Associate	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
01/22/2015	Telephone call with Danielle R. Toigo	Jordan Kinghorn; emails v Associate	with Gordon Plott 0.20 hrs.	el. 360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
01/23/2015	Emails with Ms. Giles regarding delivery of materials at closing; emails with Mr. Chambers regarding same; emails with Jon Conlin regarding timeline for discharge of maritime liens.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.40 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 144.00
01/26/2015	Telephone call and emails with counsel for purchaser regarding deliverables at closing and draft vesting order; telephone call with Paul Chambers regarding same; review application response of Imperial Towing; send index to application record to Gordon Plottel.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 576.00
01/27/2015		s Verbrugge and BMO reg			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.30 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 108.00
01/27/2015	5 Review and respond to emails from Captain DeSouza regarding status of claim and response.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.10 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 45.00
01/28/2015	Prepare for and attend at application for Vesting Order; attend to entry and certification of same; emails to Paul Chambers regarding same and materials needed to close sale; emails with purchaser's counsel regarding same; review letter from purchaser's counsel; respond to same by email; request copy of certified Receivership Order; emails with mortgagees counsel regarding discharge of their mortgages from title to Malaspina Straits. Danielle R. Toigo Associate 3.50 hrs. 360.00/hr \$ 1,260.00				



Page 5 Invoice #: 891206

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	525.00	1.10	577.50
M.D. Parrish	Partner	450.00	3.70	1,665.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	360.00	12.50	4,500.00
		Total	17.30	CAD \$ 6,742.50



Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson Page 6 Invoice #: 891206

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 6,742.50 337.13 471.98	
Total Fees Inc	luding Taxes		\$ 7,551.61
Disbursemen Non-Taxable	ts		
01/14/15	Registration/Court Fees /DYE DURHAM/6220742/COURT SERVICES	80.00	
01/30/15	Filing Service/ Court Fees - Payable to: CASH / OBTAINING CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER AT COURT REGISTRY/ 28JAN/ DRT/ 17807	40.00	
<u>Taxable</u>			
01/08/15	Lasercopy	7.20	
01/08/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	7.20	
01/10/15	Lasercopy	2.80	
01/13/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
01/13/15	Lasercopy	2.00	
01/13/15	Lasercopy	26.80	
01/13/15	Lasercopy	1.20	
01/14/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	5.60	
01/14/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	15.60	
01/14/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	48.00	
01/14/15	Lasercopy	12.80	
01/14/15	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	19.95	
01/16/15	Lasercopy	1.20	
01/19/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
01/22/15	Lasercopy	2.00	
01/26/15	Lasercopy	3.60	
01/26/15	Lasercopy	1.20	
01/26/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	12.40	
01/26/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor	62.80	



Page 7 Invoice #: 891206

Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes		CAD	\$ 8,130.52
Total Disbur	sements Including Taxes		578.91
GST		21.86	
Total Disbur	sements	557.05	
01/30/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	10.80	
01/30/15	Lasercopy	3.20	
01/30/15	Lasercopy	10.00	
01/29/15	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	83.95	
01/29/15	Lasercopy	4.00	
01/28/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
01/28/15	Lasercopy	10.80	
01/28/15	Lasercopy	20.80	
01/27/15	Title Searches/Court filings/Cert. Copies /DYE	14.95	
01/27/15	Lasercopy	13.60	
01/26/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	1.20	
01/26/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
01/26/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	13.60	
01/26/15	Document Scan IVAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	6.00	
01/26/15	Telephones Charges /12502877755/Campbell River	1.80	
01/26/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	5.60	
	Xerox 5775		

Tax Summary	
GST	358.99
BCPST	471.98
Total Taxes Included in This Bill	830.97

	This is Exhibit referred to in the
1	affidavit of Kibben Jackson
	made before me on this
	day of October 20 5
	97
	A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia
	7111001110 101 = 111111

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

FASKEN O

March 31, 2015 Invoice #: 901559 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through February 28, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 5,737.50

Total Disbursements

132.33

Total Taxes

694.63

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 6,564.46

Fasken Martineau/DuMoulin LLP

Per: K!M/. Jackson E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLr

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



March 31, 2015 Invoice #: 901559 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

01/29/2015	Numerous emails with counsel for purchaser's office regarding documents needed for closing of sale of Malaspina Straits; numerous emails and telephone calls with Paul Chambers regarding same; email from counsel for BMO confirming delivery of executed Form 7 discharge.					
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.90 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 324.00	
01/30/2015	telephone call to Ve- undertaking letter; e	for Imperial Paving regard ssel Registry regarding sa mails with office for purch of materials to same.	me: review, cons	ider and revise		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.50 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 540.00	
02/02/2015	Emails with Sera Hallett regarding discussion with Transport Canada and following up with same on delivery of declaration for discharge of Imperial Paving mortgage.					
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00	
02/03/2015	Draft and send ema Straits.	il to Paul Chambers upda	ting on closing of	sale of Malaspina		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.30 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 108.00	
02/04/2015	Emails with purchas Malaspina Straits; e	ser's counsel regarding sta mails with Paul Chambers	atus of registration regarding same	of bill of sale for		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.30 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 108.00	
02/05/2015	Numerous emails a discharging mortgage	nd telephone calls with Vege from vessel.	essel Registry reg	arding process for		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.90 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 324.00	

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris



Page 3 Invoice #: 901559

02/06/2015	Review email from Transport Canada confirming it will discharge marine mortgages; emails with Kibben Jackson regarding extending closing date; emails to purchaser's counsel regarding same; further emails with purchaser's counsel confirming registeration of Malaspina Straits and transfer of funds.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 216.00
02/10/2015	documents; instruct of	th Paul Chambers regard on discharge of financing operty Registry; review so osing documents. Associate	statements again	st Malaspina Strait	ts s \$ 324.00
	Daniello IX. Tolgo	Associate	0.50 1115.	300.00/11	φ 324.00
02/10/2015		statement; file partial rele			
	E.S. Hui	Secretary	0.30 hrs.	205.00/hr	\$ 61.50
02/11/2015	Chambers regarding		g closing of sale;	email to Paul	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
02/16/2015	Conference with Kibben Jackson regarding ships sold by Receiver without vesting order being obtained to discharge mortgages on title; review and consider email from Kibben Jackson and materials regarding same.				3
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.40 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 144.00
02/17/2015	Draft, revise and finalize email to Paul Chambers regarding sold vessels with undischarged mortgages and plan for dealing with same; emails with Magnus Verbrugge regarding same.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 576.00
02/17/2015	O15 Conferences with Danielle Toigo regarding sale of vessels and discharge of mortgages; review emails exchanged between Danielle Toigo and Paul Chambers regarding same.				s
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
02/18/2015	Emails with Mr. Verbrugge regarding service of petition on Allied Shipbuilders; draft letter to same regarding discharge of mortgage; emails with Paul Chambers regarding same.				aft
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 432.00
02/18/2015		d to emails regarding stat	•		
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00



Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Page 4 Invoice #: 901559

02/19/2015	Review and respond to emails regarding status of coverage dispute; review correspondence from insurance counsel; research and consider legal issue regarding insurer response.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.80 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 360.00
02/20/2015	correspondence from and texts regarding coverage claim issues; consider strategy; draft email to BMO counsel regarding issues; draft report to Deloitte.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	2.00 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 900.00
02/23/2015	Review Form 7 mortgage discharges provided by BMO with repsect to Transporter No. 2 and other vessels; emails with Paul Chambers regarding same and regarding sale of Coast VII.				er ng
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.30 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 108.00
02/23/2015	Continue developing update.	g legal strategy and action	items; report to I	Deloitte regarding	,
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.70 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 315.00
02/24/2015	Emails with Magnus Verbrugge requesting mortgage discharge for Coast VII and BMO acceptance of sale price; emails with Paul Chambers regarding same; commence drafting letter to Vessel Registry regarding discharge of mortgages.				·
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 216.00
02/25/2015	2/25/2015 Revise and finalize letter to Vessel Registry requesting discharge of mortgages; emails with Paul Chambers and Magnus Verbrugge regarding BMO acceptance on purchase price of Coast VII.				on
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.50 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 180.00
02/25/2015	02/25/2015 Review and respond to emails regarding status and strategy; consider issues regarding reply to insurer.				
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00
02/27/2015	7/2015 Telephone call with Allied Shipbuilders regarding discharge of marine mortgage; draft and send email to Paul Chambers updating on same.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.30 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 108.00



Matter Number: 242587.00098

Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Page 5 Invoice #: 901559

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	525.00	0.20	105.00
M.D. Parrish	Partner	450.00	3.90	1,755.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	360.00	10.60	3,816.00
E.S. Hui	Secretary	205.00	0.30	61.50
		Total _	15.00	CAD \$ 5,737.50



Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson Page 6 Invoice #: 901559

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 5,737.50 286.88 401.63	
Total Fees Inc	cluding Taxes	-	\$ 6,426.01
Disbursemen Non-Taxable	ts		
02/10/15 Taxable	BC Online Searches/Queries 433108I - PARTIAL DISCHARGE/242587.00098/BPD051/1 0/02/2015/HUI, ELAINE (P)	10.00	
01/26/15	Lasercopy	6.00	
02/05/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
02/05/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
02/05/15	Lasercopy	0.80	
02/06/15	Lasercopy	4.00	
02/10/15	Lasercopy	1.60	
02/10/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
02/10/15	Lasercopy	1.60	
02/10/15	BC Online Searches/Queries 433108I - PARTIAL	1.50	
02/10/15	Lasercopy	0.80	
02/11/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
02/11/15	Lasercopy	5.60	
02/11/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	3.20	
02/11/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	3.20	
02/11/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
02/11/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
02/11/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
02/11/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.40	
02/11/15	Postage	1.65	
02/11/15	Delivery/Courier Expense /CORPORATE	3.01	
02/11/15	Delivery/Courier Expense	7.80	



Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Page 7 Invoice #: 901559

livery/Courier Expense FedEx - 8674502, ts ts Including Taxes rsements and Taxes	14.60 132.33 6.12 293.00 401.63	
8674502, ts ts Including Taxes	132.33 6.12	CAD \$ 6,564.46
8674502, ts ts Including Taxes	132.33 6.12	
8674502, ts ts Including Taxes	132.33 6.12	
8674502, ts	132.33	138.45
8674502,	132.33	
8674502,		
	14.60	
otocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor rox 5775	8.00	
cument Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th or Xerox 5775	8.00	
sercopy	7.60	
sercopy	1.20	
sercopy sercopy	2.00 0.40	
livery/Courier Expense DRPORATE	6.57	
sercopy	0.40	
cument Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th	0.80	
otocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor	0.80	
sercopy	24.40	
ercopy	0.80	
	1.60	
	percopy ptocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor pox 5775 cument Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th por Xerox 5775 gercopy ivery/Courier Expense DRPORATE gercopy gercopy gercopy gercopy cument Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th por Xerox 5775	ercopy 1.60 ercopy 0.80 ercopy 24.40 otocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor ox 5775 cument Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th 0.80 or Xerox 5775 ercopy 0.40 ivery/Courier Expense 6.57 DRPORATE ercopy 2.00 sercopy 3.40 ercopy 3.40

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LL,

FASKEN (G)
MARTINEAU (G)

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

March 31, 2015 Invoice #: 901559 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through February 28, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 5,737.50

Total Disbursements

132,33

Total Taxes

694.63

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 6,564.46

Tax Summary

GST

293.00

BCPST

401.63

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

694.63

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

Application of the second of t
This is Exhibit referred to in the
affidavit of Kinben Jackson
made before me on this
day of 00 to 20 15
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia
Manager and the second

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin

FASKEN
MARTINEAU

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4 June 02, 2015 Invoice #: 918072 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through April 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 4,104.50

Total Disbursements

49.30

Total Taxes

495.01

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 4,648.81

Fasker Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M./Jackson

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

FASKEN O

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4 June 02, 2015 Invoice #: 918072 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

03/03/2015	Emails with Magnus Verbrugge following up on discharge of BMO mortgage for Coast VII; emails with Paul Chambers confirming BMO mortgage discharge for vessels previously sold.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
03/05/2015	Emails with Paul Ch	ambers regarding closing	of sale of Coast	VII.	*
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
03/05/2015		t to e-mails regarding requiy to insurer; telephone co			
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 135.00
03/06/2015	Emails with Paul Ch	ambers confirming sale o	f Coast VII.		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
03/06/2015	Review and respond to e-mails regarding further request for information by insurer; research legal position regarding request by insurer; formulate strategy.				r;
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 180.00
03/09/2015	Draft letter to Vessel Registry enclosing BMO mortgage discharge; follow up with Allied Shipbuilders by email regarding the mortgage discharge.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.40 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 144.00
03/10/2015	Review mortgage discharge from Allied Shipbuilders; draft letter to Vessel Registry enclosing same.				у
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00

Vancouver Calgary Toronto Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg



Page 3 Invoice #: 918072

03/12/2015	Receive voicemail from Vessel Registry regarding rejection of discharge of Allied Shipbuilders' mortgage.					
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00	
03/12/2015	stay to proceed with Chambers regarding respect to same; em	Telephone conversation with and letter from counsel for Kleaman regarding lifting stay to proceed with Warrior Marine Services litigation; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding same; review letter from counsel for Warrior Marine with respect to same; emails exchanged and telephone conversation with counsel for Warrior Marine regarding lifting stay; further emails exchanged with client regarding				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.50 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 262.50	
03/13/2015	action to proceed ar	ation with counsel for Kleand issues pertaining to sa	me.			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00	
03/13/2015	Review and respond M.D. Parrish	d to e-mails regarding sta Partner	tus and instruction 0.20 hrs.	ns. 450.00/hr	\$ 90.00	
03/17/2015	Katzie First Nation	chael Parrish regarding in regarding same and inten	tion of bank to ter	minate.		
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00	
03/17/2015	Review and respon M.D. Parrish	d to e-mails regarding sta Partner	tus and strategy.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00	
	W.D. Famsii	raitilei	0.20 1115.	450.00/111	\$ 90.00	
03/19/2015	Email to Paul Chan Danielle R. Toigo	nbers delivering discharge Associate	e of BMO mortgag 0.10 hrs.	e from Coast VII. 360.00/hr	\$ 36.00	
03/19/2015	applications to list s	lence from counsel for Wa stay and other relief; emai on and position of receive	ls exchanged with			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50	
03/20/2018		ail to Paul Chambers rega		ence with Vessel		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.50 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 180.00	



Page 4 Invoice #: 918072

03/20/2015	Teleconference with Michael Parrish and counsel for Katzie First Nation regarding outstanding insurance claim and issues pertaining to same; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers and Huey Lee regarding same.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.80 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 420.00
03/20/2015	Prepare for and atter and advise regarding for Katzie and Deloit	nd teleconference with co g limitation issue; review a te.	ounsel for Katzie; and respond to e-	research, consider mails with counsel	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	1.50 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 675.00
03/20/2015	Conference with and on Transporter No. 2	d emails from Danielle To 2.		charge of mortgage	
	Vicki Tickle	Associate	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00
03/24/2015	Letter from Transpo Coast VII; instruction	rt Canada regarding discl	narge of mortgage ail to Paul Chamb	e with respect to pers regarding sam	e.
	Vicki Tickle	Associate	0.10 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 45.00
03/27/2015	Review and respond issues regarding sa	d to e-mails regarding dis le and disposal.		onsider and advise	on
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.40 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 180.00
03/31/2015	disposes of barge;	Michael Parrish regarding email to Gorden Plotel to egard and concerns with I	advise of inquiries		er
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
04/01/2015		ation with counsel for Por mail from Huey Lee rega		ing barge and	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50
04/02/2015	consider and advise	d to numerous e-mails re e upon insurance and sal surer regarding change of	e issues; review a	sale of vessel; and respond to e-m	ails
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 225.00
04/06/201		with counsel for Katzi Firs	st Nation regardin	g timing for decisio	n
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00



Page 5 Invoice #: 918072

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

04/09/2015 Research and summarize the law regarding jurisdiction of Transport Canada and

administrative procedure to seize and sell private vessels.

Samantha W.S. Associate

280.00/hr

\$ 224.00

Chang

04/15/2015 Emails exchanged with Gordon Plotel and Huey Lee regarding discharge of receiver and persuit of insurance claims; conference with Michael Parrish regarding same.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.20 hrs.

525.00/hr

\$ 105.00

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	525.00	2.90	1,522.50
M.D. Parrish	Partner	450.00	3.50	1,575.00
Vicki Tickle	Associate	450.00	0.30	135.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	360.00	1.80	648.00
Samantha W.S. Chang	Associate	280.00	0.80	224.00
_		Total	9.30	CAD \$ 4,104.50



Page 6 Invoice #: 918072

CAD \$ 4,648.81

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 4,104.50 205.23 287.32	
Total Fees In	cluding Taxes	Name of the Control o	\$ 4,597.05
Disbursemer	nts		
Taxable			
03/09/15	Lasercopy	1.20	
03/09/15	Lasercopy	3.20	
03/09/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.00	
03/09/15	Delivery/Courier Expense FedEx - 728826354,	14.45	
03/10/15	Delivery/Courier Expense FedEx - 728826354,	14.45	
03/10/15	Photocopies /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	1.20	
03/10/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
03/10/15	Lasercopy	0.80	
03/11/15	Lasercopy	0.40	
03/11/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
03/11/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	1.20	
03/20/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	2.40	
03/24/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 27th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
04/14/15	Lasercopy	4.00	
04/23/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	1.20	
04/23/15	Document Scan /VAN - 1c1s 26th Floor Xerox 5775	0.80	
Total Disbu	rsements	49.30	
GST		2.46	
Total Disbu	rsements Including Taxes		51.76
		_	

Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes



Page 7 Invoice #: 918072

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Tax Summary

GST

BCPST

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

207.69

287.32

495.01

FASKEN O

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4 June 02, 2015 Invoice #: 918072 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through April 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 4,104.50

Total Disbursements 49.30

Total Disbursements 49.30

Total Taxes 495.01

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 4,648.81

Tax Summary

 GST
 207.69

 BCPST
 287.32

 Total Taxes Included in This Bill
 495.01

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

And the state of t
This is Exhibit referred to in the
affidavit of Kibben Tackson
made before me on this
day of Ω Ω Ω Ω Ω Ω 20 Ω
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia
Trafficialism and the Market is a second of the second of

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

)
FASKEN
MARTINEAU

June 08, 2015 Invoice #: 919069 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through May 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$5,830.50

Total Disbursements

35.60

Total Taxes

701.45

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 6,567.55

Fasker Martineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M. Jackson El.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Patent and Trade-mark Agents
2900 – 550 Burrard Street

Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



June 08, 2015 Invoice #: 919069 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

05/04/2015	E-mails with Paul Cl Danielle R. Toigo	nambers updating on call Associate	to Allied Shipbuild 0.10 hrs.	lers. 360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
05/05/2015	bank security and gr	Paul Chambers regarding uarantees in light of realiz hedules of realizations and	ations; begin revi	s with respect to ewing history of	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 210.00
05/06/2015	Continue analysis o	f security position and rec	overy; e-mails ex	changed with Paul	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50
05/07/2015	Telephone converse security review.	ation with Paul Chambers	regarding marsh	alling question and	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
05/12/2015	E-mail to Paul Char Danielle R. Toigo		0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
05/15/2015	Telephone call with to BMO; review and regarding same.	Paul Chambers regarding d consider receivership or	g discharge applic der related to sam	cation and distributine; e-mails with san	on ne
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 216.00
05/15/2015	Telephone confere report.	nce with Paul Chambers r	egarding status a	nd action items	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00



Page 3 Invoice #: 919069

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

05/22/2015	Review, consider and respond to e-mails from Paul Chambers regarding drafting of discharge materials; e-mail to Michael Parrish with Receiver's report.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.40 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 144.00
05/25/2015	Review and revise R	Receiver's Third Report; e- rafting application materia	-mails with Mìcha Is for discharge a	el Parrish regardi pplication.	ing
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	3.70 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 1,332.00
05/26/2015	Continue reviewing Jackson for review.	and revising third report o	f the Receiver's;	send same to Kib	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	3.40 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 1,224.00
05/26/2015	Review and revise r M.D. Parrish	report to Court. Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 135.00
05/27/2015	Draft affidavit #1 of	Huey Lee; draft affidavit t	o be sworn by Fa	sken's; continue	
00,2,,20.0	drafting and revising	g Third Report of the Rec	eiver.		
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.80 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 648.00
05/28/2015	Draft notice of appli	ication for discharge appli e-mail same to Paul Cham	cation; further dra	aft and revise third ee with comment	d
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	2.50 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 900.00
05/29/2015	Review Kihhen Jac	kson's comments and e-r	nail on Receiver's	Report.	
00/20/20 10	Danielle R. Toigo		0.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 72.00
05/29/2015	discharge and app	mendments to report of C roval of activities and fees nts regarding same and s	s; e-mail same to	of application for client and Daniell	e
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.00 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 525.00

Professional Summary

Professional	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson M.D. Parrish Danielle R. Toigo	Partner Partner Associate	525.00 450.00 360.00	1.90 0.50 12.80	997.50 225.00 4.608.00
Darlielle IX. Tolgo	Associate	Total	15.20	CAD \$ 5,830.50



Page 4 Invoice #: 919069



Page 5 Invoice #: 919069

Our Fees GST BCPST Total Fees Including Taxes	\$ 5,830.50 291.53 408.14 \$ 6,53	 0 17
Disbursements Taxable 05/15/15 Lasercopy 05/19/15 Lasercopy	0.40 2.80	
05/19/15 Lasercopy 05/22/15 Lasercopy 05/26/15 Lasercopy 05/29/15 Lasercopy Total Disbursements GST	0.40 9.60 19.20 3.20 35.60 1.78	
Total Disbursements Including Taxes		37.38
Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes	CAD \$ 6,56	7.55
Tax Summary	293.31	
GST BCPST	408.14	
Total Taxes Included in This Bill	701.45	

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



June 08, 2015 Invoice #: 919069 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through May 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 5,830.50

Total Disbursements 35.60

Total Taxes 701.45

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 6,567.55

Tax Summary

 GST
 293.31

 BCPST
 408.14

 Total Taxes Included in This Bill
 701.45

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

This is Exhibit referred to in the affidavit of
day of
A Commissioner fer taking Affidavits for British Columbia

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



July 14, 2015 Invoice #: 928335 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through June 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 442.50

Total Disbursements

8.40

Total Taxes

53.53

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 504.43

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

合つ Per: K.M. Jackson

E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

OWN 7 COUR. 110 COOK 11, 7127110... 02000200

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



July 14, 2015 Invoice #: 928335 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

06/01/2015 Telephone conversation with Paul Chambers regarding dealings with Vancouver

Sand and Gravel with respect to fee claim in relation to discharge application.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.20 hrs.

525.00/hr

\$ 105.00

06/05/2015 Review status of ongoing witness interviews and fact investigation and email to

Gordan Plottel regarding status.

M.D. Parrish

Partner

0.40 hrs.

450.00/hr

\$ 180.00

06/08/2015 Review Notice of Civil Claim forwarded by counsel for Kleaman; email to counsel for

claimant regarding stay of proceedings and addressing claim generally; forward

communications to client.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.30 hrs.

525.00/hr

\$ 157.50

Professional Summary

Professional	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson M.D. Parrish	Partner Partner	525.00 450.00	0.50 0.40	262.50 180.00
		Total	0.90	CAD \$ 442.50



Page 3 Invoice #: 928335

Our Fees GST BCPST		\$ 442.50 22.13 30.98	
Total Fees In	cluding Taxes	-	\$ 495.61
Disbursemei <u>Taxable</u>	nts		
06/04/15	Lasercopy	3.20	
06/05/15	Lasercopy	3.60	
06/05/15	Lasercopy	1.60	
Total Disburs	sements	8.40	
GST		0.42	
Total Disburs	sements Including Taxes		8.82
Total Fees,	Disbursements and Taxes	,	CAD \$ 504.43
Tax Summary			
GST		22.55	
BCPST		30.98	
Total Taxes Incl	uded in This Bill	53.53	•

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



July 14, 2015 Invoice #: 928335 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through June 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees	\$ 442.50
Total Disbursements	8.40
Total Taxes	53.53
Total Amount Owing This Bill	CAD \$ 504.43

Tax Summary

 GST
 22.55

 BCPST
 30.98

 Total Taxes Included in This Bill
 53.53

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

This is Exhibit referred to in the affidavit of Ki wen Jawson
made before me on this
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



August 17, 2015 Invoice #: 936615 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through July 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$4,249.50

Total Disbursements

16.40

Total Taxes

510.77

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 4,776.67

Fasken Marineau DuMoulin LLP

Per:/K.M. Jackson E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

FASKEN ©

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4 August 17, 2015 Invoice #: 936615 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Attention: Huey Lee

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

07/02/2015	Emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding discussion with Vancouver Sand & Gravel and potential settlement.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/10/2015	& Gravel; emails exc	tion with Huey Lee regard hanged with Paul Chamb	ers and Huey Lee	e regarding same.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50
07/14/2015	Review and consider emails from Paul Chambers setting out terms of settlement between Receiver and Vancouver Sand & Gravel and Bryan Hall; telephone call with Mr. Chambers regarding same; review settlement agreement and tolling agreement for background on same; draft agreement revising terms of lease payment and send to Kibben Jackson for review with comment.				
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	2.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 792.00
07/15/2015	Review Kibben Jack	son's comments on the spers for comment with revi	ettlement agreem iew.	ent; revise same a	nd
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.60 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 216.00
07/15/2015	Review and draft an	nendments to settlement a vith Danielle Toigo regard	agreement prepar ing same.	red by Danielle Toig	go;
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 210.00
07/16/2015	Telephone call with Danielle R. Toigo	_	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
	_				
07/17/2015	5 Emails with Paul Ch Danielle R. Toigo	nambers and Kibben Jack Associate	son regarding set 0.10 hrs.	tlement agreement 360.00/hr	\$ 36.00



Page 3 Invoice #: 936615

07/21/2015	Kibben Jackson rega	n settlement agreement fr rding same; commence r Associate	om Bryan Hall; re evising settlemen 0.70 hrs.	view emails from t agreement. 360.00/hr	\$ 252.00
07/21/2015	Telephone conversation and emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding settlement between receiver and Vancouver Sand & Gravel and impact of same on Kleaman; emails exchanged with client regarding same; review amended draft of settlement agreement forwarded by counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel; email to client with comments on same.				
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	1.10 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 577.50
07/22/2015		ttlement agreement; send s with same regarding sa		Jackson for review	
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	1.20 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 432.00
07/22/2015		aft of settlement agreeme h comments regarding fu			
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/23/2015		lement agreement; send th same and Kibben Jack			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.80 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 288.00
07/23/2015	to Danielle Toigo reg	raft of settlement agreeme garding same; emails exc rding communications wit	hanged with coun	sel for Vancouver	il
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/24/2015	Kleaman regarding	with counsel for Vancouve finalizing agreement; ema etty Torsky regarding disc	ails exchanged an	d telephone	or ·
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50
07/28/2015	5 Emails exchanged with counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel and review draft no interest letter; telephone conversation with counsel for Kleaman regarding settlement.)	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/28/201	5 Review and respon policy regarding iss	d to e-mails regarding fur ues.	ther insurance rela	ated claim; review	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.50 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 225.00



Page 4 Invoice #: 936615

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

07/29/2015	same to Paul Chamb	ounsel for Kleaman regard pers and Hui Lee with con	ding payment of c nments and seeki	ommission; forward ng instructions with	d 1
	respect to response. K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/30/2015	Numerous emails ex	changed with counsel for nan to commission payme	· Kleaman regardi ent.	ng settlement and	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
07/30/2015	Telephone conferen	ce with Justin Katz regard m Justin Katz regarding c	ding insurance cla laim; review policy	iim; review /·	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 135.00
07/31/2015	Emails exchanged versions emails exchanged versions.	with counsel for Kleaman vith Paul Chambers and I	luey Lee regardin	ig same.	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson M.D. Parrish Danielle R. Toigo	Partner Partner Associate	525.00 450.00 360.00 Total	3.50 0.80 5.70 10.00	1,837.50 360.00 2,052.00 CAD \$ 4,249.50



Page 5 Invoice #: 936615

Our Fees GST BCPST Total Fees In	cluding Taxes	\$ 4,249.50 212.48 297.47	\$ 4,759.45
Disbursement Taxable 07/14/15 07/15/15 07/23/15 Total Disburs GST	Lasercopy Lasercopy Lasercopy	10.40 3.20 2.80 16.40 0.82	17.22
Total Fees,	Disbursements and Taxes	CA	D \$ 4,776.67
Tax Summary GST BCPST Total Taxes Inc	luded in This Bill	213.30 297.47 510.77	

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



August 17, 2015 Invoice #: 936615 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through July 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees \$ 4,249.50

Total Disbursements 16.40

Total Taxes 510.77

Total Amount Owing This Bill CAD \$ 4,776.67

Tax Summary

 GST
 213.30

 BCPST
 297.47

 Total Taxes Included in This Bill
 510.77

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

This is Exhibit referred toyin the
affidavit of Kibben Jallann
made before me on this
day of mala and the form 20 min
A Commissioner for taking Affidavits for British Columbia

2900 - 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee

September 24, 2015 Invoice #: 947505 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through August 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 1,378.50

Total Taxes

165.43

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 1,543.93

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP

FOR Per: K.M. Jackson E.&O.E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Vancouver

Calgary

Toronto

Ottawa

Montréal

Québec City

London

Paris

Johannesburg

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



September 24, 2015 Invoice #: 947505 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

08/04/2015	Telephone call with	counsel for BMO.			
	Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	0.10 hrs.	360.00/hr	\$ 36.00
08/06/2015	commission paymer Paul Chambers rega	ation with counsel for Klean of from Vancouver Sand & arding same and strategy oil for counsel for Vancouver Partner	Gravel; telephon for dealing with c	e conversation with laim in terms of	\$ 367.50
08/06/2015	Email to Mr. Katz re M.D. Parrish	garding insurance claim. Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 90.00
08/07/2015	Telephone conversa of negotiations with	ation with counsel for Vand Kleaman.	couver Sand & G	ravel regarding stat	us
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
08/10/2015	Review and respon	d to e-mails regarding aba	ndonment of ves	sel	
	M.D. Parrish	Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$ 135.00
08/18/2015	Telephone conversion	ation with counsel for Klea	man regarding se	ettlement and terms	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00
08/20/2015		ation with Paul Chambers n and discuss next steps.	to advise as to co	onversation with	
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00



Page 3 Invoice #: 947505

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

08/25/2015 Emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding timing for response; email to

Paul Chambers and Hui Lee forwarding same.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs.

08/29/2015 Email from counsel for Kleaman regarding reopening negotiations with Vancouver

Sand & Gravel; email to Huey Lee and Paul Chambers forwarding same with

comments.

K.M. Jackson

Partner

0.20 hrs.

525.00/hr

525.00/hr

\$ 105.00

\$ 105.00

08/31/2015 E-mail from Justin Katz regarding claim against Coast Marine; review and respond

to e-mails regarding new claim; consider insurance issues.

M.D. Parrish

Partner

0.50 hrs

450.00/hr

\$ 225.00

Professional Summary

Professional	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	525.00	1.70	892.50
M.D. Parrish	Partner	450.00	1.00	450.00
Danielle R. Toigo	Associate	360.00	0.10	36.00
		Total	2.80	CAD \$ 1,378.50



165.43

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

Page 4 Invoice #: 947505

Our Fees GST BCPST	\$ 1,378.50 68.93 96.50	
Total Fees Including Taxes	\$ 1,543.93	
Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes	CAD \$ 1,543.93	
Tax Summary		
GST	68.93	
BCPST	96.50	

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



September 24, 2015 Invoice #: 947505 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098
Matter: Katzie Group of Companies
Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through August 31, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 1,378.50

Total Taxes

165.43

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 1,543.93

Tax Summary

GST

68.93

BCPST

96.50

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

165.43

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

2900 – 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



October 13, 2015 Invoice #: 951899 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies

For Professional Services rendered through September 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

Total Taxes

\$ 1,942.50

233.11

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 2,175.61

Fasken Wartineau DuMoulin LLP

Per: K.M. Jackson

E.&O!E.

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2
Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP
CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002
SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

2900 – 550 Burrard Street

Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



October 13, 2015 Invoice #: 951899 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

\$ 105.00

FEE MEMORANDUM

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

09/01/2015 Telephone conversation with Huey Lee and Paul Chambers regarding discussions

with counsel for Kleaman and strategy for dealing with same; review emails from Michael Parrish to counsel requesting lifting stay to persue insurance policy.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs. 525.00/hr

09/03/2015 Emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman, counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel

and with client regarding re-opening settlement discussions and terms relating to

same.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs. 525.00/hr \$ 105.00

09/14/2015 Email from counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel regarding settlement terms and

renegotiating same; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding same; email

to counsel for Kleaman regarding same.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs. 525.00/hr \$ 105.00

09/15/2015 Emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding settlement and negotation of

sharing with respect to same; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding

same and regarding instructions of bank.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.20 hrs. 525.00/hr \$ 105.00

09/16/2015 Telephone conversation with counsel for Bank of Montreal regarding status of

negotiations with Kleaman and Vancouver Sand & Gravel and issues with respect to claim to fee under settlement agreement by Receiver; email to Magnus

Verbrugge regarding same; emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding

amended settlement offer and terms.

K.M. Jackson Partner 0.50 hrs. 525.00/hr \$ 262.50



Page 3 Invoice #: 951899

09/17/2015	Emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding settlement proposal, including split of settlement proceeds; emails exchanged with Magus Verbrugge regarding same; emails exchanged with Paul Chambers regarding same; voicemail for counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50		
09/21/2015	Emails exchanged with Receiver regarding consent of bank to settlement proposal; voicemail and email to counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel regarding discussion with respect to settlement.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00		
09/22/2015	Emails exchanged with counsel for Vancouver Sand & Gravel, counsel for Kleaman and counsel for Bank of Montreal regarding settlement; emails exchanged with client regarding same; draft amendments to settlement agreement and circulate to foregoing persons for review and comment.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.80 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 420.00		
09/23/2015	Email from Paul Chambers with comments on draft settlement agreement and GST issue; emails exchanged with counsel for Kleaman regarding same; draft amendments to settlement agreement and circulate to counsel for parties and Receiver for comments.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.40 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 210.00		
09/24/2015	f settlement bers regarding sam	e.					
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00		
09/28/2015	ed with counsel for nent.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.20 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 105.00		
09/29/2015	Telephone conversation with Gord Plottel to explain basis for settlement with Vancouver Sand & Gravel and Kleaman; emails exchanged with Huey Lee, Paul Chambers and counsel for BMO regarding same.						
	K.M. Jackson	Partner	0.30 hrs.	525.00/hr	\$ 157.50		



Page 4 Invoice #: 951899

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
K.M. Jackson	Partner	525.00	3.70	1,942.50
		Total	3.70	CAD \$ 1,942.50



233.11

Page 5 Invoice #: 951899

Matter Number: 242587.00098 Matter: Katzie Group of Companies Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

Our Fees GST BCPST	\$ 1,942.50 97.13 135.98		
Total Fees Including Taxes	\$ 2,175.61		
Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes	CAD \$ 2,175.61		
Tax Summary			
GST	97.13		
BCPST	135.98		

Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP Barristers and Solicitors

Patent and Trade-mark Agents

2900 - 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, British Columbia, Canada V6C 0A3

604 631 3131 Telephone 604 631 3232 Facsimile

Deloitte & Touche LLP 2800 - 1055 Dunsmiur Street PO Box 49279 Vancouver, BC V7X 1P4

Attention: Huey Lee



October 13, 2015 Invoice #: 951899 GST #: 87937 6127 RT0003

REMITTANCE COPY Please return with your payment

Matter Number: 242587.00098 **Matter: Katzie Group of Companies** Responsible Professional: K.M. Jackson

For Professional Services rendered through September 30, 2015 as described in the attached memorandum

Total Fees

\$ 1,942.50

Total Taxes

233.11

Total Amount Owing This Bill

CAD \$ 2,175.61

Tax Summary

GST

97.13

BCPST

135.98

Total Taxes Included in This Bill

233.11

Accounts are due when rendered.

VANCOUVER OFFICE BANKING DETAILS

SCOTIABANK, 7th Floor, 409 Granville Street, Vancouver, BC V6C 1T2 Account Name: Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP CAD Account No: 0142011265-12, Transit No.: 03020, Bank Code: 002 SWIFT Code: NOSCCATT, ABA No.: 026002532

Ottawa Montréal Québec City London Paris Johannesburg Toronto Calgary Vancouver

No.S144832 Vancouver Registry

IN THE SUPREME COURT OF BRITISH COLUMBIA

BETWEEN:

BANK OF MONTREAL

T.

PETITIONER

AND:

KATZIE COAST MARINE SERVICES INC. et.al

RESPONDENTS

AFFIDAVIT #1 OF KIBBEN JACKSON

FASKEN MARTINEAU DUMOULIN LLP

Barristers and Solicitors 2900 - 550 Burrard Street Vancouver, BC, V6C 0A3 +1 604 631 3131

Counsel: Danielle Toigo Matter No: 242587.00098

242587.00098/90329398.2