Court File No. 16-CV-11472-00CL

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P.

Plaintiff

- and -

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ARC HOLDINGS INC., ARC INVESTMENTS LTD., ARC/DARK CRYSTAL PRODUCTIONS INC., KICK PRODUCTIONS LTD., IN THE JUNGLE PRODUCTIONS INC., TF I PRODUCTIONS INC., BL II PRODUCTIONS INC., ARCADIA PRODUCTIONS LTD., EGGS LTD., PRINCESS PRODUCTIONS INC., UNDERZOO PRODUCTIONS INC., HOLE IN THE BELLY PRODUCTIONS LTD., SIR SIMON PRODUCTION LTD., SAMURAI PRODUCTIONS LTD., THOMAS MURRAY, KALLAN KAGAN and PETER KOZIK

Defendants

THIRD REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., RECEIVER OF ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ET AL. (September 2, 2016)

- This report is filed by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (the "Receiver") in its capacity as receiver of the assets, properties and undertakings of Arc Productions Ltd. and the other corporate Defendants (collectively, "Arc" or the "Company") and the other Property as defined in the Receivership Order granted by the Honourable Mr. Justice Penny on Wednesday, August 10, 2016 (the "Receivership Order").
- 2. The Receiver has provided the Court with the following reports:

- (a) a first report of the Receiver (in its former capacity as Interim Receiver)
 dated August 8, 2016 in connection with the receiver's recommendation
 that a full receivership order be granted;
- (b) a second report of the Receiver dated August 16, 2016 in connection with the Receiver's recommendation for the approval of the sale of substantially all of the assets and undertaking of Arc to Jam Filled Entertainment (Toronto) Inc. ("Jam Filled").

Copies of these reports and other materials relevant to the Receivership can be accessed from the Receiver's website at <u>www.insolvencies.deloitte.ca</u>.

- 3. In preparing this Third Report, the Receiver has been provided with, and has relied upon unaudited, draft and/or internal financial information, the Company's books and records, discussions with former management of the Company, and information from third-party sources (collectively, the "**Information**"). Except as described in this Third Report:
 - (a) the Receiver has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal consistency and use in the context in which it was provided. However, the Receiver has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially comply with Canadian Auditing Standards ("CAS") pursuant to the Chartered Professional Accountants Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver expresses no opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under CAS in respect of the Information; and
 - (b) the Receiver has prepared this Third Report in its capacity as a Court-appointed officer to support the Court's approval of the relief being sought. Parties using

the Third Report, other than for the purposes outlined herein, are cautioned that it may not be appropriate for their purposes.

A. Purpose of the Report

- 4. The Receiver files this Third Report to report on the following issues and support the Receiver's recommendation that the Court provide the relief sought:
 - (a) the activities of the Receiver since August 16, 2016 in respect of administering these receivership proceedings;
 - (b) the Receiver's future activities required in respect of administering these receivership proceedings;
 - (c) the assignment of the Peter Street lease to the landlord;
 - (d) the statement of receipts and disbursements to August 26, 2016;
 - (e) the fees of the Receiver and its legal counsel for the period from August6 to 26, 2016; and,
 - (f) the Receiver's recommendations to the Court.

B. Background

5. Arc is a corporation incorporated under the laws of Ontario. Arc has its head office in Toronto, Ontario. Arc is in the business of providing animation and computer graphic services to the film and television industry. Prior to the Interim Receivership, Arc had approximately 550 full time and contract employees.

- Each of the other corporate defendants (the "Corporate Guarantors") has its head office in Toronto, Ontario, and each is a subsidiary and/or affiliate of Arc.
- 7. Thomas Murray, Kallan Kagan and Peter Kozik, are the only shareholders of Arc Investments Ltd., the ultimate indirect parent of Arc. The Receiver understands that Murray, Kagan and Kozik have resigned as Directors of Arc.
- 8. On Friday, July 29, 2016, the Plaintiff, Grosvenor Park Media Fund L.P. (the "Lender"), brought a motion seeking the appointment of an Interim Receiver over Arc and certain other property. That motion was granted by the Honourable Mr. Justice Wilton-Siegel and the Interim Receiver was appointed pursuant the Interim Receivership Order dated July 29, 2016 (the "Original Interim Receivership Order"). Pursuant to the endorsement accompanying the Original Interim Receivership Order, the fact of the receivership order was to remain confidential and the Interim Receiver was not to implement the powers provided to it pending a return conference on August 2, 2016.
- 9. On Tuesday, August 2, 2016, the Lender sought and obtained the (fresh) Interim Receivership Order.
- Pursuant to paragraph 14 of the Interim Receivership Order, the employment of all of the employees of Arc and the Corporate Guarantors (as defined therein) was terminated. The operations of Arc in the ordinary course ceased as of the opening of business on August 2, 2016.

 On Wednesday, August 10, 2016, the Receivership Order was granted by the Honourable Mr. Justice Penny.

C. Activities of the Receiver since August 16, 2016

- 12. Prior to the closing of the Jam Filled sale transaction, the Receiver and Jam Filled negotiated an Amended and Restated Asset Purchase Agreement ("Amended and Restated APA").
- 13. The Receiver proceeded to close the sales transaction with Jam Filled on August 22, 2016. A copy of the Receiver's Certificate evidencing the closing of the Amended and Restated APA on August 22, 2016 is attached to this Third Report as Appendix "A".
- 14. Following the closing, the Receiver facilitated the transfer of purchased assets to Jam Filled and subsequently exited the remainder of the Premises not being assumed under the Amended and Restated APA (being the three floors on 134 Peter Street, Toronto). Identified lease agreements not assigned to Jam Filled were terminated and arrangements were made with the lessors to return their respective assets. The Receiver has also negotiated transfer agreements with owners of digital property where such customers have not entered into other arrangements with Jam Filled.
- 15. The Receiver has continued to administer employees' Wage Earner Protection Program Act ("WEPP") applications and responded to employee inquiries as received. The Receiver has provided to Koskie Minsky, Court-appointed representative counsel to former employees of Arc, with the information it has requested to date.

- 16. As reported in the Second Report, the largest asset of the Arc estate is film tax credit recoveries from Ontario Computer Animation and Special Effects ("OCASE"), Ontario Production Services Tax Credit ("OPSTC") and Production Services Tax Credit ("PSTC") filings. The Receiver has engaged specialist consultants to compile production and financial information, and to prepare and file 2015 and 2016 OCASE, OPSTC and PSTC tax returns and credit applications. Specific activities in this regard included:
 - (a) Preparation and filing of Canadian Audio-Visual Certification Office
 ("CAVCO") applications relating to the PSTC tax credits, including remittance of filing fees;
 - (b) Obtained and filed 2012 and 2014 missing production certificates with CRA to permit their review and audit of these outstanding credits;
 - (c) Compiled information to permit the preparation and filing of 2015 tax returns for TF I Productions Inc. and BL II Productions Inc., both of which are wholly-owned subsidiaries of Arc, in order to claim credits for certificates we received; and
 - (d) Responded to outstanding information requests from CAVCO and provided further documentation for past submissions as required.
- 17. The Receiver has contacted CRA to arrange for a trust examination with regards to the employee income tax deduction arrears and GST/HST arrears. On or about August 17,

2016, the CRA asserted that the Company is liable for unpaid GST/HST in the amount of approximately \$582,999.

D. Assignment of Lease of Peter Street Premises

18. The landlord of the Peter Street premises formerly occupied by Arc has requested that the Receiver assign to it the Receiver's right, title and interest in the Peter street premises lease on an 'as is' basis. The Receiver ceased to occupy the Peter street premises on August 25, 2016, and accordingly has had no further need of the premises since that date. As the landlord has agreed to reimburse the Receiver for its reasonable fees, costs, and expenses of effecting the assignment, including preparation and attendance in court, and as the Receiver has determined that there is otherwise no prejudice to the interests of stakeholders, the Receiver has agreed to accommodate the landlord's request to assign the lease to the landlord.

E. Future Receivership Activities Required

19. Pursuant to the Amended and Restated APA, the Receiver is holding rights under certain contracts identified by Jam Filled in trust for a specified period following August 22, 2016 (the "Hold Period") in order for the counterparties to these contracts to provide consent to the transfer or assignment or otherwise. The Amended and Restated APA requires Jam Filled to pay all counterparty costs, expenses and other liabilities incurred or accruing after August 22, 2016 and until the expiration of the Hold Period or the termination of the contracts. At this time, negotiations are continuing with two counterparties.

- 20. The Receiver will continue to facilitate the return of digital property where applicable.
- 21. The Receiver will take such steps as are required to compile documentation, prepare filings and administer the collection of OCASE, OPSTC and PSTC credits recoverable for all periods up to August 2, 2016.
- 22. The Receiver will complete the filing of corporate and HST tax returns, and other statutory reporting requirements pursuant to the *Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act*.

F. Statement of Receipts and Disbursements

- 23. The actual receipts and disbursements of the Receiver up to and including August 26, 2016 are summarized in the Receiver's Statement of Receipts and Disbursements attached to this Third Report as Appendix "B". As at August 26, 2016, there is a surplus of receipts over disbursements, before accrued receivership liabilities, of \$1,889,888. Total actual receipts is \$2,148,666 which is comprised of the following major receipts:
 - (a) Canadian dollar cash on hand of \$1,838,764; and
 - (b) U.S. dollar cash on hand of \$278,902.

Total actual disbursements is \$258,779 which is comprised of the following major disbursements:

- (a) Receiver's first interim billing of \$92,986 (excluding HST);
- (b) Receiver's legal counsel's first interim billing of \$28,182 (excluding HST); and

(c) Payment to contract employees of \$80,105.

G. Fees of the Receiver and its Legal Counsel

- 24. Professional fees and disbursements charged by the Receiver in relation to the administration of the receivership for the period from August 6 to August 26, 2016 were \$303,146 (excluding HST). A copy of the Receiver's account for this period is included in the affidavit of Paul Casey sworn September 1, 2016 and is attached here as Appendix "C".
- 25. Professional fees and disbursements charged by the Goldman Sloan Nash & Haber LLP, independent legal counsel to the Receiver, for the period from August 6 to August 26, 2016 were \$86,199 (excluding HST). A copy of the GSNH's account for this period is included in the affidavit of Mario Forte sworn September 2, 2016 and is attached here as Appendix "D".

H. Recommendation

- 26. The Receiver recommends that the Court make an order:
 - (a) Approving the assignment of the Peter Street lease;
 - (b) Approving the reported actions of the Receiver since August 16, 2016 to date in administering these receivership proceedings;
 - (c) Approving of the fees of the Receiver and its legal counsel for the period from August 6 to August 26, 2016; and

All of which is respectfully submitted at Toronto, Ontario this 2nd day of September, 2016.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.,

solely in its capacity as the Court-appointed receiver of Arc Productions Ltd.

Per:

asey ``

Paul M. Casey, CPA, CA, FCIRP Senior Vice-President

GROSVENOR	PARK MED	IA FUND L P
OKOS V LIVOK	I AKK MLD	TATUND L.I.

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., et al. Court File No. 16-CV-11472-00CL

and **Plaintiff**

Defendants

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

Proceeding commenced at Toronto

THIRD REPORT OF THE RECEIVER (September 2, 2016)

6597892

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

THIRD REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., RECEIVER OF ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ET AL. (September 1, 2016)

APPENDIX "A"



Court File No. 16-CV-11472-00CL

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

B E T W E E N:

GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P.

Plaintiff

-and-

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ARC HOLDINGS INC., ARC INVESTMENTS LTD., ARC/DARK CRYSTAL PRODUCTIONS INC., KICK PRODUCTIONS LTD., IN THE JUNGLE PRODUCTIONS INC., TF I PRODUCTIONS INC., BL II PRODUCTIONS INC., ARCADIA PRODUCTIONS LTD., EGGS LTD., PRINCESS PRODUCTIONS INC., UNDERZOO PRODUCTIONS INC., HOLE IN THE BELLY PRODUCTIONS LTD., SIR SIMON PRODUCTION LTD., SAMURAI PRODUCTIONS LTD., THOMAS MURRAY, KALLAN KAGAN and PETER KOZIK

Defendants

RECEIVER'S CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice Penny of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (the "Court") dated August 10, 2016, Deloitte Restructuring Inc. was appointed as the receiver (the "Receiver") of the undertaking, property and assets of Arc Productions Ltd. and the other corporate defendants (the "Debtor").

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated August 19, 2016, the Court approved the agreement of purchase and sale made as of August 16, 2016, as amended and restated (the "Sale Agreement") between the Receiver and Jam Filled Entertainment (Toronto) Inc. (the "Purchaser") and provided for the vesting in the Purchaser of the Debtor's right, title and interest in and to the Purchased Assets, which vesting is to be effective

with respect to the Purchased Assets upon the delivery by the Receiver to the Purchaser of a certificate confirming (i) the payment by the Purchaser of the Purchase Price for the Purchased Assets; (ii) that the conditions to Closing as set out in sections 7.1, 7.2 and 7.3 (collectively, "Section 7") of the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and (iii) the Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver.

C. Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial capitals have the meanings set out in the Sale Agreement.

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

1. The Purchaser has paid and the Receiver has received the Purchase Price for the Purchased Assets payable on the Closing Date pursuant to the Sale Agreement;

2. The conditions to Closing as set out in Section 7 of the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and

3. The Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver.

4. This Certificate was delivered by the Receiver at Toronto on August 22, 2016.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC. in its capacity as Receiver of the undertaking, property and assets of ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD. ET AL, and not in its personal capacity

Per:

Name: Paul M. Casey Title: Senior Vice-President

TD. ET AL Court File No: 16-CV-11472-00CL Defendants	ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE Proceeding commenced TORONTO	RECEIVER'S CERTIFICATE	 GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP 480 University Avenue, Suite 1600 Toronto ON M5G 1V2 Fax: 416-597-3370 Mario Forte (LSUC #: 27293F) Tel: 416-597-6477 Email: forte@gsnh.com Sanja Sopic (LSUC #: 66487P) Tel: 416-597-7876 Email: sopic@gsnh.com Sanja Sopic (LSUC #: 66487P) Tel: 416-597-7876 Email: sopic@gsnh.com Lawyers for Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court appointed Receiver of Arc Productions Ltd. et al.
ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD. ET AL Defendants			
GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P. and Plaintiff			

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

THIRD REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., RECEIVER OF ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ET AL. (September 1, 2016)

APPENDIX "B"

In the Matter of the Receivership of Arc Productions Ltd. ("Arc") Statement of Receipts and Disbursements For the period from August 2 to 26, 2016

Description	 Amount	Notes	
Receipts			
Cash on hand and other receipts - CAD\$	\$ 1,838,764		
Cash on hand - USD\$	278,902	1	
Administration of asset transfers and occupancy cost recoveries	31,000	2	
Total actual receipts	 2,148,666		
Disbursements			
Receiver's fees	92,986	4	
Receiver's legal counsel fees	28,182	4	
Contract employees	80,105	3	
Tax credits administration fees	30,000		
HST paid post-receivership	18,936		
Utilities	7,220		
Miscellaneous disbursements	1,280		
Official receiver filing fee	70		
Total actual disbursements	 258,779		
Excess of Receipts over Disbursements	\$ 1,889,888		

Notes:

- 1 This amount is translated at an exchange rate of 1.3.
- 2 Reimbursement of costs by Arc customers.
- **3** The Receiver contracted certain of the Arc employees to assist with records of employment, Wage Earner Protection Program, T4s, tax credit administration, computer systems backup.
- 4 Includes first interim billing of the Receiver and its legal counsel.

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

THIRD REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., RECEIVER OF ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ET AL. (September 1, 2016)

APPENDIX "C"

Court File No. 16-CV-11472-00CL

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P.

Plaintiff

- and -

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ARC HOLDINGS INC., ARC INVESTMENTS LTD., ARC/DARK CRYSTAL PRODUCTIONS INC., KICK PRODUCTIONS LTD., IN THE JUNGLE PRODUCTIONS INC., TF I PRODUCTIONS INC., BL II PRODUCTIONS INC., ARCADIA PRODUCTIONS LTD., EGGS LTD., PRINCESS PRODUCTIONS INC., UNDERZOO PRODUCTIONS INC., HOLE IN THE BELLY PRODUCTIONS LTD., SIR SIMON PRODUCTION LTD., SAMURAI PRODUCTIONS LTD., THOMAS MURRAY, KALLAN KAGAN and PETER KOZIK

Defendants

AFFIDAVIT OF PAUL M. CASEY (Sworn September 1, 2016)

I, PAUL M. CASEY, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a Senior Vice-President of Deloitte Restructuring Inc. ("**Deloitte**"), the Court appointed Receiver in these proceedings (the "**Receiver**"). As such, I have knowledge of the matters hereinafter deposed to, except where stated to be on information and belief and whereso stated I verily believe it to be true.

2. Deloitte was appointed as Interim Receiver pursuant to the Fresh As Amended Interim Receivership Order granted by the Honourable Mr. Justice Penny originally dated Friday, July 29, 2016 and amended Tuesday, August 2, 2016 (the "Interim Receivership Order"). On Wednesday, August 10, 2016, Deloitte was appointed as Receiver by order of the Honourable Mr. Justice Penny.

3. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit "A" is a copy of the second, third and fourth interim invoices rendered by the Receiver in respect of the weekly periods from August 6, 2016 to August 26, 2016. The invoice contains the fees (including details of the billing rates and total hours of each of the members of Deloitte who acted on behalf of the Receiver in these proceedings), disbursements and GST/HST charged by Deloitte in these proceedings.

4. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit "B" is a schedule summarizing each invoice in Exhibit "A", the total billable hours charged per invoice, the total fees charged per invoice and the average hourly rate charged per invoice. The Receiver expended a total of 799.2 hours in connection with this matter during the period from August 6, 2016 to August 26, 2016, giving rise to fees and disbursements totalling \$342,555.18, including HST.

5. To the best of my knowledge, Deloitte's rates and disbursements are consistent with those in the market for these types of matters and the hourly billing rates charged by Deloitte are comparable to the rates charged by Deloitte for services rendered in similar proceedings.

SWORN before me in the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, on this 1st day of September, 2016. PAUL M. CASEY A Commissioner for taking affidavits Name: Anna Koronees, a Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario for Deloitte Restructuring Inc., Licensed Insolvency Trustee. Expires June 3, 2019.

This is Exhibit "A" referred to in the

affidavit of Paul M. Casey

sworn before me, this 1st

day of September, 2016.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Anna Koroneos, a Commissionel. etc. Province of Ontaric for Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Licensed Insolvency Trustee Expires June 3, 2019.

Deloitte.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide East 22 Adelaide Street West Suite 200 Toronto ON M5H 0A9 Canada

Tel: 416-601-6150 Fax: 416-601-6151 www.deloitte.ca

Privileged and Confidential

Arc Productions Ltd. c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc., Receiver Bay Adelaide Centre 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9

Date:August 16, 2016Invoice No:4151454Client/Mandate No:850135.1000009Billing Partner:Paul CaseyHST Registration122893605No:122893605

Invoice #2

For professional services rendered by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. as Court-appointed Interim Receiver and Receiver of Arc Productions Ltd. ("Arc" or the "Company") for the period from August 6 to August 12, 2016.

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-06	Casey,Paul M	Employee communications; Telephone Conversation ("TC") with John Young, Boat Rocker ("BR"); communications with prospective purchasers and respond to information requests; Confidentiality Agreement and provide info to Spin Master; NDA matters; emails with counsel; review profitability analysis; follow-up re: equipment list;	4.5
2016-08-07	Casey,Paul M	Conference call with counsel and analysis re: WEPP entitlements and impact on other creditors; conference call and follow-up with prospective purchaser, Splash Entertainment	2.5
2016-08-08	Brown,Rose M	Opening US\$ Bank Account. Set up CDN\$ & US\$ bank accounts on Ascend. Prepare deposit slip for CDN\$ & US\$ account and deposit	3.9
2016-08-08	Burcher,Julia	WEPPA administration, facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-08	Casey,Paul M	Attend onsite meeting with Spin Master to discuss completion of urgent episodes; draft and finalize Receiver's First Report to Court; correspondence with studios; receipt and analysis of offers; conference calls with secured lenders; TCs John Young BR re: clarifications and amendments; other on-site receivership administration.	13.7
2016-08-08	Chu,Jonathan	Edited and compiled list for CRA documents required for ARC tax credits.	0.5
2016-08-08	Cotton,John	VHD Conversion, tweaking, testing, and booting.	2.0
2016-08-08	Cynn,Deborah	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-08	Delgado, Magdalena	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-08	Hon,Kris	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-08	Koroneos,Anna	ROEs, WEPP listing update with numerous employees on updates.	12.5
2016-08-08	Kovacs Buttery,Yasmin Albia	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0

- 1 -

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-08	Liu,Samson	Engagement Management and onsite attendance re I.T. and data issues.	1.5
2016-08-08	Maki,Daniel Paul	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-08	Page,Graham	On-site at Arc, prepping for the phase one of the employee pick up. Security arrangements, getting Deloitte employees organized. Hosting the employee pick up and facilitating process.	9.0
2016-08-08	Quevillon,Nicole Amanda	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	4.5
2016-08-08	Tailor,Jay	Response to employee e-mails with relation to Receivership and other employment matters; communication with bank on trust accounts; assessing lease agreements to determine owned assets; assistance with sales process as needed.	8.0
2016-08-08	Leung,Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to understand position, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, assessing bids submitted from sales process, calls with counsel, secured lender re bids.	14.0
2016-08-09	Brown,Rose M	Estate Administration - Clean up excel spreadsheet of AP and Employee listing and import into Ascend. Prepare Labels and send to Print shop to Label and copy notices and stuff envelopes. Printed second set of labels for Employee and label envelopes and help with the stuffing of envelopes for the WEPP claim mailing.	5.7
2016-08-09	Burcher,Julia	WEPPA administration.	8.0
2016-08-09	Casey,Paul M	Emails TCs Grosvenor Park ("GP") and B. Sherman; draft, negotiate and finalize terms of conditional LOI with BR; communications with studios and counsel; emails to employees re: BR transaction; onsite meetings with BR; TCs counsel; emails to other prospective purchasers; Kay engagement letter; Spin Master arrangements; TC Allied other receivership admin	10.5
2016-08-09	Chu,Jonathan	Calculate payouts for contractors; delivered letters and cheques; Entered ARC employee data for WEPPA	5.5
2016-08-09	Cotton,John	Finance Server live booting and configuration.	0.5
2016-08-09	Koroneos,Anna	Update addresses; discussions with employees; prepare and send email to former employees; with Rena on ROEs and with J. Tailor; organize WEPP team and allocate; enter WEPP employee information and prep. mail merge; contact print shop and mail room for timing; book room for mailing; with R. Brown on addresses and mailing to creditors of the 245/246 BIA notice.	
2016-08-09	Liu,Samson	Engagement Management – I.T. and data	1.0
2016-08-09	Page,Graham	Inputting 240 WEPPA claim amounts into the online system. Working through preparing/organizing the WEPPA submission.	12.0
2016-08-09	Tailor,Jay	Response to employee e-mails with relation to Receivership and other employment matters; Call with Matt from the LA office and discussion on status; assistance with mailing lists; data room maintenance; determining leased vs. owned assets to purposes of deal assessment.	8.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-09	Leung,Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to understand position, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, drafting report on sales process, calls with counsel.	12.0
2016-08-10	Brown,Rose M	Estate administration - Prepare disbursement cheques. Prepare redirection letters and forms for mail. Attend at Canada Post. Scan copy of re-direction correspondence and send to WL. Help with the sorting and stuff of WEPP Claims.	4.4
2016-08-10	Burcher,Julia	WEPPA administration, facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-10	Casey,Paul M	Prepare and attend in court for receivership motion; on- site attendance at Arc; employee matters; discussion with counsel re: rep counsel proposal; communications with studios; TC with Scalar re: arrears and BR process; communications with BR re status and projects; status of employee mailings; draft and issue reporting and sale recommendation to GP; review contractor agreements; discuss tax credit documentation and CRA authorization letter; Spin Master occupancy agreement.	10.0
2016-08-10	Chu,Jonathan	Entered ARC employee data for WEPPA, Assistance with ARC employee proof of claims, WEPPA forms, and Deloitte covering letter.	6.5
2016-08-10	Cotton,John	On site transfer of specified file structures.	2.5
2016-08-10	Cynn,Deborah	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-10	Delgado,Magdalena	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-10	Hon,Kris	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	8.0
2016-08-10	Koroneos,Anna	WEPPA administration; mailing of 200 packages; with former employees on questions; update address and email listing; respond to queries from staff - with R. Brown, G. Page; J. Chu on WEPP mailing; and random testing of mail for accuracy.	8.0
2016-08-10	Liu,Samson	Engagement management, I.T. and data management matters	0.5
2016-08-10	Maki,Daniel Paul	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	7.0
2016-08-10	Page,Graham	Starting WEPPA mailing process. Processed 1-100 and 300-301; on-site at ARC, prepping for the phase two of the employee pick up. Organize security and Deloitte employee supervision and instruction. Hosting the employee pick up and facilitating process.	
2016-08-10	Tailor,Jay	Meeting with Andrew K, Lynn V, Michelle A, Joe W on tax credit filings and discussing next steps; preparing paperwork and documentation to deliver to the OMDC and CAVCO to provide access to appropriate individuals.	8.0
2016-08-10	Thorn,Alexandra	Facilitating employee repossession of belongings.	6.0
2016-08-10	Leung,Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to understand position, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, drafting report on sales process, calls with counsel, revising collateral analysis.	10.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-11	Brown,Rose M	Estate & Banking Administration - help print shop with Labeling and stuff envelopes for mailing, Confirm deposit of funds with bank, Prepare disbursement cheques for contract workers.	3.7
2016-08-11	Burcher,Julia	WEPPA administration.	8.0
2016-08-11	Casey,Paul M	On-site attendance; meetings regarding fixed assets and leases; meeting BR regarding Scalar; other projects; communications with counsel for Mass Animation, Disney; Spin Master and Disney occupancy matters; review proposal from proposed employee rep counsel; email to counsel; Discussions Young/BR re: diligence activities and Projects; APA; Discussion with Forte regarding lease negotiations; reporting to GP.	11.2
2016-08-11	Chu,Jonathan	Visit ARC storage site to review documents for Tax forms relating to tax credit; Steven Hecht pickup; Pick up of ARC mail on commissioner; Filed documents for ARC, employee proofs of claim, WEPPA, and cover letter.	4.8
2016-08-11	Cotton, John	On site preservation of specified data.	1.5
2016-08-11	Koroneos,Anna	Save documents to Q for staff retrieval; emails on o/s items including pick of mail being held and updated address and email lists; respond to former employee inquiries; respond to emails; review and amend draft invoice - corrections for formatting and detailed entries.	3.0
2016-08-11	Liu,Samson	Data Management.	1.0
2016-08-11	Page,Graham	Finishing the WEPPA mailing process, processed 101- 300 and 401-540.	8.5
2016-08-11	Tailor,Jay	Visit to the Storage facility to look for important documentation pertaining to tax filings/key communication from the CRA; data room maintenance; registration with Service Canada as authorized user for ROEs filings.	7.0
2016-08-11	Leung,Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to understand position, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, calls with counsel, revising collateral analysis, communications with legal counsel of Disney.	10.0
2016-08-12	Brown,Rose M	Estate Administration - Prepare mailing voucher and check on mailing and give to mailing room to post. Prepare Affidavit of mailing. Confirm transfer of funds of 1m in CDN\$ account. Input disbursement cheque. Prepare draft R&D and GL's and send to PC & WL. Forward telephone calls from creditors to WL. Pick up cheque at reception copy and scan and send to WL. Prepare deposit slip and bank. Update Website with Texts and documents relating to employees.	4.8
2016-08-12	Casey,Paul M	Finalize and issue comments on rep counsel proposal to Goodmans and GSNH; Website administration with Rose Brown; draft outline for Court Report; TCs Leung re various; TCs Young/BR; TC Mattel/HIT re Thomas; Emails to counsel etc; TC Leung re BR status; reporting email to GP.	5.0
2016-08-12	Cotton,John	On site. Status reporting on data preservation.	0.5

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-12	Koroneos,Anna	Call with P. Casey; various employee issues;	2.5
2016-08-12	Liu,Samson	Data Management	1.0
2016-08-12	Page,Graham	Phone conversation re WEPPA with S. Bayoumi	0.4
2016-08-12	Tailor,Jay	Response to employee e-mails with relation to Receivership and other employment matters; contacting key vendors on matters for providing ongoing service.	7.0
2016-08-12	Venugopal,Naveen Kumar	Data Imaging.	0.5
2016-08-12	Leung,Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, drafting Second Report of receiver, calls with counsel, communications with Disney.	8.0
Total Hours	- I		392.1

Summary of Fees

Professionals	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
Paul Casey	Partner	585	57.4	\$ 33,579.00
Warren Leung	Manager	375	54.0	20,250.00
Anna Koroneos	Manager	375	37.0	13,875.00
Graham Page	Manager	375	39.9	14,962.50
Jay Tailor	Senior	290	38.0	11,020.00
Jonathan Chu	Analyst	225	17.3	3,892.50
Rose Brown	Administrator	105	22.5	2,362.50
Samson Liu	Manager, IT	375	5.0	1,875.00
John Cotton	Senior, IT	290	7.0	2,030.00
Naveen Kumar Venugopal	Analyst, IT	225	0.5	112.50
Magdalena Delgado	Analyst, IT	225	16.0	3,600.00
Deborah Cynn	Senior	290	16.0	4,640.00
Julia Burcher	Analyst	225	32.0	7,200.00
Kris Hon	Analyst	225	16.0	3,600.00
Yasmin Albia Kovacs Buttery	Analyst	225	8.0	1,800.00
Daniel Paul Maki	Analyst	225	15.0	3,375.00
Nicole Amanda Quevillon	Analyst	225	4.5	1,012.50
Alexandra Thorn	Analyst	225	6.0	1,350.00
			392.1	\$ 130,536.50
Add: Administration Fee				9,137.56
Total Fees				\$ 139,674.06
HST on fees and disbursements @ 13%				18,157.63
Total Payable				\$ 157,831.69

.

Deloitte

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide East 22 Adelaide Street West Suite 200 Toronto ON M5H 0A9 Canada

Tel: 416-601-6150 Fax: 416-601-6151 www.deloitte.ca

Privileged and Confidential

Arc Productions Ltd.

c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc., Receiver **Bay Adelaide Centre** 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9

Date: August 23, 2016 4155514 Invoice No: Client/Mandate No: 850135.1000009 Billing Partner:

Paul Casey

HST Registration No:

122893605

Invoice #3

For professional services rendered by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. as Court-appointed Receiver of Arc Productions Ltd. ("Arc" or the "Company") for the period from August 13 to August 19, 2016

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-14	Casey, Paul M	Review Asset Purchase Agreement ("APA") and Draft Receiver's Second Report to Court; email to counsel re APA issues; email to staff and counsel re open points on Report; other emails.	3.5
2016-08-14	Leung, Warren	Facilitating sales process due diligence, correspondences with counsel, drafting of second report of receiver, review of asset purchase agreement.	4.0
2016-08-15	Bryk, Adam A	QA review of Second Report of Receiver, second review of updated draft.	1.7
2016-08-15	Casey, Paul M	Telephone Conversations ("TC") with Sherman, Forte, John Young re closing date negotiations; update group; TC with Leung re status.	2.0
2016-08-15	Casey, Paul M	On site admin and instructions staff; update website and instructions Brown; finalize Receiver's Second Report and comments from various parties; detailed reviews and negotiations with Stikemans on APA; attend at GSNH to swear affidavit.	10.1
2016-08-15	Koroneos, Anna	Several emails with employees looking for answers on maternity leave, freelancers and mailing of WEPP package; respond to all.	1.0
2016-08-15	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to facilitate asset transfer, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, calls with counsel, review of asset purchase agreement, facilitating return of company assets, drafting second report of receiver.	12.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-15	Liu, Samson	I.T. management re data backup.	0.5
2016-08-15	Page, Graham	WEPPA processing and discussions with employees via email and phone conversations.	6.5
2016-08-15	Tailor, Jay	Response to employee queries regarding ROEs and other employment related matters; communication with employees who are in possession of loaned assets; communication with LA office employee; Arranging for pickup of personal belongings for employees.	8.3
2016-08-15	Brown, Rose M	General Administration and scanning of return mail.	0.8
2016-08-16	Casey, Paul M	Negotiation of APA; TCs Young; discussions Sherman amend and issue Statutory Notice of Receiver; Finalize and issue Receiver's Second Report; Court motion material including form of approval and vesting order; set up tax meeting with team; estate disbursements; other receivership admin.	12.8
2016-08-16	Koroneos, Anna	TC with Sean McNamara of Service Canada; email correspondence with OSB; subsequent email correspondence with S. McNamara on estate number; with team on emails re; new 245/6 notice; forward to OSB; respond to employees; respond to staff questions.	2.0
2016-08-16	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with production studios to facilitate asset transfer, calls with vendors re stay of proceedings, calls with counsel, review of asset purchase agreement, facilitating return of company assets.	10.5
2016-08-16	Liu, Samson	I.T. management re data backup.	0.5
2016-08-16	Page, Graham	WEPPA processing, conversations with employees via email and phone conversation.	7.5
2016-08-16	Tailor, Jay	Response to employee queries regarding ROEs and other employment related matters; follow up communication with employees who are in possession of loaned assets; return mail correspondence; contract employee's payroll; discussions with Paul C. and Warren on various receivership matters.	8.7
2016-08-16	Brown, Rose M	Estate Administration - Scanning of employee return letters, Make up new folders on Q Drive, and Update Website with various documents. Various email from AK and send document to her has requested. Banking Administration - Deposit and cheques.	2.3
2016-08-17	Casey, Paul M	TC with landlord counsel and discussions re assignment of Peter Street lease and interim rent; communications with BR; review transaction closing documents; Mtg. Andrew Kay and team re tax recoveries; discuss form of Order re employee rep counsel; other employee communication matters; Blazing Occupancy Agreement; other receivership admin.	12.0
2016-08-17	Chu, Jonathan	Received employee proof of claims forms for ARC Productions; Scanned redirected mail; Investigated discrepancy between bounced mail and employee list.	6.8
2016-08-17	Koroneos, Anna	Respond to questions re: WEPP and POC form; respond to W. Leung on Corp search and directors for CRA audits; respond to W. Leung on CRA contacts for audit; respond to emails from former employees including employee waiting for SIN from HR; review of emails from P. Casey on employee representation.	1.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
2016-08-17	Koroneos, Anna	With G. Page and reenter TIF on Service Canada site; reissue link to forms to G. Page with email instruction.	0.5
2016-08-17	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, preparing recovery analysis, call with CRA re tax audits, facilitating asset extraction, call with insurance broker, review of insurance policies.	9.5
2016-08-17	Liu, Samson	I.T. management re data backup.	0.5
2016-08-17	Page, Graham	WEPPA processing and discussions with employees via email and phone conversations. Discussions with J. Chu regarding WEPPA.	4.5
2016-08-17	Tailor, Jay	Responding to queries Service Canada; Meeting with KWCA, Joe W, Lynn V, Michelle A and Deloitte Team on status of tax credits, determining next steps for applications and appropriate time line; inspection of documents for filings.	8.0
2016-08-17	Brown, Rose M	Website updates and preparing of disbursement cheques.	1.5
2016-08-18	Chu, Jonathan	Continued to confirm WEPPA forms for employees.	4.8
2016-08-18	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with secured creditor, calls with counsel re closing, review of closing documents, facilitating asset extraction, call with insurance broker.	11.5
2016-08-18	Liu, Samson	I.T. management re data backup.	0.5
2016-08-18	Page, Graham	WEPPA questions, emails and phone calls.	3.5
2016-08-18	Tailor, Jay	Supervision and queries from BoatRocker, Data room maintenance and uploading documents per BR's request; e-mail to report status update on tax credits to Brad.	7.5
2016-08-18	Brown, Rose M	General Administration, Several calls to BOM regarding wire, Website updates and WEPP.	2.0
2016-08-19	Casey, Paul M	Emails and TCs with counsel, JFET, regarding amendments to APA; review orders and closing documents and instructions; TCs Leung re status.	2.0
2016-08-19	Chu, Jonathan	WEPPA Form confirmation.	8.5
2016-08-19	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process due diligence, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with creditors re proceedings, calls with counsel, review of closing documents, review of amended APA.	8.5
2016-08-19	Liu, Samson	I.T. management; Logistics of Backup data.	1.0
2016-08-19	Page, Graham	WEPPA claims, questions emails and phone calls.	1.5
2016-08-19	Tailor, Jay	Meeting at KWCA with Brad Sherman, Andrew Kay, Joe Woodward to discuss next steps and applications process; Coordination with One Team on storage of information and files from Arc; Call with Samson on how to restore and access certain files.	8.0
2016-08-19	Brown, Rose M	Estate & Banking Administration - Updating documents and text on Website, Prepare disbursement cheques.	1.7
Total Hours			200.0

Summary of Fees

Professionals	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
Casey, Paul M	Partner	585	42.4	\$ 24,804.00
Bryk, Adam A	Partner	585	1.7	994.50
Leung, Warren	Senior Manager	455	56.0	25,480.00
Koroneos, Anna	Senior Manager	455	4.5	2,047.50
Page, Graham	Manager	375	23.5	8,812.50
Liu, Samson	Manager, IT	375	3.0	1,125.00
Tailor, Jay	Senior	290	40.5	11,745.00
Chu, Jonathan	Analyst	225	20.1	4,522.50
Brown, Rose M	Administrator	105	8.3	871.50
			200.0	\$ 80,402.50
Add: Administration Fee				5,628.18
Total Fees				\$ 86,030.68
HST on fees and disburseme	nts @ 13%			11,183.99
Total Payable	<u> </u>			\$ 97,214.67

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.

Deloitte.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide East 22 Adelaide Street West Suite 200 Toronto ON M5H 0A9 Canada

Tel: 416-601-6150 Fax: 416-601-6151 www.deloitte.ca

Privileged and Confidential

Arc Productions Ltd. c/o Deloitte Restructuring Inc., Receiver Bay Adelaide Centre 22 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9

Date:	August 30, 2016
Invoice No: Client/Mandate No: Billing Partner:	4158784 850135.1000009 Paul Casey
HST Registration	122893605

Invoice #4

For professional services rendered by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. as Court-appointed Receiver of Arc Productions Ltd. ("Arc" or the "Company") for the period from August 20 to August 26, 2016

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
8/16/2016	Cotton, John	On site data collection and preservation.	3.5
8/17/2016	Cotton, John	Virtual machine setup and configuration.	0.5
8/18/2016	Cotton, John	On site data preservation, Virtual machine configuration.	1.5
8/19/2016	Cotton, John	On site data preservation.	1.0
8/20/2016	Casey, Paul M	Update meeting with Leung and Page; review emails; email to Grosvenor Park ("GP") re Orders and status.	1.0
8/20/2016	Casey, Paul M	Telephone conversation ("TC") with Brad Sherman re status.	0.5
8/21/2016	Casey, Paul M	Emails with purchaser and counsel re closing.	0.2
8/22/2016	Tailor, Jay	Employee scheduled picks and supervision; Loaned equipment contacting employees; Employee queries on ROE; account correspondence.	
8/22/2016	Page, Graham	Responding to various WEPP emails and claims including phone calls.	2.5
8/22/2016	Ngai, Bosco Jun	Data Collection.	3.0
8/22/2016	Liu, Samson	I.T. Management/Backup Data.	1.5
8/22/2016	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: facilitating sales process close, supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with creditors re proceedings, calls with counsel, planning and implementing vacating premise, communication to lessors re termination.	14.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
8/22/2016	Koroneos, Anna	TC with G. Page on maternity leave employees and respond.	0.3
8/22/2016	Delgado, Magdalena	On-Site/Data Preservation.	5.0
8/22/2016	Chu, Jonathan	Entered WEPPA claims onto Service Canada website; on ARC location to file employee records.	
8/22/2016	Casey, Paul M	On site attendance and meetings with Boat Rocker/Jam Filled re closing matters; emails GP; discuss assigned contracts; meeting Woodward and team re books and records and status of work; planning re Peter street move; communication with Studios; account correspondence; administrative meetings with team; execute CAVCO application and cheque requisition; Closing documentation and emails etc.	6.5
8/23/2016	Tailor, Jay	Requesting Service Canada inquiries regarding employee ROEs; Communication with Vendors; Tax Credits management with Joe, Lynn, and Michelle.	9.0
8/23/2016	Page, Graham	Responding to various WEPP emails and claims including phone calls. Increase in calls due to rejection letters sent by Service Canada.	3.0
8/23/2016	Liu, Samson	I.T. Management/Backup Data.	1.5
8/23/2016	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with creditors re proceedings, calls with counsel, planning and implementing vacating premise, communication to lessors re termination and arranging-possession, update call with secured creditor, arrangements with customers re asset transfer.	11.5
8/23/2016	Koroneos, Anna	TC with Former employee on WEPP; with G. Page on same; respond to questions; review and respond to emails.	0.5
8/23/2016	Delgado, Magdalena	Onsite/Data preservation.	4.0
8/23/2016	Chu, Jonathan	Entered WEPPA forms; on location; double checked applications.	8.0
8/23/2016	Casey, Paul M	Call with Team on Exit arrangements and planning; Holdover admin with JFET; Property transfer agreements with Studios; communications with landlord; HST liability and email to lender; update estimated realization calculation and discuss with Leung; prep and attend call with GP; rejected projects and data room info for GP; email from Woodward re CAVCO.	5.5
8/23/2016	Brown, Rose M	Review and file of return mail, Open and give WEPP POC to G Page.	0.6
8/24/2016	Tailor, Jay	Requesting Service Canada inquiries regarding employee ROEs; Communication with Rogers and discussion with Naman on cancelling accounts; Data backup communication with Samson & Team.	8.7
8/24/2016	Page, Graham	Responding to various WEPP emails and claims including phone calls. Increase in calls due to rejection letters sent by CRA.	3.0
8/24/2016	Ngai, Bosco Jun	Data Collection.	3.5
8/24/2016	Liu, Samson	I.T. Management/Laptop Setup.	1.0
8/24/2016	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with creditors re proceedings, calls with counsel, planning and implementing vacating premise, communication to	10.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
		lessors re termination and arranging re-possession, calls with CRA and insurance broker, arrangements with customers re asset transfer.	
8/24/2016	Koroneos, Anna	TC with Jasmine re: SIN requirements; review and respond; with G. Page on questions.	0.4
8/24/2016	Cotton, John	On site data preservation.	2.5
8/24/2016	Chu, Jonathan	Entered WEPPA claims for employees; Onsite organization of files.	9.3
8/24/2016	Casey, Paul M	Update website; edit agreement with Disney; emails Leung re status of transition arrangements; other receivership admin.	2.0
8/24/2016	Brown, Rose M	Website updates - Text and documents. Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques.	1.1
8/25/2016	Tailor, Jay	Requesting Service Canada inquiries regarding employee ROEs; Loaner Laptop setup communication, server communication, moving/inspecting office files for safe disposal.	8.0
8/25/2016	Page, Graham	Dealing with WEPPA phone calls, communicating with employee legal counsel, and dealing with WEPPA emails.	2.5
8/25/2016	Ngai, Bosco Jun	Collections, evidence management, laptop preparation.	5.0
8/25/2016	Liu, Samson	I.T. Management/Laptop Setup/VM Setup.	1.5
8/25/2016	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with creditors re proceedings, calls with counsel, planning and implementing vacating premise, communication to lessors re termination and arranging re-possession, calls with CRA and insurance broker, arrangements with customers re asset transfer.	8.0
8/25/2016	Koroneos, Anna	Review and respond to Jasmine re: SIN coming and process following receipt; review of email from P. Casey on employee list and protocol re: poc; review response from G. Page.	0.5
8/25/2016	Delgado, Magdalena	Onsite/Data preservation.	0.5
8/25/2016	Chu, Jonathan	Pickup of IM boxes and labels; Organized for the pickup of Iron Mountain boxes; Onsite organization of files; Entered WEPPA claims for employees.	9.5
8/25/2016	Casey, Paul M	Scalar and Allied interim costs; TCs Tailor; review and execute certificate for CAVCO for 5 productions; Mtgs Page; respond to Koskie Minsky and confirm info share; GP communications; other lessors; Beanfield disclaimer; Conf. Call with team and counsel re transition matters and future Court attendance; lease assignment.	3.5
8/25/2016	Brown, Rose M	Trust Banking Administration - Contract and Disbursement cheques. Mail out Contract worker cheques. Prepare wire instruction sheet for Lego receivables. Pick up Courier package from Allied and scan invoice and send to PC & WL.	2.0
8/26/2016	Tailor, Jay	Using Citrix to wireless access into server for Sage/Timberline access; Service Canada queries.	1.0
8/26/2016	Page, Graham	Investigating mat. leave WEPPA members. Responding to Employee phone calls and emails.	3.1
8/26/2016	Liu, Samson	I.T. Management/Laptop Setup/VM Setup.	2.0
8/26/2016	Leung, Warren	Attendance Onsite: supervising team, meeting with team re status update, calls with counsel, planning and implementing vacating premise, communication to	7.0

Date	Professional	Description	Hours
		lessors re termination and arranging re-possession, calls with insurance broker, arrangements with customers re asset transfer, updates to secured creditor.	
8/26/2016	Delgado, Magdalena	Onsite data preservation.	1.0
8/26/2016	Cotton, John	Set up and configuration of Virtual Machine; On site data preservation.	2.0
8/26/2016	Chu, Jonathan	Onsite organization of file delivery; Delivery of laptops from BAE to ARC; Entered WEPPA Claims; Documented Iron Mountain forms onto Deloitte template.	7.0
8/26/2016	Casey, Paul M	Emails Leung.	0.1
Total Hours			207.1

Summary of Fees

Professionals Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
Casey, Paul M Partner	585	19.3	\$ 11,290.50
Leung, Warren Senior Manager	455	50.5	22,977.50
Koroneos, Anna Senior Manager	455	1.7	773.50
Liu, Samson Manager, I.T.	375	7.5	2,812.50
Page, Graham Manager	375	14.1	5,287.50
Tailor, Jay Senior	290	34.5	10,005.00
Cotton, John Senior, I.T.	290	11.0	3,190.00
Ngai, Bosco Jun Senior, I.T.	290	11.5	3,335.00
Chu, Jonathan Analyst	225	42.8	9,630.00
Delgado, Magdalena Analyst, I.T.	225	10.5	2,362.50
Brown, Rose M Administrator	105	3.7	388.50
		207.1	\$ 72,052.50
Add: Administration Fee			5,043.68
Add: Disbursements			345.25
Total Fees			\$ 77,441.43
HST on fees and disbursements @ 13%			10,067.39
Total Payable			\$ 87,508.82

Remittance information on last page

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty (30) days after the invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.

This is Exhibit "B" referred to in the

affidavit of Paul M. Casey

sworn before me, this 1st

day of September, 2016.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Anna Koroneos, a Commissionen, blo. Province of Onterio for Delotte Restructuring to ... Licensed Insolvency Truste Expires June 3, 2011

EXHIBIT "B"

Calculation of Average Hourly Billing Rates of Deloitte Restructuring Inc. for the period August 6, 2016 to August 26, 2016

Invoice No.	Fees	HST	Hours	Average	Total
				Rate	
4151454	\$139,674.06	\$18,157.63	392.1	\$356.22	\$157,831.69
(August 6 to August 12,					
2016)(2nd Invoice)					
4155514	\$86,030.68	\$11,183.99	200.0	\$430.15	\$97,214.67
(August 13 to August 19,					
2016)(3rd Invoice)				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
4158784	\$77,441.43	\$10,067.39	207.1	\$373.93	\$87,508.82
(August 20 to August 26,					
2016)(4th Invoice)					
TOTALS	\$303,146.17	\$39,409.01	799.2	\$379.31	\$342,555.18

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

THIRD REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., RECEIVER OF ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ET AL. (September 1, 2016)

APPENDIX "D"

Commercial List File No. CV-16-11472-00CL

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P.

Plaintiff

- and –

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ARC HOLDINGS INC., ARC INVESTMENTS LTD., ARC/DARK CRYSTAL PRODUCTIONS INC., KICK PRODUCTIONS LTD., IN THE JUNGLE PRODUCTIONS INC., TF I PRODUCTIONS INC., BL II PRODUCTIONS INC., ARCADIA PRODUCTIONS LTD., EGGS LTD., PRINCESS PRODUCTIONS INC., UNDERZOO PRODUCTIONS INC., HOLE IN THE BELLY PRODUCTIONS LTD., SIR SIMON PRODUCTION LTD., SAMURAI PRODUCTIONS LTD., THOMAS MURRAY, KALLAN KAGAN and PETER KOZIK

Defendants

AFFIDAVIT OF MARIO FORTE

(Sworn September 2, 2016)

I, Mario Forte, of the City of Toronto, hereby MAKE OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a barrister and solicitor qualified to practice in the Province of Ontario and am counsel with the law firm of Goldman Sloan Nash & Haber LLP ("GSNH") and therefore have knowledge of the matters in this affidavit. Where this affidavit is based on information and belief, I have stated the source of that information and believe it to be true.

2. GSNH are lawyers of record for Deloitte Restructuring Inc. ("**Deloitte**") in its capacity as the Court appointed Receiver (the "**Receiver**") of Arc Productions Ltd. and the other corporate defendants ("**Arc**"). Prior to its appointment as Receiver on August 10, 2016, Deloitte was appointed Interim Receiver of Arc on July 29, 2016 (the "Interim Receiver").

3. Attached as **Exhibit "A"** to this affidavit is a copy of invoices rendered by GSNH to Deloitte in its capacity as Receiver for fees and disbursements incurred by GSNH in the course of this proceeding.

With the exception of one time entry dated August 2, 2016 which was not picked up in a previous invoice, the invoices attached as Exhibit "A" cover the period from August 6, 2016 to August 26, 2016 with detailed descriptions of each docketed entry and the total billable hours by lawyer with their respective hourly rate.

4. Attached as **Exhibit "B"** is a schedule summarizing the total billable hours charged and the total fees charged.

5. The average hourly rate charged for the invoice set out in Exhibit "A" is approximately \$434.07 That is comprised of hours docketed by the following timekeepers at GSNH with the corresponding hourly rates:

Mario J. Forte	\$550.00
John McKeown	\$500.00
Sanja Sopic	\$290.00
Jordan C. Barris	\$200.00
Ernesto Aleman	\$150.00

6. To the best of my knowledge the rates charged by GSNH throughout the course of this proceeding are comparable to the rates charged by other law firms in the Toronto market for the provision of similar services.

7. The hourly billing rates outlined above are comparable to the hourly rates charged by GSNH for services rendered in relation to similar proceedings.

8. I make this affidavit in support of a motion by the Receiver for, among other things, approval of the fees and disbursements of GSNH as its counsel for the period from August 2, 2016 to August 26, 2016.

)

)

SWORN before me at the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario this 2nd day of September, 2016

MARIO FORTE

A Commissioner for taking oaths, etc. Sanja Sopic

This is Exhibit "A" to the Affidavit of Mario J. Forte sworn before me this 2nd day of September, 2016. here A Commissioner for taking oaths, etc.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide Centre 22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 Canada

DATE: FILE NO:

161502

August 16, 2016

~

Suite 1600 480 University Avenue Toronto, Ontario M5G 1V2 Telephone: (416) 597-9922 Facsimile: (416) 597-3370

Attention: Paul Casey

12233 6290 RT0001 H.S.T. NO: INVOICE NO: 145587

. •

· .

IN ACCOUNT WITH

GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS

Arc Productions Ltd. et al. RE:

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above noted matter from August 6th, 2016 to and including August 16th, 2016.

DATE	LAWYER		TIME
Aug/06/16	MJF	engaging with Splash to settle NDA; discussions with various potential bidders who wish to negate NDA; discussion with counterparty counsel on transition	2.40
Aug/07/16	SFS	issues and related matters Participating in conference call regarding employee unpaid wages and priority of funds assigned to Grosvenor Park.	1.10
	MJF	conference call and follow up on discussions and advice concerning Wednesday hearing for permanent receiver and dealing with WEPPA memo and presentation issues	1.50
Aug/08/16	SFS	for report; reviewing 'true sale" position Discussing priorities dispute and next steps in file with M. Forte. Reviewing motion record of Grosvenor Park seeking full receivership order. Email correspondence with client. Reviewing Receiver's first report. Serving	2.10
	MJF	same. fully engaged in dealing with counterparty issues, creditor communication and negotiations, advice and guidance on numerous issues in respect of the sale process and related documentation, court reporting, strategic advice on process, document review etc.	8.40
	JCB	Reviewed PPSA searches in Schedule C of draft letter to Deloitte and amended for accuracy.	1.00
Aug/09/16	SFS	Discussing agreement to be drafted to permit Disney to access its products. Forwarding service list and PPSA summaries to K. Esaw. Drafting access agreement and reviewing client's revisions to same. Email	4.20

ACCOUNTS ARE DUE WHEN RENDERED

*)			•			
Deloitte Restru	icturing In	С.	August		145587	
			1110100	140.	140007	
	MJF	correspondence re same. engaged in numerous discussions to advise and d with various aspects of the sale process and counterparty property transfers including documer preparation and review; discussions with prospect employee representative counsel on retainer matt dealing with counsel to counterparties on return of property; negotiations with purchaser counsel to fi the LOI; discussions with purchaser counsel on de structure and managing the timeline and work allo to complete transaction.	nt ive ers; f nalize eal			7.60
	MJF	engaged in numerous matters concerning the deliv an LOI with Jam Filled; engaging with counsel to v producer counterparties concerning the assertion or rights against Arc; advising on the characterization numerous lease arrangements with Arc and advisi possible treatment in APS and vesting issues	arious of their ∩of			7.10
Aug/10/16	SFS	Attending before Justice Penny for full receivership order. Revising transition and occupation services agreement. Pulling construction liens on property.	o			3.10
	MJF	engaged in negotiations of APS issues and advisin numerous matters in connection with the Jam Fille deal: advising on and engaging with various produ in connection with proprietary matters including re of contractual rights and receiver's legal analysis position in respect thereof	ed Icers			6.10
Aug/11/16	SFS	Discussing registrations against Arc Productions v Forte. Reviewing master lease agreement and schedules to determine when certain equipment delivered. Making list of equipment for which there confirmation of delivery. Email correspondence wi client.	e is no			3.60
	MJF	advising on and engaging with various producers connection with proprietary matters including revie contractual rights and receiver's legal position in r thereof	ew of			8.10
	MBR	Reviewing with M. Forte manner of dealing with				0.30
	JCB	assignment of leases on sale transaction. Updated Service List to include all secured credite	ors			0.65
	SFC	meeting M. Forte, request urgent PPSA uncertifie search re ARC Productions Ltd. through ESC wel can't obtain password for PPSA from office, meet Forte	osite as			0.30
Aug/12/16	SFS	Discussing APA with M. Forte. Reviewing same. Participating in conference call re APA. Drafting n of motion. Reviewing delivery receipts to confirm delivery of NFS equipment. Reviewing PPSA sea to determine timing and PMSI status. Email correspondence re same.				5.90
	MJF	engaged in negotiations of APS issues and advis numerous matters in connection with the Jam Fill deal: advising on and engaging with various prod	ed			6.80

, n

-

	ructuring I	nc.			August 16, Invoice No	
			vith proprietary mights and receive			
Aug/13/16	SFS	Reviewing lette	e list and reviewi from Blazing Sa	amurai's cou	nsel and	1.8
	MJF		ndence with M. F 'S changes and a			1.4
Aug/14/16	SFS	Email to couns agreement. Re revising. Email	sions to APA and el for Mass Anima viewing Receiver correspondence	ation re acce 's second Re	ess eport and	3.
	MJF	conditional per recovery matte	PA. S issues for contr iod: advising on p rs; reviewing APS	production pr	operty	2.
Aug/15/16	MJF	transaction; de motion; dealing of property; rev	gotiation and adv aling with various g with production viewing and prepa itract property iss eof	s respondent counterparti aring legal ai	s to sale es on return nalysis on	8.
OUR FEE I H.S.T. on F						\$40,893. 5,316.
	-ee		HOURS	RATE	TOTAL	
H.S.T. on F	⁼ ee MMARY		ноиrs 24.90	rate 290.00	total \$7,221.00	
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F.	⁼ ee MMARY Sopic					
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F. Mario J.	⁼ ee MMARY Sopic Forte	ain	24.90	290.00	\$7,221.00	
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F. Mario J. Michael	⁼ ee MMARY Sopic Forte B. Rotszt	ain	24.90 60.20	290.00 550.00	\$7,221.00 \$33,110.00	
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F. Mario J. Michael Jordan C	⁼ ee MMARY Sopic Forte B. Rotszt		24.90 60.20 0.30	290.00 550.00 575.00	\$7,221.00 \$33,110.00 \$172.50	
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F. Mario J. Michael Jordan C Sandra I DISBURSI Photocopie Faxes Laser Cop	Fee MMARY Sopic Forte B. Rotszt C. Barris F. Camero EMENTS es ies Search Di	on-Milks	24.90 60.20 0.30 1.65	290.00 550.00 575.00 200.00	\$7,221.00 \$33,110.00 \$172.50 \$330.00	
H.S.T. on F FEE SUI Sanja F. Mario J. Michael Jordan C Sandra R DISBURSI Photocopie Faxes Laser Cop Teraview S	Fee MMARY Sopic Forte B. Rotszt C. Barris F. Camero EMENTS: es ies Search Din Record	on-Milks : sbursement	24.90 60.20 0.30 1.65	290.00 550.00 575.00 200.00	\$7,221.00 \$33,110.00 \$172.50 \$330.00 \$60.00 166.25 0.75 110.25 206.55	

•

.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Ş.

August 16, 2016 Invoice No: 145587

• ·

TOTAL LEGAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS (includes\$5,393.66H.S.T.)	\$46,883.35
PREVIOUS BALANCE	\$31,845.10
BALANCE DUE	\$78,728.45

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

BOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP

Per: Mario J. Forte

E. & O. E.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide Centre 22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 Canada

DATE: August 24, 2016 FILE NO: 161502 Suite 1600 480 University Avenue Toronto, Ontario M5G 1V2 Telephone: (416) 597-9922 (416) 597-3370 Facsimile:

H.S.T. NO: INVOICE NO: 12233 6290 RT0001 145683

IN ACCOUNT WITH

Attention: Paul Casey

GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS

Arc Productions Ltd. et al. RE:

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above noted matter from August 16, 2016 to and including August 22, 2016.

DATE	LAWYER		TIME
Aug/16/16	SFS	Email correspondence with client and purchaser's counsel. Reviewing revisions to APA and Receiver's Second Report. Drafting fee affidavit. Participating in conference call. (incurred August 15, 2016)	5.90
	SFS	Discussing revisions to Agreement of Purchase and Sale with M. Forte. Reviewing and revising Agreement of Purchase and Sale based on client's and purchaser's comments. Conference calls with M. Forte and client/opposing counsel. Conference calls with counsel for Mass and revising access and transition agreement. Reviewing and revising form of approval and vesting order. Finalizing Second Report of the Receiver. Updating service list and serving approval and vesting order and second report of the Receiver.	11.10
	MJF	intensively engaged in the negotiation of APA issues and related matters flowing form asset sale; engaged with third party producers in connection with negotiating the return of property and compensation arrangements for the estate; engaged in numerous discussions with suppliers' counsel and related matters with respect to treatment of supply arrangements and property disputes; reviewing various production contracts and supply arrangements in order to advise on entitles and rights in specified property and providing oral opinions thereon.	11.30
Aug/17/16	SFS	Arranging for Receiver's motion record to be finalized and filed. Email correspondence with client re various matters. Reviewing and revising closing agenda.	6.10

ACCOUNTS ARE DUE WHEN RENDERED

Pursuant to the Solicitors' Act interest at a rate of 3.00% per annum will be charged on amounts due, calculated commencing one month after the date of delivery of this account. Any disbursements recorded after preparation of this account will be billed at a later date.

Deloitte Restri	ucturing Ind	с.	August 24, 20 ⁻ Învoice No: 1	
		Reviewing progress draw documents regarding co with Vestacon and formulating response to request Engie's counsel. Drafting equipment accommodati agreement. Reviewing approval and vesting order Email correspondence with counsel for purchaser, and contract counter parties re various matters. Arranging for closing documents to be signed	t from on	
	MJF	intensively engaged in dealing with numerous matt affecting the completion of the APA including revie deal documentation; engaged in dealing with cou to producers on various aspects of proposed deal return of property; advising on contractual obligation and various rights affecting Arc's rights in property; dealing with Landlord on lease issues;	w of nsel and ons	5.10
	JSM	Inter-office conference concerning covenant not to	use	0.10
	EIA	TO email exchange with Mr. Forte, to providing corporate precedents for Articles of Amendment, to conference with M. Forte, to printing and providing same, to file;	o the	0.27
Aug/18/16	SFS	Call with counsel for Scalar re redaction of APA. Reviewing redacted APA and serving. Email correspondence with purchaser's counsel re closin agenda and various matters. Conference calls with and purchaser's counsel re amendments to APA.	n client	10.50
	MJF	Reviewing and revising Approval and Vesting Orde intensively engaged in negotiating all matters conr with the completion of the APA; responding to num counter parties claiming interests in assets and dis vesting matters; dealing with requests for changes vesting language, scope etc.;	nected nerous sputed	10.60
Aug/19/16	SFS	Conference call re revisions to APA. Attending in c and making submissions. Reviewing closing docur provided and revisions to APA.		5.70
	MJF	negotiation of outstanding matters affecting APA a transition period; attending court to obtain approva APA: dealing with numerous follow up matters; engaging with suppliers and counterparty counsel various transition and related matters;	ll of	4.20
	JCB	Created PPSA summaries from eighty three page		1.60
Aug/21/16	SFS	document of PPSA searches Email correspondence with purchaser's counsel at client re exchange of closing documents and revis same to refer to amended and restated APA.		0.90
	MJF MJF	negotiating remaining issues on JF deal		2.40 3.10
Aug/22/16	SFS	Email correspondence with client and various stakeholders re various matters. Revising Receive certificate and instructing E. Marris re filing same.	er's	0.90
	MJF	responding to and documenting requests for asset transfers; dealing with issues arising on closing of deal: Preparation of transfer agreement template:	l JF	4.60

1

,

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.			August 24 Invoice N	4, 2016 o: 145683
negotiating terms o dealing with post-c advising on numer receivership obliga	losing matter ous issues ar	s and resp ising from	oonding and termination of	
OUR FEE HEREIN				\$35,044.50
H.S.T. on Fee				4,555.79
FEE SUMMARY	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL	
Sanja F. Sopic Mario J. Forte John S. McKeown Jordan C. Barris Ernesto I. Aleman	41.10 41.30 0.10 1.60 0.27	290.00 550.00 500.00 200.00 150.00	\$11,919.00 \$22,715.00 \$50.00 \$320.00 \$40.50	
DISBURSEMENTS: Printing/Binding (External) Photocopies Courier Laser Copies Courier* TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		-	690.58 213.50 147.76 304.00 2,071.56	\$3,427.40
H.S.T. on Disbursements				\$176.26
DISBURSEMENTS MARKED WITH * INDICATE EXEMP TOTAL LEGAL FEES AND DISBURSEN PREVIOUS BALANCE BALANCE DUE		des\$4,73	2.05H.S.T.)	\$43,203.95 \$78,728.45 \$121,932.40

.

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP

Per: Mario J. Forte

E. & O. E.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Bay Adelaide Centre 22 Adelaide St. West, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 Canada

DATE: FILE NO:

August 29, 2016 161502

Suite 1600 480 University Avenue Toronto, Ontario M5G 1V2 Telephone: (416) 597-9922 Facsimile: (416) 597-3370

Attention: Paul Casey

H.S.T. NO: INVOICE NO: 12233 6290 RT0001 145931

IN ACCOUNT WITH

.

. 10-

GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS

RE: Arc Productions Ltd. et al.

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above noted matter to and including August 26, 2016.

DATE	LAWYER		TIME
Aug/02/16	SFS	Discussing receivership appointment with M. Forte. Conducting PPSA summaries.	1.20
Aug/22/16	MJF	dealing with Kapow counsel and Landlord issues concerning assignment	0.40
Aug/23/16	SFS	Email correspondence with client and counsel for lien claimant re acceptance of Statement of Claim. Reviewing and responding to emails from various stakeholders re restructuring proceedings.	0.70
	MJF	advising on various residual contract matters and lease opinion issues; advising on equipment returns and lease amendments	1.40
Aug/24/16	SFS	Email correspondence with secured creditor in Macedonia. Revising form of termination of property agreement pertaining to Disney. Email correspondence with client re disconnection of One Connect services. Email correspondence with counsel for LEGO.	3.40
	MJF	advising on process for lease assignments and related property return issues; considering HST related matters and priority issues; reviewing production/IP issues for Kapow.	1.10
Aug/25/16	SFS	Email correspondence with client re Disney termination of property agreement, Beanfield invoice and various matters. Conference call re outstanding matters. Phone call to counsel for Kody Kapow. Email correspondence with counsel for lien claimant, landlord and LEGO. Revising transition services agreement for Sony Animations Star Project.	2.70
	MJF	advising on process for dealing with lease termination	0.90

ACCOUNTS ARE DUE WHEN RENDERED

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. August 29 Invoice No						
Aug/26/16	SFS	and disclaimer iss process and cost Discussing file wit statutory setoff for M. Forte and J. Ba	issues; h M. Forte. provincial a arris. Email	Discussing and federal correspond	research re film credits with ence with	1.60
	MJF	project counterpai advising on proper advising on variou	1.10			
	responding to lessors. JCB Researched issue of whether Federal government can claim set-off on claim for Provincial tax credits					
OUR FEE H H.S.T. on Fe						\$5,979.00 777.27
FEE SUM	MARY		HOURS	RATE	TOTAL	
Mario J	. Sopic . Forte C. Barris		9.60 4.90 2.50	290.00 550.00 200.00	\$2,784.00 \$2,695.00 \$500.00	
DISBURSE ESC Corp. I Laser Copie ESC Gov't I	Fee s				138.00 0.25 120.00	
TOTAL DIS	BURSEM	ENTS		=		\$258.25
H.S.T. on D						\$17.97
DISBURSEMEN	ITS MARKED	WITH * INDICATE EXEMP	T			
TOTAL LEC (includes \$		S AND DISBURSE ST)	MENTS			\$7,032.49
PREVIOUS	BALANC	E				\$90,087.30
BALANCE	DUE					\$97,119.79
THIS IS OU	IR ACCOU	JNT HEREIN				
GOLDMAN	SLOAN I	NASH & HABER LL	.Р			

Per: Mario J. Forte

E. & O. E.

л , 21

80-y

This is **Exhibit "B"** to the Affidavit of Mario J. Forte sworn before me this **2nd** day of September, 2016.

A Commissioner for taking oaths, etc.

Commercial List File No. CV-16-11472-00CL

ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST)

GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P.

Plaintiff

- and –

ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD., ARC HOLDINGS INC., ARC INVESTMENTS LTD., ARC/DARK CRYSTAL PRODUCTIONS INC., KICK PRODUCTIONS LTD., IN THE JUNGLE PRODUCTIONS INC., TF I PRODUCTIONS INC., BL II PRODUCTIONS INC., ARCADIA PRODUCTIONS LTD., EGGS LTD., PRINCESS PRODUCTIONS INC., UNDERZOO PRODUCTIONS INC., HOLE IN THE BELLY PRODUCTIONS LTD., SIR SIMON PRODUCTION LTD., SAMURAI PRODUCTIONS LTD., THOMAS MURRAY, KALLAN KAGAN and PETER KOZIK

Defendants

SUMMARY OF ACCOUNTS OF GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP

Invoice No.	Date	Period Ending	Hours	Fees	Disburse- ments	HST	Total
145587	August 6, 2016	August 16, 2016	87.35	\$40,893.50	\$596.19	\$5,316.16	\$46,805.85
145683	August 24, 2016	August 22, 2016	84.37	\$35,044.50	\$3,427.40	\$4,732.05	\$43,203.95
145931	August 29, 2016	August 26, 2016	17	\$5,979.00	\$258.25	\$795.24	\$7032.49
	1	Total	188.72	\$81,917.00	\$4,281.84	\$10,843.45	\$97,042.29

TD. ET AL Court File No: 16-CV-11472-00CL Defendants	ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE Proceeding commenced TORONTO	AFFIDAVIT OF MARIO FORTE	GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP 480 University Avenue, Suite 1600 Toronto ON M5G 1V2 Fax: 416-597-3370 Mario Forte (LSUC #: 27293F) Tel: 416-597-6477 Email: forte@gsnh.com . Sanja Sopic (LSUC #: 66487P) Tel: 416-597-7876 Email: sopic@gsnh.com . Lawyers for Deloitte Restructuring Inc. in its capacity as the Court appointed Receiver of Arc Productions Ltd. et al.
ARC PRODUCTIONS LTD. ET AL Defendants			
GROSVENOR PARK MEDIA FUND L.P. and Plaintiff			