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INTRODUCTION 

1. On July 16, 2019 (the “Date of Receivership”), Royal Bank of Canada (“RBC” or the 

“Applicant”) made an application to the Court of Queen’s Bench for Saskatchewan (the 

“Court”) seeking an order pursuant to section 243(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, 

R.S.C. 1985 c. B-3 (the “BIA”), section 65(1) of The Queen’s Bench Act, 1998, SS 1998, c 

Q-1.01, and section 64(8) of The Personal Property Security Act, 1993, SS, 1993, c P-6.2 

(the “PPSA”), to appoint Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”) as receiver (the 

“Receiver”), without security, of all the present and after acquired assets, undertakings, and 

properties (the “Property”) of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”).  The 

Honourable Justice B. J. Scherman granted an Order (the “Receivership Order”) 

appointing Deloitte as Receiver that same day.  A copy of the Receivership Order (attached 

hereto as Exhibit A) and other information regarding the receivership proceedings can be 

accessed at www.insolvencies.deloitte.ca/en-ca/7GB (the “Receiver’s Website”). 

2. The Receivership Order provides, inter alia, for the following: 

(a) No proceeding (a “Proceeding”) against or in respect of the Company or the Property 

shall be commenced or continued except with the written consent of the Receiver or 

with leave of the Court and any and all Proceedings currently underway against or in 

respect of the Company or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended pending 

further Order of the Court. 

(b) The Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be paid their reasonable fees and 

disbursements, and the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall by entitled to, and 

are hereby granted, a charge (the “Receiver’s Charge”) on the Property as security 

for such fees and disbursements, both before and after the making of the Receivership 

Order, and the Receiver’s Charge shall form a first charge on the Property in priority 

to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory or 

otherwise, in favour of any Person (as defined in the Receivership Order), but subject 

to sections 14.06(7), 81.4(4) and 81.6(2) of the BIA. 

(c) Any interested party may apply to the Court to vary or amend the Receivership Order 

on not less than seven (7) days’ notice to the Receiver and to any other party likely 

http://www.insolvencies.deloitte.ca/en-ca/7GB
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to be affected by the order sought or upon such other notice, if any, as the Court may 

order. 

3. This report constitutes the first report of the Receiver (the “First Report”), and is being 

filed to inform the Court as to the following: 

(a) The activities of the Receiver since the Date of Receivership; 

(b) Details of the Company’s assets and liabilities including charges, security interests, 

and encumbrances registered against the Property; and 

(c) The results of the Receiver’s Sales Process (as defined below). 

4. Furthermore, the First Report, along with the confidential supplement to the First Report 

dated February 24, 2020 (the “Confidential Report”), are being filed in support of the 

Receiver’s application to this Honourable Court on February 28, 2020, seeking the 

following: 

(a) Approval of the reported actions of the Receiver since the Date of Receivership in 

respect of administering these receivership proceedings; 

(b) Approval of the Final 369 Offer (as defined below) and the respective Asset Purchase 

Agreement (as defined below) for the sale of the Property; 

(c) Approval of the repayment of the Receiver’s borrowings under the Borrowing 

Facility (as defined below); 

(d) Approval of the Receiver’s Holdback (as defined below) to complete the within 

application and to finalize the receivership proceedings; 

(e) Approval of the future distribution of funds, after repayment of the Borrowing 

Facility and retention of the Receiver’s Holdback, to RBC as they relate to the RBC 

Security (as defined below) and as they become available up to the amount of the 

RBC Indebtedness (as defined below); 

(f) Approval of the payment of any amounts remaining from the Receiver’s Holdback to 
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RBC on account of the priority of the RBC Security up to the amount of the RBC 

Indebtedness; 

(g) Approval of the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal counsel; 

(h) Approval of the Receiver’s Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the period 

July 16, 2019 to February 21, 2020; 

(i) An Order sealing the Confidential Report in the Court file; and 

(j) An Order discharging the Receiver. 

TERMS OF REFERENCE 

5. In preparing this First Report, the Receiver has relied upon unaudited financial 

information, the books and records of the Company and discussions with former 

management of the Company (“Management”), interested parties, and the stakeholders of 

the Company. 

6. The financial information of the Company has not been audited, reviewed or otherwise 

verified by the Receiver as to its accuracy or completeness, nor has it necessarily been 

prepared in accordance with generally accepted accounting principles and the reader is 

cautioned that this First Report may not disclose all significant matters about the Company.  

Additionally, none of the Receiver’s procedures were intended to disclose defalcations or 

other irregularities.  If the Receiver were to perform additional procedures or to undertake 

an audit examination of the financial statements in accordance with generally accepted 

auditing standards, additional matters may have come to the Receiver’s attention.  

Accordingly, the Receiver does not express an opinion nor does it provide any other form 

of assurance on the financial or other information presented herein.  The Receiver may 

refine or alter its observations as further information is obtained or brought to its attention 

after the date of this First Report. 

7. Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts contained in this First Report are expressed 

in Canadian dollars. 

8. Capitalized terms used in this First Report but not defined herein are as defined in the 
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Receivership Order. 

BACKGROUND 

9. 7 G. B. is a private company incorporated in August 2012 under the laws of the Province of 

Saskatchewan.  The Company was incorporated as a holding company, with the sole 

purpose of developing a single residential real estate development in Weyburn, 

Saskatchewan (“Weyburn”).  As at May 7, 2019, according to the Saskatchewan Corporate 

Registry, the sole officer, director, and common shareholder was Mr. Gurmej Singh Josan 

(“Mr. Josan”). 

10. 7 G.B.’s head office is located in Surrey, British Columbia.  The Company’s only asset was 

an approximate 15.4 acre parcel of land (the “7 G.B. Land”) in Weyburn known as Douglas 

Heights (the “Douglas Heights Development”).  Based on a review of the records provided 

by Mr. Josan and discussions with consultants formerly involved in the project, the Douglas 

Heights Development was to be constructed in three (3) phases.  As at the Date of 

Receivership, the 7 G.B. Land had already been subdivided into fifty (50) residential lots, 

forty-eight (48) of which ranged in size from 0.13 acres to 0.21 acres, one (1) parcel of 0.95 

acres, and one (1) parcel of 3.64 acres (collectively the “Lots”). 

11. As at the Date of Receivership, the Receiver was advised by Clifton Associates (“Clifton”), 

7 G.B.’s former engineering consultant, that although underground services had been 

installed for all three (3) phases of the Douglas Heights Development, certain deficiencies 

required remediation.  Furthermore, Mr. Josan advised that only phase one (1) of the project 

had been actively marketed, and only two (2) Lots had been sold. 

12. RBC is the principal lender to the Company and holds various first ranking security 

positions (the “RBC Security”) as against the Company and its assets.  RBC was owed 

approximately $2.1 million (the “RBC Indebtedness”) from the Company at the Date of 

Receivership. 

Powers of the Receiver 

13. The Receiver’s powers are detailed in Paragraph 3 of the Receivership Order and include 

the power to take and maintain possession and control of the Property; the power to manage, 
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operate, and carry on the business of the Company; and the power to market and sell the 

Property (subject to Court approval if one sale exceeds $75,000 or if in the aggregate the 

sales exceed $250,000), among others. 

14. The Receivership Order also empowers the Receiver to borrow by way of a revolving credit 

or otherwise, such monies from time to time as it may consider necessary or desirable, 

provided that the outstanding principal amount does not exceed $350,000 (or such greater 

amount as the Court may by further Order authorize) (the “Borrowing Facility”). 

Possession and Control of the Property 

15. On the Date of Receivership, Mr. Josan advised that all development activities at the 

Douglas Heights Development had previously ceased in October 2018.  Accordingly, as at 

the Date of Receivership, there were no active operations and no employees to terminate (as 

Mr. Josan advised that the Company never had any employees).  The Receiver attended at 

the Douglas Heights Development on the Date of Receivership and confirmed that all 

operations had ceased.  

16. Given the current economic environment in the Weyburn area, in consultation with RBC, 

the Receiver made the determination that it would not incur any costs to continue with the 

Douglas Heights Development, and that it would attempt to sell the Property in its current 

state. 

ACTIVITIES OF THE RECEIVER 

17. Since the Date of Receivership, the Receiver has undertaken the following activities with 

respect to the Property: 

(a) Attended at the Douglas Heights Development to take possession and control of the 

Property, and to inventory and photograph same; 

(b) Arranged for insurance coverage for the Property effective August 16, 2019, as the 

Company’s prior policy had lapsed on April 17, 2019; 

(c) Arranged for mail redirection to the Receiver’s office; 
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(d) Contacted various consultants and stakeholders to ascertain the status of the Douglas 

Heights Development (i.e. City of Weyburn, Clifton, KMP Law, Home Life 

Crawford Realty, etc.); 

(e) Contacted Mr. Josan on several occasions with respect to the books and records of 

the Company, and to confirm that the Company had no active employees as at the 

Date of Receivership; 

(f) Arranged for weed control for the Property so as to comply with a maintenance and 

nuisance abatement notice issued by the City of Weyburn; 

(g) Arranged for the remediation of a soil washout which resulted in the exposure of 

underground services on the Property; 

(h) Prepared a detailed sales and information package (the “SIP”), attached hereto as 

Exhibit B, and conducted a robust sales process (the “Sales Process”)  for the 

Property; 

(i) Negotiated an asset purchase agreement (the “Asset Purchase Agreement”) with 

0756369 B.C. Ltd. (“369 B.C.”); and 

(j) Prepared, reviewed, and finalized this First Report and the Confidential Report. 

ASSETS 

7 G.B. Land 

18. At the Date of Receivership, Management advised that the only asset of the Company was 

the 7 G.B. Land, and that the Company had no inventory, equipment, or other assets.  The 

net book value of the 7 G.B. Land was reported by Management to be approximately $6.1 

million as at September 30, 2018. 

19. Prior to the Date of Receivership, RBC engaged B.R. Gaffney & Associates Real Estate 

Appraisers and Consultants (“B.R. Gaffney”) to conduct an independent appraisal (the 

“Appraisal”) of the Douglas Heights Development.  The Appraisal was finalized on 

October 31, 2018 (with an effective appraisal date of September 19, 2018).  The Receiver 



7 
 

has not released the Appraisal to any other party due to the risk of impeding or limiting the 

potential realization of the 7 G.B. Land.  A copy of the Appraisal is attached as Exhibit A 

to the Confidential Report. 

20. The Receiver is not aware of any other assets of the Company as at the date of this First 

Report. 

SALES PROCESS 

21. The Receiver engaged in discussions with several parties, including Management and RBC, 

with respect to a process to sell the 7 G.B. Land and to ascertain who may be an interested 

party. 

22. In consultation with RBC, the Receiver concluded that a formal Sales Process was necessary 

to gauge the interest in the market for the 7 G.B. Land.  As part of the Sales Process, the 

Receiver prepared the SIP which included a detailed listing of the Lots being offered for 

sale, along with the related terms and conditions of the Sales Process.  The SIP was 

distributed to auctioneers and various other interested parties commencing on August 23, 

2019. 

23. Certain of the terms and conditions of sale (the “Terms and Conditions”) detailed in the 

SIP included, but were not limited to, the following: 

(a) The Receiver was seeking offers and/or proposals from auction companies, realtors, 

developers, and other parties for the realization of the 7 G.B. Land; 

(b) The 7 G.B. Land was being offered for sale on an “as is, where is” basis; 

(c) The Receiver would not be obligated to accept the highest offer, or any proposal;  

(d) Viewings were to be coordinated with the Receiver; 

(e) Proposals and offers were to be submitted by September 27, 2019 (the “Submission 

Deadline”); and 

(f) Parties seeking to purchase some or all of the 7 G.B. Land would be required to 
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submit a standard form of offer prepared by the Receiver, a 20% deposit, and would 

have to be prepared to close the sale on or before fifteen (15) days after the date of 

acceptance or within five (5) business days following the granting of a sale approval 

and vesting order (the “Sale Approval and Vesting Order”) by the Court, whichever 

is later (or such other date as may be agreed to by the purchaser and the Receiver). 

24. Interested parties were identified through discussions with Management, industry contacts, 

and industry contact lists.  The Receiver also advertised the acquisition opportunity in the 

Regina Leader-Post (August 24, 2019), the Saskatoon Star Phoenix (August 24, 2019), and 

the Weyburn Review (August 21, 2019), copies of which are attached hereto as Exhibit C.  

Approximately 160 potential interested parties were contacted directly by the Receiver.  The 

SIP was distributed to 61 interested parties which included 38 developers, 10 auctioneers, 

11 realtors, and 2 individuals who were previously involved with the Douglas Heights 

Development (collectively the “Interested Parties”). 

25. Based on the Sales Process and the results therefrom, discussions with Interested Parties 

subsequent to the Submission Deadline, and the current state of the economy in southeastern 

Saskatchewan, the Receiver is of the view that proceeding with the offer from 369 B.C. (the 

“Final 369 Offer”) will result in the highest return to the creditors.  

26. The Receiver is recommending that the Court approve the Final 369 Offer and the respective 

Asset Purchase Agreement for the reasons outlined in the Confidential Report.  The Final 

369 Offer, the other offers and auction proposals received, and the Sales Process are more 

fully described in the Confidential Report. 

27. The Receiver has discussed and shared all the offers and proposals received during the Sales 

Process, and subsequent thereto, with RBC, and RBC is in support of accepting the Final 

369 Offer for the 7 G.B. Land. 

 CREDITOR CLAIMS AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTIONS 

28. The Receiver and the Receiver’s independent legal counsel, McDougall Gauley LLP 

(“McDougall Gauley”), have reviewed the validity and priority of the secured and priority 

claims that have been identified, and the Receiver advises as follows: 
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(a) McDougall Gauley has conducted an independent review of the validity and 

enforceability of the RBC Security (the “Security Opinion”) and has opined that the 

RBC Security: 

(i) is valid and enforceable; 

(ii) ranks in priority to the other secured creditors of 7 G. B.; and 

(iii) ranks in priority to the unsecured creditors of 7 G.B. and any subsequently 

appointed trustee in bankruptcy. 

(b) The Company’s records indicate that there are no debts owing to Canada Revenue 

Agency (“CRA”) on account of unremitted payroll source deductions (as the 

Company had no employees), or any goods and services tax (“GST”).  As at the date 

of this First Report, the Receiver has collected a GST refund in the amount of $19,154 

owing to the Company. 

29. Subject to the repayment of the Receiver’s Court authorized borrowing facility (the 

“Borrowing Facility”) (further discussed below), and any other necessary reserves from 

the sale proceeds (the “Proceeds”) the Receiver determines may be necessary to account 

for the Unpaid Legal Fees, the Estimated Receiver Fees, and the Estimated Legal Fees (all 

terms as defined below) (collectively the “Receiver’s Holdback”), the Receiver is 

proposing to distribute the balance of the Proceeds (the “Residual Proceeds”) to RBC on 

account of the priority of the RBC Security, up to the value of the RBC Indebtedness (the 

“Proposed Distributions”). 

30. Other unsecured creditors include third party service providers who are not claiming any 

security interest in the 7 G.B. Land.  As at the Date of Receivership, 7 G. B. listed unsecured 

creditors with claims of approximately $20,000. 

31. At the Date of Receivership, as the Company did not have any employees, the Receiver 

determined that there was no need for any filing under the Wage Earner Protection Program 

(“WEPP”). 
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FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS OF THE RECEIVER AND ITS LEGAL COUNSEL 

32. Pursuant to paragraph 18 of the Receivership Order, the Receiver and its legal counsel shall 

pass their accounts from time to time.  The Receiver is of the view that the primary party of 

interest is RBC given that they hold a priority interest over all of the Property of the 

Company.  RBC has been served with this First Report, has reviewed the contents of the 

Confidential Report, and has been provided with all invoices of the Receiver within these 

proceedings. 

33. Attached as Exhibit D is a summary of the invoices of the Receiver for fees and 

disbursements incurred during the course of the proceedings for the period July 15, 2019 to 

January 21, 2020.  The Receiver’s accounts total $57,288 in fees and disbursements, 

excluding GST.  The Receiver estimates that its fees and disbursements to finalize this First 

Report and the Confidential Report, prepare for and attend the February 28, 2020 hearing, 

and to finalize the Receiver’s discharge will approximate $15,000 (plus GST) (the 

“Estimated Receiver Fees”). 

34. The fees charged by the Receiver are based on the amount of professional time required at 

hourly billing rates, which vary depending upon the experience level and location of 

professionals involved.  The average blended hourly rate charged by the Receiver in these 

proceedings for invoices issued to date is $380 per hour.  The rates charged by the Receiver 

are the normal rates and charges for engagements of this nature, and are comparable to the 

rates charged for the provision of services by other professional firms providing specialized 

financial advisory services. 

35. The Receiver is of the view that its fees and disbursements are fair and reasonable in the 

circumstances and have been duly rendered in response to the required and necessary duties 

of the Receiver in accordance with the provisions of the Receivership Order. 

36. Attached as Exhibit E is a summary of the invoice of the Receiver’s legal counsel for fees 

and disbursements incurred during the course of the proceedings for the period August 15, 

2019 to February 18, 2020.  The accounts total $34,100 in fees and disbursements excluding 

Provincial Sales Tax and GST, and remain unpaid as at the date of this First Report (the 

“Unpaid Legal Fees”).  The Receiver’s legal counsel estimates that its fees and 
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disbursements to prepare for and attend the February 28, 2020 hearing and to assist with 

finalizing the Receiver’s discharge will approximate $12,500 (plus taxes) (the “Estimated 

Legal Fees”). 

37. The Receiver has reviewed the invoice rendered by its legal counsel and finds it reasonable 

and validly incurred in accordance with the provisions of the Receivership Order. 

STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

38. The Receiver has prepared a Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the period of July 

16, 2019 to February 21, 2020 for 7 G.B., a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit F. 

39. As at the date of this First Report, in accordance with paragraph 20 of the Receivership 

Order, the Receiver has borrowed $100,000 from the Court authorized Borrowing Facility 

to fund the receivership proceedings.  It is the Receiver’s intention to repay the Borrowing 

Facility prior to distributing the Residual Proceeds to RBC. 

40. In accordance with the Asset Purchase Agreement, the Receiver was responsible for 

payment of the 2019 municipal property taxes for the 7 G.B Land, including any arrears.  

On December 19, 2019, with the consent of RBC, the Receiver paid approximately $38,512 

to the City of Weyburn to satisfy its obligations under the Asset Purchase Agreement.  

APPROVALS SOUGHT 

41. The Receiver believes that, other than completing the Proposed Distributions and certain 

administrative matters, the Receiver’s mandate pursuant to the Receivership Order (the 

“Receiver’s Mandate”) is substantially complete. 

42. For the reasons outlined above, the Receiver respectfully requests that the Court provide an 

Order: 

(a) Approving all activities, actions, and proposed courses of action of the Receiver 

(collectively, the “Actions of the Receiver”) to date in relation to the discharge of 

its duties and the Receiver’s Mandate pursuant to the Order of this Court in these 

proceedings, as such actions of the Receiver are more particularly described in this 

First Report and the Confidential Report; 
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(b) Approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal counsel for the 

period July 15, 2019 to January 21, 2020, and August 15, 2019 to February 18, 2020, 

respectively; 

(c) Approving the Receiver’s Holdback to complete the within application and to finalize 

the receivership proceedings, without the requirement of taxation or formal passing 

of accounts; 

(d) Approving the Receiver’s Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the period 

July 16, 2019 to February 21, 2020; 

(e) Approving the Final 369 Offer and the respective Asset Purchase Agreement for the 

sale of the Property; 

(f) Approving the repayment of the Receiver’s borrowings under the Borrowing Facility; 

(g) Approving, subject to the retention of the Receiver’s Holdback, payment of the 

balance of the funds held in trust to RBC on account of the priority of the RBC 

Security up to the amount of the RBC Indebtedness; 

(h) Approving payment of any amounts remaining from the Receiver’s Holdback to RBC 

on account of the priority of the RBC Security up to the amount of the RBC 

Indebtedness; 

(i) Sealing the Confidential Report in the Court file; 

(j) That upon payment of the Proposed Distributions and any amounts remaining from 

the Receiver’s Holdback to RBC, the Receiver shall be discharged as Receiver, 

provided that notwithstanding such discharge: 

(i) The Receiver shall remain Receiver for the performance of such routine 

administrative tasks as may be required to complete the administration of these 

proceedings; and 

(ii) The Receiver shall continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders 

made in these proceedings, including all approvals, protections, and stays of 
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proceedings in favor of Deloitte in its capacity as Receiver; 

(k) That upon the Receiver filing with this Honourable Court its discharge certificate (the 

“Receiver’s Discharge Certificate”) confirming that the Receiver has completed the 

Receiver’s Mandate, that Deloitte be discharged from any and all liability, save and 

except for any liability arising out of gross negligence or willful misconduct on the 

part of the Receiver; and 

(l) Granting such further and other relief that the Court considers just and warranted in 

the circumstances. 

All of which is respectfully submitted at Saskatoon, Saskatchewan, this 24th day of February 

2020. 

 
DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC. 
In its capacity as Receiver of 
7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., 
and not in its personal capacity.  
 

 
 
Per: Brent Warga, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT 

Senior Vice-President
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Invitation for offers  

On July 16, 2019, Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”) was appointed as Receiver (the “Receiver”) of 
7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”) pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Justice 
B. J. Scherman of the Court of Queen’s Bench of Saskatchewan (the “Court”). The Receiver is offering for 
sale herein its interest, if any, in the assets of the Company. 

Sealed offers for the purchase of the Receiver's interest in the assets of the Company will be received by 
Deloitte, in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B., until 5:00 p.m. (CDT) on Friday, September 27, 2019. 
Deloitte is accepting offers on the real property of the Company. 

7 G.B. was a residential property development company incorporated to complete a 15.4 acre development 
known as Douglas Heights in Weyburn, Saskatchewan. The Company’s only asset was the 15.4 acre parcel of 
land. According to the former principal of the Company, development of the Douglas Heights project ceased 
in October 2018. 

This sales and information package (the “Sales and Information Package”) is not intended for general 
circulation or publication, nor is it to be reproduced or used for any purpose other than that outlined herein. 
The Receiver does not assume responsibility or liability for losses occasioned to any parties as a result of the 
circulation, publication, reproduction, or use of this Sales and Information Package. 

The information provided herein was obtained from the books and records of the Company and information 
compiled since Deloitte’s appointment as Receiver. The information is being provided for the sole use of 
prospective purchasers in considering their interest in acquiring any or all of the assets (sometimes also 
referred to as the “Assets”) of the Company and does not purport to contain all of the information that a 
prospective purchaser may require. Prospective purchasers should conduct their own investigations and due 
diligence on the Assets and the information contained in this Sales and Information Package. The Receiver 
specifically notes that it has not independently verified or audited any of the information contained herein. 
The Receiver provides no representation or warranty as to the accuracy or completeness of the information 
contained in this Sales and Information Package and shall have no liability for any representations expressed 
or implied herein, or for any omissions from this Sales and Information Package or for any other written or 
oral communication transmitted to prospective purchasers in the course of their evaluation of the Assets. 
Under no circumstances shall any of the Companies’ employees or former employees be contacted directly or 
indirectly by any potential bidder: (i) to answer any questions regarding the possible acquisition of all or part 
of the Assets; or (ii) to request additional information. 

The Assets are being offered for sale on an “as is, where is” basis. The Receiver makes no representations, 
expressed or implied, as to the description, condition, size, quantity, quality or value of the Assets. Any 
purchaser will be asked as a condition of sale to sign an acknowledgement that they have inspected and 
satisfied themselves as to the condition of the Assets. 

The Terms and Conditions of Sale are detailed later in this Sales and Information Package along with the 
following key dates for the process: 
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Event Timing  

Asset viewings By appointment only on the following days: 
August 26-30, September 3-6, September 9-12, September 15-20, and 
September 23-27 

Offer deadline 5:00 p.m. CDT on September 27, 2019 

Closing date On or before fifteen (15) days after the date of acceptance or within five (5) 
business days following the granting of a Sale Approval and Vesting Order by 
the Court, whichever is later, or such other date as may be agreed by the 
Purchaser and the Receiver. Any extension of the Closing Date will be at the 
sole discretion of the Receiver. 

The highest or any offer need not be accepted by the Receiver. Offers shall be subject to the Terms and 
Conditions of Sale which shall be deemed to form part of the offer. 

To make an arrangement to view the Assets, please contact John R. Fritz by phone at 204-944-3586 or by 
email at jofritz@deloitte.ca. 

mailto:jofritz@deloitte.ca
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Terms and Conditions of sale 

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”), in its capacity as Court Appointed Receiver (the “Receiver”) of 
7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”) and not in its personal capacity, is offering for sale 
herein its interest, if any, in the assets of the Company (the “Assets”) on the following terms and 
conditions: 

Offers 
1. The Assets are being offered for sale on an “as is, where is” without recourse basis and with no 

representations or warranties from the Receiver or any other party as to title, encumbrances, 
description, fitness for use, condition (environmental or otherwise), defect (patent or latent), 
collectability, merchantability, quantity, quality, value or the validity, invalidity, or enforceability of any 
patent, copyright or trademark right, or any other matter or thing whatsoever, either stated or implied. 

2. Offers made for all, or a portion of, the Assets (the “Offers”) must be submitted by completing the form 
of Offer to Purchase attached hereto as Schedule A. Sealed envelopes marked “OFFER – 7 G.B. 
Enterprises Inc.” shall be delivered or mailed, postage prepaid, to the Receiver at 360 Main Street, 
Suite 2300, Winnipeg, Manitoba R3C 3Z3 Attention John R. Fritz so as to be in its hands by 5:00 p.m. 
(CDT) on Friday September 27, 2019 (the “Offer Deadline”). Offers that do not strictly comply with 
these Terms and Conditions of Sale may, at the absolute discretion of the Receiver, be rejected for that 
reason alone. 

3. All Offers must be accompanied by a bank draft or certified cheque, in each case drawn on a Canadian 
Chartered Bank or Credit Union, payable to “Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in Trust”, in an amount equal to 
twenty percent (20%) of the purchase price for the Assets as stated in such Offer(s) (the “Deposit”). 

4. The Assets have been segregated into the following parcels (a “Parcel” or collectively the “Parcels”) and 
are more particularly described in the Asset Parcel sections of the Sales and Information Package: 
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Offers can be made en bloc or on an individual Parcel basis, but en bloc Offers must stipulate a separate 
price for each Parcel. Offers submitted for more than one Parcel will be considered as a separate Offer for 
each Parcel unless the Offer specifically states that the acceptance of one Parcel is conditional upon the 
acceptance of one or more Parcels. 

5. Each party making an offer (the “Offeror”) must rely on its own judgment, inspection, and investigation 
of the Assets. Each Offeror acknowledges and agrees that it has had a full opportunity to conduct, and 
has conducted, such tests, examinations, inspections, and investigations as it deems necessary or 
advisable to fully acquaint itself with the Assets, their title, fitness for particular purpose, location, 
existence, condition, quality, quantity, merchantability, suitability for intended purpose and with any 
other attributes that the Offeror considers relevant. 

Parcel # Title # ICS Parcel # Property Address Lot Block Plan Acres Land Titles 
Parcel Value

Tax Assessed Value

Phase I - Fully Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies)
1
2
3 145887586 203036217 609 Confederation Drive 3 3 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,800                  
4 145887799 203036385 613 Confederation Drive 4 3 102171877 0.18     140,000          124,200                  
5 145887250 203035957 617 Confederation Drive 5 3 102171877 0.18     150,000          125,500                  
6 145887441 203036116 621 Confederation Drive 6 3 102171877 0.21     150,000          130,000                  
7 145887564 203036194 9 Michel Court 9 3 102171877 0.17     205,000          123,800                  
8 145887227 203035935 5 Michel Court 8 3 102171877 0.16     137,000          120,000                  
9 145887575 203036206 1 Michel Court 7 3 102171877 0.15     150,000          119,100                  

10 145887621 203036251 21/637 Michel Court / Confederation Drive 10 4 102171877 0.16     145,000          120,500                  
11 145887632 203036262 608 Confederation Drive 21 5 102171877 0.16     120,000          121,100                  
12 145887261 203035968 612 Confederation Drive 20 5 102171877 0.15     250,000          119,400                  
13 145887340 203036026 616 Confederation Drive 19 5 102171877 0.13     175,000          114,400                  
14 145887339 203036015 620 Confederation Drive 18 5 102171877 0.14     140,000          116,700                  
15 145887238 203035946 624 Confederation Drive 17 5 102171877 0.15     140,000          117,800                  
16 145887687 203036318 628 Confederation Drive 16 5 102171877 0.15     140,000          118,400                  
17 145887429 203036105 632 Confederation Drive 15 5 102171877 0.15     138,000          118,500                  
18 145887531 203036183 636 Confederation Drive 14 5 102171877 0.15     136,000          118,600                  

Phase III - Underground Serviced Lots
19 145887496 203036150 641 Confederation Drive 11 4 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,300                  
20 145887834 203036420 645 Confederation Drive 12 4 102171877 0.18     165,000          125,100                  
21 145887395 203036071 649 Confederation Drive 13 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
22 145887777 203036374 653 Confederation Drive 14 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
23 145887755 203036363 657 Confederation Drive 15 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
24 145887676 203036307 661 Confederation Drive 16 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
25 145887744 203036352 665 Confederation Drive 17 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
26 145887610 203036240 669 Confederation Drive 18 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
27 145887159 203035878 673 Confederation Drive 19 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
28 145887283 203035980 677 Confederation Drive 20 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
29 145887643 203036273 681 Confederation Drive 21 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
30 145887463 203036127 685/629 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 22 4 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,900                  
31 145887508 203036161 640 Confederation Drive 13 5 102171877 0.16     140,000          120,600                  
32 145887182 203035890 644 Confederation Drive 12 5 102171877 0.16     175,000          120,500                  
33 145887407 203036082 648 Confederation Drive 11 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
34 145887485 203036149 652 Confederation Drive 10 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
35 145887328 203036004 656 Confederation Drive 9 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
36 145887171 203035889 660 Confederation Drive 8 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
37 145887474 203036138 664 Confederation Drive 7 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
38 145887294 203035991 668 Confederation Drive 6 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
39 145887373 203036059 672 Confederation Drive 5 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
40 145887362 203036048 676 Confederation Drive 4 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
41 145887148 203035867 680 Confederation Drive 3 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
42 145886956 203035856 684 Confederation Drive 2 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
43 145887597 203036228 690/701 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 1 5 102171877 0.17     145,000          123,600                  

Phase II - Underground Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies) 
44 145887823 203036419 26 Powell Place 7 2 102171877 0.15     175,000          119,000                  
45 145887384 203036060 22 Powell Place 6 2 102171877 0.14     175,000          115,200                  
46 145887801 203036396 18 Powell Place 5 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
47 145887665 203036295 14 Powell Place 4 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
48 145887654 203036284 10 Powell Place 3 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
49 145887609 203036239 6 Powell Place 2 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
50 145887711 203036330 2/625 Powell Place / 10th Ave 1 2 102171877 0.16     205,000          120,800                  
51 145887733 203036341 30 Powell Place 8 2 102171877 0.95     637,000          116,300                  

Condos
52 145887519 203036172 Powell Place 9 2 102171877 3.64     2,583,000       171,300                  

Total 12.49  11,146,000$ 6,128,700$           

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
DOUGLAS HEIGHTS DEVELOPMENT

Land Parcel Summary

SOLD - Not included in Sale
SOLD - Not included in Sale
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6. Proposals from auctioneers and realtors to auction and/or list for sale any of the Parcels on behalf of the 
Receiver will be considered. 

7. Viewing of the Assets will be by appointment only. Appointments can be made by contacting John R. Fritz 
by phone at 204-944-3586 or by email at jofritz@deloitte.ca at the offices of the Receiver. The following 
dates are scheduled for viewing of the Assets: 

• August 26-30; 
• September 3-6;  
• September 9-12;  
• September 15-20; and 
• September 23-27. 

8. The submission of any Offer to the Receiver shall constitute an acknowledgement and an acceptance by 
the Offeror of the terms of the Offer to Purchase, and the Terms and Conditions of Sale. 

9. Offerors will have until the expiration of the Offer Deadline to proceed with further due diligence.  

10. Each Offeror acknowledges that it has had the opportunity to consult with, and has consulted with, its 
own independent legal counsel prior to making the Offer. 

11. Any Offer accepted by the Receiver will be subject to a condition requiring approval of such Offer by the 
Court of Queen’s Bench for Saskatchewan (the “Court”). The Order respecting Court approval shall be in 
form and content acceptable to the Receiver. 

Sales process 
12. The Receiver reserves the right to amend or terminate this sales process, or to withdraw or amend its 

description of any of the Assets, at any time, at its sole discretion. With respect to any withdrawal or 
amendment, the sole obligation of the Receiver to the Offeror shall be to inform the Offeror of the 
withdrawal or amendment. With respect to the termination of the sales process, the sole obligation of 
the Receiver to the Offeror shall be to return any Deposit it has received without interest or deduction. 

Acceptance of offers  
13. The Receiver shall be entitled to accept Offers prior to the Offer Deadline.  

14. Each Offeror acknowledges that the Receiver is not obligated to accept any Offer and that the highest 
Offer shall not necessarily be accepted. The Receiver reserves the right to reject any or all Offers without 
explanation.  

15. After receipt of the Offers, the Receiver may, in its sole discretion, negotiate with any Offeror to seek 
clarification and negotiate further with any Offeror in respect of any Offer. The Receiver shall not 
be obliged to negotiate with any Offeror or give any Offeror the opportunity to resubmit an Offer, 
whether or not the Receiver negotiates with other Offeror(s). 

16. Upon submission of an Offer to the Receiver, no Offeror shall be entitled to retract, withdraw, vary or 
amend the Offer prior to acceptance or rejection thereof by the Receiver, without the prior written 
consent of the Receiver. 

17. Deposits accompanying Offers that are not accepted by the Receiver shall be returned without interest 
thereon by prepaid registered mail or courier to the unsuccessful Offeror at the address set forth in the 
Offer, with such items to be sent out by the Receiver on or before Friday, October 4, 2019. 

mailto:jofritz@deloitte.ca
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18. Upon the acceptance in writing by the Receiver of an Offer from an Offeror (the “Purchaser”): 

a. the Receiver will apply to the Court for a sale approval and vesting Order (the “Sale Approval and 
Vesting Order”), in form and content acceptable to the Receiver which will, amongst other things, 
vest title to the purchased Assets (the “Purchased Assets”) in the Purchaser free and clear of any 
and all security interests (whether contractual, statutory, or otherwise), hypothecs, caveats, 
mortgages, trusts or deemed trusts (whether contractual, statutory, or otherwise), liens, executions, 
levies, charges or other financial or monetary claims, whether or not they have attached or been 
perfected, registered or filed and whether secured, unsecured, or otherwise excepting utility caveats.  

b. the closing date shall be established as a date that is on or before fifteen (15) days after the date of 
acceptance or within five (5) business days following the granting of a Sale Approval and Vesting 
Order by the Court, whichever is later, or such other date as may be agreed by the Purchaser and the 
Receiver (the “Closing Date”); and 

c. the Deposit made by the Purchaser shall be non-refundable, except as set out herein. 

19. If the sale contemplated is completed, the Purchaser’s Deposit will be applied, without interest, against 
the purchase price.  

20. If an Offer is accepted by the Receiver, but the sale of the Purchased Assets is not completed as a result 
of any act or omission on the part of the Purchaser, the Purchaser’s Deposit shall be forfeited to the 
Receiver as a genuine pre-estimate of liquidated damages and not as a penalty. Furthermore, the 
Receiver shall be entitled to pursue all of its rights and remedies against the Purchaser. 

21. The Purchased Assets shall remain at the risk of the Receiver until the Closing Date. The Purchased 
Assets thereafter shall be at the risk of the Purchaser. Until the Closing Date, the Receiver shall hold 
all insurance policies or proceeds thereof in trust for the parties as their interests may appear and, in 
the event of substantial damage to the Purchased Assets, the Purchaser may either have the net 
proceeds of the insurance and complete the transaction or may cancel the transaction and have all 
monies theretofore paid returned without interest, cost or compensation of any kind whatsoever. 
Where any damage is not substantial, the Purchaser shall be obliged to complete the transaction and be 
entitled to the net proceeds of insurance referenced to such damage. 

22. The Offeror shall cause to be paid and delivered to the Receiver on the Closing Date the offered purchase 
price plus any applicable goods and services tax and any other applicable taxes. These amounts shall be 
paid to the Receiver on the Closing Date by certified cheque, bank draft or wire, in each case drawn on a 
Canadian Chartered Bank or Credit Union by the Purchaser. After payment the Purchaser shall take 
delivery and possession of the Purchased Assets on an "as is and where is" basis on the Closing Date, 
without recourse to the Receiver or its respective employees, servants and agents. 

23. The Purchased Assets shall be as they exist on the Closing Date with no adjustments to be allowed to the 
Purchaser for changes in condition, qualities or quantities from the date of viewing to the Closing Date. 
The Purchaser acknowledges and agrees that the Receiver shall not be required to inspect the Purchased 
Assets or any part thereof and the Purchaser shall be deemed at its own expense to have relied entirely 
on its own inspection and investigation. 

24. All Purchased Assets shall be surrendered to the Purchaser upon closing at the Douglas Heights 
development site in Weyburn, Saskatchewan. 
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25. The Purchaser acknowledges that no warranties or conditions, express or implied, pursuant to the 
Sale of Goods Act (Saskatchewan) or similar legislation in other jurisdictions apply hereto and all of the 
same are hereby waived by the Purchaser. 

26. The Purchaser agrees that all insurance maintained by the Receiver in respect of the subject 
Purchased Assets shall be cancelled on the Closing Date and that the Purchaser shall be responsible for 
placing its own insurance on the Purchased Assets thereafter. 

27. The Purchaser shall indemnify the Receiver and hold the Receiver harmless against and from all 
losses, costs, damages and expenses which the Receiver may sustain, incur or be or become liable for 
by reason of or arising from any acts or omissions of the Purchaser in relation to any of the Purchased 
Assets. 

28. At the Closing Date, the Purchaser shall be entitled to such deeds or assignments as may be 
considered necessary by the Receiver to convey the Purchased Assets to the Purchaser provided that 
the Purchaser shall remain liable notwithstanding any assignment thereof by the Purchaser. Any such 
deeds or assignments shall contain only a release of the Receiver’s interest in the Purchased Assets and 
shall not contain any covenant other than a covenant that the Receiver has not done any act to 
encumber the Purchased Assets. The Receiver shall not be required to produce any abstract of title, title 
deeds or documents thereof or any evidence as to title, other than those in its possession. 

29. If Court approval of any sale transaction in a form satisfactory to the Receiver is not obtained, neither 
the Purchaser nor the Receiver will be obligated to complete the contemplated purchase and the Deposit 
accompanying the Offer shall be returned to the Purchaser without interest as soon as reasonably 
practicable. 

30. The Offeror and the Receiver mutually agree to do all such further acts and execute all such further 
documents and instruments as may reasonably be necessary or convenient to give full effect to the sale 
transaction. 

General 
31. Deloitte is acting solely in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B., and not in its personal capacity, and 

Deloitte (and its employees, servants and agents) shall have no liability whatsoever in any way related 
to the Sales and Information Package, the Offer to Purchase, the Terms and Conditions of Sale, or in any 
way related to the Assets (as these terms are defined herein), whether in contract, in tort, under statute 
or otherwise. 

32. All stipulations as to time are strictly of the essence. 

33. The Sales and Information Package, the Offer to Purchase, and the Terms and Conditions of Sale, shall 
be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the Province of Saskatchewan and the 
Offeror irrevocably attorns to the jurisdiction of the Court of Queen’s Bench of Saskatchewan. 
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DATED at Winnipeg, Manitoba this 23rd day of August, 2019. 

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., 
In its capacity as Receiver of  
7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. 
and not in its personal capacity. 
 
360 Main Street 
Suite 2300 
Winnipeg, MB  R3C 3Z3 
 
Tel: 204-944-3586 
Fax: 204-947-2689 
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Schedule A – Offer to purchase 

OFFER TO PURCHASE 

TO: DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., 
RECEIVER OF 7 G.B. ENTERPRICES INC. 

 360 Main Street 
Suite 2300 

 Winnipeg, MB  R3C 3Z3 
 
 Attention: John R. Fritz 
 
1. Name of Offeror: _________________________________________________________________  

2. Address of Offeror: _______________________________________________________________  

3. Telephone and fax: _______________________________________________________________  

4. E-mail address: __________________________________________________________________  

The undersigned acknowledges having received and reviewed the Terms and Conditions of Sale 
(“Terms and Conditions”) pertaining to the sale of the Assets of 7 G. B. Enterprises Inc., that the Offeror 
has inspected and satisfied itself as to the condition of the Assets, and that this Offer is submitted pursuant 
to the said Terms and Conditions and the undersigned agrees to be bound thereby as if the same were set 
out herein as part of this Offer. 

En bloc offer 
 

Offer in Canadian dollars 
(excluding any applicable taxes) 

Offer Price  $ 

Deposit enclosed (20%)* $ 
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Parcel(s) offer Complete table below as appropriate 

 

 
 
* All deposits must be made by certified cheque or bank draft payable to “Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in 
Trust”. 

Parcel # Title # ICS Parcel # Property Address Lot Block Plan Acres

Offer in CDN$ 
(excluding any 

applicable taxes)
Deposit
(20%)

Phase I - Fully Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies)
1 N/A N/A
2 N/A N/A
3 145887586 203036217 609 Confederation Drive 3 3 102171877 0.17    
4 145887799 203036385 613 Confederation Drive 4 3 102171877 0.18    
5 145887250 203035957 617 Confederation Drive 5 3 102171877 0.18    
6 145887441 203036116 621 Confederation Drive 6 3 102171877 0.21    
7 145887564 203036194 9 Michel Court 9 3 102171877 0.17    
8 145887227 203035935 5 Michel Court 8 3 102171877 0.16    
9 145887575 203036206 1 Michel Court 7 3 102171877 0.15    

10 145887621 203036251 21/637 Michel Court / Confederation Drive 10 4 102171877 0.16    
11 145887632 203036262 608 Confederation Drive 21 5 102171877 0.16    
12 145887261 203035968 612 Confederation Drive 20 5 102171877 0.15    
13 145887340 203036026 616 Confederation Drive 19 5 102171877 0.13    
14 145887339 203036015 620 Confederation Drive 18 5 102171877 0.14    
15 145887238 203035946 624 Confederation Drive 17 5 102171877 0.15    
16 145887687 203036318 628 Confederation Drive 16 5 102171877 0.15    
17 145887429 203036105 632 Confederation Drive 15 5 102171877 0.15    
18 145887531 203036183 636 Confederation Drive 14 5 102171877 0.15    

Phase III - Underground Serviced Lots
19 145887496 203036150 641 Confederation Drive 11 4 102171877 0.17    
20 145887834 203036420 645 Confederation Drive 12 4 102171877 0.18    
21 145887395 203036071 649 Confederation Drive 13 4 102171877 0.18    
22 145887777 203036374 653 Confederation Drive 14 4 102171877 0.18    
23 145887755 203036363 657 Confederation Drive 15 4 102171877 0.18    
24 145887676 203036307 661 Confederation Drive 16 4 102171877 0.18    
25 145887744 203036352 665 Confederation Drive 17 4 102171877 0.18    
26 145887610 203036240 669 Confederation Drive 18 4 102171877 0.18    
27 145887159 203035878 673 Confederation Drive 19 4 102171877 0.18    
28 145887283 203035980 677 Confederation Drive 20 4 102171877 0.18    
29 145887643 203036273 681 Confederation Drive 21 4 102171877 0.18    
30 145887463 203036127 685/629 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 22 4 102171877 0.17    
31 145887508 203036161 640 Confederation Drive 13 5 102171877 0.16    
32 145887182 203035890 644 Confederation Drive 12 5 102171877 0.16    
33 145887407 203036082 648 Confederation Drive 11 5 102171877 0.17    
34 145887485 203036149 652 Confederation Drive 10 5 102171877 0.17    
35 145887328 203036004 656 Confederation Drive 9 5 102171877 0.17    
36 145887171 203035889 660 Confederation Drive 8 5 102171877 0.17    
37 145887474 203036138 664 Confederation Drive 7 5 102171877 0.17    
38 145887294 203035991 668 Confederation Drive 6 5 102171877 0.17    
39 145887373 203036059 672 Confederation Drive 5 5 102171877 0.17    
40 145887362 203036048 676 Confederation Drive 4 5 102171877 0.17    
41 145887148 203035867 680 Confederation Drive 3 5 102171877 0.17    
42 145886956 203035856 684 Confederation Drive 2 5 102171877 0.17    
43 145887597 203036228 690/701 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 1 5 102171877 0.17    

Phase II - Underground Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies) 
44 145887823 203036419 26 Powell Place 7 2 102171877 0.15    
45 145887384 203036060 22 Powell Place 6 2 102171877 0.14    
46 145887801 203036396 18 Powell Place 5 2 102171877 0.14    
47 145887665 203036295 14 Powell Place 4 2 102171877 0.14    
48 145887654 203036284 10 Powell Place 3 2 102171877 0.14    
49 145887609 203036239 6 Powell Place 2 2 102171877 0.14    
50 145887711 203036330 2/625 Powell Place / 10th Ave 1 2 102171877 0.16    
51 145887733 203036341 30 Powell Place 8 2 102171877 0.95    

Condos
52 145887519 203036172 Powell Place 9 2 102171877 3.64    

Total 12.49 $ $

Land Parcel Summary

SOLD - Not included in Sale
SOLD - Not included in Sale
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Please confirm, by ticking the appropriate box below, if the Offer is contingent upon the Receiver accepting 
all of the above Parcels included in the Offer. 

  No, the above Offer is not contingent upon the Receiver accepting the Offer on all of the above 
Parcels bid on. As detailed in the Terms and Conditions of Sale, the Receiver, at its sole option, may 
accept the Offer in respect of any one or more Parcels, but not necessarily all of them.  

  Yes, the above Offer is contingent upon the Receiver accepting the Offer on all of the above Parcels 
bid on. If the Receiver does not accept the Offer on all Parcels, the entire Offer will be void. 

 

DATED at the City of ___________________ in the Province/State of ___________________                   

this __________ day of ___________________________, 2019. 

 

Signature of Offeror: ___________________________ 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Schedule B – Plan of survey 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Schedule C – Asset photographs 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Schedule D – Parcel descriptions 

 

  

  

Parcel # Title # ICS Parcel # Property Address Lot Block Plan Acres Land Titles 
Parcel Value

Tax Assessed Value

Phase I - Fully Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies)
1
2
3 145887586 203036217 609 Confederation Drive 3 3 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,800                  
4 145887799 203036385 613 Confederation Drive 4 3 102171877 0.18     140,000          124,200                  
5 145887250 203035957 617 Confederation Drive 5 3 102171877 0.18     150,000          125,500                  
6 145887441 203036116 621 Confederation Drive 6 3 102171877 0.21     150,000          130,000                  
7 145887564 203036194 9 Michel Court 9 3 102171877 0.17     205,000          123,800                  
8 145887227 203035935 5 Michel Court 8 3 102171877 0.16     137,000          120,000                  
9 145887575 203036206 1 Michel Court 7 3 102171877 0.15     150,000          119,100                  

10 145887621 203036251 21/637 Michel Court / Confederation Drive 10 4 102171877 0.16     145,000          120,500                  
11 145887632 203036262 608 Confederation Drive 21 5 102171877 0.16     120,000          121,100                  
12 145887261 203035968 612 Confederation Drive 20 5 102171877 0.15     250,000          119,400                  
13 145887340 203036026 616 Confederation Drive 19 5 102171877 0.13     175,000          114,400                  
14 145887339 203036015 620 Confederation Drive 18 5 102171877 0.14     140,000          116,700                  
15 145887238 203035946 624 Confederation Drive 17 5 102171877 0.15     140,000          117,800                  
16 145887687 203036318 628 Confederation Drive 16 5 102171877 0.15     140,000          118,400                  
17 145887429 203036105 632 Confederation Drive 15 5 102171877 0.15     138,000          118,500                  
18 145887531 203036183 636 Confederation Drive 14 5 102171877 0.15     136,000          118,600                  

Phase III - Underground Serviced Lots
19 145887496 203036150 641 Confederation Drive 11 4 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,300                  
20 145887834 203036420 645 Confederation Drive 12 4 102171877 0.18     165,000          125,100                  
21 145887395 203036071 649 Confederation Drive 13 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
22 145887777 203036374 653 Confederation Drive 14 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
23 145887755 203036363 657 Confederation Drive 15 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
24 145887676 203036307 661 Confederation Drive 16 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
25 145887744 203036352 665 Confederation Drive 17 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
26 145887610 203036240 669 Confederation Drive 18 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
27 145887159 203035878 673 Confederation Drive 19 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
28 145887283 203035980 677 Confederation Drive 20 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
29 145887643 203036273 681 Confederation Drive 21 4 102171877 0.18     150,000          124,200                  
30 145887463 203036127 685/629 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 22 4 102171877 0.17     140,000          123,900                  
31 145887508 203036161 640 Confederation Drive 13 5 102171877 0.16     140,000          120,600                  
32 145887182 203035890 644 Confederation Drive 12 5 102171877 0.16     175,000          120,500                  
33 145887407 203036082 648 Confederation Drive 11 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
34 145887485 203036149 652 Confederation Drive 10 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
35 145887328 203036004 656 Confederation Drive 9 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
36 145887171 203035889 660 Confederation Drive 8 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
37 145887474 203036138 664 Confederation Drive 7 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
38 145887294 203035991 668 Confederation Drive 6 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
39 145887373 203036059 672 Confederation Drive 5 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
40 145887362 203036048 676 Confederation Drive 4 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
41 145887148 203035867 680 Confederation Drive 3 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,800                  
42 145886956 203035856 684 Confederation Drive 2 5 102171877 0.17     210,000          123,900                  
43 145887597 203036228 690/701 Confederation Drive / 10th Ave 1 5 102171877 0.17     145,000          123,600                  

Phase II - Underground Serviced Lots (identified deficiencies) 
44 145887823 203036419 26 Powell Place 7 2 102171877 0.15     175,000          119,000                  
45 145887384 203036060 22 Powell Place 6 2 102171877 0.14     175,000          115,200                  
46 145887801 203036396 18 Powell Place 5 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
47 145887665 203036295 14 Powell Place 4 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
48 145887654 203036284 10 Powell Place 3 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
49 145887609 203036239 6 Powell Place 2 2 102171877 0.14     140,000          115,200                  
50 145887711 203036330 2/625 Powell Place / 10th Ave 1 2 102171877 0.16     205,000          120,800                  
51 145887733 203036341 30 Powell Place 8 2 102171877 0.95     637,000          116,300                  

Condos
52 145887519 203036172 Powell Place 9 2 102171877 3.64     2,583,000       171,300                  

Total 12.49  11,146,000$ 6,128,700$           

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
DOUGLAS HEIGHTS DEVELOPMENT

Land Parcel Summary

SOLD - Not included in Sale
SOLD - Not included in Sale
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16 © Deloitte LLP and affiliated entities 
 

 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 1 – ICS# 203036037 (601 Confederation Drive) - SOLD 

Parcel 2 – ICS# 203035979 (605 Confederation Drive) - SOLD  
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 3 – ICS# 203036217 (609 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 4 – ICS# 203036385 (613 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 5 – ICS# 203035957 (617 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 6 – ICS# 203036116 (621 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 7 – ICS# 203036194 (9 Michel Court) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 8 – ICS# 203035935 (5 Michel Court) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 9 – ICS# 203036206 (1 Michel Court) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 10 – ICS# 203036251 (21/637 Michel Court/Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 11 – ICS# 203036262 (608 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 12 – ICS# 203035968 (612 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 13 – ICS# 203036026 (616 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 14 – ICS# 203036015 (620 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 15 – ICS# 203035946 (624 Confederation Drive) 

  



Sales and information package | Schedule D – Parcel descriptions 

31 © Deloitte LLP and affiliated entities 
 

 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 16 – ICS# 203036318 (628 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 17 – ICS# 203036105 (632 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 18 – ICS# 203036183 (636 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 19 – ICS# 203036150 (641 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 20 – ICS# 203036420 (645 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 21 – ICS# 203036071 (649 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 22 – ICS# 203036374 (653 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 23 – ICS# 203036363 (657 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 24 – ICS# 203036307 (661 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 25 – ICS# 203036352 (665 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 26 – ICS# 203036240 (669 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 27 – ICS# 203035878 (673 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 28 – ICS# 203035980 (677 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 29 – ICS# 203036273 (681 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 30 – ICS# 203036127 (685/629 Confederation Drive/10th Ave) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 31 – ICS# 203036161 (640 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 32 – ICS# 203035890 (644 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 33 – ICS# 203036082 (648 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 34 – ICS# 203036149 (652 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 35 – ICS# 203036004 (656 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 36 – ICS# 203035889 (660 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 37 – ICS# 203036138 (644 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 38 – ICS# 203035991 (668 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 39 – ICS# 203036059 (672 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 40 – ICS# 203036048 (676 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 41 – ICS# 203035867 (680 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 42 – ICS# 203035856 (684 Confederation Drive) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 43 – ICS# 203036228 (690/701 Confederation Drive/10th Ave) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 44 – ICS# 203036419 (26 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 45 – ICS# 203036060 (22 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 46 – ICS# 203036396 (18 Powell Place) 

  



Sales and information package | Schedule D – Parcel descriptions 

62 © Deloitte LLP and affiliated entities 
 

 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 47 – ICS# 203036295 (14 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 48 – ICS# 203036284 (10 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 49 – ICS# 203036239 (6 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 50 – ICS# 203036330 (2/625 Powell Place/10th Ave) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 51 – ICS# 203036341 (30 Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Parcel 52 – ICS# 203036172 (Powell Place) 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

Schedule E – Identified deficiencies 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 

  

 



Sales and information package | Schedule E – Identified deficiencies 

72 © Deloitte LLP and affiliated entities 
 

 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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 Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc., makes no representations as to the accuracy or completeness of the 
information presented.  Interested parties are to rely on their own investigations to determine the accuracy of same. 
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Liquor Permit Advertising Form

Under the provisions of The Alcohol and
Gaming Regulations Act, 1997,

Notice is hereby given that Saskatchewan
Indian Gaming Authority Inc. has applied
to the Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming
Authority (SLGA) for a Restaurant permit
to sell alcohol in the premises known as
Bear Claw Casino & Hotel at White
Bear First Nation IR365, White Bear
First Nation SK.

Written objections to the granting of the
permit may be filed with SLGA not more
than two weeks from the date of
publication of this notice.

Every person filing a written objection
with SLGA shall state their name,
address, and telephone number in printed
form, as well as the grounds for the
objection(s). Petitions must name a
contact person, state grounds, and be
legible. Each signatory to the petition and
the contact person must provide an
address and telephone number.
Frivolous, vexatious or competition-based
objections within the beverage alcohol
industry may not be considered and may
be rejected by the Saskatchewan Liquor
and Gaming Licensing Commission, who
may refuse to hold a hearing.

Write to:
Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming
Authority
Box 5054
REGINA SK S4P 3M3

Sealed bids marked "Bid for Peepeekisis
Cree Nation No. 81 - Water Treatment Plant
Upgrades" will be received at the offices of
Associated Engineering (Sask.) Ltd.,
#1-2225 Northridge Drive, Saskatoon, SK
S7L 6X6 up to Thursday, September 19,
2019 at 2:00 p.m. local time.

The work involves the construction of the
Upgrades and Expansion to the Peepeekisis
Cree Nation Water Treatment Plant
including substructure, building, process and
building mechanical, electrical and controls
and appurtenances.

Contract Documents may be examined at
the offices of Associated Engineering
(Sask.) Ltd., #1-2225 Northridge Drive,
Saskatoon, SK S7L 6X6.

Contract Documents will be available for
pickup by interested General Contractors at
the offices of Associated Engineering
(Sask.) Ltd., on or after Thursday, August
29, 2019 at 1:00 p.m. local time upon
deposit of $200.00 per set, taxes included.
Deposit will be refunded if Bid Documents
are returned complete, undamaged,
unmarked and reusable within seven (7)
days of bid submission. Failure to comply
will result in forfeiture of deposit.

Technical inquiries by bidders are to be
directed to Shengtao Weng 306-653-4969 or
by email at wengs@ae.ca.

A mandatory Bidder’s briefing site meeting is
scheduled for Wednesday, September 4,
2019 at 10:30 a.m. local time at the
Peepeekisis Cree Nation Water Treatment Plant.

Bids must be accompanied by the specified
Bid Bond and Consent of Surety Company
or a certified cheque payable to the owner.

The lowest or any bid will not necessarily be
accepted.

Contact for the Owner
Peepeekisis Cree Nation No. 81
c/o SAL Engineering Ltd.
2220 Avenue C North
Saskatoon, SK S7L 6C3
Phone: 306-653-4511
Email: donpoon@salengineering.ca
Attn: Don Poon, P. Eng., C. Eng., MICE,
CMC, CCCA, F.ASCE

Contact for the Engineer
Associated Engineering (Sask.) Ltd.
#1-2225 Northridge Drive
Saskatoon, SK S7L 6X6
Phone: 306-653-4969
Email: wengs@ae.ca
Attn: Shengtao Weng, M.Sc., P.Eng.

Name Change Notice
I, Sandeep Kaur Gangar, daughter of Harpal
Singh, holder of Indian Passport number
H7360642, issued at Chandigarh, on
September 25, 2009, permanent resident of
Village-Awa, District Fazilka, Punjab, India,
152123 and presently residing at 5056 Crane
Crescent, Regina, S4W0H9, SK, Canada, do
hereby change my name from Sandeep Kaur
to Sandeep Kaur Gangar.

Name Change Notice
I, Hardeep Singh Gangar, son of Jagsir
Singh, holder of Indian Passport number
H6274220, issued at Chandigarh, on August
03, 2009, permanent resident of Village-
Awa, District Fazilka, Punjab, India, 152123
and presently residing at 5056 Crane
Crescent, Regina, S4W0H9, SK, Canada, do
hereby change my name from Hardeep
Singh to Hardeep Singh Gangar.

Form 16-48
(Rule 16-48)

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the estate of MARIO NARDIN, late of 1641
Rothwell Street, Regina, Saskatchewan, deceased.

All claims against the above estate, duly
verified by statutory declaration and with
particulars and valuation of security held, if
any, must be sent to the undersigned before
the 30th day of September, 2019.

Jane Karen Ottenbreit
Executor
298 Froom Crescent
Regina, Saskatchewan S4N 1B7
Address

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the estate of JUDITH CAROLYN
BIBERDORF, late of Regina, Saskatchewan,
deceased.

All claims against the above estate, duly
verified by statutory declaration and with
particulars and valuation of security held, if
any, must be sent to the undersigned before
the 21 day of September, 2019.

RODGER W. LINKA
Executor’s lawyer
Linka Howe Peterson Law Offices
300-533 Victoria Avenue
Regina, SK S4N 0P8

Queen City AniFest
Conexus Arts
Centre, Aug 24th.
Join the Nerd Side.
www.qcanifest.com

2001 Dodge Ram
4x4. 198,000 kms.

$5800 OBO.
306-539-0241

Events

Trucks & SUV’s

Legal & Tender Notices

Public Notices

Legal & Tender Notices

Legal & Tender Notices

Standing Buffalo
General Band Meeting

Posted: Tuesday August 20, 2019

TO: Band Membership

RE: GENERAL BAND MEETING DATES
The General Band Meeting will take place on Friday September 6, 2019 from 5:00 p.m. to
8:00 p.m. held at Standing Buffalo School Gymnasium. Supper will be provided.

The Urban General Band Meeting will take place on Saturday September 7, 2019 from
10:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. at R.T.S.I.S. (The Gathering Place) in Regina, Sk. Lunch will
be provided.

The Band Audit will be presented by Meyers Norris Penny and a copy can be provided
earlier for reviewing purposes at Band Office.

All band members encouraged to attend.

Thank you
Chief and Council

INVITATION FOR OFFERS
7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.

7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”) was a
residential property development company incorporated
to complete a development known as Douglas Heights in
Weyburn, Saskatchewan.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of
the Company, invites offers to purchase the Receiver’s
right, title and interest, if any, in the assets of the
Company which include an approximate 15.4 acre parcel
of land, subdivided into fifty (50) residential land parcels,
forty-eight (48) of which range in size from 0.13 acres to
0.21 acres, one (1) parcel of 0.95 acres, and one (1) parcel
of 3.64 acres.

All offers must be sealed and marked “OFFER – 7 G.B.”
and be delivered or mailed, postage prepaid, to Deloitte
Restructuring Inc. at 360Main Street, Suite 2300,Winnipeg,
MB R3C 3Z3 to be received no later than 5:00 p.m. CDT
on Friday, September 27, 2019. Every offer submitted
shall be in the form of the Offer to Purchase prescribed
in the Sales and Information Package. The highest or any
offer will not necessary be accepted.

To obtain a copy of the Sales and Information Package
and/or to arrange an appointment to view the assets,
please contact John R. Fritz at (204) 944-3586 or
(jofritz@deloitte.ca).

TAX ENFORCEMENT LIST
VILLAGE OFWILCOX

PROVINCE OF SASKATCHEWAN

Notice is hereby given under The Tax Enforcement Act that unless the arrears and costs
appearing opposite the land and title number described in the following list are fully paid before
October 23, 2019, an interest based on a tax lien will be registered against the land.

Note: A sum for costs in an amount required by subsection 4(3) of The Tax Enforcement Act is
included in the amount shown against each parcel.

DESCRIPTION
OF PROPERTY

Title No. Total Arrears* Costs Total Arrears
and Costs

LOT 6-BLK/PAR
4-PLAN 50195
EXT 0

145648806 658.62 120.00 778.62

LOT 4-BLK/PAR
4-PLAN 50195
EXT 0

145648749 4,428.27 120.00 4,548.27

LOT 5-BLK/PAR
4-PLAN 50195
EXT 0

145648783 4,428.27 120.00 4,548.27

LOT 22-BLK/PAR
4-PLAN 50195
EXT 0

LOT 26-BLK/
PAR 4-PLAN
101405146 EXT 1

135960295

135960307

1,330.76 120.00 1,450.76

LOT 22-BLK/PAR
9-PLANAM2389
EXT 0

LOT 23-BLK/PAR
9-PLANAM2389
EXT 0

146916164

146916030

1,065.61 120.00 1,185.61

LOT 4-BLK/PAR
13-PLAN CN370
EXT 0

147567213 608.13 120.00 728.13

*Penalty is calculated to the date of the Notice and will continue to accrue as applicable.

Dated this 20th day of August, 2019

Tammy Ritchie, Administrator

2018 ARREARS

AGE OVER
THE HILL

Haul rubbish, clean
eaves, cut trees,
demiolition, yard

work,. Sr discount.
306-596-0965

Brazeau Masonry
and Roofing

Asphault shingling
Brick, Block, Stone
Layer, Chimney

Repair. Stucco and
Parging. Licensed
and Insurred. Free

Estimates
Wayne 306-331-8069

RENOVATIONS &
FOUNDATIONS.
30 yrs experience.
Concrete, windows,
siding, bathrooms,
basements, we do it
all! Senior rates.
306-537-8971

BT RENO’S
Decks, fences,
landscaping,
tree trimming
& renovations
306-530-7917

Interior/Exterior
Painting Residential
and Commercial
Call: 306-994-6388

Disposal
& Hauling

Eavestroughing
& Roofing

Home
Renovations

Painters &
Decorators

Services

antHony WaLLaCe / aFP / getty images

People hold hands as they form a human chain  
along a pedestrian crossing in Hong Kong on Friday.

Hong Kong

43-km-long human 
chain formed in vigil

S h i b a n i  M a h t a n i  
a n d  t i f f a n y  L i a n g 

Hong Kong • Inspired by an effort 
30 years ago in the Baltic states that 
called for the end of Soviet rule, tens 
of thousands in Hong Kong on Friday 
held hands under the night sky to 
form a human chain snaking 43 kilo-
metres across the territory, in a vigil 
against an increasingly authoritar-
ian China intent on clamping down 
against their protest movement.

“Hong Kongers, Add Oil!” they 
chanted, a phrase that loosely trans-
lates to keep going. “Democracy 
now!”

Parts of the human chain passed 
hand sanitizer down the line be-
fore holding their hands up in the 
air, linking themselves with friends, 
family and strangers. 

Participants turned on their cell-
phone lights and waved them toward 
the sky, illuminating the city’s most 
iconic neighbourhoods, including 
along Victoria Harbour, as passing 
cars honked in deafening support.

“I was a bit embarrassed holding 
strangers’ hands at first,” said one 
29-year-old participant who wanted 
to be identified just by his last name, 
Lam. 

“But later, I thought, we are family. 
Why not?”

As they held their peaceful demon-
stration — its imagery harking back 
to the similarly implausible fight 
against the Soviet Union’s power in 
1989 — there were more signs that 
Beijing is becoming increasingly ag-
gressive in its efforts to stamp out the 
protests and squeeze entities seen as 
supportive of them.

Rebecca Sy, who heads a union 
representing flight attendants from 
Cathay Pacific’s regional airline, held 
a news conference Friday announ-
cing her termination, among the 
more than a dozen aviation industry 
workers forced out in connection to 
the political demonstrations. Diplo-
mats too have come under pressure: 
A Hong Kong passport holder work-
ing for the British consulate was de-
tained while trying to return to the 
semi-autonomous territory from 
Shenzhen, prompting the Canadian 
consulate to halt mainland visits for 
its staff.

“All of these events, they are all 
related to the same thing, which is 
China taking away our freedoms,” 
said Noelle, a 53-year old wedged in 
the line, who only wanted to be iden-

tified by her first name for fear of re-
percussions over her participation. 
“This is exactly what we don’t want 
in Hong Kong, and that is why we are 
here today.”

Noelle, along with a majority of 
participants, had their faces obscured 
with masks — an indication of the 
fear that has gripped this city. Protest-
ers interviewed believe that even par-
ticipating in peaceful protests can get 
one fired from their jobs or otherwise 
put them at risk.

Friday’s human chain, dubbed 
the “Hong Kong Way,” was an 
idea borrowed from an almost 
650-kilometre long gathering of  
two million people in Estonia, Latvia 
and Lithuania. Their demonstration 
was a bid for independence from the 
Soviet Union, and the show of unity 
discredited the Russian narrative at a 
time when Baltic independence was 
a fringe idea promoted by a group of 
radicals.

Hong Kong protesters partici-
pating in the vigil are fighting for 
their government to recognize de-
mands that have hardened over their 
months-long protest movement. 

Triggered by a now-shelved extra-
dition bill that would have allowed 
fugitives to be transferred to the 
mainland, demonstrators have been 
angling for an independent investi-
gation into police use of force; they 
also want their government to be dir-
ectly elected, believing their leaders 
serve Beijing rather than Hong Kong.

Preparations for the human chain 
were complex logistically, said a 
24-year old organizer who only want-
ed to be known by the initials J.C. for 
fear of reprisal. 

In recent days, groups of volun-
teers have gone out to test the routes 
by making a short chain of people, 
testing out safety issues such as the 
presence of pedestrian crossings and 
roads. 

The route, which stretched across 
Hong Kong island, the Kowloon area 
across Victoria Harbour and the New 
Territories area which borders main-
land China, was deliberately planned 
near subway stops to make partici-
pation convenient. Over 40 so-called 
“team leaders” were on site on Friday, 
J.C. said, to direct the crowd and ob-
serve any safety considerations.

Protesters in recent weeks have 
urged nonviolent ways of getting 
their government’s attention, after 
escalating violence between police, 
those perceived to sympathize with 
them and protesters. On a pages-long 
thread on LIHKG.com, some front-
line protesters — more accustomed to 
ripping bricks off sidewalks and pre-
paring for drawn-out confrontations 
with riot police — admitted that hold-
ing hands seemed “lame,” but was an 
important show of unity at a pivotal 
time for Hong Kong.

The Washington Post
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85th Birthday

Nestor Yachiw
Come & go tea

2 - 5 pm
Sept 1st
Elks hall

508 - 12 ST E
No cards or gifts

Anniversary

60th Wedding
Anniversary

Richard & Helen
Boechler

August 24th, 1959

Anniversary

Deb & Larry
Aug 25th, 1979 &
Loving you more.

Love Lar

AnniversariesBirthdays

Legal & Tender Notices

Celebrating

Book your
announcement today!

Let us in on your 
BIG NEWS...

• Birth • Engagement
• Wedding
•Graduation 
• Retirement

Your Daily
Horoscope
Creators Syndicate

Holiday
Mathis

SUNDAY, AUGUST 25, 2019
Five years is a long time from now, but that day in 2024 will
come really quickly and you’ll have about a thousand cell-
phone pictures to prove it. So what do you want those pic-
tures to be about?This is the point in the Virgo solar journey
that’s ideal for making projections and setting some mile-
stones so you’ll know you’re on the right track.
TODAY’S BIRTHDAY (Aug. 25). You’re not overly worried about
the same things you once were.You have hard evidence that life
seems to be working out for you. Much is going in your favor and
the trend will continue. New friends come into your life and inter-
esting twists happen in the next 10 weeks. Your excellent judg-
ment leads to a big January win. Cancer and Pisces adore you.
Your lucky numbers are: 9, 2, 19, 18 and 33.
ARIES (March 21-April 19). As much as you love your people,
you also need to take care of yourself. The perspective you get
from alone time is invaluable and will help you appreciate the rich-
ness that relationships bring to your life.
TAURUS (April 20-May 20). You’re not as comfortable as you
want to be, and yet the day goes better when you focus on what
there is to love about your domestic life. Home is home for a rea-
son. Embrace it and let it help you decide on your next move.
GEMINI (May 21-June 21). Ask your important question because
it’s like the whole universe is conspiring to answer you. Also, the
answer could come from anywhere, so you may as well aim your-
self in the direction of sunshine and fun.
CANCER (June 22-July 22). Whatever the worst task is, do it
first. Just get it over with so you don’t have this expectation of
unpleasantness hanging over your head anymore. The best part
of the day comes directly afterward.
LEO (July 23-Aug. 22). In something as simple as a short conver-
sation, many different kinds of currencies are being exchanged.
The one that seems the most important (money and time are the
usual culprits) is actually the least important commodity.
VIRGO (Aug. 23-Sept. 22). If you think your job is hard, try imag-
ining the hard jobs required throughout humanity’s existence.The
slightest amount of research reveals that pretty much it’s all of
society has been built on hard jobs.
LIBRA (Sept. 23-Oct. 23). Love isn’t defined by a length of time.
It’s an investment that can happen little by little over weeks or de-
cades, or it can happen all at once. There’s a different alchemy
alive in each arrangement.
SCORPIO (Oct. 24-Nov. 21). Treat technology as a servant and
not a master. To answer every call and text would be a mistake.
Such distractions keep you from the real-life matters that seem
less important than they really are.
SAGITTARIUS (Nov. 22-Dec. 21). It’s time to put the word out.
Pretend like you’re your own PR person. You may have to talk
things out to a few different people before you find the right spin,
so start with the people who are kind, objective and likely to give
you good feedback.
CAPRICORN (Dec. 22-Jan. 19). This isn’t a day to worry about
such things as large as “career” or “lifestyle,” rather it’s a time to
focus on the small and simple questions like, “Which kind of bread
should I choose?”
AQUARIUS (Jan. 20-Feb. 18). A lot of wonderful and terrible
things will happen -- as they always do. Much will depend on the
tone you generate. You’ll be very aware of your energy and how
you wield it today.
PISCES (Feb. 19-March 20).The people you think will be helpful
will not be so helpful at all. It’s not their fault.The expectation was
all yours. But you need helpful people. Move quickly on. Embrace
new energy.

INVITATION FOR OFFERS
7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.

7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”) was a
residential property development company incorporated
to complete a development known as Douglas Heights in
Weyburn, Saskatchewan.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of
the Company, invites offers to purchase the Receiver’s
right, title and interest, if any, in the assets of the
Company which include an approximate 15.4 acre parcel
of land, subdivided into fifty (50) residential land parcels,
forty-eight (48) of which range in size from 0.13 acres to
0.21 acres, one (1) parcel of 0.95 acres, and one (1) parcel
of 3.64 acres.

All offers must be sealed and marked “OFFER – 7 G.B.”
and be delivered or mailed, postage prepaid, to Deloitte
Restructuring Inc. at 360Main Street, Suite 2300,Winnipeg,
MB R3C 3Z3 to be received no later than 5:00 p.m. CDT
on Friday, September 27, 2019. Every offer submitted
shall be in the form of the Offer to Purchase prescribed
in the Sales and Information Package. The highest or any
offer will not necessary be accepted.

To obtain a copy of the Sales and Information Package
and/or to arrange an appointment to view the assets,
please contact John R. Fritz at (204) 944-3586 or
(jofritz@deloitte.ca).

8/24/19

Solution to 8/23/19

Rating: GOLD

JANRIC CLASSIC SUDOKU
Fill in the blank cells using numbers 1 to 9. Each number can appear only once in each row,
*%26., /,) +1+ -2%*4( 0;# 2%<7* /,) $!%*#;; #27.7,/97%, 9% ;%25# 9:# $6&&2#( 3:# )7"8*629'
level ranges from Bronze (easiest) to Silver to Gold (hardest).
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HANDY MAN BILL
Decks, Plumbing,
Elec., Fences,

Drywall, Painting,
Carpentry, Prompt.

306-371-3155

WE DO IT RIGHT
We return calls &
show up! Water
Heater placement.
Customer’s Choice
Plumbing/Heating

374-3222

Fences & Decks
Bsmnt & Bath Reno’s.

Small repairs
Free estimates.
306-850-5463

GARBAGE REMOVAL.
Small moves &

delivery, w 1/2 ton.
www.ngkhauling.com

7days/wk
306-227-4345 /
306-477-2094

Moving 24 ft
Truck. Rubbish
Removals 1/2
Ton & Trailer
306-221-2327

ABC Services
Eaves Cleaning &
Repair,Tree, Hedge
Pruning. Senior disc

306-241-4220

Legend Electric
Residential and
commercial
electrical services
in Saskatoon and
area. FREE quotes.
Call: 306-250-5429
www.LegendElect
ricSK.com

JD’S Paving Stones
Patios, Driveways,
Walls, Repairs to All,
Fences, Concrete,
Irrigation & Turf etc.
Jeremy 306-220-3235

All kinds of Tree
Cutting/Pruning, Hauling,

Eavestrough Yard Cleaning
10% off for month of April! City &
Urban areas included. Up to 100
miles out of city. Free estimates!

306-374-3369 or 717-1016

Free Estimates.
Big & Small Tree &
Stump removal,
trimming/pruning.

Hauling.
Eavestrough clean.
Yard work. 20 yrs
Exp. Joe: 280-5522

or 955-3618

P&I TREE CUTTING
& TRIMMING

22 Yrs Exp. Yard
Cleaning, Free Est.

Low Rates!
306-881-7610

Eavestroughing
& Roofing

Decks, Fences
& Siding

Yard Care
& Seasonal

Yard Care
& Seasonal

Contractors &
Skilled Trades

Electrical

Disposal
& Hauling

Yard Care & Seasonal

Services

Buy & Sell
It’s a Snap 

In the 
Classi!eds. 
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ALL DAY. EVERY DAY.
ALL YOU CAN EAT BUFFET

44 SIMS AVE., WEYBURN

306-842-7444

DRIVE-THRU OPEN LATE
only $12.00

LOST CHILD 

TOWING
~ 24 Hour Service ~

Toll Free 1-800-222-4357
CAA-HELP

861-0585

Inclusion Weyburn has 
two more yellow collection 
bins in town, set up at the 
Co-op Foods parking lot. 

These are in addition to 
the two bins in the Zion Lu-
theran Church parking lot, 
which will remain in place. 
“Inclusion Weyburn is so 
appreciative of the people 
of Weyburn and commun-
ity who have supported us 
with many donations to the 
bins,” said Jackie Wilson of 
Inclusion Weyburn.

“It is such a good fund-
raiser for our organiza-
tion, as donated items are 
sold by the pound and that 
money comes directly to 
Inclusion Weyburn, where 
it helps us provide pro-
gramming for our citizens 
who have intellectual dis-
abilities,” she added.

Inclusion Saskatchewan 
set up a list of what can and 
cannot be taken in the bins. 
The items which can be 

donated are most anything 
that can fit on a store shelf, 
and include clothing and 
soft items.

These include men’s, 
women’s and children’s 
clothes and shoes, acces-
sories like jewelry, purs-
es, wallets, laptop bags, 
backpacks, mitts, hats, 
scarves, nylons, socks 
and underwear, and other 
soft items like blankets, 
sheets, towels, pillows 
and tablecloths.

Media items are also ac-
cepted, like CDs, DVDs, 
records, cassette tapes, 
VHS, DVD and Blu-Ray 
players, video game con-
soles and cartridges, and 
small household items 
such as pots, pans, bake-
ware, kitchen utensils, 
dishes, cutlery, glassware, 
small toys, puzzles, games 
and stuffed animals.

Small appliances can 
be donated as well, such 

as coffee makers, toast-
ers, bread makers, blend-
ers, small radios, candles, 
small picture frames, bas-
kets, ornaments, hand tools 
and knick-knacks.

The items which are 
not accepted include TVs, 
computers, laptops and 
computer monitors, micro-
waves, large appliances, 
encyclopedias, textbooks, 
magazines, newspapers, 
bikes and children’s riding 
toys, food, shampoo, soap, 
perfume and make-up.

They also cannot take 
empty bottles or jars, yo-
gurt containers or other 
recyclables, weapons and 
explosives, hazardous 
waste, flammable prod-
ucts, construction materi-
als and automobile parts.

If anyone has a ques-
tion about an item not on 
this list, call Inclusion Sas-
katchewan’s toll-free num-
ber at 1-877-477-2171.

Inclusion Weyburn adds two 
more yellow collection bins

Prairie Sky Co-op in 
Weyburn announced they 
will be closing the Coteau 
Avenue gas bar, which is 
located next to the food 
store, effective Friday, 
Sept. 20.

The gas bar requires 
major repairs to continue 
to operate safely and meet 
Co-op members’ expecta-
tions into the future. The 
cost of these repairs, along 
with the sales volume of 
this site, led to the deci-
sion to close this location. 
Every effort will be made 
to retain the gas bar em-
ployees and move them 
to other Co-op locations 
wherever possible. 

Customers are en-
couraged to use the other 
C-Store locations in Wey-
burn, with the Suds City 

location at 1794 First Av-
enue, and the Main Track 
location at the junction of 
Highways 13 and 39. 

The Co-op also has 
pump locations in Beaubi-
er, Lang and Milestone that 
can use a customer’s Prai-
rie Sky Co-op member-
ship number to earn equity 
and cash back. For fuel 
purchases made in 2018, 
members received a five-

per-cent allocation. 
“Prairie Sky Co-op 

remains committed to in-
vesting in the community 
and has a long-term plan to 
invest in our facilities and 
equipment to best serve our 
membership,” said Kevin 
Arthur, General Man-
ager of Prairie Sky Co-op. 
“We’ll be sharing more de-
tails of these investments 
in the near future.”

Closure of Coteau Avenue gas bar

By Greg Nikkel
Prime Minister Justin 

Trudeau has given poor 
leadership to Canadians, 
and the report of the Eth-
ics Commissioner only 
confirms that, said Dr. 
Robert Kitchen, MP for 
Souris-Moose Mountain.

He provided comments 
on the ongoing scandal in 
the SNC-Lavalin affair, 
and noted he and his team 
are gearing up for the fed-
eral election, expected to 
be underway some time in 
September.

The Ethics Commis-
sioner report  “shows 
Canadians the terrible 
leadership we have from 
this present government, 
and Prime Minister who 
is the champion of that,” 
said Kitchen.

The commissioner said 
in the report, in reference 
to the former Attorney-
General of Canada, “The 
Prime Minister, directly 
and through his senior 
officials, used various 
means to exert influence 
over Ms. Wilson-Ray-
bould. The authority of 
the Prime Minister and 
his office was used to cir-
cumvent, undermine and 
ultimately attempt to dis-
credit the decision of the 
Director of Public Pros-
ecutions as well as the 
authority of Ms. Wilson-
Raybould as the Crown’s 
chief law officer.”

Conservative leader 
Andrew Scheer made a 
request on Monday to the 
RCMP Commissioner to 
open an investigation into 

Trudeau’s actions, saying 
in a letter, “I believe I speak 
for millions of Canadians 
by requesting that you use 
all the resources at your 
disposal to investigate this 
matter, not only so that jus-
tice is done but so that it is 
seen to be done.”

MP Kitchen noted that 
Trudeau was made aware 
of the findings of the Eth-
ics Commissioner some 
time ago, with plenty of 
time to respond. “His re-
sponse has been to say 
he’s not going to apolo-
gize to Canadians. He’ll 
apologize for all sorts of 
things, but not for actions 
that he takes.”

The wrong actions 
taken by the prime min-
ister and senior officials 
in his office were also 
pointed out by Wilson-
Raybould when she testi-
fied about what happened 
in regard to SNC-Lavalin, 
as undue pressure was put 
on her not to prosecute the 
construction company.

In saying he would not 
apologize, Trudeau said 
his reason is that he was 
fighting for Canadian jobs 
as Canadians expect him 
to be doing.

With the federal elec-
tion looming, Kitchen 
said this issue, and that of 
the economy, are going to 
be huge as they get under-
way with the campaign. 
While Trudeau was wor-
ried about jobs related to 
SNC-Lavalin, the Liber-
als haven’t been so wor-
ried about the challenges 
facing the economy in the 

agricultural and energy 
sectors.

Producers are facing 
challenges to marketing 
canola and beef, and in 
regard to energy, there has 
been no federal support to 
help the oil industry out as 
it has been struggling for 
a long time.

Kitchen pointed out 
that investment dollars 
for oil and gas are leav-
ing Canada because of 
the policies of the Liberal 
government.

As one example, he 
noted there are maybe 20 
or 30 active rigs in south-
east Saskatchewan. “In 
North Dakota, they have 
over 80 rigs going in the 
same formation as our 
rigs. Our economy is hurt-
ing because of that.”

Another huge challenge 
is the Liberal plan to shut 
down coal-fired electrical 
generating plants, which 
will have a huge impact 
on Estevan and Coronach 
where SaskPower has 
major power generating 
plants. The shutdown of 
those plants will also have 
a negative impact on sur-
rounding towns and cit-
ies, including Weyburn, 
while the Liberals ignore 
the environmental bene-
fits of carbon capture and 
sequestration, which are 
in use especially at the 
Boundary Dam in Estevan.

“The trickle-down im-
pact on the community 
will hit restaurants, gro-
cery stores, supply stores 
— all of these will feel the 
impact,” said Kitchen.

MP decries PM’s lack of ethics  
in the SNC-Lavalin scandal

By Greg Nikkel
Dustin Duncan, MLA 

for Weyburn-Big Muddy 
and Environment Min-
ister, will be seeking 
re-election with the Sas-
katchewan Party in next 
year’s provincial election.

Premier Scott Moe 
recently made a small 
shuffle of the provincial 
cabinet, and asked to make 
sure that any ministers re-
maining in cabinet were 
going to commit to run-
ning in the 2020 election.

Duncan remained in 
his Environment portfolio, 
and is still the minister re-
sponsible for SaskPower, 
but with a new baby girl 
in his family, he asked the 
premier if he might give up 
being responsible for the 
Water Security Agency.

Premier Moe agreed, 
and the Water Security 

Agency is now the respon-
sibility of Greg Ottenbreit, 
the minister of Highways 
and Infrastructure.

“I think first and fore-
most, he wanted to make 
sure the cabinet ministers 
will be running again. 
This is the cabinet that we 
will go into the election 
with,” said Duncan. “I’m 
still enjoying the work, 
and I feel challenged in 
the roles I’ve been given.”

“From the provincial 
perspective, I’m still very 
positive about the stance 
the province has taken on 
issues, especially on the 
carbon tax issue. I feel 
that’s important and want 
to continue with that work 
that I’ve been doing.”

He reca l led  some 
words of advice of the 
former deputy premier 
Ken Krawetz, who told 
him, “If there are still two 
or three things you want 
to achieve for your con-
stituency, then you should 
consider running again.”

Duncan said he has 
been able to check off a 
couple of items from his 
“wish list” for Weyburn-
Big Muddy, but he still has 
some items he would like 
to see through to reality.

“Still at the top of my 
list is to get a new hospital 
for Weyburn. We’re still 
not quite there yet, and I’d 
like to be able to get a new 
hospital here. We’re get-
ting closer to achieving 
that, but there’s still a bit 
of work to do.”

In the last budget, Wey-
burn and Prince Albert 
split $5 million between 

them for planning for new 
health care facilities, which 
helps Weyburn to advance 
further, but the city still 
has not been able to begin 
building a new hospital.

Duncan said he feels 
that having a minister in 
cabinet will help this pro-
ject go through to fruition.

He considers getting 
passing lanes on Highway 
39 as a partial victory to-
wards his long-term goal 
to see Highway 6 and 39 
twinned from Regina to 
Estevan, and getting a new 
health care centre in Rad-
ville was another check. 
This was a goal when he 
first ran for MLA, and 
their new facility was 
opened a few years ago.

Duncan also pointed 
out that the government 
helped pay for major up-
grades to the City of Wey-
burn’s reservoir and water 
treatment plant, as well 
as to the Weyburn Com-
prehensive School and 
Southeast College, and is 
now helping to fund a new 
elementary school under 
construction in Weyburn.

He said most residents 
know that he is in the 
Weyburn constituency of-
fice every Friday, and he 
makes himself available to 
hear any problems or con-
cerns constituents might 
have or want addressed by 
the government.

“I’m certainly grate-
ful for the support I get at 
home and with family and 
friends. This is not some-
thing I would want to do 
without their support,” 
said Duncan.

MLA Dustin Duncan to 
run for another term

Photo 3407 — Jackie Wilson

Weyburn police donate to Humane Society
Representatives of the Weyburn Police Association, Sgt. Hugh Gilchrist and 
Const. Jake Sonnenberg, presented pet food to the Weyburn Humane Society 
for use at the animal shelter. Accepting the donation was shelter staff Lisa Webb 
and Colleen Morrice.

Photo 1023 courtesy Colleen Morrice

INVITATION FOR OFFERS 
7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.

7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. (“7 G.B.” or the “Company”) was a 
residential property development company incorporated 
to complete a development known as Douglas Heights in 
Weyburn, Saskatchewan.

Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its capacity as Receiver of the 
Company, invites offers to purchase the Receiver’s right, title 
and interest, if any, in the assets of the Company which include 
an approximate 15.4 acre parcel of land, subdivided into fifty 
(50) residential land parcels, forty-eight (48) of which range in 
size from 0.13 acres to 0.19 acres, one (1) parcel of 0.95 acres, 
and one (1) parcel of 3.64 acres.

All offers must be sealed and marked “OFFER – 7 G.B.” 
and be delivered or mailed, postage prepaid, to Deloitte 
Restructuring Inc. at 360 Main Street, Suite 2300, Winnipeg, 
MB R3C 3Z3 to be received no later than 5:00 p.m. CDT on 
Friday, September 27, 2019. Every offer submitted shall be 
in the form of the Offer to Purchase prescribed in the Sales 
and Information Package. The highest or any offer will not 
necessary be accepted.

To obtain a copy of the Sales and Information Package and/or 
to arrange an appointment to view the assets, please contact 
John R. Fritz at (204) 944-3586 or (jofritz@deloitte.ca).

AD PROOF & ESTIMATE All prices exclude taxes 
Prices do not include 5% GST

Docket Media Section Insertion Date Ad Size Price

1908-035 C Weyburn Review TENDERS Aug 15, 2019 2 col x 4  
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TEN TWEETABLE TRUTHS
2017

Nine in ten Canadian adults read a community or daily newspaper 
(print/digital) every week. 
- 79% readership of daily newspapers over the course of a week
- 83% readership of community newspapers (week, month or longer ago) 
- 87% read a daily OR community newspaper in past week 

Vividata 2016 Q2 Readership and Product Database

Readers choose printed community newspapers for everything local 
… and ADVERTISING!
- 91% of community newspaper readers choose LOCAL information as their main reason for reading (editorial,  
  sports, entertainment, events)
- 63% choose to read for advertising (flyers, inserts, ROP) 
- 55% still reading for Classified ads, Employment and Real Estate

Community Newspapers Drive Results 2017

Newspaper readers choose different platforms to read newspaper content. 
- Three in ten (30%) adults read newspapers on ALL four platforms – print, computer, phone, tablet
- 85% of adults read newspaper content on any one of four platforms

Newspapers 24/7: 2017

News media consumption habits vary by platform and time of day.
- Print readership is highest at breakfast (starting the day/commute to work)
- Computer readership strong early morning and after dinner (at home)
- Phone readership is high throughout the day (on the go)
- Tablet readership peaks after dinner (relax at home and read at leisure)

Newspapers 24/7: 2017

Young adults read newspapers – just differently than older adults.  
- 85% of Millennials (age 18-34) read on any platform - 73% read on their phone and 46% in print
- 83% of Boomers (age 52-70) read on any platform – 64% in print and 50% on their phones

Newspapers 24/7: 2017

Nine in ten Canadian 
adults read a community 
or daily newspaper
(print/digital) every week.
– 79% readership of daily news-
papers over the course of a week
– 83% readership of community 
newspapers (week, month or 
longer ago)
– 87% read a daily OR commu-
nity newspaper in past week

Vividata 2016 Q2 Readership and Product Database

Dustin Duncan



 
 

Exhibit D – Fees and Disbursements of the Receiver 
  



Date Invoice # Fees Disbursements GST Total Hours
17-Oct-19 8000821427 38,345$      3,243$            2,079$             43,668$         102.8         
23-Jan-20 8000973075 15,700        -                 785                  16,485          39.4           

Total 54,045$     3,243$           2,864$            60,153$       142.2        

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.

SUMMARY OF RECEIVER FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS



Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per 
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the 
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid. 

ATTN: Gordon Fry
Royal Bank of Canada
1790 Hamilton Street
Regina SK  S4P 2B2
Canada

Invoice 8000821427

October 17, 2019
1136959

360 Main St 
Suite 2300 
Winnipeg MB  R3C 3Z3

Tel: (204) 942-0051 
Fax: (204) 947-9390 
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#: ROY00355
Engagement Partner:

GST Registration:

Brent Warga 

122893605RT0001

For professional services rendered

Fees

In accordance with the Court Appointed Receivership proceedings
of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. for the period July 15, 2019 to October 11,
2019:

B. Warga - Partner (33.6 hrs):   $16,800.00
R. Adlington - Partner (1.0 hrs):   $500.00
J. Fritz - Senior Manager (34.0 hrs):   $12,750.00
T. Dew - Senior Associate (30.5 hrs):   $7,625.00
S. Tahir - Associate (3.0 hrs):   $600.00
A. Keene - Technician (0.7 hrs):   $70.00
Total (102.8 hrs):   $38,345.00

GST applicable 38,345.00

Expense

Insurance:   $2,808.75
Mail Redirection:   $320.00
Travel:   $114.40
Total:   $3,243.15

GST applicable 3,243.15

Sales Tax

GST at 5.00% 2,079.41

Total Amount Due (CAD) 43,667.56

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.



Date Name Hours Total Description
7/15/2019 Warga, Brent 3.2               1,600.00          Review of materials provided by RBC re: 7 G.B. Enterprises; drafting notice and statement of the Receiver.
7/16/2019 Dew, Todd 0.5               125.00             Review file materials.
7/16/2019 Tahir, Shadab 3.0               600.00             Travel time to and from Weyburn, SK and time on site.
7/16/2019 Fritz, John 0.5               187.50             Review of documents and initial email to Management;  commentary to same.
7/16/2019 Warga, Brent 2.9               1,450.00          Drafting website materials; logistic details for site attendance; call with Gurmej; various e-mail correspondence re: 

file matters.
7/17/2019 Keene, Ashley 0.5               50.00               Website creation.
7/17/2019 Dew, Todd 2.0               500.00             Emails and phone calls to City of Weyburn; trust accounting; file review.
7/18/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Contact City of Weyburn re: Receivership appointment; phone and email former engineer on the project.
7/19/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Create interested parties list for potential sale of the assets.
7/22/2019 Warga, Brent 0.8               400.00             Call with former realtor; updates to Notice and Statement of Receiver; e-mail correspondence with Gurmej.
7/23/2019 Dew, Todd 3.0               750.00             Prepare Notice and Statement of the Receiver; cover letter and mailing to creditors.
7/23/2019 Fritz, John 1.6               600.00             Review of Court Order, Notice and Statement of the Receiver, PPSR searches, land titles, and demand for notice; 

direction to T. Dew.
7/23/2019 Warga, Brent 1.3               650.00             E-mail correspondence with RBC; review of Notice and Statement of the Receiver; review of various e-mail 

correspondence; call to Gurmej.
7/23/2019 Adlington, Ryan 0.5               250.00             QAR Notice and Statement of the Receiver.
7/24/2019 Fritz, John 2.0               750.00             Statutory notice revisions; finalization and distribution of same; review of property and preliminary information for 

Sales and Information Package disclosure.
7/24/2019 Warga, Brent 1.0               500.00             Discussion with J. Fritz re: Notice and Statement of the Receiver and sales process/package.
7/26/2019 Keene, Ashley 0.2               20.00               Website updates.
7/26/2019 Fritz, John 0.7               262.50             Website updates; direction to D. Braun re: sales document information compilation.
7/26/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             Review of land parcels; preparation of preliminary summary schedules.
7/30/2019 Warga, Brent 0.2               100.00             E-mail correspondence with Gurmej.

8/1/2019 Warga, Brent 1.3               650.00             Updates to Sales and Information Package.
8/6/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             Calls with the City of Weyburn re: site clean up.
8/7/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Discussion with B. Warga re: site conditions; review emails; telephone calls to/from and emails to/from landscapers 

re: quotes for cutting grass and weeds.
8/7/2019 Warga, Brent 3.7               1,850.00          Drafting of Sales and Information Package; review of materials from City of Weyburn re: site clean up.
8/8/2019 Warga, Brent 2.8               1,400.00          Drafting of Sales and Information Package; review of e-mail correspondence and materials from Gurmej; e-mail 

correspondence with Gurmej.
8/9/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Draft letters; email and fax to financial institutions re: bank accounts; various email correspondence.
8/9/2019 Warga, Brent 1.8               900.00             Updates to Sales and Information Package; various e-mail correspondence with Clifton Associates.

8/13/2019 Fritz, John 4.0               1,500.00          Review and edits to Sales and Information Package; provision for internal review; insurance documentation and 
correspondence for FC&A quote.

8/14/2019 Fritz, John 0.7               262.50             Tax return review; provision of draft Sales and Information Package to J. Lee, P. Olfert, and G. Fry.
8/14/2019 Adlington, Ryan 0.5               250.00             QAR Sales and Information Package.
8/15/2019 Fritz, John 4.3               1,612.50          Insurance call; correspondence with G. Fry and  J. Lee re: SIP; drafting and distribution of SIP; ad for proof and 

quote; review of City of Weyburn's documents; call with M. Warren from City of Weyburn re: process, contacts, 
zoning, etc.; interested party calls.

8/15/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             Review of advertisements; review of sales package edits from MLT.
8/16/2019 Fritz, John 3.3               1,237.50          Court service items with P. Olfert; finalizing insurance coverage; revisions to Sales and Information Package ("SIP"); 

arranging advertising of SIP.
8/19/2019 Dew, Todd 0.4               100.00             Review sale package.
8/19/2019 Fritz, John 1.7               637.50             Calls to target parties for Sales and Information Package; correspondence re: newspaper advertisements and 

revisions.
8/19/2019 Warga, Brent 0.8               400.00             Correspondence with RBC re: borrowing certificate; discussions with J. Fritz re: sales package.
8/20/2019 Dew, Todd 2.0               500.00             Phone calls to interested parties for sale of land development.
8/20/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Phone calls with interested parties.
8/21/2019 Fritz, John 0.2               75.00               Direction to T. Dew.
8/22/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Add interested parties to list for sale of land development; discussion with contractor re: grass cutting.
8/22/2019 Fritz, John 0.2               75.00               Direction to T. Dew re: calls, etc.
8/23/2019 Dew, Todd 3.0               750.00             Contact interested parties for sales package.
8/23/2019 Fritz, John 4.5               1,687.50          Review and edits to SIP; finalize for distribution.
8/23/2019 Warga, Brent 0.7               350.00             Review of final edits to Sales Package.
8/26/2019 Dew, Todd 0.5               125.00             Send out sale packages to interested parties.
8/26/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Asset sale correspondence; direction to T. Dew.
8/27/2019 Dew, Todd 2.0               500.00             Telephone calls and emails to contractors re: grass cutting quotes; telephone call to City of Weyburn re: on site work; 

various e-mail correspondence.
8/27/2019 Fritz, John 0.4               150.00             Tax request items; correspondence to Management and former Accountant re: invoice copies; direction to T. Dew.

8/29/2019 Fritz, John 0.2               75.00               Correspondence with former accountant re: documentation for GST audit.
8/30/2019 Dew, Todd 3.0               750.00             Calls and emails to interested parties re: Sales and Information Package; emails City of Weyburn; telephone calls to 

City of Weyburn and Clifton & Associates.
8/30/2019 Fritz, John 0.4               150.00             Direction to T. Dew; various items with the City of Weyburn.

9/3/2019 Dew, Todd 0.4               100.00             Telephone calls; internal discussions re: property with J. Fritz.
9/3/2019 Warga, Brent 0.4               200.00             Call with renter living in one of the residences; various file matters.
9/4/2019 Dew, Todd 0.5               125.00             Emails and phone calls re: property maintenance.
9/5/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Communications to interested parties re sales package.
9/5/2019 Fritz, John 0.7               262.50             Call with former accountant re: GST invoice support; correspondence to Management re: records and GST audit 

documentation.
9/6/2019 Dew, Todd 0.5               125.00             Telephone discussion with City of Weyburn re: repair work; trust accounting.
9/9/2019 Dew, Todd 2.0               500.00             Call interested parties re: sales package.

9/12/2019 Fritz, John 0.8               300.00             Call and correspondence with CRA re: GST audit.
9/20/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Emails and telephone calls to City of Weyburn re: site issues.
9/23/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Phone calls and emails surrounding repair work required on site.
9/23/2019 Fritz, John 1.5               562.50             Interested party correspondence; compilation of information for First Report.

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
RECEIVERSHIP TIME SUMMARY

INVOICE NO: 8000821427



Date Name Hours Total Description

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
RECEIVERSHIP TIME SUMMARY

INVOICE NO: 8000821427

9/23/2019 Warga, Brent 2.7               1,350.00          Drafting of First Report.
9/25/2019 Dew, Todd 0.4               100.00             Trust accounting; review of various e-mails
9/25/2019 Fritz, John 0.5               187.50             Site remediation correspondence; update to B. Warga.
9/25/2019 Warga, Brent 3.5               1,750.00          Drafting of First Report and Confidential Supplement; calls with Clifton re: exposed underground services.
9/27/2019 Dew, Todd 0.4               100.00             Summary of offers.
9/30/2019 Fritz, John 0.8               300.00             Correspondence to RBC; summary of SIP results.
9/30/2019 Warga, Brent 1.2               600.00             E-mail correspondence to G. Fry re: sales process.
10/1/2019 Fritz, John 2.5               937.50             Douglas Heights Development calls and various e-mail correspondence.
10/1/2019 Warga, Brent 2.3               1,150.00          E-mail correspondence with G. Fry; calls with interested parties re: Douglas Heights interest.
10/2/2019 Fritz, John 1.5               562.50             Calls with potential purchasers; call with Counsel.
10/2/2019 Warga, Brent 1.2               600.00             Call with G. Gurwinder (second secured creditor); call with I. Sutherland.
10/3/2019 Fritz, John 0.4               150.00             Correspondence with interested parties.
10/3/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Call with RBC re: interested parties.

10/10/2019 Dew, Todd 0.2               50.00               Trust accounting.
10/11/2019 Dew, Todd 0.2               50.00               Trust accounting.

Total 102.8           38,345.00$      



Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per 
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the 
invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid. 

ATTN: Gordon Fry
Royal Bank of Canada
1790 Hamilton Street
Regina SK  S4P 2B2
Canada

Invoice 8000973075

January 23, 2020
1136959

360 Main St 
Suite 2300 
Winnipeg MB  R3C 3Z3

Tel: (204) 942-0051 
Fax: (204) 947-9390 
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#: ROY00355
Engagement Partner: Brent Warga

GST Registration: 133245290RT0001

For professional services rendered

Fees

In accordance with the Court Appointed Receivership proceedings
of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. for the period October 12, 2019
to January 21, 2020:

B. Warga - Partner (20.8 hrs): 10,400.00
J. Fritz - Senior Manager (5.2 hrs): 1,950.00
T. Dew - Senior Associate (13.4 hrs): 3,350.00
Total (39.4 hrs): 15,700.00

GST applicable 15,700.00

Sales Tax

GST at 5.00% 785.00

Total Amount Due (CAD) 16,485.00

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. 



Date Name Hours Total Description
10/16/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Telephone calls and emails for GST Audit by CRA.
10/16/2019 Fritz, John 0.6               225.00             Calls and correspondence with interested parties.
10/16/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             Review of e-mail correspondence to G. Gurwinder; discussions with J. Fritz re: file matters.
10/17/2019 Warga, Brent 0.7               350.00             Call with G. Fry; call with K. Anderson; review of e-mail correspondence.
10/18/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Emails and calls with respect to GST refund and repair work.
10/22/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Call with K. Anderson.
10/23/2019 Warga, Brent 0.6               300.00             Calls and e-mail correspondence with K. Anderson.
10/24/2019 Dew, Todd 0.8               200.00             Trust accounting; open Receiver GST account.
10/24/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             Update e-mail to RBC; e-mail correspondence with K. Anderson.
10/28/2019 Dew, Todd 1.2               300.00             Emails, faxes, and telephone calls with CRA re: GST audit.
10/29/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Calls and correspondence with interested parties.
10/30/2019 Dew, Todd 0.4               100.00             Emails, faxes, and telephone calls with CRA re: GST audit.
10/31/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Emails, faxes, and telephone calls with CRA re: GST audit; discussions with J. Fritz re: CRA GST audit.

11/4/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Email to accountant requesting 2018 Corporate Income Tax return and backup; review of same; discussions with J. 
Fritz re: GST audit.

11/4/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Direction to T. Dew re: GST refund.
11/5/2019 Warga, Brent 1.2               600.00             E-mail correspondence with K. Anderson; call with Clifton re: site remediation; review of Clifton correspondence.

11/6/2019 Fritz, John 1.8               675.00             Site remediation contract review; edits and correspondence with engineer and legal counsel.
11/6/2019 Warga, Brent 1.1               550.00             Review of various e-mail correspondence; calls and email correspondence with Clifton re: agreement.
11/7/2019 Dew, Todd 1.5               375.00             Emails, calls, and faxes with TD Canada Trust and CIBC re: closed bank account statements and cancelled cheques; 

letter to CRA re: GST audit.
11/7/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Correspondence from legal counsel; incorporation of edits into contract with engineer re: site remediation.
11/7/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Call with I. Sutherland re: Clifton agreement and general file update.
11/8/2019 Fritz, John 0.4               150.00             Correspondence with engineer; correspondence with interested parties; call with primary secured creditor.
11/8/2019 Warga, Brent 0.7               350.00             Review of offer; call with RBC; all with interested parties.

11/12/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Email review; discussions with J. Fritz and call with CRA re: GST audit.
11/12/2019 Fritz, John 0.1               37.50               Interested parties correspondence/calls.
11/15/2019 Dew, Todd 0.3               75.00               Amend letter to CRA; fax GST reassessment letter and backup to CRA.
11/18/2019 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Correspondence to interested parties; review correspondence to secured creditor.
11/18/2019 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             E-mail correspondence with RBC; email correspondence to interested parties.
11/21/2019 Fritz, John 0.2               75.00               Direction to T. Dew re: GST refunds.
11/25/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Review of e-mail correspondence.
11/26/2019 Fritz, John 0.2               75.00               Enquiry to City of Weyburn re: interested parties information request; call to interested parties counsel re: same.

11/26/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Discussions with J. Fritz re: City of Weyburn communications.
11/27/2019 Warga, Brent 0.6               300.00             Call with Robertson Stromberg; review of e-mail correspondence from Clifton and the City of Weyburn.
11/29/2019 Dew, Todd 0.2               50.00               Review and scan internal documents to J. Fritz.
11/29/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Review of e-mail correspondence.

12/2/2019 Warga, Brent 0.4               200.00             E-mail correspondence with G. Fry; call to I. Sutherland.
12/3/2019 Warga, Brent 1.1               550.00             Call with I. Sutherland; call with K. Anderson; e-mail correspondence with purchaser and with RBC.
12/5/2019 Dew, Todd 0.8               200.00             Review GST Notice of Assessment; call to CRA; filing of 2019 GST return.
12/5/2019 Warga, Brent 1.2               600.00             Drafting of First Report.
12/6/2019 Warga, Brent 1.0               500.00             Review of Asset Purchase Agreement.
12/9/2019 Dew, Todd 0.2               50.00               Trust accounting.

12/10/2019 Warga, Brent 2.3               1,150.00          Drafting of First Report.
12/17/2019 Warga, Brent 0.7               350.00             Call with McDougall Gauley re: closing; review of property tax liabilities.
12/18/2019 Dew, Todd 1.0               250.00             Trust accounting; courier letter and payment to City of Weyburn; email review.
12/18/2019 Warga, Brent 3.1               1,550.00          Drafting of Confidential Report; calls with the City of Weyburn; e-mail correspondence with McDougall Gauley.

12/24/2019 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             E-mail correspondence with RBC re: file matters.
1/2/2020 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             E-mail correspondence with I. Sutherland and RBC.
1/8/2020 Dew, Todd 0.2               50.00               Trust accounting.
1/8/2020 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             E-mail correspondence with legal counsel re: closing.
1/9/2020 Dew, Todd 0.3               75.00               GST returns.
1/9/2020 Warga, Brent 0.4               200.00             Execution of APA; correspondence with legal counsel.

1/14/2020 Dew, Todd 0.5               125.00             S. 246(2) OSB reporting.
1/14/2020 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             Calls with realtor re: interest in the land.
1/16/2020 Warga, Brent 0.1               50.00               E-mail correspondence to/from legal counsel re: closing.
1/17/2020 Warga, Brent 0.4               200.00             E-mail correspondence with RBC and legal counsel.
1/20/2020 Fritz, John 0.4               150.00             Review of 246(2) Report and R&D; finalize for QA.
1/20/2020 Warga, Brent 0.5               250.00             E-mail correspondence with legal counsel.
1/21/2020 Fritz, John 0.3               112.50             Finalize 246(3) report for distribution.
1/21/2020 Warga, Brent 0.3               150.00             E-mail correspondence with I. Sutherland re: file matters and security review.

Total 39.4             15,700.00$      

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
RECEIVERSHIP TIME SUMMARY

INVOICE NO: 8000973075



 
 

Exhibit E – Fees and Disbursements of the Receiver’s Legal Counsel 
 

  



Date Invoice # Fees Disbursements GST PST Total Hours
21-Feb-20 621961 32,627$           1,474$             1,705$        1,958$        37,763$         75.9         

Total 32,627$          1,474$            1,705$      1,958$      37,763$       75.9        

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.

MCDOUGALL GAULEY LLP
SUMMARY OF LEGAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS



 
IN ACCOUNT WITH 

 

 
   

 barristers and solicitors  
 (306) 653-1212 

500 - 616 Main Street 
Saskatoon, Saskatchewan S7H 0J6 

 

   
 Brent Warga 

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. 
360 Main Street, Suite 2300 
Winnipeg, MB 
Canada R3C 3Z3 
 

Date: February 21, 2020 
Invoice No.: 621961  
File Number: 549268.9/IAS 
 
GST 890275415  
PST 1887298  

 

    
 

 
 

A monthly late charge of 18% per annum will be applied to unpaid balance after 30 days. 

 
 

 RE: 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc.  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH:  
 
. 
 DATE DESCRIPTION  
 15/08/19 Correspondence from Warga   
 15/08/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 15/08/19 Telephone attendance on Warga   
 19/08/19 Review of sales and information package   
 21/08/19 Review Receiver's Proposed Information and Sales Package   
 21/08/19 Correspondence to Fritz   
 21/08/19 To review and revise draft SIP materials   
 21/08/19 To receipt of email from Fritz   
 02/10/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 02/10/19 Review of file re: sales process issues   
 02/10/19 Telephone attendance on Warga and Frith   
 02/10/19 Telephone attendance on Warga   
 02/10/19 Telephone attendance on Warga   
 02/10/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 02/10/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 07/11/19 To: emails from and to I. Sutherland; review engineer's contract; consideration of legal issues, re: 

revisions to contract   
 07/11/19 Correspondence from Fritz   
 07/11/19 Correspondence to Fritz re: suggested edits to contract   
 07/11/19 Correspondence to Fritz   
 07/11/19 Review of engineering contract   
 03/12/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 03/12/19 Correspondence to Anderson   
 03/12/19 Review of offer to purchase   
 03/12/19 Telephone attendance on Warga re: APA preparation   
 03/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 03/12/19 To receipt of email from Anderson   
 05/12/19 Consideration of purchase and sale issues   
 05/12/19 Document preparation: draft and revise purchase and sale agreement   
 05/12/19 Email to B. Warga, re: draft offer   
 05/12/19 Review title prints, re: target properties   
 05/12/19 Correspondence to Anderson and Ponath   
 05/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga re: relief sought   
 05/12/19 To receipt of email from Anderson - lawyer for purchaser   
 06/12/19 To considering required materials for court application confirming sale   
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A monthly late charge of 18% per annum will be applied to unpaid balance after 30 days. 

 
 

 DATE DESCRIPTION  
 06/12/19 Review and consideration of steps required on application of receiver   
 06/12/19 Correspondence to Anderson   
 06/12/19 To review and revise draft materials   
 06/12/19 To review and revise draft agreement   
 06/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 08/12/19 Correspondence to Warga re: forwarding   
 08/12/19 Correspondence to Warga re: timing of application for SAVO   
 08/12/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 08/12/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 08/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 08/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 08/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 09/12/19 Telephone attendance on Metivier re: court time   
 09/12/19 Telephone attendance on Metivier re: court time   
 10/12/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 10/12/19 Correspondence to Warga   
 10/12/19 Correspondence to Olfert   
 10/12/19 Review of security file   
 10/12/19 To receipt of eail from Warga re: independent security review   
 10/12/19 To receipt of email from Olfert   
 10/12/19 To receipt of email from Olfert   
 11/12/19 Review file (correspondence, sales and info package, receivership order and titles)   
 12/12/19 Review of offer to purchase   
 12/12/19 Review of sales and information packages   
 17/12/19 Consideration of legal issues, re: tax arrears and permitted encumbrances; wording of SAVO, re: 

tax arrears   
 17/12/19 Email from K. Anderson, draft purchase agreement   
 17/12/19 Email from J. Ponath, re: prior encumbrances   
 17/12/19 Email from B. Warga, re: outstanding property taxes   
 17/12/19 Email to K. Anderson   
 17/12/19 Email from and to K. Anderson re: status   
 17/12/19 Email from and to I. Sutherland   
 17/12/19 Email to B. Warga re: property taxes   
 17/12/19 Email to J. Ponath re: update to offer   
 17/12/19 To obtain tax search   
 17/12/19 Telephone attendance on B. Warga   
 17/12/19 Correspondence to Warga re: timing of execution of sale agreement   
 17/12/19 Correspondence to Anderson   
 17/12/19 To consider issues re: property taxes/adjustment   
 17/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 17/12/19 To receipt of email from Anderson   
 17/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 18/12/19 Consideration of property tax issue   
 18/12/19 Email from and to B. Warga regarding property tax   
 18/12/19 Email from and to B. Warga regarding property tax adjustment and closing   
 18/12/19 To attend on file; verify property tax due date and arrears   
 19/12/19 Email from J. Ponath   
 24/12/19 Document preparation: draft and revise purchase agreement (tax adjustments)   
 24/12/19 Email from and to B. Warga, re: status   
 24/12/19 Email from B. Warga, re: revision to purchase agreement   
 24/12/19 Email to J. Ponath, re: revised purchase agreement   
 24/12/19 To receipt of email from Warga   
 02/01/20 Email from J. Ponath re: status   
 02/01/20 Emails from B. Warga and I. Sutherland re: file update   
 02/01/20 Correspondence to Warga re: status of agreement   
 02/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
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A monthly late charge of 18% per annum will be applied to unpaid balance after 30 days. 

 
 

 DATE DESCRIPTION  
 04/01/20 Review and consideration of template Order, template Order notes, precedent materials; 

Consideration of draft Order, affidavit   
 06/01/20 Perusing documents   
 06/01/20 To reviewing affidavit of Gordon Fry and making outline of RBC's security   
 07/01/20 Review letter agreement and all 6 renewals thereto, as well as the irrevocable letter of credit and 

collateral mortgage   
 07/01/20 Review and consideration of Sale and Purchase Agreement; Prepare drat Vesting Order   
 08/01/20 Consideration of legal issues re: schedule of lands to asset purchase agreement   
 08/01/20 Consideration of timing/closing issues re: court application and closing of asset purchase 

transaction   
 08/01/20 Email from J. Ponath   
 08/01/20 Email to and from B. Warga re: closing date request from Purchaser   
 08/01/20 Email to and from B. Warga re: adjustments for property taxes   
 08/01/20 Email to J. Ponath re: revised purchase agreement   
 08/01/20 Review draft purchase agreement re: adjustments   
 08/01/20 Review list of target land; Schedule A to Asset Purchase Agreement   
 08/01/20 To review and revise asset purchase agreement; prepare clean and redlined copies of asset 

purchase agreement   
 08/01/20 Document preparation prepare security review   
 08/01/20 Review the general security agreement, the guarantees and postponements   
 08/01/20 Prepare draft Order; Prepare table of land titles   
 08/01/20 Prepare draft Vesting and Discharge Order; Review list of land titles to be included in draft Order; 

Review correspondence re: timing of application   
 08/01/20 Review and consideration of scope of Order, sealing order; Consideration of closing date and 

implications to APA   
 10/01/20 Prepare Draft Notice of Application, Affidavit to seal Confidential Receiver's Report; Review and 

revise materials   
 15/01/20 Email from and to B. Warga regarding status   
 15/01/20 Email from J. Ponath regarding status   
 15/01/20 Email from and to B. Warga regarding correspondence from purchaser's counsel   
 15/01/20 Telephone attendance on J. Ponath regarding Asset Purchase Agreement   
 15/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 16/01/20 Email from and to J. Ponath   
 16/01/20 Email to B. Warga regarding update   
 20/01/20 To reviewing notice of application, affidavit and draft order   
 21/01/20 Receive and review finalized sales and purchase agreement; Consideration of next steps   
 21/01/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 21/01/20 To review and revise draft security report   
 21/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga re: APA/security review   
 22/01/20 To review draft Security Opinion; to consider issues   
 22/01/20 Email from B. Warga   
 22/01/20 Email I. Sutherland to B. Warga   
 22/01/20 To attend on file; consideration of next steps   
 22/01/20 Consideration of additional security we will need to review as we are seeking a distribution of 

funds, as well as additional language to put in opinion   
 22/01/20 Perusing documents   
 22/01/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 22/01/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 22/01/20 To review and revise draft security opinion   
 22/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga - court time   
 22/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 23/01/20 Consideration of priority between Builders lien claimant, subsequent mortgagees, enforcement 

charge holder and second registered security interest against RBC's priority   
 23/01/20 Review 3 mortgages of 0756369 B.C. Ltd, mortgage of A3J Construction Ltd., builders' lien claim 

and judgment search of 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. for purpose of preparing opinion letter   
 23/01/20 Review and revise security opinion   
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A monthly late charge of 18% per annum will be applied to unpaid balance after 30 days. 

 
 

 DATE DESCRIPTION  
 23/01/20 Telephone attendance on Warga re: security opinion/need to review G.S.A.   
 24/01/20 To review and revise draft Security Opinion   
 24/01/20 Email with counsel for purchaser re: general security agreement.   
 27/01/20 Review revised Security Opinion   
 27/01/20 Email Local Registrar re: court time availability   
 27/01/20 Review General security agreement between 7 G.B. Enterprises Inc. and 0756369 B.C. Ltd.   
 27/01/20 Review and revise security opinion   
 27/01/20 To review and revise draft materials   
 28/01/20 Review and revise draft sale approval and vesting order   
 28/01/20 Correspondence to Warga re: draft materials/timing of report   
 28/01/20 To review and revise draft Application   
 28/01/20 To review and revise draft Affidavit   
 28/01/20 To review and revise draft Order   
 29/01/20 Review draft Notice of Application, draft Affidavit of Richards and draft Sale Approval, 

Distribution and Vesting Order   
 29/01/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 30/01/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 30/01/20 Correspondence to Registrar - Court House   
 30/01/20 To review and revise security opinion   
 30/01/20 Telephone attendance on Warga   
 30/01/20 Telephone attendance on Warga   
 30/01/20 To receipt of email from Warga re: opinion   
 30/01/20 To receipt of email from Registrar - Court House   
 30/01/20 To receipt of email from Registrar - Court House   
 31/01/20 To consider scope of security opinon review - enforceability of security against trustee   
 31/01/20 Consideration of security position of RBC as against the Trustee in Bankruptcy   
 31/01/20 Correspondence re: scope of security opinion   
 31/01/20 Review and revise Notice of Application, Draft Order, Affidavit to seal application; Prepare 

drafting notes for review by Receiver (Deloitte)   
 02/02/20 Document preparation prepare first draft of brief of law   
 02/02/20 Review First Report of the Receiver and Confidential Report of the Receiver   
 03/02/20 To review and revise draft materials   
 04/02/20 Review and revise second draft of brief   
 04/02/20 Review and revise third draft of brief   
 04/02/20 Correspondence to Registrar - Court House   
 04/02/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 05/02/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 06/02/20 Receive and review Receiver's Reports; Amend Notice of Application and Draft Order re: draft 

Receiver's Reports; Prepare note to file re: outstanding questions and comments on draft materials   
 06/02/20 To review and revise draft materials   
 07/02/20 Correspondence to Metiver   
 07/02/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 10/02/20 Correspondence to Metivier   
 10/02/20 To receipt of email from Metivier   
 10/02/20 To receipt of email from Metivier   
 11/02/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 13/02/20 Email from client re: court dates   
 13/02/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
 18/02/20 Consideration of revisions to security opinion   
 18/02/20 Email Local Registrar re: court time availability   
 18/02/20 Email from registrar re: court time   
 18/02/20 Correspondence from Metivier   
 18/02/20 Correspondence to Metivier   
 18/02/20 Correspondence to Warga   
 18/02/20 To receipt of email from Warga   
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A monthly late charge of 18% per annum will be applied to unpaid balance after 30 days. 

 
 

 
 TOTAL FEES: $32,626.50) 
 
 
 DISBURSEMENTS AND OTHER CHARGES: 
. 
 LTO - Access/Output Fees* Saskatoon Title 

Search 
 $616.00) 

 Document Copying*  $224.35) 
 Long Distance*  $4.40) 
 PPR Search*(Saskatoon)  $27.00) 
 LTO - Searches*  $588.00) 
 Corporate  Registry(Saskatoon)*  $6.00) 
 LTO - Judgement Registry Searches/Detail* 

SASKATOON 
 $8.00) 

 
 TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $1,473.75) 
 *GST applicable 
 
 GST @ 5.00% on fees and taxable disbursements: $1,705.02) 
 PST @ 6.00% on fees: $1,957.59) 
 
 TOTAL FEES, DISBURSEMENTS & TAXES: $37,762.86) 
 
  
 IAS/SKB  
 E&OE
 



 
 

Exhibit F – Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the period July 16, 2019 to 
February 21, 2019 

 



Amount
Receipts

GST refund 22,036$              
Insurance refund 26                       
Interest 369                     
Receiver's borrowings 100,000              
Sale of Property - Deposit 314,263              

Total Receipts 436,695              

Disbursements
Advertising 1,597                  
Filing fees 70                       
GST paid on disbursements 959                     
GST paid on Receiver fees 2,708                  
Insurance 2,809                  
Mail redirection 320                     
Property taxes 38,512                
Receiver fees and disbursements 54,045                
Repairs and maintenance 14,458                
Travel 114                     

Total Disbursements 115,592              

Excess of Receipts over Disbursements - Funds Held in Trust as at February 21, 2020 321,103$            

7 G.B. ENTERPRISES INC.
STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

for the period of July 16, 2019 to February 21, 2020
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