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Court File No.: CV-19-00618506-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

BETWEEN:
BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —

BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDINGS LLC

Respondents

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION PURSUANT TO SECTION 243(1) OF THE
BANKRTUPCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED; AND
SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED

NOTICE OF MOTION
(returnable July 28, 2020)

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte), in its capacity as the court-appointed receiver
and manager (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties of Best Made Toys
International, ULC (“BMT”), Best Made Toys LLC, Best Made Toys Global Enterprises
Limited (“BMTGE”) and Best Made Toys Holdings LLC (collectively, the “Company”), will
make a motion to a judge presiding over the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List)
(the “Court”) on July 28, 2020, at 9:30 a.m., or as soon after. Please refer to the conference
details attached as Schedule “A” hereto in order to attend the motion and advise if you intend to

join the motion by emailing amanda.campbell@dentons.com.
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PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The motion is to be heard orally.

THE MOTION IS FOR:

1. An Order, substantially in form attached hereto as TAB 3 of the Motion Record, for the

following relief (the “Distribution and Discharge Order”):

(2)

(b)

(©)

(d)

(e)

abridging the time for service of the Notice of Motion herein, Motion Record and
the First Report of Deloitte, in its capacity as Receiver, dated July 22, 2020 (the
“First Report”) so that this Motion is properly returnable on July 28, 2020, and

dispensing with further service thereof;

approving the First Report and the activities of the Receiver as described therein;

approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements dated July 21,

2020 (the “Receiver’s R&D”);

authorizing the Receiver to make distributions to certain employees of BMTGE

on account of the BMTGE Employee Claims (as defined herein);

authorizing an interim distribution to BMO in the amount of USD4,400,000, (the
“Interim BMO Distribution”), and a final distribution of the remaining cash in

the receivership estate to BMO following (the “Final BMO Distribution”):

(1) the payment of the Remaining Fees (as defined herein), plus any other

amounts outstanding pursuant to the Receiver’s charge; and

(i1) the payment of BMTGE Employee Claims, with such claims to be

delivered and paid within 45 days after the granting of the proposed

NATDOCS\47673503\V-4



-3

Distribution and Discharge Order, failing which the amount of the

BMTGE Employee Claims shall be distributed to BMO;

® approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver as set out in the affidavit of
Jorden Sleeth sworn July 22, 2020, and the fees and disbursements of the
Receiver’s independent counsel, Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons”), as set out in
the affidavit of Robert Kennedy sworn July 22, 2020 (collectively, the “Fee

Affidavits™);

(2) discharging Deloitte as Receiver; and

(h) such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court

may permit.

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE:

BACKGROUND

1. The Company was a global provider of plush toys, pet toys, and pet beds.

2. BMO provided term loan and operating financing to BMT. On April 30, 2018, BMT was

indebted to BMO for USD12.1 million.

3. On May 4, 2018, BMO engaged Deloitte to perform an independent business review with
respect to BMT's affairs and financial position, including an assessment of BMO's
collateral position. BMO continued to support BMT until late February 2019 when BMO
determined that it could not provide an additional USDS8.0 million of liquidity for BMT

to complete production of open orders.
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By April 5, 2019, BMT was no longer able to meet its liabilities in the ordinary course

without third party capital injections. Neither BMO nor BMT's shareholders were willing

to make further advances or equity injections. As of April 10, 2019, advances made by

BMO under the Credit Agreement were approximately USD22.4 million.

5. By Order of this Court dated April 25, 2019 (the “Appointment Order”), Deloitte was

appointed as the receiver and manager of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of

the Company.

6. Following its appointment as Receiver pursuant to the Appointment Order, the Receiver,

among other things:

(2)

(b)

(©)

(d)

(e)

completed and mailed out the notice and statement of the Receiver as required by

the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (the “BIA”);

established the Receiver’s website and posted relevant Receivership materials
(including the court orders, motion materials, Receiver’s reports, notices to

creditors and service lists, and bankruptcy materials) to the website;

responded to employee and other stakeholder questions;

undertook steps to comply with its responsibilities under the Wage Earner

Protection Program Act (“WEPPA”);

undertook steps to safeguard the Company’s premises and take possession of hard
copy records in order to collect BMT’s accounts receivable and to prepare

relevant tax filings; and
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® undertook a review of BMT’s third-party storage agreements to determine
whether there was any value in negotiating a settlement for pre-filing arrears and

release of the inventory for realization purposes;

(2) submitted a comprehensive claim package to EDC and engaged in various
discussions with EDC in respect of EDC’s guarantee of 50% of any shortfall on a
BMO revolving facility granted in favour of BMT, which resulted in a payout by

EDC to the Receiver in the amounts of USD1,556,214 and CAD339,004.;

(h) undertook a review of BMT’s booked open ordered and issued notices to notices
to BMT’s global customers and Chinese-based contract manufacturers on April

26, 2019, advising of the Appointment Order;

(1) held discussions with various parties to determine their interest in acquiring some
or all of the assets of BMT from the Receiver and also contacted several

liquidators to obtain assessments of BMT’s assets in a liquidation;

() entered into a transaction with KellyToy Worldwide Inc. (“KellyToy”) for the
exclusive rights to the BMT open order book, which included a USD50,000
deposit, a $50,000 amount to be held in escrow, plus a percentage of the gross

margin realized by KellyToy on completed orders; and

(k) negotiated an agreement for the sale of BMT’s excess inventory and warehouse
assets with KellyToy and executed an Asset Purchase Agreement (“APA”) on
June 27, 2019, pursuant to which the Receiver collected USD 615,000 in

consideration for the assets and the goods delivered.
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BMT BANKRUPTCY

Paragraph 3(r) of the Appointment Order authorized the Receiver to “execute an
assignment into bankruptcy, assigning the Debtors into bankruptcy, or to consent to an

application for the making of a bankruptcy order against the Debtors”, which includes

BMT.

On December 20, 2019, the Receiver filed an assignment in bankruptcy in respect of
BMT, only. The BMT estate has no funding or assets to pay the bankruptcy
administration costs.  The costs of the BMT bankruptcy will be funded from the

Receivership (which is supported by BMO).

Since the date of bankruptcy, the Trustee has complied with the notice requirements set
out in the BIA. The first meeting of creditors of BMT (the “FMOC”) was held at the
Trustee’s premises, 8 Adelaide Street West, Toronto Ontario, on January 8, 2020.

Deloitte’s appointment as trustee in bankruptcy was affirmed at the FMOC.

BMO SECURITY OPINION

10.

11.

Pursuant to paragraph 18 of the Appointment Order, the Receiver engaged Dentons, to

act as the Receiver’s counsel.

The Receiver obtained a security opinion from Dentons with respect to the BMO security
documentation (the "Security Opinion") and, subject to the customary qualifications and
assumptions contained therein, the Security Opinion opines that: (a) the security held by
BMO is valid and legally enforceable against BMT, and (b) BMO has a perfected

security interest in the personal property of BMT (the “Property”).
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Subject to the customary assumptions and qualifications contained in the Security

Opinion, Dentons has opined that the BMO security documents:

(a) constitute legal, valid and binding security interests in favour of BMO in the

Property;

(b) are sufficient to secure the payment and performance of the obligations secured

thereby; and

(©) are properly registered and perfected in the applicable jurisdiction.

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

13.

As set out in the Receiver’s R&D, the excess of receipts over disbursement is
approximately USD4.675 million. As further described below, the Receiver is seeking
authorization to distribution of this surplus to BMO by way of the Interim BMO

Distribution and the Final BMO Distribution.

BMTGE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS

Hong Kong Operations

14.

On April 25, 2019, following the granting of the Appointment Order, the Receiver
attended a teleconference with BMT’s CEO and all of BMT’s Hong Kong-based
employees where the Receiver advised the employees that following the Appointment
Order there was an immediate closure of the BMT business and termination of all BMT
staff. The Receiver effected termination of these employees by way of writing to them

immediately following the teleconference.
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16.

17.

18.

19.
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BMTGE did not have any significant assets, with the exception of accounts receivable

which are collected and paid into a Canadian bank account held with BMO.

BMO issued a Statutory Demand on BMTGE (Hong Kong entity) on May 26, 2019 in
preparation for a possible insolvency proceeding in Hong Kong (the “HK Demand”).

No payment was made by BMTGE to BMO pursuant to the HK Demand.

Accounts receivable collections into the BMTGE bank account at BMO total
USD712,000 as at June 30, 2020. The Receiver has not transferred or distributed any

funds held in this account.

The Receiver understands that the only creditor claims related to BMTGE with any
priority that may rank ahead of BMO’s security interest are in respect of statutory
amounts due to terminated employees. The Receiver understands from its independent
counsel, Dentons, that under Hong Kong employment legislation, terminated employees
are entitled to a limited priority payment upon their termination and such amounts rank in
priority to secured interests pursuant to the governing legislation. The Receiver enlisted
the assistance of its Hong Kong member firm to calculate the limited priority termination
obligations due to BMTGE’s former employees and a total of 8 employees are owed an
aggregate of approximately HKD 152,354.25 (approximately USD20,000) (the

“BMTGE Employee Payment”).

To satisty the statutory obligations due to BMTGE’s Hong Kong based employees, the
Receiver is seeking the Court’s approval to pay such amounts from the funds in

BMTGE’s Canadian domiciled account at BMO.
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The Receiver has already attempted on a number of occasions to communicate with the
HK Employees, with limited success (i.e. three of eight former employees have
responded to the Receiver as of the date of this First Report). The Receiver would issue
such payments, if approved by the Court, after these former employees execute releases
of the Receiver, BMTGE, BMT and their affiliates. As part of that process, the Receiver
will need to communicate the HK Employees and facilitate the delivery of the employee
claim in short order. As such, the Receiver is requesting that the Court order the
Receiver to continue attempts to locate and communicate with the HK employees and
deliver the BMTGE Employee Payment for an additional 45 day period, failing which,
the Employee Claim Payment, or any part thereof, be distributed to BMO pursuant to its

secured claim.

BMO DISTRIBUTIONS

21.

22.

23.

Based on the Security Opinion: (i) the security held by BMO is valid and legally

enforceable against BMT, and (i) BMO has a perfected security interest in the Property.

As of July 20, 2020, BMO is owed approximately USD9,371,583 and CAD693,25 (the

“BMO Indebtedness”).

There are sufficient funds in the estate as outlined in the Receiver’s R&D to support the
BMO Interim Distribution, as a partial repayment of the BMO Indebtedness. The
Receiver is of the view that the BMO Interim Distribution is appropriate and reasonable

in the circumstances.
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As shown in the Receiver's R&D, as at June 30, 2020, the Receiver is holding
approximately USD4.675 million. There will be insufficient funds in the receivership
estate to fully repay the BMO Indebtedness. Accordingly, the Receiver is also seeking
approval to further distribute all remaining funds collected by the Receiver to BMO,
subject to the payment of the WEPPA Claim, any BMTGE Employee Claims paid within

the Employee Payment Period, and the Remaining Fees.

Once the WEPPA Claim is paid by the Receiver and the BMTGE Employee Claims are
finally addressed (or the 45 days expires), the Receiver proposes to pay the balance of the
funds it holds to BMO on account of the BMO Indebtedness (the Final BMO

Distribution).

PROFESSIONAL FEES

26.

27.

28.

29.

The Receiver, and its legal counsel, Dentons, have maintained detailed records of their

professional time and costs since the date of the Appointment Order.

The total fees of the Receiver during the period from April 25, 2019 to July 17, 2020,
total $508,888.75 for fees and disbursements, together with and HST in the amount of

$66,155.61, totalling $575,044.36.

The total fees of Dentons, in its capacity as counsel to the Receiver, during the period
from April 17, 2019 to July 20, 2020 total $170,198.65 for fees and disbursements, and

HST in the amount of $22,125.83, totalling $192,324.48.

The Receiver estimates that it will incur a further CAD30,000 in fees and disbursements,

plus HST to complete the administration of the receivership proceeding (the “Receiver’s
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Remaining Fees”). Dentons estimate that it will incur a further CAD20,000 in fees and
disbursements, plus HST (the “Dentons Remaining Fees”, and together with the

Receiver’s Remaining Fees, the “Remaining Fees™).

The Receiver is of the view that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its
counsel are reasonable in the circumstances and have been or will be validly incurred in
accordance with the provisions of the Receivership Order. The Receiver is currently
seeking Court approval of such fees as set out in the Fee Affidavits, together with the

Remaining Fees.

DISCHARGE OF THE RECEIVER

31.

32.

As detailed in the First Report, the Receiver has worked diligently to carry out its duties

in good faith and in the best interest of BMT’s stakeholders.

All of the Receiver’s duties as set out in the Appointment Order have been completed,

subject to (collectively, the “Remaining Activities”):

(a) the payment of WEPPA claims and the BMTGE Employee Claims;

(b) the payment of all invoices outstanding for professional fees of the Receiver and

its counsels together with any final estate expenses;

(©) completing the BMO Interim Distribution, and BMO Final Distribution; and

(d) the filing of the Receiver’s final report pursuant to Section 246(3) of the BIA with

the Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy.
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33. Once the Receiver has completed the Remaining Activities, the Receiver will file the
Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, substantially in the form attached as Schedule “A” to
the proposed Distribution and Discharge Order, with the Court certifying that all

Remaining Activities have been completed.

34, Such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may

permit.

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE WILL BE USED AT THE

HEARING OF THE MOTION:

35. The First Report of the Receiver; and

36. Such further and other material as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may
permit.
DATED: July 22,2020 DENTONS CANADA LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, Ontario M5SK 0A1

Robert Kennedy (LSO #474070)
Tel:  (416) 367-6756

Fax: (416) 863-4592
robert.kennedy@dentons.com

Mark A. Freake (LSO #63656H)
Tel:  (416) 863-4456
mark.freake(@dentons.com

Lawyers for Deloitte Restructuring Inc., in its
capacity as Court-appointed Receiver of Best
Made Toys International., ULC, et al.

TO: SERVICE LIST
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Schedule “A”
Conference Details to join Motion via Zoom

Join Zoom Meeting:
https://dentons.zoom.us/}/94677154101?pwd=Z3BmQi9HTiNyZTFtSHROSnFEc2xuUT09

Meeting ID: 946 7715 4101
Password: 352062

Dial in information
Toll Free: 1 (855) 703-8985
Local: 1 (647) 558-0588
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Court File No. CV-19-00618506-00CL
ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST)
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BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant

-and-

BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDING LLC
Respondents

FIRST REPORT OF DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC. IN ITS CAPACITY AS
RECEIVER OF BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL ULC AND ITS AFFILIATES

DATED JULY 22, 2020
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INTRODUCTION AND PURPOSE OF THIS REPORT

1. Best Made Toys International, ULC (“BMT” or the “Company”) and its affiliates, was a
global provider of plush toys, pet toys, and pet beds. Bank of Montreal (“BMO”) provided
term loan (the “Term Loan”) and operating financing (the “Revolver Facility”’) to BMT.
On April 30, 2018, BMT was indebted to BMO for USD12.1 million (consisting of the
Term Loan in the amount of USDS8.6 million and the Revolver Facility in the amount of
USD3.5 million). On May 4, 2018, BMO engaged Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”)
to perform an independent business review with respect to BMT's affairs and financial
position, including an assessment of BMO's collateral position. BMO continued to support
BMT until late February 2019 when BMO determined that it could not provide an additional
USDS8.0 million of liquidity for BMT to complete production of open orders. By April 5,
2019, BMT was no longer able to meet its liabilities in the ordinary course without third
party capital injections. Neither BMO nor BMT's shareholders were willing to make further
advances or equity injections. As of April 10, 2019, advances made by BMO under the
Credit Agreement were approximately USD22.4 million, (consisting of the Term Loan in

the amount of USD8.6 million and the Revolver Facility in the amount of USD13.8 million).

2. On April 25, 2019, Deloitte was appointed receiver (the “Receiver”), without security, of
all of the assets, undertakings and properties of BMT and its subsidiaries set out in the
corporate organization chart in Appendix “A” hereto pursuant to an Order (the
“Appointment Order”) of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the

“Court™). A copy of the Appointment Order is attached hereto as Appendix “B”.

3. On April 23, 2019, the proposed Receiver issued a pre-filing report (the “Pre-Filing

Report™) to the Court to provide information with respect to the background of the BMT
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business, the financial difficulties facing the BMT business and to support the application

made by BMO for the Appointment Order. A copy of the Pre-Filing Report is attached

hereto as Appendix “C”.

4. The Appointment Order, the Pre-Filing Report, and other relevant information filed in

connection with the receivership proceedings can be accessed on the Receiver’s website at

www.insolvencies.deloitte.ca/en-ca/bmt (the “Website”).

5. The purpose of this first report of the Receiver (the “First Report”) is to:

a.

provide an update in respect of the activities of the Receiver since its appointment,
including an update on the marketing and sale of the BMT assets, and the recovery of

accounts receivable of BMT;

provide the Court with an update regarding the status of certain BMT entities which

are domiciled in Hong Kong and China;

provide the Court with an update on the security opinions rendered to the Receiver by
its independent counsel, Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons”), in respect of the security
granted by BMT to BMO and, based on such opinion, seek the Court’s approval to

make distributions to BMO on account of its security interests;

advise the Court of contracts terminated by the Receiver and other lien matters;

advise the Court of the bankruptcy of BMT;

provide the Court with an update on the Receiver’s receipts and disbursements for the

period of April 25, 2019 to July 21, 2020;
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g. provide the Court with the necessary information to support making an Order (the

“Distribution and Discharge Order”) that, among other things:
i.  approves the Receiver’s actions and activities to date;

ii.  approves the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements for the period
April 25, 2019 to July 21, 2020 (the “Receiver’s R&D”), attached hereto as

Appendix “D”;

iii.  authorizes the Receiver to make distributions to certain employees of Best Made
Toys Global Enterprises Limited (“BMTGE”) on account of limited employee

priority claims (the “BMTGE Employee Claims”);
iv. authorizes the Receiver to make distributions to BMO as follows:

* an interim distribution in the amount of USD4.4 million (the “Interim BMO

Distribution”); and

* a final distribution of the remaining cash in the receivership estate to BMO

following (the “Final BMO Distribution”):

* the payment of the Remaining Fees (as defined herein), plus any other

amounts outstanding pursuant to the Receiver’s charge; and

* the payment of priority claims which include the WEPPA Claim (as
defined herein) and the BMTGE Employee Claims, such claims to be

delivered and paid within 45 days after the granting of the proposed
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Distribution and Discharge Order with any residual proceeds being paid

to BMO;

v.  approves the Receiver’s activities and the fees and costs of the Receiver and its
legal counsel as described in this First Report, together with the estimated

Remaining Fees; and

vi. discharges the Receiver upon the filing of a Receiver’s discharge certificate,
attached as Schedule “A” to the proposed Distribution and Distribution Order
(the “Receiver’s Discharge Certificate”), certifying that the Remaining
Activities (as defined herein) have been completed to the satisfaction of the

Receiver.

6. Capitalized terms not defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the

Appointment Order.

TERMS OF REFERENCE

7. In preparing this First Report, Deloitte has been provided with, and has relied upon
unaudited, draft and/or internal financial information, BMT's books and records, discussions
with management of BMT, discussions with BMO and its legal counsel, and information
from third-party sources (collectively, the “Information”). Except as described in the Pre-

Filing Report and this First Report:

a. Deloitte has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal consistency and use
in the context in which it was provided. However, Deloitte has not audited or otherwise

attempted to verify the accuracy or completeness of the Information in a manner that
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would wholly or partially comply with Canadian Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant
to the Chartered Professional Accountants Canada Handbook and, accordingly, Deloitte
expresses no opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under CAS in respect of

the Information; and

b. Deloitte has prepared this First Report in its capacity as Receiver to provide
background to the Court for its consideration of the relief being sought. Parties using
the First Report other than for the purposes outlined herein are cautioned that it may

not be appropriate for their purposes.

8. Unless otherwise stated, all dollar amounts contained in the Report are expressed in USD,
the Company’s reporting currency. Financial information reported herein is presented on a

consolidated basis and not at the individual operating company level.

UPDATE ON THE RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES TO DATE
Creditor Communications

9. Shortly after the Receiver’s appointment, the Receiver:

a. completed and mailed out the notice and statement of the Receiver as required by the

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (the “BIA”);

b. established the Website and posted relevant receivership materials (including the Court
Orders, motion materials, Receiver’s reports, notices to creditors and service lists, and

bankruptcy materials); and

c. responded to employee and other stakeholder questions. This activity has been ongoing
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throughout the receivership administration.
Wage Earner Protection Program Administration
10. The Receiver has undertaken steps to comply with its responsibilities under the Wage

Earner Protection Program Act (“WEPPA”), including:
a. calculating unpaid wage amounts for each employee;

b. assessing each employee’s eligibility for a claim for termination notice and severance

pay;
c. calculating the vacation entitlement owed to each employee; and

d. entering all of this information into the Service Canada website used to administer

WEPPA.

11.  On May 3, 2019, the Receiver mailed packages to 16 former employees so that they could
file WEPPA claims for amounts due to them as a result of their termination. This mailing
contained the claim summary for each employee, a proof of claim and an instruction letter
advising claimants how to submit their WEPPA claim to receive payment thereunder. As
of July 21, 2020, the Receiver has received proofs of claim from all 16 employees in respect
of their WEPPA entitlement. The Receiver required the assistance of 15 of these former
employees and paid their outstanding wages and vacation pay; accordingly, these former
employees’ WEPPA claims are only in respect of unsecured termination notice pay and

severance pay.

12.  The Receiver determined and Service Canada has confirmed that the quantum of the super-

priority payable to Service Canada for unpaid wages and vacation pay pursuant to section
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81.4 of the BIA to be approximately CAD2,000 (the “WEPPA Claim”). The WEPPA
Claim ranks in priority to all creditors and will be paid to Service Canada following the

issuance of the proposed Distribution and Discharge Order.

Safeguarding the Company’s premises — Insurance

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

The Company’s premises consisted of two leased warehouses which were used for
production, storage and shipping. The Company’s main operating premises was located at
120 St. Regis Crescent North, Toronto, ON, and included an office area for approximately
20 people (the “St. Regis Facility”). The second facility was located at 53 Bakersfield
Street, North York, ON (the “Bakersfield Warehouse”) which was used primarily for

warehousing and storage.

On April 25, 2019, following the issuance of the Appointment Order, the Receiver changed

the locks on both of the Company’s leased premises.

The Receiver vacated the premise at St. Regis Facility on October 31, 2019 in accordance
with the requirements of the lease. The Receiver settled a portion of the landlord’s claim in
respect of damage to the building (most of which pre-existed the Receiver’s appointment)

from the security deposit held by the landlord in the amount of CAD25,000.

The Receiver vacated the Bakersfield Warehouse on November 30, 2019.

The Receiver also obtained insurance coverage for BMT's various leased and owned assets.
The insurance coverage was later amended as the insured vehicles were returned and the

quantum of required insurance decreased.
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Recovery of books and records

18.

19.

The Receiver took possession of hard copy records in order to collect BMT’s accounts
receivable and to prepare relevant tax filings. Such records are boxed, inventoried and

stored at off-site storage.

The Receiver engaged BMT’s former IT contractor to backup BMT’s document and email

servers, including any accounting systems and electronic records.

BMT Bankruptcy

20.

21.

22.

23.

Paragraph 3(r) of the Appointment Order authorized the Receiver to “execute an assignment
into bankruptcy, assigning the Debtors into bankruptcy, or to consent to an application for

the making of a bankruptcy Order against the Debtors”, which includes BMT.

On November 5, 2019, the Receiver received notice from Canada Revenue Agency that,
following its audit of BMT’s HST account, BMT had an unremitted HST liability of

CAD235,614.86.

On December 20, 2019, the Receiver filed an assignment in bankruptcy in respect of BMT,
only. Since the BMT bankruptcy estate has no funding or assets to fund the bankruptcy
administration costs, BMO, as the first secured creditor (as discussed further below), agreed

that the costs of the BMT bankruptcy are to be funded from the receivership estate.

Since the date of Bankruptcy, the Trustee has complied with the notice requirements set out
in the BIA. The first meeting of creditors of BMT (the “FMQOC”) was held on January 8§,

2020. Deloitte’s appointment as trustee in bankruptcy was affirmed at the FMOC.
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As detailed in the Pre-Filing Report, EDC guaranteed 50% of any shortfall (the “EDC
Guarantee”) on a new BMO revolving facility granted in favour of BMT (the “EDC

Revolver”).

Deloitte, with BMO’s assistance, submitted a claim to EDC on February 11, 2020, with the
expectation that BMO would receive approximately USD2,000,000 pursuant to the EDC
Guarantee. The claim package delivered to EDC included various supporting schedules, as
required by EDC. Deloitte, BMO and EDC held various calls to discuss the claim and
complete amendments as required by EDC. On April 9, 2020, a claim payout figure of
USD1,556,214 and CAD339,004 was agreed to by all parties (the “EDC Payment”). EDC

has paid the EDC Payment to BMO.

EDC will therefore have a subrogated unsecured claim against BMT to the extent of the

EDC Payment.

STATUS OF THE BUSINESS AND MARKETING OF THE CANADIAN ASSETS

Open orders

27.

Immediately following the Appointment Order, the Receiver determined BMT had
approximately USD23.0 million of booked open orders due to ship to customers for the
remainder of 2019 (the “Open Order Book™). The Receiver issued notices to BMT’s global
customers and Chinese-based contract manufacturers on April 26, 2019, advising of the
Appointment Order and the Receiver’s intention to provide a further update on the status of

customer orders by no later than May 3, 2019.
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If BMT’s customer shipping windows were not met, those customers could cancel orders or
otherwise demand set-offs for late delivery. As shipping windows are pushed further into
the future, the risk of losing the order or otherwise delivering the order late for no profit is
greatly increased. BMT did not have sufficient cash flow to fund current orders on hand,

and BMO was not willing to fund the completion of open orders.

The time sensitive nature of these open orders (i.e. production and shipping time to meet
fall delivery dates) required the Receiver needed to market the Open Order Book
expeditiously. The specialized nature of the plush toy industry meant that direct competitors
with the operational, product specification and financial wherewithal to reconfirm and
execute the orders for customers were the most likely potential purchasers for BMT’s open

orders.

Prior to the Receiver’s appointment, Deloitte, in its capacity as financial advisor to BMO
ran an informal process to solicit investment in or the sale of BMT between January and
March, 2019. During that process, Deloitte contacted 97 potentially interested parties (i.e.
toy manufacturers/competitors), however, none were interested in acquiring BMT or
providing an investment on terms that were acceptable to BMT or BMO. In the summer of
2018, Deloitte also had discussions with 25 potential investors/purchasers to canvass their
interest in acquiring or investing in BMT. No acceptable expressions of interest were

received at that time.

Following its appointment, the Receiver held discussions with eleven parties to determine
their interest in acquiring some or all of the assets of BMT from the Receiver. The Receiver

also contacted three liquidators to obtain assessments of BMT’s assets in a liquidation. The
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only offer the Receiver obtained that attributed value to the Open Order Book was from
KellyToy Worldwide Inc. (“KellyToy”). After consultation with BMO, the Receiver
entered into an agreement with KellyToy, as amended (the “KellyToy Agreement”) that
provided for a USD50,000 non-refundable deposit in exchange for the exclusive rights to
the Open Order Book, a USD50,000 amount to be held in escrow (the “Open Order
Escrow”), plus a percentage of the gross margin realized by KellyToy on completed orders
(a “Gross Margin Payment”). A copy of the KellyToy Agreement is attached hereto as

Appendix “E”.

The Receiver understands that in working the Open Order Book, KellyToy experienced
considerable difficulty working with BMT’s Chinese manufacturers for the following

reasons:

a. BMO’s security did not extend over BMT’s Chinese operations, and therefore the

Receiver did not have authority to effect control over these operations;

b. BMT’s other direct competitors were actively working to undermine the completion

of the orders in China;

c. certain of BMT’s Chinese employees were actively working to undermine the sale of
the Open Order Book notwithstanding the Receiver’s correspondence to them and

direction to cease such activities; and

d. BMT’s indebtedness to Chinese manufacturers was approximately USD4.9 million at
the time of the Appointment Order and many factories were unwilling to take any

further risks by dealing with KellyToy or be affiliated with BMT in any way.
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33.  On August 20, 2019, the Receiver was informed by KellyToy that the open order book sales
had been disappointing for them, and they had only been able to complete one order at that

time. As a result of the foregoing, no Gross Margin Payment was paid by KellyToy to the

Receiver.

34.  The Receiver did not return the Open Order Escrow and negotiated with KellyToy to apply
this amount to fund reimbursable expenses due from KellyToy, as further described below.

Inventory and warehouse equipment

35.  Following the execution of the KellyToy Agreement, the Receiver began marketing the sale
of BMT’s excess inventory and warehouse equipment. Based on a review of the BMT
current inventory, the Receiver determined that (as at May 9, 2019), BMT had
approximately USD3.152 million of inventory located in the St Regis Facility, the
Bakersfield Warehouse and two third-party storage facilities. A summary of inventory value

(in USD) by location is provided below:

Finished
Location/Possession Address Skin Cost Goods Cost Total Cost

Best Made Toys* 120 St Regis Crescent North, North York, Ontario 92,236 36,116 128,352
Best Made Toys* 53 Bakersfield Street, North York, Ontario 336,040 56,847 392,887
Simtech Supply Chain Management Ltd. Cambridge, Ontario 1,522,251 19,421 1,541,672
Crossdock Systems Missisauga, Ontario 946,245 142,976 1,089,221
Total 2,896,772 255,359 3,152,132
36. The vast majority of inventory on hand in the abovementioned facilities was work-in-

process (otherwise know as the “skin” or “shell” of the toy). Any potential purchaser would
require the expertise and equipment to complete the inventory for sale to the public. Given
the sale and investment solicitation processes undertaken by Deloitte in 2018 and 2019
described above, the Receiver’s renewed marketing efforts targeted various direct
competitors and third-party fibre stuffing facilities with the expertise to complete the

inventory. The Receiver received indications of the forced liquidation value of the
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warehouse assets from various liquidators. The inventory was marketed alongside
warehouse equipment required for production on an en bloc basis which would give a
purchaser the inventory and the equipment required to convert that inventory into finished

goods (the “En Bloc Assets™).

The Receiver communicated with 11 potential purchasers of the En Bloc Assets. Interested
parties were provided with a listing of inventory counts, value and locations, as well as
pictures and specification for the warehouse equipment. Several interested parties travelled
to Toronto from Ottawa, Montreal, Los Angeles, New York and Rotterdam to inspect the

En Bloc Assets, and to discuss the potential purchase of same with the Receiver.

The Receiver obtained four separate bids for the purchase of the En Bloc Assets. An offer
presented by KellyToy represented the best value and fairest sale conditions. On June 4,
2019, the Receiver signed a non-binding term sheet with KellyToy for the acquisition of the
En Bloc Assets, which culminated in the parties executing an asset purchase agreement

dated June 27, 2019 (the “APA”). A copy of the APA is attached hereto as Appendix “F”.
Pursuant to the APA, the Receiver:

a. facilitated the completion of several work in process items to deliver finished goods to
KellyToy. KellyToy was to reimburse the Receiver for expenses incurred by the

Receiver for the benefit of the Purchaser. The total of such amount was USD458,981;

b. maintained employment of warehouse and production staff to facilitate completion of

the sale (occupation and staff costs were reimbursed by the Purchaser); and

c. soldthe assets as per the APA for USD670,000, subject to a damaged goods adjustment
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(USD55,000 threshold).

The Receiver collected USD615,000 in consideration for the En Bloc Assets as the goods

delivered included damaged goods whose value exceeded USD55,000.

Furniture, fixtures and fittings

41.

Deloitte engaged Platinum Assets Services Inc. to sell various remaining fixed assets which

had been excluded from the APA for total consideration of USD6,412.

STATUS OF HONG KONG OPERATIONS

42.

43.

44,

45.

On April 25, 2019, following the issuance of the Appointment Order, the Receiver attended
a teleconference with BMT’s CEO and all of BMT’s Hong Kong-based employees during
which the Receiver advised the employees that there was an immediate closure of the BMT
business and termination of all BMT staff (in Canada, the U.S., Hong Kong and China).
The Receiver effected termination of all employees by way of writing to them immediately

following the teleconference.

BMT’s Hong Kong entity did not have any significant assets, with the exception of accounts

receivable that are collected and paid into a Canadian bank account held with BMO.

BMO issued a Statutory Demand on BMTGE (Hong Kong entity) on May 26, 2019 in
preparation for a possible insolvency proceeding in Hong Kong (the “HK Demand”). No

payment was made by BMTGE to BMO pursuant to the HK Demand.

The Receiver was of the view that an insolvency proceeding in Hong Kong would not secure
any material realizations for the benefit of BMO and/or other creditors and it would add

further unnecessary costs to the receivership. The Receiver understands that no creditor
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groups would be prejudiced by the lack of formal insolvency proceeding in Hong Kong,
save for any potential employee priority entitlements arising from the closure of BMTGE.
In this regard, the Receiver has reviewed and considered any priority entitlements to Hong

Kong employees as mandated by Hong Kong laws.

The Receiver is seeking an Order of this Court to facilitate the payment of the BMTGE

Employee Claims which total approximately USD20,000 (as discussed below).

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE COLLECTION EFFORTS

47.

48.

49.

As at the date of the Appointment Order, BMT had third party customer accounts receivable
of approximately USD6.8 million, of which approximately USD6.0 million was due to
BMT and approximately USDO0.8 million was due to BMTGE. As noted above, BMTGE

operates a bank account with BMO domiciled in Canada.

Since the date of the Appointment Order through July 21, 2020, the Receiver collected
approximately USD4.5 million from customers, of which USD3.8 million is held in the

Receiver’s trust account and USD712,000 is held in BMTGE’s BMO bank account.

BMT’s customers consisted primarily of major North American retailers. Due to the
operational issues facing BMT over the last two years, as outlined in the Pre-Filing Report,
many customers with significant accounts receivable balances claimed set-offs for the

following reasons:

a. Product was delivered late or not at all thereby missing key promotional windows such
as Black Friday and Valentines Day which resulted in customers incurring costs and

losing profits;

NATDOCS\47775582\V-1



32

- 18 -
b. Incorrect product quantities were delivered to customers, with some customers

receiving too much product and others receiving too little product;

c. Poor sell-through rates realized by the customer which typically resulted in markdowns

on product delivered;

d. Original paperwork provided to the customer as evidence for collection was missing

or incomplete; and

e. BMT had other arrangements with customers whereby BMT committed to pay
amounts for specific charity programs (e.g. BMT agrees to participate in a charity
teddy bear program and therefore had a payable to the customer) and/or marketing
arrangements (e.g. BMT agrees to pay for shelving space and therefore has a payable

due to a customer), which subsequently set-off against the account receivable.

50.  As a result of the above noted set-offs, approximately USD2.3 million of accounts

receivable were deemed by the Receiver to be uncollectable.

STATUS OF STORAGE FACILITIES AND AGREEMENTS

51.  Following the Appointment Order, the Receiver undertook a review of BMT’s third-party
storage agreements to determine whether there was any value in negotiating a settlement for
pre-filing arrears and release of the inventory for realization purposes since all third-party
storage providers asserted a storage lien over the inventory demanding payment of pre-filing

accounts.

52. BMT had four different third-party storage and/or fulfilment contracts, of which the

Receiver determined in consultation with BMO that:
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a. Two storage facilities located in Ontario were commercially viable to continue while

the Receiver marketed the sale of inventory held in those facilities; and

b. Two storage facilities located in Buffalo, New York were not commercially viable to
continue and were terminated by the Receiver and inventory was abandoned as the
outstanding storage costs and costs to recover such inventory was less than the

realizable value of the inventory.

53.  The Receiver paid approximately CAD20,000 in arrears to each of the two storage facilities

that were continued.
OTHER TRUST AND LIEN CLAIMS

54.  On May 22, 2019, the Receiver received a trust claim from PSMA Inc. (“PSMA”), which
is a former sales agent of BMT. In essence, PSMA claims that it is owed sales commissions
in the amount of USD82,194.03 in respect of a payment made by Walgreen Inc. to BMT
and USD7,694.23 in respect of a payment made by “LTD” to BMT (collectively, the
“Claimed Commissions”) and that BMT holds the Claimed Commissions pursuant to a

“constructive trust in favour of PSMA”.

55.  Following receipt of PSMA’s trust claim, Dentons, on behalf of the Receiver, engaged in
various discussions with BMT and with PSMA’s counsel to determine the nature and

validity of PSMA’s asserted trust claim.

56. By letter dated June 26, 2019, Dentons, on behalf of the Receiver, advised PSMA’s counsel

that:

a. the Receiver accepts that there was a verbal agreement in place between BMT and
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PSMA relating to the payment of sales commissions and that BMT has in the past paid

commissions to PSMA pursuant to such agreement;

b. the Receiver is not satisfied that the Claimed Commissions are impressed with a trust
in favour of PSMA because: (i) the documentation provided by PSMA does not
evidence the clear intention to create a trust and indeed does not reference any trust
agreement between BMT and PSMA; (i1)) BMT advised the Receiver that there was no
trust arrangement between BMT and PSMA; (iii) as a general practice, BMT did not
hold commissions payable to PSMA in a trust account or otherwise segregate the funds
in any way; (iv) PSMA has not established a proprietary interest in the goods sold by
BMT to Walgreens or LTD, nor in the proceeds of the sale of such goods; and (v) as a
result of the receivership proceedings and the shortfall to BMT’s secured creditors,
BMT will not be benefit from, nor be unjustly enriched by, the collection accounts

receivable from Walgreens and LTD; and
c. Accordingly, the Receiver denied PSMA’s trust claim.

57. By email dated July 8, 2019, PSMA’s counsel advised Dentons that PSMA would not be
challenging the Receiver’s position regarding PSMA’s trust claim but that PSMA still
wished to assert an unsecured claim against BMT in respect of the Claimed Commissions.
By email dated July 14, 2018, Dentons responded advising PSMA’s counsel that the
Receiver is aware of PSMA’s unsecured claim but would not formally review such claim
unless there was the prospect of a distribution to unsecured creditors. As noted herein, there

are insufficient funds in the receivership estate to support a distribution to BMT’s unsecured
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creditors. As such, the Receiver has not taken any further action in respect in PSMA’s

unsecured claim.

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

58.  Attached hereto as Appendix “D” is the Receiver’s R&D for the period from April 25,2019
through July 21, 2020. As set out in the Receiver’s R&D, the Receiver has realized cash
receipts and disbursements from the following sources (note all amounts in USD):

In the Matter of the Receivership of Best Made Toys International, ULC and its affiliates
Receiver's Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements
For the period April 25,2019 to July 21, 2020
All balances in USD $
CAD balances converted using the Bank of Canada spot rate as at July 21, 2020 (0.7437)

Receipts
Accounts receivable collections 3,805,733
Accounts receivable collections - Hong Kong Account 712,001
Sale of assets to KellyToy 615,000
Income tax refund 594,880
Reimbursement from KellyToy 458,981
HST collected / refunds 147,840
Other 251,528
Total Receipts $ 6,585,963
Disbursements Operating expenses 452,362
Occupation rent 203,365
Wages/Employee expenses 219,062
Source deductions 184,490
Insurance 66,087
Taxes paid 90,439
Professional fees 421,050
Advance to BMO (i.e. payment of BMO legal invoices) 107,383
Cumulative effect of foreign exchange 24,845
Other 141,115
Total Disbursements $ 1,910,198
Excess of receipts over disbursements $ 4,675,765
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As discussed above, pursuant to the APA, KellyToy reimbursed a large portion of the
operating disbursements primarily in respect of occupation rent, and employee wages

incurred in the production of toys for sale to KellyToy’s customers.

As of July 21, 2020, the excess of receipts over disbursement is approximately USD4.675
million. As further described below, the Receiver is seeking authorization to distribute the
surplus after payment of the Remaining Fees and other amounts identified herein to BMO

by way of the Interim BMO Distribution and the Final BMO Distribution.

RECEIVER’S REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO PAY BMTGE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS

6l.

62.

As described herein, accounts receivable collections into the BMTGE bank account at BMO
total USD712,000 as at July 21, 2020. The Receiver has not transferred or distributed any

funds held in this account.

The Receiver understands that the only creditor claims related to BMTGE with any priority
that may rank ahead of BMO’s security interest are in respect of statutory amounts due to
terminated employees. The Receiver understands from Dentons, its independent counsel,
that under Hong Kong employment legislation, terminated employees are entitled to a
limited priority payment upon their termination and such amounts rank in priority to secured
interests governed in Hong Kong. The Receiver enlisted the assistance of its Hong Kong
member firm so that the Receiver could estimate the limited priority termination obligations
due to BMTGE’s former employees. It was determined that a total of 8 employees are owed
an aggregate of approximately HKD152,354.25 (approximately USD20,000) (the

“BMTGE Employee Payment”)

NATDOCS\47775582\V-1



37

223 -
63. BMTGE’s operations consisted of a showroom and liaison office to customers and
factories. It operated out of leased premises which were seized and re-leased by the landlord
shortly after the Receiver’s appointment. The Receiver did not seek recognition of its
appointment in Hong Kong nor did it initiate insolvency proceedings in Hong Kong in order

to preserve costs (as outlined above).

64.  The Receiver understands that BMTGE has unsecured trade payables due to creditors,
however there is no process to call for such claims, nor any assets of BMTGE in Hong Kong

to satisfy such claims following the payment of secured claims.

65.  To address the limited priority claims of the BMTGE employees, the Receiver is seeking
the Court’s approval to pay such priority wage amounts due to them from the funds in
BMTGE’s Canadian domiciled account at BMO. The Receiver has already attempted on a
number of occasions to communicate with the HK Employees with limited success (i.e.
three of eight former employees have responded to the Receiver as of the date of this First
Report). The Receiver would issue such payments, if approved by the Court, after these
former employees execute releases in favour of the Receiver, BMTGE, BMT and their
affiliates. As part of that process, the Receiver will need to communicate with the HK
Employees and facilitate the delivery of the employee claim in short order. As such, the
Receiver is requesting that the Court direct the Receiver to continue attempts to locate and
communicate with the HK employees and deliver the BMTGE Employee Payment for an
additional 45 day period (the “Employee Payment Period”), failing which, the BMTGE

Employee Payment, or any part thereof be distributed to BMO pursuant to its secured claim.
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RECEIVER’S REQUEST TO MAKE DISTRIBUTIONS TO BMO

66.

67.

68.

69.

70.

The Receiver obtained a security opinion from Dentons with respect to the BMO security
documentation (the "Security Opinion") and, subject to the customary qualifications and
assumptions contained therein, the Security Opinion opines that: (a) the security held by
BMO is valid and legally enforceable against BMT, and (b) BMO has a perfected security

interest in all the personal property of BMT (the “Property”).

As of July 20, 2020, BMO is owed approximately USD9,371,583 and CAD693,259 from
BMT (the “BMO Indebtedness”). BMO will suffer a significant shortfall and aside from
certain priority claims discussed herein, is the only economic stakeholder in the BMT

realizations.

During the receivership, BMO’s counsel, Borden Ladner Gervais LLP (“BLG”) provided
legal services to BMO in respect of its loans to BMO during the course of the receivership
administration. These fees (totalling CAD126,609.13, inclusive of disbursements and HST,
CAD144,390.42) were paid by the Receiver out of realization proceeds of BMT as an

advance distribution to BMO and are reflected as such in the Receiver’s R&D.

There are sufficient funds in the estate as outlined in the Receiver’s R&D to support the
Interim BMO Distribution, as a partial repayment of the BMO Indebtedness. The Receiver
is of the view that the Interim BMO Distribution is appropriate and reasonable in the

circumstances.

As shown in the Receiver’s R&D, as at July 21, 2020, the Receiver is holding approximately
USD4.675 million. There will be insufficient funds in the receivership estate to fully repay

the BMO Indebtedness. Accordingly, the Receiver is also seeking approval to further
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distribute all remaining funds collected by the Receiver to BMO, subject to the payment of
the WEPPA Claim, any BMTGE Employee Claims paid within the Employee Payment

Period, and the Remaining Fees.

Once the WEPPA Claim is paid by the Receiver and the BMTGE Employee Claims are
finally addressed (or the 45 days expires), the Receiver proposes to pay the balance of the
funds it holds to BMO on account of the BMO Indebtedness (the “Final BMO

Distribution”).

PROFESSIONAL FEES

72.

73.

74.

The Receiver, and its legal counsel, Dentons, have maintained detailed records of their

professional time and costs since the date of the Appointment Order.

The total fees of the Receiver during the period from April 21, 2019 to July 17, 2020, total
CAD496,332.00, together with expenses and disbursements in the sum of CAD12,556.75
and HST in the amount of CAD66,155.61, totalling CAD575,044.36, as more particularly
described in the Affidavit of Jorden Sleeth sworn July 22, 2020 (the “Sleeth Affidavit”),

attached hereto as Appendix “G”.

The total fees of Dentons, in its capacity as counsel to the Receiver, during the period from
April 17, 2019 to July 20, 2020 total CAD134,642.50, together with expenses and
disbursements in the sum of CAD35,556.15 and HST in the amount of CAD22,125.83,
totalling CAD192,324.48, as more particularly described in the Affidavit of Robert
Kennedy sworn July 22, 2020, (the “Kennedy Affidavit”, and together with the Sleeth

Affidavit, the “Fee Affidavits”) attached hereto as Appendix “H”.
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The Receiver estimates that it will incur a further CAD30,000 in fees and disbursements,
plus applicable taxes (the “Remaining Receiver’s Fees”) to complete the administration of
the receivership proceeding. Dentons estimates that it will incur a further CAD20,000 in
fees and disbursements, plus applicable taxes (the “Remaining Legal Fees” and together

with the Remaining Receiver’s Fees, the “Remaining Fees”).

The Receiver respectfully submits that the Receiver’s fees and disbursements, together with
the Dentons fees and disbursements, as set out in the Fee Affidavits, together with the
estimated Remaining Fees, are reasonable in the circumstances and have been or will be
validly incurred in accordance with the provisions of the Receivership Order. Of note, BMO

has previously approved all the invoices referenced above.

RECEIVER’S DISCHARGE

77.

78.

The Receiver’s remaining activities and duties will include: (i) the payment of the WEPPA
Claim, (ii) continuing attempts to communicate with the BMTGE employees and facilitate
the delivery of Employee Payments within the Employee Payment Period, (iii) the payment
of the Remaining Fees, (iv) completing the Interim BMO Distribution and Final BMO
Distribution, and (v) the filing of the Receiver’s final report pursuant to section 246(3) of
the BIA (collectively, the “Remaining Activities”). Once the Receiver has completed the
Remaining Activities, the Receiver will file the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate with the

Court certifying that the Remaining Activities have been completed.

To the best of the Receiver’s knowledge and belief, all duties of the Receiver as out in the

Appointment Order have been or will be completed and the Receiver respectfully requests
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that this Court grant an Order discharging the Receiver, subject to the Receiver completing

the Remaining Activities.

RECOMMENDATIONS

79.

For the reasons set out above, the Receiver respectfully requests that the Court approve the

Receiver’s request for an Order:

approving the Receiver’s First Report and the activities and conduct of the Receiver

outlined herein;

approving the Receiver’s R&D;

approving and authorizing the Receiver to pay any BMTGE Employee Claims within

the Employee Payment Period, as outlined herein;

approving and authorizing the Receiver make the Interim BMO Distribution and the

Final BMO Distribution, as outlined herein;

approving the professional fees and disbursements of the Receiver and those of'its legal
counsel as more particularly described in the Fee Affidavits, and authorizing the

Receiver to pay all such fees and disbursements from available funds;

discharging the Receiver, subject to the Receiver completing the Remaining Activities

and the filing of the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate; and
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g. declaring that, upon the filing of the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, Deloitte is
released and discharged from any and all liability that Deloitte now has or may
hereafter have by reason of, or in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of
Deloitte while acting in its capacity as Receiver, save and except for the Receiver’s

gross negligence or wilful misconduct.

All of which is respectfully submitted at Toronto, Ontario this 22" day of July, 2020.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC.,
as the Receiver of

Best Made Toys International, ULC and its
affiliates and not in its personal or corporate
capacity

Per:
Jorden Sleeth, CPA, CA, CAIRP, LIT
Senior Vice-President
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Appendix “A”
List of Affiliates

Best Made Toys LL.C

Best Made Toys Global Enterprises Limited
Best Made Toys International, ULC

Best Made Toys Holding LL.C

Best Made Toys (Shanghai) Co Ltd*

*Not subject to these proceedings
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In the Matter of the Receivership of Best Made Toys International, ULC and its affiliates
Receiver's Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements

For the period April 25, 2019 to July 21, 2020
All balances in USD $

CAD balances converted using the Bank of Canada spot rate as at July 21, 2020 (0.7437)

Receipts

Disbursements

Accounts receivable collections

Accounts receivable collections - Hong Kong Account

Sale of assets to Kelly Toys
Income tax refund
Reimbursement from Kelly Toys
HST collected / refunds
Cash on Hand - Hong Kong Account
Open Order Book sale to Kelly Toys
Other
Interest
Sale of assets to other parties
Other receipts
Miscellaneous refunds

Total Receipts

Operating disbursements
Operating expenses
Occupation rent
Wages/Employee expenses
Source deductions
Insurance
Utilities
Storage
Repairs and maintenance
Computer services
Auctioneer commissions
Security
Bank charges
Redirection of mail

Taxes paid on operating disbursements
HST paid
GST paid
PST paid

Receiver's fees and costs
Fees

HST on receiver's fees and costs

Legal fees/disbursements

Fees

HST on legal fees
Cumulative effect of foreign exchange

Total Disbursements

Excess of receipts over disbursements

3,805,733
712,001
615,000
594,880
458,981
147,840
132,673

50,000

51,752

13,958

2,928
216 68,855

$ 6,585,963

452,362

203,365
219,062
184,490
66,087
13,975
7,753
5,900
2,573
1,462
363
964

243 1,159,097

86,342
213

3,884 90,439

381,924

47,887 429,811

182,359

23,647 206,006

24,845

$ 1,910,198

$ 4,675,765
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Court File No. CV-19-00618506-00CL
ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

COMMERCIAL LIST

IN THE MATTER OF Section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, R.S.0. 1990 ¢.C.43, as
amended, and in the matter of Section 243(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C.
1985, c. B-3, as amended

BETWEEN:

BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —

BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDING LLC
Respondents

AFFIDAVIT OF JORDEN SLEETH
(Sworn July 22, 2020)

I, Jorden Sleeth of the Town of Oakville, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE
OATH AND SAY:
1. I am a Senior Vice-President of Deloitte Restructuring Inc., the court appointed receiver
and manager (the “Receiver”) of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Best Made
Toys International, ULC (the “Company”) and its subsidiaries set out in Appendix “A” hereto
(collectively with the Company, “BMT”). As such, I have personal knowledge of the matters to

which I hereinafter refer.

2. Attached hereto as Appendix “B” is a summary of the accounts of the Receiver with
respect to BMT for the periods April 21, 2019 to May 31, 2019, June 1, 2019 to June 30, 2019,
July 1, 2019 to July 31, 2019, August 1, 2019 to August 31, 2019, September 1, 2019 to October
31, 2019, November 1, 2019 to December 31, 2019, January 1, 2020 to March 31, 2020, and
April 1 to July 17, 2020 (the “Billing Period”) along with the detailed accounts issued in respect
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of the Billing Period which include detailed descriptions of the activities, number of hours
worked, applicable hourly rates, and total hours and fees. The Receiver’s average hourly rate
charged over the Period is approximately $391.40. I confirm that these accounts accurately

reflect the services provided by the Receiver in this proceeding for the Billing Period.

3. Based on my review of the accounts referred to herein and my personal knowledge of this
matter, the accounts referred to herein represent a fair and accurate description of the services

provided and the amounts charged by the Receiver.

4. I swear this affidavit in support of the Receiver’s Motion for, among other things,

approval of its fees and disbursements and for no other or improper purpose.

SWORN before me at the City of Toronto,
in the Province of Ontario, on July 22, 2020

Nt N ' -’

JORDEN SLEETH
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
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Appendix “A”
List of Affiliates
Best Made Toys LLC
Best Made Toys Global Enterprises Limited
Best Made Toys International, ULC
Best Made Toys Holding LLC
Best Made Toys (Shanghai) Co Ltd*

*Not subject to these proceedings
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Appendix “B”

Accounts of the Receiver for the period April 21, 2019 to July 17, 2020



In the matter of the Receivership of Best Made Toys International, ULC et al.

Summary of invoices issued by Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
For the Period April 21, 2019 to July 17, 2020

131

Invoice # Period Hours Fees Expenses HST Total
8000642464|April 21 to May 31, 2019 474.81$ 199,312.00 | $ 6,831.96 26,798.78 | $  232,942.74
8000696174 [June 1 to 30, 2019 171.51 % 68,262.50 | $ 250.49 8,906.69 | $ 77,419.68
8000779367[July 1 to 31, 2019 119.51 % 45,070.00 | $ 3,084.80 6,260.12 | $ 54,414.92
8000779356{August 1 to 31, 2019 110.7 1 $ 45,630.00 | $ 492.14 5,995.88 | $ 52,118.02
8000941686|September 1 to October 31, 2019 202.6 | $ 68,047.50 | $ 969.27 8,972.18 | $ 77,988.95
8000983849[November 1 to December 31, 2019 6751 % 20,945.00 | $ 389.13 2,773.44 1 $ 24,107.57
8001136709|January 1 to March 31, 2020 89.81% 35,545.00 | $ 477.36 4,682.91 1 % 40,705.27
8001286491 |April 1 to July 17, 2020 31.7 1 $ 13,520.00 | $ 61.60 1,765.61 | $ 15,347.21

Total 1,268.1 | $496,332.00 | $12,556.75 66,155.61 | $ 575,044.36
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ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Second interim bill in connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC

for the month of June, 2019.

Please see the attached appendices.

Expense

Travel Expenses

Sales Tax

149

Invoice 8000696174

Deloitte LLP
Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: July 26,2019

Client No.: 1332039

WBS#: BES00071

Engagement Partner:  Jorden Sleeth

HST Registration: 133245290RT0001
HST applicable 68,262.50
HST applicable 250.49
HST at 13.00% 8,906.69

Total Amount Due (CAD) 77,419.68

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Invoice Number 8000696174

July 26,2019

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8000696174 77,419.68
Unit)

Payment for invoice
8000696174

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice
number(s) paid

Payment Options

1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory): Preferred Method
The Bank of Nova Scotia
Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002 ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number: 1363514

2. Wire Payment:
The Bank of Nova Scotia

Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:

Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number: 476961363514

Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code: NOSCUS33
ABA Routing Number: 026002532

3. Online Payment:

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of
the Client No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to:

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/o T04567C c/o T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Summary of Fees
Work performed for the month of June 2019
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Name Level Hours Rate Amount

Sleeth, Jorden Partner 15.3 $ 700.00 | $ 10,710.00
Whittingham, Andrew Senior Manager 61.5 $ 550.00 | $ 33,825.00
Haghiri, Golnaz Senior 0.7 $ 325.00 | $ 227.50
Keene, Ashley Analyst 0.3 $ 250.00 | $ 75.00
Watson, Devin Analyst 77.8 $ 250.00 | $ 19,450.00
Jack, Sean Analyst 3.5 $ 250.00 | $ 875.00
Brown, Rose Consultant 12.4 $ 250.00 | $ 3,100.00
Total Fees 171.5 68,262.50
Out-of-pocket Expenses: 250.49
Total Fee and Out-of-pocket expenses 68,512.99
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Time Details
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Date Name Narrative Hours
6/3/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Markup version of the APA and discuss with C Mason at BLG 0.8
6/3/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Deal with Bakersfield landlord requests for payment of arrears 1.2
and top-up rent. Various emails and calls re the same.
6/3/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Liaise with Stein Fibers to obtain details of terms, updating 2.1
offer comparison analysis and provide to J Sleeth with
comments and recommendations
6/3/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Finalize analysis of inventory at Marco and Speed Global. 2.2
Discuss with D Watson and approve letters to terminate the
cantracte
6/3/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Review revised APA; review notice of BMT debt charge 0.4
converting to floating charge prepared by BLG; review bid
analysis and recommendation, provide comments to A.
Whittingham.
6/3/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Prepare transfer between account, have 1.3
signed & send to BMO. Confirm receipt and input into Ascend.
Prepare disbursement cheques for Rent and courier to location -
1 hr direct. Print back up for several request for
disbursements.
6/3/2019 |Watson, Devin Updated Asset Valuation Analysis with A. Whittingham' s 7.2
comments; Responded to emails from creditors and
customers; drafted employee invoices to be sent to R. Brown
for payment; drafted letter to storage Company regarding
inventory held
6/4/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend update call with Denton's 0.4
6/4/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Execute and deliver signed term sheet to Kelly Toys 0.5
6/4/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Liaising with Commercial Air Compressors onsite regarding the 1.2
removal of assets.
6/4/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with BLG to discuss APA. Prepare 2.4
inventory and asset schedules for APA. Discussing APA with
Dentons.
6/4/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Review changes to APA, consider HST issues 0.5
6/4/2019 |Watson, Devin Supervised the collection of leased equipment by the lessors; 3.7
responded to creditors emails and calls;
6/4/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Call with Bruce Faulken re PECO pallets, confirm arrangements 0.5
for deal to continue supply.
6/4/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques - 1.2
General and Payroll.
6/5/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Updating final version of APA and sending to BLG, discussing 1.2
same with Dentons
6/5/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Call with Kelly Toy re sale of assets 0.3
6/5/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review updated ERV and discuss realization with D Watson and 1.0

S Gobin
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Date Name Narrative Hours
6/5/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Meeting with CFO to discuss status of collections 0.5
6/5/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss and finalize letter to Stein Fibers 0.3
6/5/2019 |Watson, Devin Contacted Rogers regarding payment of internet and account 3.3
management; Instructed R. Brown to make several payments
to critical suppliers; responded to creditors and sent out
demand letters for outstanding receivables
6/6/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Review correspondence from Kelly Toys re: May 2019 sales, 0.6
other APA issues, consider same.
6/6/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit, Disbursement cheque 1.5
and prepare reconciliation and R&D to Jun 5, 2019.
6/6/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Meeting with S Gobin re AR collections and analysis 0.8
6/6/2019 |Watson, Devin Updated AR tracker, Cash Flow Forecast and ERV analysis as at 7.0
June 6, 2019; called Toronto Hydro to change over accounts;
furthered the process of generating new RP and RT accounts
with the CRA
6/7/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Call with A. Whittingham and Kelly Toys re: APA issues 0.4
6/7/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with Kelly Toy to discuss terms, 2.0
Toronto production, storage facilities and APA. Send separate
follow-up emails re APA, Simtech inventory, sublease, Toronto
production, Ocean State order
6/7/2019 |Watson, Devin Finished updating the ERV as at June 6, 2019; worked on first 6.5
draft of BMO summary update; reconciled Deloitte AR
collections with BMT internal reporting
6/7/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review lease agreement for ST Regis and discuss with J Sleeth 0.6
6/10/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Various - update call with A. Whittingham; Kelly Toy APA call 2.6
with BLG; call with A. Whittingham and E. Flaherty (Kelly) re:
APA issues; review ERV and provide revisions, discuss same
with A. Whittingham
6/10/2019 |Watson, Devin Drafted employee invoices to be sent to R. Brown for payment; 5.2
updated BMO summary deck with A. Whittingham comments;
Drafting letters and emails to creditors, spoke with call center
agent at Rogers to get added into the account; reconciled the
BMT AR
6/10/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.4
6/10/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Meetings with D Watson re ERV analysis, updating and 2.5
reviewing ERV analysis turns, working on accompanying slide
deck for BMO
6/10/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Onsite meeting with mechanic re stuffing machines 0.5
6/10/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Asset Purchase Agreement draft: prepare for and attend call 2.9
with Kelly Toy and BLG respectively to discuss APA. Review
most recent APA draft and Kelly Toy markups.
6/11/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss WEPPA claims status with J Hagiri 0.3
6/11/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Read and consider CRA letter re HST audit, discuss with J 0.4

Sleeth and email CFO re same
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

6/11/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

Review draft ERV schedule and presentation materials for
status update meeting with R. Kiefer, provide
comments/revisions to same to A. Whittingham; review memo
from Dentons re: sales agency trust claim; review CRA letter
re: HST ITCs denied;

1.0

6/11/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Execute amendment to order book term sheet and draw
$100,000 from escrow

0.5

6/11/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

discuss APA revisions with A. Whittingham and review email to
BLG re: same.

0.3

6/11/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Email BLG instructions re APA draft edits

0.6

6/11/2019

Watson, Devin

Sent invoices to R. Brown to be paid; Called employees who
hadn't submitted their WEPPA POC forms; updated BMO
summary deck with comments from J. Sleeth; Split out the
opening AR balances on the ERV between the two facilities and
updated uncollectible

7.2

6/11/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Finalizing ERV analysis and accompanying slides and deliver to
BMO with covering letter

2.2

6/12/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Review of HST liabilities on proposed asset sale, discuss tax
implications with BLG, provide Kelly Toy with relevant tax
advice referrals

1.0

6/12/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Transfers between accounts,
record incoming wire and prepare disbursement cheque and
deposit cheque.

1.8

6/12/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

Review APA revisions prior to circulation to Kelly Toys; consider
response to landlord; consider HST issues on Kelly transaction.

0.7

6/12/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Prepare for and attend meeting with BMO to provide update on
Receivership process

1.6

6/12/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

Prepare for and attend meeting with R. Kiefer to provide
Receivership update (realizations to date, ERV estimate,
international updates, etc.), debrief same with A. Whittingham.

1.5

6/12/2019

Watson, Devin

Spoke with Toronto Hydro, waste management, ADT and
Rogers regarding the set-up of a new account; responded to
creditors and vendors via email; Communicated with R, Brown
re which invoices to pay

5.3

6/13/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

Review revised APA, discuss revisions with A. Whittingham.

0.5

6/13/2019

Watson, Devin

Updated Cash flow to project until the end of October 2019;
responded to creditor and vendor emails; Drafted employee
invoices for work performed the week of June 14, 2019

4.2

6/13/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Brief D Watson re BMO meeting previous day and discuss next
steps

0.4

6/13/2019

Haghiri, Golnaz

Work on WEPPA administration to update payments from SC
and update POC received.

0.7

6/14/2019

Watson, Devin

Drafted cancellation letter to Coto; responded to various
creditor and vendor emails.

2.0

6/14/2019

Whittingham, Andrew

Deal with Coto order issues, prepare letter to cancel supply
contract and open LC

0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours
6/14/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Payroll & Disbursement 2.1
cheques, Review account online, reconcile GL to bank, Update
R&D, Print GL's reports and send to DW.
6/14/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Update call with A. Whittingham re: status of Kelly transaction, 0.6
CFO retainer, landlord issues; receive update from Dentons re:
sales agent trust claim and consider same
6/17/2019 |Watson, Devin Updating the cash flow with actuals from the week of June 14, 2.3
2019; responded to emails from creditors.
6/17/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Various emails to BMT team re Kelly deal 0.4
6/17/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review insurance coverage and instruct coverage to be placed 0.2
for another month
6/17/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Consider Rogers invoice issue, discuss with D Watson 0.2
6/18/2019 |Watson, Devin Completed the update of cash flow for the week of June 14, 6.5
2019; updated the AR collection projections after meeting with
S. Gobin; responded to emails from creditors.
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Follow up emails to Loblaws and Big Lots re collections 0.2
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Emails exchanged with Kelly Toy re APA discussion 0.2
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Emails with Bakersfield landlord re access to facility and filing 0.2
claim in the Receivership.
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Read and consider emails from Grant Thornton re tax filings. 0.3
Prepare and send response to confirm "pens down" approach.
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss AR with D Watson 0.2
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Read and consider Platinum auction proposal for office 0.5
furniture and computers. Forward to J Sleeth with
recommendation.
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend meeting with CFO and D Watson re AR 1.5
collections status. Follow up discussions with D Watson re way
forward.
6/18/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Meetings and discussions with CFO re CRA audits of HST and 1.0
Payroll accounts. Review schedule of HST payable prepared by
CFO.
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discussions with K Zhu re Kelly Toy production in Toronto 0.4
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discussions with CFO re collection of Big Lots AR 0.4
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Emails with Bakersfield landlord re access and utilities invoices 0.2
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with Kelly Toy re APA, send 0.8
instruction email to BLG
6/19/2019 |Watson, Devin Call with CRA for update on the HST and source deduction 3.7
account creation; drafted AR demand letter for TRU Canada;
reviewed cash flow to ensure it ties to cash on hand.
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Call with Bobby Sohli of BLG re HST requirements for inventory 0.5
transaction, review of Bobby's follow up email re HST status
and reply
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare skeleton structure for First Receiver's report to the 0.4

Court
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Date Name Narrative Hours
6/19/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Call with A. Whittingham and Kelly Toy re: APA and HST issue, 0.4
debrief with A. Whittingham
6/19/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review of updated 20-week Cash Flow and discuss same with 0.8
D Watson
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Call with J Sleeth to discuss status 0.3
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review and approve emails to Lojas and Hamleys re AR 0.2
collections.
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Various emails to insurance broker re D&O tail coverage and 0.5
discussions re same with D Watson.
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Calls and emails exchanged with Bobby Sohli of BLG re HST 0.7
requirements on inventory transaction. Call with Ed Flaherty of
Kelly Toy re same.
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review emails from KWM counsel in Hong Kong. Discuss with 0.5
CFO and forward to Dentons/BLG for comment.
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Open link from PMSA and send email to Dentons re PMSA trust 0.3
claim
6/20/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend meeting with IT consultant and CFO to 1.4
discuss procedures for office closure and future access to
servers.
6/20/2019 |Watson, Devin Drafted demand emails for S. Gobin to send to International 4.0
customers; called Insurance broker to get a D&O Quote,
coordinated Iron Mountain drop off/pick up; responded to
creditor emails
6/21/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Gobin re: retention agreement and tax return 0.5
6/21/2019 |Watson, Devin Supervised realtor showing of Bakersfield property; Responded 2.0
to emails from creditors.
6/24/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss HST response letter with J Sleeth 0.2
6/24/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss tail D&O coverage with J Sleeth and place coverage. 0.2
6/24/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Various emails and discussions with BLG re Kelly deal 0.4
6/24/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss CRA HST re-assessment with S Gobin. Review of 3.2
taxable supply reconciliation and ITCs available. Draft letter to
CRA responding to re-assessment and prepare associated
appendix.
6/24/2019 |Watson, Devin Responded to creditor and customer emails 1.0
6/24/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Various: HST return - review HST return working papers and 1.4
memo from S. Gobin, call with S. Gobin re: same; discuss
retention bonus structure with S. Gobin, revise retention
contract and circulate to S. Gobin; consider insurance renewal
6/25/2019 |Watson, Devin Drafted invoices for employee work performed the week 2.0
ending June 21, 2019; Responded to creditor and vendor
emails; Finished drafting transition memo for S. Jack
6/25/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Printing back up for issue of 0.8
disbursement/payroll cheques, Review account online and
request for back up for incoming receipts into the US$ account.
6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss HST matters with CFO 0.4
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Date Name Narrative Hours

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Status update meeting with D Watson 0.5

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review and update AR collections status, confirm write offs 0.6
with CFO

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review email and supporting docs from PMSA counsel re trust 1.2
claim, discuss the same with CFO. Review draft letter to PMSA
counsel and provide comments.

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with Kelly Toys re deal closing. 1.1
Email instructions re APA to BLG for document completion.

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Email HK landlord re release of leased property. 0.2

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review of revised CFO contract and instruct payment on 0.5
retention bonus. Draft hourly contract for Peter John (WH
supervisor).

6/25/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review of revised APA prepared by BLG. Discuss same with J 0.8
Sleeth and provide copies to Kelly Toy.

6/25/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Consider collection approach re: Loblaws and discuss same 3.2
with A. Whittingham; review submissions from Walgreens sales
agent re: trust claim for commission on AR collection; consider
HR resolution issues; call with Kelly Toy re: production costs
and recovery to Receiver; review of income tax return and
approve filing; review revised Kelly APA and call with Kelly.

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Amending APA for Kelly Toy comments. Return draft APA to 2.1
Kelly with explanation of changes. Discussing same with J
Sleeth. Facilitate another turn of the APA per Kelly's request.

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review and execute auction agreement with Platinum Assets. 0.4

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Email Crossdock re samples issue, discuss with K Zhu 0.3

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discussions with M Sipp (Kelly Toy) and Karen Zhu re revising 0.8
employment contract to 90 day terms.

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Amend existing labour hire contract to the Receivership 0.5
proceedings and provide copy to J Sleeth

6/26/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Review of status on Loblaws AR collection, discuss same with 1.2
CFO. Prepare for and attend call with Loblaws counsel re
settlement.

6/26/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement/payroll cheques, 3.0
Prepare payroll schedules.

6/26/2019 |Watson, Devin Corresponding with R. Brown regarding payment of critical 2.7
supplier invoices; responding to customer and creditor inquires

6/26/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Liaise with former director (N. Manzoor) re: D&O insurance; 0.7
review and edit the Octagon contract labour contract, discuss
same with A \Whittinaham

6/27/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Further updates to APA. Discussions with Kelly Toy re 1.6
execution. Meeting with J Sleeth to execute the document.

6/27/2019 |Jack, Sean Constructing rebuttal letter to the CRA relating to the HST 1.5
payable amounts due to imported goods - provided to A
Whittingham for initial review

6/27/2019 |Keene, Ashley Issue chq, sign & courier. 0.3

6/27/2019 |Brown, Rose Prepare courier slip for payroll cheques and rent cheques and 0.3

take to mail room.
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Date Name Narrative Hours
6/27/2019 |Watson, Devin Responded to emails regarding creditors and outstanding AR. 2.0
6/28/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Discuss HST reconciliation with S Jack. 0.5
6/28/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Call with Ed Flaherty of Kelly Toy re inventory 0.4
6/28/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Provide Kelly commercial invoice for samples 0.3
6/28/2019 |Whittingham, Andrew Finalize Octagon draft contract 0.4
6/28/2019 |Jack, Sean Draft response letter to the CRA relating to the HST payable 2.0
amounts due to imported goods - adjusted the letter as per A
Whittingham comments
Total 171.5
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ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Interim bill in connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC for

the month of July, 2019.

Please see the attached appendices.

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax

159

Invoice 8000779367

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

September 20, 2019
1332039

BES00071

Jorden Sleeth

122893605RT0001

45,070.00

3,084.80

6,260.12

54,414.92

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Invoice Number 8000779367

September 20, 2019

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8000779367 54,414.92
Unit)

Payment for invoice
8000779367

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice
number(s) paid

Payment Options

1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory): Preferred Method
The Bank of Nova Scotia
Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002 ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number: 1363514

2. Wire Payment:
The Bank of Nova Scotia

Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:

Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number: 476961363514

Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code: NOSCUS33
ABA Routing Number: 026002532

3. Online Payment:

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of
the Client No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to:

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/o T04567C c/o T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Date Name Narrative Hours

7/5/2019 Jack, Sean Review and revise CRA letter, responded to A Whittingham 3.0
comments and made necessary edits, aided in proceedings
with the CRA payroll audit, process cash flow revisions

7/5/2019 Brown, Rose Trust banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.1

7/5/2019 Watson, Devin Drafted email for A. Whittingham to review regarding a 3.5
repayment of a deposit; supervised CRA auditor and answered
any questions re: BMT payroll and HST.

7/6/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review and revise draft response to CRA re: HST liability 0.8

7/8/2019 Jack, Sean Conducted cash balancing for the prior week, corresponded 3.3
with Karen, Outside vendors and R. Brown regarding necessary
payables, completed company employee invoices for time
worked

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meykos issue review and approval of refund 0.5

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Draft new employment contract for Karen Zhu, discuss same 0.6
with Karen Zhu

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Working on HST re-assessment including discussions with CFO 1.2
and review of ITCs

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meetings and discussions with KellyToy and K Zhu re 0.8
production and logistics

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Reviewing and approving various storage and production costs 0.5

7/8/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review and consider options to place $2.55M into interest 0.8
bearing term deposits

7/8/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review BLG invoices, circulate same to BMO for approval 0.5

7/9/2019 Brown, Rose Prepare letter to close account, prepare two investment 1.2
purchase sheet, have signed and scan and fax to BMO.
Prepare payroll cheques and courier to company office.

7/9/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Working on final draft response to CRA re HST re-assessment. 1.8
Finalize draft and appendices and provide to J. Sleeth with
explanation of changes.

7/9/2019 Jack, Sean Corresponded with Karen, outside vendors and R. Brown 2.0
regarding necessary payments to issue

7/10/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review payments with S. Jack 0.5

7/10/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Call with Kelly Toys re: inventory acquisition, removal, 0.5
planning and logistics

7/10/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Calls with Simtech and Bakersfield landlord re: inventory 0.8
removal planning, introduction to Kelly Toy

7/10/2019 Brown, Rose Print back up for disbursement requests. Prepare letter to CRA 0.4
to transfer source deductions RP 1 to RP 2 and copy cheques &
letters.

7/11/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review and consider GST liability due to Canada Customs on 0.8
imported goods, discuss same with A. Whittingham, call with
R. Kennedy and A. MacFarlane re: same

7/11/2019 Jack, Sean Corresponded with Karen, outside vendors and R. Brown re: 2.1

payments and tracking for Kelly Toy reimbursement; drafted
letter re: pallet recovery
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Date Name Narrative Hours
7/11/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Email details of CRA claim to Dentons, attendance on call with 0.8
Dentons to discuss the same
7/11/2019 Brown, Rose Input investment purchase into Ascend; update GL with 2.0
various receipts; reconciliation account to online banking
report and update R&D; Prepare disbursement cheques.

7/12/2019 Brown, Rose Input receipts and complete R&D. 0.3

7/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meetings with staff at premises to discuss key custody 0.5
arrangements and vacation planning

7/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discuss employee T4s with CFO 0.4

7/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meeting with CFO and S Jack to discuss status of AR collections 0.8

7/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Email details of CRA claim to Dentons 0.4

7/12/2019 Jack, Sean Review payments with Karen, call to vendors for supporting 2.3
invoices, liaise with R. Brown re: raising cheques

7/15/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Receive updates from A. Whittingham re: landlord issues, 0.5
staffing, onsite production, consider same and provide
direction.

7/15/2019 Jack, Sean Worked on Go Daddy Domain issue; cash balancing from the 2.0
prior week with info from R. Brown

7/15/2019 Koo, Ada Bank reconciliations for the month of June 0.4

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating AR tracker schedule, overlaying EDC revolver 1.4
collections

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Dealing with internet domain name issues, calls with IT 1.2
specialists, emails to GoDaddy, discussions with BMT staff

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Drafting email summary update for BMO, including AR 1.2
collections, inventory sale and open order book update

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Email Kellytoy re open order book sales 0.3

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send email instructing Dentons to prepare AR 0.4
demand letters for 3 customers

7/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send email instructing Dentons re GST liabilities 0.3

7/15/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques/wire, 2.1
Payroll cheques and update schedules. Review accounts on
line and update R&D to July 12, 2019. Fax letter to BMO to
close escrow account.

7/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Calls with S Jack to discuss status and outstanding tasks 0.4

7/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Dealing with internet domain name issues, draft email to 0.4
Michael Nadel

7/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with EDC re update and claims 0.7
process

7/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating ERV analysis, finalizing summary update for BMO, 2.0
discussing with J Sleeth

7/16/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. Update 0.8
Ascend with WEPPA claims.

7/16/2019 Jack, Sean Worked on Go Daddy Domain issue / Cash balancing from the 2.6

prior week with info from R. Brown
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Date Name Narrative Hours

7/16/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Call with R Kiefer and EDC re: realization and claim update; 0.7
debrief same with A. Whittingham

7/17/2019 Brown, Rose Update letter/sent for to CRA for transferring of Source 0.3
deductions remitted to RP0O002 account.

7/17/2019 Jack, Sean Worked on Go Daddy Domain issue; review supplier invoices 1.9
and processed for payment

7/18/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 1.7

7/18/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review estate disbursements; emails team for approvals etc. 0.4

7/18/2019 Jack, Sean Cash balancing from the prior week with info from R. Brown; 1.8
arranged for garbage pick up; met with Capital Assets
liquidators

7/22/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Read and consider emails from KellyToy and BMT re Simtech 0.4
services; attendance on call with Daryl Lester (Simtech) re
cooperation.

7/22/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discussing with S Jack and K Zhu re fibre delivery 0.3

7/22/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discussing w S Jack and responding to various creditor emails 0.5
to Gowlings WLG, Gerry Seetner, Soneil and Oracle.

7/22/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Print various back up for 1.9
cheques, Input and print cheques, have signed and send out.
Reconcile Ascend to online bank report for July 19, 2019.
Update R&D and send Bank Reconciliation, GL's and R&D to SJ.

7/22/2019 Jack, Sean Creation of template for cost reimbursement from KellyToy; 2.3
process invoices and attend to operating issues with Karen

7/22/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send email to KellyToy re costs of Deloitte staff 0.4
facilitating production.

7/23/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement/payroll cheques. 1.7

7/23/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meetings and discussions with S Jack regarding reimbursement 1.0
of production costs from KellyToy; reviewing schedule and
supporting documents.

7/23/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Approving various supplier payments 0.2

7/23/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discussion with S Jack re leases and payments. Respond to J 0.4
Sleeth email re actual costs per lease agreement.

7/23/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review and approve various payments (lease, CRA payroll 0.6
withholdings); update call with A. Whittingham

7/24/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review PSMA constructive trust claim correspondence between 0.2
Dentons and A. Whittingham

7/24/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Considering insurance coverage and reviewing policy/payment 0.7
history. Approve extension and payment of August policies.

7/24/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Email to Crossdock re timing of removal of inventory. 0.2

7/24/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Working through initial set up of production reimbursement 1.8

schedule and adjusting as necessary. Discuss same with S
Jack. Review APA for reimbursement terms and apply to
schedule. Prepare and send covering email to KellyToy
requesting reimbursement.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

7/24/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Read and consider update from Dentons re PMSA claim. 0.4
Respond to Dentons with further information and instructions.

7/24/2019 Jack, Sean Responded to changes from A Whittingham on the final bill to 1.1
KellyToy

7/24/2019 Brown, Rose Cheque Disbursement and send out by courier. 1.0

7/26/2019 Jack, Sean Met with Rep from Platinum assets auctioneers, helped prepare 1.7
- used the APA to designate assets to be sold

7/29/2019 Jack, Sean Completed employee invoices for payment; onsite attendance, 4.6
meet with K. Zhu and S. Gobin re: KellyToy production and
inventory removal

7/29/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with Torys re Loblaw collections 0.3

7/29/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discussions with CFO re status of TEDI, Walmart US, Walmart 0.7
Canada, Target, Supervalu, Big Lots etc. Various emails re the
same.

7/29/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Approval of various supplier payments 0.3

7/30/2019 Brown, Rose Deposit cheque. 0.8

7/30/2019 Jack, Sean Finalized and forwarded invoices for production, called City of 1.4
Toronto to organize pick up of clothing bin

7/31/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Attendance at BMT - tour production, meeting with S. Gobin 3.6
re: status of tax returns (corporate and HST), AR collections
from customers;

7/31/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Status update and next steps meeting with A. Whittingham 0.8
and S. Jack; discuss Landlord concerns re: 120 St Regis premis
turnover.

7/31/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meet with S. Jack and J. Sleeth re: status update; review and 0.9
approve employee bonus payments and discuss with S. Jack

7/31/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discuss security alarm system with CFO, email S Jack re new 0.3
contacts

7/31/2019 Jack, Sean Meet with A. Whittingham re: security, employee bonuses 1.8
payments, process same for payment

7/31/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare payroll schedules and 2.4
prepare payroll and disbursement cheques. Review account
online and request back up for incoming receipts.

Total 119.5

Page 6 of 6




ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Interim bill in connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC for

the month of August, 2019.

Please see the attached appendices

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8000779356

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date: September 20, 2019

Client No.: 1332039

WBS#: BES00071

Engagement Partner:  Jorden Sleeth

HST Registration: 122893605RT0001
HST applicable 45,630.00
HST applicable 492.14
HST at 13.00% 5,995.88

Total Amount Due (CAD) 52,118.02

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.
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Invoice Number 8000779356

September 20, 2019

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8000779356 52,118.02
Unit)

Payment for invoice
8000779356

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice
number(s) paid

Payment Options

1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory): Preferred Method
The Bank of Nova Scotia
Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002 ABA/Transit Routing: 47696002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number: 1363514

2. Wire Payment:
The Bank of Nova Scotia

Business Service Centre, 20 Queen Street West, 4th Floor, Toronto, Ontario M5H 3R3

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:

Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number: 476961363514

Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code: NOSCUS33
ABA Routing Number: 026002532

3. Online Payment:

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of
the Client No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to:

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay: For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay:
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/o T04567C c/o T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Date Name Narrative Hours

8/12/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement and payroll 2.0
cheques.

8/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review SJ Partners request for tax information. Discuss with J 0.4
Sleeth and Dentons, email Sj Partners advising accordingly.

8/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discussions with S Jack re Crossdock pre-filing invoices. 1.0
Approving payment of the same following discussion with R
Brown.

8/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discuss non-payment of purchase price with J Sleeth and send 0.5
email to Kelly demanding payment.

8/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review insurance coverage and costs, respond to Kelly Toy 0.5
requests re insurance premiums.

8/12/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Preparation for and attendance at meeting with J Sleeth and S 1.0
Jack re BMT status and next steps.

8/12/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Meet with A. Whittingham and S. Jack re: outstanding items 0.9
and resolutions; review status of KellyToy payments and
production impact, review correspondence drafts to SJ Capital
and KellyToy; review and approve BMT Receiver account bank
recs.

8/12/2019 Jack, Sean Invoices for BMT employees, reconciliation of Cash balances 4.0
reports, process of cross dock invoices and other company
invoices.

8/13/2019 Jack, Sean Organization of the auction materials, finalization of company 2.0
invoices

8/13/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review previous bankruptcy filing analysis, discuss with CFO 0.6
and prepare updated file note for J Sleeth.

8/13/2019 Brown, Rose Prepare disbursement for mailing and courier to SJ. Scan and 0.8
saving previous issued disbursements on Q Drive. Update file
creditor POC.

8/14/2019 Brown, Rose Scan and saving previous issued disbursements on Q Drive. 0.6
Review HST remittance forms for code number.

8/14/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review status of file and past emails, and prepare workstream 2.5
checklist with milestones. Discuss checklist with J Sleeth.
Meeting with S Jack re checklist.

8/14/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Liaising with CFO and shareholder re required tax information. 0.4

8/14/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Call with CFO to discuss AR collections and tax reporting 0.4
status.

8/14/2019 Jack, Sean Inputing company invoices to Ascend regarding Crossdock, 0.5
SimTech and Go Daddy for payment.

8/15/2019 Jack, Sean Reconciliation of incoming AR from KIK; drafting / work on the 1.0
HST returns for April — July 2019; Submission and
administration of invoices for payment.

8/15/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Landlord issues - consider last day on premises, discuss same 0.3
with A. Whittingham.

8/15/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and 0.8
saving disbursement copy on Q Drive.

8/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review of previous BMO status updates and prepare 1.4

comprehensive court report outline with appendices.
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Date Name Narrative Hours
8/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Approving payment of operational expenses. 0.3
8/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meetings with S Jack to discuss HST filings. 0.5
8/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discuss status of inventory transaction with J Sleeth. Prepare 1.0
and send email to Kelly Toy re production costs and shutting
down production.
8/15/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review of past advice re HK employee priorities, send to S 0.3
Jack.
8/16/2019 Jack, Sean Prepared HST reporting filings for receivership period (prepare 3.5
outstanding filings, review support, compile) and provide to A.
Whittingham for review.
8/16/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review HST filing; discussions with A. Whittingham re: 0.6
KellyToy payments and lack of response.
8/16/2019 Brown, Rose Update creditor list. 0.7
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meeting with S Jack re Receiver's First Court Report. 0.6
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send response to Troy's re Loblaw AR collection. 0.4
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Meeting with J Sleeth to discuss status. 0.6
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Discuss April - July HST returns with S Jack and J Sleeth. 0.4
Finalize calculations and approve filing with CRA.
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send email to SJ Partners re tax information 0.3
8/16/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Emails and calls with 120 St Regis landlord. Confirm vacancy 0.4
date via letterhead.
8/19/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Reconciled GL to online Banking 1.4
Reports. Update R&D per GL's and send S Jack. Prepare
deposit and take to the bank. Complete scanning of
disbursement cheques and save on Q and file.
8/19/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Update meeting with A. Whittingham re: KellyToy production 0.5
and payment issues, S] Capital Partners tax information
requests, landlord issues re: vacating premises.
8/19/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send tax information to Scott Johnson as 0.4
requested. Review books and records custody issues.
8/19/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Drafting Receiver's first court report sections (purpose of 4.4
report, terms of reference and receiver's activities to date).
Setting up report structure and formatting. Dealing with Kelly
Toy production issues. Calls with BLG and Dentons re same.
Discussions with J Sleeth re same. Email correspondence with
M Sipp re trucks picking up from St Regis.
8/19/2019 Jack, Sean BMT contract employees weekly invoices, completed SJ 4.0
partners, research of books and records retention for BMT
record storage, processing of company invoices, liaison with
stuffing machine mechanics.
8/20/2019 Jack, Sean Bi Weekly production cost invoicing of Kelly Toys. 3.0
8/20/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with Kelly Toys to discuss 1.5

production, purchase price, reimbursement and vacating the
premises. Follow up discussions with J Sleeth and email sent to
Kelly.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

8/20/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review of Kelly Toy reimbursement schedule and associated 0.8
invoices. Discuss same with Sean Jack and provide to Kelly Toy
for payment.

8/20/2019 Brown, Rose Deposit chq in Ascend and to the bank. 0.3

8/20/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Prepare payroll cheques for couriering 0.7
and have Operating expense cheque signed and sent out.

8/20/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Call with KellyToy re: APA payments and cost reimbursement, 0.8
prepare and debrief same with A. Whittingham.

8/20/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Drafting Receiver's first court report sections - order book sale 2.5
update, inventory and fixed asset sale update, furniture,
fixtures and fittings, and 3rd party equipment updates.

8/21/2019 Jack, Sean WSIB calculation and liaison, computation of amount owing. 2.0

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Drafting Receiver's first court report sections - AR collection 1.2
efforts and engagement of legal counsel.

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Provide Dentons AR contacts for demand letters. Review 3 0.5
demand letters and provide comments.

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare draft email to BMO confirming bankruptcy assignment 0.5
and timing of first creditors meeting.

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review and approve WSIB payments. 0.4

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Correspondence with HUB re reduction in GL premium. 0.3

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Email to Simtech re outstanding invoices on account and 0.3
inventory sale.

8/21/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Correspondence with Kelly Toys re CAED certificate. 0.3

8/21/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

8/22/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Status update meeting with A. Whittingham and S. Jack, 1.3
review outstanding issues and determine resolution plans.

8/22/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating work stream checklist and preparing for team status 1.5
meeting. Attendance at status meeting.

8/22/2019 Jack, Sean Correspondence with Ellie Marshall of platinum assets 2.9
regarding sold items, also organization of received payments
and outgoing invoices. Status update meeting with J. Sleeth
and A. Whittingham.

8/23/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement/Payroll 1.2
cheque and courier slip for rent cheques and Payroll.

8/23/2019 Jack, Sean updating of Cash report and AR tracker. 2.6

8/26/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review of current cash requirements and advise R Brown re 0.3
additional term deposit placement.

8/26/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare and send email to BLG with instructions on WM 0.4
Canada.

8/26/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Working on updating AR collections tracker, updating 5.5
Estimated Realization Valuation for BMO. Allocating any
recoveries to EDC vs Existing Revolver. Discussing outcome
and implications of the updated ERV with J Sleeth.

8/27/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Review and revise ERV update memo for BMO, discuss same 1.5

with A. Whittingham.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

8/27/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Analyzing variances between ERV provided to BMO on June 6 4.0
and updated ERV. Prepare draft covering email and AR write-
offs summary for BMO.

8/27/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Review of Kelly Toy open order book reporting, term sheet and 0.8
amending agreement. Prepare and send file note email to J
Sleeth with recommendations.

8/27/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Drafting Receiver's first court report sections - storage 2.5
agreements and liens, receipts and disbursements, receiver's
professional fees, request to make distributions and status of
Hong Kong operations.

8/28/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and 1.8
input incoming receipts by wire and transfer.

8/28/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Update call with R. Kiefer re: revised ERV (prepare and 0.5
attend).

8/29/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and 1.3
prepare transfer between accounts and fax to BMO. Input
transfer into Ascend.

8/29/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Call with A. Slavens of Torys re: Loblaws AR, debrief with A. 0.7
Whittingham.

8/30/2019 Brown, Rose Check online banking for incoming wire and input into Ascend. 0.7
Prepare deposit slip and take to the bank.

Total 110.7
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ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Interim bill in connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC from

September 1 to October 31,2019.

Please see the attached appendices

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8000941686

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

December 23,2019
1332039

BES00071

Jorden Sleeth

122893605RT0001

68,047.50

969.27

8,972.18

77,988.95

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



Invoice Number 8000941686

December 23,2019

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8000941686 77,988.95 Payment for invoice 8000941686
Unit)

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice number(s) paid

Payment Options
1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory) :
*Preferred Method*

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment
Transit - Institution : 47696-002 Transit - Institution : 47696-002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number : 1363514

2. Wire Payment:

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment, Beneficiary Bank (Bank of Nova Scotia) :
Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number : 476961363514
Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code : NOSCCATT

Clearing Code : CC000247696

Address: P.O. Box 4234 STN A, Toronto ON M4W 5P6

Page2/2
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USD Payment, Intermediary Bank (Bank of America NA) :

Address: 222 Broadway, New York, NY 10038

Account Number: 476961363514
Swift Code: BOFAUS3N
ABA Routing Number : 026009593

Note: Intermediary Bank information may not be required for

payments coming from outside the US

3.Online Payment :

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of the Client

No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to :

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay : For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay :
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/0T04567C c/o0T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Sleeth, Jorden Partner 10.7 $ 700.00 | $ 7,490.00
Whittingham, Andrew Senior Manager 7.1 $ 550.00 | $ 3,905.00
Greenbaum, Stacey Manager 59.8 $ 425.00 | $ 25,415.00
Jack, Sean Analyst 30.0 $ 250.00 | $ 7,500.00
Klein, Emily Analyst 61.6 $ 250.00 | $ 15,387.50
Brown, Rose Consultant 33.4 $ 250.00 | $ 8,350.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 202.6 $ 68,047.50
Out-of-pocket Expenses $ 969.27
Total Fees and Expenses $ 69,016.77
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Appendix #2

Name
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Work performed for the months of September & October 2019

Date Name Narrative Hours

9/3/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Prepare Disbursement cheques and 1.1
updated R&D.

9/3/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating workstream checklist. Prepare for and attend BMT 1.0
handover meeting with J. Sleeth.

9/3/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Meeting with A. Whittingham, J.Sleeth re file introduction. File 1.5
review.

9/4/2019 Jack, Sean Meeting with A. Whittingham, J. Sleeth, S. Greenbaum to 1.5
discuss file; S. Greenbaum introduction re daily duties and
necessary work for file on a go-forward basis.

9/4/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Meeting with A. Whittingham, J.Sleeth, S. Jack re file status. 2.0
Initial file review.

9/4/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Tour of St Regis and Bakersfield and take photos of issues / 1.4
tasks. Prepare and send file note re leased premises and
remaining tasks.

9/4/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend call with BLG re Walmart Canada legal 0.7
hold issue. Discuss with S. Gobin.

9/4/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Prepare for and attend meeting with S.Jack re handover and 0.8
workstream checklist.

9/4/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and 1.0
deposit.

9/5/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and 1.2
deposit.

9/5/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating workstream checklist. Prepare for and attend meeting 1.0
with S.Greenbaum, J. Sleeth and S. Jack re status of file and
handover of tasks.

9/5/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Status update and file transition meetings with A. 1.0
Whittingham, J.Sleeth, S.Jack, E. Klein

9/5/2019 Klein, Emily Meeting with Sean Jack and Stacey Greenbaum to be 0.7
onboarded onto the file.

9/6/2019 Whittingham, Andrew Updating workstream checklist. Call with J. Sleeth and S. 2.3
Greenbaum re handover. Discuss handover with S. Jack.
Preparing file note re status of CRA accounts.

9/6/2019 Brown, Rose Print disbursement back up. 0.2

9/6/2019 Brown, Rose July bank reconciliation. 0.3

9/6/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Status update and file transition calls with A. Whittingham and 1.0
J. Sleeth.

9/6/2019 Jack, Sean Processing of invoices, instructions to E.Klein regarding bi 3.0
weekly Kelly Toy invoice.

9/9/2019 Klein, Emily Creating invoices for BMT employees, call with RBC insurance 1.5
regarding termination of policy, drafting email to RBC for
termination of policy.

9/9/2019 Brown, Rose Disbursement cheques, Call to Hydro One to confirm amount 1.3
owing, prepare various invoice and approval for payment
future disbursements on Estate.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

9/9/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Onsite at BMT: review of office / warehouse space, call with 8.0
Platinum assets, review of A/R disputes with S. Gobin, file
review with S. Jack.

9/9/2019 Jack, Sean Hand over of file duties to E Klein and S Greenbaum, 4.0
processing of invoices including prefiling invoices necessary for
release of goods from Crossdock, review of HVAC invoices.

9/10/2019 Jack, Sean Preparation of cashflow forecast and tracking, file review with 2.5
S. Greenbaum, discussions with E. Klein on the processes for
employee payments.

9/10/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of 120 St. Regis lease re G. Seetner HVAC claims, 4.0
review of production reimbursement schedule re Kelly Toys,
File oversight for E. Klein and S. Jack.

9/10/2019 Brown, Rose Preparing Payroll Schedules, Input and print payroll and 2.5
disbursement cheques. Print and have signed and mail/courier
out. Reconcile GL to Bank and prepare Update R&D to Sep 6,
2019.

9/10/2019 Klein, Emily Preparation of letter re RBC terminatation of life insurance 0.3
policy held by BMT.

9/11/2019 Jack, Sean Continued hand off of file, preparation of AR reconciliation and 3.5
cashflow, follow up fax to CRA regarding RP0002 accounts.

9/11/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey File oversight for E. Klein and S. Jack, review of various post 3.0
filing payments, discussions with Platinum Assets.

9/11/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Review deposit from Kellytoys 1.1
and discuss with S. Jack & S. Greenbaum. Prepare
disbursement cheques.

9/11/2019 Klein, Emily Call with OpenText to discuss outstanding amounts. 0.1

9/12/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Reviewing receipts and disbursement. 0.3

9/12/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Status update meeting with J. Sleeth and S. Jack, review and 4.0
monitoring E. Klein and S. Jack, call with S. Gobin, call with G.
Seetner re HVAC.

9/12/2019 Jack, Sean Status update with J. Sleeth, review/ processing of invoices, 4.0
preparation of cashflow; call with CRA regarding WEPP.

9/12/2019 Klein, Emily Setting up garbage pickup, calling with ADT, drafting letter to 1.3
ADT to terminate services as of Oct 31.

9/13/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Reviewing receipts. 0.2

9/13/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey File over-sight for E.Klein, meeting with J. Sleeth re file status 3.0
and HK bank accounts, emails re G. Seetner and 120 St. Regis,
call with S. Gobin.

9/16/2019 Jack, Sean Status update with S. Greenbaum, review of cashflow with E. 6.0
Klein, review of Kelly Toy invoice.

9/16/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey File oversight re E. Klein and S. Jack, review and approval of 3.0
invoices, review of HK receipts, call with Karen re production.

9/16/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement/payroll cheques. 0.9
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Date

Name

Narrative

Hours

9/16/2019

Klein, Emily

Drafting letters to ADT and OpenText regarding outstanding
invoices. Contacting waste company to set up pick up of
cardboard. Preparing employee invoices. Preparation of Cash
Flow model. Review of 2015 APA.

3.5

9/17/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

File oversight re E. Klein and S. Jack.

1.0

9/17/2019

Klein, Emily

Kelly Toys Production invoice for period ending Sept 16.
Setting up garbage pickup, contacting Opennote, reconciling
Hong Kong AR with payments.

3.0

9/17/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Prepare cheque for
mailing/couriering, Prepare Updated R&D to Sep 13, 2019.
Scanning and filing of Receipts and Disbursement vouchers.

1.5

9/17/2019

Jack, Sean

Finalization of completed tasks such as reviewing AR tracker,
explanation of WSIB reporting to E. Klein.

5.5

9/18/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

File overview with S. Jack and E. Klein, review of A/R tracker,
review of BMT employee invoices.

3.0

9/18/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Returning cheque to G Seetner,
Reviewing and print disbursement back up for prepare
cheques. Prepare Disbursement cheques. Scanning of US$
receipts and filing on Q Drive.

1.5

9/18/2019

Klein, Emily

Meeting regarding next steps of file re WSIB and WEPPA, calls
with Rogers & Bell regarding outstanding invoices, calls with
employees re WEPP, preparing WSIB invoice.

4.0

9/19/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

Status update call with Kelly Toys, call with S.Gobin and E.
Klein re A/R tracker.

1.0

9/19/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

Status update meeting with S. Greenbaum and call with
KellyToy re: status of production and inventory extraction.

1.1

9/19/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Admin - Prepare transfer between accounts.
Input and print disbursement cheques. Review payroll schedule
to compare to WSIB payment.

1.4

9/19/2019

Klein, Emily

Updating WSIB invoice, call with Bell regarding outstanding
invoice amount, call with S. Gobin and S. Greenbaum
regarding collection of updated AR amounts.

1.5

9/20/2019

Klein, Emily

Review of invoices received, updating Kelly Toys invoice for
payments made, updating WSIB invoice.

1.5

9/20/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Adm - Scan and save disbursement payment on
Q drive.

0.1

9/23/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Adm - disbursement/payroll cheque’s.

1.0

9/23/2019

Klein, Emily

Creating employee invoices for week ending Sept 20, updating
Kelly Toys invoice, call with Enbridge re o/s invoice, setting up
cardboard pickup at Bakersfield.

1.8

9/24/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

File oversight for E.Klein.

1.0

9/24/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Admin - Complete mailing of disbursement and
courier out payroll cheques. Reconciled bank to GL and
prepare updated R&D.

1.1

9/24/2019

Klein, Emily

Review of Crossdock accounts, call with City of Toronto to
discuss outstanding invoice from solid waste management.

1.5

9/25/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

File oversight for E.Klein, schedule for reimbursement re Kelly
Toys.

2.0
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Narrative

Hours

9/25/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Admin - Disbursement cheques and review GL to
confirm may deposit was received.

1.0

9/25/2019

Klein, Emily

Reconciliation re unpaid invoices, mailing Toronto Revenue
Services to receive information regarding Toronto waste
management invoice.

0.5

9/26/2019

Klein, Emily

Submission for payment of invoices, WEPPA, call with S. Gobin
regarding updated AR tracker. Coordination of transfer of funds
between accounts, review of letters and invoices from BMT
suppliers and customers, drafting letters to WSIB and Bell.

2.5

9/26/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Print disbursement payment
back up. Have two cheque signed and mail. Scan cheques and
save on Q Drive. Review GL/Ascend to confirm June, July and
August swept receipts from company account were received.

1.4

9/26/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

Call with S. Gobin re A/R tracker, file oversight for E.Klein.

1.5

9/27/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque/Scan
save on Q and printing invoice back up for disbursement
requests.

0.4

9/27/2019

Klein, Emily

Reconciliation and payment of Simtech invoices.

0.5

9/27/2019

Brown, Rose

Prepare August bank reconciliations.

0.3

9/27/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

Discussions with SimTech re payment, File oversight for
E.Klein.

2.0

9/30/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

Review of employee invoices, review of HVAC landlord
concerns.

1.0

9/30/2019

Sleeth, Jorden

HVAC / Landlord update from S. Greenbaum

0.4

9/30/2019

Klein, Emily

Creating invoices for employees for week ending sept 27,
sending letter to Bell, call with Ohio Tax org to cancel business
taxes.

1.0

9/30/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Adm- scan signed cheque and save on q drive
and file paper copy. Reconcile Bank to GL and update R & D.

1.5

10/1/2019

Klein, Emily

Sending invoices for processing, call with RBC Life Insurance
regarding outstanding invoices, co-ordination with S.Gobin
regarding Ohio Tax forms, emails with SPS commerce
regarding outstanding invoices.

0.7

10/1/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Scan disbursements/Receipts
from Friday/Monday and save on Q Drive. Reviewing and
printing further disbursements.

0.7

10/2/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking - Review incoming receipts, discuss with S.
Greenbaum and input reallocation to correct GL's. Print and
scan receipts documents and save on Q Drive. Prepare deposit
slips.

1.6

10/3/2019

Greenbaum, Stacey

Call with S. Gobin re radiant heaters.

0.3

10/3/2019

Klein, Emily

Preparation of production invoice for Kelly Toys for week
ending Oct 4, updating WSIB invoice for period ending Sept
30.

1.5

10/3/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administration - Deposits.

0.5

10/4/2019

Brown, Rose

Trust Banking Administraiton - Disbursement cheques.

0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours

10/4/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with KellyToys re status update, call with J. Sleeth re 120 1.0
St. Regis.

10/4/2019 Klein, Emily Paying invoices, updating WSIB premium remittance invoice 0.5
and letter.

10/4/2019 Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Greenbaum re: landlord issues, Hong Kong issues. 0.5

10/7/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of employee invoices, review of WSIB. 0.5

10/7/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking administration - Disbursement cheque and 0.6
prepare Payroll schedule and slips.

10/7/2019 Klein, Emily Submitting former employee's proof of claim, requesting 0.8
changes for insurance policy, creating employee invoices for
week ending October 4.

10/8/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Onsite at BMT (120 St. Regis) - site visit with landlord, 2.0
meeting with Karen.

10/8/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement cheques 0.8
and scan cheque/back up and save on Q Drive.

10/8/2019 Klein, Emily Setting up garbage pick for St Regis location, call with WSIB, 0.7
call re forklift repair, submission of various invoices for
payment.

10/9/2019 Klein, Emily Preparation of production invoice for Kelly Toys, call with CRA 2.5
regarding cheque re 2016 tax returns, reconciliation of
Crossdock account, reconciliation of source deductions.

10/10/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Call with S. Gobin, status call with J. Sleeth. 0.7

10/10/2019 [Klein, Emily Call with CRA, call with Rogers, emails with S. Gobin regarding 1.0
outstanding invoices, organize waste pick-up.

10/11/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Tom Gaa, BBS law, re Oracle, review of Oracle claim. 0.5

10/11/2019 |Brown, Rose Review disbursement for copy of insurance policy copy and 0.3
discuss with E. Klein.

10/15/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review of employee invoices, Kelly Toy reimbursement 0.5
schedule.

10/15/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden Review reimbursement schedules provided to Kelly Toy; status 1.0
update discussions with S. Greenbaum; call with R. Kiefer re:
general file update.

10/15/2019 |Klein, Emily Creating employee invoices for week ending Oct 11. 1.5
Preparation of Kelly Toys invoice for 3 weeks period ending Oct
11.

10/15/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Update R&D to Oct 11, 2019. 0.7
Prepare disbursement cheques.

10/16/2019 |Klein, Emily Call with Rogers regarding outstand invoices, call with Canada 1.0
Springs regarding water cooler pickup, submission of invoices
for payment.

10/16/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Payroll schedule, employee 0.8
cheques and Source deductions. Courier payroll cheque to
BMT offices.

10/17/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm-Disbursement cheques. 0.8

10/17/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Status update call with Kelly Toys. 0.3
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Date Name Narrative Hours
10/17/2019 |Klein, Emily Call with S. Gobin regarding assets onsite at 120 St. Regis. 0.3
10/18/2019 |Klein, Emily Call with Toronto Hydro, Rogers, Canadian Springs, GoDaddy 1.5
re reconciliation of accounts and cancelation of such services.
Emails with S. Gobin and Karen regarding various outstanding
matters.
10/21/2019 [Klein, Emily Preparation of employee invoices, emails with Karen regarding 2.4
outstanding moving matters, submission of invoices for
payment, reconciling Crossdock statements, call with CRA
regarding tax return review, call with collection agency.
10/21/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement cheques 2.0
and scan cheque/back up and save on Q Drive. Reconcile
account to bank and update R&D.
10/21/2019 |Brown, Rose Prepared Sept. bank reconciliations for review. 0.1
10/21/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Approval of invoices, CRA review, status call J. Sleeth. 2.0
10/22/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.3
10/22/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Onsite at BMT - review of space, discussions with Kelly Toys 3.0
and Karen.
10/22/2019 |Klein, Emily Onsite at BMT. Organizing garbage pickup, sending emails with 4.5
Karen, paying invoices.
10/22/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden Review HK tax issues memo from S. Gobin. 0.3
10/23/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden Review Hamleys issues, consider litigation. 0.3
10/23/2019 |Klein, Emily Submission of invoices for payment, organizing garbage pick 3.0
up and forklift delivery, preparing CRA assessment documents,
emails with suppliers re outstanding invoices.
10/23/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey 53 Bakersfield discussion with KellyToys and landlord, CRA 3.5
correspondence, review of invoices, call with S. Gobin.
10/24/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden HK tax return/filing issues; status update memo to E. Klein. 1.5
10/24/2019 |Klein, Emily Submission of invoices for payment, emails with Karen, 2.0
suppliers and KellyToys regarding outstanding invoices, review
of mail.
10/24/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Approval of invoices. 1.0
10/24/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2
10/25/2019 |Brown, Rose Fax & emails. 0.3
10/25/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden Status updates from S. Greenbaum, call with Karen and Peter 0.7
onsite.
10/28/2019 [Klein, Emily Call with Karen regarding production updates, preparing 2.0
employee invoices, submission of invoices for payment,
preparing letters for various creditors.
10/28/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Adm - Disbursement cheques and input 0.9
incoming wire received and prepare update R&D.
10/28/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden St. Regis turnover - draft response email to G. Seetner re: 1.5
status of turnover, update discusions with M. Sipp, E. Klein; air
tank as fixtures issue.
10/29/2019 [Klein, Emily Onsite at 120 St. Regis. Preparing Kelly Toys Invoice. 5.0
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Date Name Narrative Hours

10/29/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement/Payroll cheques, 0.8
have signed, scan and save on Q and courier/mail cheques.

10/29/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden St. Regis turnover - calls with new tenant, draft detailed 2.2
response to air tank as fixtures issue, discuss same with R.
Kennedy.

10/29/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Air tank discussion with new tenant re 120. St Regis and J. 0.5
Sleeth.

10/30/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

10/30/2019 |Klein, Emily Onsite at 120 St. Regis to supervise clean up of warehouse, 5.0
discussions on outstanding invoices and HST returns,
preparation of Kelly Toys production invoice.

10/30/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden St. Regis turnover - calls with E. Klein re: status of property 0.7
turnover; call with A. Macfarlane re: Loblaws release.

10/31/2019 |[Sleeth, Jorden St Regis turnorver - review status of property, call with S. 0.5
Greenbaum, call with landlord.

10/31/2019 |Klein, Emily Emails and calls with Karen and S.Gobin regarding outstanding 0.5
matters and closing of warehouse.

10/31/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Onsite at BMT re landlord inspection. 1.0

Total 202.6




ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

Interim bill in connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC from

November 1 to December 31, 2019.

Please see the attached appendices.

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8000983849

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration:

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

January 30, 2020
1332039
BES00071
Jorden Sleeth

122893605RT0001

20,945.00

389.13

2,773.44

24,107.57

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



Invoice Number 8000983849

January 30, 2020

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8000983849 24,107.57 Payment for invoice 8000983849
Unit)

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice number(s) paid

Payment Options
1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory) :
*Preferred Method*

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment
Transit - Institution : 47696-002 Transit - Institution : 47696-002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number : 1363514

2. Wire Payment:

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment, Beneficiary Bank (Bank of Nova Scotia) :
Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number : 476961363514
Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code : NOSCCATT

Clearing Code : CC000247696

Address: P.O. Box 4234 STN A, Toronto ON M4W 5P6

Page2/2
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USD Payment, Intermediary Bank (Bank of America NA) :

Address: 222 Broadway, New York, NY 10038

Account Number: 476961363514
Swift Code: BOFAUS3N
ABA Routing Number : 026009593

Note: Intermediary Bank information may not be required for

payments coming from outside the US

3.Online Payment :

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of the Client

No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to :

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments, pay : For USD Dollar ($) Payments, pay :
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/0T04567C c/o0T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Sleeth, Jorden Partner 3.0 $ 700.00 | $ 2,100.00
Greenbaum, Stacey Manager 15.5 $ 425.00 | $ 6,587.50
Keene, Ashley Senior 0.1 $ 325.00 | $ 32.50
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.4 $ 250.00 | $ 100.00
Klein, Emily Analyst 33.9 $ 250.00 | $ 8,475.00
Brown, Rose Consultant 14.6 $ 250.00 | $ 3,650.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 67.5 $ 20,945.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses $ 389.13
Total Fees and Expenses $ 21,334.13




Date

Appendix #2

Name
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Work performed for the months of November & December 2019

Date Name Narrative Hours

11/1/2019 Klein, Emily Emails with HUB regarding outstanding amounts due, emails 0.5
with Karen and Shelly regarding inventory.

11/4/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Update Ascend and prepare R&D to Nov 1/19. 0.6

11/4/2019 Klein, Emily Creating employee invoices, reconciling Octagon hours for 1.0
invoice, completing Kelly Toys invoice.

11/5/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare disbursement/payroll 0.7
cheques.

11/5/2019 Klein, Emily Sending operating invoices for payment. 0.5

11/6/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Prepare S. 246 notice. 0.3

11/6/2019 Klein, Emily Updating R&D. 0.5

11/7/2019 Koo, Ada Prepare October bank reconciliation. 0.2

11/7/2019 Klein, Emily Emails with Kellytoys regarding outstanding invoices. 0.3

11/8/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Disbursement cheques. 0.4

11/8/2019 Klein, Emily Reconciliation of bank accounts and R&D. 2.0

11/11/2019 [Klein, Emily Sending invoices to trust admin for payment, creating 4.5
employee invoices, review of received mail, updating R&D
summary, compiling invoices to send to Kellytoys for
reimbursement.

11/11/2019 |Brown, Rose Reviewing payables and send copies to EK. 0.3

11/11/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review of certain items (Oracle, Walmart, Hamleys, Inventory 2.2
adjustment) and BIA S.246 notice, call with M. Sipp re
Bakersfield.

11/12/2019 |Brown, Rose Payroll and disbursement cheques. Review disbursement to 1.5
confirm Hydro refund cheque.

11/12/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review Kellytoy disbursement invoice & follow up re Kellytoy 0.5
questions.

11/12/2019 |Klein, Emily Correspondence with Karen and Marguerite re outstanding 2.5
invoices. Updating Kellytoys invoice. Finalize S.246 report.

11/12/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Review s.246 report, revise and approve for distribution; 0.5
review correspondence with KellyToy and Seetner.

11/13/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Call with R. Kennedy re A/R demands and HK IRD letter, 0.5
finalize HK IRD letter.

11/13/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Disbursement cheques and review R&D 1.8
and send Interim Report to OSB.

11/13/2019 |Klein, Emily Correspondence with Karen and Marguerite regarding 2.0

outstanding payments and services. Sending invoices to trust
admin for payment. Call with Enbridge regarding discrepancies
in invoices received.
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Date Name Narrative Hours
11/14/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration. 1.0
11/14/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Update meeting with S. Greenbaum, review various issues - 1.2
Loblaws, WalMart, Bakersfield, HST deemed trust.
11/14/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Status meeting with J. Sleeth re Oracle, Wal Mart Canada. 0.3
11/15/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Weekly invoice approvals. 1.0
11/15/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Deposit. 0.3
11/18/2019 |Klein, Emily Employee invoices for w/e Nov 15. 1.0
11/18/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 1.1
11/19/2019 [Klein, Emily Arrange garbage pickup, correspondence with SimTech. 1.0
11/19/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Status update call with M. Sipp, preparing court report. 1.8
11/19/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden File update call with R. Kiefer, debrief same with S. 0.8
Greenbaum.
11/19/2019 |Brown, Rose Update R&D and reconcile to bank. 0.5
11/20/2019 |Klein, Emily Preparing First Receiver's draft report, updating R&D and A/R 4.3
schedules, correspondence with SimTech re invoicing, sending
invoices for payment, call with CRA regarding notice received.
11/20/2019 |Brown, Rose Review Crossdock payment and confirm cheque was cashed 0.2
and send copy of cheque to EK.
11/20/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Status update call with J. Sleeth and R. Kiefer (BMO), court 2.2
report writing, review of inventory escrow.
11/21/2019 |Klein, Emily Correspondence with Google Suite re access. Arranging 2.2
garbage pick ups, correspondence with SimTech,
correspondence with Marguerite on outstanding invoices.
11/21/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust banking - disbursement cheques 0.5
11/21/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Preparing court report. 1.3
11/22/2019 |Keene, Ashley Website update. 0.1
11/22/2019 |Brown, Rose Review GL for incoming receipt coding. Send EK us $ online 0.5
banking report.
11/22/2019 |Sleeth, Jorden Review escrow agreement re: KellyToy APA with S. 0.5
Greenbaum; status update call with R. Kennedy.
11/22/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review of court report with E.Klein. 1.2
11/22/2019 |[Klein, Emily Review of First Receiver's report with S. Greenbaum, 1.6
correspondence with SimTech re outstanding invoices,
reconciling bank statement with Kellytoys receipts.
11/25/2019 |Klein, Emily Creating employee invoices for w/e Nov 22. Calls with 1.2
Enbridge, Hamleys, and Service Canada re outstanding
invoices. Arranging garbage pickup for Bakersfield.
11/26/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review of inventory escrow and call with M. Sipp re the same, 1.5
emails with Bakersfield landlord.
11/26/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement/Payroll cheques. 0.7
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Date Name Narrative Hours

11/26/2019 |[Klein, Emily Correspondence with PECO re pallet pickup, correspondence 1.3
with Karen on status of Bakersfield closing, review of received
mail, correspondence with Shelly re outstanding invoices.

11/27/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Status update call with J.Sleeth. 0.2

11/28/2019 |Klein, Emily Call with Shelly regarding A/R reconciliation. Preparing court 1.7
report.

11/28/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Review of court report with E.Klein. 0.2

11/29/2019 |Brown, Rose Printing disbursement requests. 0.1

11/29/2019 |Klein, Emily Creating employee invoices. 0.5

12/2/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit and 1.6
disbursement/payroll cheques.

12/2/2019 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of Toys R Us claim, finalize inventory escrow re 0.6
Kellytoys.

12/2/2019 Klein, Emily Organizing and filing mail. 0.2

12/3/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques and mail 0.3
cheques.

12/5/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Disbursement cheques. 0.4

12/6/2019 Klein, Emily Correspondence with Marguerite regarding SimTech invoices, 0.2
responding to former employees WEPP questions.

12/7/2019 Klein, Emily Review of invoices and sending to trust admin for payment. 0.5
Emails with Simtech and Marguerite regarding amounts due.

12/9/2019 Klein, Emily Call with Service Canada re ROEs for various employees. 1.0
Reconciling A/R.

12/9/2019 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement requests. 0.5

12/10/2019 |Klein, Emily Emails with Karen and Marguerite regarding forklift rental 0.8
costs. Sending invoices to trust admin to be paid. Call with
former employee regarding WEPPA. Call with Shelly regarding
outstanding AR collections.

12/10/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - recording wire received in 0.5
Ascend and print/can support.

12/10/2019 |Koo, Ada Prepare November bank reconciliation. 0.2

12/11/2019 [Klein, Emily Call with CRA re audit on BMT's Receivership activity. 0.2

12/16/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Admin - Disbursements - Wire/cheque 0.6

12/18/2019 |Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque and input 0.3
wire,

12/18/2019 |Klein, Emily Completing employees ROE forms. 1.2

12/19/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Deloitte HK regarding letter from HK government re 0.7
employees.

12/19/2019 |Klein, Emily Email with Toronto Utility regarding outstanding invoice. 0.1
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Date Name Narrative Hours

12/20/2019 |Brown, Rose Review account for process of wire. Email to BMO to obtain 0.2
confirmation.

12/23/2019 |Greenbaum, Stacey Call with S. Gobin re HK employees. 1.0

12/23/2019 |Klein, Emily Drafting preliminary final reimbursement schedule for 1.1
Kellytoys.

Total 67.5




ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

In connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC from January 2,
2020 to March 31, 2020.

Please see the attached appendices.

Expense

Out-of-pocket Expenses

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8001136709

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration :

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

April 22,2020
1332039
BES00071
Jorden Sleeth

122893605RT0001

35,545.00

477.36

4,682.91

40,705.27

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



Invoice Number 8001136709

April 22,2020

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8001136709 40,705.27 Payment for invoice 8001136709
Unit)

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice number(s) paid

Payment Options
1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory) :
*Preferred Method*

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment
Transit - Institution : 47696-002 Transit - Institution : 47696-002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number : 1363514

2. Wire Payment:

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment, Beneficiary Bank (Bank of Nova Scotia) :
Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number : 476961363514
Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code : NOSCCATT

Clearing Code : CC000247696

Address: P.O. Box 4234 STN A, Toronto ON M4W 5P6

Page2/2
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USD Payment, Intermediary Bank (Bank of America NA) :

Address: 222 Broadway, New York, NY 10038

Account Number: 476961363514
Swift Code: BOFAUS3N
ABA Routing Number : 026009593

Note: Intermediary Bank information may not be required for

payments coming from outside the US

3.Online Payment :

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of the Client

No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to :

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments : For USD Dollar ($) Payments :
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/0T04567C c/o0T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Sleeth, Jorden Partner 12.1 700.00 8,470.00
Greenbaum, Stacey Senior Manager 25.5 550.00 14,025.00
Koo, Ada Analyst 0.5 250.00 125.00
Klein, Emily Analyst 39.4 250.00 9,850.00
Brown, Rose Consultant 12.3 250.00 3,075.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 89.8 35,545.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses 477.36
Total Fees and Expenses 36,022.36




Date

Appendix #2

Name
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Work performed from January 2 to March 31, 2020

Date Name Narrative Hours

1/2/2020 Klein, Emily Preparation of disbursements. 0.4

1/2/2020 Brown, Rose Input wire and services fees from Dec 2019. 0.2

1/3/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review draft first receiver's report, edit and draft update 2.8
sections.

1/6/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey ERV analysis. 1.4

1/6/2020 Klein, Emily Phone call with S.Greenbaum on ERV and first Receiver's 2.7
Report. Updating ERV and R&D.

1/7/2020 Klein, Emily Updating ERV and R&D and call with S.Greenbaum on the 2.4
same.

1/7/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Status update meeting with S. Greenbaum and E. Klein re: 1.3
ERV, HK, EDC claim timing.

1/7/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey December 31 ERV analysis. 2.2

1/8/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Discussion with Dentons re HK items. 0.6

1/8/2020 Klein, Emily Emails with creditors for invoices re operations. Updating ERV, 2.7
R&D, and first Receiver's report.

1/9/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Dentons re Hamleys A/R, review of first Receiver's 1.8
report, review of Kelly Toys inventory escrow, notes to file.

1/9/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review ERV update with E. Klein; debrief Dentons call with S. 1.7
Greenbaum

1/9/2020 Brown, Rose Review Kelly Toy deposit and confirming entries in Ascend. 1.2
Prepare schedule. Discuss with E Klein. Trust Banking
Administration - Disbursement cheque.

1/9/2020 Klein, Emily Review of ERV and R&D with S.Greenbaum and J.Sleeth. 1.6

1/10/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

1/10/2020 Klein, Emily Call with S.Gobin regarding outstanding matters (EDC, AR). 0.5

1/13/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Art Goguen re Red Rock insurance. 0.4

1/13/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposits. 0.5

1/13/2020 Klein, Emily Updating first Receiver's report. 2.3

1/13/2020 Klein, Emily Mail review; emails with SimTech, Waste Connections; emails 0.6
with S. Gobin re AR - EDC breakdown; call re WEPPA.

1/14/2020 Klein, Emily Updating ERV and EDC calculations. 2.6

1/14/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey December 31 ERV analysis. 1.9

1/15/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of vacation pay and escrow accounts. 1.3

1/15/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review updated realization schedule and provide comments to 1.4
S. Greenbaum.

1/15/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheques. 0.5
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Date Name Narrative Hours
1/15/2020 Klein, Emily CRA request re audit of Receiver's account; preparing final 2.1
reimbursement schedule for Kelly Toys.
1/16/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Finalize December 31 ERV. 1.4
1/17/2020 Klein, Emily Preparing final reimbursement schedule for Kelly Toys. 1.1
1/20/2020 Klein, Emily Finalizing the final reimbursement schedule for Kelly Toys. 1.6
1/21/2020 Klein, Emily Compiling documents re CRA request; updating the first 3.5
Receiver's report with S.Greenbaum; updating Kelly Toy with
amounts outstanding with Simtech.
1/21/2020 Brown, Rose Wepp correspondence - Scan and save on Q. 0.1
1/22/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of EDC claim. 1.3
1/22/2020 Klein, Emily Meeting with S.Greenbaum and J.Sleeth re EDC claim and 3.8
updating of the same; A/R reconciliation from monies received;
preparing employee invoice.
1/23/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with Dentons HK re: IRD letter and income tax priority, 1.2
discuss employee claim priority; debrief with S. Greenbaum.
1/23/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Dentons HK re various HK issues; draft IRD letter re 2.1
HK taxes; review of final Kelly toys reimbursement .
1/23/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Deposit. 0.4
1/23/2020 Klein, Emily Finalizing reimbursement schedule with S.Greenbaum. 0.3
1/24/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with S. Gobin re HK employees. 0.6
1/24/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Payroll cheque and remittance. 1.5
Review Payroll schedule for 2019 and reconcile sheet to Ascend
and prepare T4's.
1/27/2020 Klein, Emily Coordination re Kelly Toys reimbursement information and final 0.6
SimTech invoice documents.
1/28/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey HK IRD correspondence. 0.7
1/28/2020 Klein, Emily Preparing EDC claim form with S.Greenbaum; organizing and 1.6
filing mail.
1/29/2020 Klein, Emily Compiling documents for CRA audit request; preparing letter to 2.8
BMO re closing bank accounts.
1/29/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque and 0.6
Review GL and obtain back up support for two entries
requested by EK.
1/30/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review EDC claim forms with S. Greenbaum. 0.8
1/30/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of HK employees schedule prepared by S. Gobin; 2.6
review of EDC claim; review of CRA letter; call with R. Kennedy
re insured A/R and follow up with Red Rock.
1/30/2020 Klein, Emily Correspondence with a creditor re Proof of Claim questions; 0.9
completing CRA audit review with S.Greenbaum; review of
EDC claim form with J.Sleeth and S.Greenbaum and sending
follow-up questions to S. Gobin.
1/31/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with S. Gobin re HK employees. 1.1
2/3/2020 Koo, Ada Prepare December bank reconciliation - 2 accounts. 0.2
2/3/2020 Klein, Emily Compiling documents for EDC claim form appendices. 2.4
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Date Name Narrative Hours

2/5/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - confirm incoming wire received 0.2
and input into Ascend.

2/10/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with BMO re EDC claim and amend EDC claim. 0.6

2/10/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare T4 slips and summary, reconcile to Ascend GL. 2.0

2/10/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Greenbaum and R. Kiefer re: EDC claim review; 0.8
debrief same with S. Greenbaum.

2/11/2020 Brown, Rose Complete reconciliation of T4's to Ascend GL. Update T4's slip 1.3
and discuss with EK to review slips.

2/11/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with EDC re: claim submitted, debrief with S. Greenbaum. 0.7

2/11/2020 Klein, Emily Review of 2019 T4 slips. 1.2

2/11/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with S.Gobin re EDC claim; call with EDC & BMO re EDC 0.4
claim.

2/13/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare labels for mailing T4's. 0.4

2/19/2020 Brown, Rose Labels, copy and send out T4 slips. 0.3

2/26/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.2

3/3/2020 Brown, Rose Scan and saving Service Canada Letter. 0.2

3/9/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - pull online banking reports and 0.7
reconcile to Ascend and input bank charges. Inquiry regarding
investment purchase.

3/10/2020 Koo, Ada Prepare January bank reconciliation. 0.3
3/10/2020 Brown, Rose Set up investment, print purchase info and have signed and 0.3
fax to BMO. Print certificate.

3/11/2020 Klein, Emily Downloads of Google cloud documents onto Q drive. 0.7
3/19/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with R. Kiefer; follow up with S. Greenbaum and E. Klein. 0.6
3/23/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with BMO and EDC, amending EDC claim. 1.4
3/24/2020 Klein, Emily Employee invoice. 0.2
3/24/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Print payroll request. 0.2
3/25/2020 Klein, Emily ROE for employee. 0.8
3/25/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare payroll schedule and 0.6

payroll deductions, input cheques.
3/26/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Status update call with S. Greenbaum re: HK employees; EDC 0.8
claim discussion.
3/26/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of outstanding task list. 0.7
3/26/2020 Brown, Rose Print Disbursement cheques. 0.2
3/30/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Preparation of HK labour department letter re employees. 3.0
3/30/2020 Brown, Rose Disbursement wire. 0.3
3/31/2020 Brown, Rose Disbursement wire. 0.2
Total 89.8




ATTN: Robert A. Kiefer

Bank of Montreal (Special Accounts Management Unit)
100 King Street West, 7th Floor

Toronto ON M5X 1A1

Canada

For professional services rendered

Fees

In connection with Best Made Toys International, ULC from March 9, 2020

to July 17, 2020.

Please see the attached appendices.

Expense

Out of pocket Expenses

Sales Tax
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Invoice 8001286491

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Bay Adelaide Centre

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto ON M5H 0A9

Tel: (416) 601-6150
Fax: (416) 601-6151
www.deloitte.ca

Date:
Client No.:
WBS#:

Engagement Partner:

HST Registration :

HST applicable

HST applicable

HST at 13.00%

Total Amount Due (CAD)

July 22,2020
1332039
BES00071
Jorden Sleeth

122893605RT0001

13,520.00

61.60

1,765.61

15,347.21

Accounts shall be due and payable when rendered. Interest shall be calculated at a simple daily rate of 0.0493% (equivalent to 18% per
annum). Interest shall be charged and payable at this rate on any part of an account which remains unpaid from thirty(30) days after the

invoice date to the date on which the entire account is paid.



Invoice Number 8001286491

July 22, 2020

Use the following payment methods and ensure your payment contains the details provided in the example.

Client Name Client# Invoice# Amount (CAD) Comments

Bank of Montreal (Special
Accounts Management 1332039 8001286491 15,347.21 Payment for invoice 8001286491
Unit)

Contact:

Please send payment confirmation by email to: receivablesdebiteurs@deloitte.ca, and reference the invoice number(s) paid

Payment Options
1. EFT Payments(remittance email mandatory) :
*Preferred Method*

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment
Transit - Institution : 47696-002 Transit - Institution : 47696-002
Account Number: 1590219 Account Number : 1363514

2. Wire Payment:

Bank of Nova Scotia: 44 King Street West, Toronto, Ontario M5H 1H1

CAD Payment USD Payment, Beneficiary Bank (Bank of Nova Scotia) :
Account Number: 476961590219 Account Number : 476961363514
Swift Code: NOSCCATT Swift Code : NOSCCATT

Clearing Code : CC000247696

Address: P.O. Box 4234 STN A, Toronto ON M4W 5P6

Page2/2
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USD Payment, Intermediary Bank (Bank of America NA) :

Address: 222 Broadway, New York, NY 10038

Account Number: 476961363514
Swift Code: BOFAUS3N
ABA Routing Number : 026009593

Note: Intermediary Bank information may not be required for

payments coming from outside the US

3.Online Payment :

Select either Deloitte LLP or Deloitte S.E.N.C.R.L./s.r.l. through your financial institution and quote the seven digits of the Client

No. shown above.

Please note we do not accept Interac e-Transfers.

4. Cheque payments, please mail to :

For CAD Dollar ($) Payments : For USD Dollar ($) Payments :
DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP DELOITTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES LP
c/0T04567C c/o0T04567U

PO Box 4567, Stn A PO Box 4567, Stn A

Toronto ON M5W 0J1 Toronto ON M5W 0J1
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Appendix #1

Summary of Fees

Name Level Hours Rate Amount
Sleeth, Jorden Partner 8.5 700.00 5,950.00
Greenbaum, Stacey Senior Manager 5.9 550.00 3,245.00
Klein, Emily Analyst 15.2 250.00 3,800.00
Brown, Rose Consultant 2.1 250.00 525.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees 31.7 13,520.00
Out-of-pocket Expenses 61.60
Total Fees and Expenses (CAD) 13,581.60




Appendix #2

Work performed from March 9, 2020 to July 17, 2020
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Date Name Narrative Hours

3/11/2020 Klein, Emily Downloading all documents on the Google cloud onto the Q 0.7
drive and cancelling Google cloud membership.

3/23/2020 Klein, Emily Updating the EDC application so that the enforcement costs 1.9
are in CAD. Call with SG to discuss the changes made on the
EDC detail.

3/24/2020 Klein, Emily Sending final employee invoice to Rose Brown for payment. 0.2

3/25/2020 Klein, Emily Completing ROE details for employee Michelle Gobin. 0.8

4/1/2020 Brown, Rose Fax into BOM Wire request and email to BOM contact to 0.2
confirm processed.

4/2/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Input wire processed Apr 1 0.2
and reconcile bank to GL to obtain listing of outstanding
cheques.

4/6/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with BMO re claim form and updating claim 0.4

4/7/2020 Klein, Emily Investigating outstanding cheque listing and contacting these 0.4
vendors whom have not cashed these respective cheques.

4/7/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey EDC claim form 0.5

4/9/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with BMO & EDC re claim form 0.3

4/23/2020 Klein, Emily Re-issuing payment for outstanding Cheques that had stop 0.3
payments made on them.

4/23/2020 Brown, Rose Prepare stop payment, have signed and send to BMO. 0.2

4/24/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Prepare replacement cheque 0.3
for employee and input stop payment in Ascend.

4/29/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Greenbaum re: HK employees, tax returns, paths 0.5
to finalizing file.

4/29/2020 Klein, Emily Calculating the WSIB remittance for the period October 1, 0.9
2019 to March 31, 2020.

4/29/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement cheque. 0.3

4/30/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking Administration - Disbursement wire, confirm 0.4
wire with BMO.

4/30/2020 Klein, Emily Finalizing WSIB remittance paper work for the period 0.2
October, 2019 to March, 2020.

5/4/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with Grant Thornton HK & follow up email 0.3
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Date Name Narrative Hours

5/6/2020 Brown, Rose Scan and send mail to SG. 0.1

5/12/2020 Klein, Emily Calling the CRA regarding the corporate tax return details for 0.9
2019. Investigating how to object against penalties incurred
from income tax returns.

6/15/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Prepare to do list for o/s items 1.0

6/15/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Respond to R. Kiefer email, circulate status update to R. 0.4
Kennedy.

6/15/2020 Klein, Emily Calling the WSIB to close the account and reconcile payments 1.2
made. Calling the CRA regarding outstanding penalties owed
and notifying them of the bankrupt estate.

6/16/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Status update call with J. Sleeth; Call with J. Sleeth and R. 1.2
Kennedy; various follow up items (HK, security deposit, tax)

6/16/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Calls with S. Greenbaum re: outstanding items to resolve; 1.0
call with S. Greenbaum and R. Kennedy re: plan to attend in
court for distribution order.

6/17/2020 Klein, Emily Completing an income tax objection form to dispute a tax 2.2
form penalty, updating and reconciling the R&D to May 31,
2020, sending a request to have payroll audits complete.

6/18/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Gobin re: tax reporting and finalizing estate. 0.3

6/23/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review updated R&D, circulate estimated distribution memo 1.0
to R. Kiefer; call with R. Kennedy and S. Greenbaum re:
distribution motion, report preparation.

6/28/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review and revise receiver report, circulate comments to S. 1.5
Greenbaum and E. Klein.

6/29/2020 Klein, Emily Updating the First Receiver's Report using J. Sleeth's and S. 1.9
Greenbaum's comments. Corresponding with the WSIB
regarding outstanding premiums owed.

6/29/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of receiver's report re J. Sleeth comments 0.2

6/30/2020 Klein, Emily Updating the First Receiver's Report and discussing over 1.0
conference call with S. Greenbaum and J. Sleeth.

6/30/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Call with S. Greenbaum and E. Klein re: receiver report 0.8
revisions.

6/30/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with J. Sleeth and E. Klein re receiver's report 0.5

7/2/2020 Klein, Emily Updating the First Receiver's Report and the R&D to June 30. 0.8

7/6/2020 Sleeth, Jorden Review and revise distribution court report, circulate to R. 3.0
Kennedy for review.

7/7/2020 Klein, Emily Creating a summary table of all legal fees paid during the 1.0
Receivership.
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Date Name Narrative Hours

7/7/2020 Brown, Rose Trust Banking - Disbursement voucher. Confirm investment 0.4
not renew with the bank and input into Ascend.

7/8/2020 Klein, Emily Corresponding with the CRA regarding outstanding 0.3
documents required for the RT0002 audit.

7/9/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Review of CRA correspondence & Walmart emails re E. Klein; 1.0
follow up emails with HK employees

7/9/2020 Klein, Emily Corresponding with S. Greenbaum regarding outstanding CRA 0.5
audit requests. Going through current files to locate relevant
documents for the audit.

7/13/2020 Greenbaum, Stacey Call with HK employees 0.5

Total 31.7
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Appendix "H”
to the First Report of the Receiver
dated July 22, 2020
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Court File No.: CV-19-00618506-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

BETWEEN:
BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —
BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDINGS LLC

Respondents

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION PURSUANT TO SECTION 243(1) OF THE
BANKRTUPCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED; AND
SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED

AFFIDAVIT OF ROBERT KENNEDY
(sworn July 22nd, 2020)

I, ROBERT KENNEDY, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, SWEAR

AND SAY AS FOLLOWS:

1. I am a Partner with Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons”), as such, I have knowledge of the

matters to which I hereinafter depose.

2. Pursuant to an Order dated April 25, 2019 (the “Receivership Order”), Deloitte
Restructuring Inc. was appointed Receiver and Manager of Best Made Toys
International, ULC, Best Made Toys LLC, Best Made Toys Global Enterprises Limited

and Best Made Toys Holdings LLC in the within proceedings (the “Receiver”).

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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3. The Receiver retained Dentons as counsel to advise it with regard to the matters related to

its appointment and the exercise of its powers and performance of its duties.

4. The Receivership Order provides at paragraph 19 that the Receiver, and counsel to the
Receiver, shall be paid their reasonable fees and disbursements at their standard rates and

charges.

5. The Dentons fees and disbursements for the period of April 17, 2019 to July 20, 2020
(the “Fee Period”), are summarized in the invoices rendered to the Receiver (the
“Invoices”). The Invoices are a fair and accurate description of the services provided, the
disbursements incurred and the amounts charged by Dentons. I am advised by the
Receiver that it has reviewed the Invoices and that it considers the fees and disbursements

as fair and reasonable. Attached and marked as Exhibit “A” are the Invoices.

6. Attached and marked as Exhibit “B” is a schedule summarizing the Invoices, the total
billable hours charged, the total fees charged (both prior to and after the application of the

applicable discount) along with the average hourly rate charged.

7. Attached and marked as Exhibit “C” is a schedule summarizing the respective years of
call and standard billing rates of each of the solicitors at Dentons who acted for the

Receiver.

8. The Dentons rates and disbursements are consistent with those in the market for these
types of matters and have been previously approved by this Honourable Court in similar

proceedings.

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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-3-
0. Due to the circumstances of the COVID-19 pandemic, I am unable to be physically
present to swear this Affidavit. I, however, was linked by way of video technology to the

Commissioner commissioning this document.

10. I make this affidavit in support of the motion for, among other things, approval of the

fees and disbursements of Dentons and for no other or improper purpose.

SWORN before me by video conference )
from City of Toronto in the Province of
Ontario, to City of Toronto in the Province
of Ontario, on 22nd day of July, 2020. >~

J
A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. ROBERT KENNEDY

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1



THIS IS EXHIBIT "A" REFERRED TO IN THE
AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE OF ROBERT KENNEDY
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 22nd DAY OF JULY,
2020.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc.

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3462424

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date Matter Number Lawyer
October 31, 2019 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 92,269.00
Less: Discount (3,776.50)
Net Professional Fees S 88,492.50
Disbursements 23,878.12
HST (13.0%) on $112,370.62 14,608.19
Total Amount Due $ 126,978.81 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Credit Card:

Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:

Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all out¢anding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 342406
Page 2 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

17-Apr-19

18-Apr-19

18-Apr-19

21-Apr-19

22-Apr-19

22-Apr-19

23-Apr-19

23-Apr-19

23-Apr-19

23-Apr-19

24-Apr-19

24-Apr-19

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Rennie Ali

Kori Williams

Danijel Augustinovic

Robert Kennedy

Danijel Augustinovic

Robert Kennedy

Review correspondence from Alex MacFarlane. Review
loan documentation. Conference with Kori Williams.
Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review draft order. Various conversations with Jorden
Sleeth. Conversation with Alex MacFarlane. Review
notice of application.

Emails in connection with documents for security
review.

Conversation  with  Jorden Sleeth regarding
appointment. Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth
regarding report. Conference with Kori Williams. Review
loan documentation. Correspondence from and to
Christine Mason.

Review loan and security documentation.
Correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.

Emails and telephone calls in connection with security
review.

Various correspondence from and to Kori Williams
regarding security review. Review loan and security
documentation. Review application materials. Work on
Receiver's Report. Various correspondence to and from
Jorden Sleeth. Conversation with Jorden Sleeth.

Conducting ON, BC and UCC searches with respect to
Canadian borrower, US borrower and guarantor.

Emails in connection with security review. Begin review
of security and credit agreement. Office conferences
with Danijel Augustinovic.

Review security. Review BLG security review. Various
correspondence regarding same.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review various correspondence regarding security
review. Voicemail from and to Kori Williams regarding
security review. Review correspondence from BLG
regarding application record. Review application
record. Review various correspondence from Alex
MacFarlane regarding HK matters.

Review security. Various correspondence regarding
same.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review application materials. Review various



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34624p4

Page 3 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

25-Apr-19
25-Apr-19
25-Apr-19

29-Apr-19

30-Apr-19

01-May-19

02-May-19

03-May-19

03-May-19

06-May-19

06-May-19

06-May-19

Rennie Ali
Danijel Augustinovic
Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Jonathan Meyer

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

correspondence regarding HK matters. Consider
appointment matters. Various conversations with
Jorden Sleeth regarding appointment matters.
Correspondence to and from Bevan Brooksbank.

Conducting BIA and PPSA searches.
Review and revise security report.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review appointment order. Work on HK matters.
Various correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane.

Various correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane.
Various correspondence to and from Robert Rhoda.
Review and consider matters re: HK enforcement.
Preperation for conference call. Attend conference call.
Correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth re:
insurance matters. Conversation with Alex MacFarlane
re: insurance matters. Conference call with Robert
Rhoda and James Wong re: HK matters and strategy.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda and James Wong.
Conversation with Jorden Sleeth.

Review correspondence from James Wong. Conference
with Kori Williams regarding security reviews. Review
receivership order regarding bank accounts. Consider
HK issues. Review correspondence from Jorden Sleeth.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Conversation with Jorden Sleeth and Andrew
Whittingham re: administration and HK matters.
Correspondence from and to Alex MacFarlane.
Correspondence to James Wong.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Correspondence from and to Alex MacFarlane.
Voicemail to and from Alex MacFarlane.

Emails and office conferences in connection with
security review. Review lease agreement with
Commercial Air Compressor Ltd.

Correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda re: HK matters.

Reviewing the law relating to unregistered equipment
leases for Kori Williams. Meeting with Kori Williams
regarding same.

Emails and office conferences with Jonathan Meyer.
Office conferences with Robert Kennedy. Review and
revise security report/opinion. Review lease.

Review and revise memorandum re: HK strategy.
Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth. Consider HK strategy
matters and review security documentation.
Conference with Kori Williams re: security opinion



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34624p2

Page 4 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

07-May-19

07-May-19

08-May-19

08-May-19

09-May-19

10-May-19

10-May-19

13-May-19

13-May-19

14-May-19

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

matters. Correspondence to Robert Rhoda.

Review equipment lease and analyze same to determine
whether it is a true or a financing lease.

Review correspondence from Robert Rhoda. Consider
HK strategy. Various correspondence to and from
Jorden Sleeth. Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re:
strategy. Prepare notes re: HK strategy.
Correspondence from and to Andrew Whittingham.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda. Conversation with
Alex MacFarlane.

Finalize review of leases in connection with title issue.
Email correspondence to and from Robert Kennedy in
connection with same.

Work on HK matters and strategy. Correspondence to
Robert Rhoda and James Wong. Review AR list and
revise demand letter. Review lease documentation.
Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham. Correspondence to Alex MacFarlane.
Conversation with Alex MacFarlane. Conference with
Kori Williams.

Review and consider HK options. Various
correspondence to and from Robert Rhoda. Attend
conference call re: HK enforcement options. Various
conversations with Jorden Sleeth re: enforcement
strategy.

Emails in connection with leases. Review security
documents in connection with security opinion. Review
and revise opinion.

Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham. Work on HK matters. Correspondence to
Jorden Sleeth re: HK receivables. Conference with
Daniel Augustinovic re: opinions.

Telephone call with Deloitte. Review security report.
Further research on true leases. Review forklift lease.

Correspondence to Robert Rhoda. Review draft
demand letter re: AR. Consider receivable collection
matters. Various correspondence to and from Jorden
Sleeth. Conference with Kori Williams. Various
correspondence to and from Andrew Whittingham.
Review lease matters. Attend conference call re: lease
and security reviews. Conference with Kori Williams re:
release.

Various correspondence to and from Robert Rhoda.
Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review  draft statutory demand. Variosu
correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34243
Page 5 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

15-May-19

15-May-19

15-May-19

15-May-19

16-May-19
16-May-19

16-May-19

16-May-19

17-May-19

17-May-19

22-May-19

22-May-19

23-May-19

23-May-19
24-May-19

26-May-19

Kim Lawton

Kori Williams

Danijel Augustinovic

Robert Kennedy

Rennie Ali
Kori Williams

Danijel Augustinovic

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Robert Kennedy

Rennie Ali

Kori Williams

Kori Williams

Danijel Augustinovic
Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Correspondence to and from Andrew Whittingham.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda re: third party
demands. Conversation with Alex MacFarlane re:
administration matters.

Emails and discussions with Kori Williams regarding full
and final release.

Prepare and circulate receipt and releases to be
executed by lessors of equipment. Emails in connection
with replicated additional release.

Prepare draft release. Various correspondences
regarding same. Review invoices.

Various correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane.
Conversation with Alex MacFarlane. Review statutory
demand. Review draft release. Various correspondence
to and from Andrew Whittingham.

Ordering updated ON and BC PPSA and BIA searches.

Arrange for additional searches, review same. Emails in
connection with amended and restated forbearance
agreement. Emails in connection with release letters.
Emails in connection with PPSA registration in
connection with PPSA registration against the HK
registration.

Review and revise security opinion. Correspondence
regarding return of equipment.

Review correspondence from Jorden  Sleeth.
Correspondence to Alex MacFarlane. Conference with
Kori Williams. Work on HK matters. Correspondence to
Andrew Whittingham.

Emails in connection with PPSA registration in
connection with the HK entity.

Conversation with Alex MacFarlane re: administration
matters.

Obtaining ON PPSA search with respect to Best Made
Toys Global Enterprises Limited

Review and revise security report. Emails to and from
Dentons US in connection with US report. Office
conferences with Danijel Augustinovic.

Revise and circulate security report. Telephone call with
Danijel Augustinovic and Scott Thompson (Dentons US)
in connection with the US security report.

Call with Scott Thompson regarding security review.

Various correspondence re: administration matters.
Conversation with Alex MacFarlane.

Work on HK matters. Various correspondence to and
from Robert Rhoda. Correspondence to Alex



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34624b 4}
Page 6 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

27-May-19

28-May-19

29-May-19

30-May-19

31-May-19

31-May-19

03-Jun-19

03-Jun-19

04-Jun-19

04-Jun-19

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

MacFarlane. Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth.

Review correspondence from Robert Rhoda.
Correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth.
Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: administration
matters. Review various correspondence from Chris
Savo.

Review correspondence re: commission claims. Review
statutory demand. Correspondence from and to Chris
Savo. Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham re: administration matters. Conversation
with Andrew Whittingham.

Various correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth re:
administration matters. Review and consider landlord
issues.

Review various correspondence re: administration
matters. Conversation with Jorden Sleeth and Andrew
Whittingham. Review correspondence from Robert
Rhoda. Review draft notice re: debenture. Review
executed demand. Correspondence to Robert Rhoda.

Review notice. Various correspondence to and from
Alex MacFarlane. Various correspondence to Robert
Rhoda. Review and consider commission issue.
Conference with Mark Freake. Voicemail left with
Gordon Hearn.

Review notice. Various correspondence to and from
Alex MacFarlane. Various correspondence to Robert
Rhoda. Review and consider commission issue.
Conference with Mark Freake. Voicemail left with
Gordon Hearn. Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth and
Andrew Whittingham.

Review letter from Fernandes Hearn LLP regarding trust
claim by PSMA Inc. Review case law regarding trust
issues.

Various correspondence to and from James Wong.
Review  statutory demand  package. Review
correspondence from Christine Mason. Review
comments. Correspondence to Christine Mason.
Review correspondence from Andrew Whittingham.

Review case law regarding implied and constructive
trusts in the context of a receivership. Email Robert
Kennedy regarding PSMA Inc. trust claim.

Review correspondence from Andrew Whittingham.
Correspondence to Alex MacFarlane re: demand.
Review memorandum re: commissions. Consider
commission / trust claim issue. Review notice re:
floating charge. Correspondence to Robert Rhoda (x2).



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 342405
Page 7 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

05-Jun-19

06-Jun-19

06-Jun-19

10-Jun-19
10-Jun-19

11-Jun-19

12-Jun-19

12-Jun-19

13-Jun-19

14-Jun-19

14-Jun-19

19-Jun-19

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake
Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Correspondence to Christine Mason. Conversation with
Christine Mason. Review APA and provide comments.
Various conversations with Andrew Whittingham re:
administration matters. Conversation with Jorden
Sleeth. Conference with Mark Freake. Correspondence
to Andrew Whittingham re: APA and comments.

Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review correspondence from Andrew Whittingham.
Review draft APA. Voicemail received from Gordon
Hearn. Correspondence from and to Gordon Hearn.
Conversation with Gordon Hearn.

Draft response to Gordon Hearn regarding PSMA Inc.
claim.

Correspondence from and to Andrew Whittingham.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda. Conversation with
Jorden Sleeth. Correspondence to Gord Hearn.
Conference with Mark Freake re: administration
matters. Review correspondence from Gord Hearn.

Review case law regarding PSMA Inc.'s trust claim.

Review correspondence from Gordon Hearn. Consider
claim matters. Various correspondence to and from
Mark Freake re: next steps. Correspondence to Jorden
Sleeth.

Further review of case law regarding PSMA Inc.'s trust
claim. Email Jordan Sleeth and Andrew Whittingham
regarding same.

Email correspondence with clients regarding PSMA's
trust claim.

Correspondence from and to Mark Freake. Review
demand. Review correspondence from Alex
MacFarlane.

Various correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane
re: HK matters. Conference with Mark Freake re: trust
claim.

Conference call with Gordon Hearn regarding PSMA
trust claim. Conversation with Robert Kennedy and
email correspondence with Jorden Sleeth and Andrew
Whittingham regarding same.

Conference with Mark Freake. Review trust claim
correspondence. Various correspondence to and from
Robert Rhoda. Correspondence to Alex MacFarlane.
Attend conference call re: trust claim.

Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham. Various correspondence to and from
Mark Freake. Review correspondence from Alex
MacFarlane.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 342406

Page 8 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

20-Jun-19

20-Jun-19

25-Jun-19

26-Jun-19

26-Jun-19

28-Jun-19

03-Jul-19

05-Jul-19
08-Jul-19
11-Jul-19

11-Jul-19

12-Jul-19

15-Jul-19

15-Jul-19

15-Jul-19
16-Jul-19

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Kori Williams

Kori Williams
Kori Williams
Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Yves St-Cyr
Mark Freake

Email correspondence with Jorden Sleeth, Andrew
Whittingham and Gordon Hearn regarding PSMA trust
claim.

Review file re: service of statutory notice. Various
correspondence to and from Alex MacFarlane.
Correspondence to  Andrew  Whittingham  re:
administration matters.

Review corroborating documents from Gordon Hearn
and PSMA Inc. regarding alleged trust. Draft responding
letter to Gordon Hearn regarding Receiver's position on
alleged trust. Various email correspondence with
Jorden Sleeth, Andrew Whittingham and Robert
Kennedy regarding same.

Revise letter to Gordon Hearn. Email correspondence
with the Receiver and Gordon Hearn regarding same.

Review various correspondence re: sale commission
claim. Review draft reply. Conversation with Jorden
Sleeth.

Various correspondence to and from Scott Johnson.
Conversation with Scott Johnson re: foreign companies.
Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth and Andrew
Whittingham.

Email correspondence to and from Scott Thompson in
connection with US security review.

Emails in connection with US security review.
Emails in connection with US security review.

Email Gordon Hearn regarding PSMA trust claim. Attend
conference call with Jorden Sleeth, Andrew
Whittingham Robert Kennedy and Alex MacFarlane
regarding HST priority issues.

Various correspondence to and form Andrew
Whittingham . Attend conference «call re:
administration update, CRA and HK / China. Conference
with Mark Freake.

Review correspondence and notices from CRA regarding
GST/HST issues. Email Larry Nevsky regarding tax on
imports. Discuss same with Robert Kennedy.

Review correspondence and notices from CRA regarding
GST/HST issues. Email Larry Nevsky regarding tax on
imports. Discuss same with Robert Kennedy.

Review various correspondence re: HST priority
matters.

Review correspondence and attached documents.

Telephone call with Manon Jubinville regarding Best
Made Toys' liability for unpaid GST on imports.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34624b 4
Page 9 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

16-Jul-19

16-Jul-19

17-Jul-19

18-Jul-19

18-Jul-19

18-Jul-19

18-Jul-19

19-Jul-19

24-Jul-19

25-Jul-19

28-Jul-19

08-Aug-19

12-Aug-19

13-Aug-19

14-Aug-19

16-Aug-19

19-Aug-19

Yves St-Cyr

Manon Jubinville

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Yves St-Cyr

Manon Jubinville

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Review documents. Review provisions of the Excise Tax
Act and the Income Tax Act. Conference call with
Manon Jubinville.

Various discussions with Mark Freake and exchanges of
emails. Working session with Yves St-Cyr.

Review correspondence regarding Best Made Toys
accounts receivable collections. Email Robert Kennedy
regarding same.

Email Manon Jubinville regarding import tax issue.
Draft demand letters regarding accounts receivable.

Review memorandum re: HST priority. Various
correspondence to and from Mark Freake. Conference
with Mark Freake.

Review of Manon Jubinville's tax memorandum
regarding HST liabilities (CRA's priority).

Review of the legislation. Writing of an email with our
comments regarding the CRA's priority with respect to
GST paid at customs.

Email Manon Jubinville regarding import tax issue.
Draft demand letters regarding accounts receivable.

Draft demand letters regarding accounts receivable.
Email correspondence with Gordon Hearn regarding
PSMA claim.

Draft and revise demand letters regarding accounts
receivable. Telephone call with Gordon Hearn regarding
PSMA claim. Report to clients regarding same.

Review trust claim. Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth
and Andrew Whittingham re: bankruptcy strategy.

Correspondence to and from Scott Johnson.
Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth re: records.

Email correspondence with Receiver regarding PSMA
claim.

Conversation with Andrew Whittingham regarding AR
and next steps.

Email correspondence with Gordon Hearn regarding
PSMA claim.

Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham. Conversation with Andrew Whittingham
re: lease and sale matters. Review purchase agreement.

Review lease. Review purchase agreement. Consider
next steps re: purchase agreement and lease matters.
Voicemail left with Jorden Sleeth. Review demand
letter. Conference with Mark Freake. Conversation with
Andrew Whittingham.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 342408
Page 10 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date Timekeeper Description of Work

20-Aug-19 Robert Kennedy Review correspondence from  Scott Johnson.
Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth and Andrew
Whittingham re: lease and purchase agreement.
Conference with Mark Freake. Review purchase
agreement.

21-Aug-19 Mark Freake Draft and revise accounts receivable demand letters.
Email correspondence with Robert Kennedy regarding
same.

21-Aug-19 Robert Kennedy Conference with Mark Freake re: demand letter. Review
correspondence from Andrew Whittingham. Review
demand letter.

22-Aug-19 Mark Freake Finalize and send accounts receivable demand letters.
Email Receiver regarding same.

22-Aug-19 Robert Kennedy Review demand letters.

05-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Various correspondence to and from Andrew
Whittingham. Review demand letters Correspondence
to Alex Cheung.

10-Sep-19 Mark Freake Email correspondence with Stacey Greenbaum
regarding account receivables demand letters.

11-Sep-19 Mark Freake Draft letters to Tokmanni Oy and Hamleys of London
Ltd. regarding accounts receivable. Email
correspondence with Stacey Greenbaum and Robert
Kennedy regarding same.

11-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth and
Stacey Greenbaum. Review and consider lease
documentation. Review replacement quote.
Conversation with Jorden Sleeth. Conference with Mark
Freake re: third party demands. Review demand letters.
Review correspondence to third parties.

16-Sep-19 Mark Freake Receive and review letter and payment information
from Tokmanni Oy. Email correspondence with Stacey
Greenbaum regarding same.

16-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Review correspondence from Heli Halmela re: account
payment. Review various correspondence re:
receivables.

17-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Review demand letters. Various correspondence to and
from Stacey Greenbaum.

18-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Review demand letters. Correspondence to Stacey
Greenbaum.

26-Sep-19 Mark Freake Email Hamleys Asia Limited regarding accounts
receivable. Email correspondence with  Stacey
Greenbaum regarding same.

26-Sep-19 Robert Kennedy Review various correspondence re: collection of AR.

30-Sep-19 Mark Freake Review correspondence from James Wong regarding

Hong Kong employment matters.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 342409
Page 11 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

Date Timekeeper

Description of Work

18-Oct-19 Mark Freake

23-Oct-19 Mark Freake

23-Oct-19 Robert Kennedy

29-Oct-19 Mark Freake

29-Oct-19 Robert Kennedy

31-Oct-19 Robert Kennedy

Email correspondence with Gordon Hearn regarding
PSMA claim.

Email correspondence with Stacey Greenbaum and
Jorden Sleeth regarding Hamleys account receiverable
and next steps.

Review various correspondence re: AR matters. Review
demand letter.

Telephone call with Robert Kennedy regarding air tank
issue and related lease issues. Review file for 120 St
Regis lease.

Review various correspondence from Jorden Sleeth re:
tank issue. Review attachments. Review transaction
documents. Correspondence to Jorden Sleeth.
Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: sale of tanks.

Review correpsondence re: HK taxes. Conversation with
Jorden Sleeth.

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Danijel Augustinovic 10.0 505.00 5,050.00
Jonathan Meyer 2.1 270.00 567.00
Kim Lawton 0.7 575.00 402.50
Kori Williams 23.0 680.00 15,640.00
Manon Jubinville 3.8 750.00 2,850.00
Mark Freake 25.2 560.00 14,112.00
Rennie Ali 1.0 200.00 200.00
Robert Kennedy 71.1 725.00 51,547.50
Yves St-Cyr 2.0 950.00 1,900.00
Total 138.9 $92,269.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 92,269.00
Less: Discount (3,776.50)
NET PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 88,492.50
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS
Conference Call charges S 1.36
Dentons Hong Kong 22,722.97
Photocopy & Printing Charges 204.75
Searches 949.04
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 23,878.12

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS

TAXES

23,878.12

$ 112,370.62

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $88,492.50 S 11,504.03



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34220

Page 12 of 12
Matter # 569588-000003

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $23,878.12
TOTAL TAXES

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

3,104.16

14,608.19

S 126,978.81 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3477042

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date

Matter Number Lawyer

December 31, 2019 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 3,394.00
Disbursements 7.00
HST (13.0%) on $3,401.00 442.13
Total Amount Due $ 3,843.13 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.
Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324
Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:
Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 347284
Page 2 of 2
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper Description of Work

05-Nov-19 Robert Kennedy Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: HK taxes. Various
correspondence to and from Stacey Greenbaum.

12-Nov-19 Robert Kennedy Review correspondence from Stacy Greenbaum.
Conversation with Stacy Greenbaum re: HK tax issues
and AR recoveries.

19-Nov-19 Robert Kennedy Review correspondence from Stacey Greenbaum.

21-Nov-19 Robert Kennedy Correspondence from and to Stacey Greenbaum.

04-Dec-19 Robert Kennedy Conference with Kori Williams re: security review.
Review draft.

09-Dec-19 Kori Williams Lender opinion.

15-Dec-19 Robert Kennedy Review draft bankruptcy materials. Correspondence to
Stacey Greenbaum.

19-Dec-19 Robert Kennedy Review bankruptcy materials.  Review receivership

order. Meeting with Jorden Sleeth re: bankruptcy and
next steps.

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Kori Williams 0.3 680.00 204.00
Robert Kennedy 4.4 725.00 3,190.00
Total 4.7 $3,394.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 3,394.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS
Photocopy & Printing Charges S 7.00
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS S 7.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 7.00
TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS S 3,401.00
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $3,394.00 S 441.22
HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $7.00 0.91
TOTAL TAXES 442.13
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S 3,843.13 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3483204

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date

Matter Number Lawyer

January 31, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 9,220.00
Disbursements 3.75
HST (13.0%) on $9,223.75 1,199.09
Total Amount Due $ 10,422.84 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.
Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324
Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:
Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34224
Page 2 of 3
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date

Timekeeper

Description of Work

03-Jan-20

06-Jan-20
07-Jan-20

08-Jan-20

09-Jan-20

15-Jan-20
17-Jan-20

20-Jan-20

21-Jan-20

22-Jan-20

23-Jan-20

23-Jan-20

27-Jan-20

30-Jan-20

Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy
Robert Kennedy

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Mark Freake
Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Robert Kennedy

Mark Freake

Mark Freake

Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: bankruptcy
administration matters. Review security opinion. Review
bankrutpcy documentation.

Review bankruptcy documentation.

Review correspondence from Stacey Greenbaum.
Correspondence to Stacey Greenbaum. Consider HK
matters. Preparation for first meeting of creditors.

Preparation for First Meeting of Creditors. Attend
meeting. Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: meeting.
Conference with Jorden Sleeth and Stacey Greenbaum
re: administration issues. Review HK matter.
Correspondence to Robert Rhoda. Conference with
Mark Freake re: AR recoveries.

Discuss Hamleys matter with Robert Kennedy. Conduct
searches for Hamleys accounts payable line.
Conference call with Stacey Greenbaum and Emily Klein
regarding same.

Email Robert Rhoda regarding Hong Kong tax issues.

Email correspondence with Receiver regarding Hamleys
accounts receivable issue and Hong Kong tax issue.

Email correspondence with Robert Rhoda and Stacey
Greenbaum regarding Hong Kong tax issues. Consider
next steps regarding Hamleys.

Discuss Hong Kong tax issue with Robert Kennedy.
Email correspondence regarding conference call.

Review correspondence and supporting documentation
regarding Hong Kong tax issues. Email correspondence
regarding conference call to discuss same.

Prepare for and attend conference call with Receiver
and Dentons Hong Kong regarding corporate tax and
employee priority payables issues.

Preparation for conference call with HK. Attend
conference call. Consider next steps re: HK payables.
Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.

Review and approve letter to Hong Kong IRD. Discuss
Hamleys collection issues with Robert Kennedy. Email
Stacey Greenbaum regarding strategy for same.

Review correspondence from Shelly Gobin regarding
Hamleys receivable. Email Stacey Greenbaum regarding
litigation and next steps.



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 34228
Page 3 of 3
Matter # 569588-000003

Date Timekeeper

Description of Work

30-Jan-20  Robert Kennedy

Review correspondence from Stacey Greenbaum.
Review ToysRus AR matters and Red Rock insurance.
Conversation with Stacey Greenbaum. Conference with

Mark Freake re: AR matters.

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Mark Freake 4.4 610.00 2,684.00
Robert Kennedy 8.6 760.00 6,536.00
Total 13.0 $9,220.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 9,220.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS
Photocopy & Printing Charges S 3.75
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS S 3.75
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 3.75
TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS S 9,223.75
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $9,220.00 S 1,198.60
HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $3.75 0.49

TOTAL TAXES

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

1,199.09

S 10,422.84 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3490564

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date Matter Number Lawyer
February 29, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 2,436.00
HST (13.0%) on $2,436.00 316.68
Total Amount Due $ 2,752.68 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Credit Card:

Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:

Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 349834
Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Page 2 of 2
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al. Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper Description of Work

04-Feb-20 Mark Freake Telephone and email correspondence with Tessa Blank
of Dentons UK regarding Hamleys receivable and
collection strategy. Discuss strategy with Robert
Kennedy. Report to Stacey Greenbaum regarding same.

04-Feb-20 Robert Kennedy Review various correspondence re: Hamley invoices.
Consider strategy and next steps.

10-Feb-20 Mark Freake Email Stacey Greenbaum regarding Hamleys strategy.
Discuss same with Robert Kennedy.

10-Feb-20 Robert Kennedy Review correspondence from Stacy Greenbaum.
Conference with Mark Freake re: Hamley's and next
steps.

11-Feb-20 Robert Kennedy Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: motion and
distribution.

25-Feb-20 Mark Freake Prepare for and attend conference call with Tessa Blank

and Stacey Greenbaum regarding Hamley's receivables.
Review draft demand letter from Tessa Blank. Provide
instructions regarding service.

25-Feb-20 Robert Kennedy Conference with Mark Freake re: AR matters.
Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Mark Freake 2.0 610.00 1,220.00
Robert Kennedy 1.6 760.00 1,216.00
Total 3.6 $2,436.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 2,436.00
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $2,436.00 S 316.68
TOTAL TAXES 316.68

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S 2,752.68 CAD
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233

Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3498333

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date

Matter Number Lawyer

March 31, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 228.00
Disbursements 24.41
HST (13.0%) on $252.41 32.81
Total Amount Due $ 285.22 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.
Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324
Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:
Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3493534}
Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Page 2 of 2
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al. Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper Description of Work
19-Mar-20 Robert Kennedy Review file. Correspondence to Mark Freake re: AR
matters.
Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Robert Kennedy 0.3 760.00 228.00
Total 0.3 $228.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 228.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS
Long Distance Telephone Calls S 4.83
Courier & Delivery 19.58
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS S 24.41
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 24.41
TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS S 252.41
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $228.00 S 29.64
HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $24.41 3.17
TOTAL TAXES 32.81

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S 285.22 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3504203

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date

Matter Number Lawyer

April 30, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 426.00
Disbursements 11,642.87
HST (13.0%) on $12,068.87 1,568.95
Total Amount Due $ 13,637.82 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.
Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:
Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 35287
Page 2 of 2
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper

Description of Work

02-Apr-20 Robert Kennedy

30-Apr-20 Mark Freake

Correspondence from and to Rob Kiefer re: distribution
order. Review A/R matters. Consider next steps.

Review correspondence regarding Hong Kong employee
issues.

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Mark Freake 0.2 610.00 122.00
Robert Kennedy 0.4 760.00 304.00
Total 0.6 $426.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 426.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS
Dentons Hong Kong S 11,642.87
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 11,642.87

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

11,642.87

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS S 12,068.87
TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $426.00 S 55.38

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $11,642.87 1,513.57
TOTAL TAXES 1,568.95
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 13,637.82 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3511768

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date Matter Number Lawyer
May 31, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 1,703.00
HST (13.0%) on $1,703.00 221.39
Total Amount Due $ 1,924.39 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please emailus at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Credit Card:

Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:

Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INvOICE 35244

Page 2 of 2
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper

Description of Work

04-May-20 Robert Kennedy

08-May-20 Mark Freake

08-May-20 Robert Kennedy

Review correspondence from Stacy Greenbaum.
Consider next steps re: employee payments.

Review correspondence and notes regarding Hong Kong
employee issues. Call with Robert Kennedy regarding
same.

Review correspondence from Stacey Greenbaum.

Review HK employee priority issues. Conference with
Mark Freake. Correspondence to Stacey Greenbaum.

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Mark Freake 0.3 610.00 183.00

Robert Kennedy 2.0 760.00 1,520.00

Total 2.3 $1,703.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 1,703.00
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $1,703.00 S 221.39

TOTAL TAXES 221.39
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE s 1,924.39 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3518078

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date Matter Number Lawyer
June 30, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 4,988.00
HST (13.0%) on $4,988.00 648.44
Total Amount Due $ 5,636.44 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Credit Card:

Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:

Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 3512¢}d}
Page 2 of 3
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper Description of Work
17-Jun-20  Robert Kennedy Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: discharge matters.
Consider motion matters.
22-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth. Various
correspondence to and from Rob Kiefer. Consider
distribution motion matters.
23-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Review file. Various correspondence to and from Rob
Kiefer. Consider and preparation of motion materials.
24-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Various correspondence to and from Stacey Greenbaum
and Jorden Sleeth. Review and consider record matter.
Conference with Jordan Schultz. Consider motion
matters.
25-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth.
Correspondence to Rob Kiefer. Attend to scheduling.
Conversation with Stacey Greenbaum. Review
correspondence re: BMT ULC minute book. Conference
with Jordan Schultz.
26-Jun-20  Jordan Schultz Email to MLT regarding production of minute book.
26-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Correspondence from and to Jorden Sleeth. Review
correspondence from Jordan Schultz.
29-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Conversation with Jorden Sleeth re: motion matters.
Review various correspondence re: records.
30-Jun-20 Robert Kennedy Review various correspondence from Jordan Schultz.
Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Attend to scheduling. Correspondence from and to Rob
Kiefer. Conversation with Jordan Schultz regarding
records.  Conversation with Rob Kiefer regarding
discharge. Review correspondence from Stacey
Greenbaum.
Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Jordan Schultz 0.4 500.00 200.00
Robert Kennedy 6.3 760.00 4,788.00
Total 6.7 $4,988.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES S 4,988.00
TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $4,988.00 S 648.44
TOTAL TAXES 648.44



DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3512¢}H
Deloitte Restructuring Inc. Page 3 of 3
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al. Matter # 569588-000003

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S 5,636.44 CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400
Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

Salans FMC SNR Denton McKenna Long
dentons.com

Deloitte Restructuring Inc. INVOICE # 3520973

8 Adelaide Street West, Suite 200

Toronto, ON M5H 0A9 GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention: Jorden Sleeth

Date Matter Number Lawyer
July 20, 2020 569588-000003 Robert Kennedy

Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

Professional Fees S 23,755.00
HST (13.0%) on $23,755.00 3,088.15
Total Amount Due $  26,843.15 CAD
Payment Options:
Cheques: Internet Banking:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP Accepted at most financial institutions. Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and
and mailed to the above noted address. your account number is 569588. Please email us at
Edm.Accounting@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment
amount.
Wire Transfer: Interac e-Transfer:
Bank of Montreal e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password.
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2 Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Bank ID: 001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Credit Card:

Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax. We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. Expiry Date: Card Verification Code (CVC):
Amount: Cardholder Name:

Signature:

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt. Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.




DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.

Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INVOICE 3522448
Page 2 of 3
Matter # 569588-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date Timekeeper Description of Work
08-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Various correspondence to and from Jorden Sleeth.
Review draft report and consider next steps.
13-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on Receiver's Report. Correspondence from and
Jorden Sleeth.
14-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on Receiver's Report.
15-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on Receiver's Report and motion matters. Various
correspondence re: AR recoveries. Conversation with
Jorden Sleeth. Conference with Mark Freake.
15-Jul-20  Kenneth Kraft Discuss with Rob Kennedy issues around dealing with
HK claimants to certain receivables and how to address
potentially dealing with funds if employee/claimants
can't be located.
16-Jul-20 Mark Freake Draft and revise Notice of Motion and Order regarding
Distribution and Discharge motion.
16-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on Receiver's Report. Correspondence to Robert
Rhoda. Various correspondence to and from Stacey
Greenbaum.
17-Jul-20 Mark Freake Call with Robert Kennedy regarding Distribution and
Discharge motion. Review and revise First Report of the
Receiver. Draft and revise Notice of Motion and Order.
17-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on motion materials. Conference with Mark
Freake. Consider HK employee issue.
20-Jul-20  Mark Freake Review and revise Receiver's First Report. Draft and
revise Notice of Motion and Distribution and Discharge
Order. Discussions with Robert Kennedy regarding
same.
20-Jul-20  Robert Kennedy Work on motion materials. Various correspondence to
and from Jorden Sleeth. Conversation with Jorden
Sleeth re: motion matters. Attend conference call with
Jorden Sleeth and Alex MacFarlane re: HK matters.
Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Kenneth Kraft 0.4 925.00 370.00
Mark Freake 11.3 610.00 6,893.00
Robert Kennedy 21.7 760.00 16,492.00
Total 33.4 $23,755.00
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $  23,755.00



DENTONS CANADA LLP
Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
Re: Best Made Toys International Inc. et al.

INvOICE 352249

Page 3 of 3

Matter # 569588-000003

TAXES
HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $23,755.00

TOTAL TAXES

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

$

3,088.15

3,088.15

S 26,843.15 CAD



THIS IS EXHIBIT "B" REFERRED TO IN THE
AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE OF ROBERT KENNEDY
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 22nd DAY OF JULY,
2020.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc.

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "C" REFERRED TO IN THE
AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE OF ROBERT KENNEDY
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 22nd DAY OF JULY,
2020.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc.

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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EXHIBIT “C”

Billing Rates of Dentons Canada LLP

For the period April 17,2019 to July 20, 2020

2019 Rate 2020 Rate Year of Call

Manon Jubinville $750 N/A 1987 (QB)
Kenneth Kraft N/A $925 1991
Robert Kennedy $725 $760 2002
Kori Williams $680 N/A 2008
Jordan Shultz N/A $500 2009 (BC)
Yves St-Cyr $950 N/A 2011
Kim Lawton $575 N/A 2012
Mark Freake $560 $610 2013
Danijel Augustinovic $505 N/A 2015
Jonathan Meyer $270 N/A Articling Student

Rennie Ali $200 N/A Law Clerk

NATDOCS\47216369\V-1
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Court File No.: CV-19-00618506-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)
THE HONOURABLE ) TUESDAY, THE 28™
)
JUSTICE ) DAY OF JULY, 2020
BETWEEN:
BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —

BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDINGS LLC

Respondents

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION PURSUANT TO SECTION 243(1) OF THE
BANKRTUPCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED; AND
SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED

DISTRIBUTION AND DISCHARGE ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by Deloitte Restructuring Inc. (“Deloitte”), in its capacity as the
court-appointed receiver and manager (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), of the assets,
undertakings and properties of Best Made Toys International, Best Made Toys LLC, Best Made
Toys Global Enterprises Limited (“BMTGE”) and Best Made Toys Holdings LLC (collectively,

the “Company”), for an Order:

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3



257

(a) abridging the time for service of the Notice of Motion herein, the Notice of Motion and
the First Report of Deloitte, in its capacity as Receiver, dated July 22, 2020 (the “First
Report™) so that this Motion is properly returnable on July 28, 2020, and dispensing with

further service thereof;
(b) approving the First Report, and the activities of the Receiver as described therein;

(c) approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements dated July 21, 2020

(the “Receiver’s R&D”);

(d) authorizing the Receiver to make distributions to certain employees of BMTGE on
account of employee claims in the total approximate amount of USD20,000 (the

“BMTGE Employee Claims”);

(e) authorizing an interim distribution to Bank of Montreal (“BMO”) in the amount of
USD4,400,000, (the “BMO Interim Distribution”), and a final distribution of the
remaining cash in the receivership estate to BMO following (the “BMO Final

Distribution”):

a. the payment of the Remaining Fees (as defined herein), plus any other amounts

outstanding pursuant to the Receiver’s charge; and

b. the payment of any priority payables and BMTGE Employee Claims, with such
claims to be delivered and paid within 45 days after the granting of this Order (the
“Employee Payment Period”), failing which the amount of the BMTGE

Employee Claims shall be distributed to BMO;

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3
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(f) approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver as set out in the affidavit of Jorden
Sleeth sworn July 22, 2020, the fees and disbursements of the Receiver’s counsel,
Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons™), as set out in the affidavit of Robert Kennedy sworn
July 2, 2020 (collectively, the “Fee Affidavits”), together with the estimated fees and
disbursements to be incurred by the Receiver and Dentons through completion of the
remaining activities in connection with these receivership proceedings, as set out in the

First Report (the “Remaining Fees™);

(g) discharging and releasing Deloitte as Receiver of the Company, upon the Receiver filing

with the court the certificate in the form attached hereto as Schedule “A” (the

“Receiver’s Discharge Certificate”); and

(h) such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may

permit;

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Motion Record of the Receiver dated July 22, 2020 and the First
Report, and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver, no one appearing for any
other person on the service list, although properly served as appears from the affidavit of

Amanda Campbell sworn July , 2020, filed,

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3
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SERVICE

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the timing and method of service of the Notice of Motion
and Motion Record is hereby abridged and validated and this Motion is properly returnable

today.

DISTRIBUTIONS

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is authorized and directed to make
distributions to the employees of BMTGE in satisfaction of the BMTGE Employee Claims, as
described in the First Report, provided that such distributions on account of the BMTGE
Employee Claims are completed and delivered to the employees prior to the expiry of the

Employee Payment Period.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is authorized and directed to make the BMO
Interim Distribution to BMO in partial satisfaction of the amounts owing by BMT to BMO, and
to make the Final BMO Distribution of the remaining cash in the receivership estate to BMO

following:

(a) the payment of the Remaining Fees, plus any other amounts outstanding pursuant

to the Receiver’s charge; and

(b) upon the earlier of the payment of all BMTGE Employee Claims or, the expiry of

the Employee Payment Period.

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3



260

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the First Report and the activities of the Receiver as set

out in the First Report are hereby approved.

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that: (i) the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and
Dentons, as set out in the First Report and the Fees Affidavits are hereby approved, (ii) the
Remaining Fees are hereby approved and no further approval of the fees and disbursements of
the Receiver or Dentons is required in respect of the Remaining Fees, and, (iii) the Receiver is

hereby authorized to pay any unpaid fees and disbursements.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s R&D is hereby approved.

DISCHARGE

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the amounts herein approved, and upon
the Receiver filing the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate certifying that it has completed the
remaining activities described in the First Report, Deloitte shall be discharged as Receiver,
provided however, that notwithstanding its discharge herein: (a) the Receiver shall remain
Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the
administration of the receivership proceedings, and (b) the Receiver shall continue to have the
benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in these proceedings, including all approvals,

protections and stays of proceedings in favour of Deloitte, in its capacity as Receiver.

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3
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8. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon filing the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, Deloitte
shall be released and discharged from any and all liability that Deloitte now has or may hereafter
have by reason of, or in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of Deloitte while acting in
its capacity as Receiver herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on
the Receiver’s part. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, Deloitte shall be hereby
forever released and discharged from any and all liability relating to matters that were raised, or
which could have been raised, in the within receivership proceedings, save and except for any

gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver’s part.
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Schedule “A” — Form of Receiver’s Discharge Certificate
Court File No.: CV-19-00618506-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

BETWEEN:
BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —
BEST MADE TOYS INTERNATIONAL, ULC, BEST MADE TOYS LLC,
BEST MADE TOYS GLOBAL ENTERPRISES LIMITED and BEST MADE TOYS
HOLDINGS LLC

Respondents

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION PURSUANT TO SECTION 243(1) OF THE
BANKRTUPCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED; AND
SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.0. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Justice Hainey of the Ontario Superior Court of
Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) dated April 25, 2019, Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
(“Deloitte”) was appointed as receiver and manager (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), of the
assets, undertakings and properties of Best Made Toys International, Best Made Toys LLC, Best
Made Toys Global Enterprises Limited and Best Made Toys Holdings LLC (collectively, the
“Company”).

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated July 28, 2020 (the “Distribution and Discharge
Order”), Deloitte was discharged as Receiver of the Company, effective upon the filing by the

Receiver with the Court of a certificate confirming that all matters to be attended to in

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3
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connection with the completion of the administration of the receivership proceeding herein have
been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver (the “Remaining Activities”), as set out in the
Receiver’s First Report dated July 22, 2020 (the “First Report”), provided however that,
notwithstanding its discharge: (a) Deloitte will remain Receiver for the performance of the
Remaining Activities, and (b) Deloitte as Receiver will continue to have the benefit of the
provisions of all Orders made in this proceeding including all approvals, protections and stays of

proceedings in favour of Deloitte, in its capacity as the Receiver.

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

1. The Receiver has paid all amounts required to be paid pursuant to the Distribution and

Discharge Order; and

2. The Receiver is satisfied all Remaining Activities have been completed to the satisfaction

of the Receiver.

THIS CERTIFICATE was delivered by the Receiver on , 2020.

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., solely
in its capacity as the court-appointed receiver of
the Company, and not in its personal capacity or in
any other capacity

Per:

Name:
Title:

NATDOCS\47680380\V-3
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Court File No. : -19-0061 - L
ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST )
THEHONOURABEE—— 3 WEEKDAY THE#
)
JUSHCE—— DAY OEMONTH 20¥YR
)
THE HONOURABLE ) TUESDAY, THE 28TH
)
JUSTICE ) DAY OF JULY, 2020
BETWEEN:
PEAINTIEE
Plaintiee
BANK OF MONTREAL
Applicant
-and —
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I

DISTRIBUTION AND DISCHARGE ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by RECEINVERS—NAME]Deloitte Restructuring Inc.
(“Deloitte), in its capacity as the Ceurtcourt-appointed receiver ¢and manager (in such capacity,
the “‘Receiver'’), of the—undertaking—property—and assets—ofDEBTOR}(the—"Debter",

T lobal Enterprises Limited (“‘BMTGE”) and Best Made Toys Holdings LI llectivel

(b) +—approving_the First Report, and the activities of the Receiver as set-eut-intherepert
efdescribed therein;

(c) approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements dated fFDAFE}uly 21
2020 (the “Report):—-Receiver’s R&D”):

al distribution of
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the remaining preeeeds—avatablecash in the receivership estate eftheDebtorfand}-to
BMO following (the “BMO Final Distribution’):

First Report (the “Remaining Fees”):
(g) 4—discharging RECEFVER'S—NAME]and releasing Deloitte as Receiver of the
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IS

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Repeort—the-atfidavitsMotion Record of the Receiver dated July 22,
2020 and its—eounsel-as—to—fees—(the"Fee—Affidavits)the First Report, and on hearing the
submissions of counsel for the Receiver, no one else—appearing for any other person on the
service list, although properly served as ewideneed—byappears from the Affidavitaffidavit of
INAME}Amanda Campbell sworn tBAFELfHed*—July ., 2020, filed.

1. THI RT ORDERS that the timing and meth f 1 f th t f Motion




S

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES

4. +-THIS COURT ORDERS that_the First Report and the activities of the Receiver; as set

out in the First Report; are hereby approved.

5. 2-THIS COURT ORDERS that. (i) the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its-

eounselDentons, as set out in the First Report and the FeeFees Affidavits; are hereby approved-,_
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1 3-THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees—and-disbursementsamounts

herein approved,

kereeffand upon the Receiver filing a—eertifieatethe Receiver’s Discharge Certificate certifying

that it has completed the etherremaining activities described in the First Report};—theReeeiver,

Deloitte shall be discharged as Receiver-ef-the-undertakingproperty-and-assets—of-the Debter,

provided however, that notwithstanding its discharge herein; (a) the Receiver shall remain
Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the

administration of the receivership heretnproceedings, and (b) the Receiver shall continue to have

the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in this-preeceedingthese proceedings, including all
approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in favour of fRECEFVER'S NAME]Deloitte, in

its capacity as Receiver.

8. 5—THIS COURT ORDERS AND-BDECEARES—that [RECEIVER'S NAME]is-
herebyupon filing the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, Deloitte shall be released and discharged
from any and all liability that RECEIVER'S- NAME]Deloitte now has or may hereafter have by
reason of, or in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of fRECEINVER'S NAME]Deloitte
while acting in its capacity as Receiver herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful
misconduct on the Receiver’s part. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing,
RECENVER'S NAME}HsDeloitte shall be hereby forever released and discharged from any and

all liability relating to matters that were raised, or which could have been raised, in the within
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receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the

Receiver!’s part.}*
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Court File No.: CV-19-00618506-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

BETWEFEN:




2

ith th mpletion of th ministration of the receivership pr ing_herein h. n

notwithstanding its discharge: Deloitt i1l remain Receiver for th rforman f th

DELOITTE RESTRUCTURING INC., solely in
. . | ] inted . F o

any other capacity
Per:
Name:
Title:
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